BID TABULATION

Bid #2008-889
Liquid Asphalt – Transport Load – 6 mos. Annual Contract
Bid Opening: Wednesday, October 31, 2007 @ 2:00 p.m.

UNIT PRICE PER GALLON

	Description
	Estimated Quantity
	Performance Grade Asphalt
	Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc. 


	Prime Materials & Supply
	Previous Contract

	CRS-2


	5,000

gallons
	$ 1.46 per gallon

$7,300.00
	$ 1.6408 per gallon

$8,204.00
	NO BID
	$ 1.44

	SS-1


	5,000

gallons
	$ 1.52 per gallon

$7,600.00
	$ 1.5408 per gallon

$7,704.00
	NO BID
	$ 1.45

	HFRS-2


	20,000

gallons
	NO BID
	$ 1.6408 per gallon

$32,816.00
	NO BID
	$ 1.45

	AE-P


	5,000

gallons
	$1.69 per gallon

$8,450.00
	$1.8408 per gallon

$9,204.00
	NO BID
	$1.95

	CSS-1


	10,000

gallons
	$1.52 per gallon

$7,600.00
	$1.5408 per gallon

$15,408.00
	NO BID
	$1.45


