	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX
	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX

	1
	6”X4” ADAPTER SDR  Sewer Spigot x S/W
DWV HUB
	$7.08 x 50 = $354.00
	$7.10 x 50 = $355.00
	$7.24 x 50 = $362.00
	NO BID



	2
	6” ELBOW - 22 1/2 SDR  HUB x HUB
	$6.15 x 50 = $307.50
	$6.15 x 50 = $307.50
	$6.29 x 50 = $314.50
	

	3
	6" ELBOW - 22 1/2 SDR  HUB x SPIGOT
	$7.18 x 20 = $143.60
	$7.20 x 20 = $144.00
	$7.34 x 20 = $146.80
	

	4
	6" ELBOW - 45 SDR  HUB x HUB
	$5.03 x 30 = $150.90
	$5.05 x 30 = $151.50
	$5.15 x 30 = $154.50
	

	5
	6" ELBOW - 45 SDR SPIGOT x HUB
	$6.45 x 20 = $129.00
	$6.45 x 20 = $129.00
	$6.60 x 20 = $132.00
	

	6
	8" ELBOW - 45 SDR  HUB x HUB
	$13.76 x 10 = $137.60
	$13.75 x 10 = $137.50
	$14.05 x 10 = $140.50
	

	7
	6" ELBOW - 90 SDR  HUB x HUB
	$4.68 x 50 = $234.00
	$4.70 x 50 = $235.00
	$4.79 x 50 = $239.50
	

	8
	6" ELBOW - 90 SDR  SPIGOT x HUB
	$9.57 x 30 = $287.10
	$9.55 x 30 = $286.50
	$9.78 x 30 = $293.40
	

	9
	8" ELBOW - 90 SDR  HUB x HUB
	$19.40 x 20 = $388.00
	$19.45 x 20 = $389.00
	$19.85 x 20 = $397.00
	

	10
	6" x 6" SANITARY TEE SDR  HUB x HUB x HUB
	$18.50 x 50 = $925.00
	$18.55 x 50 = $927.50
	$18.96 x 50 = $948.00
	

	11
	6" x 4" SANITARY TEE SDR HUB x HUB x HUB
	$14.00 x 50 = $700.00
	$14.05 x 50 = $702.50
	$14.35 x 50 = $717.50
	


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX
	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX

	12
	8 x 4 SANITARY TEE  SDR  HUB x HUB x HUB
	$18.30 x 20 = $366.00
	$18.35 x 20 = $367.00
	$18.75 x 20 = $375.00
	NO BID



	13
	8 x 6  SANITARY TEE SDR  HUB x HUB x HUB
	$20.60 x 10 = $206.00
	$20.65 x 10 = $206.50
	$21.13 x 10 = $211.30
	

	14
	8 x 8 SANITARY TEE  SDR  HUB x HUB x HUB
	$43.70 x 5 = $218.50
	$43.75 x 5 = $218.75
	$44.73 x 5 = $223.65
	

	15
	6 x 6 WYE SDR HUB x HUB x HUB
	$9.90 x 30 = $297.00
	$9.90 x 30 = $297.00
	$10.13 x 30 = $303.90
	

	16
	6 x 4 WYE SDR HUB x HUB x HUB
	$8.60 x 20 = $172.00
	$8.65 x 20 = $173.00
	$8.83 x 20 = $176.60
	

	17
	6 x 4 DOUBLE WYE SDR HUB x HUB x HUB x HUB
	$13.60 x 25 = $340.00
	$13.60 x 25 = $340.00
	$13.42 x 25 = $335.50
	

	18
	4” SANITARY TEE  DWV HUB x HUB x HUB
	$3.90 x 50 = $195.00
	$3.95 x 50 = $197.50
	$4.03 x 50 = $201.50
	

	19
	4” 221/2 BEND DWV HUB x HUB
	$2.70 x 20 = $54.00
	$2.75 x 20 = $55.00
	$2.78 x 20 = $55.60
	

	20
	4” 221/2 BEND DWV HUB x SPIGOT
	$3.80 x 10 = $38.00
	$3.90 x 10 = $39.00
	$3.97 x 10 = $39.70
	

	21
	4” 45 BEND DWV HUB x HUB
	$2.80 x 25 = $70.00
	$2.85 x 25 = $71.25
	$2.91 x 25 = $72.75
	

	22
	4” 45 BEND DWV HUB x SPIGOT
	$2.50 x 15 = $37.50
	$2.55 x 15 = $38.25
	$2.62 x 15 = $39.30
	


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX
	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX

	23
	4” 90 BEND DWV HUB
x HUB
	$3.60 x 50 = $180.00
	$3.55 x 50 = $177.50
	$3.64 x 50 = $182.00
	NO BID



	24
	4” 90 BEND DWV HUB
x SPIGOT
	$3.90 x 20 = $78.00
	$3.95 x 20 = $79.00
	$4.02 x 20 = $80.40
	

	25
	6” 221/2 BEND DWV HUB x HUB
	$15.80 x 10 = $158.00
	$15.85 x 10 = $158.50
	$16.18 x 10 = $161.80
	

	26
	6” 45 BEND DWV HUB
x HUB
	$11.90 x 20 = $238.00
	$11.95 x 20 = $239.00
	$12.23 x 20 = $244.60
	

	27
	6” 45 BEND DWV HUB
x SPIGOT
	$14.60 x 5 = $73.00
	$14.65 x 5 = $73.25
	$14.98 x 5 = $74.90
	

	28
	6” 90 BEND DWV HUB
x HUB
	$13.00 x 25 = $325.00
	$13.10 x 25 = $327.50
	$13.37 x 25 = $334.25
	

	29
	6” 90 BEND DWV HUB
x SPIGOT
	$18.20 x 5 = $91.00
	$18.25 x 5 = $91.25
	$18.62 x 5 = $93.10
	

	30
	4” COUPLING DWV HUB x HUB
	$1.70 x 100 = $170.00
	$1.60 x 100 = $160.00
	$1.65 x 100 = $165.00
	

	31
	6” COUPLING DWV HUB x HUB
	$5.20 x 20 = $104.00
	$5.25 x 20 = $105.00
	$5.36 x 20 = $107.20
	

	32
	4” FEMALE ADAPTER DWV HUB x FIPT
	$2.30 x 100 = $230.00
	$2.25 x 100 = $225.00
	$2.27 x 100 = $227.00
	

	33
	6” FEMALE ADAPTER DWV HUB x FIPT
	$7.40 x 25 = $185.00
	$7.45 x 25 = $186.25
	$7.60 x 25 = $190.00
	


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX
	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX

	34
	4” THREADED PLUG DWV
	$1.10 x 100 = $110.00
	$1.05 x 100 = $105.00
	$1.07 x 100 = $107.00
	NO BID



	35
	6” THREADED PLUG DWV
	$3.50 x 50 = $175.00
	$3.50 x 50 = $175.00
	$3.56 x 50 = $178.00
	

	36
	4” ADAPTER SDR SPIGOT x DWV HUB
	$4.10 x 100 = $410.00
	$4.10 x 100 = $410.00
	$4.20 x 100 = $420.00
	

	37
	6” ADAPTER SDR SPIGOT x DWV HUB
	$9.30 x 25 = $232.50
	$9.40 x 25 = $235.00
	$9.59 x 25 = $239.75
	

	38
	6 X 4 ADAPTER SDR SPIGOT x DWV HUB
	$7.00 x 20 = $140.00
	$7.10 x 20 = $142.00
	$7.24 x 20 = $142.00
	

	Total Section 1 –

Items 1 through 38


	$8,650.20
	$8,657.50


	$8,830.30
	NO BID


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX
	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX

	39
	6” ADAPTER MJ
x FLANGE
	$36.20 x 4 = $144.80
	$36.95 x 4 = $147.80
	$37.74 x 4 = $150.96
	NO BID



	40
	8” ADAPTER MJ
x FLANGE
	$54.15 x 2 = $108.30
	$55.25 x 2 = $110.50
	$56.45 x 2 = $112.90
	

	41
	6”  Mech. Joint Tee
Cast Iron
	$51.65 x 10 = $516.50
	$52.75 x 10 = $527.50
	$53.87 x 10 = $538.70
	

	42
	8"  Mech. Joint Tee
Cast Iron
	$77.60 x 7 = $543.20
	$79.26 x 7 = $554.82
	$80.97 x 7 = $566.79
	

	43
	8 x 6 Mech. Joint Tee Cast Iron
	$71.45 x 2 = $142.90
	$72.95 x 2 = $145.90
	$74.52 x 2 = $149.04
	

	44
	6"  Mech. Joint 90 Bend Cast Iron
	$37.45 x 15 = $561.75
	$38.20 x 15 = $573.00
	$39.03 x 15 = $585.45
	

	45
	8"  Mech. Joint 90 Bend Cast Iron
	$58.15 x 10 = $581.50
	$59.35 x 10 = $593.50
	$60.64 x 10 = $606.40
	

	46
	6"  Mech. Joint 45 Bend Cast Iron
	$32.45 x 5 = $162.25
	$33.15 x 5 = $165.75
	$33.87 x 5 = $169.35
	

	47
	8"  Mech. Joint 45 Bend Cast Iron
	$50.40 x 5 = $252.00
	$51.45 x 5 = $257.25
	$52.58 x 5 = $262.90
	

	48
	6” Mech. Joint 22 1/2 Bend Cast Iron
	$33.40 x 4 = $133.60
	$34.10 x 4 = $136.40
	$34.92 x 4 = $139.68
	

	49
	8” Mech. Joint 22 1/2 Bend Cast Iron
	$51.00 x 2 = $102.00
	$52.10 x 2 = $104.20
	$53.22 x 2 = $106.44
	NO BID




	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX
	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX

	50
	6” Mech. Joint 11 ¼ Bend Cast Iron
	$31.85 x 2 = $63.70
	$32.50 x 2 = $65.00
	$33.23 x 2 = $66.46
	

	51
	8” Mech. Joint 11 ¼ Bend Cast Iron
	$48.90 x 2 = $97.80
	$49.90 x 2 = $99.80
	$50.97 x 2 = $101.94
	

	52
	6x4 Mech. Joint Reducer Cast Iron
	$23.80 x 2 = $47.60
	$25.65 x 2 = $51.30
	$24.83 x 2 = $49.66
	

	53
	8x6 Mech. Joint Reducer Cast Iron
	$36.50 x 1 = $36.50
	$37.25 x 1 = $37.25
	$38.06 x 1 = $38.06
	

	54
	2" 200 WOG Mech. Joint NRS Gate Valve 2" Nut
	$181.00 x 10 = $1,810.00
	$154.55 x 10 = $1,545.50
	$166.20 x 10 = $1,662.00
	

	55
	3" 200 WOG Mech. Joint NRS Gate Valve 2" Nut
	$237.00 x 7 = $1,659.00
	$218.50 x 7 = $1,529.50
	$235.20 x 7 = $1,646.40
	

	56
	4" 200 WOG Mech. Joint NRS Gate Valve 2" Nut
	$295.00 x 5 = $1,475.00
	$244.90 x 5 = $1,224.50
	$263.40 x 5 = $1,317.00
	

	57
	6" 200 WOG Mech. Joint NRS Gate Valve 2" Nut
	$375.00 x 3 = $1,125.00
	$312.40 x 3 = $937.20
	$336.00 x 3 = $1,008.00
	

	58
	8" 200 WOG Mech. Joint NRS Gate Valve 2" Nut
	$586.00 x 2 = $1,172.00
	$497.65 x 2 = $995.30
	$535.20 x 2 = $1,070.40
	

	59
	2" 200 WOG Flanged NRS Gate Valve
w/hand wheel
	$156.00 x 10 = $1,560.00
	$153.45 x 10 = $1,534.50
	$164.40 x 10 = $1,644.00
	NO BID



	60
	3" 200 WOG Flanged NRS Gate Valve
w/hand wheel
	$220.00 x 7 = $1,540.00
	$217.00 x 7 = $1,519.00
	$233.40 x 7 = $1,633.80
	


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX
	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX

	61
	4" 200 WOG Flanged NRS Gate Valve
w/hand wheel
	$246.00 x 5 = $1,230.00
	$242.70 x 5 = $1,213.50
	$261.00 x 5 = $1,305.00
	

	62
	6" 200 WOG Flanged NRS Gate Valve
w/hand wheel
	$329.00 x 3 = $987.00
	$324.15 x 3 = $972.45
	$348.60 x 3 = $1,045.80
	

	63
	8" 200 WOG Flanged NRS Gate Valve
w/hand wheel
	$515.00 x 2 = $1,030.00
	$507.15 x 2 = $1,014.30
	$544.80 x 2 = $1,089.60
	

	64
	10" 200 WOG Flanged NRS Gate Valve
w/hand wheel
	$818.00 x 2 = $1,636.00
	$805.60 x 2 = $1,611.20
	$866.40 x 2 = $1,732.80
	

	65
	6" 200 WOG Flanged Swing Check
Weight & Lever
	$929.00 x 6 = $5,574.00
	$948.55 x 6 = $5,691.30
	$451.45 x 6 = $2,708.70
	

	66
	8" 200 WOG Flanged Swing Check
Weight & Lever
	$1,408.00 x 3 = $4,224.00
	$1,438.10 x 3 = $4,314.30
	$746.16 x 3 = $2,238.48
	

	67
	10” 200 WOG Flanged Swing Check
Weight & Lever
	$2,260.00 x 1 = $2,260.00
	$2,308.25 x 1 = $2,308.25
	$1,128.64 x 1 = $1,128.64
	


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX
	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX

	68
	2" 200 WOG FIPT  NRS Gate Valve
	$155.00 x 25 = $3,875.00
	$149.50 x 25 = $3,737.50
	$160.80 x 25 = $4,020.00
	

	69
	6” x 2” MJ Tap Cap
	$21.90 x 2 = $43.80
	$22.40 x 2 = $44.80
	$22.90 x 2 = $45.80
	NO BID



	70
	8” x 2” MJ Tap Cap
	$31.00 x 2 = $62.00
	$31.60 x 2 = $63.20
	$32.25 x 2 = $64.50
	

	71
	4” MJ Pipe Restraint Kit-C900
	$20.50 x 15 = $307.50
	$20.10 x 15 = $301.10
	$20.96 x 15 = $314.40
	

	72
	6” MJ Pipe Restraint Kit-C900
	$25.60 x 30 = $768.00
	$25.30 x 30 = $759.00
	$26.12 x 30 = $783.60
	

	73
	8” MJ Pipe Restraint Kit-C900
	$35.00 x 20 = $700.00
	$35.00 x 20 = $700.00
	$35.80 x 20 = $716.00
	

	74
	12” MJ Pipe Restraint Kit-C900
	$64.00 x 10 = $640.00
	$65.15 x 10 = $651.50
	$65.48 x 10 = $654.80
	

	Total Section 2 –
Items 39 through 74

	$37,172.70
	$36,237.87


	$31,474.45
	NO BID


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX
	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX

	75
	4” Coupling Clay –
CI / Plastic
	$2.70 x 300 = $810.00
	$3.10 x 300 = $930.00
	$2.76 x 300 = $828.00
	NO BID



	76
	6" Coupling Clay –

CI / Plastic
	$5.50 x 30 = $165.00
	$6.60 x 30 = $198.00
	$5.90 x 30 = $177.00
	

	77
	8" Coupling Clay –

CI / Plastic
	$8.50 x 25 = $212.50
	$10.50 x 25 = $262.50
	$9.07 x 25 = $226.75
	

	78
	10" Coupling Clay –

CI / Plastic
	$11.60 x 20 = $232.00
	$14.25 x 20 = $285.00
	$12.60 x 20 = $252.00
	

	79
	12" Coupling Clay –

CI / Plastic
	$13.60 x 20 = $272.00
	$16.60 x 20 = $332.00
	$14.71 x 20 = $294.20
	

	80
	4" Coupling CI / Plastic
	$2.70 x 100 = $270.00
	$3.10 x 100 = $310.00
	$2.76 x 100 = $276.00
	

	81
	6" Coupling CI / Plastic
	$5.50 x 10 = $55.00
	$6.60 x 10 = $66.00
	$5.90 x 10 = $59.00
	

	82
	8" Coupling CI / Plastic
	$8.50 x 10 = $85.00
	$10.50 x 10 = $105.00
	$9.07 x 10 = $90.70
	

	83
	10" Coupling CI / Plastic  Fernco -  1056-1010
	$11.60 x 20 = $232.00
	$16.60 x 20 = $332.00
	$12.60 x 20 = $252.00
	

	84
	4" Donut
	$5.45 x 100 = $545.00
	$5.95 x 100 = $595.00
	$5.64 x 100 = $564.00
	

	85
	6" Donut
	$9.00 x 100 = $900.00
	$9.50 x 100 = $950.00
	$9.41 x 100 = $941.00
	


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
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Beaumont, TX
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	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX

	86
	4" Tee Saddle
	$21.00 x 50 = $1,050.00
	$16.95 x 50 = $847.50
	$24.17 x 50 = $1,208.50
	

	87
	6" Tee Saddle
	$27.90 x 25 = $697.50
	$23.50 x 25 = $587.50
	$31.94 x 25 = $798.50
	

	Total Section 3 –
Items 75 through 87

	$5,526.00
	$5,800.50


	$5,967.65
	NO BID


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX
	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX

	88
	5/8" x 3/4" FNPT straight yoke ball valve
	$16.05 x 100 = $1,605.00
	$18.70 x 100 = $1,870.00
	Disqualified – did not bid on every item 

In section
	NO BID



	89
	5/8" x 3/4" CTS straight yoke ball valve
	$19.60 x 200 = $3,920.00
	$22.95 x 200 = $4,590.00
	
	

	90
	1” CTS straight
ball valve
	$34.70 x 100 = $3,470.00
	$35.60 x 100 = $3,560.00
	
	

	91
	1” PJ/CTS X ¾” straight yoke ball valve
	$32.90 x 300 = $9,870.00
	$33.75 x 300 = $10,125.00
	
	

	92
	¾” PJ/CTS X ¾” straight yoke ball valve
	$30.45 x 100 = $3,045.00
	$31.20 x 100 = $3,120.00
	NO BID


	


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX
	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX

	93
	1" Curb stop CTS
x FNPT
	$31.70 x 200 = $6,340.00
	$32.50 x 200 = $6,500.00
	Disqualified – did not bid on every item 

In section
	NO BID



	94
	1 ½” PJ/CTS x Meter Flange Ball Meter Valve
	$74.20 x 5 = $371.00
	$81.45 x 5 = $407.25
	
	

	95
	2” PJ/CTS x Meter Flange Ball Meter Valve
	$125.70 x 5 = $628.50
	$138.25 x 5 = $691.25
	
	

	96
	5/8”x 3/4" Yoke Bar
	$6.96 x 200 = $1,392.00
	$9.40 x 200 = $1,880.00
	
	

	97
	1” Yoke Bar
	$12.55 x 50 = $627.50
	$16.40 x 50 = $820.00
	
	

	98
	2” Pack Joint Coupling CTS
	$38.40 x 25 = $960.00
	$43.60 x 25 = $1,090.00
	
	

	99
	3/4" Corporation stop
CC thrd x CTS
	$14.90 x 100 = $1,490.00
	$17.20 x 100 = $1,720.00
	
	

	100
	1" Corporation stop
CC thrd x CTS
	$22.55 x 100 = $2,255.00
	$26.05 x 100 = $2,605.00
	
	

	101
	1 ½” Corporation stop CC thrd x CTS
	$58.05 x 25 = $1,451.25
	$67.05 x 25 = $1,676.25
	
	

	102
	3/4" FNPT straight yoke outlet
	$3.80 x 100 = $380.00
	$4.50 x 100 = $450.00
	Disqualified – did not bid on every item 

In section
	NO BID



	103
	1" FNPT straight yoke outlet
	$6.30 x 50 = $315.00
	$7.35 x 50 = $367.50
	
	


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX


	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX


	104
	3/4" Insert
	$1.05 x 800 = $840.00
	$.80 x 800 = $640.00
	
	

	105
	1" Insert
	$1.10 x 800 = $880.00
	$.85 x 800 = $680.00
	
	

	106
	1 1/2" Insert
	$1.50 x 200 = $300.00
	$1.15 x 200 = $230.00
	
	

	107
	2" Insert
	$1.50 x 10 = $15.00
	$1.15 x 10 = $11.50
	
	

	108
	3/4" Pack Joint
Coupling CTS
	$8.15 x 300 = $2,445.00
	$8.25 x 300 = $2,475.00
	
	

	109
	3/4" x 1" Pack Joint Coupling CTS
	$9.45 x 300 = $2,835.00
	$10.70 x 300 = $3,210.00
	
	

	110
	1" Pack Joint
Coupling CTS
	$9.30 x 300 = $2,790.00
	$10.60 x 300 = $3,180.00
	
	

	111
	1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling CTS
	$28.45 x 50 = $1,422.50
	$32.30 x 50 = $1,615.00
	Disqualified – did not bid on every item 

In section
	NO BID



	112
	3/4" Pack Joint
Coupling MNPT
	$6.70 x 50 = $335.00
	$7.60 x 50 = $380.00
	
	

	113
	1" Pack Joint
Coupling MNPT
	$7.90 x 50 = $395.00
	$8.95 x 50 = $447.50
	
	

	114
	1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling MNPT
	$19.80 x 20 = $396.00
	$22.50 x 20 = $450.00
	
	


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply
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	115
	3/4" Expansion connection Standard
	$9.25 x 800 = $7,400.00
	$10.60 x 800 = $8,480.00
	
	

	116
	1" Expansion
connection Standard
	$15.50 x 100 = $1,550.00
	$16.10 x 100 = $1,610.00
	
	

	117
	3/4" Straight Check valve for Yoke
	$13.20 x 100 = $1,320.00
	$20.15 x 100 = $2,015.00
	
	

	118
	1" Straight Check
valve for Yoke
	$16.00 x 50 = $800.00
	$24.85 x 50 = $1,242.50
	
	

	119
	3/4" Rubber yoke
end gasket
	$.23 x 100 = $23.00
	$.25 x 100 = $25.00
	
	

	120
	1" Rubber yoke
end gasket
	$.25 x 50 = $12.50
	$.30 x 50 = $15.00
	
	

	121
	3/4" Lock nuts
	$1.00 x 100 = $100.00
	$.95 x 100 = $95.00
	Disqualified – did not bid on every item 

In section
	NO BID
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	HD Supply
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	122
	1" Lock nuts
	$1.55 x 50 = $77.50
	$1.60 x 50 = $80.00
	
	

	123
	¾” Polyethylene Tubing - 200 PSI
	$.16 x 2,000 = $320.00
	$.20 x 2,000 = $400.00
	
	

	124
	1” Polyethylene Tubing - 200 PSI
	$.24 x 2,000 = $480.00
	$.32 x 2,000 = $640.00
	
	

	125
	1 ½” Polyethylene Tubing - 200 PSI
	$.52 x 300 = $156.00
	$.65 x 300 = $195.00
	
	

	Total Section 4 –
Items 88 through 125

	$63,012.75
	$69,588.75


	Disqualified – did not bid on every item 

In section


	NO BID
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	HD Supply
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	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX


	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX


	126
	2" PL X PL Dresser Coupling
	$22.90 x 50 = $1,145.00
	$31.40 x 50 = $1,570.00
	$55.08 x 50 = $2,754.00
	Disqualified – did not bid on every item 

In section

	127
	6"  Dresser Coupling


	$122.00 x 10 = $1,220.00
	$85.65 x 10 = $856.50
	$123.02 x 10 = $1,230.20
	

	128
	8"  Dresser Coupling


	$138.00 x 10 = $1,380.00
	$99.90 x 10 = $999.00
	$139.31 x 10 = $1,393.10
	


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX


	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX


	129
	10"  Dresser Coupling
	$197.00 x 5 = $985.00
	$125.60 x 5 = $628.00
	$198.65 x 5 = $993.25
	Disqualified – did not bid on every item 

In section

	130
	12"  Dresser Coupling


	$258.00 x 5 = $1,290.00
	$148.55 x 5 = $742.75
	$265.32 x 5 = $1,326.60
	

	131
	Fire Hydrant 4’ Bury MJ w/ accessories
	$1,091.00 x 9 = $9,819.00
	$1,099.50 x 9 = $9,895.50
	$943.29 x 9 = $8,489.61
	

	132
	Fire Hydrant 6’ Bury MJ w/ accessories
	$1,192.00 x 2 = $2,384.00
	$1,195.50 x 2 = $2,391.00
	$1,120.32 x 2 = $2,240.64
	

	133
	Valve Box w/ lid


	$16.90 x 100 = $1,690.00
	$17.00 x 100 = $1,700.00
	$17.02 x 100 = $1,702.00
	

	Total Section 5 –
Items 126 through 133

REVISED
	$19,913.00
	$18,782.75


	$20,129.40
	-----


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX


	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX


	134
	2" Repair clamp
	$25.00 x 200 = $5,000.00
	$26.90 x 200 = $5,380.00
	$20.73 x 200 = $4,146.00
	NO BID



	135
	2" Repair clamp
	$35.50 x 30 = $1,065.00
	$47.80 x 30 = $1,434.00
	$34.79 x 30 = $1,043.70
	

	136
	6” Repair clamp
	$46.60 x 60 = $2,796.00
	$68.70 x 60 = $4,122.00
	$51.27 x 60 = $3,076.20
	


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX

	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX


	137
	6" Repair clamp
	$51.30 x 22 = $1,128.60
	$71.75 x 22 = $1,578.50
	$51.27 x 22 = $1,127.94
	NO BID



	138
	6" Repair clamp
	$55.00 x 10 = $550.00
	$79.75 x 10 = $797.50
	$61.04 x 10 = $610.40
	

	139
	6" Repair clamp
	$63.60 x 5 = $318.00
	$82.85 x 5 = $414.25
	$61.04 x 5 = $305.20
	

	140
	8" Repair clamp
	$51.10 x 20 = $1,022.00
	$79.75 x 20 = $1,595.00
	$60.26 x 20 = $1,205.20
	

	141
	8" Repair clamp
	$49.30 x 20 = $986.00
	$82.20 x 20 = $1,644.00
	$60.26 x 20 = $1,205.20
	

	142
	8" Repair clamp
	$50.50 x 20 = $1,010.00
	$84.00 x 20 = $1,680.00
	$60.26 x 20 = $1,205.20
	

	143
	10" Repair clamp
	$78.20 x 10 = $782.00
	$121.65 x 10 = $1,216.50
	$95.80 x 10 = $958.00
	

	144
	12" Repair clamp
	$115.00 x 10 = $1,150.00
	$186.20 x 10 = $1,862.00
	$145.80 x 10 = $1,458.00
	

	145
	12" Repair clamp FORD F1- 1440- 20
	$124.50 x 10 = $1,245.00
	$194.15 x 10 = $1,941.50
	$145.80 x 10 = $1,458.00
	

	Total Section 6 –

Items 134 through 145

	$17,052.60
	$23,665.25


	$17,799.04
	NO BID


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX


	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX


	146
	2" x .75" Tap Saddle - Appoxy coated S/S band
	$14.30 x 10 = $143.00
	$18.70 x 10 = $187.00
	$14.46 x 10 = $144.60
	NO BID



	147
	2" X 1" Tap Saddle - Appoxy coated S/S band
	$14.30 x 5 = $71.50
	$18.70 x 5 = $93.50
	$14.46 x 5 = $72.30
	

	148
	6" X .75"Tap Saddle - Appoxy coated S/S band
	$18.20 x 50 = $910.00
	$22.00 x 50 = $1,100.00
	$18.47 x 50 = $923.50
	

	149
	6" X 1" Tap Saddle - Appoxy coated S/S band
	$18.20 x 20 = $364.00
	$22.00 x 20 = $440.00
	$18.47 x 20 = $369.40
	

	150
	8" X .75"Tap Saddle - Appoxy coated S/S band
	$21.60 x 50 = $1,080.00
	$26.10 x 50 = $1,305.00
	$21.92 x 50 = $1,096.00
	

	151
	8" X 1" Tap Saddle - Appoxy coated S/S band
	$21.60 x 20 = $432.00
	$26.10 x 20 = $522.00
	$21.92 x 20 = $438.40
	

	152
	8" X 2" Tap Saddle - Appoxy coated S/S band
	$25.70 x 10 = $257.00
	$51.20 x 10 = $512.00
	$26.04 x 10 = $260.40
	

	153
	10" X .75Tap Saddle - Appoxy coated S/S band
	$23.60 x 15 = $354.00
	$28.50 x 15 = $427.50
	$23.94 x 15 = $359.10
	

	154
	10" X 1" Tap Saddle - Appoxy coated S/S band
	$23.60 x 10 = $236.00
	$28.50 x 10 = $285.00
	$23.94 x 10 = $239.40
	

	155
	10" X 2" Tap Saddle - Appoxy coated S/S band
	$28.90 x 5 = $144.50
	$59.80 x 5 = $299.00
	$29.25 x 5 = $146.25
	

	156
	6” X 1 ½” Tap Saddle Appoxy coated S/S band
	$21.40 X 5 = $107.00
	$25.75 X 5 = $128.75
	$21.63 X 5 = $108.15
	NO BID


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX


	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX


	157
	8” X 1 ½” Tap Saddle Appoxy coated S/S band
	$25.70 X 5 = $128.50
	$31.00 X 5 = $155.00
	$26.04 X 5 = $130.20
	

	158
	12" X 1" Tap Saddle - Appoxy coated S/S band
	$27.40 X 7 = $191.80
	$33.00 X 7 = $231.00
	$27.70 X 7 = $193.90
	

	159
	12" X 2" Tap Saddle – Appoxy coated S/S band
	$33.60 X 5 = $168.00
	$68.75 X 5 = $343.75
	$34.01 X 5 = $170.05
	

	Total Section 7 –

Items 146 through 159

	$4,587.30
	$6,029.50


	$4,651.65
	NO BID


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX

	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX


	160
	23 1/2" Manhole Ring & Cover w/ City Logo
	$149.00 x 40 = $5,960.00
	$148.95 x 40 = $5,958.00
	$157.22 x 40 = $6,288.80
	Disqualified – did not bid on every item 

In section

	161
	23 1/2" Manhole Cover w/ City Logo
	$77.00 x 50 = $3,850.00
	$79.95 x 50 = $3,997.50
	$82.22 x 50 = $4,111.00
	

	162
	32" Manhole Ring & Cover w/ City Logo
	$226.00 x 10 = $2,260.00
	$225.95 x 10 = $2,259.50
	$237.77 x 10 = $2,377.77
	

	163
	32" Manhole Cover w/ City Logo
	$137.00 x 15 = $2,055.00
	$138.95 x 15 = $2,084.25
	$145.55 x 15 = $2,183.25
	


	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX

	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX


	164
	2" Cast Iron Adjusting Ring for 23 1/2"
	$28.40 x 50 = $1,420.00
	$28.50 x 50 = $1,425.00
	$28.72 x 50 = $1,436.00
	Disqualified – did not bid on every item 

In section

	165
	4" Cast Iron Adjusting Ring for 23 1/2"
	$44.20 x 20 = $884.00
	$44.20 x 20 = $884.00
	$44.68 x 20 = $893.60
	

	166
	2" Cast Iron Adjusting Ring for 32"
	$40.00 x 10 = $400.00
	$40.00 x 10 = $400.00
	$40.42 x 10 = $404.20
	

	167
	4" Cast Iron Adjusting Ring for 32"
	$77.90 x 5 = $389.50
	$75.00 x 5 = $375.00
	$78.72 x 5 = $393.60
	

	168
	Standard wall X 6' lg Manhole Manway - Fiberglass
	$625.00 x 3 = $1,875.00
	$494.75 x 3 = $1,484.25
	$663.11 x 3 = $1,989.33
	

	169
	Standard wall X 8' lg Manhole Manway - Fiberglass
	$749.00 x 3 = $2,247.00
	$592.90 x 3 = $1,778.70
	$794.66 x 3 = $2,383.98
	

	170
	Extra Heavy wall X 10' lg Manhole Manway - Fiberglass
	$1,120.00 x 2 = $2,240.00
	$905.20 x 2 = $1,810.40
	$1,213.33 x 2 = $2,426.66
	

	171
	Extra Heavy wall X 12' lg Manhole Manway - Fiberglass
	$1,291.00 x 2 = 

$2,582.00
	$1,043.15 x 2 = $2,086.30
	$1,367.83 x 2 = $2,735.66
	

	Total Section 8 –

Items 160 through 171

REVISED
	$26,162.50
	$24,542.90


	$27,623.78
	-----




	Item No.
	Description
	HD Supply

Houston, TX
	Golden Triangle Pipe

Beaumont, TX
	MDN Enterprise

New Caney, TX


	East Jordan Iron Works

Houston, TX


	172
	Single Cast Iron Meter box Complete w/ EXIT
	$24.20 x 100 = $2,420.00
	$22.00 x 100 = $2,200.00
	$24.46 x 100 = $2,446.00
	NO BID



	173
	Dual Concrete Meter Box Complete w/ EXIT - 2-5/8" x 3/4" meters
	$33.40 x 100 = $3,340.00
	$33.40 x 100 = $3,340.00
	$33.07 x 100 = $3,307.00
	

	174
	Concrete Meter Box Complete w/ Steel Cover 2"meter
	$71.10 x 20 = $1,422.00
	$71.70 x 20 = $1,434.00
	$70.94 x 20 = $1,418.80
	

	175
	Concrete Cover w/ Cast Iron Reader Lid to fit Single Concrete Box
	$19.40 x 100 = $1,940.00
	$19.50 x 100 = $1,950.00
	$19.27 x 100 = $1,927.00
	

	176
	Concrete Cover w/ Reader Lid to fit Dual Concrete Box
	$19.40 x 200 = $3,880.00
	$19.50 x 200 = $3,900.00
	$19.27 x 200 = $3,854.00
	

	Total Section 9 –

Items 172 through 176

REVISED
	$13,002.00
	$12,824.00


	$12,952.80
	NO BID


Revised Bid Tabulation 11/07 

