CITY OF TEXAS CITY

REGULAR CALLED CITY COMMISSION MEETING

· *  M I N U T E S  *  *

	WEDNESDAY, DECEMBER 5, 2007 - 5:00 P.M.

	KENNETH T. NUNN COUNCIL ROOM - CITY HALL


A Regular Called Meeting of the City Commission was held on Wednesday, December 5, 2007, at 5:00 P.M. in the Kenneth T. Nunn Council Room in City Hall, Texas City, Texas, with the following in attendance:  Mayor Matthew T. Doyle; Commissioners: Tommy Clark, Dedrick Johnson, Mike Land, Donald Singleton and Carl Sullivan.  Commissioner Dee Ann Haney,was not able to attend.
The Mayor called upon Reverend Kevin Herrin, The Fellowship Church, to offer the Invocation. The Mayor thanked Reverend Herrin for his attendance and offering the invocation.  Commissioner Land led all present in the recitation of the Pledge of Allegiance.

It was noted that today the City held its Youth In Government Day 2007.  Each participant is elected to various City positions by the students of Texas City High School during the observance of Youth in Government Week sponsored by the Texas City Rotary Club.
The YOUTH IN GOVERNMENT participants consisted of the following:

	STUDENT
	POSITION
	STUDENT
	POSITION

	JOSHUA DAVIS
	MAYOR
	     ERIN DOYLE
	MAYOR PRO TEM

	ERIN MARQUEZ
	COMMISSIONER AT LARGE
	     STEPHANIE RAMIREZ
	COMMISSIONER DISTRICT ONE

	DANI HAYGOOD
	COMMISSIONER DISTRICT TWO
	    LAUREN MASSEY
	COMMISSIONER DISTRICT THREE

	CASEY OLIVER
	COMMISSIONER DISTRICT FOUR
	     COURTNI ALCOCER
	CHIEF OF POLICE

	CAMERON PRATTNI
	FIRE CHIEF
	  STEVEN EVANS
	DIRECTOR OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES

	LAUREN GINDRATT
	DIRETOR OF FINANCE
	     STEPHANIE HUSBAND
	DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC WORKS

	NADIA LERMA
	CITY ENGINEER AND TRANSPORATION DIRECTOR
	     DANA LEWIS
	CITY ATTORNEY

	KAYLA STELLY

	CITY SECRETARY
	     MEREDITH HAMILTON
	MUNICIPAL COURT JUDGE

	AUTUMN WOOTEN
	MUNICIPAL COURT CLERK
	   ALEXIS JAURIGUE
	HUMAN RESOURCES DIRECTOR

	JOHN SHAW
	DIRECTOR OF PLANNING
	    TORI MASSEY
	PURCHASING COORDINATOR

	BROOKE SANDERS
	TAX ASSESSOR
	     RYAN GARZA
	BAYOU GOLF COURSE DIRECTOR

	JENNA GARZA
	COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT & HOUSING AUTHORITY
	     SHELBY STROTHER
	EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT COORDINATOR

	DENESSA JOHNSON
	BUILDING INSPECTOR
	     TORRELL JOHNSONS
	LIBRARY DIRECTOR

	AMY MEJIA
	DIRECTOR OF RECREATION & TOURISM
	
	


The Mayor made the following presentations:

SERVICE YEAR AWARD PINS were presented to the following:


KAYLUB MULL

RECREATION & TOURISN DEPT.

  5 YEARS

SHEILA BOWDEN

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DEPT.

  5 YEARS


DARRELL MATHESON
POLICE DEPT.



 25 YEARS

OSCAR DIMAS

GOLF COURSE.



 25 YEARS

The Mayor declared a quorum present and called the meeting to order at 5:00 p.m. 
	1. PUBLIC HEARING

a. Public Hearing to consider Sterling Chemicals request to rezone from "C" (Multi-family

Residential), "D" (Neighborhood Service), "E" (General Business) and "F-1" (Outdoor Industrial) to "H" (Heavy Industry) and IBD (Industrial Business District) to administratively correct the existing land use designation; being all of Blocks 40,41,64,65,66,67,79, 80,81,82,83 and 84 of Texas City 1st Addition and a portion of Blocks 12, 13, 36, 37, 38 and 39 of Texas City 1st Addition save and except Lots 4, 5, Block 67, Texas City 1st Division; location is bound by 6th Street, Bay Street, 2nd Avenue South and 4th Avenue South, Texas City, Texas.  (Inspections Dept.)

Mayor Doyle pointed out that this was not Sterling’s request; the City brought this to Sterling after we discovered it; this is a correction on the City’s behalf.

Don Carroll, City Planner, reported that this request came before the Zoning Commission on November 7, 2007.  Seven property owners were notified of the intent to rezone.  There was no opposition to the proposed rezoning.  Staff made a revised recommendation and recommended a portion be zoned IBD (Industrial Business District) in place of “H” (Heavy Industry).  This revision is a result of additional data analysis.  Specifically, the rationale for the revised recommendation is the City wanting to ensure that there is no encroachment of heavy industry past 3rd Avenue South and 4th Street South.  This recommendation is consistent with the vision and current provisions established with the Land Use Plan designation of the Industrial Transition Zone and the Industrial Business District Zoning District designation.  The area set aside for IBD offers a higher land use and better transition between the residue heavy industrial land uses to the south and east.  After consideration of the recommendation and all pertinent information, the Zoning Commission recommended approval of the rezoning request as amended by Staff’s recommendation.

Commissioner Land made a motion to CLOSE the PUBLIC HEARING; the motion was seconded by Commissioner Johnson.  All present voted AYE.  MOTION CARRIED.

2. PRELIMINARY ZONING APPROVAL

a. Consider Preliminary approval of rezoning property to "H" (Heavy Industry) and "IBD" (Industrial Business District); being all of Blocks 40, 41, 64, 65, 66, 67, 79, 80, 81, 82, 83 and 84 of the Texas City1st and a portion of Blocks 12, 13, 36, 37, 38 and 39, of Texas City 1st Addition, save and except Lots 4 & 5, Blk. 67, Texas City 1st Addition. (Planning)



	Commissioner Sullivan made a MOTION of to APPROVE preliminary rezoning to "H" (Heavy Industry) and "IBD" (Industrial Business District); being all of Blocks 40, 41,64,65, 66, 67, 79, 80, 81, 82, 83 and 84 of the Texas City1st and a portion of Blocks 12,13, 36, 37, 38 and 39, of Texas City 1st Addition, save and except Lots 4 & 5, Blk. 67, Texas City 1st Addition; Commissioner Johnson SECONDED the motion.  All present voted AYE.  MOTION CARRIED.



	3.  
	
	
	
	 
	CONSENT AGENDA
	 

	Commissioner Land requested that item h., Consider approval of Resolution No. 07-153 for the purchase of 500 Holiday Chamber Bucks from the Texas City/LaMarque Chamber of Commence in the amount of $50.00 to be given to all City employees as an incentive for continued outstanding customer service and performance, be pulled for further discussion.  Commissioner Sullivan requested that items e. Consider Resolution No. 07-150 approving and awarding Bid No. 2008-171 for the purchase and delivery of five (5) 2008 Model 3/4 Ton Pick Up Trucks & one (1) 2008 Model Explorer and f. Consider approval of Resolution No. 07-151 for the payment to BP Amoco for the final installment of the tax refund due, be pulled for further discussion.
a. Consider approval of minutes from the November 21, 2007 Regular Called City Commission Meeting.

b. Consider approval of Resolution No. 07-147 awarding Bid No. 2008-891 and authorizing the Mayor to enter into an agreement with Century Asphalt for the Picked Up Hot and Cold Mix Asphalt Contract. (Purchasing Dept.)

RESOLUTION NO. 07-147

A RESOLUTION AWARDING A BID AND AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ENTER INTO AN AGREEMENT WITH CENTURY ASPHALT FOR THE PICKED UP HOT & COLD MIX ASPHALT CONTRACT; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS RESOLUTION SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS PASSAGE AND ADOPTION.

c. Consider Resolution No. 07-148 approving and accepting the 2007-2008 Texas Traffic Safety Program Grant Agreement for the S.T.E.P.-I.D.M. (Selective Traffic Enforcement Program-Impaired Driving Mobilization) for the Police Department to conduct DWI enforcement waves; authorizing the Mayor to execute said agreement. (Police Dept.)

RESOLUTION NO. 07-148

A RESOLUTION APPROVING AND ACCEPTING THE 2007-2008 TEXAS TRAFFIC SAFETY PROGRAM GRANT AGREEMENT FOR THE S.T.E.P.-I.D.M. (SELECTIVE TRAFFIC ENFORCEMENT PROGRAM-IMPAIRED DRIVING MOBILIZATION FOR THE POLICE DEPARTMENT TO CONDUCT DWI ENFORCEMENT WAVES; PROVIDING THAT THIS RESOLUTION SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS PASSAGE AND ADOPTION.

d. Consider approval of Resolution No. 07-149 approving Amendment to the Engineering Contract to Claunch & Miller, Inc. for the Engineering and Construction Phase Service on the 16th Avenue Paving and Drainage Improvement Project for the limits of 15th Street by adding 970 linear feet from 13th Avenue to 16th Avenue. (Transportation & Planning)

RESOLUTION NO. 07-149

A RESOLUTION APPROVING AMENDMENT TO THE ENGINEERING CONTRACT TO CLAUNCH & MILLER, INC. FOR THE ENGINEERING AND CONSTRUCTION PHASE SERVICE ON THE 16TH AVENUE PAVING AND DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENT PROJECT BY ADDING APPROXIMATELY 970 LINEAR FEET FROM 13TH AVENUE TO 16TH AVENUE; PROVIDING THAT THIS RESOLUTION SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS PASSAGE AND ADOPTION.

g. Consider Resolution No. 07-152 approving the purchase and delivery of one (1) Komatsu Model WB146-5/A Backhoe/Loader through the Texas Association of School Boards (TASB), a Texas Local Government Purchasing Cooperative, for Utilities. (Purchasing Dept.)

RESOLUTION NO. 07-152

A RESOLUTION APPROVING THE PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF ONE (1) KOMATSU MODEL WB146-5/A BACKHOE/LOADER THROUGH THE TEXAS ASSOCIATION OF SCHOOL BOARDS (TASB), A TEXAS LOCAL GOVERNMENT PURCHASING COOPERATIVE, FOR UTILITIES; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS RESOLUTION SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS PASSAGE AND ADOPTION. 

Commissioner Clark made a MOTION to APPROVE items a., b., c., d. and g of the CONSENT AGENDA;  the motion was SECONDED by Commissioner Singleton.  All present voted AYE.  MOTION CARRIED.

e. Consider Resolution No. 07-150 approving and awarding Bid No. 2008-171 for the purchase and delivery of five (5) 2008 Model 3/4 Ton Pick Up Trucks & one (1) 2008 Model Explorer. (Purchasing Dept.)

Commissioner Sullivan reiterated that more consideration should be given to the local vendors.  A few years ago the legislature passed a 3% difference.  The Commissioner said that he looked at this and thought that the City could go back and give this to Gene Hamon on the basis of the ninety days – but there is one, the third bidder down, has offered it from 60 to 75 days and so that knocks that out.  The Commissioner continued stating that somewhere down the line the City is going to need to look at that and see if there is not something that the City can do to try to help the local dealerships, like Gene Hamon, who has been active in this community and pays a lot of taxes.  Mayor Doyle remarked that he agreed but as you can see the 3% doesn’t work in this case.
BID TABULATION

(5) 2008 MODEL ¾ TON PICK UP TRUCKS

& (1) EXPLORER

BID #2008-171

Bid Opening: Friday, November 16, 2007 @ 2:00 p.m.

VENDOR

SPEC “A” TRUCK

BID

SPEC “B” TRUCK

BID

SPEC “C” TRUCK

BID

TOTAL EXPLORER BID

TOTAL BID / 

DELIVERY

Grand Prairie Ford

Garland, Texas

2008 Ford F250

$16,859.00

2008 Ford F250
$ 15,167.00 x 3

 = $45,501.00

2008 F250

$15,900.00

2008 Explorer

$18,232.00

$96,492.00

14-16 wks (trucks)

7-9 wks (explorer)

Helfman Ford

Stafford, Texas

2008 Ford F250

$17,155.00

2008 Ford F250

$ 15,490.00 x 3

 = $46,470.00

2008 F250

$16,200.00

2008 Explorer

$18,650.00

$98,475.00

14-16 wks (trucks)

12-wks (explorer)

Tommie Vaughn Motors, Inc.

Houston, Texas

2008 Ford F250

$17,002.00

2008 Ford F250 $15,742.00 x 3

= $47,226.00

2008 F250 (F20)

$16,295.00

2008 Explorer 

$18,681.00

$99,204.00

60-75 days (trucks45-60 days (explorer

Planet Ford 6

Caldwell, Texas

2008 Ford F250
$17,188.00

2008 Ford f250

$15,571.00 x 3

= $46,713.00

2008 Ford F250

$16,294.00

2008 Explorer

$19,346.00

$99,541.00

120 days (trucks)

90-120 (explorer)

Philpott Motors

Nederland, Texas

2008 Ford F250
$16,998.00

2008 Ford F250
$16,523.00 x 3

= $49,569.00

2008 Ford F250
$16,622.00

2008 Explorer
$18,651.00

$101,840.00

90-120 days (trucks)60-90 days (explorer)

Gene Hamon Ford

Texas City, Texas

2008 Ford F250
$18,280.00

2008 Ford F250
$16,831.00 x 3

= $50,493.00

2008 Ford F250
$17,366.00

2008 Explorer
$19,319.00

$105,458.00

90 days (trucks)

90 days (explorer)

Mc Ree Ford, Inc.

Dickinson, Texas

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

RESOLUTION NO. 07-150

A RESOLUTION AWARDING A BID AND AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ENTER INTO A CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF FIVE (5) 2008 MODEL ¾ TON PICK UP TRUCKS AND ONE (1) 2008 MODEL EXPLORER FOR THE PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT AND RECREATION & TOURISM, RESPECTIVELY; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS RESOLUTION SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS PASSAGE AND ADOPTION. 

Commissioner Sullivan made a MOTION to APPROVE Resolution No. 07-150 approving and awarding Bid No. 2008-171 for the purchase and delivery of five (5) 2008 Model 3/4 Ton Pick Up Trucks & one (1) 2008 Model Explorer.
f. Consider approval of Resolution No. 07-151 for the payment to BP Amoco for the final installment of the tax refund due. (Finance Dept.)

Commissioner Sullivan inquired, when does the tax abatement come off on this; Cheryl Hunter, Financial Director, responded that BP’s tax abatement will go off next year.  The Commissioner noted the rollback election and remarked the citizens of Texas City are not aware of these costs that the City is still paying off.

RESOLUTION NO. 07-151

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE FINAL INSTALLMENT PAYMENT OF $511,380.03, TO BP AMOCO FOR THEIR OVERPAYMENT OF TAXES FOR FISCAL YEAR 2001-2002; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS RESOLUTION SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS PASSAGE AND ADOPTION.

Commissioner Sullivan made a MOTION to APPROVE Resolution No. 07-151 payment to BP Amoco for the final installment of the tax refund due; Commissioner Clark SECONDED the motion.  All present voted AYE.  MOTION CARRIED.
h. Consider approval of Resolution No. 07-153 for the purchase of 500 Holiday Chamber Bucks from the Texas City/LaMarque Chamber of Commence in the amount of $50.00 to be given to all City employees as an incentive for continued outstanding customer service and performance.

Commissioner Land thanked the Mayor for raising the amount to $50.00; he remarked that it has been $20.00 for 40 years. 

RESOLUTION NO. 07-153

A RESOLUTION APPROVING THE PURCHASE OF 500 HOLIDAY CHAMBER BUCKS FROM THE TEXAS CITY/LAMARQUE CHAMBER OF COMMERCE IN THE AMOUNT OF $50.00 TO BE GIVEN TO ALL CITY EMPLOYEES AS AN INCENTIVE FOR CONTINUED OUTSTANDING CUSTOMER SERVICE AND PERFORMANCE; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS RESOLUTION SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS PASSAGE AND ADOPTION. 

Commissioner Land made a MOTION to APPROVE Resolution No. 07-153 for the purchase of 500 Holiday Chamber Bucks from the Texas City/LaMarque Chamber of Commence in the amount of $50.00 to be given to all City employees as an incentive for continued outstanding customer service and performance;  Commissioner Johnson SECONDED the motion.  All present voted AYE.  MOTION CARRIED.
4. REGULAR ITEMS

Jay Williams, Recreation and Tourism Director, reported that the City Christmas Parade will be held on December 6th.  The Mayor added that the opening of the Lowry Center will be on December 14th.  The Mayor also announced that the Parade Marshall will be Commissioner Sullivan and his family; the Commissioner has 22 years of service to the community.
a. Consider approval of Ordinance No. 07-46 amending Chapter 82, Parks and Recreation, Article I, "In General", of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Texas City, Texas , by adding a new Section 82-8, Prohibiting Camping in a City Park, Recreation Area, or City Facility for more than three consecutive days. (Police Dept.)

Chief Burby reported that this ordinance is to give us the opportunity to enforce the spirit of the law as well as the letter of the law.  This is to make sure that the City does not have people homesteading here in the city parks.  With the discretion that police officers have, this change will allow us to make those decisions as we see fit.  The Mayor commented that long weekends would be exempt.    Commissioner Sullivan asked, what kind of adverse affect will this have on the dike – if they park out there with a camping trailer or motor home is this going to affect them in the same three day period.  The Chief responded no it is not; again, this is going to back to the discretionary authority that we have.  What this is designed to do is to eliminate people coming in here and homesteading here in undesirable methods.  The Mayor added that it is real clear - it is living in abandoned vehicles and those types of things.
Barbara White, resident of Texas City, commented that she is in agreement with the ordinance but she believes that it needs to read more than three days; she would like to see it read a full week.  She said that she did not want people to misconstrue and think that they can not camp out for a week.  Chief Burby responded that it has been his experience that most don’t know what the ordinance reads – the three day rule is a good time period.  He reiterated that it is discretionary; it is designed to eliminate people from homesteading in undesirable methods.

ORDINANCE NO. 07-46

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 82, PARKS AND RECREATION, ARTICLE I, “IN GENERAL”, OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF TEXAS CITY, GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS, BY ADDING A NEW SECTION 82-8 PROHIBITING CAMPING IN A CITY PARK, RECREATION AREA, OR CITY FACILITY FOR MORE THAN THREE CONSECUTIVE DAYS; CONTAINING A SAVINGS CLAUSE; PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL OF ALL ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT THEREWITH; DISPENSING WITH THE CHARTER REQUIREMENT FOR READING THIS ORDINANCE ON THREE (3) SEPARATE DAYS; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS ORDINANCE SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS PASSAGE AND ADOPTION AND PUBLICATION BY CAPTION ONLY IN THE OFFICIAL NEWSPAPER OF THE CITY.

Commissioner Land made a MOTION to APPROVE Ordinance No. 07-46 amending Chapter 82, Parks and Recreation, Article I, "In General", of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Texas City, Texas , by adding a new Section 82-8, Prohibiting Camping in a City Park, Recreation Area, or City Facility for more than three consecutive days; Commissioner Sullivan SECONDED the motion.  All present voted AYE.  MOTION CARRIED.
b. Consider approval of Ordinance No. 07-47 amending the "Master Land Use Plan" of the City of Texas City, Texas to amend the Industrial Transition Zone and to add Dickinson Bayou Transition. (Planning)

Don Carroll reported that the formulation process for the recommended changes to the City’s Land Use and Thoroughfare Plan have been completed.  This formulation process included workshops with the Planning Board and Zoning Commission.  Staff conducted land use studies, and coordinated with the stake holders of the target area, keeping them apprised of the pending alternatives being considered.  Several stake holders were included in the formulation process and their concerns and input were also a part of the formulation process with regards to the final recommendations.  Public Notice was properly posted.  There are no controversial issues associated with this recommendation.  All board members present during the workshop and Planning Board meeting voted in favor of the recommendations presented to the City Commission.
ORDINANCE NO. 07-47

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE “MASTER LAND USE PLAN” OF THE CITY OF TEXAS CITY, GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS, TO AMEND THE INDUSTRIAL TRANSITION ZONE AND TO ADD DICKINSON BAYOU TRANSITION; PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL OF ALL ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT THEREWITH; PROVIDING FOR THE READING OF THIS ORDINANCE ON THREE (3) SEPARATE DAYS; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS ORDINANCE SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS PASSAGE AND ADOPTION AND PUBLICATION BY CAPTION ONLY IN THE OFFICIAL NEWSPAPER OF THE CITY.
Commissioner Land made a MOTION to APPROVE Ordinance No. 07-47 amending the "Master Land Use Plan" of the City of Texas City, Texas to amend the Industrial Transition Zone and to add Dickinson Bayou Transition; the motion was SECONDED by Commissioner Sullivan.  All present voted AYE.  MOTION CARRIED.
Captain Grandstaff reported that he began his new job as Code Enforcement Officer on November 6th. He read off the statistics of citations, tagged vehicles, etc. since he began.  November:  23 vehicles red tagged, 8 were towed, 6 complied (they either moved the vehicles or got them fixed); 5 citations were issued; 5 houses have been condemned, 3 being pink tags (because of structural reasons), 2 were white tagged (which is if they are without electricity, no running water or illegal narcotic activity); made two arrests, 14 reports and 58 calls.  December:  1 vehicle red tagged, 3 vehicles complied from November, 3 have been towed; 4 citations were issued; 1 house was condemned, pink tag; 3 reports and 18 calls so far.  Captain Grandstaff said that they have been getting a lot of positive feedback, and of course negative feedback from people who are violating.  We are having a problem with out of town absentee owners of buildings, he said that he is starting to process and issue citations to those people to make them comply to the ordinances.
Commissioner Clark commented that he was very pleased with his progress and his position.

The Mayor stated the City is getting a lot more compliance than conflict.

   V.
PUBLIC COMMENTS 

George Jones commented on the signage on 

Jack Cross asked if there were something the City could do to make people edge their property; the Mayor remarked that the City didn’t have an ordinance on edging.
         VI.
COMMISSIONERS’ COMMENTS

Commissioner Johnson thanked the Rotary Club for their participation with Youth In Government Day.

	


Having no further business, Commissioner Singleton made a MOTION to ADJOURN at 5:40 p.m.; the motion was SECONDED by Commissioner Johnson. All present voted AYE.  MOTION CARRIED.







MATTHEW T. DOYLE, MAYOR 

ATTEST:

__________________________________

Pamela A. Lawrence, City Secretary

pal 12-06-2007
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