Bid # 2008-900

CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZER ANNUAL CONTRACT

Bid Opening: Friday, March 14, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.
SECTION ONE - TURF CHEMICALS

	VENDORS

	Item
	UAP Professional

Products
	BWI
	Brandt
	LESCO Inc.
	Univar
	Previous

Contract

	1) Award Fire Ant Killer

(25 LB bag)
	$174.60

Per bag
	$193.00
Per bag


	NO BID
	NO BID
	$184.00
Per bag
	$147.68



	2)Carbaryl SL

 (Sevin etc)
2.5 gal container
	$68.50
Per container
	$72.00
Per container
	$77.00
Per container
	$113.90
Per  container
	NO BID
	$67.00



	3) Chipco Top Choice

50 LB bag
	$147.89
Per bag
	$155.00

Per bag
	NO BID
	$162.50
Per bag
	$150.00
Per bag
	$126.00



	4) Merit 75WSP

1.6 oz
 package
	$89.42
Per package
	$25.00

Per package
	$21.88
Per package
	$32.06
Per package
	NO BID
	$28.36



	   5) MSMA

6 LB material

2.5 gal
container
	$37.50
Per container
	$39.00
Per container
	$41.18

Per container
	$57.50
Per container
	NO BID
	$32.60



	   6) Trimec
      Classic

  2.5 gal container
	$46.50
Per container
	$51.00
Per container
	NO BID
	$68.00
Per container
	$68.00
Per container
	$42.00


	7) Glyphosate

     Pro 41% Al
2.5 gal
 container
	$81.25
Per container
	$82.50

Per container
	NO BID
	$85.42
Per container
	NO BID
	NEW ITEM


	8) Simazine

            41.9%
2.5 gal 
container
	$45.00
Per container
	$50.00
Per container
	NO BID
	$60.22
Per Container
	$56.00
Per container
	NEW ITEM


	9) Non – ionic

Surfactant

1 gal
 container
	$9.50
Per gal
	$8.00

Per gal
	$17.55
Per gal
	$18.73
Per gal
	$9.00
Per gal
	$6.25



	10) Monument

Box 25
 grams
	$228.00

Per 25 gr box
	$228.00
Per 25 gr box
(fast delivery)
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$212.50




SECTION ONE - TURF CHEMICALS

	VENDORS

	Item
	UAP Professional

Products
	BWI
	Brandt
	LESCO Inc.
	Univar, Inc.
	Previous

Contract

	11) Water Buffer for treating hard water

Example-Insure XL
	$15.00

Per gal
	NO BID
	$20.00
Per gal
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$9.80



	  12) Revolver

Quart container
	$165.00
Per qt
	$186.00
Per qt
	NO BID
	$226.82
Per qt
	NO BID
	$157.36



	13) Anderson’s Goose & Crab Greens Prem

per bag
	$88.75
Per bag
	$77.00
Per bag
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$71.57



	14) Glyphosate Aquatic

2.5 gal container
	$72.82
Per container
	$130.00
Per container
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$53.98


	15) Iprodione

Flowable

(Chipco

26 etc)

2.5 gal

container
	$180.00
Per container
	$319.00

Per container
	NO BID
	$171.00
Per container
	NO BID
	 New Item


	16) Propamocarb 

Hydrochloride

66.5%

1 gal

 container
	$332.50

Per container
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$199.25
Per Container
	NO BID
	New Item


	17)Chlorothalonil

82.5% Al

5 LB. bag
	$51.25
Per bag
	$31.00
Per bag
	$37.38
Per bag
	$38.00
Per bag
	NO BID
	New Item


	18)Mefenoxam

(Subdue

Maxx)

1 gal
	$565.00
Per gal
	$614.00
Per gal
	$354.00
Per gal
	$585.73
Per gal
	NO BID
	New Item


	19)Mancozeb 

-Mn 16%

-Z 2%

48 LB case
	$6.30
Per LB
	$3.63
Per LB
	NO BID
	$4.35
Per LB.
	NO BID
	New Item

	20) Heritage

1 LB

 container
	$394.00
Per  container
	$394.00
Per container
(fast delivery)
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$379.50



SECTION ONE - TURF CHEMICALS

	VENDORS

	Item
	UAP Professional

Products
	BWI
	Brandt
	LESCO Inc.
	Univar, Inc.
	Previous

Contract

	21)Thiophanate

Methyl

(Cleary’s

3336)

2.5 gal container
	$276.50
Per container
	$275.00
Per container
	$322.50
Per container
	$256.27
Per container
	NO BID
	$247.88


	22)Prostar

Wettable

Powder

1 LB bag
	$44.10
Per bg
	$47.90
Per bag
	$45.75
Per bag
	$67.96
Per bag
	NO BID
	$41.00

	23) Lake

Colorant

WSB bags
	$10.63
Per LB
	$10.00
Per LB
	$16.50
Per LB
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$7.16


	24)Primo Maxx

1 gal container
	$406.31
Per gal
	$420.00
Per gal
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$388.00


	25)  Spray Dye

Indicator

2.5 gal container
	$56.25
Per container
	$64.00
Per container
	$45.00
Per container
	$72.45
Per container
	$56.00
Per container
	$31.20


	26) PH Buffer

gal

container or 

2.5 gal

 container
	$20.00
Per gal
	$12.00
Per gal
	$24.00

Per gal
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$9.80


	27)Liquid Wetting Agent for Turf Ex. Primer, Soaker

Lesco West

 1 or 2.5 gal

 container
	$29.00

Per gal
	$45.00
Per gal
	$45.00
Per gal
	$30.36
Per gal
	NO BID
	$28.28


	28)Barricade

 65WG
	$18.25
Per LB
	$218.00
Per 10 LB bag
	$23.85
Per LB
	$23.08
Per LB
	NO BID
	New Item


	29) Reward 1 gal or

 2.5 gal container
	$105.00
Per gal
	$116.00
Per gal
	NO BID
	$149.37
Per gal
	NO BID
	$97.00



SECTION ONE - TURF CHEMICALS

	VENDORS

	Item
	UAP Professional

Products
	BWI
	Brandt
	LESCO Inc.
	Univar, Inc.
	Previous

Contract

	30)Advion fire

Ant Bait

12 LB bag 
	$44.25
Per bag
	$10.00
Per LB / 12# bag
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$9.57

Per bag 
	New Item


	31) Rubigan

1gal 
	$297.80
Per gal
	$311.00
Per gal
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	New Item


	32)Talstar or

Bifenthrin

1 gal
	$92.00
Per gal
	$67.00
Per gal
	$72.75
Per gal
	NO BID
	$38.00
Per gal
	New Item


	33) Spreader/

Sticker

1 gal or

2.5 gal

container 
	$9.50
Per gal
	$22.00
Per 2.5 gal
	$17.55
Per 2.5 gal
	$18.73
Per 2.5 gal
	NO BID
	9.10


	34)Chemical

Tank

Cleaner

Liquid or

Powder
	$20.00
Per container
	$4.50
Per container
	$14.00
Per container
	$8.74
Per container
	NO BID
	New Item


SECTION TWO – FERTILIZER

	VENDORS

	Item
	UAP Professional

Products
	BWI
	Brandt
	LESCO Inc.
	Univar, Inc.
	Previous

Contract

	*35) 21-0-0 Ammonium Sulfate

50 LB bag
	$504.53
Per bag
	$340.00
Per bag
	NO BID
	$605.60
Per bag
	NO BID
	$224.00

	36) Fairway Pelletized
 Gypsum

per ton 
	$173.00
Per ton
	$240.00
Per Ton

	$284.00
Per ton
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$228.00


	37) 18-4-18 

50% 

Nutralene 

Greens Grade
50 LB bag 
	$25.45
Per 50 LB bag
	$22.50
Per 50 LB bag


	NO BID
	$35.31
Per 50 LB. bag
	NO BID
	$13.37


	38) ) 10-18-22

Greens
grade

50 LB bag 
	$24.95
Per 50 LB bag
	$28.80
Per 50 LB bag


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$13.43

	*39) 19-0-19
 w.MOP .86% pendimethylin 22DSGN
 50 or 100 LB 
bag 
	$920.00
Per ton
	$616.00
Per ton


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$528.00


	40)22-0-22
 100%

Nutralene

50 LB bag 
	$24.00
Per 50 LB bag
	$37.75
Per 50 LB bag


	NO BID
	$23.92
Per 50 LB bag
	NO BID
	$10.73


	41) 21-0-0

Ammonium

Sulphate

Sprayable

50 LB bag
	$7.53
Per 50 LB bag
	$8.25
Per 50 LB bag


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	 $5.31

	42) Liquid Nutrient Foliar

18-3-6

50% SRN

2.5 gal container 
	$11.25
Per gal
	$12.00
Per gal
	$7.00
Per gal
	$33.12
Per gal
	NO BID
	$8.50



SECTION TWO – FERTILIZER

	VENDORS

	Item
	UAP Professional

Products
	BWI
	Brandt
	LESCO Inc.
	Univar, Inc.
	Previous

Contract

	*43) 25-05-10 w/ 
MOP .86%

pendimethylin

220SGN
50 or 1000 LB bag 
	$737.55
Per ton
	$616.00
Per ton
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$396.80


	44)15-0-15

Urea

1% Ronstar

50 LB bag
	$1,697.60
Per ton
	$1,280.00
Per ton


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$1,350.00

	45) 25-5-15

50%

Nutralene

50 LB bag 
	$42.00
Per bag
	$21.30
Per bag
	NO BID
	$19.97
Per bag
	NO BID
	New Item

	46) ) 28-3-10

Sulfur

Coated Urea

Fairway tees 
	$16.85
Per bag
	$17.30

Per bag

	NO BID
	$21.61
Per bag
	NO BID
	$16.33


	47) 18-3-18 

Homogenous.

Green

Grade

Methylene

Urea SGN 90

50 LB bag
	$28.50
Per bag
	$35.50
Per bag

	NO BID
	$35.31
Per bag
	NO BID
	New Item



* No award made due to the unstable cost of these products; which have increased almost weekly.
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