BID TABULATION
Bid #2008-905
EMERGENCY MEDICAL
SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT ANNUAL CONTRACT
	VENDOR

	Bound Tree Medical , LLC


	Physio-Control, Inc.
	Matrx Medical
	Tri-Anim Health Services
	Ever Ready First Aid
	Laerdal Medical Corporation

	PRIVATE 
Section 1


	$1,314.80
	No Bid
	$1,062.87
	$37,940.15
	$1,433.00
	No Bid

	Section 2


	$124.37
	No Bid
	$31.91
	$18,817.09
	$23.02
	No Bid

	Section 3


	$207.27
	No Bid
	$4.63 (IC)
	$13,699.50
	$206.355
	No Bid

	Section 4


	$1,269.85
	No Bid
	$1,150.08
	$97,457.65
	$1,499.95
	No Bid

	Section 5


	$885.70
	No Bid
	$419.863 (IC)
	$1,557.00
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Section 6


	$108.81
	No Bid
	$19.63
	$1,068.91
	$32.565
	No Bid

	Section 7
	$10,171.60
	$3,504.55 (IC)
	$7,151.22 (IC)
	$18,653.64 (IC)
	$2,433.137 (IC)
	No Bid



	Section 8
	No Bid
	$2,167.00
	$2,058.45
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid



	Section 9
	No Bid
	$9,561.85
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid



	Delivery


	2 Days
	2 Days
	2 Days
	2-3 Days
	14-21 Days
	-


IC – Incomplete: did not bid on all items in section.
