BID TABULATION

Bid # 2008-908
Hauling and Disposal of Municipal Sludge

From Wastewater Treatment Plant Annual Contract
Bid Opening: Wednesday, May 28, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.

	VENDOR
	UNIT PRICE

450

 20 yard

 Roll-offs
	EXTENSION

Estimated Yearly Cost
	UNIT PRICE

350

 20 yard

 Roll-offs
	EXTENSION

Estimated Yearly Cost
	UNIT PRICE

200

 20 yard

 Roll-offs
	EXTENSION

Estimated Yearly Cost

	Republic Waste Services of Texas
Angleton, Texas
	$420.50
	$189,225.00
	$420.50
	$147,175.00
	$420.50
	$84,100.00

	Allied Waste Services
Houston, Texas
	$463.25
	$208,462.50
	$463.25
	$162,137.50
	$463.25
	$92,700.00

	Waste Management of Texas

Houston, Texas
	$669.00
	$301,050.00


	$674.00
	$235,900.00
	$694.00
	$138,800.00

	Synagro of Texas
Houston, Texas
	NO BID
	NO BID

	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	Previous Contract Pricing
	$395.00
	$177,750.00
	$395.00
	$138,250.00
	$395.00
	$79,000.00



