BID FORM

BID #2008-907
PERSONNEL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT, FIRE HOSE, NOZZLES AND RELATED EQUIPMENT

ANNUAL CONTRACT

Bid Opening: Tuesday, May 27, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.

SECTION 1- PERSONNEL PROTECTION EQUIPMENT 
	Description


	Dooley Tackaberry, Inc.
	Emergency Response Solutions of Texas
	Metro Fire
	Fuego
	Fire Supply, Inc.
	Municipal Emergency Services
	Previous Contract

Pricing

	1. Bunker Jacket

32-70 Regular & Tall
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$722.00
	$798.39
	NO BID


	$710.00


	$511.00



	2.  Bunker Pants

32-62 (XS-4X)
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$490.00
	$468.51
	NO BID


	$410.00
	$370.00

	3.  Suspenders


	NO BID
	NO BID
	With #2
	$29.50
	NO BID


	$30.00
	$19.75

	4.  Bunker Boots


	$109.95
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$96.97
	$105.82
	$121.00
	$79.00

	5.  Helmet


	$150.75
	NO BID
	$165.00
	$146.00
	$139.37
	NO BID
	$148.00

	6. Firefighting Protective Hood
	$161.20


	NO BID
	$184.00
	$121.09
	NO BID


	NO BID
	$180.00

	7.  Protective Sock Hood for Firefighting
	$25.40
	NO BID
	$21.00
	$29.84
	NO BID


	$18.00
	$12.00

	8.  Gloves


	$43.00


	NO BID
	NO BID
	$51.32
	NO BID


	$47.00
	$35.00

	9. Gauntlet Style 

w/Sleevemate Firefighting Gloves
	$126.10
	NO BID
	$125.00


	$133.51
	NO BID


	$129.00
	$99.00

	*10.  Coveralls Regular & Long Length
	______
	______
	______
	______
	______
	______
	______

	11.  Gear Bags, 

X-Large
	$36.35
	NO BID
	$55.00
	$39.75
	NO BID


	$39.00
	$33.00

	12. PASS Alarm, Motion Detector
	$204.40
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$251.28
	NO BID


	$657.00
	NEW


* Excluded – will not purchase from this contract.
SECTION 2- FIRE HOSE AND NOZZLES
	Description


	Dooley Tackaberry, Inc.
	Emergency Response Solutions of Texas
	Metro Fire
	Fuego
	Fire Supply, Inc.
	Municipal Emergency Services
	Previous Contract

Pricing

	1.  5” x 100’ sections of supply hose
	$548.90
	$1,034.20
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID


	$586.00
	$552.25

	2.  5” x 50’ sections of supply hose
	$336.95
	NO BID


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID


	$331.00
	$349.45

	3.  5” x 25’ sections of supply hose
	$231.00
	NO BID


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID


	$258.00
	$241.55

	4.  5” Stortz to 4” Female adapter
	$101.95
	NO BID


	$171.00
	NO BID
	$130.48
	$129.00
	$101.15

	5.  5” Stortz to 2.5” Female elbow
	$111.20


	NO BID


	$177.00
	NO BID
	$115.03
	$111.00
	$116.30

	6.Spanner wrench set
	$56.90
	NO BID


	$95.00
	NO BID
	$62.56
	$59.00
	$58.15

	7.  5” Stortz Blind cap


	$45.00
	NO BID


	$62.00
	NO BID
	$59.86
	$54.00
	$52.35

	8.  5” Hose Roller


	$120.15
	NO BID


	$186.00
	NO BID
	$131.60
	$139.00
	$150.00

	9.  Ball type intake valve 6” 
	$985.90
	NO BID


	$1,225.00


	NO BID
	$1,058.30
	$1,095.00
	$883.65

	*10.  5” Hose Clamp 


	______
	______
	______
	______
	______
	______
	______

	11.  1 ¾” x 50’ section of hose
	$93.20
	$96.92
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$104.00
	$90.00

	12.  2” x 50’ section of hose
	$140.90


	$143.52
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$146.00
	$105.00

	13.  1” X 50’ section of hose
	$70.45


	$54.08
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$98.00
	$60.00

	14.   3” X 50’ section of hose 
	$196.00


	$193.95
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$187.00
	$165.00

	15. 1 ¾ ” X 10’ section of attack hose
	$35.90
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$37.45

	16. 3” X 50’ section of attack hose 
	$101.60
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NEW

	17.6” x 10’ Hard Suction
	$351.25
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$428.90


	$429.00
	$343.45

	18.  1.50” Adjustable Fog Nozzle, 30-95
	$434.30
	$374.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$559.09
	$435.00
	NEW


* Excluded – will not purchase from this contract.
SECTION 2- FIRE HOSE AND NOZZLES

	Description
	Dooley Tackaberry, Inc.
	Emergency Response Solutions of Texas
	Metro
	Fuego
	Fire Supply, Inc.
	Municipal Emergency Services
	Previous Contract Pricing

	19.  1.50” Adjustable Fog Nozzle, 95-200
	$604.00
	$440.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$613.47
	$517.00
	NEW

	20.  2.50” Adjustable Fog Nozzle, 125-250
	$683.70
	$629.20
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$869.33
	$553.00
	$832.40

	21.  1.0” Adjustable Fog Nozzle, 13-60
	$526.50
	$356.40
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$512.01
	$407.00                     (15-60 GPM)
	$491.50

	22.  2.5” Solid Bore Triple Stacked Tips
	$222.80
	$178.20
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$214.79
	$196.00
	$208.75

	23.  1.5” Cellar Nozzle
	$488.65
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$291.20


	$295.00
	$282.00

	24.  2.5” Cellar Nozzle
	$608.50
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$371.91


	$401.00
	$361.65
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