BID TABULATION

Bid #2008-911
Surface Treatment, Rock, Basalt and 

Limestone Annual Contract

Bid Opening: Wednesday, June 18, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.
SURFACE TREATMENT ROCK

	Description
	App.

QTY
	Vulcan Construction Materials, LP
	Gulf Coast

Limestone
	Current contract price

	Surface 

Treatment Rock

Type PB  Grade 3
	25

tons
	$48.00
	No bid
	$45.75

	Surface Treatment Rock

Type PB  Grade 4
	25

tons
	$48.00
	No bid
	$45.75

	Surface Treatment Rock 

Type PB  Grade 5
	25

tons
	$48.00
	No bid
	$45.75


BASALT ROCK

	Description
	App.

QTY
	Vulcan Construction Materials, LP
	Gulf Coast Limestone
	Current contract price

	Basalt Rock
Type B   Grade 3 
	600 

tons
	$51.00
	No bid
	$45.75

	Basalt Rock
Type B   Grade 4
	50

tons
	$51.00
	No bid
	$45.75

	Basalt Rock

Type B   Grade 5
	600

tons
	$51.00
	No bid
	$45.75


LIMESTONE ROCK

	Description
	App.

QTY
	Vulcan Construction Materials, LP
	Gulf Coast Limestone
	Current contract price

	Limestone Rock

Type B   Grade 3
	500

tons
	No bid 
	No bid 
	$28.99

	Limestone Rock

Type B   Grade 4
	50 tons
	No bid
	No bid
	$31.99

	Limestone Rock

Type B   Grade 5
	50 tons
	No bid
	No bid
	$31.99


LIMESTONE ROCK – TYPE CC COLD MIX

	Description
	App.

QTY
	Vulcan Construction Materials, LP
	Gulf Coast Limestone  
	Current contract price

	Limestone Rock 

Type CC cold mix
	1000

tons
	$62.00
	No bid
	$50.25


