BID TABULATION

Bid # 2008-919
VEGETATION MANAGEMENT CHEMICALS

ANNUAL CONTRACT

Bid Opening: Thursday, September 4, 2008
	ITEM #
	UAP Distribution, Inc.

Houston, Texas


	LESCO, Inc.

Cleveland, Ohio
	Red River Specialties, Inc.

Houston, Texas
	Previous

Contract

Pricing

	1. 41 % Glyphosate

per 2.5 gal
	$97.50
	$114.00


	$81.00
	$36.62

	2. 41 % Glyphosate

per 30 gal drum
	$1,080.00
	$1,246.00


	$969.00
	$420.00

	3. Aquatic Glyphosate

per 2.5 gal
	$114.50
	$114.67
	$115.00
	$49.62

	4. Aquatic Glyphosate

per 30 gal drum
	$1,200.00
	No Bid
	$1,350.00
	$595.50

	5. Veterans 720

per 2.5 gal
	$61.88
	$64.75
	$66.00
	$52.07

	6. Veterans 720

per 30 gal drum
	$727.50
	$1,219.49
	$792.00
	$615.90

	7. Arsenal

per 2.5 gal
	$612.50
	No Bid
	$650.00
	$302.50

	8. Arsenal

per 30 gal drum
	$7,350.00


	No Bid
	$7,800.00
	$5,844.00



	9. Garlon 3-A

per 2.5 gal
	$132.25
	161.29
	$181.00
	$120.00

	10. Garlon 3-A

per 30 gal drum
	$1,587.00
	No Bid
	$2,172.00
	$1,440.00

	11.Plateau

per gal
	$229.10
	No Bid
	$260.00
	$277.00

	12. Oust

per 3 lb container
	$225.00
	No Bid
	$300.00
	$177.00

	13. Surfactant

per 2.5 gal
	$30.00
	$46.81
	$23.50
	$21.00

	14. Surfactant

per 30 gal drum
	No Bid
	$985.72
	$279.00
	$246.00

	15. Aquatic Surfactant

per 2.5 gal
	$30.00
	No Bid
	$45.00
	$22.00

	16. Nu Film – IR

per 2.5 gal
	$76.25
	No Bid
	$71.00
	$54.12

	17. Drift Control

per quart
	$8.25
	No Bid
	$9.60
	$8.25

	18. Drift Control

per gal
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$32.00
	

	19. Tank Cleaner

per gal
	$13.00
	*$5.77 2 lbs

disqualified
	$17.00
	$13.00

	20. Marking Dye

per gal
	No Bid
	$30.43
	$29.00
	$26.00

	21. Marking Dye

per 2.5 gal
	$91.90
	$76.07
	$71.00
	$60.00

	22. Reward

per gal
	$97.00
	$156.75
	$120.00
	$103.00


* Disqualified – vendor bid a substitution brand without prior approval – Special Conditions: ANY SUBSTITUTIONS TO BRAND SPECIFED MUST BE APPROVED, PRIOR TO BID OPENING.
