BID TABULATION

(6) 2009 MODEL ¾ TON PICK UP TRUCKS,
(1) 2009 MODEL SERVICE BODY & (1) 2009 MODEL SUV
BID #2009-193
Bid Opening: Thursday, January 8, 2009 @ 2:00 p.m.

	VENDOR


	¾ TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE P/U TRUCK

SPEC “A”
	¾ TON CREW CAB P/U TRUCK
SPEC “B”
	¾ TON P/U TRUCK

SPEC “C”
	SERVICE BODY TRUCK
SPEC “D”
	4-DOOR 4X2 SUV
SPEC “E”
	TOTAL BID

	Helfman Ford

Stafford, Texas
	(1) 2009 Ford F250
$18,499.00

98 days delivery
	 (1) 2009 Ford F250
$18,740.00

98 days delivery
	(4) 2009 Ford F250
$15,899.00 x 4 =

$63,596.00

98 days delivery
	(1) 2009 Ford F350
Service Body

$31,890.00

98 days delivery
	(1) 2009 Ford Explorer XLT
$18,600.00

98 days delivery
	$151,325.00

	Planet Ford 6

Caldwell, Texas
	(1) 2009 Ford F250

$19,471.00

120 days delivery
	 (1) 2009 Ford F250

$19,886.00

120 days delivery
	(4) 2009 Ford F250

$16,781.00 x 4 =

$67,124.00

120 days delivery
	(1) 2009 Ford F350

Service Body

$33,124.00

120 + days delivery
	(1) 2009 Ford Explorer XLT

$19,887.00

120 days delivery
	$159,492.00

	Tommie Vaughn Motors, Inc.

Houston, Texas
	(1) 2009 Ford F250

$20,183.00

75 days delivery
	 (1) 2009 Ford F250

$19,657.00

75 days delivery
	(4) 2009 Ford F250

$17,545.00 x 4 =

$70,180.00

75 days delivery
	(1) 2009 Ford F350

Service Body

$32,995.00

75 days delivery
	(1) 2009 Ford Explorer 

$18,818.00

60 days delivery
	$161,883.00

	Mc Ree Ford, Inc.

Dickinson, Texas
	(1) 2009 Ford F250

$20,826.70

90 days delivery
	 (1) 2009 Ford F250

$20,320.70

90 days delivery
	(4) 2009 Ford F250

$18,238.70 x 4 =

$72,954.80

90 days delivery
	(1) 2009 Ford F350

Service Body

$33,170.45
100 days delivery
	(1) 2009 Ford Explorer XLT $20,110.50

90 days delivery
	$167,383.15


	VENDOR


	¾ TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE P/U TRUCK

SPEC “A”
	¾ TON CREW CAB P/U TRUCK

SPEC “B”
	¾ TON P/U TRUCK

SPEC “C”
	SERVICE BODY TRUCK

SPEC “D”
	4-DOOR 4X2 SUV

SPEC “E”
	TOTAL BID

	Caldwell Country Chevrolet

Caldwell, Texas
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	(1) 2009 Chevrolet 3500 Silverado
Service Body

$36,886.00

180 days delivery
	NO BID
	

	Philpott Motors

Nederland, Texas
	(1) 2009 Ford F250

$20,987.00

120 days delivery
	 (1) 2009 Ford F250

$20,811.00

120 days delivery
	(4) 2009 Ford F250

$18,409.00 x 4 =

$73,954.80

120 days delivery
	NO BID
	(1) 2009 Ford Explorer XLT

$20,094.00

90 days delivery
	

	Rogers Dodge of Alvin

Alvin, Texas
	(1) 2009 Dodge 2500 HD
$24,516.00

180 days delivery
	 (1) 2009 Dodge 2500
$23,557.00

180 days delivery
	(4) 2009 Dodge 2500
$20,192.00 x 4 =

$80,768.00

180 days delivery
	(1) 2009 Dodge 3500 Service Body

$34,862.00

180 days delivery
	NO BID
	


BASIS OF AWARD: lowest total bid meeting all specifications.

DELIVERY: within one hundred twenty (120) calendar days of the date of the Purchase Order. 
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