ORDINANCE NO. 08-56
AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF TEXAS CITY, TEXAS, AMENDING CHAPTER 54, ARTICLE I, “FIRE PREVENTION AND PROTECTION”, OF THE CITY CODE BY AMENDING SECTION 54-2 TO INCREASE THE AWARD FOR ARSON FROM $300 TO $500; AMENDING CHAPTER 54, ARTICLE III, “FIRE PREVENTION CODE”, SECTION 54-71 OF THE CITY CODE BY ADOPTING THE 2006 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE AS THE FIRE CODE OF THE CITY OF TEXAS CITY, INCLUDING APPENDICES A, B, C AND D;  AMENDING CHAPTER 54, ARTICLE III, “FIRE PREVENTION CODE”, SECTION 54-72 OF THE CITY CODE BY ADOPTING LOCAL AMENDMENTS TO THE FIRE CODE AND AMENDMENT TO APPENDIX A; CONTAINING A SAVINGS CLAUSE; PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL OF ALL ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT THEREWITH; PROVIDING FOR THE READING OF THIS ORDINANCE ON THREE (3) SEPARATE DAYS; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS ORDINANCE SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS PASSAGE AND ADOPTION AND PUBLICATION BY CAPTION ONLY IN THE OFFICIAL NEWSPAPER OF THE CITY.


WHEREAS, upon recommendation of the Fire Chief and Fire Marshal, and full review and consideration of all matters related and attendant thereto, the City Commission is of the opinion that the 2006 Edition of the International Fire Code including appendices A, B, C and D, along with the local amendments thereto, including amendment to appendix A, should be adopted as the Fire Code for the City of Texas City and that regulations and fees should be established thereunder. 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COMMISION OF THE CITY OF TEXAS CITY, TEXAS, THAT: 

 
SECTION 1: 
Chapter 54 of The City Code, Article I, “Fire Prevention and Protection” is hereby amended by amending Article I, section 54-2 to read and provide as follows:   
“ARTICLE I.  FIRE PREVENTION AND PROTECTION
. . .

Sec. 54-2.  Arson reward established.

The mayor is hereby required, authorized and empowered to offer a reward of not less than $300.00 $500.00 payable to the person who shall be responsible for the arrest and conviction of any person committing in the city the crime of arson as arson is now defined by the state penal code.

. . .”

  
SECTION 2:   Chapter 54 of The City Code, is amended by amending Article III, “Fire Prevention Code,” section 54-71(a) to read and provide as follows:
“ARTICLE III.  FIRE PREVENTION CODE


Sec. 54-71.  International Fire Code adopted; conflicting regulations.
(a)   There is hereby adopted for and by the city a fire prevention code known as the International Fire Code, 2006, 2003, with appendices and amendments thereto, passed and recommended by the International Code Council, Inc., which code is published in book form and which is referred to, incorporated in this article and made a part of this article for all purposes. A copy of such code is filed of record in the office of the city secretary.

(b)   If there is any conflict between the provisions of the fire prevention code and the provisions of this Code of Ordinances, state law or city ordinances, rules or regulations, the provisions of this Code of Ordinances, state law or city ordinances, rules or regulations shall preempt and be controlling.
. . .”

SECTION 3:   Chapter 54 of The City Code, is amended by amending Article III, “Fire Prevention Code,” section 54-72 to read and provide as follows:

“Sec. 54-72.  Amendments to Standard Fire Prevention Code.
The code adopted by this article is amended as provided in this section.
Section 602.6, Access to Buildings by Fire Apparatus,  is amended by adding subsection 602.6.8, to read as follows:  

602.6.8. When access to or within a structure, a facility or an area is unduly difficult because of secured openings or where immediate access is necessary for lifesaving or firefighting purposes, the fire official may require a key box to be installed in an accessible location. The key box shall be of a type approved by the fire official and shall contain keys to gain necessary access as required by the fire official. The key box shall be located and installed as approved by the fire official.

Section 603.1.2, Installation,  is amended to read as follows:  

603.1.2. In occupancies of a hazardous nature in the judgment of the fire official, additional safeguards may be required by the fire official, and such safeguards may consist of one or more of the following: automatic fire detection system, fire alarm systems, automatic fire extinguishing system, standpipe systems, portable or fixed fire extinguisher, fire blankets, breathing apparatus, manual or automatic covers, or key boxes. Fire protection extinguishing apparatus required under this section shall be installed in accordance with the applicable NFiPA standards referenced in chapter 3.


Sec. 101.1 Administration. 

Title.  These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of Texas City, hereinafter referred to as “this code.” 


Sec. 102.6 is amended by the addition of the following: 

Sec. 102.6  Referenced codes and standards.  Whenever amendments have been adopted to the referenced codes and standards, each reference to said code and standard shall be considered to reference the amendments as well.  Any reference to NFPA 70 or the ICC Electrical Code shall mean the Electrical Code as adopted. 

Sec. 103.1, 103.2, and 103.3 are amended to read as follows: 


Sec. 103 Department of Fire Prevention 

Sec. 103.1  General.  The Fire Code shall be enforced by the Division of Fire Prevention.  The Division of Fire Prevention is hereby established as a division of the Fire Department of the City of Texas City and shall be operated under the supervision of the Fire Marshal, and Chief of the Fire Department. 

Sec. 103.2  Appointment.  The Fire Marshal in charge of the Division of Fire Prevention shall be appointed by the Fire Chief on the basis of proper qualification. 

Sec. 103.3  Deputies.  The Chief of the Fire Department may detail such members of the Fire Department as inspectors as shall from time to time be necessary and each member so assigned shall be authorized to enforce the provisions of the International Fire Code.  …[remainder of section 103 unchanged]…


Sec. 105.  Permits.   


Sec. 105.6  is amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 105.6   Required Operational Permits.  Operational permits are required for:  Installation of New Fire Alarm Systems, Re-Test of New Fire Alarm Systems, Above ground fuel storage tank (stationary), Flammable/Combustible liquid dispensing operations, Dry cleaning plant, Flammable Finish booths(spray booths), Day Care Center, Open burning, New or upgraded Fixed Fire Suppression systems, New sprinkler system installation, Tents & Air supported structures.  Operating without the required operational permit shall result in a stop work order, as well as a permit fee at twice the rate of the originally required permit.  Permit fee schedule is available at Texas City Fire Administration as well as the Fire Department web page http://www.texas-city-tx.org/Fire.htm.  

Sec. 109.3 is amended by the addition of the following: 

Sec. 109.3  Any person, firm, or corporation intentionally, knowingly or with criminal negligence ,violating any of the provisions or terms of this Ordinance shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and, upon conviction in the Municipal Court, shall be subject to a fine not to exceed TWO THOUSAND AND NO/100 ($2,000.00) DOLLARS for each offense, and each and every day any such violation shall continue and shall be deemed to constitute a separate offense.    


Sec. 111  is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 111  Stop Work Orders. Any person, firm, or corporation operating without the required applicable operational permit listed in Sec.105.6 amendment shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, and upon conviction in the Municipal Court, shall be subject to a fine of not less than TWO HUNDRED AND NO/100 (200.00), and not to exceed TWO THOUSAND AND NO/100 ($2,000.00) DOLLARS for each offense.   


 Sec. 111.4 is amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 111.4 Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop work order except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to for a fine not to exceed TWO THOUSAND AND NO/100 ($2,000.00) DOLLARS for each offense, and each and every day such violation shall continue shall be deemed to constitute a separate offense. 


 Sec. 202 is amended by the addition of the following: 


Sec. 202 General Definitions 

HIGH-RISE BUILDING.  A building having floors used for human occupancy located more than 55 feet (16,764 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access. 

SELF-SERVICE STORAGE FACILITY.  Real property designed and used for the purpose of renting or leasing individual storage spaces to customers for the purpose of storing and removing personal property on a self-service basis. 

STANDBY PERSONNEL.  Qualified fire service personnel, approved by the Fire Chief.  When utilized, the number required shall be as directed by the Fire Chief, or Fire Marshal.  Charges for utilization shall be as normally calculated by the jurisdiction. 

 
Open Burning. 


 Sec. 307.2.2 is amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 307.2.2 Prohibited Open Burning.  Open burning shall be prohibited within the City of Texas City. 


Exception: 

1.
Permits may be issued for open burn, trench burn, not to exceed 15 feet in diameter and 8 feet in height, and are located a minimum of 50 feet from any structure or property line.  Additional requirements may be imposed, and are at the discretion  of the Fire Marshal.    


Standby Personnel. 


Sec. 316; is amended by the addition of the following: 


Sec. 316 Standby Personnel 

Sec. 316.1 Standby personnel/Crowd managers.  When, in the opinion of the code official or designee, it is essential for public safety in a place of assembly or any other place where people congregate, because of the number of persons, or the nature of the performance, exhibition, display, contest or activity, the owner, agent or lessee shall employ standby personnel, to remain on duty 1 hour prior to times such places are open to the public, or when such activity is being conducted. 

Before each performance or the start of such activity, standby personnel shall keep diligent watch for fires during the time such place is open to the public or such activity is being conducted to take prompt measures as directed by the Fire Marshal.  Such duties may include, but not be limited to, extinguishment of fires that occur and assist in the evacuation of the public from the structure. 

There shall be trained crowd managers or crowd manager supervisors at a ratio determined by the Fire Chief, or Fire Marshal. 


Sec. 405.1; change to read as follows: 

Sec. 405.1 General.   Emergency evacuation drills complying with the provisions of this section shall be conducted in the occupancies listed in Table 405.2 or when required by the fire code official.  Drills shall be designed in cooperation with the local authorities. 


Sec. 408.5.4; change to read as follows: 

Sec. 408.5.4    Deleted.
 
Sec. 503.2.3 Surface is amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 503.2.3 Surface.  Fire lanes shall be constructed of an asphalt or concrete surface capable of supporting the imposed loads of fire apparatus and meeting the requirements of the City of Texas City parking lot standards.  Those portions of the fire lane within sixty feet (60’) of the structure to be protected shall be constructed with 6-inch thick, 3000 psi concrete or 5-inch thick, 3600 psi concrete reinforced with No. 3 bars spaced 24 inches on centers both ways and with sub-grade to a density not less than 95 percent as determined by TSDHPT Test Method Tex-113.  Portions of the fire lane constructed of asphalt shall be ninety-five (95) percent compaction with a 6-inch asphalt stabilized base and 2-inch type D hot mix asphalt concrete.  State Highway specification number 292.  Whenever forty percent (40%) of existing, non-conforming fire lanes are replaced within a twelve month period, the entire fire lane shall be replaced according to current standards. 

All fire lanes shall be maintained and kept in a good state of repair at all times by the owner and the City of Texas City shall not be responsible for the maintenance thereof.  It shall further be the responsibility of the owner to insure that all fire lane markings required by Sec. 503.3 be kept so that they are easily distinguishable by the public. 


Sec. 503.3 is amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 503.3 Marking.   Approved striping or, when allowed by the code official, signs, and or both shall be provided for fire apparatus access roads to identify such roads or prohibit the obstruction thereof.  Signs and striping shall be maintained in a clean and legible condition at all times and be replaced or repaired when deemed necessary by fire code official to provide adequate visibility. 


(1) 
STRIPING – Fire apparatus access roads shall be marked by painted lines of red traffic paint six inches (6”) in width to show the boundaries of the lane.  The words “NO PARKING FIRE LANE” or “fire lane no parking” shall appear in four inch (4”) white letters at 25 foot intervals on the red border markings along both sides of the fire lanes.  Where a curb is available, the striping shall be on the vertical face of the curb.  


(2)
SIGNS – shall read “NO PARKING FIRE LANE” or “FIRE LANE NO 
PARKING” and shall be 12” wide 
and 18” high.  Signs shall be painted on a white background with letters and borders in red, using not less than 2” 
lettering.  Signs shall be permanently affixed to a stationary post and the bottom of the sign shall be six feet, six 
inches (6’6”) above finished grade.  Signs shall be spaced not more than fifty feet (50’) apart.  Signs may be installed 
on permanent buildings or walls or as approved by the Fire Chief or Fire Marshal.  


Section 503.6 is amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 503.6 Security gates.  Where security fencing is necessary, the owner shall provide gates or openings which may be secured.  Gates when provided must open fully in either direction or be of a sliding or raised arm type.  The main entry gates serving Group R & I occupancies shall be equipped with an approved automated entry system.  All other entry points along the fire lane must be automated or Knox compatible as approved by the Fire Marshal, to permit immediate access by fire personnel and equipment in the event of fire or emergency. 


Fire Protection Water Supplies. 


Sec. 508.5.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 508.5.1 Where Required.  And as properties develop, fire hydrants shall be located at not more than the maximum spacing indicated in Table 903.4.2.  Distances between hydrants shall be measured along the route that fire hose is laid by a fire vehicle from hydrant to hydrant.  

Maximum Distance Between Hydrants

	OCCUPANCY
	SPRINKLERED
	NOT SPRINKLERED

	Residential (1 & 2 Family)
	600 feet
	500 feet 

	Residential (Multi Family)
	600 feet 
	300 feet

	All Other  
	600 feet 
	300 feet 


Table 903.4.2

2. PROTECTED PROPERTIES.  Fire hydrants required to provide a supplemental water supply for automatic fire protection system shall be within 100 feet of the fire department connection for such system. 

3. FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS.  Fire hydrants shall be located 2 feet to 6 feet back of curb or fire lane and shall not be located in the bulb of a cul-de-sac.  Hydrant discharges must be a minimum of (18”) inches in height from final grade to lowest point of discharge.   
4. MINIMUM NUMBER OF FIRE HYDRANTS.  There shall be a minimum of two (2) fire hydrants serving each property within the prescribed distances listed above. 


System approval and testing. 


Sec. 901.5 of the International Fire Code is amended by the addition of the following: 

Sec. 901.5 Installation acceptance testing.  All required tests shall be conducted by and at the expense of the owner or his representative.  The Fire Department shall not be held responsible for any damages incurred in such test.  Where it is required that the Fire Department witness any such test, such test shall be scheduled with a minimum of 48 hour notice to the Fire Marshal or his representative. 

Sec. 903.2.10.5 Spray Booths and Rooms.  New and existing spray booths and spraying rooms shall be protected by an approved automatic fire-extinguishing system. 

Sec. 903.2.10.6 Buildings Over 5,000 sq. ft.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout any and all buildings over 5,000 sq. ft.  For the purpose of this provision, fire walls shall not define separate buildings. 


Exceptions: 


1. Open parking garages in compliance with Section 406.3 of the International Building Code.  


2. When of non-combustible construction, the area of awning extension or free-standing canopies, both sides, and not used for display or storage shall not be considered for requiring sprinkler protection for areas greater than 5,000 square feet but less than otherwise required in this code.   


Sec. 903.3.1.1.1; change to read as follows: 

Sec. 903.3.1.1.1 Exempt locations.  When approved by the code official, automatic sprinklers shall not be required in the following rooms or areas where such rooms or areas are protected with an approved automatic fire detection system in accordance with Section 907.2 that will respond to visible or invisible particles of combustion.  Sprinklers shall not be omitted from any room merely because it is damp, of fire-resistance-rated construction or contains electrical equipment. 


1. 
Any room where the application of water, or flame and water, constitutes a serious life or fire hazard.  


2.
Any room or space where sprinklers are considered undesirable because of the nature of the contents, when approved by the code official.  


3.
Generator and transformer rooms, under the direct control of a public utility, separated from the remainder of the building by walls and floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assemblies having a fire-resistance rating of not less than 2 hours.  


Sec. 903.3.1.4 is amended by the addition of the following: 

Sec. 903.3.1.4 Installation.  Automatic sprinkler and standpipe systems shall be installed with the following: 


1.
A single underground supply and point for the Fire Department Connection (FDC) shall be provided for all buildings.  

2.
Fire department connections serving more than 500 GPM shall be provided with one 5-inch Storz connection and one 2-1/2 inch national standard thread connection.       

 
Add Sec. 903.6.2 to read as follows: 

Sec. 903.6.2 Spray booths and rooms.  New and existing spray booths and spray rooms shall be protected by an approved automatic fire-extinguishing system in accordance with Section 1504. 
Fire alarm and detection systems. 


Sec. 907.1.1; shall be amended by the addition of the following: 

Sec. 907.1.1  Construction documents.  Plans for fire alarm systems shall be in accordance with Texas City Fire Department Fire Alarm Submittal Guidelines. 

 
Sec. 907.2.3; change to read as follows: 

Sec. 907.2.3 Group E. A manual fire alarm system shall be installed in Group E occupancies.  When automatic sprinkler systems or smoke detectors are installed, such systems or detectors shall be connected to the building fire alarm system.  An approved smoke detection system shall be installed in Group E day care.  Where automatic fire sprinklers are not required, a full-coverage smoke detection system shall be provided in all Group E occupancies.  Unless separated by a minimum of 100 feet open space, all buildings, whether portable buildings or the main building, will be considered one building for alarm occupant load consideration and interconnection of alarm systems. 


Sec. 907.2.3 is amended to read as follows:   


Sec. 907.2.3; change exception 1 and add exception 1.1 to read as follows: 


1.
Group E educational and day care occupancies with an occupant load of less than 50 when provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system.  


1.1
Residential In-Home day care with not more than 12 children may use interconnected single station detectors in all habitable rooms.  (For care of more than five children 2 ½ or less years of age, see Section 907.2.6)  


Sec. 907.2.6 of the International Fire Code is amended by the addition of the following: 

Sec. 907.2.6.3  Group I 4 Occupancies.  An approved smoke detection system shall be installed in Group I 4 occupancies where automatic fire sprinklers are not required, a full-coverage smoke detection system shall be provided in all Group I 4 occupancies. 


Sec. 907.2.12; change to read as follows: 

Sec. 907.2.12 High-rise buildings.  Buildings having floors used for human occupancy located more than 55 feet (16,764 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access shall be provided with an approved automatic fire alarm system and an emergency voice/alarm communication system in accordance with Section 907.2.12.2. 


Sec. 907.2.12, exception # 3; change to read as follows: 


3.  
Buildings with an occupancy in Group A-5 in accordance with Section 303.1 of the International Building Code, when used for open air seating; however, this exception does not apply to accessory uses including but not limited to sky boxes, restaurants and similarly enclosed areas. 

 
Sec. 907.4 is amended by the addition of the following: 


Sec. 907.4.6 Manual alarm actuating devices shall be an approved double action type. 


Add Sec. 907.6.1 to read as follows: 

Sec. 907.6.1 Installation.  All fire alarm systems shall be installed in such a manner that the failure of any single alarm-actuating or alarm-indicating devices will not interfere with the normal operation of any other such devices.  All systems shall be Class “A” wired with a minimum of six feet separation between supply and return loops.  IDC – Class “A” style – D – SLC Class “A” Style 6 – notification Class “B” Style Y. 


Sec. 907.9.2; change to read as follows: 

Sec. 907.9.2 High-rise buildings.  In buildings that have floors located more than 55 feet (16,764 mm) above the ….{remainder of the section unchanged}. 

Sec. 1504.6 to read as follows: 

Sec. 1504.6 Fire Protection.  New and existing spray booths and spray rooms shall be protected by an approved automatic fire-extinguishing system … {remainder of section unchanged}  complying with Chapter 9 which shall also protect all exhaust plenums, exhaust ducts and both sides of dry filters when such filters are used. 


Standby personnel. 


Sec. 2404.20; change to read as follows: 

Sec. 2404.20 Standby personnel/Crowd managers.  When, in the opinion of the code official, it is essential for public safety in a place of assembly or any other place where people congregate, because of the number of persons, or the nature of the performance, exhibition, display, contest or activity, the owner, agent or lessee shall employ approved standby personnel, to remain on duty during the times such places are open to the public, or when such activity is being conducted. 

Before each performance or the start of such activity, standby personnel shall keep diligent watch for fires during the time such place is open to the public or such activity is being conducted and take prompt measures as directed by the Fire Marshal.  Such duties may include, but not be limited to, extinguishment of fires that occur and assist in the evacuation of the public from the structure. 

There shall be trained crowd managers or crowd manager supervisors at a ratio as designated by the Fire Chief, or Fire Marshal. 


Fireworks.  


Sec. 3404.2.9.5.1 is amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 3404.2.9.5.1 Location Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The storage of flammable or combustible liquids in outside above ground tanks is prohibited within each and every zoning district within the City of Texas City with the exception of those districts which are zoned for light industrial zoning use.  Installation of above ground tanks in all zoning districts shall be permitted at the discretion of the Fire Marshal following his review of the proposed installation location, and the fire protection for the storage area.  Tanks shall not be located within one hundred feet (100’) of the property line of any Group E, I or R occupancies.  

  Sec. 3406.5.4.5 and 3406.5.4.5.1 through 3406.5.4.5.3 to read as follows: 

Sec. 3406.5.4.5 Commercial, industrial, governmental or manufacturing.  Dispensing of Class II and III motor vehicle fuel from tank vehicles into the fuel tanks of motor vehicles located at commercial, industrial, governmental or manufacturing establishments is allowed where permitted, provided such dispensing operations are conducted in accordance with Sections 3406.5.4.5.1 through 3406.5.4.5.3. 


Section 3406.5.4.5.1 Site requirements. 


1.
Dispensing may occur at sites that have been permitted to conduct mobile fueling.  


2.
A detailed site plan shall be submitted with each application for a permit.  The site plan must indicate:  



a) All buildings, structures, and appurtenances on site and their use or function; 



b) All uses adjacent to the property lines of the site; 



c) The locations of all storm drain openings, adjacent waterways or wetlands; 



d) Information regarding slope, natural drainage, curbing, impounding and how a 
spill will be retained upon the site property; and, 



e) The scale of the site plan.  

            3.
The Code Official is authorized to impose limits upon: but not limited to the times and/or days during which mobile fueling operations are allowed to take place, and specific locations on a site where fueling is permitted.  


4.
Mobile fueling operations shall be conducted in areas not generally accessible to the public.  Mobile fueling shall not take place with 15 feet (4.572 m) of buildings, property lines, or combustible storage.  


Sec. 3406.5.4.5.2 Refueling Operator Requirements. 

            1.
The owner of a mobile fueling operation shall provide to the jurisdiction a written response plan which demonstrates financial ability, readiness to respond to a fuel spill, carry out appropriate mitigation measures, and to indicate its process to properly dispose of contaminated materials when circumstances require.  


2.
The tank vehicle shall comply with the requirements of NFPA 385 and Local, State and Federal requirements. The tank vehicle’s specific functions shall include that of supplying fuel to motor vehicle fuel tanks.  The vehicle and all its equipment shall be maintained in good repair.  


3.
Signs prohibiting smoking or open flames within 25 feet (7.62 m) of the tank vehicle or the point of fueling shall be prominently posted on 3 sides of the vehicle including the back and both sides.  


4.
A fire extinguisher with a minimum rating of 40:BC shall be provided on the vehicle with signage clearly indicating its location.  


5.
The dispensing nozzles and hoses shall be of an approved and listed type.  


6.
The dispensing hose shall not be extended from the reel more than 100 feet (30.48m) in length.  


7.
Absorbent materials, non-water absorbent pads, a 10 foot (3.048 m) long containment boom, and approved container with lid, and a non-metallic shovel shall be provided to mitigate a minimum 5-gallon fuel spill.  


8.
Tanker vehicles shall be equipped with a fuel limit switch such as a count-back switch, limiting the amount of a single fueling operation to a maximum of 500 gallons (1,893 L) between re-settings of the limit switch.  



Exception:  Tankers utilizing remote emergency shut-off device capability where 


the operator constantly carries the shut-off device which, when activated, 



immediately causes flow of fuel from the tanker to cease. 


9.
Persons responsible for dispensing operations shall be trained in the appropriate mitigating actions in the event of fire, leak, or spill.  Training records shall be maintained by the dispensing company and shall be made available to the Code Official upon request.  

10.
Operators of tank vehicles used for mobile fueling operations shall have in their possession at all times an approved emergency communications device to notify  the proper authorities in the event of an emergency.  


Sec. 3406.5.4.5.3 Operational Requirements. 


1.
The tank vehicle dispensing equipment shall be constantly attended and operated only by designated personnel who are trained to handle and dispense motor fuels.  


2.
Prior to beginning dispensing operations, precautions shall be taken to assure ignition sources are not present.  


3.
The engines of vehicles being fueled shall be shut off during dispensing operations.  


4.
Night time fueling operations shall only take place in adequately lighted areas.  


5.
The tank vehicle shall be positioned with respect to vehicles being fueled so as to preclude traffic from driving over the delivery hose and between the tank vehicle and the motor vehicle being fueled.  


6.
During fueling operations, tank vehicle brakes shall be set, chock blocks shall be in place and warning lights shall be in operation.  


7.
Motor vehicle fuel tanks shall not be topped off.  


8.
The dispensing hose shall be properly placed on an approved reel or in an approved compartment prior to moving the tank vehicle.  


9.
The Code Official and other appropriate authorities shall be notified when any reportable spill or unauthorized discharge occurs.  


Flammable Gas. 


Sec. 3504.2 shall be amended by the addition of the following: 

Sec. 3504.2 Maximum capacity within established limits. Tanks shall not be located  within one hundred feet (100’) of the property line of any Group A, E, I, or R occupancies. 


Sec. 3804.2 is amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 3804.2  Maximum capacity within established limits.  Above ground storage of LP gas is prohibited within each and every zoning district within the City of Texas City.  Installation of above ground tanks shall be permitted only at the discretion of the Fire Marshal following his review of the proposed installation location, and the fire protection for the storage area.  Storage shall not be located within one hundred feet (100’) of the property line of E, A, I, or R occupancies. 

Appendix A shall be amended to read as follows:

Amended Appendix A

BOARD OF APPEALS
A101.1 Scope. A board of appeals shall be established within the jurisdiction to conduct hearings to decide if modifications comply with the intent of the protection required by the International Fire Code pursuant to the provisions of Section 108 of the International Fire Code. The board shall be established and operated in accordance with this section, and shall be authorized to hear evidence from appellants and the fire code official pertaining to the application and intent of this code for the purpose of issuing orders pursuant to these provisions. 



 

A101.2 Membership. The membership of the board shall consist of three voting members having the qualifications established by this section. Members shall be nominated by the fire code official or the chief administrative officer of the jurisdiction, subject to confirmation by a majority vote of the governing body.  Members shall serve without remuneration or compensation, and may be removed from office prior to the end of their appointed terms with recommendation of the fire code official or the chief administrative officer of the jurisdiction, subject to confirmation by a majority vote of the governing body.






 

  PREFERRED MEMBERS EXPERIENCE

 A101.2.1 Design Professional One member shall be a practicing design professional 

 Registered in the practice of engineering or architecture in the state in which the board is established.



A101.2.2 Fire Protection engineering professional.  A qualified engineer, technologist, technician or safety professional trained in fire protection engineering, fire science or fire technology.  Qualified representatives in this category shall include fire protection contractors and certified technicians engaged in fire protection system design.







 A101.2.3 Industrial safety professional.  Registered industrial or chemical engineer, certified hygienist, certified safety professional, certified hazardous materials manager or comparably qualified specialist experienced in chemical process safety or industrial safety.

 A101.2.4 General Contractor. Regularly engaged in the construction, alteration, maintenance, repair or remodeling of buildings or building services and systems regulated by the code.

 A101.2.5 General industry or business representative. Business or industry not represented by a member from one of the other categories of board members described above.

A101.3 Terms of office. Members shall be appointed for terms of four years.  No member shall be reappointed to serve more than two consecutive full terms.

 A101.4 Quorum. Two members of the board shall constitute a quorum. In varying the application of any provisions of this code or in modifying an order of the fire code official, affirmative votes of the majority present, but not less than two, shall be required.

A101.5 Secretary of board. The City Secretary or designee shall act as secretary of the board and shall keep a detailed record of all its proceedings, which shall set forth the reasons for its decisions, the vote of each member, the absence of a member and any failure of a member to vote.

A101.6 Legal counsel. The jurisdiction shall furnish legal counsel to the board to provide members with general legal advice concerning matters before them for consideration Members shall be represented by legal counsel at the jurisdiction’s expense in all matters arising from service within the scope of their duties.

A101.7 Meetings.  The board shall meet at regular intervals, or as needed to be determined by the chairman.  In any event, the board shall meet within 10 days after notice of appeal has been received.

A101.8 Conflict of interest. Members with a material or financial interest in a matter before the board shall declare such interest and refrain from participating in discussions, deliberations, and voting on such matters

A101.9 Decisions. Every decision shall be promptly filed in writing in the office of the fire code official and shall be open writing in the office of the fire code official and shall be open to public inspection.   Decisions are limited to code requirements and    must provide equal or greater protection.  A copy shall be sent by e-mail or other-wise to the appellant, and a copy shall be kept publicly posted in the office of the fire code official.

A101.10  Procedures. The board shall be operated in accordance with the Administrative Procedures Act of the state in which it is established or shall establish rules and regulations for its own procedure not inconsistent with the provisions of  this code and applicable state law.

The Fire Code shall be amended by the addition of the following: 


Authorizing suites for injunctive relief.  

Notwithstanding any penal provision of this Ordinance, the City Attorney is authorized to file on behalf of the City of Texas City, the Fire Chief or his authorized representative, or both for injunctive relief as may be necessary to enforce the provisions of this Ordinance.”

Except as expressly amended herein, the original language of the International Fire Code, 2006, including appendices, shall remain unchanged.
SECTION 3:  That all ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of this Ordinance are hereby repealed.  In the event any section, clause, sentence, paragraph, or part of this Ordinance shall be for any reason adjudged by any court of competent jurisdiction to be invalid, such invalidity shall not affect, invalidate, or impair the remainder of this Ordinance.
SECTION 4:
That this Ordinance shall be read on three (3) separate days and shall become effective upon its final reading, passage, and adoption.
SECTION 5:
That this Ordinance shall be finally passed upon the date of its introduction and shall become effective from and after its passage and adoption and publication by caption only in the official newspaper of the City.
PASSED ON FIRST READING this 17th day of December, 2008.

________________________

Matthew T. Doyle, Mayor 


City of Texas City, Texas

ATTEST:

_______________________________

Pamela A. Lawrence

City Secretary


PASSED ON SECOND READING this 7th day of January, 2009.







_________________________

Matthew T. Doyle, Mayor 


City of Texas City, Texas

ATTEST:

_______________________________

Pamela A. Lawrence

City Secretary


PASSED AND FINALLY ADOPTED this 21st day of January, 2009.


________________________


Matthew T. Doyle, Mayor 



City of Texas City, Texas

ATTEST:





APPROVED AS TO FORM:

________________________


_______________________

Pamela A. Lawrence




Robert Gervais

City Secretary





City Attorney
------------------------------------------------

L:Ordinances/08-56 Fire Code and Amendments
7
Version 3

