
RESOLUTION NO. 09-022
A RESOLUTION AWARDING A BID AND AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ENTER INTO AN ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE AND JOINT SEALER; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS RESOLUTION SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS PASSAGE AND ADOPTION. 

WHEREAS, on February 17, 2009, two (2) bid packets were mailed to area vendors for the purchase and delivery of Reinforced Concrete Pipe and Joint Sealer,  Bid No. 2009-929; and

WHEREAS, bids opened on March 6, 2009, and the lowest bids received meeting specifications for the unit prices bid were submitted by Hanson Pipe and Precast, Houston, Texas and South Houston Concrete Pipe Co., Inc., South Houston, Texas, as set out on the attached Exhibit “A”, and made a part hereof.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE CITY OF TEXAS CITY, TEXAS:

SECTION 1: That the successful bidder for the purchase and delivery of Reinforced Concrete Pipe and Joint Sealer, Bid No. 2009-929, are:

Hanson Pipe and Precast, Houston, Texas
Item #s: 1, 2, 3, 4, 5 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11 and 12
Custom Stone Supply, Texas City 

Item #s 13, 14 and 15

SECTION 2: That the Mayor is hereby authorized to enter into an annual contract with Hanson Pipe and Precast, Houston, Texas and South Houston Concrete Pipe Co., Inc., South Houston, Texas for the purchase and delivery of Reinforced Concrete Pipe and Joint Sealer, Bid No. 2009-929, for the respective unit prices bid in Exhibit “A”, as attached hereto and incorporated herein for all intents and purposes.


SECTION 3:
That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and adoption.


PASSED AND ADOPTED this 18th day of March, 2009.








                                            








Matthew T. Doyle, Mayor 









City of Texas City, Texas
ATTEST:





APPROVED AS TO FORM:


                                                     
 
_____________________________      

Pamela A. Lawrence




Robert Gervais

City Secretary





City Attorney
EXHIBIT “A”

BID TABULATION

Bid # 2009-929

Reinforced Concrete Pipe

And Joint Sealer Annual Contract

Bid Opening: Friday, March 6, 2009 @ 2:00 p.m.

	ITEM

#
	Appx.

QTY
	Hanson Pipe and Precast

Houston, Texas
	South Houston Concrete Pipe Co., Inc.

South Houston, Texas
	Previous contract

prices

	1) 1”

Joint Sealer
	2 

boxes
	$32.50
	$40.00
	$33.00

	2) 1 ½”

Joint Sealer
	10 

boxes
	$35.03
	$50.00
	$43.00

	3) 1 ¾”

Joint Sealer
	5 

boxes
	37.50
	NO BID
	------

	4) 12“

Pipe
	125

LF
	$11.62
	$14.50
	$11.75

	5) 15” 

Pipe
	425

LF
	$14.16
	$17.00
	$14.25

	6) 18”

Pipe
	250

LF
	$16.57
	$20.00
	$16.50

	7) 24”

Pipe
	200

LF
	$21.58
	$26.50
	$21.75

	8) 30”

Pipe
	150

LF
	$29.90
	$37.00
	$30.50

	9) 36”

Pipe
	250

LF
	$45.28
	$56.00
	$46.50

	10) 42”

Pipe
	200

LF
	$59.20
	NO BID
	------

	11) 48”

Pipe
	10

LF
	$70.88
	NO BID
	------

	12) 54”

Pipe
	20

LF
	$86.39
	NO BID
	------

	13) 12” Catch Basin
	5

each
	$375.00
	$100.00
	$85.00

	14) 18” Catch Basin
	10

each
	$430.00
	$275.00
	$250.00

	15) 24” Catch Basin
	10

each
	$545.00
	$350.00
	$325.00
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