BID TABULATION
Bid #2009-937
EMERGENCY PHARMACEUTICALS, MEDICAL SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT 
ANNUAL CONTRACT
Bid Opening: Monday, May 18, 2009 @ 2:00 p.m.
	Bound Tree Medical , LLC

Dublin, Ohio
	Physio-Control, Inc.

Redmond, WA
	Midwest Medical Supply Co., LLC

Earth City, MO
	Previous

Contract

	PRIVATE 
Section 1


	$853.73
	No Bid
	$378.73 (IC)
	$1,314.80

	Section 2


	$18.35
	No Bid
	$24.4334
	$124.37

	Section 3


	$229.52
	No Bid
	$202.6513
	$207.27

	Section 4


	$1,187.42
	No Bid
	$1,220.24
	$1,269.85

	Section 5


	$816.73
	No Bid
	$396.66 (IC)
	$885.70

	Section 6


	$31.01
	No Bid
	$19.387 (IC)
	$108.81

	Section 7
	$9,811.32


	$100.73 (IC)


	$7,231.62 (IC)
	$10,171.60

	Section 8
	No Bid


	$3,709.00


	No Bid
	$2,167.00

	Section 9
	No Bid


	$20,655.73


	No Bid
	$9,561.85

	Section 10
	$420.91


	No Bid


	$734.50 (IC)
	New Section

	Delivery


	2 Days
	Disposables: 15 Days

Defibrillator/Monitors: 

45 Days
	2-7 Days
	


IC – Incomplete: did not bid on all items in section.

