BID TABULATION

Bid # 2010-948
Water and Sewer System Repairs Annual Contract
Bid Opening: Monday, November 2, 2009 @ 2:00 p.m.

	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	PREVIOUS PRICING
AMOUNT EACH

	No.
	DESCRIPTION OF WORK
	D. Wagner Construction
	Huff & Mitchell, Inc.
	Hugh Patrick
	

	1
	Rubber Tire Backhoe with Operator


	$65.00

$63,375.00
QTY 975 HRS
	$64.00

$62,400.00

QTY 975 HRS
	NO BID
	$65.00

	2
	Hydraulic Hammer 1,000 lb.

to include Rubber Tire Backhoe with Operator
	$120.00

$2,880.00
QTY 24 HRS
	$115.00

$2,760.00

QTY 24 HRS
	
	$120.00

	3


	Tracked Excavator 26,000 lbs.

with Operator
	$110.00

$8,880.00
QTY 80 HRS
	$118.00

$9,440.00

QTY 80 HRS
	
	$110.00

	4
	Tracked Excavator 27,000 – 35,000 lbs. with Operator
	$110.00

$33,000.00
QTY 300 HRS
	$125.00

$37,500.00

QTY 300 HRS
	
	$130.00

	5


	Tracked Excavator 36,000 lbs. and up with Operator
	$148.00

$11,840.00
QTY 80 HRS
	$143.00

$11,440.00

QTY 80 HRS
	
	$148.00

	6
	Articulated Front End Loader

with Operator
	$80.00

$14,400.00
QTY 180 HRS
	$100.00

$18,000.00

QTY 180 HRS
	
	$106.00

	7
	Dozer – 70 HP

With Operator
	$77.00

$3,080.00
QTY 40 HRS
	$75.00

$3,000.00

QTY 40 HRS
	
	$77.00


	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	PREVIOUS PRICING

AMOUNT EACH

	No.
	DESCRIPTION OF WORK
	D. Wagner Construction
	Huff & Mitchell, Inc.
	Hugh Patrick
	

	8
	½ Ton Pick-up Truck

Hourly rate is for Pick-Up Alone

Does not include labor


	$5.00

$19,000.00
QTY 3800 HRS
	$9.00

$34,200.00

QTY 3800 HRS
	NO BID
	$10.00

	9
	Stake / Flat Bed Truck

¾ Ton to One Ton-material hauling only
	$5.00

$1,400.00
QTY 280 HRS
	$18.00

$5,040.00

QTY 280 HRS
	
	$20.00

	10
	Stake / Flat Bed Truck

with Dump Body w/ operator

1.5 Ton to 2.5 Ton
	$30.00

$5,100.00
QTY 170 HRS
	$28.00

$4,760.00

QTY 170 HRS
	
	$30.00

	11
	Dump Truck – 6 to 8 yard

Single Axle with Operator
	$32.00

$1,280.00
QTY 40 HRS
	$34.00

$1,360.00

QTY 40 HRS
	
	$32.00

	12
	Dump Truck – 12 to 14 yard

Tandem Axle with Operator
	$45.00

$1,080.00
QTY 24 HRS
	$42.00

$1,008.00

QTY 24 HRS
	
	$45.00

	13
	Well Pointing System

For 0 to 20 LF in length (0 to 18 feet deep

Per Week
	$30.00

$6,000.00
QTY 200 LF
	$30.00

$6,000.00

QTY 200 LF
	
	$30.00

	14
	Well Pointing System

For lengths over 20 LF (0 to 18 feet depth)

Per Week
	$21.00

$2,100.00
QTY 100 LF
	$20.00

$2,000.00

QTY 100 LF
	
	$21.00


	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	PREVIOUS PRICING

AMOUNT EACH

	No.
	DESCRIPTION OF WORK
	D. Wagner Construction
	Huff & Mitchell, Inc.
	Hugh Patrick
	

	15
	Traffic Devices for Lane Closure or Detours.  One lot necessary to control traffic WITHOUT Flashers.
	$40.00

$7,000.00
QTY 175 DAYS
	$39.00

$6,825.00

QTY 175 DAYS
	NO BID
	$40.00

	16
	Traffic Devices for Lane Closure or Detours. One lot necessary to control traffic WITH Flashers.
	$75.00

$3,000.00
QTY 40 DAYS
	$240.00

$9,600.00

QTY 40 DAYS
	
	$255.00

	17


	4” Pump with Hose

20 feet Suction

100 feet Discharge
	$17.00

$11,900.00
QTY 700 HRS
	$6.00

$4,200.00

QTY 700 HRS
	
	$7.00

	18
	Air Compressor up to 185 CFM with 100’ of hose
	$28.00

$672.00
QTY 24 HRS
	$26.00

$624.00

QTY 24 HRS
	
	$28.00

	19


	30# Pneumatic Chipping Hammer
	$10.00

$240.00
QTY 24 HRS
	$9.00

$216.00

QTY 24 HRS
	
	$10.00

	20
	90# Pneumatic Pavement Breaker


	$14.00

$336.00
QTY 24 HRS
	$13.00

$312.00

QTY 24 HRS
	
	$14.00

	21
	Trench Shoring Box

5 feet to 10 feet depth

UNDER 14 feet in length
	$800.00

$4,000.00
QTY 5 WEEKS
	$780.00

$3,900.00

QTY 5 WEEKS
	
	$800.00

	22
	Trench Shoring Box

11 feet to 16 feet depth

UNDER 14 feet in length
	$900.00

$3,600.00
QTY 4  WEEKS
	$880.00

$3,520.00

QTY 4 WEEKS
	
	$900.00


	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	PREVIOUS PRICING

AMOUNT EACH

	No.
	DESCRIPTION OF WORK
	D. Wagner Construction
	Huff & Mitchell, Inc.
	Hugh Patrick


	

	23
	Trench Shoring Box

5 feet to 10 feet depth

OVER 14 feet in length
	$800.00

$1,600.00
QTY 2 WEEKS
	$780.00

$1,560.00

QTY 2 WEEKS
	NO BID
	$800.00

	24
	Trench Shoring Box

11 feet to 16 feet depth

OVER 14 feet in length
	$1,000.00

$2,000.00
QTY 2 WEEKS
	$980.00

$1,960.00

QTY 2 WEEKS
	
	$1,000.00

	25
	Hydraulic Trench Shoring

all Depths
	$80.00

$1,600.00
QTY 20 DAYS
	$150.00

$3,000.00

QTY 20 DAYS
	
	$160.00

	26
	Portable Cutoff Saw

to include blades
	$6.00

$8,940.00
QTY 1490 HRS.
	$5.00

$7,450.00

QTY 1490 HRS
	
	$5.00

	27
	Pipe Laser

with Accessories
	$10.00

$400.00
QTY 40 HRS
	$9.00

$ 360.00

QTY 40 HRS
	
	$10.00

	28
	Compactor

19” X 24”  or  20” X 24” Plate

10” X 13”  or  11” X 13” Shoe
	$10.00

$400.00
QTY 40 HRS
	$9.00

$ 360.00

QTY 40 HRS
	
	$10.00

	29
	Mobilization

Transportation of equipment to and from job site - One per job.
	$1,000.00

$40,000.00
QTY 40 EA.
	$950.00

$38,000.00

QTY 40 EA.
	
	$1,000.00

	30
	Laborer – Utility


	$17.00

$68,000.00
QTY 4000 HRS
	$16.50

$66,000.00

QTY 4000 HRS
	
	$17.00


	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	PREVIOUS PRICING

AMOUNT EACH

	No.
	DESCRIPTION OF WORK
	D. Wagner Construction
	Huff & Mitchell, Inc.
	Hugh Patrick
	

	31
	Pipe Layer


	$19.00

$26,600.00
QTY 1400 HRS
	$18.00

$25,200.00

QTY 1400 HRS
	NO BID
	$19.00

	32
	Foreman / Crew Leader


	$32.00

$64,000.00
QTY 2000 HRS
	$31.00

$62,000.00

QTY 2000 HRS
	
	$32.00

	33
	Cement Finisher


	$25.00

$5,750.00
QTY 230 HRS
	$24.00

$5,520.00

QTY 230 HRS
	
	$25.00

	34
	Carpenter


	$25.00

$3,000.00
QTY 120 HRS
	$24.00

$2,880.00

QTY 120 HRS
	
	$25.00

	35
	Truck Driver


	$20.00

$800.00
QTY 40 HRS
	$18.00

$720.00

QTY 40 HRS
	
	$20.00

	36
	Welder


	$60.00

$1,440.00
QTY 24 HRS
	$55.00

$1,320.00

QTY 24 HRS
	
	$60.00

	37
	Operator


	$27.00

$648.00
QTY 24 HRS
	$26.00

$ 624.00

QTY 24 HRS
	
	$27.00

	38
	Superintendent


	$45.00

$13,500.00
QTY 300 HRS
	$44.00

$13,200.00

QTY 300 HRS
	
	$45.00


	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	PREVIOUS PRICING

AMOUNT EACH

	No.
	DESCRIPTION OF WORK
	D. Wagner Construction
	Huff & Mitchell, Inc.
	Hugh Patrick
	

	39
	Service Replacement with Cleanouts up to 8’ of service line to include up to 8 feet of Main installed all depths, complete in place, labor and equipment by Contractor.  Material by Owner.  (Sanitary Sewer)
	$2,500.00

$50,000.00
QTY 20 EACH
	$4,500.00

$90,000.00

QTY 20 EACH
	NO BID
	$5,000.00

	40
	Additional Length of Service Line.

All depths complete in place.  (Sanitary Sewer)
	$25.00

$1,250.00
QTY 50 LF
	$24.00

$1,200.00

QTY 50 LF
	
	$25.00

	41
	Remove existing fire hydrant and install new fire hydrant, all depths, complete in place.  Labor and equipment by Contractor.  Materials by Owner.
	$1,500.00

$7,500.00
QTY 5 EACH
	$1,600.00

$8,000.00

QTY 5 EACH
	
	$1,700.00

	42
	Install Fire Hydrant Assembly

all Depths complete in place.  Labor and equipment by Contractor.  Materials by Owner.  (Includes valve and box)
	$1,500.00

$3,000.00
QTY 2 EACH
	$1,450.00

$2,900.00

QTY 2 EACH
	
	$1,500.00

	43
	Install 6-8 inch Valve and Valve Box, all Depths, complete in place.  Labor and equipment by Contractor.  Materials by Owner.
	$600.00

$4,200.00
QTY 7 EACH
	$590.00

$4,130.00

QTY 7 EACH
	
	$600.00

	44
	Wet Connection.  Labor and equipment by Contractor.  Materials by Owner.
	$1,500.00

$7,500.00
QTY 5 EACH
	$1,490.00

$7,450.00

QTY 5 EACH
	
	$1,500.00

	45
	Install 6”-8” PVC C-900 Waterline in Open Cut, all Depths. Complete in place. Labor and equipment by Contractor.  Materials by Owner.
	$20.00

$20,000.00
QTY 1000 LF
	$28.00

$28,000.00

QTY 1000 LF
	
	$30.00


	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	PREVIOUS PRICING

AMOUNT EACH

	No.
	DESCRIPTION OF WORK
	D. Wagner Construction
	Huff & Mitchell, Inc.
	Hugh Patrick
	

	46
	Install 6” to 8” Sanitary Sewer Open Cut 5’-10’ deep, complete in place.  Labor and equipment by Contractor.  Materials by Owner
	$50.00

$5,000.00
QTY 100 LF
	$58.00

$5,800.00

QTY 100 LF
	NO BID
	$60.00

	47
	Install 10-18 inches Sanitary Sewer Open Cut 5’-10’ deep, complete in place.  Labor and equipment by Contractor.  Materials by Owner.
	$55.00

$5,500.00
QTY 100 LF
	$62.00

$6,200.00

QTY 100 LF
	
	$65.00

	48
	Concrete Pavement Replacement including Saw Cut, complete in place.  Labor and equipment by Contractor.  Materials by Owner.  (Street)
	$20.00

$10,000.00
QTY 500 SF
	$24.00

$12,000.00

QTY 500 SF
	
	$25.00

	49
	Install 1 ½ inch Water Service Taps for dual meter box.  All depths complete in place.  Equipment and labor by Contractor.  Materials by Owner – Long.  No open cut, use boring or other means.
	$660.00

$33,000.00
QTY 50 EACH
	$650.00

$32,500.00

QTY 50 EA
	
	$660.00

	50
	Install 1 ½ inch Water Service Taps for dual meter box.  All depths complete in place.  Equipment and labor by Contractor.  Materials by Owner – Short
	$400.00

$20,000.00
QTY 50 EACH
	$390.00

$19,500.00

QTY 50 EACH
	
	$400.00


	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	VENDOR
	PREVIOUS PRICING

AMOUNT EACH

	No.
	DESCRIPTION OF WORK
	D. Wagner Construction
	
	Hugh Patrick
	

	51
	Install 1 inch Water Service Taps for single meter box.  All depths complete in place.  Equipment and labor by Contractor.  Materials by Owner – Long.  No open cut, use boring or other means.
	$660.00

$33,000.00
QTY 50 EACH
	$650.00

$32,500.00

QTY 50 EACH


	NO BID
	$660.00

	52
	Install 1 inch Water Service Taps for single meter box.  All depths complete in place.  Equipment and labor by Contractor.  Materials by Owner – Short
	$400.00

$20,000.00
QTY 50 EACH
	$390.00

$19,500.00

QTY 50 EACH
	
	400.00



	53
	Performance Bond


	$10,127.00
QTY LUMP SUM
	$10,800.00

QTY LUMP SUM
	
	12,421.00

	
	TOTAL

BID AMOUNT 1 through 53
	$672,838.00
	$738,739.00
	
	------

	
	Overtime Rate - % of ST


	150%
	1.5%
	
	

	
	Minimum Call Out – hours


	8 hrs
	6 hrs
	
	

	
	Incidental Material Markup - % of cost
	21%
	18%
	
	

	
	Incidental Rental Equipment Markup - % of cost
	21%
	18%
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