BID TABULATION

BID #2010-949 

Police Department Uniforms Annual Contract

Bid Opening: Wednesday, November 4, 2009 @ 2:00 p.m.

	QTY
	DESCRIPTION
	Lone Star Uniforms
	Tyler Uniform, Inc.
	Prodefense 
	GT Distributors - Disqualified
	Previous 

Contract Price

	12

each
	Standard Duty - Patrol

Short Sleeve Shirt-Light Blue Female w/Zipper           Elbeco #Z9813
	$32.00

$384.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$28.15
$337.80


	$28.50



	4

each
	Standard Duty - Patrol

Long Sleeve Shirt-Light Blue Female w/Zipper           Elbeco #Z9313
	$34.00

$136.00
	
	
	$31.15
$124.60
	$32.00



	200 each


	Standard Duty - Patrol

Short Sleeve Shirt-Light Blue Male w/Zipper               Elbeco #Z3313-3
	$32.00

$6,400.00
	
	
	$28.15
$5,630.00
	$28.50



	200 each
	Standard Duty - Patrol

Long Sleeve Shirt-Light Blue Male w/Zipper               Elbeco #Z313
	$34.00

$6,800.00
	
	
	$31.15
$6,230.00
	$32.00



	100 each


	Standard Duty - Patrol

Trousers Male/Female

Elbeco
	$30.00

$3,000.00
	
	
	$30.06
$3,006.00
	$30.00



	10 each
	Uniform Hat
	$36.00

$3600
	
	
	$48.56
$485.60
	$32.50



	25 each


	Raincoat with “Police” screen printed on back

Neese 1650C or Equal
	$14.00

$350.00
	
	
	$8.42
$210.50


	$12.00




	QTY
	DESCRIPTION
	Lone Star Uniforms
	Tyler Uniform, Inc.
	Prodefense 
	GT Distributors – 
Disqualified
	Previous 

Contract Price

	25 each


	Convertible Jacket

Blauer 6026 or Equal
	$90.00

$2,250.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	No Bid
	$80.00



	  20 

 Each 


	Badge-Patrolman

Rhodium

Blackinton #B879
	$85.00

$1,700.00
	
	
	$48.80

$996.00
	$80.00



	20

each
	Badge – Sergeant 
& above Gold

Blackinton # B879
	$85.00

$1,700.00
	
	
	$55.37
$1,107.40


	$59.00



	20

Each
	Badge – Hat B720

Must match 
# B879 Badge
	$72.00

$1,440.00
	
	
	$47.41
$948.20
	$72.00



	20

Each
	Uniform Tie

Samuel Broome #90010
	$4.00

$80.00
	
	
	$3.25

$65.00
	$4.00



	20

Each
	Name Plate

Blackinton Style J1
	$9.00

$180.00
	
	
	$6.18

$123.60
	$8.50



	20

Each
	Collar Brass

Blackinton Style 

#15 cut out letters
	$14.00

$280.00
	
	
	$18.78
$375.60
	$14.00



	20 

Each
	Body Armor

Gatorhawk 

style G-LITE-2
	$500.00

$10,000.00


	
	
	No Bid
	$475.00



	20 each
	Reflective Vest

Blauer style # 339
	$45.00

$900.00
	
	
	$38.70
$774.00
	$40.00



	20

Each
	Duty Belt

Safariland 2.25”
	$55.00

$1,100.00
	
	
	$42.19
$843.80
	$55.15



	20

Each
	Holster - Duty

Safariland 6280
	$115.00

$2,300.00
	
	
	$90.89
$1,817.80
	$110.65



	20

Each
	Holster – No Light Duty

Safariland 6280
	$105.00

$2,100.00
	
	
	$83.22
$1,664.40
	$104.00




	QTY
	DESCRIPTION
	Lone Star Uniforms
	Tyler Uniform, Inc.
	Prodefense 
	GT Distributors – 
Disqualified
	Previous

 Contract Price

	  20

each
	Mag Case – double

Safariland
	$29.00
$580.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	            $23.13
           $462.60
	$23.40



	20

each
	Cuff Case – double w/snaps Safariland
	$34.00

$680.00
	
	
	           $25.18
         $503.60 
	$34.80



	20 each
	Cuff Case – single w/snaps Safariland
	$27.00
$540.00
	
	
	$17.89
$357.80
	$18.75



	20 each
	Keepers – single w/snaps
	$4.00

$80.00
	
	
	$2.04
$40.80
	$1.75



	20

each
	Flashlight Holder Ring

SL20
	$10.00

$200.00
	
	
	$5.75
$115.00
	$3.60



	20

each
	Baton

21” Monadnock expandable w/
friction lock
	$95.00

$1,900.00
	
	
	$52.87
$1,057.40
	$54.00



	20

each
	Baton Holder

21” expandable
	$23.00

$460.00
	
	
	$14.28
$285.60
	$16.25



	20

each
	OC Case – for 2oz canister
	$23.00

$460.00
	
	
	$17.89

$357.80
	$18.75



	20

each
	Flashlight Holder – for Stinger flashlight
	$24.00

$480.00
	
	
	$15.21
$304.20
	$12.00



	20 each
	Flashlight – Stinger w/AC charger
	$94.00

$1,880.00
	
	
	$65.24
$1,304.80
	$84.60



	20 each
	Flashlight – Streamlight

20SL LED
	$120.00

$2,400.00
	
	
	$90.44
$1,808.80
	$110.95




	QTY
	DESCRIPTION
	Lone Star Uniforms
	Tyler Uniform, Inc.
	Prodefense 
	GT Distributors – 
Disqualified
	Previous

 Contract Price

	20

each
	Radio Case w/ metal clip

Holder for Motorola

MTS-2000
	$36.00

$720.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$20.51
$410.20
	$22.95

	20

each
	Handcuffs – Smith & Wesson

Nickel Chained
	$25.00

$500.00
	
	
	$19.68
$393.60
	$22.95

	20

each
	Detention, ID & Communications

Shirt – 5.11 Tactical Series Male/Female
	$42.00

$840.00
	
	
	$35.90
$718.00
	$41.50



	  20

each
	Detention, ID & Communications

Pants – 5.11 Tactical Series Male/Female
	$36.00

$720.00
	
	
	$33.90

$678.00
	$34.00



	20

each
	Detention, ID & Communications

Jacket – Blauer 6026 
or equal
	$90.00

$1,800.00
	
	
	No Bid
	$80.00



	50 each


	K-9 BDU

Shirt Male Proper or equal
	$36.00

$1,800.00
	
	
	$23.87
$1,193.50
	$32.90



	50 each


	K-9 BDU

Pants Male Proper or equal
	$28.00

$1,400.00
	
	
	$23.89
$1,193.50
	$28.50



	50

each
	SWAT BDU

Shirt Male Proper or equal
	$36.00

$1,800.00
	
	
	$23.87
$1,193.50
	$32.90




	QTY
	DESCRIPTION
	Lone Star Uniforms
	Tyler Uniform, Inc.
	Prodefense 
	GT Distributors – 
Disqualified
	Previous

 Contract Price

	50

each
	SWAT BDU

Pants Male Proper or equal
	$28.00

$1,450.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$23.87

$1,193.50
	$28.50



	50

each
	Standard Duty - Patrol

Short Sleeve Knit Shirt

Warm Weather - Unisex
	$68.00

$3,400.00
	
	
	No Bid
	$65.00



	  20

each
	Service Award

Medal of Honor
	$10.00

$200.00
	
	
	$8.13

$162.60
	$5.00

	20

each
	Service Award

Medal of Valor
	$10.00

$200.00
	
	
	$8.13

$162.60
	$5.00

	  20

each
	Service Award

Life Saving
	$10.00

$200.00
	
	
	$8.13

$162.60
	$5.00

	20

each
	Service Award

Purple Heart
	$10.00

$200.00
	
	
	$8.13

$162.60
	$5.00

	20

each
	Service Award

Community Service
	$10.00

$200.00
	
	
	$8.13

$162.60
	$5.00

	20

each
	Service Award

Master Peace Officer
	$10.00

$200.00
	
	
	$8.13

$162.60
	$5.00

	20

each
	Service Award

Field Training Officer
	$10.00

$200.00
	
	
	$8.13

$162.60
	$5.00


	QTY
	DESCRIPTION
	Lone Star Uniforms
	Tyler Uniform, Inc.
	Prodefense 
	GT Distributors – 
Disqualified
	Previous

 Contract Price

	20

each
	Service Award

2 years
	$6.00

$120.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$8.13

$162.60
	$5.00

	20

each
	Service Award

5 years
	$6.00

$120.00
	
	
	$8.13

$162.60
	$5.00

	  20

each
	Service Award

10 years
	$6.00

$120.00
	
	
	$8.13

$162.60
	$5.00

	20

each
	Service Award

15 years
	$6.00

$120.00
	
	
	$9.10
$182.00
	$5.00

	20

each
	Service Award

20 years
	$6.00

$120.00
	
	
	$9.10
$182.00


	$5.00

	20

each
	Service Award

25 years
	$6.00

$120.00
	
	
	$10.08
$201.60


	$5.00

	20

each
	Service Award

30 years
	$6.00

$120.00
	
	
	$10.08

$201.60


	$5.00

	20

each
	Service Award Bar Holder

2 ribbon
	$3.00

$60.00
	
	
	$3.61
$72.20
	$5.00

	20

each
	Service Award Bar Holder

3 ribbon
	$3.00

$60.00
	
	
	$4.16

$83.20
	$5.00


