BID TABULATION

Stationery Annual Contract

Bid # 2011-978
Bid Opening: Monday, October 18, 2010 @ 2:00 p.m.

UNIT PRICES – PER BOX

	Description
	Dreyfus Printing
Alvin, Texas
	Speedy’s Printing
Galveston, Texas
	Houston Chronicle
Houston, Texas
	M I Printing Services
Webster, Texas
	Previous Contract

	Department Letterhead

	$105.00

$ 98.00  
$ 96.00
	NO BID


	$152.00 
$101.20 
$ 86.73
	$ 73.50
$ 58.90
$ 58.13
	$118.00

$116.50

$116.00

	Municipal Court Letterhead
	$ 71.00
	$ 48.61 
	$ 65.00
	$ 52.00
	$75.00

	Mayor’s Letterhead – 
Seal
	$ 98.00
	$ 97.22
	$128.80
	$ 60.00
	$91.00

	Mayor’s 2nd page Letterhead
	$ 35.00 
	$ 87.25
	$ 34.50
	$ 52.00
	$35.00

	Mayor’s Envelopes


	$146.00 
	$104.55
	$142.60
	$ 88.00
	$136.00

	Envelopes with multi departments ordering
	$129.50 
$124.50 
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$ 66.80

$ 64.80
	$124.00

$122.00

	Envelopes with one department ordering
	$ 99.50 
	NO BID
	$136.00
	$ 66.80
	$91.00

	Envelopes with

gold seal
	$131.00
	$104.55
	$136.00
	$ 78.00
	$138.00


UNIT PRICES – PER BOX

	Description
	Dreyfus Printing
	Speedy’s Printing

Galveston, Texas
	Houston Chronicle
Houston, Texas
	M I Printing Services

Webster, Texas
	Previous Pricing

	Window envelopes used–payable checks
	$ 34.00 
	$ 17.99
	NO BID
	$ 28.00
	$35.50

	Letter Manila

Envelopes 4 ¾ “x11”
	$104.50 
	$ 44.90
	$106.50
	$ 52.50
	$91.50

	Manila Clasp Envelopes

6.5” x 9.5”
	$ 26.00 
	$ 70.45 
	$ 36.40
	$ 80.00
	$25.50

	Manila Clasp Envelopes

9.5” x 12.5”
	$ 33.70 
	$ 77.55
	$ 39.50
	$ 70.00
	$ 33.70

	Staff Business Cards
	$ 65.00 
	NO BID
	$ 28.85
	$ 32.00


	$74.75

	Executive Mgmt. Business Cards – Seal
	$ 75.00
	$ 95.10

Disqualified – did not bid on every item
	$ 57.60

Disqualified – did not bid on every item
	$ 65.00
Disqualified – did not turn in original bid form
	$77.45


