BID TABULATION

Personnel Protective Equipment, Fire Hose, Nozzles and Related Equipment Annual Contract

Bid #2011-982
Bids opened: Monday, November 8, 2010 @ 2:00 p.m.

SECTION 1 – PERSONNEL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT
	ITEM

	Dooley Tackaberry, Inc.
Deer Park, Texas
	Ferrara Fire Apparatus Inc
Holden, La
	MES
Houston, Texas
	Metro Fire Apparatus
Houston, Texas
	NAFECO/Wilson
New Braunfels, TX
	Previous
Contract



	1.1. Bunker Jacket

32-70 Regular & Tall
	$782.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$748.90

	1.2. Bunker Pants

32-62 (XS-4X)
	$473.00
	
	
	
	
	$449.00

	Items 1 & 2 award together

Combined to match
	$1,255.00
	
	
	
	
	$1,187.85

	1.3. Suspenders
	$44.60 included at NC with set of gear
	
	
	
	
	$44.60 included at NC with set of gear

	1.4. Bunker Boots


	$129.00
	
	
	
	
	$123.10

	1.5. Helmet
	$151.35
	
	
	
	
	$152.10

	1.6. Firefighting Protective Hoods
	$176.85
	
	
	
	
	$176.85

	1.7. Protective Sock Hood for Firefighting
	$17.50
	
	
	
	
	$17.50

	1.8. Gloves
	$48.65
	
	
	
	
	$48.65


SECTION 1 – PERSONNEL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT

	ITEM
	Dooley Tackaberry, Inc.

Deer Park, Texas
	Ferrara Fire Apparatus Inc

Holden, La
	MES

Houston, Texas
	Metro Fire Apparatus

Houston, Texas
	NAFECO/Wilson

New Braunfels, TX
	Previous

Contract



	1.9. Gauntlet Style w/ Sleevemate Firefighting

Gloves
	$138.30
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$138.30

	1.10. Coveralls

Regular & Long Length
	$105.10

$131.35 2X-4X
	
	
	
	
	$105.10

$131.35

 2X-4X

	1.11. Gear Bags,

X-Large
	$42.70
	
	
	
	
	$42.70

	1.12. PASS Alarm, Motion Detector
	$431.85
	
	
	
	
	$251.70


SECTION 2 – FIRE HOSE AND NOZZLES

	ITEM


	Dooley Tackaberry, Inc.

Deer Park, Texas
	Ferrara Fire Apparatus Inc

Holden, La
	MES

Houston, Texas
	Metro Fire Apparatus

Houston, Texas
	NAFECO/Wilson

New Braunfels, TX
	Previous

Contract



	2.1. 5” x 100’ sections of supply hose
	$560.25
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$560.25

	2.2. 5” x 50’ sections of 
supply hose
	$348.30
	
	
	
	
	$348.30

	2.3. 5” x 25’ sections of supply hose
	$242.35
	
	
	
	
	$242.35

	2.4. 5 inch Stortz to 4 inch Female NST hydrant adapter
	$125.95
	
	
	
	
	$125.95

	2.5. 5 inch Stortz to 2.5 NST discharge elbow
	$125.95
	
	
	
	
	$125.95


SECTION 2 – FIRE HOSE AND NOZZLES

	ITEM


	Dooley Tackaberry, Inc.

Deer Park, Texas
	Ferrara Fire Apparatus Inc

Holden, La
	MES

Houston, Texas
	Metro Fire Apparatus

Houston, Texas
	NAFECO/Wilson

New Braunfels, TX
	Previous

Contract



	2.6. Set of four (4) spanner wrenches and holders, 5 inch Stortz
	$70.30
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$70.30

	2.7. 5 inch Stortz blind caps

with chains
	$52.25
	
	
	
	
	$61.90

	2.8. 5 inch one (1) man 
hose roller
	$118.75
	
	
	
	
	$140.65

	2.9. Ball type intake valve, 6.0 NH x 5” Stortz
	$1,076.65
	
	
	
	
	$1,141.90

	2.10. 5” screw down hose clamp with mounting bracket
	$589.65
	
	
	
	
	$530.75

	2.11. 1 ¾ “x 50’ section of attack/supply hose, double jacket
	$108.55
	
	
	
	
	$108.55

	2.12. 2” x 50’ section of attack hose
	$156.25
	
	
	
	
	$156.25

	2.13. 1’ x 50’ section of forestry hose, single jacket
	$78.45
	
	
	
	
	$78.45

	2.14. 3” x 50” section of attack/supply hose, double jacket
	$198.90
	
	
	
	
	$198.90


SECTION 2 – FIRE HOSE AND NOZZLES

	ITEM


	Dooley Tackaberry, Inc.

Deer Park, Texas
	Ferrara Fire Apparatus Inc

Holden, La
	MES

Houston, Texas
	Metro Fire Apparatus

Houston, Texas
	NAFECO/Wilson

New Braunfels, TX
	Previous

Contract



	2.15. 1 ¾” x 10’ section of attack hose, double jacket
	$41.75
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$41.75

	2.16. 3” x 20’ section of attack/supply hose, double jacket
	$112.30
	
	
	
	
	$112.30

	2.17. 6” NH x 10’ Hard Suction, Maxi-flex type
	$380.30
	
	
	
	
	$380.30

	2.18. 1.50” Adjustable Fog Nozzle, 
30-125 gpm
	$589.00
	
	
	
	
	$560.75

	2.19. 1.50” Adjustable Fog Nozzle,
 95-200 gpm
	$647.10
	
	
	
	
	$615.80

	2.20. 2.50” adjustable Fog Nozzle flow 
125-250 gpm
	$704.10
	
	
	
	
	$670.30

	2.21. 1.0” Adjustable Fog Nozzle Flow 
20-60 gpm
	$541.90
	
	
	
	
	$515.90

	2.22. 2.5” Solid Bore Triple Stacked Tips
	$229.70

	
	
	
	
	$218.55



	2.23. 1.5” Cellar Nozzle


	$307.00
	
	
	
	
	$292.30

	2.24. 2.5” Cellar Nozzle
	$394.20
	
	
	
	
	$375.15
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