
BID TABULATION 
 

Bid # 2011-989 
 

Reinforced Concrete Pipe 
And Joint Sealer Annual Contract 

 

Bid Opening: Friday, February 18, 2011 @ 2:00 p.m. 
 

ITEM 
# 

Appx. 
QTY 

Hanson Pipe and Precast 
Houston, Texas 

South Houston Concrete Pipe 
Co., Inc. 

South Houston, Texas 

Previous 
contract 
prices 

1) 1” 
Joint Sealer 

2  
boxes 

*$32.50 $40.00 $32.50 

2) 1 ½” 
Joint Sealer 

10  
boxes 

*$35.03 $50.00 $35.03 

3) 1 ¾” 
Joint Sealer 

5  
boxes 

37.50 NO BID 37.50 

4) 12“ 
Pipe 

125 
LF 

$17.00 $12.50 $11.62 

5) 15”  
Pipe 

425 
LF 

$18.70 $14.00 $14.16 

6) 18” 
Pipe 

250 
LF 

$20.40 $15.25 $16.57 

7) 24” 
Pipe 

200 
LF 

$25.50 $19.50 $21.58 

8) 30” 
Pipe 

150 
LF 

$35.70 $27.75 $29.90 

9) 36” 
Pipe 

250 
LF 

$52.70 $44.00 $45.28 

10) 42” 
Pipe 

200 
LF 

  $68.00                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                NO BID $59.20 

11) 48” 
Pipe 

10 
LF 

$85.00 NO BID $70.88 

12) 54” 
Pipe 

20 
LF 

$136.00 NO BID $86.39 

13) 12” Catch 
Basin 

5 
each 

$375.00 $95.00 $100.00 

14) 18” Catch 
Basin 

10 
each 

$430.00 $275.00 $275.00 

15) 24” Catch 
Basin 

10 
each 

$545.00 $375.00 $350.00 

 
*Convenient to purchase sealer with pipe at one time. 


