
           

CITY OF TEXAS CITY
REGULAR CALLED CITY COMMISSION MEETING

AGENDA

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 5, 2014 - 5:00 P.M.
KENNETH T. NUNN COUNCIL ROOM -  CITY HALL

 1801 9th Ave. N.
Texas City, TX  77590

             

(1) ROLL CALL
 

(2) INVOCATION
 

(3) PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
 

(4) REPORTS 

Fire Department - State of the Fire Department.
 

(5) PUBLIC HEARING

Public Hearing on sale of City property, ABST 142, Page 4PT of Lot 153 (153-01) JEMISON
ADDN, commonly known as 2820 3rd Avenue South, to an independent foundation (Texas City
Economic Development Corporation), in accordance with state law. (Management Services)

 

(6) CONSENT AGENDA
 

(a) Approve City Commission Minutes for January 15, 2014, meeting. (City Secretary) 
 

(b)   Consider and take action on Resolution No. 14-018, approving Bid # 2014-063 Water
Disinfecting Chemicals Annual Contract. (Purchasing)

 

(c)   Consider and take action on Resolution No. 14-019, calling a General Election to be held in
Texas City. (City Secretary)

 

(d)   Consider and take action on Resolution No. 14-020, approving Bid # 2014-062 for the
purchase and delivery of Cement Stabilized Sand Annual Contract. (Purchasing)

 

(e)   Consider and take action on Resolution No. 14-021, approving the purchase and delivery of a
robot to be used by the Texas City Police Department Bomb Squad Unit. (Police Department)

 

(f)   Consider and take action on Resolution No. 14-022, approving Bid # 2014-061 for the
purchase and delivery of Personnel Protective Equipment, Fire Hose, Nozzles and Related
Equipment Annual Contract. (Purchasing)

 

(g)   Consider and approve Resolution No. 14-023, authorizing the Mayor to enter into a lease
agreement with the Gulf Coast Center for property located at the southwest corner of
Magnolia and 33rd Street North. (Management Services)



 

(h)   Consider and take action on Resolution No. 14-024, approving contract extension with In-Pipe
Technology. (Purchasing)

 

(i)   Consider and approve Resolution No. 14-025, authorizing sale of City property, ABST 142,
Page 4PT of Lot 153 (153-01) JEMISON ADDN, commonly known as 2820 3rd Avenue
South, to an independent foundation (Texas City Economic Development Corporation), in
accordance with state law. (Management Services)

 

(7) PUBLIC COMMENTS
 

(8) MAYOR'S COMMENTS
 

(9) COMMISSIONERS' COMMENTS
 

ADJOURNMENT
 

 

NOTICE OF ANY SUBJECT APPEARING ON THIS AGENDA REGARDLESS OF HOW THE MATTER IS
STATED MAY BE ACTED UPON BY THE CITY COMMISSION.
NOTICE:  The City of Texas City will furnish free transportation to handicapped individuals via a 4-door
sedan for anyone wishing to attend the City Commission meetings.  Call 948-3111, City Secretary's Office
before noon on Monday preceding the meeting to make arrangements.

I, THE UNDERSIGNED AUTHORITY, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS NOTICE OF MEETING WAS
POSTED ON THE BULLETIN BOARDS AT CITY HALL, 1801 9TH AVENUE NORTH, TEXAS CITY,
TEXAS, AT A PLACE CONVENIENT AND READILY ACCESSIBLE TO THE GENERAL PUBLIC AND ON
THE CITY'S WEBSITE ON JANUARY 31, 2014 PRIOR TO 5:00 P.M. AND REMAINED SO POSTED
CONTINUOUSLY FOR AT LEAST 72 HOURS PRECEDING THE SCHEDULED TIME OF SAID
MEETING.

/s/Nicholas J. Finan
NICHOLAS J. FINAN
CITY SECRETARY
 



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   Res 14-018           
Meeting Date: 02/05/2014  
Bid # 2014-063 Water Disinfecting Chemicals Annual Contract
Submitted For: Jay Williams, Recreation and Tourism 
Submitted By: Julie Morreale, Purchasing 
Department: Purchasing 

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Approve and award Bid # 2014-063 Water Disinfecting Chemicals Annual Contract

BACKGROUND
On January 9, 2014 five (5) bid packets were mailed to area vendors. A bid tabulation is
attached for your review. Bids opened on Friday, January 24, 2014 at 2:00 P.M.

ANALYSIS
The low responsible bid meeting all specifications was received from Brenntag Southwest, Inc.,
in Houston, for the unit prices bid. It is my recommendation to award Bid # 2014-063 Water
Disinfecting Chemicals Annual Contract to Brenntag Southwest, Inc., for the unit priced bid, and
that the Mayor is authorized to execute a contract on behalf of the City Commission. Thank you.

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Res. No. 14-018
Exhibit A





BID TABULATION 
 

BID #2014-063 
 

WATER DISINFECTING CHEMICALS 
ANNUAL CONTRACT 

 
Bid Opening: Friday, January 24, 2014 at 2:00 p.m. 

 
VENDOR Sodium Hypochlorite 

Outdoor Pools 
Calcium Hypochlorite HTH 

Water storage tanks 
 and water mains 

Muriatic Acid Cyanuric Acid-Stabilizer 

Aquasol  
Poolsure 

Houston, Texas 

$1.48 per gallon $158.00 per bucket 
100lb. bucket 

$3.89 per gallon 
30 gallon drum 

$69.50 Bag 

Valley Solvents & 
Chemicals 

Pasadena, Texas 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Progressive Commercial 
Aquatics, Inc. 

Houston, Texas 

$1.68 per gallon $170.00 per bucket 
100lb. bucket 

$4.25 per gallon 
30 gallon drum  

$119.00 drum 

Brenntag 
Altivia Corp. 

Houston, Texas 

$1.24per gallon $134.00 per bucket 
100lb. bucket 

$3.30 per gallon 
30 gallon drum 

$55.00 Bag 

Kleen Supply 
Galveston, Texas 

NO BID $135.00 per bucket 
100lb. bucket 

$3.00 per gallon 
30 gallon drum 

$96.40 Bag 

Previous Contract 
 

$1.39 per gallon $139.00 per bucket 
100lb. bucket 

$3.00 per gallon 
30 gallon drum 

New item 

 



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   Res 14-019           
Meeting Date: 02/05/2014  

Submitted By: Justin Herter, City Secretary
Department: City Secretary

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Calling of Election.

BACKGROUND
As prescribed by State Law, the City of Texas City must comply with dates, notices, and actions
to hold its election in May. This year the City has entered into an agreement for the County to
run the City's election as part of a universal voting system (approved in December). In line with
that agreement, the City must still call the election and post all proper notices. The resolution
designates the dates and times and the polling places for the May 10, 2014 election. The
locations were previously approved by the City Commission in December.

ANALYSIS

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Res. No. 14-019
District Map
Notice















   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   Res 14-020           
Meeting Date: 02/05/2014  
BID # 2014-062 Cement Stabilized Sand Annual Contract
Submitted By: Rita Williams, Purchasing 
Department: Purchasing 

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Approve and award Bid # 2014-062 for the purchase and delivery of Cement Stabilized Sand
Annual Contract.

BACKGROUND
On January 6, 2014 bid packets were mailed to area vendors. A bid tabulation is attached for
your review.

Bids opened on Tuesday, January 21, 2014 at 2:00 p.m.

ANALYSIS
The low responsible bid meeting all specifications was received from JDB Services, Inc., in
Pasadena, for the unit prices bid.

It is my recommendation to award Bid # 2014-062 for the purchase and delivery of Cement
Stabilized Sand to JDB Services, Inc., for the unit prices bid and that the Mayor is authorized to
execute a contract on behalf of the City Commission.

Thank you. 

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Res. No. 14-020
Exhibit A





BID TABULATION 
 

Bid # 2014-062 
 

CEMENT STABILIZED SAND ANNUAL CONTRACT 
 

Bid Opening: Tuesday, January 21, 2014 at 2:00 p.m. 
 

 
VENDOR 

 
1½ Sack 

 
2 Sack 

 
3 Sack 

JDB Services, Inc. 
Pasadena, Texas 

$14.62 
per ton 

$16.65 
per ton 

$20.72 
per ton 

Dorsett Bros. 
Pasadena, Texas 

NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Previous Contract 
Pricing 

$14.36 
per ton 

$16.32 
per ton 

$20.24 
per ton 

 



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   Res 14-021           
Meeting Date: 02/05/2014  
Bomb Squad Robot
Submitted For: Justin Herter, City Secretary 
Submitted By: Justin Herter, City Secretary
Department: City Secretary

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Resolution No. 12-054 accepting the FY 2011 Port Security Grant Program Sub-Grantee award
from Harris County, as the Fiduciary Agent for the Federal Emergency Management Agency,
for the Texas City Police Deparatment was passed on May 16, 2012. The amount of this grant
was $576,600.00. From this grant we purchased the Total Containment Vessel and two gas
powered saws for the Bomb Squad in the amount of $351,173.88 leaving a balance of
$225,426.12 for the purchase of the large robot.

The Andros F6b robot is the last item to be purchased from this grant. The robot is an EOD
Robot for the bomb squad to conduct render safe operations remotely and has chemical and
radialogical detection capabilities. The purchase price for the robot and attachments is
$225,374.00.

BACKGROUND

ANALYSIS

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Res. No. 14-021
Ideal 
SS2
Break Down of Robot







IDEAL PRODUCTS INC.
126 Capital Court
Nicholasville.KY 40356
Voice (859) 881-TOOL (8665)  Toll Free  (866) 931-4EOD (4363)
Fax (859)881-8880
FEDERAL ID# 61-1282956

To  whom it may concern:

IDEAL PRODUCTS INC.  Is the World wide SOLE SUPPLIER and MANUFACTURER FOR : 
All of the items listed below are manufactured in the U.S by Ideal Products Inc. and the 

purchased components and materials in the parts, are made in the US. 

.  The original PAN™ Disrupter 12 gauge   K100, K100PL, K998PL, USNK998POST, K998NS

.   The “Wildcat” disrupter  K101, K102

.  The Mini PAN™ Disrupter 410 gauge  K200PL, K300PL

.  T3 Disrupter (Titanium 12 gauge)  K4300PL, K4500PL

.  357 Magnum Micro Disrupter (357 gauge)  K7000
Disrupter parts and Accessories

.  2001  Disrupter seating tool

.  2010  Shell extractor

.  3000   Firing  pin for standard PAN™ Breech

.  3000PL   Firing pin for push lock breech plug

.  3010,3011,3012   Inserts for disrupter breeches

.  3020,3020PL   Springs for disrupter breeches

.  3050,3051,3052   Straight fittings for disrupter breeches

.  3075,3076,3077   Ferrule nuts for disrupter breeches

.  K300B  Breech parts kit

.  K3010C   Commercial spare parts kit

.  K3010M  Military spare parts kit

.  K4350   Breech plug assembly

.  K4350PL   Push lock breech plug assembly  

.  K2001   Red laser sight and adapter for disrupters (12gauge)

.  2033G  and K2033G Green laser sight 

.  K3118ULC    Ultra light post stand

.  2030 and 2030D   Rail mounts for 12 gauge disrupters

Disrupters

We do not use distributors.
Ideal Products Inc. will warranty all of our products for 1 year from date of purchase against 
defects in workmanship.

Sincerely,
Scott Johns
Owner/ President



Phone:
Toll Free:
FAX:

Federal Id: 61-1282956

Website:
E-Mail:

DATE:
ATTN:

FAX:

Qty Unit Cost Total Cost
2 2,200.00 4,400.00$                       

-$                               
-$                               
-$                               
-$                               
-$                               
-$                               
-$                               
-$                               

4,400.00$                       

● Purchase Orders accepted.
●
●
●
● Payment with credit card after invoicing will incur 2.5% credit card surcharge.
●

K101
Part #

QUOTE #:
TO:

PHONE:
EMAIL:

IDEAL PRODUCTS INC.
126 Capital Ct.
Nicholasville, KY  40356

(859) 881-8665

(859) 881-8880

www.idealproductsinc.net
scott@idealproductsinc.net

(866) 931-4EOD (4363)

2789
TOM ROBISONTEXAS CITY PD
#N/A#N/A

January 29, 2014

trobison@texas-city-tx.org

Description
IP24 DISRUPTER UNIT

FOB:  Destination (UPS GROUND Continental US Only)

The World Wide Distributor of the Original PAN Disrupter™

WE ARE PLEASED TO QUOTE THE FOLLOWING PER YOUR REQUEST:

1 TO 2 WEEKS ARO
SCOTT JOHNSAuthorized By:

Delivery:
QUOTE GOOD FOR 90 DAYS

Total

THANK YOU FOR THE OPPORTUNITY TO EARN YOUR BUSINESS!

Terms for all US customers are net 30 days.  A 2% Finance Charge will be added to past due invoices.
Terms for all International customers are Net due prior to shipping (Proforma Invoice).
Visa and Mastercard accepted.  Credit card payment expected at time of shipment.  

Price subject to change if quantity changes.

http://www.idealproductsinc.net/�
mailto:scott@idealproductsinc.net�
mailto:trobison@texas-city-tx.org�


Break Down of F6 Robot

From: Tom Robison
Sent: Wednesday, January 29, 2014 6:14 PM
To: Capt. Ross Clements; Chief Robert Burby
Subject: Breakdown of the robot purchase

Chief and Ross,

The Andros F6b robot purchase had to be broken up into three quotes to get the most 
equipment options and best prices.

1. Robot with attachements to include Striker 12 Shotgun and 40 mm Breacher with 
mount assemblies came out to $212,114.00.

2. The Chemical Detection equipment and calibration supplies and fittings totaled 
$8,860.00.

3. The two Wildcat Pan Disruptors totaled $4,400.00.

The grand total came to $225,374.00. This is 100% reimbursed from the FY 2011 Port 
Security Grant from Harris County and is the final purchase for this grant.

Tom



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   Res 14-022           
Meeting Date: 02/05/2014  
BID # 2014-061 PERSONNEL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT, FIRE HOSE, NOZZLES AND
RELATED EQUIPMENT ANNUAL CONTRACT
Submitted For: David Zacherl, Fire Department  Submitted By: Julie Morreale, Purchasing 
Department: Fire Department

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Approve and award Bid # 2014-061 Personnel Protective Equipment, Fire Hose, Nozzles and
Related Equipment Annual Contract.

BACKGROUND
January 6, 2014 Six (6) bid packets were mailed to area vendors. A letter of recommendation
and bid tabulation are attached for your review. Bids were opened on Tuesday, January 21,
2014 at 2:00 PM.

ANALYSIS
It is my recommendation to award the annual contract as follows: Section 1 - Casco Industries,
in Houston,TX for the unit prices bid; Section 2 - Nevada Pacific, in Zephyr,TX for the unit prices
bid and that the Mayor is authorized to execute contract(s) on behalf of the City Commission.
Thank you.

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Res. No. 14-022
Exhibit A -Bid Tab
Exhibit A - Recommendation letter





Page 1 of 3 

BID TABULATION 
 

Personnel Protective Equipment, Fire Hose, Nozzles and Related Equipment Annual Contract 
 

Bid #2014-061 
 

Bids opened: Tuesday, January 21, 2014 at 2:00 p.m. 
 

SECTION 1 – PERSONNEL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT 
 

ITEM Dooley Tackaberry, 
Inc. 

Deer Park, Texas 

Casco Industries 
Houston, Texas 

MES 
Houston, Texas 

Nevada Pacific 
Zephyr, Texas 

NAFECO/Wilson 
New Braunfels, 

Texas 

Previous 
Contract 

1. Bunker Jacket 
32-70 Regular & Tall 

$931.00 $783.00 
 

$870.00 No Bid No Bid $750.00 
30% for sizes 

60 + 
2. Bunker Pants 
32-62 (XS-4X) 

$636.00 $527.00 
 

$519.00 No Bid No Bid $514.00 
30% for sizes 

60 +  
 

3. Suspenders $40.00 $28.75 $33.00 No Bid No Bid $25.00 

4. Bunker Boots 
 

$103.65 $120.00 
 

$131.00 
 

No Bid No Bid $120.00 
 

5. Helmet $156.70 $191.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $188.00 

6.Firefighting Protective 
Hoods 

$188.60 $179.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $175.00 

7. Protective Sock Hood 
for firefighting 

$19.75 $22.00 $20.95 No Bid $20.00 $20.00 

8. Gloves $63.50 $57.00 $59.00 No Bid $56.00 $56.00 

 
 
 



Page 2 of 3 

SECTION 1 – PERSONNEL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT 
 

ITEM Dooley Tackaberry, 
Inc. 

Deer Park, Texas 

Casco Industries 
Houston, Texas 

MES 
Houston, Texas 

Nevada Pacific 
Zephyr, Texas  

NAFECO/Wilson 
New Braunfels, 

Texas 

Previous 
Contract 

9. Gauntlet Style w/ 
Sleevemate firefighting 
Gloves 

$158.00 $160.00 $179.00 No Bid $171.00 $145.00 

10. Coveralls 
Regular & Long Length 

$110.00 
 

$119.00 
 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $112.00 
$139.00 

11. Gear Bags, X-Large $49.20 $44.00 $34.00 No Bid $45.00 $44.00 

 
SECTION 2 – FIRE HOSE AND NOZZLES 

 
ITEM Dooley Tackaberry, 

Inc. 
Deer Park, Texas 

Casco Industries 
Houston, Texas 

MES 
Houston, Texas 

Nevada Pacific 
Zephyr, Texas  

NAFECO/Wilson 
New Braunfels, 

Texas 

Previous 
Contract 

1.5” x 100’ sections of 
supply hose 

$555.00 $645.00 $533.00 $566.30 $699.00 $554.45 

2. 5” x 50’ sections of 
supply hose 

$352.00 $392.00 $364.00 $357.40 $425.00 $432.00 

3. 5” x 25’ sections of 
supply hose 

$250.00 $265.00 $224.88 $281.50 $285.00 $361.00 

4. 6” Ball valve, Intake $820.00 $825.00 $1,012.00 $1,189.00 No Bid $811.62 

5. 1 .75 x 50’ section of 
attack/supply hose, 
double jacket 

$100.60 $81.00 $103.00 $135.19 $97.00 $106.00 

6. 2” x 50’ section of 
attack  

$38.00 $42.00 $78.00 $35.76 $39.00 $149.00 
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SECTION 2 – FIRE HOSE AND NOZZLES 
 

ITEM Dooley Tackaberry, 
Inc. 

Deer Park, Texas 

Casco Industries 
Houston, Texas 

MES 
Houston, Texas 

Nevada Pacific 
Zephyr, Texas  

NAFECO/Wilson 
New Braunfels, 

Texas 

Previous 
Contract 

7. 3” x 50’ section of 
attack/supply 

$136.00 $138.00 $141.00 $175.66 $135.00 $149.00 

8. 1.75 x 10’ Attack $190.00 $186.00 $191.00 $211.61 $182.00 $199.42 

9. 3” x 20’ section of attack/ $111.00 $114.00 $112.00 $116.36 $107.00 $168.00 

10. 1.5 adjustable fog 
nozzle, 200 gpm 

$655.00 $638.00 $629.00 $413.00 $645.00 $622.00 

11. 1.50 adjustable fog 
nozzle,250 gpm 

$737.80 $719.00 $711.00 $474.00 $725.00 $707.00 

12. 2.5 adjustable fog 
nozzle, 250 gpm 

$1,071.00 $1,059.00 $1,047.00 $744.00 $1,069.00 $986.00 

13. 1.0” adjustable fog 
nozzle flow 60 gpm 

$618.00 $602.00 $595.00 $413.00 $609.00 $572.00 

 



Texas City Fire Department 

Memorandum 


To: Rita Williams, Purchasing Director 

From: David Zacher!, Assistant Chief 

Date: January 22, 2014 

Re: Bid #2014-061 Personnel Protective Equipment, 
Fire Hose, Nozzles and Related Equipment 

After reviewing the bids opened on January 21 , 2014 at 2:00 p.m. it is my recommendation that 
we award the bids as follows: 


Section 1: Personnel Protective Equipment awarded to Casco Industries as the lowest, 

responsible total bid, meeting all of these specifications in accordance with Instructions to 

Bidders: Item 9. Basis of Award. 


Section 2: Fire Hose & Nozzles awarded to Nevada Pacific as the lowest, responsible total bid, 
meeting all of these specifications in accordance with Instructions to Bidders: Item 9. Basis of 
Award. 

If you have any questions or desire additional information, please contact me at your earliest 

convenience. 


Thanks! 


Authorized for Distribution : 

foseP9 A. Gorman, Fire Chief 

"Working Together to Enhance the Community" 



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   Res 14-023           
Meeting Date: 02/05/2014  
Gulf Coast Center Lease
Submitted For: Justin Herter, City Secretary 
Submitted By: Justin Herter, City Secretary
Department: City Secretary

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Consider entering into Long Term lease with the Gulf Coast Center on property located at 33rd
Street North and Magnolia for Park and Ride and Gulf Coast Centers Adminstration Center
including Transportation Services.

BACKGROUND
The City of Texas City has designated roughly 10 acres at the intersection of Magnolia and 33rd
St. N. as an area for a Park and Ride and some other aspect. The Gulf Coast Center, which
operates the Park and Rides in Galveston County including one at the Mall of the Mainland is in
need of new administration offices. Working with the mayor, there is an opportunity to use
various grant monies and use the property as matching in-kind monies to located the Gulf Coast
Centers Administration offices at this location, get assistance on the Park and Ride construction
and construct and Emergency Management Center here to assist in evacuations and have
command center during emergencies. When the Park and Ride lot is not being used, it is also
available for overflow parking for events at the Carlos Garza Park. The situation allows all
parties to benefit and take advantage of various federal dollars lessening the impact on the local
citizens.

ANALYSIS

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Res. No. 14-023
Map
Draft Contract







































































   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   Res 14-024           
Meeting Date: 02/05/2014  
Extension contract of an in-pipe system at the Lift Stations
Submitted For: Corbin Ballast, Utilities  Submitted By: Julie Morreale, Purchasing 
Department: Utilities

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Approve contract extension with In-Pipe Technology. Implementation approval was made by
City Commission on November 7, 2012 under Resolution No. 12-140.

BACKGROUND
This has effectively been able to comply with the sanitary sewer overflow initiative entered into
by the City of Texas City with the TCEQ to reduce sewer overflows. This system is designed to
eliminate odor; corrosion, oil and grease in the sewage collection system reducing stoppages
and deterioration. In-Pipe Technology Company, LLC, Wheaton, Illinois, is the patent holder for
the in-pipe technology solution and sole source provider.

ANALYSIS
It is my recommendation to extend the contract with In-Pipe Technology Company, LLC for a
total contract price of $170,400.00

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Res. no. 14-024
Exhibit A







aN-PIPE 

~ TECHNOLOGY 

REAL SCIENCE, REAL RESULTS, 

January 13, 2014 

Calvin Bremer 


City ofTexas City 


3901 Bay Street Ext. 


Texas City, TX 77590 


Re: Contract Extension 

Dear Calvin; 

I recently reviewed our contract with Texas City and that a year has passed since it was issued. This 

letter serves to confirm the continuation of In-Pipe Technology Company's services to Texas City under 

the terms of the signed agreement which provides for an additional year with no change to pricing or 

scope of services through November of 2014. I attached a copy of the signed signature pages for your 

reference. 

If you are in agreement, please initial a copy of this letter and return to my attention. 

We appreciate our business with Texas City and enjoy our working relationship with you and your staff. 

We also look forward to being of continued service to the City. 

Please let me know if you have any questions. 

Sincerely; 

Jim Elliott 


Vice President of Sales 


In-Pipe Technology Company 


725 N. Central Avenue 


Wood Dale, Illinois 60191 


Cc: Chase Conway - In-Pipe Texas 


Bob Carlile Independent Representative 


Ginny Blake - In-Pipe Technology 


Dave Crawford -In-Pipe Technology 


725 N. Central Avenue • Wood Dale IL 60191 • 630.509.2488 • in-pipe.com 
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aN-PIPE
~ TECHNOLOGY 

REAL SCIENCE, REAL RESULTS, 

January 13, 2014 

Calvin Bremer 


City ofTexas City 


3901 Bay Street Ext. 

Texas City, TX 77590 


Re: Contract Extension 

Dear Calvin; 

I recently reviewed our contract with Texas City and that a year has passed since it was issued. This letter serves to 

confirm the continuation of In-Pipe Technology Company's services to Texas City under the terms of the signed 

agreement which provides for an additional year with no change to pricing or scope of services through November 

of 2014. I attached a copy of the signed signature pages for your reference. 

If you are in agreement, please initial a copy of this letter and return to my attention. 

We appreciate our business with Texas City and enjoy our working relationship with you and your staff. We also 

look forward to being of continued service to the City. 

Please let me know if you have any questions. 

Sincerely; 

Jim Elliott 


Vice President of Sales 


In-Pipe Technology Company 


725 N. Central Avenue 


Wood Dale, Illinois 60191 


Cc: Chase Conway -In-Pipe Texas 


Bob Carlile -Independent Representative 


Ginny Blake - In-Pipe Technology 


Dave Crawford -In-Pipe Technology 


Acknowledged and Accepted by: 

Signature: 

Printed name: 

Title: 

Date: 


725 N. Central Avenue • Wood Dale Il60191 • 630.509.2488 • in-pipe.oom 
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CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG 

Meeting Data: 11/0712012 

Implementation of an in-pipe system at the Uft Stations 

Submitted For: Lift Stations Submitted By: Rita Vllilliams, Purchasing 

Department: Purchasing 


Information 
ACTION REQUEST (Brief &Ummlry) 
Approve the contreact to implementation of an in-pipe system to remedy sorne maintenance 
and odor issues at the lift stations. 

Funds have been made available by a budget amendment approved by City Commission 
on October 3,2012 under Ordinance No. 12-39. 

Appropriate funds are budgeted in the Sewer Revenue Fund: Maintenance - Lift Station. 

BACKGROUND 
This is an effort to comply with the sanitary sewer overflow initiative entered into by the City 
of Texas City with the TCEQ to reduce sewer overflows. The system is designed to 
eliminate odor; corrosion; oil and grease in the sewage collection system reducing 
stoppages and deterioration. 

In addition, In-Pipe has stated that once the system is initiated; in approximately eight (8) 
months the City could possibly see a reduction in sludge disposal and electrical costs at the 
Wastewater Treatment Plant. 

For over a decade In-Pipe Technology Company, LLC, in Wheaton, Illinois, has held the 
patent to the in-pipe technology solution. 

ANALYSIS 

It is my recommendation the award a contract to In·Pipe Technology Company, LLC, for the 
implementation of an in-pipe system at the lift stations for the total contract price of 
$170,400.00. 

Thank you. 

ALTERNAlWES CONSIDERED 

http://IO.0.3.44/frsipublisWprincag_memo.cfm?seq=2083&rev_num=O&form=AG_ME... 10/3112012 
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RESOLUTION NO.ll-140 

ABSOLUTION APPROVINGCONTRACI' FORIMPLEMENTATION~' 
AN IN-PIPE SYSTEM AT THE LIn STATIONS WITH IN·PIP 
TECHNOLOGY COMPANY, LLC, A SOLE SOURCE PROVIDER; A 
PROVIDING THAT TlDS RESOLUTION SHALL BECOME EFFECI' 
FROM AND AFrER ITS PASSAGE AND ADOPTION. ' 

WHEREAS, the Purchasing Coordinator is reconuncnding tbattbe City cn3into' contract 
for implementation ofan in-pipe system from In-Pipe Teclmology Company, LLC. lllinois, 
a patent holder for the in-pipe technology solution and sole source provider, for a con price of 
$170,400.00; I 

WHEREAS, this in-pipe teclmology is designed to eliminate odor, corrosion. oil ~grease, 
in the sewage collection system and reduce stoppages and deterioration and implementation ofthis 
technology would expand the City's efforts to comply with the sanitary sewer ovcrt1ow Initiative 
entered into by the City with the Texas Commission on Environmental Quality to ~e SC'WCr 

overflows; and I 

WHEREAS, funds are available in the Sewer Revenue Fund: Maintenance - Lit Station 
account. 

NOW, mEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE 
CITY OF TEXAS CITY, TEXAS: ~ 

SICl'ION I: That the City Commission ofthe City ofTcxas City, Texas. hereby pproves 
and authorizes the Mayor to enter in to a contract with In-Pipe Technolo&y Company. LL , fOI the 
in-pipe teclmology, for the contract price of $170,400.00, as set out on Exhibits "A" ~d "8," 
attached hereto and made a part hereof. tor all intents and purposes. I 

SECTION 2: That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after i,passage 
and adoption. I 

http:170,400.00
http:170,400.00


PASSED AND ADOPTED this .,. day of November, 20ll. 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

rZ.OJt?& 

Ronald F. Plaekemeier 
City Attorney 

2 



100 Bridge 51"'''' Tel: 630.•7151144 
Wheaton, fL 60lH1 

Purchasing Quote Proposal Number: 2012-J365RS 
Date: October 30, 2012 
Reference: Texas City, TX 
Availability: 4 Weeks,ARO 
Delivery: Customer Site 
Validity: Proposal valid for 4S Days 

To: 	 From: 
City ofTexas City 	 In-Pipe Technology'~ Company, Inc. 
3901 Bay Street Ext 	 100 Bridge Street 
Texas City, TX 77590 	 Wheaton,IL 
Phone: (409) 643~5961 	 601814841 

Fax: 	 Phone: (630) 871-5844 

Email: cbremer@texAS-city-tx,org 	 Fax: (630) 871-0303 

Attn: Mr. Calvin D. Bremer, Superintendent 	 E-mail: jelliott@in-pipe.com 
Attn: Jim Elliott, Vice President 

Item 	 Item Code # Description Price/month 

Month I - 12 IPT-CTC-IM Implementation and startup $14,200 

Total 12 month Price: $110,400.00 

Terms 
1. 	 Refer to attacned lPTC standard Tenns and Conditions. 

2. 	 Per the IPTC Standard Terms and Conditions, this agreement may be cancelled at any time with 
thiny (30) days written notice . 

.l 	This agreement may be extended for an additional twelve (l2) months at no increase in cost to 

TeKas City. 

4. 	 Payments to be made out to In-Pipe Texas, LLC 

http:110,400.00
mailto:jelliott@in-pipe.com


_______ 

100 Bridge S'reet Tel: 630.8715844 

W!\oll'9n. IL 60 JR7 

5. 	 The contract will remain in effect for twelve (12) consecutive months from the date of 
installation. 

6. 	 Any expansion of services or modification of the contract is subject to future negotiation. 

We offer In-Pipe Technology service 10 improve the economics and efficiency of your collection and 

treatment systems. 


Thank you for your consideration. We look forward to reviewing the proposal with you. 


OFFERED BY: 


IN-PIPE TECHNOLOGY COMPANY INC. 


Jim Elliott 
Vice President - Sales 

ACCEPTED BY; 
City of Texas City, TX 

Title_t1~"'\__"'\)"-L-t-----
\ 

Date: --I-\\.L...--l+--.....I.-"'-"ll __--­

Our Representative Is: 
Robert Carlile 
Independent Representative 
IN-PIPE TECHNOLOGY 
(832) 264-5596 (cell) 
iptcarlile@gmail.com 
PO Box 1922 
Cypress, TX 77410 

mailto:iptcarlile@gmail.com
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EXHIBITA 

TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

1.0 ACCEPTANCE Sale of any prodLICIs or services (hereafter, the 'Products") by In·Pipe Technology 
Company. Inc, ("Sallet) 10 Purchaser shall be subject 10 the lerms and conditions of sale contained herein, No 
change in or addition 10 these 1erms shall be binding upon Seller unless specificall~ accepled in writing by Seilar. 
Seller objects in advance to any additional or different lerrns proposed In Purchaser's order 

2.0 PRICING Prices shall be Saller's price in effect at time of shipment unless otherwise specified in Seller's 
written Quotation. Quotations automatically expire 90 calendar days from Quolation date end may be canceled at any 
time by wrillen notice. 

3.0 FORCE MAJEURE LlMlTAnON Saller shall not be Hable for any loss. damage or expense resulting from 
delay or failure In the performance ot Seller's obligallons hereunder if such dalay or failure is due to acts of God or 
the public enemy, strikes, labor troubles, fire, explosions, riots, war, govemmenlal orders or restrictions, shortages of 
materials or labor, dalay in transportation, theft, accidents or any other cause lI'Ihich is bayond Seller's reasonBble 
control. Upon the occurrence of any such event preven6ng the Seiter from performing all of its then outstanding 
contracts, the Sillier shall then be entitted to perform such of its contracts as it may select end shall incur no liabilily to 
the Purchaser by reason of performing contracts other than this agreement. IN NO EVENT SHALL THE SELlER BE 
LIABLE FOR ANY LOSS BY REASON OF PLANT SHUTDOWN, NON·OPERATION OR INCREASE IN EXPENSE 
OF OPERATION OF OTHER EQUIPMENT OR FACILITIES, 

4.0 DELIVERY Shipping dates are estimates only and are based on Seller's proj$CIed production schedules and 
commitments by suppliers. DElAY IN SHIPMENT OR VARIANCE FROM SfilPPING SCHEDULE SHALL NOT BE 
CAUSE FOR CANCaLATION OR CLAIM FOR DAMAGE. Receipt by the Purchaser of any Products or services. 
shalt constitute acceptance of delivery and waiver of any claims due Ie delay, 

5.0 WARRANTY Supplier warrants IhaI Hs labor, materials. and equipment supplied hereunder shall be free 
from defect and shall conform Ie the standards 01 cere in effect In its industry at the time of performance of such 
labor, materials, and equipment lor the lime tnis contrectls in effect, 

5,1 Supplier's obligation is limited to repair or replacement EO.B, Purchaser's facility when 
examination of any suen equipment shall disclose them to Supplier's reasonable satisfaction to have been 
defective and Purchaser snail have promptly notified Supplier of the discovery of any such defect. Supplier will 
nol be responsible for; we'" done, material or equipment furnished or repairs or alterations made by others. 

5.2 For any breach hereunder, Supplier shall be liable to Purchaser for al damages (limited as stated 
in "Liabilily of Supplier") as shatl be applicable under the law, except as otherwise provided in this agreement. 
Purchaser shall be entitled to pursue all rights and remedies available by law, except as otherwise provided in 
this agreement. THE ABOVE WARRANTY IS INLIEU OF ALl OTHER WARRANTIES, EXPRESS OR 
IMPLIED, INCLUDING, BUT NOT LIMITED TO, WARRANTIES OR MERCHANTABILITY OR FITNESS FOR A 
PARTICULAR PURPOSE, WHICH ARE HEREBY DISClAIMED. 

6,0 LIABILITY OF SELlER SELLER SHALl DEFEND, INDEMNIFY, AND HOLD HARMLESS THE PURCHASER 
AND THEIR RESPECnvE DIRECTORS. OFFICERS, EMPLOYEES, AGENTS AND ASSIGNS (THE 
"INDEMNIFIED PARTIES") FROM AND AGAINST NoN AND ALL CLAIMS, DEMANDS, OR CAUSES OF ACTION 
(AND Al.L LOSSES, LIABILITIES, EX~NSES, AND JUDGMENTS INCURRED IN CONNECTION THEREWITH, 
INCWDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO ATIORNEYS' FEES AND EXPENSES, COURT COSTS, AND OTHER 
EXPENSES INCURRED IN ENFORCING THIS INDEMNITY F'ROVISION) OR FROM ANY OTHER LOSS OR 
CLAIM ARISING FROM THIRD PARTY PERSONAL INJURY OR PROPERTY DAMAGE BROUGHT BY SELLER 
OR ANY OF salER'S EMPLOYEES, DIRECTORS, OFFICERS, AGENTS. OUTSIDE ADVISORY OR SUPPORT 
CONSULTANTS, OR REPRESENTATIVES, OR BY ANY THIRD PARTY, BASED UPON, OR IN CONNECTION 
WITH, RESULTING FROM, OR ARISING OUT OF, THE NEGLIGENT ACT OR, OMISSION, OR MISCONDUCT OF 
SELLER'S EMPLOYEES. DIRECTORS, OFFICERS, AGENTS, OUTSIDE ADVISORY OR SUPPORT 
CONSULTANTS, OR REPRESENTATIVES 

The Saller shall procure and maintain throughout the term of this Agreement, at Ita Iole CClst and expense, insurance 
of Ihe type$ and in the minimum amounts sill forth below. Upon execution of this Agreement. the Seller shall furnish 
to the Purchaser certificates of insurance and any endorsemen1 required heteYnder issued by the insurance cerrier 
e~idencing compliance with the Insurance requirements hereof. Certificetes shall list the SeHer, the Ilame of the 
insurance company, the policy number, the term of coverege, and the timits of CClverage. Lapse of or cancellation of 
insurance, however caused, shall be deemed breech of this Agreement. In the event of lapse or cancellation of any 
required insurance it is Ilers.r the specific responsibility of Sillier to notify the Purchaser Immediately and to 
immediately reinstate the lapsed or cancelled il1$urance or to purchase replecement Insurance that meets the 
requirements of this Agreement. Additionally, aR required insurance shall be endorsed Ie require that tile Purchaser 



100 Bridge S'occ' Tel: 630,81U844 
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"bfj'provided"wii'ii'ii(le'ilsCiiiii1YI3iifd..ys·priorWriiieii-niii'ic;-ofany;:e(ijJ-ctIOii-i/i"iiiiiiiiiit-of"iiii·tiili'tY'by'·endOrsemenl'Oi 
the policy. cancellation, or non-n:mewal of thlt insurance coverage require<! under this Agruement. If replacemem 
insurance is purmased Seller is to deliver immediately to the Purmaser a replacement certificate and additional 
inswed BndOl'6ement. 

The amounts and t)'pes of insurance set forth herein are minimums as required by the Purchaser. SeUer, at its sole 
discretion. may purchase additiOl1allimits of insurance and coverage it deems necessary or prudent to proteclilself 
and the work or operations to be performed under this Agreement. Seller shall require that all its subcontractors, of 
any and alf tiars. to have insurance in compliance with the requirements of this Agreement; Seller shall secure and 
maintain subcontractors' certiflcatss of ins.urance and additional insured endorsements as proof thereof. At its 
discretion. at any time, the Purchaser may requlr. an audit of the required insurance documents and Contractor shall 
immediately deliver to the Purmaser all $ubcontractors' certiflCatft and endorsements for review by thlt Purchaser, 

The Seiler shall obtain slJch inSlJI'8nce from such compantss having a Bests rating of B+NII or beller, licensed 10 
transact business in the Slats of Texas, and shall obtain such insurance of the lollowing types and minimum fimits: 

1, 	 Worker's Compensation insurance in accordance with the laws 01 the Slate 01 Texas. and Employer's 
Uability coverage with a limit of not less than $500,000 eacll employee for Occupational Disease; 
$500,000 policy limit lor Occupational Disease; and Employer's liability of $500,000 each accident. 

2 	 Commercial General Llablllty insurance. including coverage for Products/Completed Operation, Blanket 
Contractual. Contractors' Protective Llability Broad Form Property Damage, PersonallnjurylAdvertising 
Liabmty. and Bod~y Injury and Property Damage with limits of not lass than 

$2,000,000 generel aggregate limit 

$1.000,000 each occurrence, combined single Mmit 

$1.000,000 aggregate Products. combined single limit 

$1.000,000 aggregate PersanallnjurylAdvertislng LieblHty 

3. 	 Business Automobile Liability coverage applying to ownec!, non-owned end hired aulomobiles. with 
fimits of not less ltlan $1.000,000 each occurrence combined single limit for Bodily Injury and Properly 
Damage oombined. 

4. 	 Umbrella Excess Liability insurance written as eKceSs. of Employer's Llability, with fimits not less than 
$1.000.000 each occurrence combined single limit. 

5. 	 Professional Liability insurence with limits nolless than $1.000,000 each clairnlannualeggregeta. 

The Indemnified Parties shall be added es additional insureds to all coverages required under this Agreement. ellcepl 
for 'NOrker's compensation insurance and professional liability insurance. using ISO form CG 2010 (07 04) or 
aquivalent. All policies written on behalf of the Seller shel contain a waiver of subrogation in favor of tha Indemnified 
Parties. with the exception of prcfessioom liability insurance. In addition. all of the aforesaid policies shall be 
endorsed 10 provide that they are primary coverages and not in .xcess of IIny other insurence available to the 
Purchaser. and without rights of conbibution or recovery ag8il1l!i the Purchaser or frem any such other Insurance 
available to the Purchaser. The Seller, and not the Purchaser, shall be responsible for paying the premiums lind 
deductibies. if any, that may from time to time be due under aH of the insurance policies required of the Seller. 

7.0 PAYMENTS Terms of payment are net 30 days. The lesser of the maximum legal rate or 8% per annum of 
interast and all costs of collection (indIJding attorney's fees) shall be charged on past due accounts. All orders are 
subject to the continuing approval of Saller'S cre<flt department If Purchaser is in default in any payment. Seller may 
c!eclare all payments for 'NOrk completed Immediately due and payable, stop al further work until payments are 
brought curnsnt and/or require advance payment for futura shipments, If the financial condition of the Purchaser at 
any lime does not in the judgmem of Seiler Justify continuance 01 production or shipment on the tanms of payment set 
forth herein, Sellar may require full or partial payment in advance or shall be entitled to cancel any ooIer then 
outstanding and shall receive reimbursement for its reasonable and preper cancellation charges. In the event of 
bankruptcy or insolvency of the Purchaser or in tha event any proceeding Is brought against the Purch86er. 
voluntarily or involuntarily under the bankruptcy or any insolvency laws, Seller shall be entitied to cancel any order 
then outstanding at any time during the period allowed for filing claims against the estate end shall receive 
reimbursement for its reasonable and proper cancellation chsrgft. 

8.0 DRAWINGS Ir drawings are fumished with this proposal. they are submitted only to show the general style. 
arrangement and approximate dimensions of the equipment and serviCtl$ olJered. No 'NOrk is to be based upon 
proposal drawings, It is the Purchaser's responsibility to verify that the data given on certiflad drewings is suitable for 
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applicabie-instajiaiioneo;;ditio;;s~-Any chiing;;i-mai:feafuir-iiieord9r-iS-relea'ii6d'for'man~lactUre-Wui~be'subje<:rio 
extra charges. 

9.0 TlTLEIRISK OF LOSSIDEFAULT Unless otherwise speclfled by Seller, delivery wi' be made F.O.B. point of 
shipment 10 Purchaser. TIUe to right of possession and ownarship of equipment covered herein shall remain Ihe 
properly of the Seller. The Purchaser agrees to do al acts necessary to perfect and maintain such right and title in 
the Seller. In case of failure or refusal to make payments when due, then and In any such event lhe whole of the 
unpaid portion of the purchB&S price shell, at Saller's option, become Immedialely due and payable and In case of 
such default on Purchaser's part. Seller shall thereupon haVB the right to enter the premises upon which such 
property shall be installed and take possession of and remove the same without legal process. This equipment shall 
retain its character es personal property regardless of its mode of ettachment. Risk of loss or damage shall pass to 
Purchaser on delivery to carrier. 

10.0 TAXES In addition 10 any price spacified herein, Purchaser shall pay the gross amount of any present. or 
future salss, use. excess, value added or other 61mBar tax applicable 10 the price. sale or delivery of any Products or 
their use by Seller or Purchaser, or Purchaser shall furnish Seller with a tax exempt cartirlCBte acceptable to the 
taxing authorltieli. 

H.O CANCELLATION Any order placea with SeUer may be cancelled by the Purclleser only upon thirty (30) 
days written notice Upon delivery of sllCh notice by the Purchaser to the Seller, tha Seller shan discontinue 1111 
services In ccnnection with the performance of this Agraement and shell prooaed to cancel prompUy all IIxisting 
orders and contracts insofar as such orders or contracts are chargeable to this Agreement As soon as precticeble 
after receipt of notice of termination. the Seller shall submit II statement shOwing in detail the services performed 
under this Agreement 10 the data of termination. The Purchaler shaft then pay the Seller promptly thllt proportioo of 
the prescribed charges which the services actually performed under Ihi& Agreement bear 10 the totsl 88l'Vices called 
for under this Agreement. IlIss such payments on accounl of chargas that have praviously been made. 

12.0 PROPRIETARY PT BULK MICROBE CULTURE The Client agrees that it wiU use prudent attempts to 
ensure that no analysis wiN be allowed on the IPT bulk microbe culture reagenlS without prior written authorization by 
In-Pipe Technology Company. LLC. In-Pipe Technology methodology is protected by US PatanlS (1115.57a.211 and 
5,788.841 and Canada Palenlli 2.272.689) ownea by the company. 

13.0 DISPUTE RESOLUTION Any dispute or controversy arising out of. under, or in connection with. or In relation 
10. thUi Agreement andlor any amendments thereto. or the breach thereof, which b not resolved informally by prior 
mutual agreement of the Purchaser and Seller. shaD be submitted to non-binding arbitration. unless otherwise waived 
IIndior modified in writing by the Parties. The cost of such arbitretion shall be paid by the Purchaser and Seller 
equally; however. the prevailing party In the arbitration shall be entitled to reimbursement of lIS attorneys feas and 
other CQIiII$ and expenses Incurred in connection therewith. 

If a dispute arises which is not resolved by arbitration pursuant 10 the above. and either party reasonably rate Ins 
counsel for the purpose of enforcing any provision of this Agreement. including without Hmitalion the InslitutJon of any 
action or proceeding to enforce any provision of this All reamenl. or to recover damages if otherwise available 
hereunder. or to obtain injunctive or other relief by reason of any alleged breach of any provision of this Agreement, 
or for a declaretion based on a demonstrated necessity of SllCh Party's righlS or obligations under this Agreement. or 
for any other judiciel or equitable remedy. then if the matter Is settled by judicial or quasi-judicial determination. the 
preval~ng Party shall be entitled. in addition to such other re~ef as may be granted. to be reimbursed by the losing 
Party for all costs and expenses incurred including, without limitation, aa attorneys' fees and costs for services 
rendered 10 the preva~ing Party and any attorneys' fees and coslS incurred in enforcing any judgment or order 
entered. The prevailing Party shall be as determined by the ccurt in the initial or any subsequent proceeding. 

1•.0 GENERAL The terms and conditions hereof cancel and supersede all previous understandings or 
agreements relating 10 the Products covered hereunder, written or oral, bel:w8en Seller and Purchaser and contain 
the entire understanding of the parties hereto. No waiver, alteration, deletion or modification of or addition to any of 
the provisions hereof shall be binding unless in writing and signed by a duly authorized representel:iYe of the Seller. If 
any term. provision or condition contained herein shall. 10 any expert, be Invalid or unenforceable. Ihe remainder of 
the terms. prOllisions and conditions hereof other than those which are Invalid or unenforceabla. shall not be artected 
thereby and each term, provision and condition of this order shall be valid and enforoaable to the fullest extant 
permitted by law. This order and all rights and obfigations of the parties shall be construed and interpreted under and 
pursuent 10 the laws of the Stata ot illinOiS. 



McHALE & SLAVIN, P.A. 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW 

uS, a INTERNATIONAL PATENTS, TRAOEMARKS, COPVRIGHTS, 

RELATED LICENSING. LJTlGATION 

2855 fOG... BOULEVARD 


PALM BE:ACH GARDENS' FLORIDA • ~!410·2~IO 


TELEPHONE (S61) 625-6575 FACSIMIUI< ("0" 62!H5e74 


June 23rd, 2009 

To Whom It May Concern: 

This law firm represents In-Pipe Technology <IJ Company, LLC. (In-Pipe) in 
intellectual property matters. For over a decade, In-Pipe's patented technology in the field 
of in-situ microbial treatment by modification of the sewer b10film through the principle of 
competitive exclusion using beneficial bacteria has enabled them to maintain a definitive 
poSition in the field of municipal wastewater treatment. 

In-Pipe's patent portfolio includes: 

I. United States Patent 5,578,211 originally issued to Dickerson on November 
26,1996, entitled Wastewater Gas Reduction Method, which is directed toward a method 
of reducing undesirable gases in a wastewater collection piping system; and 

II. United States Patent 5,788,841, originally issued to Dickerson on August 4, 
1998. entitled "Method For Improving Wastewater Treatment". which is directed toward a 
method of treating wastewater prior to being processed within a wastewater treatment 
facility. wherein the wastewater is delivered to the wastewater treatment facility by a 
collection piping system having an interior surface, and wherein the wastewater includes a 
predominant waste material. 

As broadly claimed, the method of the '211 patent allows IPT to preclude others 
from making, using or selling a method for reducing undesirable gases in a wastewater 
collection piping system having an interior surface, wherein the piping system Includes a 
p1urality of pumping stations for periodically moving the wastewater progressively toward 
a wastewater treatment facility.. and wherein the wastewater includes a predominant 
waste material, compriSing the steps of: 

1) introducing select microbes into the piping system at a frequency 
corresponding to the pumping activity of the pumping stations, and in an amount 
proportional to the surface area of the interior surface of the piping system; 

2) wherein the select microbes are capable of completely consuming the 
predominant waste material in the wastewater; and 

3) wherein an anaerobic biomass comprising almost entirely the select 
microbes is formed along the interior surface of the piping system. 

The claims of the 'S41 patent further allow In-Pipe to preclude others from making. 
using or selling a method for treating wastewater prior to being processed within a 
wastewater treatment faCility, wherein the wastewater is delivered to the wastewater 

MIAMI (305) 374-3311 ~w WiQgteots CQCJ CHICAGO (312) 1139-2.51:; 
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treatment facility by a collection piping system having an interior surface, and wherein the 
wastewater Includes a predominant waste material, comprising the steps of: 

1) introducing select microbes into the piping system in an amount 
proportional to the surface area of the interior surface of the piping system, wherein the 
seJect microbes are capable of completely consuming the predominant waste material in 
the wastewater, untfl a biomass comprising almost entirely the select microbes is formed 
along the interior surface ofthe piping system; 

2) monitoring the biological oxygen demand (BOD) level of the wastewater at a 
downstream location immediately prior to the wastewater treatment facility in comparison 
to a desired BOD level; and 

3) adjusting the introduction of the select microbes into the piping system in 
proportion to the average downstream flowrate ofthe wastewater through the piping 
system to minimize the difference between the monitored BOD level and the desired BOD 
level. 

In accordance with each of the claimed methods, the microbes may be introduced in 
an initially non-active state, may be non-pathogenic, and are capable of functioning in 
either an aerobic or an anaerobic manner. 

Additionally, the methods may be characterized by the step of monitoring the level 
of nitrogen in the piping system, and carrying out adjustments ofthe microbes in order to 
maintain at least one mg!1 oftotal nitrogen in the wastewater. 

Optionally, a predetermined quantity ofozone may be introduced into the piping 
system at sel ected locations to further reduce the presence of the undesirable gases. 

Furthermore, the introduction of the select microbes may be accompHshed by a 
microprocessor-controlled pump, and select pumps in the sewer collection system. 

In accordance with 35 USC § 271(t), the solicitation, encouragement or inducement 
of individuals or companies to offer to knowingly or unknowingly infringe on US Patents, is 
also considered an infringement of patented property. 

In-Pipe's policy is to vigorollsly protect its intellectual property rights. 

Should you have any questions related to rn-Pipe's patented technology, please 
make such inquiries to Mr. fohn Wit Iiams, President &CEO of In-Pipe Technology. 

Best Regards, 

McHale &Slavin, P.A. 


~II.~ 
Ferris H. Lander 



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   Res 14-025           
Meeting Date: 02/05/2014  
Sale of Property
Submitted By: Justin Herter, City Secretary
Department: City Secretary

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Consider and approve Resolution No. 14-025, authorizing sale of City property, ABST 142,
Page 4PT of Lot 153 (153-01) JEMISON ADDN, commonly known as 2820 3rd Avenue South,
to an independent foundation (Texas City Economic Development Corporation), in accordance
with state law. (Management Services)

BACKGROUND
The city has been working with a company that is interested in developing in the Industrial
Business District. The company has chosen a site that is owned by the City of Texas City. It is
land south of the South of Butler Equipment that is bounded by (George has description or
should be in title now). The land is ? acres (see the attachments of the survey and map of the
area). The City intends to sell the property to the Texas City Economic Development
Corporation, an independent foundation. Under state statutes, the city may sell property directly
to an independent foundation that it wants to have developed by contract (Section 272.001(B)(4)
of the Local Government Code. When dealing with the Intertek property sale in 2012, Staff had
discussed this with the Attorney General's Office, Zindia Thompson, and other staff members as
well as other economic development professionals in Texas familiar with the state statutes on
sale of City property and economic development. All agreed with the process. While there is not
a definition of "independent foundation" in the state statutes, Ms. Thompson stated that the
Economic Development Corporation, by its incorporation under the state statutes, is an
independent foundation by definition. Attached is the outline of the agreement on the
requirements of the development of the land and the amount of property to be sold. This sale
would fullfill the plan outlined for the area zoned IBD. The City Attorney has reviewed and is in
agreement with the process and the additional steps taken to be open to the public with the
sale. This property was provided to the City at no cost through an agreement with the other
taxing entities through our Property In Trust agreement, so money will be exchanged with the
Texas Economic Development Corporation from the City of Texas City.

Should City Commission approve, the Texas City Economic Development Corporation will take
action to fulfill the agreement by entering into an agreement with the company to develop the
property. 
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