
           

CITY OF TEXAS CITY
REGULAR CALLED CITY COMMISSION MEETING

AGENDA

WEDNESDAY, JULY 15, 2015 - 5:00 P.M.
KENNETH T. NUNN COUNCIL ROOM -  CITY HALL

 1801 9th Ave. N.
Texas City, TX  77590

             

(1) ROLL CALL
 

(2) INVOCATION
 

(3) PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
 

(4) PROCLAMATIONS AND PRESENTATIONS
 

(a)   Service Awards
Tomas Gomez Public Works 07/01/2010 05 years
Billie Powers Parks & Recreation 07/05/2005 10 years

Retirement
Gary Boatright Fire 27 Years of Service

 

(b)   Check presentation to Mayor for Rotary Trail (Texas City Rotary Club)
 

(5) REPORTS
 

(a)   Financial Quarterly Report (Finance)
 

(6) PUBLIC HEARING
 

(a)   City of Texas City requests to rezone from “IBD” (Industrial Business District) to “Site-Plan” to construct
above ground storage tanks for petroleum products, bulk storage, equipment storage, warehouses and
offices. Being all of Block 223, 224,225, 226 and 227, T.C. 2nd Division. Located in the 800 and 900
block of 4th Avenue South. (Planning)

 

(7) CONSENT AGENDA
 

(a)   Approve City Commission Minutes for July 1, 2015 meeting. (City Secretary)
 

(b)   Consider and take action on Resolution No. 15-047, approving the re-appointment or appointment of
representatives to the Galveston County United Board of Health. (City Secretary)

 

(c)   Consider and take action on Resolution No. 15-048, approving the submission of an HGAC Grant
application for the Body Camera Implementation Project. (Police Department)

 

(d)   Consider and take action on Resolution No. 15-049, approving and awarding Bid # 2015-091 Solid
Waste Disposal Annual Contract. (Public Works)



 

(e)   Consider and take action on Resolution No. 15-050, approving and awarding Bid # 2015-089 Liquid
Asphalt - Transport Load. (Public Works)

 

(f)   Consider and take action on Resolution No. 15-051, approving and awarding RFP # 2015-090
Temporary Employment Services Annual Contract. (Human Resources)

 

(g)   Consider and take action on Resolution No. 15-052, approving a contract for Removal of Debris from
the Bioreactor. (Public Works)

 

(h)   Consider and take action on Resolution No. 15-053, accepting the TXDOT STEP (Selective Traffic
Enforcement Program) Traffic Safety 2016 Grant. (Police Department)

 

(8) REGULAR ITEMS
 

(a)   Consider and take action on Ordinance No. 15-20, approving to permanently rezone property for Stripe
Convenience Stores from “C”(Multi-Family Residential) and “A” (Single Family Residential) to “E”
(General Business) to construct a fuel station / convenience store. (Planning)

 

(b)   Consider and take action on Ordinance No. 15-21, approving to permanently rezone property for City
of Texas City to rezone from “IBD” (Industrial Business District) to “Site-Plan” to construct above
ground storage tanks for petroleum products, bulk storage, equipment storage, warehouses and
offices. (Planning)

 

(c)   Consider and take action on Ordinance No. 15-22, amending Sections 95.017 and 95.018 dealing with
animal registration (Dogs, Cats and Ferrets) for the City of Texas City. (Management Services).

 

(9) PUBLIC COMMENTS
 

(10) MAYOR'S COMMENTS
 

(11) COMMISSIONERS' COMMENTS
 

ADJOURNMENT
 

NOTICE OF ANY SUBJECT APPEARING ON THIS AGENDA REGARDLESS OF HOW THE MATTER IS STATED
MAY BE ACTED UPON BY THE CITY COMMISSION.
NOTICE:  The City of Texas City will furnish free transportation to handicapped individuals via a 4-door sedan for
anyone wishing to attend the City Commission meetings.  Call 948-3111, City Secretary's Office before noon on
Monday preceding the meeting to make arrangements.

I, THE UNDERSIGNED AUTHORITY, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS NOTICE OF MEETING WAS POSTED
ON THE BULLETIN BOARDS AT CITY HALL, 1801 9TH AVENUE NORTH, TEXAS CITY, TEXAS, AT A PLACE
CONVENIENT AND READILY ACCESSIBLE TO THE GENERAL PUBLIC AND ON THE CITY'S WEBSITE ON
FRIDAY, JULY 10, 2015, PRIOR TO 5:00 P.M. AND REMAINED SO POSTED CONTINUOUSLY FOR AT LEAST
72 HOURS PRECEDING THE SCHEDULED TIME OF SAID MEETING.

/s/ Nicholas J. Finan
NICHOLAS J. FINAN
CITY SECRETARY
 



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   4. (a.           
Meeting Date: 07/15/2015  
July 2015 Service Awards
Submitted For: Jennifer Price, Human Resources 
Submitted By: Susan Sensat, Administration
Department: Administration

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Service Awards
Tomas Gomez Public Works 07/01/2010 05 years
Billie Powers Parks & Recreation 07/05/2005 10 years

Retirement
Gary Boatright Fire 27 Years of Service

BACKGROUND

ANALYSIS

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   4. (b.           
Meeting Date: 07/15/2015  

Submitted By: Michelle Garcia, City Secretary
Department: City Secretary

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Check presentation to Mayor for Rotary Trail (Texas City Rotary Club)

BACKGROUND

ANALYSIS

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   5. (a.           
Meeting Date: 07/15/2015  

Submitted By: Michelle Garcia, City Secretary
Department: City Secretary

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Financial Quarterly Report (Finance)

BACKGROUND

ANALYSIS

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   6. (a.           
Meeting Date: 07/15/2015  
REZONING PUBLIC HEARING FOR CITY OF TEXAS CITY
Submitted For: Jean Vincent, Transportation and Planning 
Submitted By: Jean Vincent, Transportation and Planning
Department: Transportation and Planning

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
City of Texas City requests to rezone from “IBD” (Industrial Business District) to “Site-Plan” to
construct above ground storage tanks for petroleum products, bulk storage, equipment storage,
warehouses and offices. Being all of Block 223, 224,225, 226 and 227, T.C. 2nd Division.
Located in the 800 and 900 block of 4th Ave. So.

BACKGROUND
This request went before the Zoning Commission on June 16, 2015 for a Public Hearing. After
hearing all pertinent information and answering questions from surrounding property owners the
members unanimously voted approval of the rezoning request. (Reference minutes from
meeting for further details).

ANALYSIS

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
City of Texas City Rezoning Documents 















   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   7. (a.           
Meeting Date: 07/15/2015  

Submitted By: Michelle Garcia, City Secretary
Department: City Secretary

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Approve City Commission Minutes for July 1, 2015 meeting. (City Secretary) 

BACKGROUND

ANALYSIS

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   7. (b.           
Meeting Date: 07/15/2015  

Submitted By: Michelle Garcia, City Secretary
Department: City Secretary

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Consider and take action on Resolution 15-047,approving the re-appointment or appointment of
representatives to the Galveston County United Board of Health. (City Secretary)

BACKGROUND
In accordance with the Health District Inter-local Agreement executed December 2002, the
Court of Galveston County will submit member governments nominees for United Board of
Health positions. Approval by a majority of the member governments is required to confirm
appointment of each board member. This request is to approve all re-appointments and
appointments nominated.

On Tuesday, May 26, the Commissioners' Court nominated the following:

Term will be May 1, 2015 -April 30, 2017
Name Represents
Ben G. Raimer, MD UTMB (reappointment)
Eric Froeschner Interested Citizen (reappointment)
Mark Sonnier Interested Citizen (reappointment)
John Hackbarth , DDS Dentist (reappointment)
Tim Rainey Municipality (reappointment)
Steve Pratt Food Service/Food Sales Industry (reappointment)
Michael Roussos Mainland Medical Center (new appointment)

ANALYSIS

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Resolution No. 15-047 Ratify Appointments Galv. Cnty United Board of Health
United Board of Health Re-Appointments and Appointments



 RESOLUTION NO. 15-047 

 

A RESOLUTION ENDORSING THE APPOINTMENTS OF MUNICIPALITY 

REPRESENTATIVES TO COMPLETE THE TERM ON THE GALVESTON 

COUNTY UNITED BOARD OF HEALTH; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS 

RESOLUTION SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS 

PASSAGE AND ADOPTION. 

 

WHEREAS, members of the Galveston County United Board of Health are nominated by 

the Galveston County Commissioners Court and confirmed by the Member Governments of the 

Health District;  

 

WHEREAS, there are appointments under consideration; and 

 

WHEREAS, the Galveston County Commissioners’ Court has made its nominations. 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE 

CITY OF TEXAS CITY, TEXAS: 

 

SECTION 1: That the City Commission of the City of Texas City, Texas, hereby endorses 

the following Re-appointments and appointments to the Galveston County United Board of Health. 

 

Term will be May 1, 2015 – April 30, 2015 

 

Name     Represents 

Ben G. Raimer, M.D.    UTMB  (reappointment)     

Eric Froeschner   Interested Citizen (reappointment) 

Mark Sonnier    Interested Citizen (reappointment)  

John Hackbarth, D.D.S.  Dentist (reappointment) 

Tim Rainey    Municipality (reappointment)    

Steve Pratt    Food Service/Food Sales (reappointment) 

Michael Roussos                                Mainland Medical Center (new appointment) 
 

SECTION 2: That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage 

and adoption. 
 

PASSED AND ADOPTED this 15th day of July, 2015. 

 

 

                                                                 

     Matthew T. Doyle, Mayor  

City of Texas City, Texas 

 

 

ATTEST:      APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

 

 

                                                         ___________________________ 

Nicholas J. Finan     Ronald F. Plackemeier 

City Secretary      City Attorney 











   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   7. (c.           
Meeting Date: 07/15/2015  

Submitted By: Justin Herter, City Attorney Office
Department: City Attorney Office

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Consider and take action on Resolution 15-048, (Police Department)

BACKGROUND
We are requesting an HGAC grant in the amount of $26,060.00 for the purchase of body
cameras. There is no city match. The state is requiring that the attached resolution be
completed and approved by council and that I down load the “passed” resolution to their
website as soon as possible. 

ANALYSIS

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Resolution No. 15-048 -HGAC Grant for Body Cameras



 RESOLUTION NO. 15-048 
 

A RESOLUTION APPROVING THE SUBMISSION OF A HOUSTON-
GALVESTON AREA COUNCIL (HGAC) APPLICATION FOR THE BODY 
CAMERA IMPLEMENTATION PROJECT IN THE AMOUNT OF 
$26,060.00; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS RESOLUTION SHALL 
BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS PASSAGE AND 
ADOPTION. 

 
WHEREAS,  the City of Texas City finds it in the best interest of the citizens of Texas City , 

Texas,  that the Body Camera Implementation Project be operated for the 2015 (Year); and 
  
WHEREAS,  the City of Texas City agrees that in the event of loss or misuse of the Criminal 

Justice Division funds, City of Texas City assures that the funds will be returned to the Criminal 
Justice Division in full; and 

 
WHEREAS, the City of Texas City designates Matthew Doyle – Mayor as the grantee’s 

authorized official.  The authorized official is given the power to apply for, accept, reject, alter or 
terminate the grant on behalf of the applicant agency. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE 
CITY OF TEXAS CITY, TEXAS: 
 
 SECTION 1:  That the City Commission of the City of Texas City hereby approves the 
submission of a Houston-Galveston area council (HGAC) application for the body camera 
implementation project in the amount of $26,060.00 
 

SECTION 2:  That the Mayor is given the power to apply for, accept, reject, alter or terminate 
the grant on behalf of the applicant agency. 
 
 SECTION 3:  That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage 
and adoption. 
 
 PASSED AND ADOPTED this 15th day of July, 2015. 
 
 
       _________________________ 
       Matthew T. Doyle, Mayor   
       City of Texas City, Texas 
 
 
ATTEST:      APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
__________________________   __________________________ 
Nicholas J. Finan     Ronald F. Plackemeier 
City Secretary      City Attorney 



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   7. (d.           
Meeting Date: 07/15/2015  
BID # 2015-091 Solid Waste Disposal Annual Contract
Submitted For: Mike McKinley, Public Works  Submitted By: Mike McKinley, Public

Works
Department: Public Works

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Consider and take action on Resolution No. 15-049, approving and awarding Bid # 2015-091
Solid Waste Disposal Annual Contract. (Public Works)

BACKGROUND
Bid packets were sent to the two local landfills. The bids were opened on Thursday, June 25,
2015 at 2:00 p.m.. The low responsible bid meeting all specifications was received from
Republic Services.

ANALYSIS
It is the recommendation of the Publics Works Department, to award Bid # 2015-091 Solid
Waste Disposal Annual Contract to Republic Service, and that the Mayor is authorized to
execute a contract on behalf of the City Commission. A bid tabulation is attached for your
review.

Thank you.

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Resolution No. 15-049 Solid Waste Disposal Annual Contract
Exhibit A



RESOLUTION NO. 15-049 
 

A RESOLUTION APPROVING AND AWARDING BID # 2015-091 SOLID 
WASTE DISPOSAL ANNUAL CONTRACT; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS 
RESOLUTION SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS 
PASSAGE AND ADOPTION.  
 
 
WHEREAS, bid packets were mailed to area vendors for the Solid Waste Disposal Annual 

Contract, Bid No. 2015-091; and 
 
WHEREAS, bids were opened on Thursday, June 25, 2015 at 2:00 p.m.; and, 
 
WHEREAS,  the low responsible bid meeting all specifications was received from Republic 

Services, Texas. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE 

CITY OF TEXAS CITY, TEXAS: 
 

SECTION 1: That the successful bidders for the Residential Solid Waste Collection and 
Disposal annual contract, Bid No. 2015-091, is Republic Services, Houston, Texas. 
 
 SECTION 2: That the Mayor is hereby authorized to enter into an annual contract with 
Republic Services, Houston, Texas, for Residential Solid Waste Collection and Disposal annual 
contract, Bid No. 2015-091, for the respective unit price bids in Exhibit “A”, as attached hereto and 
incorporated herein for all intents and purposes. 
 
 SECTION 3: That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage 
and adoption. 
 
 PASSED AND ADOPTED this 15th day of July, 2015. 
 
 
                                                      
       Matthew T. Doyle, Mayor    
       City of Texas City, Texas 
 
 
ATTEST:      APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
                                                         _____________________________       
Nicholas J. Finan     Ronald F. Plackemeier 
City Secretary      City Attorney 
 



BID TAB. TOTALS 
 

BID # 2015-091 
 

Solid Waste Disposal Annual Contract 
 

Bid Opening: Thursday, June 25, 2015 @ 2:00 p.m. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

                                                                                                     VENDOR 
SERVICE REPUBLIC SERVICES WASTE MANAGEMENT 

Receive & Dispose of Loose 
Garbage        

 
2000 yd/mo 

$6.15/YD 
 

$12300.00 

$9.25/YD 
 

$18500.00 
Receive & Dispose of Compacted  

Garbage  
 

2000 yd/mo 

$6.85/YD 
 

$13700.00 

$12.25/YD 
 

$24500.00 
Receive & Dispose of Loose 

Rubbish 
 

2000 yd/mo 

$6.15/YD 
 

$12300.00 

$9.25/YD 
 

$18500.00 
Receive & Dispose of Compacted  

Rubbish 
 

2000 yd/mo 

$6.85/YD 
 

$13700.00 

$12.25/YD 
 

$24500.00 
 



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   7. (e.           
Meeting Date: 07/15/2015  
Bid # 2015-089 Liquid Asphalt - Transport Load
Submitted For: Mike McKinley, Public Works  Submitted By: Mike McKinley, Public

Works
Department: Public Works

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Consider and take action on Resolution No. 15-050, approving and awarding Bid # 2015-089
Liquid Asphalt - Transport Load. (Public Works)

BACKGROUND
Bids were opened Thursday, June 24, 2015 at 2 p.m. The low responsible bid meeting all the
specifications was received from Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc. A bid tabulation is attached
for your review.

ANALYSIS
It is the recommendation of the Public Works Department to award Bid # 2015-089 Liquid
Asphalt - Transport Load Annual Contract to Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc., and that the
Mayor is authorized to execute a contract on behalf of the City Commission.

Thank you.

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Resolution No. 15-050 Award Bid - Liquid Asphalt Transport Loads
Exhibit A



RESOLUTION NO. 15-050 
 
A RESOLUTION APPROVING AND AWARDING BID # 2015-089 
LIQUID ASPHALT - TRANSPORT LOAD; AND PROVIDING THAT 
THIS RESOLUTION SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER 
ITS PASSAGE AND ADOPTION. 
  
WHEREAS, bids were mailed/picked up by area vendors for Bid No. 2015-089 Liquid 

Asphalt Transport Load Annual Contract; and,  
 
WHEREAS, bids were opened Thursday, June 24, 2015 at 2 p.m. The low responsible 

bid meeting all the specifications was received from Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc., as set out 
on the bid tabulation attached hereto as Exhibit “A” and made a part hereof for all intents and 
purposes. 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE 

CITY OF TEXAS CITY, TEXAS: 
 
SECTION 1: That the City Commission hereby accepts the contract by Cleveland 

Asphalt Products, Inc. for Liquid Asphalt Transport Load Annual Contract. 
 
SECTION 2: That the Mayor is hereby authorized to enter into a contract with Cleveland 

Asphalt Products, Inc. for Liquid Asphalt Transport Load. 
 
SECTION 3: That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its 

passage and adoption. 
 
 
PASSED AND ADOPTED this 15th day of July, 2015. 
 
 
      _________________________ 

Matthew T. Doyle, Mayor 
      City of Texas City, Texas 
 
 
 

ATTEST:      APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 

________________________   _________________________ 
Nicholas J. Finan     Ronald F. Plackemeier 
City Secretary      City Attorney 



BID TAB. TOTALS 

 2015-089 LIQUID ASPHALT – TRANSPORT LOAD 

Bid Opening: Thursday, June 24, 2015 at 2 p.m. 

 

BIDDER CRS-2 
Cationic Emulsion 

 
 

6,000 gallons 

SS-1 
Slow Set Emulsion 

 
 

10000 gallons 

EAP & T 
Prime and Tack 

 
 

10000 gallons 

Cleveland Asphalt 
Products 

 

$1.9925/gal. 
 

$11955.00 

1.9925/gal 
 

$19925.00 

$1.9925/gal. 
 

$19925.00 
Martin Asphalt 

Company 
No bid No bid No bid 



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   7. (f.           
Meeting Date: 07/15/2015  
RFP # 2015-090 Temporary Employment Services Annual Contract
Submitted For: Rita Williams, Purchasing  Submitted By: Rita Williams, Purchasing 
Department: Human Resources

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Consider and take action on Resolution No. 15-051, approving and awarding RFP # 2015-090
Temporary Employment Services Annual Contract. (Human Resources)

BACKGROUND
Proposal packets were mailed to area vendors on June 10, 2015. A proposal tabulation is
attached fro your review.

The proposals were opened and reviewed by Jennifer Price, HR Director on Thursday, June 25,
2015. 

ANALYSIS
The low responsible proposal meeting all specifications was received by Action Personnel, Inc.,
in Texas City for the hourly/billing rates proposed.

It is my recommendation and the recommendation of the HR Director to award RFP # 2015-090
Temporary Employment Services Annual Contract to Action Personnel, Inc., for the
hourly/billing rates proposed and that the Mayor be authorized to execute a contract on behalf of
the City Commission.

Thank you.

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Resolution No. 15-051 Temporary Employment Services Contract
Exhibit A



 RESOLUTION NO. 15-051 
 

A RESOLUTION AWARDING A BID AND AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR 
TO ENTER INTO AN AGREEMENT FOR TEMPORARY EMPLOYMENT 
SERVICES ANNUAL CONTRACT; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS 
RESOLUTION SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS 
PASSAGE AND ADOPTION. 
 
WHEREAS, on June 10, 2015, request for proposal packets were mailed to area vendors for 

temporary employment services annual contract, Request for Proposal No. 2015-090; and 
 
WHEREAS, proposals were opened and reviewed by Jennifer Price, Human Resources 

Director, on Thursday, June 25, 2015; and, 
 
WHEREAS, the lowest proposal meeting specifications was submitted by Action Personnel, 

Inc., in Texas City. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE 
CITY OF TEXAS CITY, TEXAS: 
 

SECTION 1: That Action Personnel, Inc. is awarded the temporary employment services 
annual contract, RFP No. No. 2015-090, as recommended by the Human Resources Director and the 
Purchasing Coordinator.  

 
SECTION 2: That the Mayor is hereby authorized to enter into an agreement with Action 

Personnel, Inc. for temporary employment services annual contract for the total bid amounts as 
described in Exhibit “A,” attached hereto and made a part hereof for all intents and purposes. 
 

SECTION 3: That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage 
and adoption. 
 

PASSED AND ADOPTED this 15th day of July, 2015. 
 
 
 

      _________________________ 
      Matthew T. Doyle, Mayor   
      City of Texas City, Texas 
 
 

ATTEST:      APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
________________________   _________________________ 
Nicholas J. Finan     Ronald F. Plackemeier 
City Secretary      City Attorney 



PROPOSAL TABULATION FORM 
 

RFP # 2015-090 
TEMPORARY EMPLOYMENT SERVICES ANNUAL CONTRACT 

 

Proposals due: Thursday June 25, 2015 at 2:00 p.m. 
 

VENDOR 
CATEGORIES OF 

SERVICES 
Action Personnel, Inc. 

Texas City, Texas 
TEI Staffing 
Alvin, Texas 

Ann Best Elite Temp. 
Texas City, Texas 

Previous 
Contract 

Administrative 
Assistant 

*$10.50 
$15.22 

*$18.00 
$25.80 

NO BID *$10.50 
$15.44 

Clerk/Cashier 
 

*$9.00 
$13.05 

*$12.00 
$17.20 

NO BID *$8.00 
$11.76 

Deputy Court 
Clerk 

*$10.00 
$14.50 

*$14.00 
$20.08 

NO BID *$9.50 
$13.97 

Custodian 
 

*$9.00 
$13.50 

*$11.00 
$16.84 

NO BID *$8.00 
$11.76 

Laborer(General) 
 

*$8.50 
$12.33 

*$9.00 
$13.78 

NO BID *$8.00 
$11.76 

Network 
Administrator 

*$15.00 
$21.75 

*$22.00 
$31.55 

NO BID *$15.00 
$22.05 

 
* HOURLY PAY RATES 

 
  BILLING RATE 



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   7. (g.           
Meeting Date: 07/15/2015  
BID #2015-093 Removal of Debris from the Bioreactor
Submitted For: Mike McKinley, Public Works  Submitted By: Mike McKinley, Public

Works
Department: Public Works

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Approve and award a contract for Bid #2015-093 Removal of Debris from the Bioreactor.

BACKGROUND
Bid packets were mailed out to area vendors on June 18, 2015. Bids were opened on Monday,
July 6, 2015, at 2:00 p.m.
The responsible bid meeting all specifications was received from Synagro South, LLC. for the
total bid amount of $43,575.00. A bid tabulation is attached for your review.

ANALYSIS
It is the recommendation of the Utilities Department to award BID # 2015-093, Removal of
Debris from the Bioreactor, to Synagro South LLC. for the total bid amount of $43,575.00, and
that the Mayor is authorized to execute a contract on behalf of the City Commission.

The Utilities Department further requests that the Mayor be authorized to execute change
orders, not to exceed 25% of the contract amount, without bringing the matter before the
Commission

Thank you

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Exhibit A



BID TAB TOTALS 
 

BID # 2015-093 
 

Removal of Debris From the BioReactor 
 

Bid Opening: Monday, July 6, 2015 @ 2:00 p.m. 
 

VENDOR 
SERVICE SYNAGRO SPECIALIZED MAINTENANCE 

SERVICES, INC. 
 
 
 

 
Price Per Cubic  

Yard 

 
$124.50 

 
$141.67 

 

    

 
Total Bid Amount 

Based on 350 Cubic Yards 

 
$43,575.00 

 
$49,584.50 

 

 



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   Res 13-078           
Meeting Date: 07/15/2015  
Approve Traffic Safety Grant- STEP Grant
Submitted By: Justin Herter, City Attorney Office
Department: City Attorney Office

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Approve Texas Traffic Safety Grant's
Fiscal Year 2016
ID: 2016-TexasCit-S-1YG-0017
Period: 10/01/2015 to 09/30/2016

Total Award: $67,970.98
Amount Eligible for Reimbursement by Department of Transportation $33,427.97
Match Amount provided by City of Texas City $34,543.01

BACKGROUND

ANALYSIS

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Res No 15-053



 

 

 RESOLUTION NO. 15-053 

 

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF 

TRANSPORTATION SELECTIVE TRAFFIC ENFORCEMENT PROGRAM 

TRAFFIC SAFETY 2016 GRANT #2016-TEXASCIT-S-1YG-0017; AND 

PROVIDING THAT THIS RESOLUTION SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE 

FROM AND AFTER ITS PASSAGE AND ADOPTION. 

 

 

 WHEREAS, the Texas Department of Transportation (TXDOT) offers a grant for 

reimbursement for a selective traffic enforcement program; 

 

WHEREAS, the City of Texas City Police Department is eligible for $33,427.97, which 

must be matched by City funds in the amount of 34,543.01, under a reimbursement grant for the 

period of October 1, 2015 to September 30, 2016. 

 

WHEREAS, the Texas Department of Transportation (TXDOT) awarded the City of Texas 

City, specifically the Texas City Police Department, such grant funding upon approval of the terms 

and conditions of the attached Grant Agreement. 

 

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE CITY OF TEXAS CITY, 

TEXAS: 

 

SECTION 1: That the City Commission hereby accepts the Texas Traffic Safety Program 

Grant and approves of the terms and conditions of the Texas Traffic Safety Program Grant 

Agreement, attached hereto as Exhibit “A”, and made a part hereof for all intents and purposes.   

 

SECTION 2:  That the Mayor is hereby authorized to execute the documentation necessary 

to receive said grant funding. 

 

SECTION 3:  That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage 

and adoption. 

 

 PASSED AND ADOPTED this 15th day of July, 2015. 

 

 

_____________________________ 

Matthew Doyle, Mayor 

City of Texas City, Texas 

 

ATTEST:               APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

 

                                                        _____________________________     

Nicholas J. Finan     Ronald F. Plackemeier 

City Secretary      City Attorney 



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   8. (a.           
Meeting Date: 07/15/2015  
Permanent Rezoning of Property - Stripes
Submitted For: Jean Vincent, Transportation and Planning 
Submitted By: Jean Vincent, Transportation and Planning
Department: Transportation and Planning

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Consider approval of an ordinance to permanently rezone property for Stripe Convenience
Stores from “C”(Multi-Family Residential) and “A” (Single Family Residential) to “E” (General
Business) to construct a fuel station / convenience store. Being a 1.5441 acre tract out of a
1.9631 acre tract, being part of Lot 3, Boudreaux’s Re-plat. Located in the 2800 block of Loop
197 North (corner of 29th Street and Loop 197 North).

BACKGROUND
This item previously received approval by both the Zoning Commission and City Commission. A
building permit has been issued and this item is now ready for final zoning approval by
ordinance.

ANALYSIS

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Ordinance No. 15-20 - Rezone C and A to E - Fuel Station - Convenience Store



ORDINANCE NO. 15-21 
 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 40 OF THE CODE OF 
ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF TEXAS CITY, GALVESTON COUNTY, 
TEXAS, ALSO KNOWN AS THE ZONING ORDINANCE, TO 
PERMANENTLY REZONE PROPERTY FOR STRIPE CONVENIENCE 
STORES FROM “C”(MULTI-FAMILY RESIDENTIAL) AND “A” 
(SINGLE FAMILY RESIDENTIAL) TO “E” (GENERAL BUSINESS) TO 
CONSTRUCT A FUEL STATION / CONVENIENCE STORE, BEING A 
1.5441 ACRE TRACT OUT OF A 1.9631 ACRE TRACT, BEING PART OF 
LOT 3, BOUDREAUX’S RE-PLAT, LOCATED IN THE 2800 BLOCK OF 
LOOP 197 NORTH (CORNER OF 29TH STREET AND LOOP 197 NORTH) 
TEXAS CITY, GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS; ORDERING SAID 
CHANGES MADE ON THE CITY ZONING MAP; CONTAINING A 
SAVINGS CLAUSE; PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL OF ALL 
ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT THEREWITH; DISPENSING WITH THE 
CHARTER REQUIREMENT FOR READING THIS ORDINANCE ON 
THREE (3) SEPARATE DAYS; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS 
ORDINANCE SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS 
PASSAGE AND ADOPTION AND PUBLICATION BY CAPTION ONLY 
IN THE OFFICIAL NEWSPAPER OF THE CITY. 
 
WHEREAS, proper notice has been given and public hearing was held and given 

unanimous approval by the Zoning Commission; and, 
 

WHEREAS, and it is the considered opinion of the City Commission that said Ordinance 
be amended and changed. 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE 

CITY OF TEXAS CITY, TEXAS: 
 
 SECTION 1:  That certain property located in the 2800 block of loop 197 north (corner of 
29th street and loop 197 north) Texas city, Galveston County, Texas, currently zoned as “C” 
(Multi-Family Residential) and “A” (Single Family Residential), is hereby rezoned and classified 
as “E” (General Business), to construct a fuel station / convenience store. 

 
  SECTION 2:  That the City Engineer shall designate said changes from as “C” (Multi-
Family Residential) and “A” (Single Family Residential), to “E” (General Business), as 
hereinabove provided, on the original zoning map, as amended, and on the duplicate copy thereof 
kept in the Office of the City Planning Board. 
 
           SECTION 3: That all ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of 
this Ordinance are hereby repealed.  In the event any section, clause, sentence, paragraph, or part 
of this Ordinance shall be for any reason adjudged by any court of competent jurisdiction to be 
invalid, such invalidity shall not affect, invalidate, or impair the remainder of this Ordinance. 
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 SECTION 4: That the Charter requirement for reading this Ordinance on three (3) 
separate days has been dispensed by a majority vote of the City Commission. 
  
 SECTION 5: That this Ordinance shall be finally passed upon the date of its introduction 
and shall become effective from and after its passage and adoption and publication by caption 
only in the official newspaper of the City. 
 
 
 PASSED AND ADOPTED this 15th day of July, 2015. 
 
 
 

__________________________ 
Matthew T. Doyle, Mayor   
City of Texas City, Texas 

 
 
 
ATTEST:       APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
________________________    _______________________ 
Nicholas J. Finan      Ronald F. Plackemeier 
City Secretary       City Attorney 



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   8. (b.           
Meeting Date: 07/15/2015  
ORDINANCE TO PERMANENTLY REZONE PROPERTY
Submitted For: Jean Vincent, Transportation and Planning 
Submitted By: Jean Vincent, Transportation and Planning
Department: Transportation and Planning

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Consider approval of an ordinance to permanently rezone property for City of Texas City from
“IBD” (Industrial Business District) to “Site-Plan” to construct above ground storage tanks for
petroleum products, bulk storage, equipment storage, warehouses and offices. Being all of
Block 223, 224,225, 226 and 227, T.C. 2nd Division. Located in the 800 and 900 block of 4th
Ave. So.

BACKGROUND
This request was previously given unanimous approval by the Zoning Commission during a
Public Hearing held on June 16, 2015. It is now ready for the ordinance to permanently rezone
the property.

ANALYSIS

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Ordinance No. 15-21 - Rezone IBD to S-P -Construct above ground Storage Tanks



ORDINANCE NO. 15-21 
 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 40 OF THE CODE OF 
ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF TEXAS CITY, GALVESTON 
COUNTY, TEXAS, ALSO KNOWN AS THE ZONING ORDINANCE, TO 
PERMANENTLY REZONE PROPERTY FOR CITY OF TEXAS 
CITY FROM “IBD” (INDUSTRIAL BUSINESS DISTRICT) TO “SITE-
PLAN” TO CONSTRUCT ABOVE GROUND STORAGE TANKS FOR 
PETROLEUM PRODUCTS, BULK STORAGE, EQUIPMENT 
STORAGE, WAREHOUSES AND OFFICES, BEING ALL OF BLOCK 
223, 224,225, 226 AND 227, T.C. 2ND DIVISION, LOCATED AT 
LOCATED IN THE 800 AND 900 BLOCK OF 4TH AVENUE SOUTH 
TEXAS CITY, GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS; ORDERING SAID 
CHANGES MADE ON THE CITY ZONING MAP; CONTAINING A 
SAVINGS CLAUSE; PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL OF ALL 
ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT THEREWITH; DISPENSING WITH THE 
CHARTER REQUIREMENT FOR READING THIS ORDINANCE ON 
THREE (3) SEPARATE DAYS; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS 
ORDINANCE SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND AFTER ITS 
PASSAGE AND ADOPTION AND PUBLICATION BY CAPTION ONLY 
IN THE OFFICIAL NEWSPAPER OF THE CITY. 
 
WHEREAS, proper notice has been given and public hearing was held on June 16, 2015 

and given unanimous approval by the Zoning Commission, and 
 
WHEREAS, and it is the considered opinion of the City Commission that said Ordinance 

be amended and changed. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE 
CITY OF TEXAS CITY, TEXAS: 
 
 SECTION 1:  That certain property located at the 800 and 900 block of 4th Avenue South, 
being all of Block 223, 224,225, 226 and 227, T.C. 2nd Division, Texas City, Galveston County, 
Texas, currently zoned as District “IBD” (Industrial Business District), is hereby rezoned and 
classified as District “S-P” (Site Plan), to construct above ground storage tanks for petroleum 
products, bulk storage, equipment storage, warehouses and offices. 

 
  SECTION 2:  That the City Engineer shall designate said changes from District “IBD” 
(Industrial Business District), to District “S-P,” Site Plan, as hereinabove provided, on the original 
zoning map, as amended, and on the duplicate copy thereof kept in the Office of the City Planning 
Board. 
 
           SECTION 3: That all ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of 
this Ordinance are hereby repealed.  In the event any section, clause, sentence, paragraph, or part 
of this Ordinance shall be for any reason adjudged by any court of competent jurisdiction to be 
invalid, such invalidity shall not affect, invalidate, or impair the remainder of this Ordinance. 
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 SECTION 4: That the Charter requirement for reading this Ordinance on three (3) 
separate days has been dispensed by a majority vote of the City Commission. 
  
 SECTION 5: That this Ordinance shall be finally passed upon the date of its introduction 
and shall become effective from and after its passage and adoption and publication by caption only 
in the official newspaper of the City. 
 
 
 PASSED AND ADOPTED this 15th day of July, 2015. 
 
 
 

__________________________ 
Matthew T. Doyle, Mayor   
City of Texas City, Texas 

 
 
 
ATTEST:       APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
________________________    _______________________ 
Nicholas J. Finan      Ronald F. Plackemeier 
City Secretary       City Attorney 



   
CITY COMMISSION REGULAR MTG   8. (c.           
Meeting Date: 07/15/2015  

Submitted By: Michelle Garcia, City Secretary
Department: City Secretary

Information
ACTION REQUEST (Brief Summary)
Consider and take action on Ordinance No. 15-23, amending Section 95.017 and 95.018
dealing with animal registration (Dogs, cats and Ferrets) for the City of Texas City (Management
Services).

BACKGROUND
The Animal Resource Center is under the Control of the Galveston County Health District.
There is a board of advisors to the Animal Resource Center that includes Texas City as one of
the municipalities that participates on the board. The advisory board recommended to the
Health District Board that there be a unified fee schedule for pet registration. The board
approved. The City of Texas City now needs to amend its ordinances to reflect the unified
change. Our current ordinance had a $10 lifetime pet registration fee while the County was a $5
annual fee. The proposed change in our ordinance is now a $20 lifetime pet registration fee that
includes a microchip. The microchip alone would be worth more than $20.

Attached is Section 6 of the Health District Animal Control Policies that deals with the pet
registration requirements including the microchipping. The ordinance attached states these will
be our policies as they are or as they are modified.

ANALYSIS

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Fiscal Impact

Attachments
Ordiance No. 15-22 - Amending Section 95.017 and 95.018 - Animal Registration
Animal-Services-Policy - Section 6



ORDINANCE NO. 15-22 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTIONS 95.017 AND 95.018 DEALING 
WITH ANIMAL REGISTRATION (DOGS, CATS AND FERRETS) FOR 
THE CITY OF TEXAS CITY; DIRECTING THE CHIEF EXECUTIVE 
OFFICER TO FILE OR CAUSE TO BE FILED A COPY OF THE 
ORDINANCE IN THE OFFICE OF THE GALVESTON COUNTY 
CLERK; DISPENSING WITH THE REQUIREMENT FOR READING 
THIS ORDINANCE ON THREE (3) SEPARATE DAYS AND PROVIDING 
THAT THIS ORDINANCE SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE FROM AND 
AFTER ITS PASSAGE AND ADOPTION. 
 

 WHEREAS, the City of Texas City authorizes the Galveston County Health District to 
enforce registration of animals (Dogs, Cats and Ferrets) for the City of Texas City; and 

 WHEREAS, the City of Texas City adopts policies/ordinances established by the District 
including registration fees, relating to animal registration; and 

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE 
CITY OF TEXAS CITY, TEXAS: 

 SECTION 1: That the City Commission of the City of Texas City, Texas, hereby 
approves amending Sections 95.017 and 95.018 dealing with animal registration (Dogs, cats and 
Ferrets) for the City of Texas City. 

 SECTION 2: That The Code of Ordinances of the City of Texas City, Texas, Title IX, 
Chapter 95 (Animals), is amended to read and provide as follows: 

Section 95.017 is changed to read: 

§ 95.017 ISSUANCE OF TAG; FEE; WEARING OF TAG; REPLACEMENT TAGS. 
 
(A) Upon the presentation of proof of vaccination of each dog or cat and the payment of 

a fee of $10, the Galveston County Animal Resource Center shall furnish the owner 
thereof a durable tag per animal. The tag shall be valid for the time of ownership or 
control of such animal and shall at all times be securely attached to a collar or 
harness around the neck of the animal. The City of Texas City authorizes the 
Galveston County Health District to enforce registration of animals (Dogs, Cats and 
Ferrets) for the City of Texas City and further, the City of Texas City adopts 
policies/ordinances established by the District including registration fees, relating to 
animal registration. 
 

(B) In the event of replacement for a lost tag or change in ownership or control of such 
animal, there shall be a fee of $10. 

 
(1998 Code, § 18-33) 
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 Section 95.018 is changed to read: 
 
§ 95.018 RECORDS OF TAGS. 
 
The Galveston County Animal Resource Center shall prepare a card upon which shall be 
recorded the name of the person receiving an identification tag under § 95.017 of this 
chapter, his or her address, a description of the animal for which a tag is issued and the 
date of inoculation. The card shall be kept in such a place as to be readily available to the 
Galveston County Animal Resource Center for inspection. 
 
(1998 Code, § 18-34) 

 
 SECTION 3: That the City Charter requirement for reading this Ordinance on three (3) 
separate days has been dispensed by a majority vote of the City Commission. 

SECTION 4: That this Ordinance shall be passed and adopted on the date of its 
introduction, and shall become effective from and after its passage and adoption. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED this 15th day of July, 2015.   

 

_____________________________   
Matthew T. Doyle, Mayor 
City of Texas City, Texas 

 
 
 
ATTEST:      APPROVED AS TO FORM 
 
 
 
______________________________    _____________________________  
Nicholas J. Finan     Ronald F. Plackemeier 
City Secretary      City Attorney 

http://www.amlegal.com/nxt/gateway.dll?f=jumplink$jumplink_x=Advanced$jumplink_vpc=first$jumplink_xsl=querylink.xsl$jumplink_sel=title;path;content-type;home-title;item-bookmark$jumplink_d=texas(texascity_tx)$jumplink_q=%5bfield%20folio-destination-name:'95.017'%5d$jumplink_md=target-id=JD_95.017
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