
City of Texas City 
 

BID TABULATION 

 2021-094 CEMENT STABILIZED SAND ANNUAL CONTRACT 

Bid Opening: Tuesday, March 09, 2021 at 10:00 a.m. 

 
BIDDER JDB SERVICES 

Inc. 
SCC Materials  WADERA 

Construction 
1-1/2 SACK 
300 TONS 

$17.73 
$5,319.00 

$28.00 
$8,400 

NO BID 

1-1/2 SACK 
DELIVERED 

$21.60 
$6,480.00 

$36.20 
$10,860.00 

NO BID 

2 SACK 
200 TONS 

$17.51 
$3,502.00 

$30.54 
$6,108.00 

NO BID 

2 SACK 
DELIVERED 

$24.20 
$4,840.00 

$38.74 
$7,748.00 

NO BID 

3 SACK 
100 TONS 

$23.07 
$2,307.00 

$35.62 
$3,562.00 

NO BID 

3 SACK 
DELIVERED 

$31.14 
$3,114.00 

$42.82 
$4,282.00 

NO BID 

TOTAL BASE 
BID F.O.B. 

 
$11,128.00 

 

 
$18,070.00 

 
NO BID 

TOTAL BASE 
DELIVERED 

 
$14,434.00 

 

 
$22,890.00 

 
NO BID 

 


