City of Texas City

BID TABULATION

2021-097 Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Curb Inlet, Catch Basin, and Sealer Annual
Contract

Bid Opening: Wednesday, April 14, 2021 at 10 a.m.

BIDDER Hanson Pipe | South Houston | Concrete ASAP
TEM and Precast Concrete Pipe

1” Joint Sealer No Bid $45.00 No Bid
1 %" Joint Sealer No Bid $55.00 No Bid
12" R.C.P. No Bid $18.00/ft No Bid
15" R.C.P. No Bid $22.00/ft No Bid
18" R.C.P. No Bid $27.00/ft No Bid
24" R.C.P. No Bid $36.00/ft No Bid
30" R.C.P. No Bid $48.00/ft No Bid
36" R.C.P. No Bid $74.00/ft No Bid
12" Catch Basin No Bid $120.00 No Bid
18" Catch Basin No Bid $345.00 No Bid
24" Catch Basin No Bid $450.00 No Bid
Type “B” Inlet No Bid $1300.00 No Bid
Type “B-B” Inlet No Bid $1600.00 No Bid
Type “C” Inlet No Bid $1400.00 No Bid
Type “H-2" Inlet No Bid $1700.00 No Bid
% Discount on No Bid 0 No Bid

Items Not Listed

* Did not bid all items requested




