
BID TAB TOTALS 

 2021-109 VEGETATION MANAGEMENT CHEMICALS 

Bid Opening September 23, 2021 at 2:00 p.m. 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Nutrien Ag 
Solutions 

 

Helena 
 

Red River 

41% Glyphosate 
2.5 Gal. Container 

Unit / Extended 

$42.00 
 

$2,016.00 

 
NO BID 

$95.00  
 

$4,560.00 
41% Glyphosate 

30 Gal. Drum 
Unit / Extended 

$487.50 
 

$1,950.00 

 
NO BID 

$1,140.00 
 

$4,560.00 
Aquatic Glyphosate 
2.5 Gal. container 
Unit / Extended 

$54.38 
 

$1,305.00 

 
NO BID 

$100.00 
 

$2,400.00 
Aquatic Glyphosate 

30 Gal. Drum 
Unit / Extended 

$642.60 
 

$1,285.20 

 
NO BID 

$1,200.00 
 

$2,400.00 
Arsenal 

2.5 Gal. Container 
Unit / Extended 

$114.23 
 

$1,370.70 

 
NO BID 

$155.60 
 

$1,867.20 
Arsenal 

30 Gal. Drum 
Unit / Extended 

$1,370.70 
 

$1,370.70 

 
NO BID 

$1,867.20 
 

$1,867.20 
Garlon 3-A 

2.5 Gal Container 
Unit / Extended 

$141.25 
 

$3,390.00 

 
NO BID 

$146.60 
 

$3,518.40 
Garlon 3-A 

30 Gal. Drum 
Unit / Extended 

$1,695.00 
 

$3,390.00 

 
NO BID 

$1.759.20 
 

$3,518.40 
Plateau 
1 Gal. 

Unit / Extended 

$104.50 
 

$418.00 

 
NO BID 

$130.00 
 

$520.00 
Oust 

3 LB Container 
Unit / Extended 

$78.75 
 

$157.50 

 
NO BID 

$108.66 
 

$217.32 

ITEM Nutrien Ag 
Solutions 

 

Helena 
 

Red River 



BID TAB TOTALS 

 2021-109 VEGETATION MANAGEMENT CHEMICALS 

Bid Opening September 23, 2021 at 2:00 p.m. 

 

 

ITEM Nutrien  Ag 
Solutions 

Helena Red River 

Surfactant 
2.5 Gal. Container 

Unit / Extended 

$23.50 
 

$564.00 

 
NO BID 

$40.00 
 

$960.00 
Surfactant 

30 Gal. Drum 
Unit / Extended 

$282.00 
 

$564.00 

 
NO BID 

$480.00 
 

$960.00 
Aquatic Surfactant 
2.5 Gal. Container 

Unit / Extended 

$36.25 
 

$145.00 

 
NO BID 

$40.00 
 

$160.00 
Nu Film – IR 

2.5 Gal. Container 
Unit / Extended 

$92.50 
 

$740.00 

 
NO BID 

$105.70 
 

$845.00 
Drift Control 
Per Quart 

Unit / Extended 

$10.45 
 

$209.00 

 
NO BID 

$11.28 
 

$225.60 
Drift Control 
Per Gallon 

Unit / Extended 

$41.80 
 

$209.00 

 
NO BID 

$34.00 
 

$170.00 
Tank Cleaner 

Per Gallon 
Unit / Extended 

$31.00 
 

$310.00 

 
NO BID 

$23.88 
 

$238.80 
Marking Dye 
Per Gallon 

Unit / Extended 

$16.10 
 

$161.00 

 
NO BID 

$22.00 
 

$220.00 
Marking Dye 

2.5 Gallon Container 
Unit / Extended 

$40.25 
 

$161.00 

 
NO BID 

$52.50 
 

$210.00 
Reward 

Per Gallon 
Unit / Extended 

$77.25 
 

$77.25 

 
NO BID 

$54.00 
 

$54.00 
 

TOTAL EXTENDED 
 

$19,793.35 
 

NO BID 
 

$29,471.92 


