
BID TABULATION 
Bid # 2022-009 

Rental and Service of Portable Toilets 
Bid Opening Wednesday, February 02, 2022 

 
Monthly Rental and Service of Portable Toilet 

 
 
 

Description 

 
 

 
Unit 

C. Johnnie 
on the Spot 

Texas 
Outhouse Inc. 

Pot-O-Gold Texas Waste 
Co. 

United Site 
Service 

 
Service one time per 
week 

 
 

 
Per Unit 
Per Month 

 
 

$40.00 

 
 

$75.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
Service two times 
per week 

 
 

 
Per Unit 
Per Month 

 
 

$60.00 

 
 

$100.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
Services three times 
per week 
 
 

 
Per Unit 
Per Month 

 
 

$80.00 

 
 

$125.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
Services four times 
per week 
 
 

 
Per Unit  
Per Month 

 
 

$135.00 

 
 

$150.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
Additional  service 
on existing service 
day 
 

  
 

$15.00 

 
 

$15.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
Two services on  
non-service day 
 
 

  
 

$30.00 

 
 

$20.00 

 
 

No Bid 
 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
Additional  Service 
non-service day 
 
 

  
 

15.00 

 
 

$25.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 

 

 

 



BID TABULATION 
Bid # 2022-009 

Rental and Service of Portable Toilets 
Bid Opening Wednesday, February 02, 2022 

 
Monthly Rental and Service of Handicap Portable Toilet 

 
 
 

Description 

 
 

 
Unit 

C. Johnnie 
on the Spot 

Texas 
Outhouse Inc. 

Pot-O-Gold Texas Waste 
Co. 

United Site 
Service 

 
Service one time per 
week 

 
 

 
Per Unit 
Per Month 

 
 

$40.00 

 
 

$85.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
Service two times 
per week 

 
 

 
Per Unit 
Per Month 

 
 

$60.00 

 
 

$110.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
Services three times 
per week 
 
 

 
Per Unit 
Per Month 

 
 

$80.00 

 
 

$135.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
Services four times 
per week 
 
 

 
Per Unit  
Per Month 

 
 

$135.00 

 
 

$160.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
Additional  service 
on existing service 
day 
 

  
 

$15.00 

 
 

$15.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
Two services on  
non-service day 
 
 

  
 

$30.00 

 
 

$20.00 

 
 

No Bid 
 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
Additional  Service 
non-service day 
 
 

  
 

15.00 

 
 

$25.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 

 

 



BID TABULATION 
Bid # 2022-009 

Rental and Service of Portable Toilets 
Bid Opening Wednesday, February 02, 2022 

 
Rental for Special Events 

 
 
 

Description 

 
 

 
Unit 

C. Johnnie on 
the Spot 

Texas 
Outhouse Inc. 

Pot-O-Gold Texas Waste 
Co. 

United Site 
Service 

 
Regular and or 

Handicap for the 
length of the event 

 

 
 

Per Unit 

 
 

$40.00 

 
 

$55.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
Additional Service 

days 
 

 
Per Unit 

 
$15.00 

 
$35.00 

 
No Bid 

 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 

 

Cost for Damaged Portable Toilet 

 
 
 

Description 

 
 

 
Unit 

C. Johnnie on 
the Spot 

Texas 
Outhouse Inc. 

Pot-O-Gold Texas Waste 
Co. 

United Site 
Service 

 
Standard Portable 

toilet 
 

 
 

Per Unit 

 
 

$0.00 

 
 

$800.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

 
Handicap accessible 

portable toilet 
 

 
Per Unit 

 
$0.00 

 
$1600.00 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 


