
BID TABULATION 

 2022-024 Right-Of-Way Vegetation Management Annual Contract                         
Bid Opening: Tuesday, August 30, 2022 at 2 p.m. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

CrewType: 

1) 3 – Person lift crew WO/ Chipper (Primary Crew) 

2) 3 – Person lift crew W/ Chipper (Optional) 

3) 2 – Person manual chip crew (Optional) 

BIDDER Crew Type 1 
Straight Time 

OT 

Crew Type 2 
Straight Time_ 

OT 

Crew Type 3 
Straight Time 

OT 
 

Sequoia Tree 
Experts 

$90.00/hr 
_______________ 

$126.00/hr 

$99.50/hr 
  
 $133.50/hr 

$80.00 
_____________ 

$109.00 
 

Momo’s Tree 
Service 

$215.00/hr 
______________ 

 

$215.00/hr 
_______________ 

 

 
_______________ 

 
 

Texas Ranch 
Maintenance 

$206.25/hr 
 

$309.35/hr 

 
_______________ 

 
_______________ 

Expert Tree 
Service,LLC 

$93.64/hr 
 

$124.30/hr 

$99.64 
 

$130.30 

$72.04 
 

$94.56 
 

Hunter Tree  
Service 

No Bid 
_______________ 

No Bid 
_______________ 

No Bid 
_______________ 

 
Arbor Tech 

No Bid 
 

No Bid 
 

No Bid 
 

 
Tree Worx 

No Bid 
 

No Bid 
 

No Bid 
 
 
 

 
Tree  

Solutions of 
Texas 

 

$155.50/hr 
 
 

$190.50/hr 

$180.50/hr 
 
 

$215.50/hr 

$137.50/hr 
 
 

$157.50/hr 


