
BID TAB TOTALS 

 2022-027 VEGETATION MANAGEMENT CHEMICALS 

Bid Opening September 22, 2022 at 10:00 a.m. 

 
 

 

 

 
 

Nutrien Ag Solutions 
 

Alligare 
 

Red River 

41% Glyphosate 
2.5 Gal. Container 

Unit / Extended 

 
$82.50/$3,960.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$95.00/$4,560.00 

 
41% Glyphosate 

30 Gal. Drum 
Unit / Extended 

 
$990.00/$3,960.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$1,125.00/$4,500.00 

 
Aquatic Glyphosate 
2.5 Gal. container 
Unit / Extended 

 
$106.25/$2,550.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$112.50/$2,700.00 

 
Aquatic Glyphosate 

30 Gal. Drum 
Unit / Extended 

 
$1275.00/$2,550.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$1,135.00/$2,270.00 

 
Arsenal 

2.5 Gal. Container 
Unit / Extended 

 
$156.00/$1,872.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
Arsenal 

30 Gal. Drum 
Unit / Extended 

 
$1,872.00/$1,872.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
Garlon 3-A 

2.5 Gal Container 
Unit / Extended 

 
$120.00/$2,880.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$127.50/$3,060.00 

 
Garlon 3-A 

30 Gal. Drum 
Unit / Extended 

 
$1,440.00/$2,880.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$1,530.00/$3,060.00 

 
Plateau 
1 Gal. 

Unit / Extended 

 
$120.00/$480.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$128.00/$512.00 

 
Oust 

3 LB Container 
Unit / Extended 

 
$84.00/$168.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$101.85/$203.70 

 



BID TAB TOTALS 

 2022-027 VEGETATION MANAGEMENT CHEMICALS 

Bid Opening September 22, 2022 at 10:00 a.m. 

 
 

ITEM Nutrien  Ag Solutions Alligare Red River 

Surfactant 
2.5 Gal. Container 

Unit / Extended 

 
$28.00/$672.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$32.25/$774.00 

 
Surfactant 

30 Gal. Drum 
Unit / Extended 

 
$336.00/$672.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$420.00/$840.00 

 
Aquatic Surfactant 
2.5 Gal. Container 

Unit / Extended 

 
$112.00/$448.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$32.25/$129.00 

 
Nu Film – IR 

2.5 Gal. Container 
Unit / Extended 

 
$87.53/$700.24 

 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
Drift Control 
Per Quart 

Unit / Extended 

 
$12.00/$240.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$14.58/$291.60 

 
Drift Control 
Per Gallon 

Unit / Extended 

 
$48.00/$240.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$45.00/$225.00 

 
Tank Cleaner 

Per Gallon 
Unit / Extended 

 
$31.00/$310.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$32.00/$320.00 

 
Marking Dye 
Per Gallon 

Unit / Extended 

 
$27.50/$275.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$34.00/$340.00 

 
Marking Dye 

2.5 Gallon Container 
Unit / Extended 

 
$68.75/$275.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$75.00/$300.00 

 
Reward 

Per Gallon 
Unit / Extended 

 
$108.00/$108.00 

 

 
NO BID 

 
$78.00/$78.00 

 


