
BID TABULATION 
 

Bid # 2023-010 
Gasoline and Diesel Annual Contract 

 
Bid Opening: Friday, July 07, 2023 at 2:00 p.m. 

               
ITEM 

# 
DESCRIPTION  

APACHE 
 

SUNCOAST 
 

Texas 
Fueling 

 
Arnold Oil 
Company 

1 
 

Gasoline 87 Octane 
Unleaded 

Large Lot Transport (4000+) 
– 80,000 gal. 

 
0.075+ 

 

 
0.0050+ 

 
NO BID 

 
0.085+ 

2 
 

Gasoline 87 Octane 
Unleaded 

Medium Lot Bobtail  (1,000-
3,999) – 90,000 gal 

 
0.295+ 

 
0.1298+ 

 
NO BID 

 
0.110+ 

3 
 

Gasoline 87 Octane 
Unleaded 

Small Lot Bobtail (0-999)-
25,000 gal 

 
0.590+ 

 
0.3500+ 

 
NO BID 

 
0.250+ 

4 
 

No. 2 Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel 
TxLED 

Large Lot Transport (4,000) -
70,000 gal 

 
0.075+ 

 
0.0050+ 

 
NO BID 

 
0.085+ 

5 
 

No. 2 Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel 
TxLED 

Medium Lot Bobtail  (1,000-
3,999) – 80,000 gal 

 
0.295+ 

 
0.1298+ 

 
NO BID 

 
0.110+ 

 
6 
 

No. 2 Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel 
TxLED 

Small Lot Bobtail  (0-999) – 
20,000 

 
0.590+ 

 
0.3500+ 

 
NO BID 

 
0.250+ 

  
Total 

 
$87,950.00 

 
$38,566.00 

 
NO BID 

 
$42,700.00 
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