
City of Texas City 
BID TABULATION 

 2024-001 WATER AND SEWER LINE REPAIR MATERIALS ANNUAL CONTRACT 

Bid Opening: Wednesday, January 31, 2024 at 2:00 p.m. 

 
BIDDER Ferguson Core  and 

Main 
Accurate 

Meter Supply 
Coburn’s 
Supply 

Company 
Section 1Items 1-38 $40,427.95 $34,935.50 No Bid $26,831.15 

Section 2A Items 39-58 $25,113.38 $24,443.75 $23,613.68* $22,992.01 

Section 2B Items 59-66 $20,973.20 $20,960.74 No Bid $19,195.26*** 

Section 2C Items 67-72 $4,801.18 $4,853.96 $4,848.94 $4,639.30 

Section 3 Items 73-85 $6,612.01 $6,822.65* $6,707.11 $6,421.56 

Section 4 Items 86-118 $81,831.15 $81,743.75 $90,478.25* 
Item 95 Missed 

$82,213.05 

Section 5 Items 119- 124 $11,209.89 $9,057.80 $9,867.49 $9,437.93 

Section 6 Items 125-136 $27,214.65* $27,134.55 $29,402.50 $26,534.25 

Section 7 Items 137-150 $7,983.20* $6,595.50* $6,365.75 $7,922.20 

Section 8 Items 151-156 No Bid 
 

$24,474.72** 
Only Item 156 NB 

No Bid 
 

No Bid 
 

Section 9 Items 157-168 $30,663.95** $30,665.45** $118,403.50 $118,706.80 

Section 10 Items 169-177 No Bid $35,146.25 $35,568.75 $38,040.45 

 

*     Corrected section total 

**   Some Items “No Bid” in this section 

***  Wrong Fire Hydrant 
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