Vehicle Bid Results

BID SCHEDULE 1 - ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2014 3/4-TON
4 X4 EXTENDED CAB LONG BOX 4-DOOR PICKUP

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Fremont Motors $28,330.00 $1,500.00  $26,830.00
Menholt Chevy No Bid

Archie Cochrane $27,245.00 $1,000.00  $26,245.00
Bison Ford Rejected non-compliant

BID SCHEDULE 2 - ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2014, FOUR
WHEEL DRIVE OR AWD, FOUR DOOR MID-SIZE UTILITY VEHICLE

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Fremont Motors $25,047.00 $1,000.00 $24,047.00
Menholt Chevy $23,918.00 $1,000.00 $22,918.00
Archie Cochrane $24,843.00 $1,000.00 $23,843.00
Bison Ford Rejected non-compliant

BID SCHEDULE 3 - ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2014 FULL SIZE
1/2 TON 2WHEEL DRIVE EXTENDED CAB SHORT BOX PICK-UP

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Fremont Motors $23,756.00 None $23,756.00
Menholt Chevy $24,773.00 None $24,773.00
Archie Cochrane $23,425.00 None $23,425.00
Bison Ford Rejected non-compliant

BID SCHEDULE 4 - TWO (2) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2014
FOUR (4) DOOR MID-SIZE SEDANS

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Fremont Motors $41,864.00 $2,200.00 $39,664.00
Menholt Chevy No Bid

Archie Cochrane $36,548.00  $3,000.00  $33,548.00
Bison Ford Rejected non-compliant

BID SCHEDULE 5 - ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2014 ONE-TON 4X4 CREW CAB,

CAB AND CHASSIS, 56" CAB TO AXLE WITH HI-ROOF UTILITY BODY

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Fremont Motors $41,359.00 None $41,359.00
Menholt Chevy No Bid

Archie Cochrane $40,385.00 None $40,385.00

Bison Ford Rejected non-compliant



BID SCHEDULE 6 - ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2014 ONE-TON
TWO WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR CAB PICK WITH SERVICE BODY

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Fremont Motors $31,567.00 None $31,567.00
Menholt Chevy No Bid

Archie Cochrane $31,509.00 None $31,509.00
Bison Ford Rejected non-compliant

BID SCHEDULE 7 - ONE (1) NEW 2014 CURRENT MODEL 1/2-TON 4X4

REGULAR CAB SHORT-BOX PICKUP WITH SNOW PLOW

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Fremont Motors $34,329.00 $3,100.00  $31,229.00
Menholt Chevy $32,383.00 $4,000.00 $28,383.00
Archie Cochrane No Bid

Bison Ford Rejected non-compliant

BID SCHEDULE 8 - ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2014 3/4-TON
4X4 REGULAR CAB PICKUP

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Fremont Motors $26,137.00 $1,500.00 $24,637.00
Menholt Chevy No Bid

Archie Cochrane $25,217.00 $1,500.00 $23,717.00
Bison Ford Rejected non-compliant

BID SCHEDULE 9 - ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2014 ONE-TON
4 X4 REGULAR CAB LONG BOX PICKUP

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Fremont Motors $26,818.00 None $26,818.00
Menholt Chevy No Bid

Archie Cochrane $25,576.00 None $25,576.00

Bison Ford Rejected non-compliant



