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2013 Fall Pursuit Vehicle Bid

Ronan Dodge

Billion Dodge Chrysler Jeep

Bison Motor Company

Awarded

No Bid

No Bid

$30,562.22

Ford Interceptor

Full carpet flooring

Ronan Dodge

Billion Dodge Chrysler Jeep

Bison Motor Company

Awarded

$27,165.00

No Bid

No Bid

2013 Charger RWD

Not equipped with Reverse Sensing System

Ronan Dodge

Billion Dodge Chrysler Jeep

Bison Motor Company

Awarded

$33,147.00

No Bid

$30,065.08

2013 Chevy Tahoe Pursuit Special Services Vehicle

Ford Interceptor SUV

Not equipped with Bluetooth or Reverse Sensing
System

Full carpet flooring-available with only all carpet or
all rubber. Does not meet - 4WD Requested not
AWD. Must be able to shift into Hi/Lo

Ronan Dodge

Billion Dodge Chrysler Jeep

Bison Motor Company

$34,738.00

No Bid

$31,202.56

2013 Chevy Tahoe Pursuit Special Services Vehicle

2013 Ford Utility Police Interceptor

Cannot supply front/rear wiring harness; Bluetooth
and Reverse Sensing System Not Available

Ronan Dodge

Billion Dodge Chrysler Jeep

Awarded
$30,950.00 $29,937.00 No Bid
2013 Charger Police RWD Dodge Charger

To replace key to vehicle, it must be programmed
by a dealer

Setina panel installed; receeded panel between front
and rear seats; Setina manufacturing; parts & labor
installed: parts-$947 Labor-$170; freight for 49
Setina divider panels $1,374 - Did not meet -Actual
Bid price =$32,428.00

CANCELLED LINE

No Bid

No Bid

$29,820.24

2013 Ford Utility Police Interceptor

Remote vehicle start system & leather package with
heated front seats-dealer installed




Karl Tyler Chevrolet

Duvall Ford

No Bid

$30,985.74

2013 Ford Sedan Police Interceptor

Ecoboost 365; Base engine 288hp

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

Duvall Ford

$28,872.95

No Bid

2013 Chevy Caprice Police Patrol Vehicle 4dr
Sedan

Bluetooth aftermarket only-not included; block
heater not available; 600 cold cranking AMPS not
720; no column shifter; Setina 10RP

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

Duvall Ford

Awarded

$31,266.59

$30,158.50

2013 Chevy Tahoe 4WD

2013 Ford Utility Police Interceptor

Exception of hands-free communication

Setina-dealer installed - Does not meet - 4WD
requested not AWD - Must be able to shift into Hi/Lo

Karl Tyler Chevrolet Duvall Ford
Awarded
$32,170.34 $30,269.50

2013 Chevy Tahoe 4WD

2013 Ford Utility Police Interceptor

4x4-auto 4x4 but not full-time AWD; Bluetooth not
available from factory

Karl Tyler Chevrolet Duvall Ford

$29,699.39 No Bid

2013 Chevy Caprice Police Patrol Vehicle 4dr
Sedan
No column shift; 600 cold cranking AMPs not 720;
no block heater - Did not meet.

Duvall Ford

No bid No Bid




