
                      Vehicle Bid Results

BID SCHEDULE 1 –   ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2015 3/4-TON 4 X 4  
EXTENDED CAB 4-DOOR LONG BOX PICKUP 
Vendor Total Bid   Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy $29,953.50 $1,500.00 $28,453.50
Fremont Motors $29,014.00 $3,500.00 $25,514.00
Archie Cochrane $29,326.00 $1,500.00 $27,826.00
Bison Ford $26,194.97 $700.00 $25,494.97

BID SCHEDULE 2 - FIVE (5) NEW 2015 CURRENT MODEL FOUR (4) 
DOOR MID-SIZE SEDANS
Vendor Total Bid    Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy $100,624.65 $4,750.00 $95,874.65  
Fremont Motors NO BID  
Archie Cochrane $92,895.00 $7,000.00 $85,895.00
Bison Ford $90,301.70 $2,200.00 $88,101.70

BID SCHEDULE 3 - ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2015, 3/4 TON 
4X4, CREW CAB, SHORT BOX PICKUP W/TOPPER
Vendor Total Bid  Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy $36,900.55 NONE $36,900.55
Fremont Motors $35,407.00 NONE $35,407.00
Archie Cochrane $35,827.00 NONE $35,827.00
Bison Ford $28,624.52 NONE $28,624.52

BID SCHEDULE 4 - ONE (1) NEW 2015 MODEL ¾-TON 4x4 REGULAR CAB 
LONG BOX PICKUP WITH UTILITY BODY, AND SNOW PLOW 
Vendor Total Bid    Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy $41,894.40 $1,500.00 $40,394.40
Fremont Motors $39,510.00 $1,500.00 $38,010.00
Archie Cochrane $40,441.00 $2,000.00 $38,441.00
Bison Ford $36,211.02 $1,500.00 $34,711.02

BID SCHEDULE 5 - TWO (2) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2015 FULL SIZE 
1/2-TON 2 WHEEL DRIVE, REGULAR CAB LONG-BOX PICKUPS
Vendor Total Bid    Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy $45,605.22 NONE $45,605.22
Fremont Motors $50,888.00 NONE $50,888.00
Archie Cochrane $48,948.00 NONE $48,948.00
Bison Ford $48,836.36 NONE $48,836.36



BID SCHEDULE 6 - ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2015 FULL SIZE 
1/2-TON 2 WHEEL DRIVE, EXTENDED CAB LONG-BOX PICKUP 
Vendor Total Bid    Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy $25,917.30 NONE $25,917.30
Fremont Motors $27,724.00 NONE $27,724.00
Archie Cochrane $26,259.00 NONE $26,259.00
Bison Ford $25,803.19 NONE $25,803.19

BID SCHEDULE 7 - TWO (2) NEW 2015 MODEL ¾-TON 4x4 REGULAR 
CAB LONG BOX PICKUPS WITH UTILITY BODIES
Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy $73,587.20 NONE $73,587.20
Fremont Motors $64,406.00 NONE $64,406.00
Archie Cochrane $67,120.00 NONE $67,120.00
Bison Ford $59,184.04 NONE $59,184.04

BID SCHEDULE 8 - ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2015 ONE-TON 4 X 4 
EXTENDED CAB PICKUP WITH UTILITY BOX, AIR COMPRESSOR AND LIFTGATE 
Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy NO BID
Fremont Motors NO BID
Archie Cochrane $48,507.00 NONE $48,507.00
Bison Ford $45,251.97 NONE $45,251.97

BID SCHEDULE  9 - ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2015 ONE-TON 
TWO WHEEL DRIVE DUAL REAR WHEELS, REGULAR CAB, CAB AND 
CHASSIS 60” CAB TO AXLE WITH MOUNTED 9’ FLATBED 
Vendor Total Bid  Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy NO BID
Fremont Motors $30,067.00 $7,000.00 $23,067.00
Archie Cochrane $30,989.00 $5,000.00 $25,989.00
Bison Ford $27,183.31 $1,000.00 $26,183.31

BID SCHEDULE  10- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2015 1-TON 4 WHEEL 
DRIVE REGULAR CAB PICKUP WITH SERVICE BODY 
Vendor Total Bid  Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy $41,252.10 NONE $41,252.10
Fremont Motors $38,349.00 NONE $38,349.00
Archie Cochrane $36,415.00 NONE $36,415.00
Bison Ford $34,957.97 NONE $34,957.97

BID SCHEDULE  11- TWO (2) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2015 MID-SIZE 
4 WHEEL DRIVE, EXTENDED CAB SHORT-BOX PICKUPS 



Vendor Total Bid  Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy $54,892.42 $1,500.00 $53,392.42
Fremont Motors NO BID  
Archie Cochrane $55,428.00 $1,500.00 $53,928.00
Bison Ford $51,805.26 $300.00 $51,505.26

BID SCHEDULE  12- ONE (1) NEW 2015 CURRENT MODEL SMALL CARGO VAN 
Vendor Total Bid  Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy $22,711.65 $1,000.00 $21,711.65
Fremont Motors NO BID  
Archie Cochrane $22,270.00 $1,500.00 $20,770.00
Bison Ford $21,784.34 $1,000.00 $20,784.34

BID SCHEDULE  13- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2015 ONE-TON 
TWO WHEEL DRIVE DUAL REAR WHEELS, REGULAR CAB, CAB AND 
CHASSIS 60” CAB TO AXLE WITH MOUNTED 9’ FLATBED 
Vendor Total Bid  Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy NO BID
Fremont Motors $29,169.00 $5,000.00 $24,169.00
Archie Cochrane $30,767.00 $5,000.00 $25,767.00
Bison Ford $27,070.21 $2,500.00 $24,570.21

BID SCHEDULE  14- TWO (2) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2015 ONE-TON TWO WHEEL 
DRIVE DUAL REAR WHEELS, REGULAR CAB, CAB AND CHASSIS 60” CAB TO  
AXLE WITH MOUNTED 9’ DUMP BODY
Vendor Total Bid  Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy NO BID
Fremont Motors $65,896.00 $4,800.00 $61,096.00
Archie Cochrane $69,556.00 $5,500.00 $64,056.00
Bison Ford $62,764.62 $1,800.00 $60,964.62

BID SCHEDULE  15- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2015 3/4-TON 
4 X 4 REGULAR CAB PICKUP
Vendor Total Bid  Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy $28,676.60 NONE $28,676.60
Fremont Motors $25,784.00 NONE $25,784.00
Archie Cochrane $27,434.00 NONE $27,434.00
Bison Ford $24,023.97 NONE $24,023.97
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