Vehicle Bid Results

BID SCHEDULE 1- THREE (3) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2016, FOUR WHEEL DRIVE, FOUR DOOR
FULL SIZE SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Menholt Chevy No Bid

Fremont Motors $122,895.00 $8,300.00 $114,595.00
Archie Cochrane $123,375.00 $9,450.00 $113,925.00
Bison Motors No Bid

Billion Auto Group No Bid

BID SCHEDULE 2- TWO (2) NEW 2016 CURRENT MODEL FOUR (4) DOOR MID-SIZE SEDANS

Menholt Chevy
Fremont Motors
Archie Cochrane
Bison Motors
Billion Auto Group

BID SCHEDULE 3- ONE (1) NEW 2016 CURRENT MODEL COMPACT 2 DOOR SUV JEEP WRANGLER

$39,687.10
$37,682.00
$37,680.00
$40,158.92
$40,820.00

$2,000.00
$1,600.00
$3,200.00
$2,200.00
$4,000.00

$37,687.10
$36,082.00
$34,480.00
$37,958.92
$36,820.00

OR EQUAL WITH SNOW PLOW

Menholt Chevy
Fremont Motors
Archie Cochrane
Bison Motors
Billion Auto Group

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$30,080.00

$6,000.00

$24,080.00

BID SCHEDULE 4- ONE (1) NEW 2016 CURRENT MODEL SMALL CARGO VAN

Menholt Chevy
Fremont Motors
Archie Cochrane
Bison Motors
Billion Auto Group

BID SCHEDULE 5- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2016 3/4-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR CAB

No Bid
$22,801.00
$23,140.00
$22,836.46
$23,842.00

$500.00
$500.00
$1,250.00
$400.00

$22,301.00
$22,640.00

$21,586.46
$23,442.00

LONG BOX PICKUP

Menholt Chevy
Fremont Motors
Archie Cochrane
Bison Motors
Billion Auto Group

$28,869.20
$30,064.00
$29,550.00
$29,661.88
No Bid

$2,000.00
$1,500.00
$1,000.00
$2,000.00

$26,869.20
$28,564.00

$28,550.00
$27,661.88



BID SCHEDULE 6- TWO (2) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2016 3/4-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR CAB
PICKUPS WITH SERVICE BODIES

Menholt Chevy $76,132.00 None $76,132.00
Fremont Motors No Bid
Archie Cochrane $73,974.00 None $73,974.00
Bison Motors $72,198.56 None $72,198.56
Billion Auto Group No Bid

BID SCHEDULE 7- TWO (2) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2016 MID-SIZE 4 WHEEL DRIVE, EXTENDED
CAB LONG-BOX PICKUPS

Menholt Chevy $62,071.44 $1,000.00 $61,071.44
Fremont Motors No Bid
Archie Cochrane $57,760.00 $1,300.00 $56,460.00
Bison Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group $54,902.00 $1,000.00 $53,902.00

BID SCHEDULE 8- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2016 3/4-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE EXTENDED
CAB 4-DOOR PICKUP WITH SERVICE BODY

Menholt Chevy $40,179.00
Fremont Motors No Bid

Archie Cochrane $38,974.00
Bison Motors $38,241.28

Billion Auto Group $40,880.00

BID SCHEDULE 9- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2016 ONE-TON 4 X 4 REGULAR CAB LONG

$2,000.00

$1,750.00
$1,000.00
$1,500.00

$38,179.00

$37,224.00
$37,241.28
$39,380.00

BOX PICKUP WITH SNOW PLOW

Menholt Chevy $38,204.92
Fremont Motors No Bid

Archie Cochrane $38,018.00
Bison Motors $37,598.33

Billion Auto Group $38,210.00

BID SCHEDULE 10- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2016 ONE-TON TWO WHEEL DRIVE DUAL

$2,000.00

$1,500.00
$2,000.00
$1,000.00

$36,204.92

$36,518.00

$35,598.33
$37,210.00

REAR WHEELS, REGULAR CAB, CAB AND CHASSIS 60” CAB TO AXLE WITH MOUNTED 9’ DUMP

BODY AND LIFTGATE

Menholt Chevy No Bid
Fremont Motors No Bid
Archie Cochrane $40,788.00
Bison Motors $40,619.74

Billion Auto Group $44,299.00

$3,000.00
$2,500.00
$2,000.00

$37,788.00
$38,119.74
$42,299.00



