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Vehicle Bid Results

BID SCHEDULE 1- TWO (2) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2017 ONE-TON 4 X 4 REGULAR CAB LONG 
BOX PICKUPS 

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid

Bison Motors $58,077.40 $2,800.00 $55,277.40
Archie Cochrane $60,460.00 $4,600.00 $55,860.00
Fremont Motors $64,988.00 $3,400.00 $61,588.00
Billion Auto Group $59,972.00 $4,000.00 $55,972.00

BID SCHEDULE 2- SEVEN (7) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2017 FULL-SIZE 4 WHEEL DRIVE, 
EXTENDED CAB 4-DOOR SHORT 6.5’ BOX PICKUPS 

Bison Motors $195,682.48 $5,300.00 $190,382.48
Archie Cochrane $185,857.00 $7,000.00 $178,857.00
Fremont Motors $190,204.00 $10,900.00 $179,304.00
Billion Auto Group $184,191.00 $5,710.00 $178,481.00

BID SCHEDULE 3- THREE (3) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2017 MID-SIZE 2 WHEEL DRIVE, EXTENDED 
CAB PICKUPS

Bison Motors No Bid
Archie Cochrane        $70,959.00 $1,300.00 $69,659.00
Fremont Motors $72,510.00 $1,300.00 $71,210.00
Billion Auto Group $70,806.00 $2,100.00 $68,706.00

BID SCHEDULE 4- TWO (2) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2017 FULL SIZE 1/2-TON 2 WHEEL DRIVE, 
REGULAR CAB LONG-BOX PICKUPS

Bison Motors $50,503.76 $2,500.00 $48,003.76
Archie Cochrane         $50,338.00 $3,500.00 $46,838.00
Fremont Motors $53,666.00 $4,000.00 $49,666.00
Billion Auto Group $47,012.00 $2,250.00 $44,762.00

BID SCHEDULE 5- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2017 FULL SIZE 1/2-TON 2 WHEEL DRIVE, 
EXTENDED CAB LONG-BOX PICKUP 

Bison Motors $26,094.98 $500.00 $25,594.98
Archie Cochrane $25,565.00 $1,700.00                      $23,865.00
Fremont Motors $27,611.00                        $1,800.00 $25,811.00
Billion Auto Group No Bid

BID SCHEDULE 6- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2017 3/4-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR CAB 
PICKUP WITH SERVICE BODY

Bison Motors $33,702.86 $0.00 $33,702.86
Archie Cochrane        $36,548.00                              $0.00                       $36,548.00  
Fremont Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group No Bid
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BID SCHEDULE 7- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2017 ONE-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR 
CAB PICKUP WITH SERVICE BODY

Bison Motors $35,720.86 $0.00 $35,720.86
Archie Cochrane $37,457.00 $0.00 $37,457.00
Fremont Motors No Bid                   
Billion Auto Group No Bid

BID SCHEDULE 8- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2017 3/4-TON 2 WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR CAB 
PICKUP WITH SERVICE BODY 

Bison Motors $31,431.60 $2,000.00 $29,431.60
Archie Cochrane $34,229.00 $4,300.00                         $29,929.00
Fremont Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group No Bid

BID SCHEDULE 9- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2017 3/4-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR CAB 
LONG BOX PICKUP 

Bison Motors $27,329.36 $800.00 $26,529.36
Archie Cochrane $29,168.00 $200.00 $28,968.00
Fremont Motors $31,668.00 $900.00 $30,768.00
Billion Auto Group $28,423.00             $450.00                           $27,973.00

BID SCHEDULE 10- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2017 FULL SIZE 1/2-TON 2 WHEEL DRIVE, 
EXTENDED CAB SHORT-BOX PICKUP

Bison Motors $25,532.64                        $0.00 $25,532.64
Archie Cochrane $25,263.00 $0.00                            $25,263.00
Fremont Motors $25,624.00 $0.00 $25,624.00
Billion Auto Group $28,450.00                   $0.00                            $28,450.00


