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Vehicle Bid Results

BID SCHEDULE 1- TWO (2) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2018 3/4-TON 4 X 4 CREW CAB, SHORT BOX 
PICKUPS

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid

Bison Motors No Bid
Denny Menholt $77,868.00 None $7,7868.00
Fremont Motors $73,396.00 None $73,396.00
Billion Auto Group $72,278.00 None $72,278.00

BID SCHEDULE 2- TWO (2) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2018 FULL-SIZE ½ TON, 4 WHEEL DRIVE, 
EXTENDED CAB 4-DOOR SHORT 6.5’ BOX PICKUPS
Bison Motors $59,328.32 None $59,328.32
Denny Menholt $57,482.00 None $57,482.00
Fremont Motors $53,412.00 None $53,412.00
Billion Auto Group $53,840.00 None $53,840.00

BID SCHEDULE 3- TWO (2) NEW 2018 CURRENT MODEL COMPACT 2 DOOR SUV JEEP 
WRANGLERS OR EQUAL WITH SNOW PLOWS
Bison Motors No Bid
Denny Menholt No Bid
Fremont Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group $82,100.00 $8,900.00 $73,200.00

BID SCHEDULE 4- TWO (2) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2018 3/4-TON 2 WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR CAB 
PICKUPS WITH SERVICE BODIES
Bison Motors $68,202.64 $2,800.00 $65,402.64
Denny Menholt $71,108.00 $1,500.00 $69,608.00
Fremont Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group $69,140.00 $3,000.00 $66,140.00

BID SCHEDULE 5- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2018 FULL SIZE 1/2-TON 2 WHEEL DRIVE, 
REGULAR CAB LONG-BOX PICKUP
Bison Motors $28,213.16 $1,500.00 $26,713.16
Denny Menholt $25,102.00 $1,000.00 $24,102.00
Fremont Motors No Bid  
Billion Auto Group $24,780.00 $   500.00 $24,280.00

BID SCHEDULE 6- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2018 3/4-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR CAB 
PICKUP WITH SERVICE BODY
Bison Motors $36,139.32 $3,500.00 $32,639.32
Denny Menholt $38,145.00 $2,500.00 $35,645.00
Fremont Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group $37,050.00 $4,200.00 $32,850.00
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BID SCHEDULE 7- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2018 ONE-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR 
CAB PICKUP WITH SERVICE BODY 
Bison Motors $36,699.32 $3,500.00 $33,199.32
Denny Menholt $39,397.00 $2,500.00 $36,897.00
Fremont Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group $38,600.00 $4,200.00 $34,400.00

BID SCHEDULE 8- TWO (2) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2018 3/4-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE EXTENDED 
CAB 4-DOOR PICKUPS WITH SERVICE BODIES
Bison Motors $76,814.64 $1,000.00 $75,814.64
Denny Menholt $77,010.00 $1,000.00 $76,010.00
Fremont Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group $80,100.00 $2,400.00 $77,700.00

BID SCHEDULE 9- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2018 3/4-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR CAB 
LONG BOX PICKUP
Bison Motors $29,570.36 None $29,570.36   
Denny Menholt $30,839.00 None $30,839.00
Fremont Motors $28,693.00 None $28,693.00
Billion Auto Group $29,200.00 None $29,200.00

BID SCHEDULE 10- TWO (2) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2018 ONE-TON TWO WHEEL DRIVE DUAL 
REAR WHEELS, REGULAR CAB, CAB AND CHASSIS 60” CAB TO AXLE WITH MOUNTED 9’ DUMP 
BODIES
Bison Motors $76,358.64 $4,000.00 $72,358.64
Denny Menholt $71,636.00 $4,000.00 $67,636.00
Fremont Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group $73,972.00 $9,200 $64,772.00

BID SCHEDULE 11- ONE (1) NEW 2018 CURRENT MODEL LARGE, HIGH ROOF, EXTENDED 
LENGTH, DUAL REAR WHEELS CARGO VAN
Bison Motors No Bid
Denny Menholt No Bid
Fremont Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group    No Bid


