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Vehicle Bid Results

BID SCHEDULE 1- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2019 FULL SIZE 1/2-TON 2 WHEEL DRIVE, 
REGULAR CAB LONG-BOX PICKUP
Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Yellowstone Country Motors $23,220.00 $ 500.00 $22,720.00
Billion Auto Group $24,276.00 $ 550.00 $23,726.00
Bison Motors $28,889.00 $1,000.00 $27,889.00
Bison Motors/Kois/Normont No Bid

BID SCHEDULE 2- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2019 ONE-TON TWO WHEEL DRIVE DUAL 
REAR WHEELS, REGULAR CAB, CAB AND CHASSIS 60” CAB TO AXLE WITH MOUNTED 9’ DUMP 
BODY
Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Yellowstone Country Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group $42,716.00 None $42,716.00
Bison Motors/Normont $38,596.00 None $38,596.00
Bison Motors/Kois $39,269.00 None $39,269.00

BID SCHEDULE 3- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2019 3/4-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR CAB 
PICKUP WITH SERVICE BODY
Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Yellowstone Country Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group $40,025.00 None $40,025.00
Bison Motors/Normont $38,184.00 None $38,184.00
Bison Motors/Kois $37,487.00 None $37,487.00

BID SCHEDULE 4- THREE (3) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2019 FULL-SIZE ½ TON, 4 WHEEL DRIVE, 
EXTENDED CAB 4-DOOR SHORT 6.5’ BOX PICKUPS
Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Yellowstone Country Motors $ 77,262.00 $500.00 $ 76,762.00
Billion Auto Group $111,918.00 $750.00 $111,168.00
Bison Motors $ 97,542.00 $500.00 $ 97,042.00
Bison Motors/Kois/Normont No Bid

BID SCHEDULE 5- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2019 3/4-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE EXTENDED 
CAB LONG BOX PICKUP WITH SERVICE BODY AND LIFT GATE
Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Yellowstone Country Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group No Bid
Bison Motors/Normont $41,637.00 $1,200.00 $40,437.00
Bison Motors/Kois $40,113.00 $1,200.00 $38,913.00

BID SCHEDULE 6- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2019 ONE-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR 
CAB PICKUP WITH SERVICE BODY
Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Yellowstone Country Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group $43,614.00 None $43,614.00
Bison Motors/Normont $40,376.00 None $40,376.00
Bison Motors/Kois $39,551.00 None $39,551.00
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BID SCHEDULE 7- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2019 ONE AND A HALF-TON, 5500 SERIES 
FOUR WHEEL DRIVE DUAL REAR WHEELS, REGULAR CAB, CAB AND CHASSIS 60” CAB TO 
AXLE WITH MOUNTED 9’ DUMP BODY, SNOW PLOW AND CRANE
Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Yellowstone Country Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group $69,282.00 $1,600.00 $67,682.00
Bison Motors/Normont $65,987.00 $1,000.00 $64,987.00
Bison Motors/Kois $69,582.00 $1,000.00 $68,582.00

BID SCHEDULE 8- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2019 3/4-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE EXTENDED 
CAB 4-DOOR PICKUP WITH SERVICE BODY
Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Yellowstone Country Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group No Bid
Bison Motors/Normont $40,474.00 None $40,474.00
Bison Motors/Kois $39,777.00 None $39,777.00

BID SCHEDULE 9- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2019 3/4-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE EXTENDED 
CAB 4-DOOR PICKUP WITH SERVICE BODY, LIFT GATE AND AIR COMPRESSOR
Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Yellowstone Country Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group No Bid
Bison Motors/Normont $57,149.00 None $57,149.00
Bison Motors/Kois $54,893.00 None $54,893.00

BID SCHEDULE 10- ONE (1) NEW 2019 CURRENT MODEL HD 5500 SERIES DUAL 
REAR WHEEL, 4-WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR CAB TRUCK WITH SERVICE BODY, 
LIFTGATE AND CRANE
Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Yellowstone Country Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group $82,249.00 None $82,249.00
Bison Motors/Normont $89,202.00 None $89,202.00
Bison Motors/Kois $81,227.00 None $81,227.00

BID SCHEDULE 11- ONE (1) NEW 2019 CURRENT MODEL HD 5500 SERIES DUAL 
REAR WHEEL, 4-WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR CAB TRUCK WITH SERVICE BODY 
AND LIFTGATE
Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Yellowstone Country Motors No Bid
Billion Auto Group $71,070.00 $3,400.00 $67,670.00
Bison Motors/Normont $76,950.00 $1,700.00 $75,250.00
Bison Motors/Kois $69,889.00 $1,700.00 $68,189.00


