Vehicle Bid Results

BID SCHEDULE 1- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2020 3/4-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE EXTENDED
CAB LONG BOX PICKUP

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Denny Menholt Chewrolet $32,589.35 $2,000.00 $30,589.35
Yellowstone Country Motors No Bid

Billion Auto Group No Bid

Bison Motors $31,024.52 $ 0.00 $31,024.52

BID SCHEDULE 2- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2020 450/4500 SERIES TWO WHEEL DRIVE
DUAL REAR WHEELS, REGULAR CAB, CAB AND CHASSIS 84” CAB TO AXLE WITH MOUNTED
12’ FLATBED WITH HOIST

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Denny Menholt Chewolet No Bid

Yellowstone Country Motors No Bid

Billion Auto Group $45,257.00 $5,200.00 $40,057.00
Bison Motors $46,574.42 $ 0.00 $46,574.42

BID SCHEDULE 3- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2020 FULL SIZE 1/2-TON 4X4, REGULAR CAB
SHORT-BOX PICKUP WITH SNOW PLOW

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Denny Menholt Chewrolet No Bid

Yellowstone Country Motors $35,790.00 $2,400.00 $33,390.00
Billion Auto Group $32,216.00 $4,800.00 $27.416.00
Bison Motors $35,253.76 $5,000.00 $30,253.76

BID SCHEDULE 4- SIX (6) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2020 FULL-SIZE Y2 TON, 4 WHEEL DRIVE,
EXTENDED CAB 4-DOOR SHORT 6.5 BOX PICKUPS

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid

Denny Menholt Chewrolet $172,641.90 $4,300.00 $168,341.90
Yellowstone Country Motors $150,432.00 $2,250.00 $148,182.00
Billion Auto Group $154,476.00 $5,700.00 $148,776.00
Bison Motors $174,742.56 $2,200.00 $172,542.56

BID SCHEDULE 5- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2020 550/5500 SERIES TWO WHEEL DRIVE
DUAL REAR WHEELS, REGULAR CAB., CAB AND CHASSIS 60” CAB TO AXLE WITH MOUNTED 9’

DUMP BODY

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Denny Menholt Chewolet No Bid

Yellowstone Country Motors No Bid

Billion Auto Group $45,287.00 $4,300.00 $40,987.00
Bison Motors $48,083.52 $2,000.00 $46,083.52



BID SCHEDULE 6- FIVE (5) NEW 2020 CURRENT MODEL FOUR (4) DOOR AWD MID-SIZE SEDANS

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Denny Menholt Chewrolet No Bid

Yellowstone Country Motors $130,310.00 $2,900.00 $127,410.00
Billion Auto Group $109,515.00 $5,500.00 $104,015.00
Bison Motors $119,314.40 $7,100.00 $112,214.40

BID SCHEDULE 7- TWO (2) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2020 1-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE EXTENDED CAB

4-DOOR PICKUPS WITH SERVICE BODIES

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Denny Menholt Chewrolet $83,864.46 None $83,864.46
Yellowstone Country Motors No Bid

Billion Auto Group No Bid

Bison Motors $87,481.04 None $87,481.04

BID SCHEDULE 8- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2020 1-TON 2 WHEEL DRIVE REGULAR CAB

PICKUP WITH SERVICE BODY

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid

Denny Menholt Chewolet $39,946.50 $2,500.00 $37,446.50
Yellowstone Country Motors $36,884.00 $1,400.00 $35,484.00
Billion Auto Group $36.812.00 $2,100.00 $34,712.00
Bison Motors $38,025.52 $ 0.00 $38,025.52

BID SCHEDULE 9- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2020 550/5500 SERIES FOUR WHEEL DRIVE

DUAL REAR WHEELS, EXTENDED CAB., CAB AND CHASSIS 60” CAB TO AXLE WITH MOUNTED

9’ FLATBED WITH HOIST AND SNOW PLOW

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Denny Menholt Chewrolet No Bid

Yellowstone Country Motors No Bid

Billion Auto Group No Bid

Bison Motors $57.516.52 $2000.00 $55,516.52

BID SCHEDULE 10- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2020, 550/5500 SERIES FOUR WHEEL DRIVE
DUAL REAR WHEELS, REGULAR CAB, CAB AND CHASSIS 60” CAB TO AXLE WITH MOUNTED 9’
DUMP BODY, SNOW PLOW AND CRANE

Vendor Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
Denny Menholt Chewrolet No Bid

Yellowstone Country Motors No Bid

Billion Auto Group $69,583.00 $5,200.00 $64,383.00
Bison Motors $70,355.52 $1,000.00 $69,355.52



BID SCHEDULE 11- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2020 450/4500 SERIES FOUR WHEEL DRIVE

DUAL REAR WHEELS, REGULAR CAB, CAB AND CHASSIS 60” CAB TO AXLE WITH MOUNTED 9’

FLATBED

Vendor

Denny Menholt Chewrolet
Yellowstone Country Motors
Billion Auto Group

Bison Motors

BID SCHEDULE 12- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2020 3/4-TON 4 WHEEL DRIVE CREW CAB

Total Bid
No Bid

No Bid
$45,999.00
$47,586.52

Trade In

$600.00
$ 0.00

Net Bid

$45,399.00
$47,586.52

SHORT BOX PICKUP

Vendor

Denny Menholt Chewrolet
Yellowstone Country Motors
Billion Auto Group

Bison Motors

Total Bid

$34,554.65
$31,337.00
$30,542.00
$32,472.52

Trade In
$1,000.00
$ 300.00
$ 800.00
$2,500.00

Net Bid

$33,554.65
$31,037.00
$29,742.00
$29,972.52

BID SCHEDULE 13- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2020 ONE-TON 350/3500 SERIES TWO

WHEEL DRIVE DUAL REAR WHEELS, REGULAR CAB, CAB AND CHASSIS 60” CAB TO AXLE

WITH MOUNTED 9’ DUMP BODY

Vendor

Denny Menholt Chewolet
Yellowstone Country Motors
Billion Auto Group

Bison Motors

Total Bid Trade In Net Bid
No Bid

No Bid

$40,464.00 $4,600.00 $35.864.00
$40,668.52 $2,500.00 $38,168.52

BID SCHEDULE 14- ONE (1) NEW CURRENT MODEL 2020 ONE-TON 4 X4 REGULAR CAB LONG

BOX PICKUP WITH SNOW PLOW

Vendor

Denny Menholt Chewrolet
Yellowstone Country Motors
Billion Auto Group

Bison Motors

Total Bid Trade In Net Bid

$39,477.20 None $39,477.20
$39,177.00 None $39,177.00
$35,961.00 None $35,961.00
$37,957.52 None $37,957.52



