
Schedule Description Department Lithia Ram Fremont Motors

1 Parks 1/2 ton 4x4 regular cab Parks No Bid $42,430.00 Total
2 15 passenger vans Recreation No Bid No Bid
3 Small SUV's Parking No Bid No Bid
4 3/4 ton ex-cab long box 4x4 Animal Control No Bid No Bid
5 Detective 4 door Sedans Police No Bid $109,932.00 Total 

Low bids in red
Awarded 0 1
Totals: 0 $42,430.00 



Bison Ford Billion Auto Laurel Chevy

$45,690.00 Total $44,485.00 Total $43,104.00 Total
No Bid $159,998.00 Total $94,638.00 Total
$63,330.00 Total $61,900.00 Total $55,910.00 Total
$162,015.00 Total $151,650.00 Total $148,707.00 Total
$90,495.00 Total $104,572.00 Total $76,212.00 Total

0 0 10
0 0 $375,467 Gran total $417,897.00


