REGULAR MEETING OF THE
CANYON LAKE CITY COUNCIL
Wednesday, January 4, 2017
Closed Session —5:30 p.m.
Open Session —6:30 p.m.

City Council Chambers
31516 Railroad Canyon Road
Canyon Lake, CA 92587

Please turn off your cell phones during the meeting

CLOSED SESSION = 5:30 P.M.

Call to Order

Roll Call: Council Members Bonner, Ehrenkranz, Greene, Mayor Pro Tem Warren,
Mayor Haggerty

Public Comments — Any person wishing to address the City Council on any matter within
the jurisdiction of the City, whether or not it appears on this agenda, is asked to complete
a “Speaker Request Form” available on the back counter. The completed form is to be
submitted to the City Clerk prior to an individual being heard by the City Council. The City
Council has adopted a time limitation of three (3) minutes per person. If you are
commenting on the agenda item, your comments will be heard at the time that particular
item is scheduled on the agenda. Please note that if you are addressing the City Council
on items NOT on the agenda, the Brown Act does not allow discussion of such items.
Therefore, the City Council may only do the following: refer the matter to staff, ask for
additional information or request a report back, or give a very limited factual response.

Closed Session
a. Pursuant to Government Code Section 54956.9(d)(1)
Conference with Legal Counsel — Existing Litigation

Case No. SWS1601308, Marina vs City of Canyon Lake

b. Pursuant to Govt. Code Section 54956.9 (d)(2)
Conference with Legal Counsel — Potential Litigation — 4 cases

C. Return/Report from Closed Session



Canyon Lake City Council
Agenda — January 4, 2017

OPEN SESSION —6:30 P.M.

1. Call Open Session to Order
2. Invocation
Flag Salute
3. Roll Call: Council Members Bonner, Ehrenkranz, Greene, Mayor Pro Tem Warren,

Mayor Haggerty
4. Approval of City Council Agenda
5. Special Presentations and Proclamations:
5.1 Chamber of Commerce Announcements

6. Public Comments — Any person wishing to address the City Council on any matter within
the jurisdiction of the City, whether or not it appears on this agenda, is asked to complete
a “Speaker Request Form” available on the back counter. The completed form is to be
submitted to the City Clerk prior to an individual being heard by the City Council. The City
Council has adopted a time limitation of three (3) minutes per person. If you are
commenting on the agenda item, your comments will be heard at the time that particular
item is scheduled on the agenda. Please note that if you are addressing the City Council
on items NOT on the agenda, the Brown Act does not allow discussion of such items.
Therefore, the City Council may only do the following: refer the matter to staff, ask for
additional information or request a report back, or give a very limited factual response.

7. Consent Calendar:
All items listed on the Consent Calendar are considered to be routine matters, status
reports or documents covering previous City Council action. The items listed on the
Consent Calendar may be enacted in one motion. With the concurrence of the City
Council, a Council Member may request that an item be removed for further discussion.
Staff recommends approval of all items.
7.1 Waiver of Reading in Full of all Ordinances by Title Only

7.2 Adoption of Resolution No. 2016-37, Approving Claims and Demands of the
City Pg.5

7.3 4 Claims Against the City by John Zaitz Pg. 37
8. Pulled Consent Calendar Items
9. Schedule of Future Events:

9.1 Administration and Finance Committee Meeting



Canyon Lake City Council
Agenda — January 4, 2017

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

9.2

9.3

9.4

9.5

9.6

9.7

Public

10.1

Tuesday, January 31, 2017 at 8:00 a.m., City Council Chambers
Public Safety Committee Meeting

Wednesday, January 25, 2017 at 9:30 a.m., City Council Chambers
Canyon Lake City Council Meeting

Wednesday, February 1, 2017 at 6:30 p.m., City Council Chambers
Water Committee Meeting

Thursday, February 16, 2016 at 9:00 a.m., EVMWD

Planning Committee Meeting

Meeting Date To Be Determined

Economic Development and Healthy Communities Meeting
Meeting Date To Be Determined

Veterans Committee Meeting

Meeting Date To Be Determined

Hearing
Public Hearing, second reading, and adoption of Ordinance No. 170;

Repealing Ordinance No. 150 and Adopting the 2016 California Fire Code
as Amended by the City of Canyon Lake Pg. 47

Business ltems

111

11.2

11.3

Update re possible one-year fire contract with Riverside County to place a
two-person squad at Station 60 pg. 76

Discussion Regarding Process for Update and Possible Revision of
complete Council Reimbursement Policies Pg. 78

Discussion on Possible Cafeteria Benefit Increase for staff Pg. 80

City Manager Comments

Committee and Council Reports/Comments

13.1
13.2
13.3
13.4
13.5

Council Member Bonner
Council Member Ehrenkranz
Council Member Greene
Mayor Pro Tem Wairren
Mayor Haggerty

Announcements

The next regular City Council meeting is scheduled for Wednesday, February 1, 2017 at
6:30 p.m. for open session



Canyon Lake City Council
Agenda — January 4, 2017

15. Closed Session
a. Pursuant to Government Code Section 54956.9(d)(1)
Conference with Legal Counsel — Existing Litigation

Case No. SWS1601308, Marina vs City of Canyon Lake

b. Pursuant to Govt. Code Section 54956.9 (d)(2)
Conference with Legal Counsel — Potential Litigation — 4 cases

C. Return/Report from Closed Session

16. Adjournment

VISION STATEMENT

The vision of the City of Canyon Lake is to be a City that provides a quality of life that makes
Canyon Lake the premier place to live in Southern California.

ATTENTION RESIDENTS:

Supporting documents, including staff reports, are available for review at City Hall in the City
Clerk’s Office or on the City’s website at www.cityofcanyonlake.org once the agenda has been
publicly posted. Any written materials relating to an item on this agenda submitted to the City
Council after distribution of the agenda packet are available for public inspection in the City Clerk’s
Office during normal business hours. In addition, such writings or documents will be made
available for public review at the respective public meeting. Itis the intention of the City of Canyon
Lake to comply with the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) in all respects. If, as an attendee
or participant at this meeting, you will need special assistance beyond what is normally provided,
the City of Canyon Lake will attempt to accommodate you in every reasonable manner. Please
contact Ariel M. Hall, City Clerk, at least 48 hours prior to the meeting to inform us of your particular
needs and to determine if accommodation is feasible. Please advise us at that time if you will
need accommodations to attend or participate in meetings on a regular basis.

January 4, 2017 City Council Meeting

STATE OF CALIFORNIA }
COUNTY OF RIVERSIDE } SS. AFFIDAVIT OF POSTING
CITY OF CANYON LAKE }

I, Stephanie N. Hunter, being duly sworn, depose and say that | am the duly appointed and
gualified Office Specialist of the City of Canyon Lake and that on December 22, 2016 before
the hour of 5:00 p.m., | caused the above notice to be posted as required by Resolution
2015-36 of the City Council of the City of Canyon Lake.

Stephanie N. Hunter
Office Specialist



City of Canyon Lake

City Council
Staff Report
TO: Mayor and City Council
FROM: Michelle Gomez, Accountant
DATE: January 3, 2016
SUBJECT: List of Demands
Recommendation:

That the City Council adopts a resolution entitled: RESOLUTION NO. 2016-37

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE
CITY OF CANYON LAKE ALLOWING CERTAIN
CLAIMS AND DEMANDS AS SET FORTH IN EXHIBIT A

Background:

All claims and demands are reported and summarized for review and approval by the City Council
on a routine basis at each City Council meeting. The attached claims represent the paid claims
and demands since the City Council meeting of December 14, 2016.

Budget (or Fiscal) Impact:

All claims and demands are paid from appropriated funds or authorized resources of the City and

have been recorded in accordance with the City’s policies.

Attachments:

Resolution
List of Demands

S







RESOLUTION NO. 2016-37
A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CANYON LAKE, CALIFORNIA, ALLOWING CERTAIN CLAIMS
AND DEMANDS AS SET FORTH IN EXHIBIT A
The City Council of the City of Canyon Lake does hereby resolve as follows:

Demands are approved as shown on the Demand\Warrant Register of January 3rd, in the amount of

$240,018.38 as follows:
Payroll Earnings (Gross) '$ 39,005.80 (2nd Half of November & 1st Half of December)
Payroll Taxes - Employer $ 645.08 (2nd Half of November & 1st Half of December)
On-line Retirement 4,067.29 (2nd Half of November & 1st Half of December)
On-line Health 732.92 (For the Month of December)
General 195,567.29
TOTAL $ 240,018.38

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 3rd day of January 2017.

Mayor, Dawn Haggerty
ATTEST:

Stephanie Hunter, Office Specialist







City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 12/1/2016 Through 12/31/2016

Matching
Check Docum... Check Fund  Fund Short
Numb... Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code  Title
22775 12/14/2...  Air Force 1 Complete Maintenance 1,194.00 10 GENERAL
(Change of filters); 11/22/16
Total 12/1472... 1,194.00
22775
22776 12/14/2... AMERICAN Blood Draw, November 2016 80.00 10 GENERAL
FORENSIC NURSES
INC
Total 12/1412... 80.00
227176
22777 12/14/2...  Amy Blau Refund of Deposit Balance 425.00 10 GENERAL
for # CUP 16-11;11/29/16
Total 12/14/2... 425.00
22777
22778 12/14/2...  Aprile DeAnne Tree Lighting Ceremony - 150.00 10 GENERAL
McKinnon Music/Microphone Sound
System 12/8
Total 12/14/2... 150.00
22778
22779 12/14/2... CHARLES ABBOTT Building & Safety - 3,407.19 10 GENERAL
ASSOCIATES, INC. Permit/Plan Review; Nov
2016
22779 12/14/2... CHARLES ABBOTT Environmental Services 3,315.00 10 GENERAL
ASSOCIATES, INC. (NPDES) for October 2016
Total 12/14/2... 6,722.19
22779
22780 12/14/2... Christopher McPeck Christmas Tree & Labor for 3,759.25 10 GENERAL
Lighting Service; 12/8/16
Total 12/14/2... 3,759.25
22780
22781 12/14/2...  City Clerks Association 2017 Membership Renewal 185.00 10 GENERAL
of California
Total 12/1472... 185.00

22781

Date: 12/21/16 04:14:40 PM

Page: 19




City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 12/1/2016 Through 12/31/2016

Matching
Check Docum... Check Fund  Fund Short
Numb... Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code  Title
22782 12/14/2... CANYON LAKE PEST  Quarterly Pests (Mice & 100.00 10 GENERAL
CONTROL, Steven E. Rats); November 2016
Young
Total 12/14/2... 100.00
22782
22783 12/14/2...  Control Pump Landscape Pump Station - 540.00 20 GAS TAX
Irrigation Repairs; 12/1/16
Total 12/14/2... 540.00
22783
22784 12/14/2...  Corelogic Information Data Base for Code 28.50 10 GENERAL
Solutions, INC. Enforcement Cases; Nov 2016
Total 12/14/2... 28.50
22784 '
22785 12/14/2...  Cota Cole LLP Attorney Services (General); 3,86346 10 GENERAL
Nov 2016
22785 12/1422...  Cota Cole LLP Attorney Services for Marina 360.00 10 GENERAL
Landscape Maint; Nov 2016
Total 12/14/2... 4,223.46
22785
22786 12/14/2... DATA TICKET Code Enforcement Citation 100.00 10 GENERAL
Processing, November 2016
Total 12/14/72... 100.00
22786
22787 12/14/2...  Department of Justice Blood Alcohol Analysis; 35.00 10 GENERAL
Accounting Office November 2016
22787 12/14/2...  Department of Justice Fingerprinting; November 22400 10 GENERAL
Accounting Office 2016
Total 12/14/72... 259.00
22787
22788 12/14/2...  Jordan Ehrenkranz Expense Report Council 317.80 10 GENERAL

Date: 12/21/16 04:14:40 PM

Member Ehrenkranz, 4/1/16
to 10/1/16

Pagqx)




City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 12/1/2016 Through 12/31/2016

Date: 12/21/16 04:14:40 PM

Matching
Check Docum... Check Fund  Fund Short
Numb... Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code  Title
Total 12/14/2... 317.80
22788
22789 12/14/2...  ELSINORE VALLEY Water Bill for City Hall; 10695 10 GENERAL
MUNI WATER DIS Period: 10/24/16 to 11/22/16
22789 12/14/2...  ELSINORE VALLEY Water Bill for Fire Station; 21673 10 GENERAL
MUNI WATER DIS Period: 10/27/16 to 11/28/16
22789 12/14/2...  ELSINORE VALLEY Water Bill for Irrigation; 59231 20 GAS TAX
MUNI WATER DIS Period: 10/27/16 to 11/28/16
Total 12/14/2... 915.99
22789
22790 12/14/2...  Executive Cleaning Cleaning Services for 925.00 10 GENERAL
Services, LLC December 2016
- Total 12/14/2... 925.00
22790
22791 12/14/2...  Fastsigns Retro Fit Neon to LED 500.00 10 GENERAL
Lighting & Repaint City Hall;
11/15/16
22791 12/14/2...  Fastsigns Retro Fit Neon to LED 2,200.00 40 CAP. PROJ.
Lighting & Repaint City Hall;
11/15/16
Total 12/14/72... 2,700.00
22791
22792 12/14/2...  GOLDING 500 Blank Stock for City 51.84 10 GENERAL
PUBLICATIONS License Cards; Invoice Date
12/2/16
Total 12/14/2... 51.84
22792
22793 12/14/2...  Good Time DJ & Sound Equipment 250.00 10 GENERAL
Entertainment System Rental - Veterans Day
11/11/16
Total 12/1472... 250.00
22793

Pagorpq




City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 12/1/2016 Through 12/31/2016

Matching
Check Docum... Check Fund Fund Short
Numb... Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code  Title
22794 12/14/2... LANCE, SOLL & 2016 City Financial Audit - 9,325.00 10 GENERAL
LUNGHARD Fieldwork Performed;
11/30/16
Total 12/14/2... 9,325.00
22794
22795 12/14/2...  Office & Ergonomic New Desk for front of office, 3,81294 10 GENERAL
Solutions Inc. Invoice Date: 10/28/16
Total 12/14/2... 3,812.94
22795
22796 12/14/2...  Pitney Bowes, Inc. Monthly Digital Mailing 67.18 10 GENERAL
System; Invoice Date:
11/15/16
Total 12/1472... 67.18
22796
22797 12/14/2...  RIV. CO. SHERIFF'S Law Enforcement Services 114,151.66 10 GENERAL
DEPT., Acctg & Fin (Contract Law) 10/13/16 to
11/9/16
Total 12/14/2... 114,151.66
22797
22798 12/14/2...  SOUTHERN Electricity Bill for Traffic 209.15 20 GAS TAX
CALIFORNIA EDISON  Signals; 10/14/16 to 11/15/16
22798 12/14/2...  SOUTHERN Electricity Bill for Traffic 412.84 20 GAS TAX
CALIFORNIA EDISON  Signals; 10/28/16 to 11/30/16
Total 12/14/2... 621.99
22798
22799 12/14/2...  State Water Resources State Water Board Annual 8,980.00 10 GENERAL
Control Board Permit Fee; Invoice Date
12/1/16
Total 12/14/72... 8,980.00
22799
22800 12/14/2...  The Gas Company Gas Bill; Billing Period: 3928 10 GENERAL

Date: 12/21/16 04:14:40 PM

10/26/16 to 11/29/16

Pagof2




City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 12/1/2016 Through 12/31/2016

Matching
Check Docum... Check Fund  Fund Short
Numb... Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code  Title
Total 12/14/2... 39.28
22800
22801 12/14/2...  TVC, Inc. Remote System - Diagnosed 95.00 10 GENERAL
City's Phone System; 11/21/16
Total 12/14/72... 95.00
22801
22802 12/14/2...  U.S. Postage Service Postage Refill for November 400.00 10 GENERAL
(Postage-By-Phone) 2016
Total 12/14/2... 400.00
22802
22803 12/14/2...  U.S.Bank Veterans Day, Tree Lighting, 4,963.57 10 GENERAL
Student of Month, 11/8 to
11/30
Total 12/14/2... 4,963.57
22803
22804 12/14/2...  VERIZON Ipads; Billing Period: 239.10 10 GENERAL
CALIFORNIA 11/04/16 to 12/03/16
Total 12/14/72... 239.10
22804
22805 12/14/2...  VERIZON Cell Phone Bill; Billing 33299 10 GENERAL
CALIFORNIA Period: 11/4/16 to 12/3/16
Total 12/14/2... 332.99
22805
22806 12/14/2...  Vivint Solar Refund $21.00 for 21.00 10 GENERAL
Overpayment for License
Renewal; 12/1/16
Total 12/14/2... 21.00
22806
22807 12/14/2...  Walsh Marine Products, Five Anchor's & Chains for 1,103.75 10 GENERAL
Inc. Buoys (North Lake);
11/29/2016

Date: 12/21/16 04:14:40 PM

Pgef3




City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 12/1/2016 Through 12/31/2016

Matching
Check Docum... Check Fund  Fund Short
Numb... Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code  Title
Total 12/14/2... 1,103.75
22807
22808 12/14/2...  Warbirds West Air T-34 Formation Fly By for 600.00 10 GENERAL
Museum, Inc. Veterans Day Celebration
Total 12/14/2... 600.00
22808
22809 12/14/2...  XEROX Copier Lease, November 513.76 10 GENERAL
2016
Total 12/1472... 513.76
22809
22810 12/21/2...  BIO-TOX Blood Testing Services, 198.00 10 GENERAL
LABORATORIES December 2016
Total 12/2172... 198.00
22810
22811 12/21/2...  Timothy Brown Reimbursement for Internet 100.00 10 GENERAL
& Cell to Brown, Nov 2016
22811 12/21/2...  Timothy Brown Reimbursement for Internet 17934 10 GENERAL
& Cell to Brown, Oct 2016
22811 12/21/2...  Timothy Brown Reimbursement for Internet 9831 10 GENERAL
& Cell to Brown, Sept 2016
Total 12/21/2... 377.65
22811
22812 12/21/2... CHARLES ABBOTT Engineering & Planning 5,88825 10 GENERAL
ASSOCIATES, INC. Services, November 2016 _
22812 12/21/2... CHARLES ABBOTT Environmental Services for 7250 10 GENERAL
ASSOCIATES, INC. November 2016
22812 12/21/2... CHARLES ABBOTT Engineering Services (Gas 15,023.81 20 GAS TAX
ASSOCIATES, INC. Tax); November 2016
Total 12/2172... 20,984.56
22812
22813 12/21/2... DATA TICKET Monthly Citations for 100.00 10 GENERAL
November 2016

Date: 12/21/16 04:14:40 PM

Pagef4




City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 12/1/2016 Through 12/31/2016

Matching

Check Docum... Check Fund  Fund Short

Numb... Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code  Title

Total 12/2172... 100.00

22813

22814 12/21/2...  EnviroSupply & Service =~ Buffer pH & Aqua Solutions, 6252 10 GENERAL
Invoice Date: 12/1/16

Total 12/21/2... 62.52

22814

22815 12/21/2...  Frontier Fios Internet, Billing Period: 147.50 10 GENERAL
12/10/16 to 1/9/17

22815 12/21/2... Frontier Phones; Billing Period: 63.84 10 GENERAL
12/10/16 to 1/9/17

22815 12/21/2...  Frontier Phones; Billing Period: 340.51 10 GENERAL
12/13/16 to 1/12/17

Total 12/21/2... 551.85

22815

22816 12/21/2...  Dawn Haggerty Reimbursement for Internet 100.00 10 GENERAL
& Cell to Haggerty, Dec 2016

22816 12/21/2...  Dawn Haggerty Reimbursement for Internet 100.00 10 GENERAL
& Cell to Haggerty, Oct 2016

Total 12/21/2... 200.00

22816

22817 12/21/2... K Graphics Notice of Violation Forms for 711.72 10 GENERAL
Special Enforcement;
12/10/16

22817 12/21/2... K Graphics Notice to Tow Forms for 623.14 10 GENERAL
Special Enforcement,
12/10/16

Total 12/2122... 1,334.86

22817

22818 12/21/2...  Riverside County Division Meeting 200.00 10 GENERAL

Division / LCC (Ehrenkranz, Haggerty &

Zaitz); 11/14/16

Total 12/21/2... 200.00

22818

Date: 12/21/16 04:14:40 PM

Page]H




City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 12/1/2016 Through 12/31/2016

Matching
Check Docum... Check Fund Fund Short
Numb... Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code Title
22819 12/21/2... Maureen Kane & Techinical Training for 1,550.00 10 GENERAL
Associates, Inc. Clerks (TTC) Series 300,
3/14/17
Total 12/2172... 1,550.00
22819
22820 12/21/2... SOUTHERN Electricity Bill for City Hall; 71024 10 GENERAL
CALIFORNIA EDISON  11/15/16 to 12/15/16
22820 12/2172... SOUTHERN Electricity Bill for Fire 120.31 10 GENERAL
CALIFORNIA EDISON  Station; 11/15/16 to 12/15/16
22820 12/2172... SOUTHERN Electricity Bill for Pump 262.99 20 GAS TAX
CALIFORNIA EDISON  Station; 11/8/16 to 12/9/16
22820 12/21/2... SOUTHERN Electricity Bill for Traffic 13.05 20 GAS TAX
CALIFORNIA EDISON  Signals; 10/20/16 to 11/19/16
22820 12/21/2... SOUTHERN Electricity Bill for Traffic 199.59 20 GAS TAX
CALIFORNIA EDISON  Signals; 11/15/16 to 12/15/16
Total 12/21/2... 1,306.18
22820
22821 12/21/2... Special District Risk Dental Insurance for 198.79 10 GENERAL
Management Authority December 2016
Total 12/21/2... 198.79
22821
22822 12/21/2...  Sparkletts Water Service, December 2761 10 GENERAL
2016
Total 12/21/2... 27.61
22822
22823 12/21/2... Tyco Integrated Security =~ Alarm System; 1/1/17 to 181.02 10 GENERAL
LLC 3/31/17
Total 1212112... 181.02
22823
22824 12/21/2... JOHN ZAITZ Reimbursement for Internet 100.00 10 GENERAL
& Cell to Zaitz, Nov 2016
Total 12/21/2... 100.00
22824

Date: 12/21/16 04:14:40 PM

Page¢1§6




City of Canyon Lake
Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures
From 12/1/2016 Through 12/31/2016

. Matching
Check Docum... Check Fund  Fund Short
Numb... Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code  Title
Report Total 195,567.29

Date: 12/21/16 04:14:40 PM

Pagd 7




City of Canyon Lake

“Invoices Selected for Payment - COUNCIL CHECK REPORT

Vendor ID Invoice Description Cash Required
BIO-TOX Blood Testing Services, December 2016 198.00
Brown T Reimbursement for Internet & Cell to Brown, Nov 100.00
2016
Reimbursement for Internet & Cell to Brown, Oct 179.34
2016
'Reimbursement for Internet & Cell to Brown, Sept - 9831
2016
CHARLES ABBOTT Environmental Services for November 2016 72.50
Engineering & Planning Services, November 2016 5,888.25
Engineering Services (Gas Tax); November 2016 15,023.81
DATA TICKET Monthly Citations for November 2016 100.00
Enviro Buffer pH & Aqua Solutions, Invoice Date: 12/1/16 "62.52
Frontier Fios Internet, Billing Period: 12/10/16 to 1/9/17 147.50
Phones; Billing Period: 12/13/16 to 1/12/17 221.67
Phones; Billing Period: 12/13/16 to 1/12/17 118.84
Phones; Billing Period: 12/10/16 to 1/9/17 63.84
Haggerty Reimbursement for Internet & Cell to Haggerty, Dec 100.00
2016
Reimbursement for Internet & Cell to Haggerty, Oct 100.00
2016
K Graphics Notice to Tow Forms for Special Enforcement, 623.14
12/10/16
Notice of Violation Forms for Special Enforcement; 711,72
12/10/16
LCC, Riv. Co. Div. Division Meeting (Ehrenkranz, Haggerty & Zaitz); 200.00
; 11/14/16
Maureen Kane & Techinical Training for Clerks (TTC) Series 300, 1,550.00
Associates, Inc. 3/14/17
SCE Electricity Bill for Traffic Signals; 11/15/16 to 199.59
12/15/16
Electricity Bill for Pump Station; 11/8/16 to 12/9/16 262.99
Electricity Bill for City Hall; 11/15/16 to 12/15/16 710.24
Electricity Bill for Fire Station; 11/15/16 to 12/15/16 120.31
Electricity Bill for Traffic Signals; 10/20/16 to 13.05
11/19/16
SDRMA Dental Insurance for December 2016 198.79
Sparkletts Water Service, December 2016 27.61
TYCO - ADT Alarm System; 1/1/17 to 3/31/17 181.02
ZAITZ Reimbursement for Internet & Cell to Zaitz, Nov 100.00
2016
Report Total 27,373.04

Date: 12/21/16
04:01:54 PM

Page: 1

18




City of Canyon Lake

Invoices Selected for Payment - COUNCIL CHECK REPORT

Vendor ID Invoice Description Cash Required
- BIO-TOX Blood Testing Services, December 2016 198.00
Report Total 198.00

Date: 12/21/16
04:20:30 PM

Page: 1
19




City of Canyon Lake

Invoices Selected for Payment - COUNCIL CHECK REPORT

Vendor ID Invoice Description Cash Required

Air Force 1 Complete Maintenance (Change of filters); 11/22/16 1,194.00

AMERICAN FORENSIC Blood Draw, November 2016 80.00

Amy Blau Refund of Deposit Balance for # CUP 425.00
16-11;11/29/16

Aprile McKinnon Tree Lighting Ceremony - Music/Microphone Sound 150.00
System 12/8

CHARLES ABBOTT Building & Safety - Permit/Plan Review; Nov 2016 3,407.19
Environmental Services (NPDES) for October 2016 3,315.00

Christopher McPeek Christmas Tree & Labor for Lighting Service; 12/8/16 3,759.25

City Clerks Association 2017 Membership Renewal 185.00

of Cali

CL PEST Quarterly Pests (Mice & Rats); November 2016 100.00

Control Pump Landscape Pump Station - Irrigation Repairs; 540.00
12/1/16

Corelogic Data Base for Code Enforcement Cases; Nov 2016 28.50

Cota Cole Attorney Services (General); Nov 2016 3,863.46
Attorney Services for Marina Landscape Maint; Nov 360.00
2016

DATA TICKET Code Enforcement Citation Processing, November 100.00
2016

Department of Justice Blood Alcohol Analysis; November 2016 35.00
Fingerprinting; November 2016 224.00

Ehrenkranz Expense Report Council Member Ehrenkranz, 4/1/16 317.80
to 10/1/16

EVMWD Water Bill for City Hall; Period: 10/24/16 to 11/22/16 106.95
Water Bill for Fire Station; Period: 10/27/16 to 216.73
11/28/16
Water Bill for Irrigation; Period: 10/27/16 to 592.31
11/28/16

Executive Cleaning Cleaning Services for December 2016 925.00

Services, LL.C

Fastsigns Retro Fit Neon to LED Lighting & Repaint City Hall; 2,200.00
11/15/16
Retro Fit Neon to LED Lighting & Repaint City Hall; 500.00
11/15/16

GOLDING 500 Blank Stock for City License Cards; Invoice Date 51.84
12/2/16

Good Time DJ & Sound Equipment System Rental - Veterans 250.00
Day 11/11/16

LANCE, SOLL 2016 City Financial Audit - Fieldwork Performed; 9,325.00
11/30/16

Office & Ergonomic New Desk for front of office, Invoice Date: 10/28/16 3,812.94

Pitney Bowes Monthly Digital Mailing System; Invoice Date: 67.18

Date: 12/14/16
04:37:05 PM

11/15/16

Page: 1

20




City of Canyon Lake

Invoices Selected for Payment - COUNCIL CHECK REPORT

Vendor ID Invoice Description Cash Required

Riv Co Sheriff Acctg Law Enforcement Services (Contract Law) 10/13/16 114,151.66
to 11/9/16

SCE Electricity Bill for Traffic Signals; 10/14/16 to 209.15
11/15/16
Electricity Bill for Traffic Signals; 10/28/16 to 412.84
11/30/16

SWRCB State Water Board Annual Permit Fee; Invoice Date 8,980.00
12/1/16

The Gas Co Gas Bill; Billing Period: 10/26/16 to 11/29/16 39.28

TVC, Inc. Remote System - Diagnosed City's Phone System; 95.00
11/21/16

U.S. Postage Service Postage Refill for November 2016 400.00

US Bank Veterans Day, Tree Lighting, Student of Month, 4,963.57
11/8 to 11/30

VERIZON Cell Phone Bill; Billing Period: 11/4/16 to 12/3/16 332.99
Ipads; Billing Period: 11/04/16 to 12/03/16 239.10

Vivint Solar Refund $21.00 for Overpayment for License 21.00
Renewal; 12/1/16

Walsh Marine Products,  Five Anchor's & Chains for Buoys (North Lake); 1,103.75

Inc. 11/29/2016

Warbirds T-34 Formation Fly By for Veterans Day Celebration 600.00

XEROX Copier Lease, November 2016 513.76

Report Total 168,194.25

Date: 12/14/16

04:37:05 PM

Page: 2
21




AVIN 9107°5661 O 2T

¢
AewH ko WA Lpi90  ewnL umy 910€-28T (LL8) Xed £20€-$18 (Q08) om0y,
wes], Jmewsolopuy oedg(og)  jusmmaedag SU/EI/ZT ‘e uny TjoxAed Z1€C
N
N
. 0 h [ s \od Yoy
=24 X0\ D) .
A YIET * A iy
LTI soxg], Jokofdmg [eI0L pO°STL soxe[, sofojdwy (10, 00°0 suopoupaq (8101, 00°Z18 00°62 sSuyuieg [ejoL,
96°€69 ury I8N L1l 007CI8 aXedIPIN QU
LL'€T8 qeryior LL11 00°CI8 H-omopsN J-QHN 1H°88 00C18 toou] exepad  MIIJ
00°TI8 5501 000 000 1S enuomEeD  INSVO 0F'L 0018 o -IAS VO IAsvD 0 SN
00'0 000 ILPUWHVD IL1aVD 9501 00°CI8 IS eraIogie) Vo 00°CI8 00°62 mmisy 8oy 0 Speurdsg
jumowy  S[qEXEL XeL Spop jmnoury S[qEXE], XL, opoy umoury wononpag _ opoy Mmiowy SO Sunieg  9poy [ saakoydury
= = @ [uIiE
!‘g = ilt.r.“.uﬂhl.hﬂl e (IH!-I['I‘(.I

T[eYsoA 01 hoﬁuoh om\mo.wmsﬂmm AVAN910T'5661 O3
. : @ :
T S5 SIS LS o cens aémmm
Hed ;@@d/:i rtd gﬁ@ Voo
A\\\ \\w | <£ﬁ® %ég
SE'60% 99'29¢ Soxe], Jadojdmy (€101, ST'6v6T saxg], sakodury w107, pgogs SmonInpaq [L10Y, $9'pIIST 00'6p€ sSuney fej0],
._Emmﬂ H.«Mz . . 09792  FOFIIET ST IR s oy B
b mm..“o L wu.nou vww:wﬂ H-sw®omeN A-QAN 106131 09°8STLT 10007 [B19pS  MIIA 6€'76791 0011 mpSsy oy
1D oo.o cc.o IS BRUONED  INSVD €S°SHT 99°89191 uH-IAS VD IAsvD €r'i6d dxel-a1ld IdXId 0S°191 0s'6 mpdwoy dmopy ¢ S[e
000 000 ILRUWHVD LIAVO 20°7TL 09'8STLT IS BIIoIIE) VO 19%9% dXel-01d IXV1d ST9LIT useD 621 0DseT 4 srews
junowry  S[qEXEL, Xe],  9po) mowy S[qEXe], Xe[ opoy Junonry UOLONPS(]  9po) IOy SMOF  ounbég  apo) § saafordm

R e



mmho_&ﬁﬁm : ) AVAN 9102-5661 O 09

WA Lb'80  oumy umy 910€-787 (LL8) Xed £Z0€-$18 (Q08) oYy
SIqUISIA] [IoUn0D(05) weunredaq OU/EZ/IT  omeQ umy TjoxAed Z1€0

]
N

.U+8 wx_‘umszscg T.T.,\U C.dc;?@ VOIDY]
/el

7 PO

$9°0LE soxey, Tokopdury feyoL 7e'LSTE soxu], sakordury ejoy, $evz96 suondnpa( 18301, 971°6L00T (2414 sSupwrey fejoL,

6V°6S8ST oy 19N P1'16T 91°6,00T SO AN 000 05’6 WIS IS

.na”aqveu qerTI0L ST°16T 91°6£00C H-9mOpSIN  ¥-QHN $T°280T 1891161 1000] 1epad  MILI I¥'€Cest 00°6C€ .a__._mu.m mo.m

91°6L00T SSoID 00°8L 00°00ST 1S emioyEd  INSVO 17°L91 91°6L581 ug -1as v IAsvD 510§ dXer-e1d IIXId 0S°6LS 00°9L Keprioyy OH 9 SN
0S'T 00°00S1 IL2OPHVD LIAVO €L91L 1891161 IS ermIoyme) VD) £8°09% dXel-ald IXVId STILIT USED §TT 0OSTI 9 S[euIs g
mnowry  s[qexey, Xey, Sp0) Jumowry S[qexey, XEL  9po,) Ijanowmy mononpa  epoy WMoWy SO Suraey  apopy pI seakordwry

(95£01) Amedmopy
e =9m=anv Jo b—u uoynqLysiq Joqey
i

T00ETIOT07  ‘sse001g
910T/0E/1T =18 ¥0a1)




my|CalPERS - Payment Request Acceptance Page 1 of 1

Skip to: Content | Footer | Welcome Michelle | Help | Contact Us | CalPERS | Log out December 07, 2016

Home Profile Reporting Person Information Education . Other Organizations

Manage Reports  Billing and Payments Payroll Schedule Member Requests Health Reconciliation ~Retirement Appointment Reconciliation

Common Tasks

(4 Name: City of Canyon Lake CalPERS ID: 3813045770
Menu a i
. (v} Payment Request Acceptance
Billing and Payments _ | yoyr request for payment has been accepted.
Super Funded
Accounts * Please print this page for your records.
Rate Plan Details * If you need to contact us with questions regarding this payment, please have your Payment Confirmation Number
for faster access.
Payment Accounts

Your payment will be reflected in your CalPERS account once the payment has been received by CalPERS.
Your payment account may take longer to post, depending upon your Financial Institution. Once your payment is
processed, CalPERS will send a confirmation email to the email address in your profile.

:0 Payment Setup Total
Total Payment Amount: $732.92

:GJ Payment Summary
Payment Payment

N . Payment Selected

Confirmation Authorization ;{gcewable g::i:-‘i’az:)en ;Z‘{:':; t Account Paymen

Number Date P Nickname Amount
Employer Billing, Health - EFT -

1000790874  12/07/2016 100000014865118 Medical ' Debit 122234149 $732.92

© Copyright 2016 CalPERS | Conditions of Use | Accessibility

Build: v6.3 Baseline: 161123_150251_v6.3_Int.2319 UID: 318

ompa} 13/gliy 47

24

httne/fmxr calnare ra onviaah/ahn/financialo/mavmantomatrmantQahimQumrmmars him19nor n 197/7/190\1 4




my|CalPERS - Payment Request Acceptance

Home Profile Reporting Person Information Education Other Organizations

Page 1 of 1

Skip to: Content | Footer | Welcome Michelle | Help | Contact Us | CalPERS | Log out December 07, 2016

Manage Reports  Billing and Payments Payroll Schedule Member Requests Health Reconciliation Retirement Appointment Reconciliation

Common Tasks & Name: City of Canyon Lake CalPERS ID: 3813045770

Menu o L
- (v} Payment Request Acceptance
Billing and Payments _ | yoyr request for payment has been accepted.
Super Funded
Accounts ¢ Please print this page for your records.
Rate Plan Details » If you need to contact us with questions regarding this payment, please have your Payment Confirmation Number
for faster access. :
Payment Accounts * Your payment will be reflected in your CalPERS account once the payment has been received by CalPERS.
. * Your payment account may take longer to post, depending upon your Financial Institution. Once your payment is
processed, CalPERS will send a confirmation email to the email address in your profile.
’0 Payment Setup Total
Total Payment Amount: $2,039.84
:ﬂ Payment Summary
Payment Payment . . Payment Selected
Confirmation Authorization llzgcenvable g::i:-‘i’ag:;en ;ae‘{:'l:':d"t Account Payment
Number Date p Nickname Amount
Employer Contribution, EFT -
1000790886  12/08/2016 100000014777932 Classic, 1684, CalPERS, Debit 122234149 $1,012.32
2016/2017
Employer Contribution, PEPRA EFT -
1000790887  12/08/2016 100000014780751 New, 26189, CalPERS, . 122234149 $1,027.52
Debit
2016/2017
© Copyright 2016 CalPERS | Conditions of Use | Accessibility
Build: v6.3 Baseline: 161123_150251_v6.3_Int.2319 UID: 318
Qo Rl %
25
| SRS ) SN, DU IRURY M N DI JRSTRY - SRS S, PR SR W ST o PR SRR o [N RS | s S 1A INN1 -




mlealPERS - Payment Request Acceptance Page 1 of 1

Skip to: Content | Footer | Welcome Michelle | Help | Contact Us | CalPERS | Log out December 21, 2016

Home Profile Reporting Person Information Education Other Organizations

Manage Reports  Billing and Payments Payroll Schedule Member Requests Health Reconciliation Retirement Appointment Reconciliation

Common Tasks & Name: City of Canyon Lake CalPERS ID: 3813045770

Menu fo Zais
- \0' Payment Request Acceptance
Billing and Payments _ | yqour request for payment has been accepted.
Super Funded
Accounts * Please print this page for your records.
Rate Plan Details * If you need to contact us with questions regarding this payment, please have your Payment Confirmation Number
for faster access.
Payment Accounts * Your payment will be reflected in your CalPERS account once the payment has been received by CalPERS,
¢ Your payment account may take longer to post, depending upon your Financial Institution. Once your payment is
processed, CalPERS will send a confirmation email to the email address in your profile.

:0 Payment Setup Total
Total Payment Amount: $2,027.45

@ Payment Summary

Payment Payment . . Payment Selected
Confirmation Authorization ;l;celvable g:gi:_‘i'ag:; . ;aey;:]noe(;\t Account Payment
Number Date p Nickname Amount
Employer Contribution, EFT -
1000796066 12/21/2016 100000014777932 Classic, 1684, CalPERS, . 122234149 $1,020.61
Debit
2016/2017
Employer Contribution, PEPRA EFT -
1000796067 12/21/2016 100000014780751 New, 26189, CalPERS, Debit 122234149 $1,006.84
2016/2017

© Copyright 2016 CalPERS | Conditions of Use | Accessibility
Build: v6.3 Baseline: 161123_150251_v6.3_Int.2319 UID: 318

26
https://my.calpers.ca.gov/web/ebp/financials/payments/paymentSetupSummary html?psr.... 12/21/2016




LEOTRT  $ - $ - S - $ - $ - - $ O08'GLO'TES OTZ06'Y8 $ €9°90S°L6 $ ETOLI'TOT $ €5°795€8 $ jejol
S6'EE TLEE S6'EE G6'EE S6'EE G6'EE D71 s50U1SNg 2]GeD) JoUIEA BWIL.
WLTT £8'THY'T £LT'e6ZT 69'812'T 06'202'T 8Y'0TE'T 11 {¥J) S331AIaS OJu| 3|qEJ JBLIBM Sl
“3U] ‘eJUJOJ}|ED UOZLIOA,

TL'TOS'E 09°S28‘E ¢8'6Y8E (311GS) "auj eluIo(ED JBIUDLS

6L9 | €65

E R n.\u. ] .mcuzz_mm EENECEEE

S¥9 59

£€9°IS fra o4 19'8% 61°65 *JU] “S30IA13S XBIXT 03 UEDIBLIY 3FBUOA
219'62T 61°'SCT 15811 d7 'VSN 3|{GOIAl UIBIIA

- - - - JTi ‘@0UB3sig SU0] UOZUaA

*aut ‘auoydaaL Ayun

85'CC ST'TL ST'ZC (%44 8T 271 ‘dnoJo wodsiaL AN
86'68 0206 7956 'i6 *dJod dyidedajaL 's'n

JT1 3uoud (en3ia DML

STY9CT €E'V6IT 25'TS2T TT'TECT 99'651°T 352 3[IGON-L|
oLe oLL [-T4 4 - SUOIIEDIUNWIWIOD JEISTIBIS

SBIEUDINS SLIN SS9[2JIM PIEdald VD d1 'SDd Auoydala] Jupids

60°690°C 098967 16'911C TS'€E8T'T PIed 1504 S58[a1M d1 'S0d Auoudajal Jupds)

ST'TY 29'05 58'05 088 wni3ads Julds

wt 60'T €97 90¢C suofieaunwwio) Julids

- - - - “3uj “ods

69'ST 8Y'ST 19'%T 08'ST JT14eIsU0

61'S 9z'S 10's 131y - Auedwo) auoyda|a] ||og Jytoed

0S'ELT'E 8L'9CC°E ZSTELE LV'8IE'E 71 §2d SS3|3M Jeindul) meN
15Ty 876 v6°0p €9y 71 ‘elutogi|ed SOd 043N
£5°0T 191 8TYT *JU] ‘s33jAJBS SUOREJUNWWIO] 1IN

8LTISE T8'0S8E 85796'E lysisupied pa3jl] YSINS S9[98UY SO7

JA %4 ¥S'T (43 85T 2T1 suUojIEaluNWWO) € [9AST
0C'0 600 600 010 (s921A135 X323 W)i4) dul ‘BJEjeAY O/ U} .suﬂxc_*
- - - - ssojRMI

61T LT'T TE'S *2U§ ‘BIB|BAY 0/3 *3U} BLIBWY YLION 3|3009
- - - 1543 JT1 SUCHESIUNWLIOIS|D L SIIUBID)

LLTEY £5°£8C TE0SE 86°7LY BJ13WY JO SUOKEJUNWIWIO) JaljuoLy

89'T98'C 69°S00°E T8'8T0°E 66'SSTE (31dS) du) ejuiogi|e) JaRUOIY

- - (453 (453 SIOIAIIS XB1Z3 Vi) "IU| “BIB[BAY O/3 D17 “SS3|3IM Yse|d

8€'9T EE'TT CETT 0E'ST 71 553J23IM 12214

L9VT 80°PT W'IE - U] “AS18u3 MaN UOHE|j3Isuo)

- - - - *JU] [9104393dS - -2U[ ‘'SUOIIN|OS SoUE o)

J1X4 160 ssafaJiM Apeay - 2u) ‘suojin|os sJueydwo)

8v'ST st “3U] ‘BAIIXaN - 2U] ‘'SUONIN|OS SDUENAWIO)

T6'vL 1H95 Snquanyf eqp *dul ‘jjeJ3eaJlo - Ju) ‘suoyn|os adueldwo))

£9°0 89°0 OT1 ‘Auedwio) suoiedlunwWIWo) jurAinius)

96'19

4J03 181V

u._._ "Rg13U3 WOOY|

Auedwo) se9 ayL

fiou ¥eL yguD

YU

078087 | 9verost

SL'L26'ET

80'901°9Z

967T59°€C

—OMIAAT

20'0£0'C S0'£20'2

T6'2Y1'C

0E'600'Z

LS'88E'C

[

AR

8S'EL9'LE

$0'28L'0S

L9'8LT'TS

TE'YIL'OE

TOSIP3 EII0JI[ED UISUANGS

Ju| ‘AZ13U3 MBN UONE||BISUD))!

o)

— Aey

Areniqog

im:...uq

J3qudlag

1oquIsnoN 1960190

£102/9102 A4
Ppopad sajuss Ag Aiewiwing paxeg Aijjn
ey uoAue) jo Ay)

- Jaquiaidas -

AEnEnY

27



9T-GT [BMOV emigen: QLY AIDILNY =ipme SHASN OFAIN ===

9@ AON 10

T

Caaia

9T-GT [BNIOY =iz ALV IDILNY sl SYD) cxesie
29 AON 100

SV9S

9T-ST [BNOVY «os@pre (QILVAIDILNY el HI |V oomime

223 AON 100
@ e ®
Brmermrasinsssons: rone,

o e
< E RAZUNN

000°C
0007
0009

0008

0s
00T
0sT

00¢

000°s

000°01T
000°ST
000°02
000°5¢
000°'0€
000'sE

9T-GT [BNPY ~~@=-  (ILVIDILNY =@==  NOITFTIL ===

28

29Q AON 120

000°s
o 000°0T
000°ST
INOJ313L
9T-GT [ENIDY wempran ALY dIDILNY st JLSYM A0S s=ip==
29 AON 100
@ T e & ”
rs i e~ e
e 000°S
i

T 000°0T

000°ST
48HI ILSVM A0S
91-GT [BNIY <=egiime (QILVAIDILNY =m@me DY 1DTTF ==
AON 120

000°0T
000°0T
000°0¢
0000
000°0S
00009

Ol AERE



CITIZENSTRUST

@E@EEVE@

DEC 19 9018
4%

CITY OF CANYON LAKE
31516 RAILROAD CANYON RD
CANYON LAKE CA 92587

STATEMENT FOR THE PERIOD FROM 11/01/2016 TO 11/30/2016
ACCOUNT 1035003119

THIS IS YOUR REPORT OF INVESTMENTS AND TRANSACTIONS FOR THE PERIOD. INCLUDED
IN THE REPORT ARE

* PORTFOLIO: SUMMARY GRAPHICAL DISPLAY WITH MARKET VALUE & PERCENT
* ACTIVITY SUMMARY: MARKET VALUE WITH TRANSACTION SUMMARY

* PORTFOLIO STATEMENT: A LISTING OF COST AND MARKET VALUE OF ASSETS
HELD IN THE PORTFOLIO

‘COST BASIS APPLICABLE FOR CALCULATING CAPITAL GAINS AND LOSSES.
MARKET VALUE IS THE CURRENT VALUE OF EACH ASSET FOR MOST STOCKS AND BONDS.
MARKETS ARE THE CLOSING PRICES ON THE LAST TRADING DAY OF THE PERIOD.

* TRANSACTION STATEMENT: A COMPLETE LISTING FOR THE PERIOD GROUPED BY
TRANSACTION TYPE.

* DISCLOSURES: CITIZENS BUSINESS BANK MAY RECEIVE RESEARCH AND OTHER BENEFITS
FROM BROKER DEALERS WHICH MAY BE CONSIDERED COMPENSATION TO US. UPON REQUEST
WE WILL DISCLOSE DETAILS OF ANY COMPENSATION RECEIVED.

*TO TRUST BENEFICIARIES: UNDER SECTION 17200 OF CALIFORNIA PROBATE CODE,
YOU MAY PETITION THE COURT TO OBTAIN A COURT REVIEW OF THE ACCOUNT AND
THE ACTS OF THE TRUSTEE. CLAIMS AGAINST THE TRUSTEE FOR BREACH OF TRUST
MUST BE MADE WITHIN THREE YEARS FROM THE DATE OF RECEIPT OF AN ACCOUNTING
OR OTHER REPORT DISCLOSING FACTS GIVING RISE TO THE CLAIM.

29
Ontario | Newport Beach | Pasadena




CITY OF CANYON LAKE
31516 RAILROAD CANYON RD
CANYON LAKE, CA 92587

U g?wxccount Summary Statement

Statement Period: Nov 01, 2016 Through Nov 30, 2016

Investment Portfolio Summary
Market Value As Of 11/01/2016 11/30/2016 % Of Account

CASH & CASH EQUIVALENTS 169, 064. 53 263, 075. 95 10.1%

FIXED INCOME 2,052, 767. 27 1,930, 784. 05 74. 3%

MISCELLANEOUS 410, 239. 50 404, 764. 60 15.6%

Total 2,632,071. 30 2,598, 624. 60 100. 0%

Activity Summary
This Period  Year To Date Realized Capital Gains / Losses
Beginning Market Value 2,632,071.30 2,598,295.06 This Period Year To Date
Income 829.99 41,509.86 Long Term 0.00 13,462.00-
Asset Activity 94,028.43 133,155.93 Short Term 94.18- 437.37-
Fees 847.00- 9,180.33- .
Cash Management 94,011.42- 165.485.46- Total Gains / Losses 94.18- 13,899.37-
Change In Market Value 33,446.70- 329.54
Ending Market Value 2,598,624.60  2,598,624.60
30
Ontario Newport Beach | Pasadena




_’, E?EZ E N g?RU gP-Emf’sccount Summary Statement Page 2

Statement Period: Nov 01, 2016 Through Nov 30, 2016

Performance Summary - Total Returns

TOTAL FUND

Return On Indexes
‘Weighted Index

Return On Indexes
Fixed GT(95% FX /5% C)

1 3 1
Market Value Month Months Year
2,598,417 1.14- 1.27- 0.10
1.88- 2.52- 1.76
0.86- 0.89- 1.05
Return Comparison

Weighted Index

Since
2 3 Inception
Years Years 03/01/2010
0.87 0.91 0.93
1.33 2.58 3.30
0.96 1.05 1.60

PAST RESULTS ARE NOT INDICATIVE OF FUTURE INVESTMENT RESULTS, FUND DATA IS ON A TRADE DATE BASIS. PERFORMANCE

RESULTS ARE GROSS OF MANAGEMENT FEES. RETURNS FO|
DOES NOT INCLUDE ACCRUED INCOME.

R PERIODS LONGER THAN ONE YEAR ARE ANNUALIZED. MARKET VALUE

Ontfario | Newport Beach | Pasadena

31




g;c?nm:count Summary Statement Page 3

Statement Period: Nov 01, 2016 Through Nov 30, 2016

Portfolio Statement

Quantity Description Market Value Cost Basis

Cash & Cash Equivalents
Cash Equivalents
Citizens Business Bank Mmkt Fund

CBBMMKFM1
263,075.950 CITIZENS BUSINESS BANK 263,075.95 263,075.95
CBB-CITIZENSTRUST SWEEP ACCOUNT

Total Citizens Business Bank Mmkt Fund 263,075.95 263,075.95
Total Cash Equivalents 263,075.95 263,075.95
Total Cash & Cash Equivalents 263,075.95 263,075.95

Fixed Income
Taxable

05531FAU7 '
75,000.000 BB&T CORPORATION DTD 06/29/15 75,607.50 75,502.70
CALL 2.625% 06/29/2020-2020

24422ERE1

100,000.000 JOHN DEERE CAPITAL CORP SERIES 106,184.00 109,598.00
MTN DTD 07/12/2011 3.9%
07/12/2021

3130A1CE6 .
70,000.000 FEDERAL HOME LOAN DTD 03/27/14 70,885.50 70,920.50
2% 12/27/2019

3130A6NA1 .
100,000.000 FEDERAL HOME LOAN DTD 10/29/15 98,576.00 100,000.00
CALL 1.4% 10/29/2019-2016

3130A8EN9

50,000.000 FEDERAL HOME LOAN BANK DTD 49,244.00 50,000.00
06/14/16 CALL 1.64% :
06/14/2021-2016

3130A8NT6
100,000.000 FEDERAL HOME LOAN DTD 07/13/16 97,870.00 100,000.00
CALL 1.48% 07/13/2021-2017

313380FB8
100,000.000 FEDERAL HOME LOAN BANK DTD 99,758.00 99,667.18
08/09/12 1.375% 09/13/2019

3133EFZ91

100,000.000 FEDERAL FARM CREDIT BANK DTD ’ 97,805.00 99,909.00
04/12/16 CALL 1.62%
04/12/2021-2017

3134G9140
200,000.000 FREDDIE MAC DTD 07/26/16 CALL 1% 198,300.00 200,000.00
04/26/2019-2017

3134GAHK3
50,000.000 FREDDIE MAC DTD 09/30/16 CALL 49,348.00 49,967.50
1.6% 09/30/2021-2016

3136G1C98
50,000.000 FANNIE MAE DTD 02/05/13 1.42% 49,692.00 50,561.00
02/05/2020

32

Ontario | Newport Beach | Pasadena




Q. y

Page 4

‘ EF’?E Z E N g?@@ gagawAccount Suminary Statement

Statement Period: Nov 01, 2016 Through Nov 30, 2016

Quantity

Taxable

100,000.000

100,000.000

100,000.000

100,000.000

93,607.600

75,000.000

150,000.000

200,000.000

25,000.000

Miscellaneous

Certificates Of Deposit

Total
Total

Other Banks

100,000.000

100,000.000

100,000.000

100,000.000

Portfolio Statement ( Continued )

Description

3136G3130
FANNIE MAE DTD 07/28/16 CALL
1.6% 07/28/2021-2016

3136G3VG7
FANNIE MAE DTD 06/29/16 CALL
1.5% 09/29/2020-2016

3136G3XZ3
FANNIE MAE DTD 07/28/16 CALL
1.5% 07/28/2021-2016

3136G4EV1
FANNIE MAE DTD 10/28/16 CALL
1.625% 10/28/2021-2017

31398R7H2
FANNIE MAE SERIES 2010-M4 DTD
07/01/10 3.819% 06/25/2020

36962G5W0
GENERAL ELECTRIC CAP CORP DTD
04/27/2012 2.3% 04/27/2017

48126EAAS
JPMORGAN CHASE DTD 08/20/2012 2%
08/15/2017

69353REW4
PNC BANK NA DTD 04/29/16 CALL
2.15% 04/29/2021-2021

713448BN7

PEPSICO INC DTD 01/14/10 4.5%
01/15/2020

Taxable

Fixed Income

02587DA99

AMERICAN EXPR CENTURION
MEDIUM-TERM CD DTD 09/16/15 1.6%
09/17/2018

05580ACZs

BMW BANK BANK NORTH AMERICA DTD

09/30/15 MEDIUM-TERM CD 2.2%
09/30/2020

14042RAR2
CAPITAL ONE NA MEDIUM-TERM CD
DTD 10/07/2015 2.2% 10/07/2020

29266NS32
ENERBANK USA DTD 10/16/2015
MEDIUM-TERM CD 1.75% 10/16/2020

Total Other Banks

Total

Certificates Of Deposit

Market Value

96,828.00

97,899.00

96,499.00

97,361.00

98,632.05

75,370.50

150,676.50

197,374.00

26,874.00

1,930,784.05

1,930,784.05

100,353.70

102,027.37

102,037.31

100,346.22

404,764.60
404,764.60

Cost Basis

100,000.

100,000

100,000

99,959.

100,160.

78,075.

149,340.

203,794.

28,169

1,965,623.

1,965,623

99,975

99,980

99,615

100,000

399,570

399,570.

00

.00

.00

00

13

75

00

00

.00

76

.76

.00

.00

.00

.00

.00

00

Ontario | Newport Beach | Pasadena

33




““ gf-?w&ccount Summary Statement Page 5
: Statement Period: Nov 01, 2016 Through Nov 30, 2016
Portfolio Statement ( Continued )
j Quantity Description ' Market Value Cost Basis
Miscellaneous Sundry Assets
| Documents
DOC199647
1.000 INVESTMENT MANAGEMENT AGREEMENT 0.00 0.00
CITY OF CANYON LAKE A/C#
1035003119
Total Documents 0.00 0.00
Total Miscellaneous Sundry Assets 0.00 0.00
Total Miscellaneous 404,764.60 399,570.00
Grand Total Assets 2,598,624.60 2,628,269.71
Account Activity Summary
Cost Basis Market Value
Total Cash Excluding Cash Including Cash
Balances Beginning Of Period 0.00 2,628,380.90 2,638,878.24
Prior Accruals 6,806.94-
Unrealized Depreciation This Period 33,352.52-
Current Accruals 9,902.25
Asset Activity 94,028.43 94,122.61- 94,028.43
Cash Management 94,011.42- 94,011.42 94,011.42-
Fees 847.00- 0.00 - 847.00-
Income 829.99 0.00 829.99
Realized Gain/loss 94.18-
Non Cash Asset Changes 0.00 0.00
Balances End Of Period 0.00 2,628,269.71 2,608,526.85
Transaction Statement
Date Quantity Description Transaction Cash Cost Basis
Type
11/01/16 Beginning Balance 0.00 2,628,380.90
Income
Dividends
CBBMMKFMI
11/01/16 CITIZENS BUSINESS BANK DIVIDEND 58.17
‘ CBB-CITIZENSTRUST SWEEP ACCOUNT
Total Dividends 58.17 0.00
Interest
29266NS32
11/16/16 ENERBANK USA DTD 10/16/2015 INTEREST RCVD 148.63
MEDIUM-TERM CD 1.75% 10/16/2020
31398R7H2
11/25/16 FANNIE MAE SERIES 2010-M4 DTD INTEREST RCVD 302.19
07/01/10 3.819% 06/25/2020
34
Ontario | Newporft Beach | Pasadena




oy

o | nAccount Summary Statement
RUST
AN

ITIZENSI]
Statement Period: Nov 01, 2016 Through Nov 30, 2016
Transaction Statement ( Continued )
Date Quantity  Description Transaction Cash Cost Basis
Type
31308R7H2
11/28/16 FANNIE MAE SERIES 2010-M4 DTD INTEREST RCVD 31.37
07/01/10 3.819% 06/25/2020
313381BG9 '
11/29/16 FEDERAL HOME LOAN BANK DTD INTEREST RCVD 289.63
11/28/2012 CALL .625%
11/28/2016-2013
Total Interest 771.82 0.00
Total Income 829.99 0.00
Asset Activity
Assets Sold
31398R7H2
11/25/16 1,345.500-  FANNIE MAE SERIES 2010-M4 DTD NOTE AND MTG PMT 1,345.50 1,439.68-
07/01/10 3.819% 06/25/2020
Total Assets Sold 1,345.50 1,439.68-
Maturities
313381BG9
11/28/16 92,682.930-  FEDERAL HOME LOAN BANK DTD MATURITY 92,682.93 92,682.93-
11/28/2012 CALL .625%
11/28/2016-2013
Total Maturities 92,682.93 92,682.93-
Total Asset Activity 94,028.43 94,122.61-
Other Asset Activity
Asset Receipt
313381BG9
11/25/16 0.003 FEDERAL HOME LOAN BANK DTD SECURITY RCVD
11/28/2012 CALL .625%
11/28/2016-2013
Total Asset Receipt 0.00 0.00
Total Other Asset Activity 0.00 0.00
Fees
11/25/16 MANAGEMENT FEES CITIZENS DISBURSEMENT 847.00-
BUSINESS BANK
FOR THE PERIOD ENDING 11/20/2016
Total Fees 847.00- 0.00
Cash Management
CBBMMKFM1
11/30/16 94,011.420 NET CASH MANAGEMENT NET CASH MGMT 94,011.42- 94,011.42
Total Cash Management 94,011.42- 94,011.42
11/30/16 ' Ending Balance 0.00 2,628,269.71
35
Onfario | Newport Beach | Pasadena




@ E E Z E N g » @ ngT»Account Summary Statement Page 7

Statement Period: Nov 01, 2016 Through Nov 30, 2016

Disclosure

CitizensTrust may receive research and other benefits from Brokers/Dealers which may
be considered compensation. Upon request, we will disclose details of any compensation received.
‘We have added an additional benchmark to your performance insert. Call for details.

36

Ontario | Newport Beach | Pasadena




City of Canyon Lake

City Council
Staff Report
TO: Honorable Mayor and Members of the City Council
FROM: Aaron Palmer, City Manager
BY: Elizabeth Martyn, City Attorney
DATE: January 4, 2017
SUBJECT: Four claims against City from Former Council Member John

Zaitz

Recommendation

Informational item only. This matter is being handled by the City’s JPIA.

Background

At the November and December City Council meetings, former Council Member John
Zaitz discussed the City’s reimbursement policies/practices. Subsequently, on December
14" and December 17", former Council Member John Zaitz submitted a total of 4 claims
against the City. The first two claims are handwritten; the second two are typewritten and
are being treated as amended claims.

The claims are for cell phone and home internet amounts above the amount reimbursed to
Former Council Member Zaitz during his most recent time on the City Council pursuant to
City Council reimbursement limits. It appears that Council member Zaitz claims the
reimbursement caps were not properly adopted by former Councils. Another portion of
the claim is for a printer he had purchased.

Staff has reviewed the claims and forwarded them to the City’s risk management joint
powers authority. We are informed that the JPIA will reject those claims that are over one
year old as late claims and will reject the remaining claims from 12/14/2015 through
12/14/2016.

Budget (or Fiscal) Impact

There is no direct cost for rejecting the claims; however, if the City Council rejects the
claims and Former Council Member Zaitz pursues other legal action, the City will be
responsible for the cost of defending the City.

Attachments

1. 4 Claims against the City made by Former Council Member Zaitz

37



38



City of Canyon Lake

CLATM FORM

A CLAM SHALL BE PRESENTED BY THE CLAIMANT OR BY A PERSON ACTING ON HIS BEHALF. ANSWER ALL QUESTIONS.
OraETTING INFORMATION MAY MAKE YOUR CLAIM LEGALLY INSUFFICIENT. PLEASE PRINT LEGIBLY ON THIS FORM-—USE THE BACK IF YOU NEED ADDITIONAL SPACE.

[y
.

Lisi the complets name, posial address, and phone number of f the claimant in the spaces provided below:

Name (Please Print): ] ) /2N 2‘ AITZ

Address: — T_DEI VE
Phone ﬁfg“ A
2. List the postal address to which the person presentmg the claim desires notices to be sent:

D £1Vﬁ" CANVINS LAK =

—
—

3. List the date, Place, and other circumstances of the occurrence of transaction which gave rise to the claim

asserted
Iovenbes ~Dec,  PLACE: Cﬁw yon Loke.
Tell What happene - Give com plete info ation: <
B4 e ber W ity Failed &
!Q‘ﬁak/:&f& (aa L:)( i-::"l\ £ C)L /CV W:jTHL ﬂ»?&)\/ L./’erﬁ“jlﬁf{-&

4, Give a general description of the mdeb’tedness, obligation, injury, damage or loss incurred so far as it may be
known at the tnne of presentatxon of the claun |

. i
4 M& ?‘” l’(l\ Jl‘ “49 d!gf&.

Ll
&

5. Gwe the name or names of the public employee or employees causing the injury, damage, or loss, if known:
"‘*-i (A‘} Yine
6. Show the amount claimed as of the date of presentation of the claim, including the estimated amount of any

prospective injury, damage, or loss, insofar as it may be known at the time of the presentation of the claim,
. .together with.the.basis of computation of the amount claimed:
‘ .1/{” ¥/9¢

Date: /(9’"/3 .@/é | ' Time: C%Sbf'?‘?

Signature: RS sl /x;—\’v(/ \’“\"’ Relation to Claimant: M

/

39


shunter
Stamp

shunter
Stamp

shunter
Stamp

shunter
Stamp

shunter
Stamp

shunter
Stamp


40



City'of Camyon Lake

CLAIM FORM

A CLATM SHALL BE PRESENTED BY THE CLAIMANT OR BY A PERSON ACTING ON HIS BEHALF. ANSWER ALL QUESTIONS.
OMITTING INFORMATION MAY MAKE YOUR CLAIM LEGALLY WSUFFICIENT PLEASE PRINT LEGIBLY ON THIS FORM—USE THE BACK IF YOU NEED ADDITIONAL SPACE.

i. List the complete name, postal address, and phone number of the claimant in the spaces provided below:
Name (Please Print):_ ] D H&J 2.1 lTZ»
Address:_ - a4
Can:
Phone @@-74
2. List the postal address to which the person presenting the claim desires notices to be sent:
S.W-‘-’" seo R M -

3. List the date, Place, and other circumstances of the occurrence of transaction which gave rise to the claim
asserted: _
DATE: f% . Dev.goih PLACE.__Camy awz,/_a_..
Tell vﬂ:a happened G1ve complete information: /

Failed 'Z:(Ja,f}i/za"

4. Give a general descnptlon of the indebtedness, obligation, injury, damage or loss incurred so far as it may be
known at the time of presentafion of the glaim: 9,
7727 Va VA2 4/ F: r / > i i , , L A ALt P2 / /
, w/.“...._. ’, ,;, 36 ‘ u/ "'5‘?»« s, .
9- ‘ 2 /14..,41 d , S " x . /;4//'._.’ /
gr"""‘" (22 j 73 ' " g 4 l”/

5. Give the name or wwhc emploke 4 or employees causing the injury, damag or loss if known;:

4
v

6. Show the amount claimed as of the date of presentation of the claim, including the estimated amount of any
prospective injury, damage, or loss, insofar as it may be known at the time of the presentation of the claim,
together with the. bas1s of computatmn of thgyamount claimed;

% § /35, =
coader, 28] = X/, 51T
MM / §
s Y /.;4

Date: J* - /13— /é | Time:___ 4 /S’,ﬂ

Signature: E. RS, - Relation to Claimant: /

41 .


shunter
Stamp

shunter
Stamp

shunter
Stamp


42



City of Canyon Lake

CLAIM FORM

A CLAIM SHALL BE PRESENTED BY THE CLAIMANT OR BY APERSON ACTING ON HIS BEHALF. ANSWER ALL QUESTIONS.

OMITTING INFORMATION MAY MAKE YOUR CLAIM LEGALLY INSUGGICIENT. PLEASE PRINT LEGIBLY ON THEIS FORM-USE THE BACK IF YOU NEED ADDITIONAL SPACE.

1 List the complete name, postal address, and phone number of the claimant in the spaces provided below:
Name (Please Print):  John Zaitz
Address: Canyon Lake CA, 92587
Phone:

2 List the postal address to which the person presenting the claim desires notices to be sent:

30279 Clear Water Drive, Canyon Lake CA, 92587

3 List the date, Place and other circumstances of the occurrence of transaction which gave rise to the claim
asserted:
DATE: Jan 2015 through Dec 2016 PLACE: Canyon Lake, Calif.
Tell what happened - Give complete information: The City has not reimbursed me for my actual and

documented expenses for internet and phone.

4 Give a general description of the indebtedness, obligation, injury, damage or loss incurred so far as it may be
known t the time of presentation of the claim:
The City of Canyon Lake does not have an Expense Policy that covers or restricts or limits the

amount the city council can recover. The Cities Municipal Code states that "each council member

of the Council shall receive reimbursement for such actual and necessary expenses incurred in the

performance of official duties of the city. (effective 3-12/90) section 2.01.050 Seeking reimbursement

according to expenses and for the cost of equipment of printer and phone.

5 Give the name or names of the public employee or employees causing the injury, damage, or loss, if know:
The City Council. Failed to enact an Expense Policy as per its legal requirement but has established

a policy or reimbursing a portion of the amount.

6 Show the amount claimed as of the date of presentation of the claim, including the estimated amount of any
prospective injury, damage, or loss, insofar as it may be known at the time of the presentation of the claim,
together with the basis of computation of the amount claimed:

The amount owed at this time is undetermined based on a review of public records. The amount

could be as high as $3,000. The exact amount will be determined after a review of the records.

Date: 17Dee<16 Time:  4:39 PM
. R B . .
Signature(; ~ o v Relation to Claimant: SAME
— ] 7
/ il "™
Note: Eﬂecﬁvﬁ!/:luly 1, 2003, in orQeito pr claim you mugk use this form. A claim may be returned to you

if you do not use this form.

43


shunter
Stamp

shunter
Stamp

shunter
Stamp

shunter
Stamp


44



City of Canyon Lake

Date:

Signature £

CLAIM FORM

A CLAIM SHALL BE PRESENTED BY THE CLAIMANT OR BY APERSON ACTING ON HIS BEHALF. ANSWER ALL QUESTIONS

OMITTING INFORMATION MAY MAKE YOUR CLAIM LEGALLY INSUGGICIENT. PLEASE PRINT LEGIBLY ON THEIS FORM-USE THE BACK IF YOU NEED ADDITIONAL SPACE.
List the complete name, postal address, and phone number of the claimant in the spaces provided below:
Name (Please Print):  John Zaitz

Address: Canyon Lake CA, 92587

Phone:

List the postal address to which the person presenting the claim desires notices to be sent:
30279 Clear Water Drive, Canyon Lake CA, 92587

List the date. Place and other circumstances of the occurrence of transaction which gave rise to the claim
asserted:
DATE: Nov. thru Dec 2016 PLACE: Canyon Lake, Calif.

Tell what happened - Give complete information: On Nov 2, 2016 the City Council failed to establish

an EXPENSE POLICY. There were 3 requests to establish a policy. One failed by vote the other

Motions did not receive a second the council requested it to be brought up again on Dece3mber 14.

There was no agenda item on the December calendar. In the November meeting the City Attorney

said reasonable expenses can be reimbursed according to government code as long as there are

receipts.

Give a general description of the indebtedness, obligation, injury, damage or loss incurred so far as it may be
known t the time of presentation of the claim:

The City owes my reasonable expenses as indicated on the November and December 2016 Expense
form submitted. That is the actual expense for my cell phone and internet expense. Both phone

and internet address is included on the Business Card give to me by the city. It is necessary to print

scan and copy document for research and review as part of the duties of a Council member.

So printer is necessary. My broke so I need to replace it so that I could print out work documents.

Give the name or names of the public employee or employees causing the injury, damage, or loss, if know:
The City Council. Failed to enact an Expense Policy so it opened up to what is reasonable with

receipts.

Show the amount claimed as of the date of presentation of the claim, including the estimated amount of any
prospective injury, damage, or loss, insofar as it may be known at the time of the presentation of the claim,
together with the basis of computation of the amount claimed:

For November and December Internet should be $79.00 not $40. Additional $ 78.00

Cell Phone should be $150. not $60.00 Additional $ 180.00

Printer S 129.00

Total additional amount $ 387.00

17-Dec-16 Time: 4:20PM

— g _
T Relation to Claimant: ™\ W] L=
-

Ne— 7 - \/ \

Note:

Effectivg July 1, 2003, in or ler to pr/e&ﬁ‘txa\glgiﬂgx(} must use this form. A claim may be returned to you

S

if you do not use this form.

45



shunter
Stamp

shunter
Stamp

shunter
Stamp

shunter
Stamp


46



City of Canyon Lake

City Council
Staff Report
TO: Mayor and City Council
FROM: Aaron Palmer, City Manager
BY: Kevin Reinertson, Deputy Fire Marshal
DATE: January 4, 2016

SUBJECT: Ordinance No. 170, Repealing Ordinance No. 150 and Adopting the 2016
California Fire Code as Amended by the City of Canyon Lake

RECOMMENDATION

1. Second reading, Public Hearing and Adoption of Ordinance No. 170 for the adoption of
the 2016 California Fire Code; and

BACKGROUND

Every three years the State of California adopts a new California Fire Code, as part of the California
Building Standards Code. The regulations adopted are identified as Title 24, Part 9 of the California
Fire Code. The new regulations go into effect for local enforcement six months after the
Commission adoption. The purpose of this Ordinance is to govern the safeguarding of life and
property from fire, explosion hazards and hazardous conditions and to regulate the issuance of
permits and collection of fees.

The Fire Code was last adopted by Council in January 2013 as Ordinance 150. Local jurisdictions
are allowed to adopt the State and International Fire Codes in their entirety and make such
amendments as necessary to properly protect the health, safety, and welfare of the existing and future
residents and workers based upon climatic, geographic and topographic conditions unique to the
jurisdiction.

Ordinance No. 170 was developed through a collaborative process in the County. The team focused
on improving consistency in the application of the International and California State laws, while
effectively addressing Riverside County's diverse and unique climatic, geographic and topographic
conditions impacting the Fire Department's ability to effectively safeguard life and property from
fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances,
materials and devices, and from hazardous conditions in the occupancy of buildings and premises in
the City of Canyon Lake.

47



Upon review by Riverside County Fire Marshal James Frater, many of the ordinance changes were
administrative modifications while the following building standards amendments were added:

Chapter 1 — Scope and Administration:

Section 101.4: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150 (Section 8) and
relocated to this section to resolve any conflict with the fire code provisions. Riverside County
maintains its own severability clause and does not adopt the fire code text.

Section 102.5: This section is new to Ordinance No. 150 but does not have any change in regulatory
effect. Current amendments are to the fire code not the residential code. The scope and application
of the fire code needs to be expanded to apply to the fire sprinkler systems for accessory structures
constructed under the 2016 California Residential Code (CRC) which are now permitted to exceed
3,000 square feet in area. This modification maintains the applicability of the 2016 California Fire
Code (CFC) Section 903.2 amendment to those accessory structures greater than or equal to 3,600
square feet in area. This has no change in intent and maintains the protection offered.

Section 103.4: This section is new to resolve any conflict between state law and the fire code
provisions.

Section 104.1.1: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150 and renumbered.
It is imperative that enforcement capability be disseminated to other law enforcement entities within
the Riverside County area because of its vast topography and diversity. This gives the Riverside
County Fire Department greater enforcement capabilities due to the presence of these other agencies
across the County of Riverside.

Section 104.12: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150 and grants
authority to the Fire Chief, in cooperation with the Board of Supervisors, to close hazardous fire
areas.

Section 108.1: This section is amended to identify the board of appeals and additional criteria is
added for clarification and implementation. The modifications to this section are consistent with
Health and Safety Code 17920.5 where no board of appeals exists. This section provides for the
ability to create a Board of Appeals as needed.

Section 109.4: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150 (Section 8) and
relocated to this section to resolve any conflict with the fire code provisions. This section requires
punishments and penalties for violations to be in accordance with City Ordinance and Health and
Safety Code Sections 17995 through 17995.5.

Section 113.2: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150 and relocated to the

fees section of the fire code. This amendment is necessary to identify that fees are in accordance
with City Ordinance and fee schedules.

48



Section 113.6: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150 and relocated to the
fees section of the fire code. This section is maintained in accordance with Health and Safety Code
13009 and 13009.1, and Government Code 53150, et seq. for cost recovery.

Chapter 2 — Definitions:

Fire Chief: This definition is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150. This definition
was added to designate that this term means the Fire Chief of Riverside County whenever the
wording appears in the California Fire Code or this Ordinance. This is to distinguish obligatory
authority to the Fire Chief or any of the designated representatives for fire prevention measures and
declarations in enforcing this Ordinance

Chapter 5 — Fire Service Features

Section 503.2.1: The section is added to provide consistency with current Riverside County Fire
Department standards and access policy (FPS 06-05 rev 06/01/2011). This correlation of the fire
code is necessary for minimum fire apparatus access widths for firefighter operations and
consistency throughout the county. This modification does not supersede County road standards
contained in Ord 460 where Ord 460 is more restrictive. This modification has no change in
regulatory effect.

Section 503.2.2: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150. This section is
enhanced to specifically specify who has authority to designate Fire Lanes and modify minimum
widths.

Section 503.6.1: The section is added to provide fire department and other emergency responders
more rapid access to gated facilities. Underwriters Laboratory (UL) “determined that fires today are
more dangerous and pose more risks than in the past. Fire propagation is faster, and time to flashover,
escape times and collapse times are all shorter” (UL Fire Safety Journal Issue 1). The need for our
first responders to be on scene sooner or without disruption will provide for greater occupant and
firefighter safety, and assist in property protection.

Section 503.7: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150. This section
provides additional width for apparatus access roads where utilized for loading/unloading or
passenger drop off/pick up to prevent interference with operational access needs.

Section 507.5.7: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150. This section
provides for the size and quantities of outlets for residential standard, super hydrant standard, and
super hydrant enhanced fire hydrants and that they shall be required as determined by the Fire Code
Official.

Section 507.5.8: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150. The section

provides direct reference to Riverside County Fire Department Std. 06-11 for specific requirements
for the installation of blue reflective markers for fire hydrants.

49



Section 508.1, 508.1.3, and 508.1.6: These sections are carried over from the previous Ordinance
No. 150. These sections have been amended to require fire command centers for structures larger
than 300,000 square feet in size. To put into context, the Fire Command Center would be triggered
when the buildings are approximately 2.5 times the typical Costco Warehouse store and
approximately two times the size of a typical Walmart Supercenter. Large structures of this size
pose numerous challenges to emergency responders due to the large amounts of fuel loads from the
storage, manufacturing and/or processing of flammable/combustible commodities and other
processes within the building. Challenges include wide distribution of smoke throughout the
structure, difficulty for firefighters to locate and reach the fire and difficulty in search and evacuation
of the public, employees and firefighters. These structures typically require numerous fire protection,
early suppression and detection systems that may include, but are not limited to, fire pumps, multiple
fire sprinkler systems, advanced fire alarm systems, smoke control systems, and refrigeration gas
detection system(s). During a fire, the incident commander must have the ability to readily identify
the status of the various suppression and detection systems and have access to other building
information details that may include, but are not limited to, building floor plans, high-pile/rack
storage details, smoke control/ventilation systems, fire sprinkler zoning details, mechanical
refrigeration equipment and piping details, and hazardous materials data sheets along with quantities
and storage/use locations. A fire command center provides a centralized location for the incident
commander to review details about the building and the incident and to effectively coordinate
emergency responders and suppression activities with increased efficiency and speed. The Riverside
County Fire Department has experienced several incidents in buildings with and without Fire
Command Centers. Incident Commanders found that having detailed information on built in fire
protection systems and controls, building schematics and hazardous materials storage plans were
vital towards mitigating the event. When this information was not available, firefighting personnel
were forced to operate upon assumptions and much less information. In addition, this increased
efficiency and speed results in facilities returning to operation more expeditiously after incidents or
false alarms thereby reducing loss of revenue for the business.

Section 508.1.1 & 508.1.8: These sections are added to identify the approved location of the fire
command center and to indicate signage requirements for the entrance door.

Section 509.2.1: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150 and relocated to
a more appropriate location in the code. This amendment encompasses other exterior fire protection
water supply appliances such as Fire Department connections, and other exterior fire protection
system control valves, or any other exterior fire protection system component that may require
immediate access.

Section 606.10.1.2: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150. This section
specifies the location of manual crossover valves when manual operation is required by the Fire
Code Official. The amendment specifies that the manual valves shall be located in an approved
location immediately outside of the machinery room, in a secure metal box or equivalent and marked
as Emergency Controls. This is to ensure that the valves are in readily accessible location(s) for
access during an emergency.

Section 903.2: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150 with modification.

50



Modifications have been made to provide certain exemptions including, but not limited to,
agricultural and greenhouse Group U structures up to 5,500 square feet in area and specific shade
structures.

The existing amendment provides a base square footage requirement for all new commercial,
industrial, and residential occupancies other than one- and two-family dwellings. Though the
amendment includes a reference to the requirement for one- and two-family dwellings, the authority
for residential fire sprinkler requirements resides in Title 24, Part 2.5 [2016 California Residential
Code].

Automatic sprinkler systems have been successfully used to protect industrial and commercial
buildings and their occupants for more than 100 years. Historically the place which has offered the
least amount of fire protection to occupants was and still is their own home. This was brought to
light in 1973 by the Report of the National Commission on Fire Prevention and Control, America
Burning. At the time of the report approximately 8,000 people died in structure fires every year in
the United States. Nine out of ten of those victims died in their home.

However, the U.S. Fire Administration report “Fire in the United States 2004-2013 17th edition”
reflects that nonresidential fire losses are costly. “National estimates of nonresidential building fires
and losses, from 2004 to 2013, annually accounted for only 7 percent of fires, 2 percent of deaths,
and 8 percent of injuries. These properties, however, accounted for a disproportionately large annual
dollar loss, 21 percent. Trends in nonresidential buildings showed a 14 percent decrease in fires, a 9
percent increase in deaths, a 7 percent increase in injuries, and a 10 percent decrease in dollar loss
from 2004 to 2013.”

The same report concluded “...that, overall, the fire problem in the U.S. continues to improve. Ten-
year fire loss rates are down. It is likely that several factors continue to contribute to these trends:...”
which includes; "fire sprinklers, which quickly combat incipient fires, especially in nonresidential
and multifamily buildings, and fire codes, which have been strengthened.” Furthermore, the report
reflects that The nonresidential building category includes industrial and commercial properties,
institutions (such as hospitals, nursing homes and prisons), educational establishments (from
preschool through university), mobile properties, and storage properties. On average, about 89
percent of nonresidential structure fires, 88 percent of deaths, 91 percent of injuries, and 92 percent
of dollar losses reported to National Fire Incident Reporting System from 2004 to 2013 occurred in
nonresidential buildings.

Aside from firefighter and explosion fatalities, there has never been a multiple loss of life in a fully
sprinklered building due to fire or smoke. All fire protection features have a reliability factor. Walls
and shafts can be breached by means of poke-throughs and building alterations. Exit doors can be
blocked or locked.

The California Residential Code is requiring that all one and two family dwellings be protected by
sprinklers. 1t is still imperative, based on the geographical, topographical, climatic diversity of
Riverside County, to continue to protect all structures greater than 3,600 sq. ft. by Fire Sprinklers,
to ensure faster suppression to those occupancies that would not normally be required to be protected

51



which would exhaust a number resources including water which climatically is so precious to our
environment as a whole. It will provide for less run off into ground water due to suppression
activities and less pollutants into the environment.

Mobile homes are a part of the American landscape. In 2007 alone, more than 95,000 manufactured
homes were shipped nationwide. Manufactured housing also accounts for approximately 10 percent
of the single-family structures in the United States. Despite the fact that we drive by them, respond
to medical calls in them, and sometimes live in them, we often overlook mobile homes when it
comes to training and prefire planning. However, as the deaths of two firefighters in Craigsville,
West Virginia, showed, mobile homes can pose significant, and sometimes deadly, challenges. The
burning mobile home is a less-than-stable platform, making search and possible rescue of occupants
even more dangerous. The exterior walls are not as structurally sound when compared with those
of most site-built homes. The narrow halls complicate search. If the first-due engine pulls up and
the mobile home is burning from end to end, the firefighting strategy has already been decided. The
fire must be knocked down in order to move in. If the home is in a mobile home park, again,
protecting exposures is vital. Radiant heat can ignite the homes nearby. Fire sprinklers can prevent
the flashover from occurring and in many cases put the fire out and save valuable resources in the
process, such as water, personnel, and environmental cleanup, limited displacement into County
shelter(s), and less inconvenience to the family. The mobile home, because of its construction,
requires fast water.

The National Fire Protection Association reports in 2007-2011, 11,400 structure fires per year were
reported in manufactured homes, with associated losses of; 206 civilian deaths, 434 civilian injuries,
and $179 million in direct damage per year nationally. The roof, for example, burns through more
quickly than a typical residential roof and is not safe for firefighters. Mobile home fires can quickly
grow out of control, because there's not as much wallboard and drywall, and there are fewer walls
to keep the fire from spreading.

The record for automatic fire sprinklers is based on the simple fact that there has never been a
multiple death of building occupants from a fire developing in a building protected by an automatic
fire sprinkler system properly installed and maintained in accordance with nationally recognized
standards (NFPA 13, 13D, 13R, and NFPA 25).

AWWA Research Foundation has published the following report: Impact of Fire Flow on
Distribution System Water Quality, Design, and Operation. This report concludes the following:

“Water-efficient fire suppression technologies exist that use less water than conventional standards.
In particular, the universal application of automatic sprinkler systems provides the most proven
method for reducing loss of life and property due to fire, while at the same time providing faster
response to the fire and requiring significantly less water than conventional fire-fighting techniques.
It is recommended that the universal application of automatic fire sprinklers be adopted by local
jurisdictions.”

Consider the benefits: a single firefighter using a normal 1-1/2” fire hose can be applying between
175-400 gallons of water per minute when attempting to extinguish a fire. On the other hand, a single

52



fire sprinkler will be flowing only 18- to 40- gallons of water per minute. This means that over a 5-
minute period, the following quantities of water are used:

Fire-fighter with 1-1/2” hose:

175 gpm x 5 minutes = 875 gallons of water
400 gpm x 5 minutes = 2,000 gallons of water
Fire sprinkler system:

18 gpm x 5 minutes = 90 gallons of water

40 gpm x 5 minutes = 200 gallons of water

Section 903.3.5.3: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150. The section
limits all hydraulically calculated fire sprinkler systems to not exceed 90% of the water supply
capacity. The 10% buffer in the hydraulic calculation is a common engineering business practice
that gives some flexibility to account for system water pressures that may decrease as additional
demands are placed on the water system from additional construction or as the system ages.

Section 3204.2.1: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150. By requiring
client leased or occupant owned warehouses to have a technical report completed by a fire protection
engineer, it will minimize problems concerning commodity and sprinkler protection. By having an
engineer complete a technical report for the proposed or existing building it will provide greater
certainty that adequate protection for the commodities that are proposed will be sufficient. By not
having adequate sprinkler protection, it could be detrimental to the building and could also cause
loss of life in the event of a fire. Geographically this can be a significant problem due to the seismic
activity that Riverside County experiences. The Engineer can assess the adequate protection for the
correct commodity classifications, ensure the correct seismic provisions are in place for the type of
system to be installed, and provide a professional assurance to a very volatile type of occupancy. It
takes a vast number of resources to extinguish a fire of this type. By adding this requirement, it will
ensure an added level of safety.

Section 4904.3: This section is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150. This section is
required under State Law, Section 51178.5.

Modification has been made to correct the date of the State adopted and recommended Very High
Fire Hazard Severity Zone map.

Table B105.2 of Appendix B: This amendment is carried over from the previous Ordinance No.
150. The amended text has been moved from the body of Section B-105.2 to a new table in the 2016
California Fire Code to properly correlate to the percentage reduction in fire flow for sprinkler
systems. This allows the fire department to still have adequate fire flow mitigation with sprinkler
protection and not jeopardize main distribution systems by inadequately under sizing them and have
costly upgrades for future projects. With the geographical diversity that the County has it is
important that this requirement be added to ensure adequate water in the event of a fire.

Section C103.1: This provision is carried over from the previous Ordinance No. 150 and modified
to correlate with the new 2016 California Fire Code section number and text. This provision is to

53



clarify the additional location of fire hydrants to be at intersections. This requirement has been
standard policy within Riverside County.

BUDGET (OR FISCAL) IMPACT

None

ATTACHMENTS

e Ordinance No. 170

e 2016 California Fire Code Summary Sheet

54



ORDINANCE NO. 170

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
CANYON LAKE ADOPTING THE 2016 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
AS AMENDED AS CHAPTER 8.12 OF THE CANYON LAKE
MUNICIPAL CODE AND REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 150

The City Council of the City of Canyon Lake does ordain as follows:
Section 1. FINDINGS. The City Council finds as follows:

A Every three years the State of California adopts a new California Fire Code, as part
of the California Building Standards Code, which becomes effective 180 days after publication by
the California Building Standards Commission.

B. That Code has been published and adopted, as amended, by the California Building
Standards Commission into the California Code of Regulations as Title 24, Part 9, entitled the
California Fire Code.

C. Under State law, the City of Canyon Lake may establish more restrictive standards
reasonably necessary to provide fire protection for life and property because of local climatic,
geological or topographical conditions.

D. The City of Canyon Lake may establish more restrictive standards reasonably
necessary to provide fire protection for life and property because of local climatic, geological or
topographical conditions.

1. Climatic Conditions:

a. Riverside County and the City of Canyon Lake is located in
Southern California and covers a vast and varied geographic area. The base
climate in western Riverside County consists of semi-arid Mediterranean
weather patterns. Areas outside of the mountain terrain annually experience
extended periods of high temperatures with little or no precipitation. Hot,
dry winds, which may reach speeds of 70 M.P.H. or greater, are common to
the area. Examples are: Santa Ana/ Foehn winds, afternoon surface-heating
generated winds, and prevailing desert winds.

These climatic conditions cause extreme drying of vegetation and common
building materials. Frequent periods of drought and low humidity add to
the fire danger. This predisposes the area to large destructive fires
(conflagration) which necessitates rapid identification, locating and
extinguishment of all fires in the smallest stage possible. In addition to
directly damaging or destroying buildings, these fires are also prone to
disrupt utility services throughout the County. Obstacles generated by a

56



City of Canyon Lake
Ordinance No. 170

4848-7886-7466.1

strong wind, such as fallen trees, street lights and utility poles, will greatly
impact the response time to reach an incident scene. During these winds,
the inability to use aerial type firefighting apparatus would further decrease
our ability to stop fires in large buildings and place rescue personnel at
increased risk of injury.

b. Although Riverside County and the City of Canyon Lake
occasionally experiences periods of significant drought, the County can also
experience periods of substantial rainfall. Annual rainfall varying from
three (3) inches in Blythe to over thirty three (33) inches in Pine Cove.
When Riverside County does experience heavy rain, or rain over a period
of days or weeks, many areas of the County are subject to flooding. Runoff
from rain drains either naturally into rivers, washes, and creeks or into flood
control facilities. Flash flooding is also a common problem, especially in
the Coachella Valley and the easterly portions of the county. Flash flooding
is typically associated with short duration, high intensity precipitation
events often associated with summer thunderstorms. Such events can occur
even during a drought.

C. Water demand in southern California far exceeds the quantity
supplied by natural precipitation; and although the population continues to
grow, the already-taxed water supply does not. California is projected to
increase in population by nearly 10 million over the next quarter of a century
with 50 percent of that growth centered in Southern California. Due to
storage capacities and consumption, and a limited amount of rainfall, future
water allocation is not fully dependable. This necessitates the need for
additional and on-site fire protection features. It would also leave tall
buildings vulnerable to uncontrolled fires due to a lack of available water
and an inability to pump sufficient quantities of available water to floors in
a fire.

d. These dry climatic conditions and winds contribute to the rapid
spread of even small fires originating in high-density housing or vegetation.
These fires spread very quickly and create a need for increased levels of fire
protection. The added protection of fire sprinkler systems and other fire
protection features such as identification and notification will supplement
normal fire department response by providing immediate protection for the
building occupants and by containing and controlling the fire spread to the
area of origin. Fire sprinkler systems will also reduce the use of water for
firefighting by as much as 50 to 75 percent.

Topographical conditions
a. Natural: The topographical conditions of Riverside County varies

from three hundred (300) feet below sea-level, flat desert communities, to
mountains over ten thousand (10,000) feet in Alpine-like areas of the San

57



City of Canyon Lake
Ordinance No. 170

4848-7886-7466.1

Bernardino Mountain Range. In between these areas, developable slopes
of 25 percent and greater generally occur throughout the foothills.
Riverside County extends from Orange County to the State of Arizona and
is mixed with congested urban areas, rural lands and wild lands. A large
number of sensitive habitats for various animal species and vegetation
consist within large open space areas between major urban centers that
impact building and structure location, which impedes emergency access
and response. This variety in regions contributes to an increased emergency
response time, which necessitates cooperation between local agencies.

b. Traffic and circulation congestion is an artificially created,
obstructive topographical condition, which is common throughout
Riverside County.

C. These topographical conditions combine to create a situation, which
places fire department response time to fire occurrences at risk, and makes
it necessary to provide automatic on-site fire-extinguishing systems and
other protection measures to protect occupants and property.

Geological Conditions

Located within Riverside County are several known active and potentially
active earthquake faults, including the San Andreas, San Jacinto, and
Elsinore Fault. In the event of an earthquake, the location of the epicenter
as well as the time of day and season of the year would have a profound
effect on the number of deaths and casualties, as well as property damage.

The major form of direct damage from most earthquakes is damage to
construction. Bridges are particularly vulnerable to collapse, and dam
failure may generate major downstream flooding. Buildings vary in
susceptibility, dependent upon construction and the types of soils on which
they are built. Earthquakes destroy power and telephone lines; gas, sewer,
or water mains; which, in turn, may set off fires and/or hinder firefighting
or rescue efforts. The hazard of earthquakes varies from place to place,
dependent upon the regional and local geology. Ground shaking may occur
in areas 65 miles or more from the epicenter (the point on the ground surface
above the focus). Ground shaking can change the mechanical properties of
some fine grained, saturated soils, where upon they liquefy and act as a fluid
(liquefaction).

a. Previous earthquakes in southern California have been accompanied
by disruption of traffic flow and fires. A severe seismic event has the
potential to negatively impact any rescue or fire suppression activities
because it is likely to create obstacles similar to those indicated under the
high wind section above. With the probability of strong aftershocks there

58



City of Canyon Lake
Ordinance No. 170

California Health and

exists a need to provide increased protection for anyone on upper floors of
buildings.

b. Road circulation features located throughout the County also make
amendments reasonably necessary. Located through the County are major
roadways, highways and flood control channels that create barriers and slow
response times. Hills, slopes, street and storm drain design accompanies
with occasional heavy rainfall, causes roadway flooding and landslides and
at times may make an emergency access route impassable. There are areas
in Riverside County that naturally have extended emergency response times
that exceed the 5 minute goal.

Safety Code Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5 require that the modification or

change be expressly marked and identified as to which each finding refers. Therefore the City

Council finds that the

following table sets forth the 2016 California Fire Code sections that have

been modified and the associated local climatic, geological and/or topographical conditions
described above supporting the modification.

2016 CODE SECTION TITLE/SUBJECT FINDINGS I, II, 11l
101.4 Severability Administrative
102.5 Application of the residential code L, 1&I
103.4 and 103.4.1 Liability Administrative
104.1.1 Authority of the Fire Chief and Fire Department Administrative
104.12 Authority of the Fire Chief to close hazardous fire areas Administrative
108.1 Board of Appeals established Administrative
109.4 Violation and Penalties Administrative
113.2 Fees Administrative
113.6 Cost Recovery Administrative
202 Fire Chief Administrative
503.2.1 Dimensions Administrative
503.2.2 Authority Administrative
503.6.1 Automatic opener Administrative
503.7 Loading areas and passenger drop-offs Administrative
507.5.7 Fire hydrant size and outlets 1 &Il
507.5.8 Fire hydrant street marker I, I &Il
282:1205%;:?8508'1'3’ Fire command center I, 11 & 1
509.2.1 Minimum clearances 1 &Il
606.10.1.2 Manual operation &1l
903.2 Where required (automatic sprinkler systems) I, 1M& 1
903.3.5.3 Hydraulically calculated systems I &l
3204.2.1 Minimum requirements for client leased or occupant I, 11& 1
4904.3 High Fire Hazard Severity Zone Maps Administrative
App Ch B, Table B105.2 | Buildings other than one- or two-family dwellings I, 1N & 1
App Ch C, C103.1 Fire hydrant location I, 1N & 1

E.

4848-7886-7466.1

The additional requirements included herein are necessary to properly

59




City of Canyon Lake
Ordinance No. 170

protect the health, safety and welfare of the residents and workers of Riverside County.

F. Revenue shortages make it difficult to locate additional fire stations and provide
staffing sufficient to control fires in single and multi-story retail, commercial and industrial
buildings, making enhanced built in protection necessary.

G. The purpose of this ordinance is to adopt the 2016 California Fire Code, California
Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, as amended, to govern the safeguarding of life and property
from fire, explosion hazards and hazardous conditions and to regulate the issuance of permits and
collection of fees.

H. This ordinance is adopted pursuant to Health and Safety Code Sections 17958 and
17958.7 which allow city and county adoption of modifications or changes to the California Fire
Code that are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological and topographical
conditions.

l. The sections of the California Fire Code may be referred to by the same number
used in said published compilation preceded by the words “City of Canyon Lake Fire Code
Section” or “California Fire Code Section” or “Fire Code Section.”

J. Notwithstanding the provisions of this ordinance, the City of Canyon Lake reserves the
right to determine the extent and level of its fire services.

Section 2. Chapter 8.12 of the Canyon Lake Municipal Code is repealed in its entirety and
readopted to read as follows:

Chapter 8.12
Adoption of California Fire Code, as amended

Section

8.12.010 Scope and General Requirements.
8.12.020 Applicability.

8.12.030 Department of Fire Prevention.
8.12.040 General authority and responsibilities.
8.12.050 Board of Appeals.

8.12.060 Violations.

8.12.070 Fees.

8.12.080 Definitions.

8.12.090 Fire apparatus access roads.

8.12.100 Fire protection water supplies.

8.12.110 Fire command center.

8.12.120 Fire protection and utility equipment identification and location.

8.12.130 Mechanical refrigeration.
8.12.140 Automatic sprinkler systems.
8.12.150 Designation of high-piled storage areas.

4848-7886-7466.1 5

60



City of Canyon Lake
Ordinance No. 170

8.12.160 Fire hazard severity zones.
8.12.170 Appendix B.
8.12.180 Appendix C.

8.12.010 SCOPE AND GENERAL REQUIREMENTS

Except as stated in this Section or as amended below in this Ordinance, all of the
provisions and appendices of the 2016 California Fire Code, inclusive of all of the inclusions and
exclusions set for in each chapter’s matrix, are hereby adopted and shall apply to the City of
Canyon Lake. In addition, the following provisions that are excluded in the 2016 California Fire
Code are hereby adopted — Chapter 1, Division Il of the California Fire Code is hereby adopted,
except that Section 103.2 and 108.3 are not adopted, and Chapters 3, 25, and Section 403.12,
503, 510.2, and 1103.2 are adopted.

Section 101.4 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

101.4 Severability. If any provision, clause, sentence or paragraph of this ordinance or
the application thereof to any person or circumstances shall be held invalid, such invalidity shall
not affect the other provisions of this ordinance which can be given effect without the invalid
provision or application, and to this end, the provisions of this ordinance are hereby declared to
be severable.

8.12.020. APPLICABILITY
Section 102.5 of the California Fire Code is amended as follows:

102.5 Application of residential code. Where structures are designed and constructed in
accordance with the California Residential Code, the provisions of this code shall apply as
follows:

1. Construction and design provisions of this code pertaining to the exterior of the
structure shall apply including, but not limited to, premises identification, fire apparatus
access and water supplies. Where interior or exterior systems or devices are installed,
construction permits required by Section 105.7 of this code shall apply.

2. Administrative, operational and maintenance provisions of this code shall apply.

3. Automatic fire sprinkler system requirements of this code shall apply to detached
accessory buildings 3,600 square feet or greater in accordance with Section 903.2. The
provisions contained in Section 903.2.18 of the California Fire Code or Section R309.6 of
the California Residential Code may be used for the design of the automatic fire sprinkler
system for detached private garages.

8.12.030 DEPARTMENT OF FIRE PREVENTION

Sections 103.4 and 103.4.1 of the California Fire Code are deleted in their entirety and
replaced with the following:

4848-7886-7466.1 6

61



City of Canyon Lake
Ordinance No. 170

103.4 Liability. Any liability against Riverside County or the City of Canyon Lake or any
officer or employee for damages resulting from the discharge of their duties shall be as provided

by law.

8.12.040 GENERAL AUTHORITY AND RESPONSIBILITIES.

Section 104.1.1 is added to Section 104.1 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

104.1.1 Authority of the Fire Chief and Fire Department.

1. The Fire Chief is authorized and directed to enforce all applicable State fire laws and
provisions of this ordinance and to perform such duties as directed by the City Council.

2. The Fire Chief is authorized to administer, interpret and enforce this ordinance. Under
the Fire Chief’s direction, the Riverside County Fire Department is authorized to enforce
ordinances of the City of Canyon Lake pertaining to the following:

2.1. The prevention of fires.

2.2. The suppression or extinguishment of dangerous or hazardous fires.

2.3. The storage, use and handling of hazardous materials.

2.4. The installation and maintenance of automatic, manual and other private fire
alarm systems and fire extinguishing equipment.

2.5. The maintenance and regulation of fire escapes.

2.6. The maintenance of fire protection and the elimination of fire hazards on
land, in buildings, structures and other property, including those under
construction.

2.7. The maintenance of means of egress.

2.8. The investigation of the cause, origin and circumstances of fire and
unauthorized releases of hazardous materials.

3. The following persons are hereby authorized to interpret and enforce the provisions of
this ordinance and to make arrests and issue citations as authorized by law:

4848-7886-7466.1

3.1. The Unit Chief, Peace Officers and Public Officers of the California
Department of Forestry and Fire Protection.

3.2. The Fire Chief, Peace Officers and Public Officers of the Riverside County
Fire Department.

3.3. The Riverside County Sheriff and any deputy sheriff.

3.4. The Police Chief and any police officer of any city served by the Riverside
County Fire Department.

3.5. Officers of the California Highway Patrol.

3.6. Code Officers of the City of Canyon Lake Code Enforcement Department.
3.7. Peace Officers of the California Department of Parks and Recreation.

3.8. The law enforcement officer of the Federal Bureau of Land Management.

62



City of Canyon Lake
Ordinance No. 170

Section 104.12 is added to Section 104 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

104.12 Authority of the Fire Chief to close hazardous fire areas. Except upon National
Forest Land, the Fire Chief is authorized to determine and announce the closure of any hazardous
fire area or portion thereof. Any closure by the Fire Chief for a period of more than fifteen (15)
calendar days must be approved by the Riverside County Board of Supervisors and/or the City
Council within fifteen (15) calendar days of the Fire Chief’s original order of closure. Upon such
closure, no person shall go in or be upon any hazardous fire area, except upon the public
roadways and inhabited areas. During such closure, the Fire Chief shall erect and maintain at all
entrances to the closed area sufficient signs giving notice of closure. This section shall not
prohibit residents or owners of private property within any closed area, or their invitees, from
going in or being upon their lands. This section shall not apply to any entry, in the course of
duty, by a peace officer, duly authorized public officer or fire department personnel. For the
purpose of this section, “hazardous fire area” shall mean public or private land that is covered
with grass, grain, brush or forest and situated in a location that makes suppression difficult
resulting in great damage. Such areas are designated on Hazardous Fire Area maps filed with the
office of the Fire Chief.

8.12.050 BOARD OF APPEALS

Section 108.1 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

108.1 Board of appeals established. The Board of Appeals shall be the City Manager. If
he or she determines an outside board is needed, he or she shall designate an outside hearing
officer to hear the appeal. The Fire Chief shall be notified of any appeal and the Fire Chief or
designee shall be in attendance at the appeal hearing. Depending on the subject of the appeal,
specialized expertise may be solicited, at the expense of the applicant, for the purpose of
providing input to the Appeals Board.

8.12.060 VIOLATIONS.

Section 109.4 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

109.4 Violation and penalties. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, corporation or
association of persons to violate any provision of this ordinance, or to violate the provisions of
any permit granted pursuant to this code or ordinance. Punishments and penalties for violations
shall be in accordance with the City of Canyon Lake ordinances, fee schedule and Health and
Safety Code Sections 17995 through 17995.5.

8.12.070 FEES

Section 113.2 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

4848-7886-7466.1 8

63



City of Canyon Lake
Ordinance No. 170

113.2 Schedule of permit fees. Fees for services and permits shall be as set forth in the
City of Canyon Lake fee schedule.

Section 113.6 is added to Section 113 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

113.6 Cost recovery. Fire suppression, investigation, rescue or emergency medical costs
are recoverable in accordance with Health and Safety Code Sections 13009 and 13009.1, as may
be amended from time to time. Additionally, any person who negligently, intentionally or in
violation of law causes an emergency response, including, but not limited to, a traffic accident,
spill of toxic or flammable fluids or chemicals is liable for the costs of securing such emergency,
including those costs pursuant to Government Code Section 53150, et seq, as may be amended
from time to time. Any expense incurred by the Riverside County Fire Department for securing
such emergency shall constitute a debt of such person and shall be collectable by Riverside
County in the same manner as in the case of an obligation under contract, express or implied.

8.12.080 DEFINITIONS.

Section 202, definition of “Fire Chief” in the California Fire Code is deleted in its
entirety and replaced with the following:

FIRE CHIEF. The Fire Chief of Riverside County or the Fire Chief’s designee.
8.12.090 FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS.

Section 503.2.1 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not
less than 24 feet (7315 mm), exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in
accordance with Section 503.6, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 13 feet 6
inches (4115 mm). For additional requirements or alternatives see Riverside County Fire
Department Standards and Policies, as may be amended from time to time.

Section 503.2.2 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

503.2.2 Authority. The fire code official shall be the only authority authorized to
designate fire apparatus access roads and fire lanes and to modify the minimum fire lane access
widths for fire or rescue operations.

Section 503.6.1 is added to Section 503.6 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:
503.6.1 Automatic opener. New motorized gates shall be provided with means to be

automatically opened remotely by emergency vehicle in accordance with Riverside County Fire
Department standards and Policies, as may be amended from time to time.

4848-7886-7466.1 9

64



City of Canyon Lake
Ordinance No. 170

Exception: Gates serving individual one- and two-family dwelling parcels.
Section 503.7 is added to Section 503 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

503.7 Loading areas and passenger drop-off areas. On private properties, where fire
apparatus access roads are utilized for loading or unloading or utilized for passenger drop-off or
pick-up, an additional eight (8) feet of width shall be added to the minimum required width for
the fire apparatus access road.

8.12.100 FIRE PROTECTION WATER SUPPLIES
Section 507.5.7 is added to Section 507 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

507.5.7 Fire hydrant size and outlets. As determined by the fire code official, fire hydrant
sizes and outlets shall be based on the following:

1. Residential Standard — one (1) four (4) inch outlet and one (1) two and half (2 2) inch
outlet.

2. Super Hydrant Standard — one (1) four (4) inch outlet and two (2) two and one half (2
%) inch outlet.

3. Super Hydrant Enhanced — two (2) four (4) inch outlet and one (1) two and one half (2
%) inch outlet.

Section 507.5.8 is added to Section 507 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

507.5.8 Fire hydrant street marker. Fire hydrant locations shall be visually indicated in
accordance with Riverside County Fire Department Technical Policy 06-11, as may be amended
from time to time. Any hydrant marker damaged or removed during the course of street
construction or repair shall be immediately replaced by the contractor, developer or person
responsible for removal or damage.

8.12.110 FIRE COMMAND CENTER

Section 508.1 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

508.1 General. Where required by other sections of this code and in all buildings
classified as high-rise buildings by the California Building Code, in buildings greater than
300,000 square feet in area and in Group I-2 occupancies having occupied floors located more
than 75 feet above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access, a fire command center for
fire department operations shall be provided and comply with Sections 508.1.1 through 508.1.8.

Section 508.1.1 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

4848-7886-7466.1 10

65



City of Canyon Lake
Ordinance No. 170

508.1.1 Location and access. The fire command center shall be located adjacent to the
main lobby and shall be accessible from fire department vehicular access or as approved by the
fire code official. The room shall have direct access from the building exterior at the lowest level
of fire department access.

Section 508.1.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to add the following:

Exception: A fire command center solely required because a building is greater than
300,000 square feet in area shall be a minimum of 96 square feet (9 m2) with a minimum
dimension of 8 feet (2438mm).

Section 508.1.6 of the California Fire Code is amended to add the following:

Exception: A fire command center solely required because a building is greater than
300,000 square feet in area shall comply with NFPA 72 and contain the features set forth in
Section 508.1.6 subsections 5, 8, 10, 12, 13 and 14. The features set forth in Section 508.1.6
subsections 1, 2, 3,4, 6,7,9, 11, 15, 16, 17, 18 and 19 shall be required when such building
contains systems or functions related to these features.

Section 508.1.8 is added to Section 508 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

508.1.8 Fire command center identification. The fire command center shall be identified
by a permanent easily visible sign stating “Fire Dept. Command Center,” located on the door to
the fire command center.

8.12.120 FIRE PROTECTION AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT IDENTIFICATION AND
LOCATION

Section 509.2.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to add the following:

509.2.1 Minimum clearances. A 3-foot (914 mm) clear space shall be maintained around
the circumference of exterior fire protection system control valves, or any other exterior fire
protection system component that may require immediate access, except as otherwise required or
approved.

8.12.130 MECHANICAL REFRIGERATION.

Section 606.10.1.2 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with
the following:

606.10.1.2 Manual operation. When required by the fire code official, automatic
crossover valves shall be capable of manual operation. The manual valves shall be located in an
approved location immediately outside of the machinery room in a secure metal box or
equivalent and marked as Emergency Controls.

8.12.140 AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS.

4848-7886-7466.1 11

66



City of Canyon Lake
Ordinance No. 170

Section 903.2 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

903.2 Where required. In all new buildings and structures which are 3,600 square feet or
greater, an approved automatic sprinkler system shall be provided regardless of occupancy
classification. Where the Sections 903.2.1 — 903.2.19 of the California Fire Code require more
restrictive requirements than those listed below, the more restrictive requirement shall take
precedence.

Exception: Unless required elsewhere in this code or the California Building Code,
automatic fire sprinkler systems shall not be required for the following:

1. Detached Group U occupancies used for agricultural or livestock purposes, less than
5,500 square feet, and having setback distances of 50 feet or more from the property line
and other buildings.

2. Detached non-combustible equestrian arena shade canopies that are open on all sides
and used for riding only - no commercial, assembly or storage uses.

3. Detached fabric or non-combustible shade structures that are open on all sides and
used to shade playground equipment, temporary storage of vehicles and dining areas with
no cooking.

4. Detached Group U occupancy greenhouses less than 5,500 square feet.

5. Where determined by the Fire Chief that no major life safety hazard exists, and the
fuel load does not pose a significant threat to firefighter safety or to other structures or
property, automatic fire sprinklers may be exempted.

One- and two-family dwellings shall have an automatic fire sprinkler system regardless
of square footage in accordance with the California Residential Code. Fire sprinkler systems
shall be installed in mobilehomes, manufactured homes and multifamily manufactured homes
with two dwelling units in accordance with Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations.

The following exceptions in the California Fire Code shall not be allowed:

a. Exception in Section 903.2.3

b. Exception 2 in Section 903.2.11.3

Section 903.3.5.3 is added to Section 903 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

903.3.5.3 Hydraulically calculated systems. The design of hydraulically calculated fire
sprinkler systems shall not exceed 90% of the water supply capacity.

8.12.150 DESIGNATION OF HIGH-PILED STORAGE AREAS.

Section is added to Section 3204.2 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

4848-7886-7466.1 12

67



City of Canyon Lake
Ordinance No. 170

3204.2.1 Minimum requirements for client leased or occupant owned warehouses.
Designs of an automatic sprinkler system for client leased or occupant owned buildings
containing high pile storage shall be based on the requirements of NFPA 13. The responsible fire
protection engineer shall perform a survey of the building to determine commodity classification,
storage configuration, building height and other information related to the development of an
appropriate sprinkler system design. The fire protection engineer shall also make reasonable
efforts to meet with the building owner or operator to understand seasonal or customer related
fluctuations to the stored commodities, storage height, and configuration. The sprinkler design
shall be based on the most demanding requirements determined through the onsite survey and
discussions with the building owner or operator. The technical report shall describe the basis for
determining the commaodity and sprinkler design selection, how the commaodities will be isolated
or separated, and include referenced design document(s), including NFPA 13 or the current
applicable factory mutual data sheets. If a specific fire test is used as the basis of design, a copy
of the fire test report shall be provided at the time of plan review.

8.12.160 FIRE HAZARD SEVERITY ZONES.

Section 4904.3 is added to Section 4904 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

4904.3 High Fire Hazard Severity Zone Maps. In accordance with Government Code
Sections 51175 through 51189, Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones are designated as shown
on a map titled Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones, dated December 24, 2009 and retained on
file at the office of the Fire Chief, which supersedes other maps previously adopted designating
high fire hazard areas.
8.12.170 APPENDIX B.

Table B105.2 of the California Fire Code is amended as follows:

TABLE B105.2

REQUIRED FIRE-FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3 AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND

TOWNHOUSES

AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- FLOW DURATION

SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (Hours)

(Design Standard) (Gallons per minute)

No automatic sprinkler Value in Table B105.1(2) Duration in Table

system B105.1(2)

Section 903.3.1.1 of the 50% of the value in Table Duration in Table

California Fire Code B105.1(2) B105.1(2) at the reduced
flow rate

Section 903.3.1.2 of the 50% of the value in Table Duration in Table

California Fire Code B105.1(2)b B105.1(2) at the reduced
flow rate

For SI: 1 gallon per minute = 3.785 L/m.

4848-7886-7466.1 13

68



City of Canyon Lake
Ordinance No. 170

a. The reduced fire-flow shall be not less than 1,000 gallons per minute.
b. The reduced fire-flow shall be not less than 1,500 gallons per minute.

8.12.180 APPENDIX C.

Section C103.1 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

C103.1 Hydrant spacing. Fire apparatus access roads and public streets providing
required access to buildings in accordance with Section 503 of the California Fire Code shall be
provided with one or more fire hydrants, as determined by Section C102.1. Where more than one
fire hydrant is required, the distance between required fire hydrants shall be in accordance with
Sections C103.2 and C103.3. Fire hydrants shall be provided at street intersections.

Section 3. EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its
adoption.

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 4" day of January, 2017.

Mayor
ATTEST: Approved as to form:
Stephanie Hunter Elizabeth Martyn
Office Specialist City Attorney
4848-7886-7466.1 14

69



City of Canyon Lake
Ordinance No. 170

State of California)

County of Riverside ) ss

City of Canyon Lake )

I, Stephanie Hunter, Office Specialist of the City of Canyon Lake, do hereby certify that the
foregoing Ordinance No. 170 was introduced at an adjourned meeting of the City Council held on
the 14" day of December, 2016 and was duly adopted by the City Council of the City of Canyon
Lake at a regular meeting thereof held on the 4th day of January, 2017, by the following vote:
AYES:

NOES:

ABSTAIN:

ABSENT:

Stephanie Hunter, Office Specialist

4848-7886-7466.1 15

70






910z vioT L  fowwnsgiss
‘pasn aJaym 1no pajjads siosiniadng
10 pJeog AJuno) apisIanly ‘pais|ap uouyap /87 Sunsixy siosiniadng jo paeog z0z
93ueyd oN 9'€TT UOI1D3s 0} Pa1eI0|aJ UoI1I3S £8/ SuilsiX] A1an023y 350D ZVEOT 9'ETT
93ueyd oN "Z'€TT UOI309S 01 Pa1ed0|aJ UuoIdas /87 Sunsixy $994 1°2't0T TEIT
L8/
98ueyd oN “$'60T UOIID3s 0} pPa1ed0jaJ UoIas /87 Sunsixg|  sanjeuad pue uone|oip| fo / uoioas ¥'60T
paysliqelsa
SUON M3N| -aSueyd aanesisiulwpy ‘ssa20.4d Aj0ads 01 JuBWIpUSWE MBN sjeadde jo pieog T°80T
‘uoniuladp ,eaJe a4l snopiezey, pappe
pue a8ueyd |elIo}pa ‘seale snopJiezey JO 94nso|I 03 spJesal ul ¥IYD
3UON UoBIIPOIAI|  ja1yd 3414 3y Jo Aldoyine ay3 Ayoads 03 uo13Ias /g7 Sunsixy 9414 9y} jo Aoyiny ZIv0T ZT°v0T
UOI123S MU 03 UO[1BI0|34 PUE UOIIRDIHIPOW
[el101p3 *(s)aausisap paziioyine 4o AJuno) SpISIdALY JO 3daq 3414 78 J31YD
3UON UoBIIPOIAI|  ja1yd 3414 3y Jo Aldoyine ay3 Ayoads 03 uo13Ias /g7 Sunsixy 9414 9y} jo Aoyiny Z'roT T'Tv0T
‘me| Aq papinoad se suoisinoid aduaiayal
"309}J0 A1018|INS3U| 0 %31 9pod |9pow SAIPOIN 193440 AJojenSas u aSueyd Aue T'v'eot
3UON ul 38ueyd OoN "MaN| aaey j0u s30p 1IN £/ JUBUIPIO O} MU S| JUBWPUSWIE SIY| Apgen pue ¢°€0T
"L'£8 dIUBUIPIO
ul papinoid se A1a)es JO [9A3] Swes ujelulew pue 199}
aJenbs 009‘E JOAO $24N3INJIS BSOY) 03 S}UBWJINbaI JapuIds
241} J0 Ajjigedljdde uiejuiew 03 paJinbad s| Juswpuswe siy3
9J042J43Y3 ‘eaJe Ul 1934 alenbs 0OO‘E UeYl 1918348 Sa4n3doNJIS
AJossadoe 03 Ajdde 03 uoipa 910z 3yl ul papuedxa uaaq sey
109443 AI01BINB3I| 5p0s eryuapisal oY) Jo ad0ds ‘199440 AJojenSad ul agueyd Aue 9p03 |enuapisal
SUON ul 98ueyd o "MaN| aaey 10U S30p INQ £8/ DUBUIPIO O} MBU S| JUSWPUSWE SIY | ay1 jo uonedijddy 5201
*1X91 9p02 |9pow sade|dal L8L
93ueyd oN pue 74D ay31 jo T Ja1deyd 01 pa1ed0|aJ UoIILS /g7 Sunisixg Anjiqesanas| fo g uoidas 7’101

IN3JNANINV TVI01

a3idIa0N/MaN OL
Ina 1OVdI 1S0D
NOILONYLSNOD

(8°£8L *p10)
NOILD3S
3002 910C

(L2182
'p40) U013235
11NS3¥/NOILOV NOILYDI41LSNI/SLNININOD 103rans/3anliL apo) £10C
8'/8/ dueulpiQ pasodold - 199ys Alewwung sjuswpuawy |e207 AJuno) apISIanly

(040) @po) 2414 eluioyie] 9TOT

€T/TT/0T 14vyda



fupwwins 8'48¢ Iroe vjoz cL

109449 Adolein3au
U1 9SBJOU OU SBY UOI1eIIJIPOW SIYl ‘Speod ssadde snjeledde
"}09442 Aioje|ngau 3414 3PIM 1334 ¢ JO pJepueis Juswiedaq 2414 Ayuno)
Ul 9Se3.12Ul ON “M3N | apisianry SuilsIxa YIM 3pod 341} 91834409 03 JUSWPUSWE MAN suoisuawiq T°C°€0S

3UON

9p0d [9pow 3Y3 AQ PasSaIppe MOU S| SaIH|[1Ie}
a1e3jonoloyd Joy speod ssadoe snjesedde aJiy padinbau jo Speoy
uonedIpow Jo uodwaxa Mojje 03  uoirdadxa £8/ Sunsix3 $$922y snjeseddy aJi4 I'T°€0S

pa13jap aJow Jo OG Jo peo| Juednaso yum|  PaJinbas aiaym - sueld
S8UIp|ING SS3IMOPUIM 3pNjoul 01 JusWpUSWe 78/ Sunsix3 uonendeny Ajajes aJi4 Z'tor

3pod |apow ui
passalppe MouU suJajue| AYS ‘pa1ajap 1uswpuawe /87 Suiisix3 suidyue] Ays £°9'T'80

3p02 [9powW Ul papnjoul

MOU UoIuUap uJdlue| AYS "pais|ap uoniuyap /g7 Sunsix3 suidyue] Ays z0Z
¢T'v0T
UO[99s Ul pappe 1xa3 Suluyaq "palB|ap UoIIULEP L8/ SUnsIX3 eaJy aJl4 snopiezeH 20z

"(3)0t 235 ‘9T 9|3 L Ul BUYSP suolenNgaJ 13409
*9p0D SUOISSRJ0Ud pue Ssaulsng ay3 ul ainiels Aq paulyap

S1 193U1SU3 UOI1D3104d 2414 "PaI3|ap uonuyap 78/ Sunsixa| 13auISuz uoIId0.1d D414 z0z
93Ueyd ON| Auno) apisianty 4o Ja1yD 3414 3Y3 404 UOIHURP £8/ SUNSIX3 $a1yD a4 zoz r{1r4
'S9p0D) BIUJOJIED 3YIJO T'T
UOI323S U] passaJppe si siyl Ajjeuonippy ‘suoiiengay 4o apo) 3po)
eluJoji[eD 3y Jo 1ed si sy se paia[ap uoluyap £8/ Sunsix3 |elzuapIsay eluioyed zoz

'S9p0D) BIUJOIED 3YI 4O T'T
UOI323s U] passalppe si siy3 Ajjeuollppy ‘suolie|ngay Jo apo)
eluJoji[eD 3y Jo 1ed si sy} se paia[ap uoluyap £8/ Sunsix3 3po) aii4 ejuloyije) zoz

apod
31} Ul PapIACId S| UORIUSP SB PIB[3P UOIIURP £8/ BUNSIX3

e Suipjing

IN3JNANINV TVI01

@3aldIa0N/M3N OL (418 (8°£8L "p10)
INa LOVdNI 1SOD 'P40) U011I3S  NOILI3S
NOILONYLSNOD 11nS3Y/NOILY NOILYDIH1LSNI/SLNININOD 123rans/aLiL 3po) €TI0  3A0D 9T0T
8'/8/ dueulpiQ pasodold - 199ys Alewwung sjuswpuawy |e207 AJuno) apISIanly
€T/TT/0T 14vdd (042) ®po) 2414 eluioyied 9T0C



Apwwinsg/8/

910z vioe€ €L
(saueapAy punoue adeds
Jed|d sem 3111 Jo14d)
93ueyd oN *1°2°60G UOI303S 03} Pa1eI0|aJ JudwWpudwe 78/ Sulsixy saJueJea]d wnwiulpl 56 /0S5 1°2°60S
‘pPajaqe| 89 131Ul pUBWWOI uonesyyuapl
aseaJou| M3N 9.1} 8yl 01 JOOp 3Y3 1eYy3 aJinbaJ 03 JUSWPUIWE MIN J9]1U3dd puewwod all4 8°1°809S
*193U3 PUBWIWOD 41}
SUON M3N 9y1 4o} uonedo| ,panosdde, 3yl aulap 01 JUSWPUIWE MIN SS9JJE pue uoileloq T°1°80S
9°1°80S
"'9p0d [9pOW YlM 31e||24402 ‘€'1°80S
9UON uolledlyipoA 01 PIPON ‘pauUleIUIEW 3( 0} JudWpUAWeE /8/ 3ullsIX] J91U9J puewwod a4 I°'809 ‘1°80S
agueyd J9)jew
9UON uolledlyipoA |eIJOUPD YIIM paulelulew aq 0} Juswpuawe /g/ Suilsix3y }99l4}s u:m.__u>e_ 9Jl4 8¢/08 8°G°L0S
S19[ano
98ueyd oN ‘paulelulew aq 03 Juswpuawe 78/ 3unsixj pue azis yueapAy aJi4 /°'S/0S 1°S°L0S
sjoou pue sSujuado
9P0J [9POW YHM UlewaJ 0} P33P Juswpuawe /87 3unsixy Suip|inq 03 ssa%oy I't0S
sjjo-doup 198uassed
98ueyd oN ‘paulelulew g 03 Juswpuawe 78/ Sunsixj pue seaJe Suipeo’ /°€0S 1°€0S
“Juspidul 3y} 03 sawiy
asuodsas Aduadiswas aonpaJ 03 |eiaualod ul 3uiynsad saled ay3
uado 03 A9y e azJ|13n pue dois 03 Suipaau Inoyum yoeoudde
Asy3 se sa1e8 uado 03 sniesedde asuodsas Aduadiaws
Hwuad [Im sisuado snnewolny ‘sduljjamp Ajlwe) omy pue
9UO0 J0j uo13dadxa ue y3Im s91e3 paziio3ow Mau uo siauado
aseaJou| M3N J13eWO1NE JO UOIIe[|BISUl 9y} 3JInbaJ 0} Juswpuawe MaN Jauado snewoiny 1°9°€0S
9PO0J [9POW YHM UleWwJ 0} P33P Juswpuawe /87 Sunsixy Supjien €'€09
é ‘pauleluiew aq 03 Juawpuawe /g7 Sunsixgy Aoyiny 'Ce0s aTeos

LINIWAN3INY V201
@31d1a0N/M3N OL
3aNA 1OVdINI 1S0D
NOILONYLSNOD

€T/TT/0T 14vyda

11NS3Y/NOILOV
8'/8/ dueulpiQ pasodold - 199ys Alewwung sjuswpuawy |e207 AJuno) apISIanly
(D4D) @po) 8414 elutoyi|ed 9T0C

NOILVDIILSNI/SLNININOD

123rans/3iLiL

(L1218
'p40) uoizr3s
apo) £10Z

(8°£8L *p10)
NOILD3S
3002 910C




vi

Apwiwns g'/8/ 910Z viov
?8ueyo oN T°€0TD UOI309s 01 Paledo|aJ Juswpuawe /87 Suisixy uoiledo| JuespAy a4 1°20TD T°€0TD
‘19949 AJ01e|NSas Ul 9SueYd ON “Jewsoy apod mau| SBUljIdMP Ajlwej-om) Jo
SUON UOIIBIIPOIAI[ 01 penrewuoay "paulelulew aq 03 Juswpuawe 78/ Sunisix3|-auo ueyl Jaylo ssulpjing z'sorg 2'S0Tg
"109)49 Alore|n3au uy a3ueyd oN alep dew a1epdn
01 PaYIPOIN "sdew ZSH4H 40} 68TTS YSNOJY) G/TTG SUONIAS sdeiy duoz
QUON UoI1edIPOIA| 307 JUSWUISA0D) 32U3J343J 03 Juswpuawe /g7 Suisix3| AlIanas paezeH aai4 ysiH o6l €'voev
sasnoyalem
paumo juednddo
10 pased| Jual|d 10}
?8ueyd oN paulejulew aq 03 Juswpusawe /g7 Sunsixy[ SawW4Inbas wnwiulAl 1°2v0ZE T°2v0zZE
swalsAs
?8ueyo oN paulejulew aq 03 Juswpusawe /g7 Sunsixy| paiendjed AjjeainespAH €°G°€°€06
$94N30NJ3S PaYILISP SNOBUE|[DISIW 10} SU0IIdadIXa ppe
suondaaxa 03 PaYIPOIAl “PaUIRIUIBW P|OYSRIY] JSO09'E BUNSIXT "ETTET (swa3sAs
jo uonesjjdde uodn apo) A1ajes pue yijeaH pue 74 9T0Z Y3 YIIM 31831409 0} Japjulids dnewolne)
S1S02 Ul 9583423 UOI1BIIPOIAI|  swaisAs Japjuids a1y 104 JUSWPUBWE /87 SUIISIXS PAIIPOIN paJinbau aJaym Z°£06 2°€06
a8ueyo oN paujejulew aq 03 Juswpuawe 78/ Sunsix3 uonesado jenuep| Z'I°0I°909 2°'T°0T°909

IN3JNANINV TVI01

a3idIa0N/MaN OL
Ina 1OVdI 1S0D
NOILONYLSNOD

€T/TT/0T 14vyda

11NS3Y/NOILOV

NOILVDIILSNI/SLNININOD

123rans/3iLiL

8°/8/ ddueUIpIO pasodold - 193YS Alewwing syuswWpuawy |e307 AJuno) apisianly

(040) @po) 2414 eluioyie] 9TOT

'PI0) U01123S
3po) £10Z

(8°£8L *p10)
NOILD3S
3002 910C

(L8



City of Canyon Lake
City Council
Staff Report

TO: Honorable Mayor and Members of the City Council
FROM: Aaron Palmer, City Manager

DATE: January 4, 2017

SUBJECT: Fire Service Option with Riverside County Fire

Recommendation

Discussion and direction to staff, as to the possible staffing models open to Riverside County Fire
to re-open station 60.

Background

At the Riverside County Board of Supervisor meeting, on December 14, 2016, the Board approved
at Fire Service option for the City of Canyon Lake. Recently, the Board of Supervisors approved
a one year agreement with the City of Calimesa to keep their staffing at a two-person engine
company status with Basic Life Support (BLS) services. The item approved by the County at the
December 14" meeting was to extend the same options to the City of Canyon Lake that were
agreed to for the City of Calimesa. Namely, an engine company of less than three people.

Staff is still in the process of receiving the details of the Calimesa agreement. Also, the City has
not yet received a cost for services from County Fire. One item that is known, is that at the sixth
month mark of the contract, the City must notify the County of their intention to increase staffing
to a three person engine company if the City desires to extend the contract for fire service beyond
one year.

Staff would like to have this discussion with the Council to see if they are open to such a one year
agreement.

Fiscal Impact
Unknown at this time.
Attachments

None

76



77



City of Canyon Lake

City Council
Staff Report
TO: Honorable Mayor and Members of the City Council
FROM: Aaron Palmer, City Manager
BY: Ariel M. Hall, City Clerk
DATE: January 4, 2017
SUBJECT: Discussion regarding City reimbursement policy update

Recommendation

It is recommended that the City Council discuss the City’s reimbursement policies with no
action needed.

Background

At the November and December City Council meetings, former Council Member John
Zaitz questioned the City’s reimbursement policies and practices followed by several.
Formal tort claims made by Former Council Member Zaitz for additional compensation.

Whatever the merits of Councilmember Zaitz’s request for additional compensation (or
lack thereof), with new and returning Council members, as well as upcoming possible mid-
year budget adjustments, staff has pointed out that the City may want to do a
comprehensive review of all reimbursement policies and practices.

Staff is currently researching City history regarding reimbursements, and gathering
information from other cities regarding their policies and procedures in order to provide
the City Council with a comprehensive review and revision on the February or March City
Council agenda. An update of the policies involves a comprehensive review of increased
(or decreased) cost as well as changes in technology and information delivery

We suggest one of two possible approaches: a) the Mayor may appoint an ad hoc
committee to make a recommendation to the Council; b) this matter may be referred to the
Finance Committee.

Budget (or Fiscal) Impact

There is no cost for the review of the reimbursement policies/procedures; however,
potential amendments to the reimbursement policies/procedures could impact the City’s
budget if the allowable reimbursement amounts are increased or decreased.
Attachments

None.



79



City of Canyon Lake
City Council
Staff Report

TO: Honorable Mayor and Members of the City Council
FROM: Aaron Palmer, City Manager

DATE: January 4, 2017

SUBJECT: Increase of Employee Cafeteria Benefit Allowance

Recommendation

Increase the Employee Cafeteria Benefit allowance from $806.29 per month to $1,350 per month.

Background

At the August 3, 2016 Council meeting, the City Council discussed the possible increase to the
employee cafeteria benefit allowance. After much discussion, this item was tabled and Council ask
for this item to be brought back in January 2017.

Fiscal Impact

The City will see an annual increase of approximately $26,100 in employee benefit costs due to the
increase for FY 2016-2017. The funds for the increase to $1,350 per month were included in the FY
2016-2017 annual budget and were approved by the Council. However, this funds have not been used
since the Council has not approved a cafeteria allowance increase.

Attachments

1. August 3, 2016 Staff Report
2. Draft Cafeteria Policy

3. Cafeteria Plan Comparison

80



81



City of Canyon Lake
City Council
Staff Report

TO: Honorable Mayor and Members of the City Council

FROM: Aaron Palmer, City Manager

BY: Ariel M. Hall, City Clerk and Terry Shea, Accountant

DATE: August 3, 2016

SUBJECT: Consideration of Approving Amended Cafeteria Benefit Policy

With Increased Cafeteria Benefit Contribution

Recommendation

It is recommended that the City Council: Approve the amended Cafeteria Benefit Policy
as proposed.

Background

To comply with the Internal Revenue Service Section 125 Plan requirements, the City must
have a Cafeteria Benefit Policy. The original policy was adopted on October 1, 2014. The
policy was aligned with the practices of the City for providing benefits for its employees,
and additionally, contained legal requirements for the City to become compliant with
Section 125.

The City Manager reviewed the City’s Cafeteria Benefit Policy and is now suggesting an
increase in the amount contributed to full-time employees from $806.29 per month to
$1,350.00 per month. This increase would cover the basic HMO health plan for an
employee and their dependents.

At the June 1, 2016 City Council Meeting, the City Council asked for additional
information, comparing similar cities’ contributions to the suggested amount in the
amended Cafeteria Benefit Policy. A sheet comparing similar cities in the State, as well
as cities in Riverside County was prepared by the City’s Accountant for the City
Council’s review.

Budget (or Fiscal) Impact

The City will see an annual increase of approximately $26,100 in employee benefit costs
due to the increase.

Attachments

1. Proposed Cafeteria Benefit Policy
2. Comparison Sheet

82



83



Cafeteria Plan Benefit Policy

ADOPTED: DRAFT

84



TABLE OF CONTENTS

CHAPTER 1 - POLICIES AND PRACTICES .......ccci i 3
SECTION 1 —PURPOSE .......ooiiiiiiieiee e 3
SECTION 2 — ELIGIBLE INDIVIDUALS........cciiiiiiii i 3
SECTION 3 —CONTRIBUTIONS ..o 3
SECTION 4 — ENROLLMENT/CHANGES/PLAN YEAR ....ccocoiiiiiiiiieiei e 3

CHAPTER 2 — QUALIFIED BENEFITS ... 5
SECTION 1 —HEALTH BENEFITS ..o 5
SECTION 2 — DENTAL BENEFITS ..o 5
SECTION 3 —VISION BENEFITS......ooi e 5
SECTION 4 — LIFE INSURANCE BENEFITS ..o 5

CHAPTER 3- OTHER BENEFITS OFFERED........cccoiiiiiii 6
SECTION 1 — DEFERRED COMPENSATION .....ooiiiiiiieiieeee e 6
SECTION 2 — CASH OUT ..ot 6

CHAPTER 4 — DEFINITIONS. ... .ooi it 6

85



CHAPTER 1 - POLICIES AND PRACTICES

SECTION 1 - PURPOSE

This Cafeteria Plan allows the City to make a set contribution to each full-time employee, or full-
time employee in their probation period, each month. This contribution may be used to purchase
benefits offered within this policy. Additionally, this plan will allow each employee to contribute
pre-tax dollars to purchase additional, qualified, benefits beyond what can be purchased with the
monthly contribution from the City.

SECTION 2 — ELIGIBLE INDIVIDUALS

Full-time employees, full-time employees in their probation period, and part-time employees that
work 1,000 hours or more in a single year will be eligible for coverage under this policy.

Employees that are eligible under this policy may elect to purchase eligible benefits for their
spouse and/or qualified dependents.

SECTION 3 — CONTRIBUTIONS

The City will make a monthly contribution of $1,350.00 towards the benefits of full-time
employees, and full-time employees in their probation period.

a. Part-time employees who work 1,000 hours or more in a single year may elect to make
pre-tax contributions to purchase eligible benefits under this policy.

b. Full-time employees, or full-time employees in their probation period, may elect to make
pre-tax contributions in addition to the City contribution to purchase eligible benefits
under this policy.

C. The maximum contribution that an eligible employee may make pre-tax for qualified
benefits is $1000.00 per month.

SECTION 4 — ENROLLMENT/CHANGES/PLAN YEAR

All benefit selections made by an eligible employee are effective for the entire calendar year,
January 1% to December 31%, unless the employee experiences an eligible change in status or
other event as listed in this policy.

a. Open Enrollment
All eligible employees will be notified annually of the open enrollment period. Typically,
the open enrollment period will occur from the third Monday in September to the second

Friday in October. Benefit options may be selected and/or changed during this period.
Benefits selected during open enrollment will become effective January 1%

86



Change in Status

All eligible employees may change their benefit selections during the plan year if they
experience a change in status, and the change in benefits is consistent with the change in
status. A selection change is consistent if that change is “on account of”” and “corresponds
with” a change in status event that affects eligibility for coverage. Change in status
includes:

1. Change in marriage status
2. Change in number of dependents
3. Change in employment status

4. Changes in the eligibility of dependents

5. Changes in residence that directly affect coverage

Family and Medical Leave Act (FMLA)

Eligible employees who take unpaid FMLA leave may revoke their benefit selections
during their unpaid leave. The eligible employee may reinstate their benefit selections on
the same terms and conditions upon return from unpaid leave.

Judgment, Decree or Order

Eligible employees may revoke or change their benefit selections if a judgment, decree or
order resulting from a divorce, legal separation, annulment, or change in legal custody
requires health coverage for an eligible employee’s child.

Entitlement to Medicare or Medicaid

Eligible employees may revoke or change their benefit selections if the eligible
employee, spouse, or other dependent becomes entitled to Medicare or Medicaid.

Significant Cost or Coverage Changes

1. Cost Changes
If the cost of an eligible employee’s selected Health, Dental, or Vision plan
increase or decreases during the plan year by more than 20%, the eligible

employee may change their selection, or make a corresponding change to any pre-
tax contribution they are making.

87



2. Coverage Changes

If the plan coverage that an eligible employee has selected ceases or is
significantly curtailed, the eligible employee may revoke their corresponding
selection, and/or enroll in a similar plan.

Significantly curtailed means that there is an overall reduction in coverage
provided by the plan. Loss of coverage means that there is a complete loss of
coverage provided by the plan, such as an HMO ceasing to be available in the
area that the eligible employee resides.

CHAPTER 2 - QUALIFIED BENEFITS

SECTION 1 - HEALTH BENEFITS

The City offers Health Maintenance Organization (HMO) Basic Health Plans, Preferred Provider
Organization (PPO) Basic Health Plans, and Exclusive Provider Organization (EPO) Health
Plans through the California Public Employee Retirement System (CalPERS) organization.
Specific providers and rates may change from time to time. All employees will be notified of
providers and rates each year during open enrollment.

SECTION 2 — DENTAL BENEFITS

The City offers Dental Insurance benefits. Specific providers and rates may change from time to
time. All employees will be notified of providers and rates each year during open enrollment.

SECTION 3 — VISION BENEFITS

The City offers Vision Insurance benefits. Specific providers and rates may change from time to
time. All employees will be notified of providers and rates each year during open enroliment.

SECTION 4 — LIFE INSURANCE BENEFITS

The City offers Life Insurance benefits for the employee only. Dependents and spouses are not
eligible for Life Insurance coverage under this policy. Specific providers and rates may change
from time to time. All employees will be notified of providers and rates each year during open
enrollment.

a. Life Insurance coverage may not exceed $50,000 to be eligible under this policy for pre-
tax contributions.

88



CHAPTER 3 - OTHER BENEFITS OFFERED

SECTION 1 - DEFERRED COMPENSATION

The City offers a 457(b) Deferred Compensation Plan through Nationwide that employees may
make tax-deferred contributions to, subject to rules and regulations pertaining to such plans.

SECTION 2 — CASH OUT

If an eligible employee receives health insurance coverage through a source outside of the City’s
benefit plan, they may elect to receive the amount the employee would have paid equal to the
current Kaiser single party rate, as taxable income. In order to take advantage of “cashing out”
the City’s contribution, the eligible employee MUST provide proof of health insurance coverage.

CHAPTER 4 — DEFINITIONS

Eligible Employee Any full-time employee, full-time employee
in their probation period, or part-time
employee that works 1,000 or more hours in
the calendar year

Spouse Any person that the eligible employee is
lawfully married to

Qualified Dependent(s) Any person that is legally the child, step-
child, adopted child, or legally placed foster
child of the eligible employee, up to the age
of 26.

89



siuapuadap Joj yruow e oggs dn pue saaholjdwa Jo) %00T 6STST ZEINVE
dw3 000719 S
T+dw3 00°STT'T S
oN|eA 19N PI3IYS aNn|g ® OINH Wayiuy syl JO asealdul z+dw3 00'96S°T S GT6CT Ad||eA sseun
98e1uad49d a8esane ayl JO %G/ 01 Paseasdul JUNoWe /2T 9A1109443
00°00T°T S G8STT [I'H [eusIs
dw3 5/°569 S
T+dw3 081901 S
$1S0J U] 3seaJdul Z+dw3 sy'y97T S T12°91 EEV I N] |
938eJaAe 9Y3 40 %0T 40 49sS3| 9yl Aq T Adenuer yoes sasealou|
dw3 17°9¢9 S
T+dw3l T¥'eLe'T S
paisl| sjunowe z+dw3 ST'H¥S9°T S 04501 Cl[ILYUSEIE!
9y3 03 dn S3502 0 %00T 49A02 01 Junowe snjd wnwiuiw YIHIAId
00°008°T S 150°CT Aeg uool\ jleH
ueld YijeaH pIalys an|g ealy Aeg 0Cv'TT yanouogsj|iH
a1ey ONH SY3d 8C6TT A3]|eA s11005
Allweq + dw3 Jo %08 8T8'ET uingny
wnuwiulw YJHIN3d Shid 00°0S€ S 88€°ST 9A0J9 Jl}1oed
dw3 009TS S
T+dw3 0090/ S
junowe 3}1jauaq aduly snid ‘Ajjenuue paisnipe yOHIAId Z+dw3 00998 S G96'ST ew|ed e
wnjwaJid 9dueansul [EIIPAW |EnUUE paulqwod s,A1D 00°2S2'T S 0ELST S91P153 S9PJAA Sojed
9y3 Jo aseaJoul 23ejuadlad ay3 Jo jey Aq Jeah yoes paseasoul de)

%€ xew Asenuer AJans |dD 49d 1snlpy 86'68€‘T S 1[T9°LT s8uldsg a4 ejues
00'62V'T S 002’6 uoinqi]
00°00T°T S 1SL°€t epur ewon
002221 S 6LL°TT SOHWe|y so7

unowy uonejndod A
ued

suosiiedwo) ue|d elalaje)
9)eq uoAue) jo A

L6



OIAIH eusiD pue 9T'TI8'T S 18v'ty luowneag
J3sIe)| ‘SaoueINsuUl OM] S1940 ‘[9A3] Ajlwiey ay3 01 dn 9%00T sAed AD

00°00S°T S G8¢’s8 93}IUSIN

00°00S‘T S €99°09 dleAlse]

00°00%'T S 58886 As|jep ednung

Ajlweq 1samo| ay3 404 3502 Ul 9SB3JdUl 3y} 4O Ju324ad 05 Ag Ajjenuue 87'GO0E‘T S 642'L0T e13x1IN A
paisnlpe ¢T/T/L 311939443 ‘WnwiuIW YIHINId S9phjaul Junowy

00°0SC‘T S 168°S¢ 03JON

00°002'T S 8YT've Jewop|im

00°002‘T S T6¥°0€ 3uluueg

¥T/T/T 40 sV 00'86T‘T S 0¢6'80T g[nosws |

18'870°T S €5C°C8 1aWwaH

00°0s8 S 9Cv'8S 9J0uls|3 9xen

00°008 S €5€'8 esawley

unowy uone|ndod Auno) apisianty

ueld

c6



	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page



