Mayor Jeremy Smith

CITY OF CANYON LAKE Council Member Kasey Castillo

Council Member Jennifer Dain

City Hall Council Member Mark Terry

31516 Railroad Canyon Road Council Member Dale Welty
Canyon Lake, CA 92587 City Manager Chris Mann
www.canyonlakeca.gov City Attorney Steven Graham

City Clerk Ana V. Sauseda, CMC

AGENDA
Regular Meeting of the Canyon Lake City Council
Wednesday, November 9, 2022
Closed Session 5:00 P.M. - City Hall Administration Office — 31526 Railroad Canyon Road, Suite 5
Open Session 6:30 P.M. - City Hall Council Chamber — 31516 Railroad Canyon Road
CLOSED SESSION —5:00 P.M.

CLOSED SESSION CALLED TO ORDER
ROLL CALL

PUBLIC COMMENT LIMIT 3 MINUTES

Any person wishing to address the City Council on any matter within the jurisdiction of the City, whether or not it appears on this
agenda, is asked to complete a “Speaker Request Form” available on the back counter. The completed form is to be submitted
to the City Clerk prior to an individual being heard by the City Council. The City Council has adopted a time limitation of three (3)
minutes per person. If you are commenting on the agenda item, your comments will be heard at the time that particular item is
scheduled on the agenda. Please note that if you are addressing the City Council on items NOT on the agenda, the Brown Act
does not allow discussion of such items. Therefore, the City Council may only do the following: refer the matter to staff, ask for
additional information or request a report back, or give a very limited factual response.

Members of the public may submit comments electronically by sending an email to PublicComment@canyonlakeca.gov.
Comments submitted electronically will be provided to the City Council and included in the official record but will not be read aloud
during the meeting.

A. CONFERENCE WITH REAL PROPERTY NEGOTIATORS - Pursuant to Section 54956.8
Property: APN 349-290-008
Agency Negotiator: City Manager
Negotiating Parties: Jim Kipp
Under Negotiation: Price and Terms of Payment

B. CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL - INITIATION OF LITIGATION - Pursuant to Section
54956.9 (d)(4) — 2 cases

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda


http://www.canyonlakeca.gov/
mailto:PublicComment@canyonlakeca.gov

OPEN SESSION - 6:30 P.M.

OPEN SESSION CALLED TO ORDER

INVOCATION

FLAG SALUTE

ROLL CALL

CLOSED SESSION REPORT

APPROVAL OF CITY COUNCIL AGENDA

CEREMONIAL MATTERS Presentations, Awards, Proclamations
o Citizen of the Month

COMMUNITY REPORTS - LIMIT 3 MINUTES

e Elsinore Valley Municipal Water District Update — President Darcy Burke
e Canyon Lake Property Owners Association Update — President Renee Griffiths
e  Chamber of Commerce Update — President Jeanne O'Dell

PUBLIC SAFETY UPDATE
+¢+ Sheriff's Department

++ Code Enforcement

¢+ Fire Department

PUBLIC COMMENT LIMIT 3 MINUTES

Any person wishing to address the City Council on any matter within the jurisdiction of the City, whether or not it appears on this
agenda, is asked to complete a “Speaker Request Form” available on the back counter. The completed form is to be submitted to
the City Clerk prior to an individual being heard by the City Council. The City Council has adopted a time limitation of three (3)
minutes per person. If you are commenting on the agenda item, your comments will be heard at the time that particular item is
scheduled on the agenda. Please note that if you are addressing the City Council on items NOT on the agenda, the Brown Act
does not allow discussion of such items. Therefore, the City Council may only do the following: refer the matter to staff, ask for
additional information or request a report back, or give a very limited factual response.

Members of the public may submit comments electronically by sending an email to PublicComment@canyonlakeca.gov. Comments
submitted electronically will be provided to the City Council and included in the official record but will not be read aloud during the
meeting.

CONSENT CALENDAR

All items listed on the Consent Calendar are considered to be routine matters, status reports or documents covering previous City
Council action. The items listed on the Consent Calendar may be enacted in one motion. With the concurrence of the City Council,
a Council Member may request that an item be removed for further discussion. Staff recommends approval of all items.

(1) Waive Full Reading, Read all Ordinances by Title Only

2) Resolution - Adoption of Resolution No. 2022-59 Approving Claims and Demands of the City

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda


mailto:PublicComment@canyonlakeca.gov

(3) Minutes - Approval of City Council Minutes
e September 29, 2022 - Special City Council Meeting
e October 12, 2022 — Regular City Council Meeting

PULLED CONSENT CALENDAR ITEMS

PUBLIC HEARING

(4) Second Reading of Ordinance No. 227 — An Ordinance of the City Council of the City of Canyon Lake,
California, Adopting the 2022 California Fire Code as Amended as Chapter 8.12 of the Canyon Lake
Municipal Code

(5) Second Reading of Ordinance No. 228 — An Ordinance of the City Council of the City of Canyon Lake,
California, Amending Chapter 8.02 of the Canyon Lake Municipal Code, Adopting by Reference the
2022 Editions of the California Codes (Including but not Limited to the Green Building Code) and Related
Model Codes with Appendices and Amendments Thereto

BUSINESS ITEMS

(6) Resolution — Adoption of Resolution No. 2022-60, Approving a Budget Adjustment in the Amount of
$3,000 for Exterior Painting of the City Hall Building

CITY MANAGER COMMENTS

COMMITTEE AND COUNCIL REPORTS/COMMENTS

ANNOUNCEMENTS

The next regular meeting will be Wednesday, December 14, 2022, at 5:00 for Closed Session & 6:30 p.m.
for Open Session

ADJOURNMENT

VISION STATEMENT

The vision of the City of Canyon Lake is to be a City that provides a quality of life that makes Canyon Lake the
premier place to live in Southern California.

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda



ATTENTION RESIDENTS:

Supporting documents, including staff reports, are available for review at City Hall in the City Clerk’s Office or on the
City’s website at www.canyonlakeca.gov once the agenda has been publicly posted. Any written material relating to
an item on this agenda submitted to the City Council after distribution of the agenda packet will be available for public
inspection in the City Clerk’s Office during normal business hours. In addition, such writings or documents will be made
available for public review at the respective public meeting. It is the intention of the City of Canyon Lake to comply with
the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) in all respects. If, as an attendee or participant at this meeting, you will need
special assistance beyond what is normally provided, the City of Canyon Lake will attempt to accommodate you in
every reasonable manner. Please contact Ana V. Sauseda, City Clerk, at least 48 hours prior to the meeting to inform
us of your particular needs and to determine if accommaodation is feasible. Please advise us at that time if you will
need accommodations to attend or participate in meetings on a regular basis.

November 9, 2022 City Council Meeting

STATE OF CALIFORNIA }
COUNTY OF RIVERSIDE } SS. AFFIDAVIT OF POSTING
CITY OF CANYON LAKE }

I, Ana V. Sauseda, CMC, City Clerk of the City of Canyon Lake, California, do hereby declare that the foregoing agenda
was posted on November 4, 2022, at least seventy-two (72) hours prior to the meeting per Government Code 54954.2,
and as required by Resolution 2019-42 of the Canyon Lake City Council.

Ana V. Sauseda, CMC
City Clerk

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda


http://www.canyonlakeca.gov/

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

Page 1



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

Page 2



ATTACHMENT 1

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

Page 3



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

Page 4



RESOLUTION NO. 2022-59

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CANYON LAKE, CALIFORNIA, ALLOWING
CERTAIN CLAIMS AND DEMANDS AS SET FORTH IN EXHIBIT A

WHEREAS, the Finance & Planning Committee of the City of Canyon Lake reviewed Exhibit A at their regularly
scheduled meeting on November 9, 2022; and

WHEREAS, Exhibit A was presented at the regular meeting of the City Council on November 9, 2022, at which all
present, were given an opportunity to comment. '

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CANYON LAKE DOES HEREBY RESOLVE
AS FOLLOWS:

Demands are approved as shown on the Demand\Warrant Register of November 9th, in the amount of $301,487.74 as
follows:

Payroll Earnings (Gross) $ 125,056.90  (For Month of October)
Payroll Processing Fees $ 242.47  (For Month of October)
Payroll Taxes - Employer 2,539.61 (For Month of October)
On-line Retirement 11,382.75  (For Month of October)
PARS 8976.08 (2nd Half of September & October)
On-line Health 15,538.68  (For Month of October)
Nationwide Deferred Comp. 3,027.04  (For the Month of October)
Citizens Business Bank Interest 1,949.05  (For the Month of September)
General 132,775.16

TOTAL 5 301,487.74

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 9th day of November, 2022.

Jeremy Smith, Mayor

ATTEST:

Ana V. Sauseda, CMC
City Clerk

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

Page 5



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

Page 6



Exhibit A

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

Page 7



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

Page 8



Claims and Demands

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

Page 9



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 10



City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 10/1/2022 Through 10/31/2022

Matching
Check Document Check Fund Fund Short
Number Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code Title
28411 10/12/2022  Applicant Background Background for Reserves 121.45 10 GENERAL
Information
Total 10/12/2022 121.45
28411
28412 10/12/2022  Abila Monthly Accounting 190.46 10 GENERAL
Software Subscription
10/1/22-10/31/22
Total 10/12/2022 190.46
28412 .
28413 10/12/2022  Allstar Fire Equipment, Helmet Shields- Reserves 211.68 10 GENERAL
Inc.
Total 10/12/2022 211.68
28413
28414 10/12/2022  Amazon Capital Office Supplies for Fire 193.84 10 GENERAL
Services Station
Total 10/12/2022 193.84
28414
28415 10/12/2022  Andrew Ladeau Reserve Stipend for 50.00 10 GENERAL
September 2022
Total 10/12/2022 50.00
28415
28416 10/12/2022  ANIMAL FRIENDS Animal Control Services 3,500.00 10 GENERAL
OF THE VALLEYS Month of Sept 2022
28416 10/12/2022  ANIMAL FRIENDS Animal Control Services of 3,500.00 10 GENERAL
OF THE VALLEYS August 2022
Total 10/12/2022 7,000.00
28416
28417 10/12/2022  Bankcard Center See Attached CC Review 177.66 10 GENERAL
0025
Total 10/12/2022 177.66
28417

Date: 11/W2708ot5213% Council Agenda

Page T1



City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 10/1/2022 Through 10/31/2022

Matching
Check Document Check Fund Fund Short
Number  Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code Title
28418 10/12/2022  Bankcard Center See Attached CC Review 832.07 10 GENERAL
0058
Total 10/12/2022 832.07
28418
28419 10/12/2022  Bankcard Center See Attached CC Review 99.95 10 GENERAL
0066
Total 10/12/2022 99.95
28419
28420 10/12/2022  Jacob Brown Reserve Stipend for 50.00 10 GENERAL
September 2022
Total 10/12/2022 50.00
28420
28421 10/12/2022  CA Dept of tax and Fee Diesel Fuel tax-Acct # 99.00 10 GENERAL
Administration 245-963712
Total 10/12/2022 99.00
28421
28422 10/12/2022  Brennan Calley Reserve Stipend For 100.00 10 GENERAL
September 2022
Total 10/12/2022 100.00
28422
28423 10/12/2022  CANYON LAKE PEST Monthly Pest Control Fire 45.00 10 GENERAL
CONTROL, Steven E. Station Sept 2022
Young
28423 10/12/2022  CANYON LAKE PEST Monthly Rodent Bait Service 20.00 10 GENERAL
CONTROL, Steven E. Fire Station Sept 2022
Young
Total 10/12/2022 65.00
28423
28424 10/12/2022  Control Pump Landscape for Booster 375.00 20 GAS TAX
Station September 2022
Total 10/12/2022 375.00
28424

Date: 11/ 432087022 & Council Agenda

Paget?



City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 10/1/2022 Through 10/31/2022

Matching

Check Document Fund Fund Short

Number Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code Title

28425 10/12/2022  Caden Coppock Reserve Stipend for 100.00 10 GENERAL
September 2022

Total 10/12/2022 100.00

28425

28426 10/12/2022  Corelogic Information Database for Services 144.90 10 GENERAL

Solutions, INC. September 2022

Total 10/12/2022 144.90

28426

28427 10/12/2022  CPS HR Consulting HR Consulting Period 101.25 10 GENERAL
05/29/22-8/27/22

Total 10/12/2022 101.25

28427

28428 10/12/2022  L.N. Curtis and Sons Repairs to Hurst Spreaders 478.00 10 GENERAL

28428 10/12/2022  L.N. Curtis and Sons Repairs to SCBA Compressor 240.46 10 GENERAL

Total 10/12/2022 718.46

28428

28429 10/12/2022  Jennifer Dain Auto Allowance October 100.00 10 GENERAL
2022-Dain

Total 10/12/2022 100.00

28429

28430 10/12/2022  DATA TICKET Code Enforcement Citation 214.00 10 GENERAL
Processing April 2022

28430 10/12/2022  DATA TICKET Code Enforcement Citation 333.00 10 GENERAL
Processing August 2022

28430 10/12/2022  DATA TICKET Monthly EMS Response Fee 100.00 10 GENERAL
April 2022

28430 10/12/2022 DATA TICKET Monthly EMS Response Fee 100.00 10 GENERAL
August 2022

Total 10/12/2022 747.00

28430

28431 10/12/2022  STATE OF CA DEPT. Fingerprint Apps September 32.00 10 GENERAL

OF JUSTICE

Date: 11/W27097Z221E¥ Council Agenda

2022

Page't3



City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 10/1/2022 Through 10/31/2022

Matching

Check Document Check Fund Fund Short

Number Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code Title

Total 10/12/2022 32.00

28431

28432 10/12/2022  Division of the State Disability & Education Fee 28.40 10 GENERAL

Architect Quarter Ended 9/30/22

Total 10/12/2022 28.40

28432

28433 10/12/2022  THE GAS COMPANY SoCalGas 8/30/22-9/29/22 17.61 60 ENTERPR...

FUND

Total 10/12/2022 17.61

28433

28434 10/12/2022  Jake Stouffer Reserve Sitpend for 50.00 10 GENERAL
September 2022

Total 10/12/2022 50.00

28434

28435 10/12/2022  Jeremy Smith Auto Allowance October 100.00 10 GENERAL
2022-Smith

28435 10/12/2022  Jeremy Smith League of the Cities Event 66.00 10 GENERAL
Parking

Total 10/12/2022 166.00

28435

28436 10/12/2022  Marlon Johnson CACEO Training Mile 271.25 10 GENERAL
Reimbursement

28436 10/12/2022  Marlon Johnson CACEO Training- Text Book 54.96 10 GENERAL
Reimbursement

Total 10/12/2022 326.21

28436

28437 10/12/2022  Jonathan Sasse Reserve Stipend for 100.00 10 GENERAL
September 2022

Total 10/12/2022 100.00

28437

28438 10/12/2022  Kasey Castillo Auto Allowance October 100.00 10 GENERAL

Date: 11/l 37007582!1d Council Agenda

2022-Castillo

Paget4'



City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 10/1/2022 Through 10/31/2022

Matching

Check Document Check Fund Fund Short

Number Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code Title

Total 10/12/2022 100.00

28438

28439 10/12/2022  Pieter Koopman Reserve Stipend for 100.00 10 GENERAL
September 2022

Total 10/12/2022 100.00

28439

28440 10/12/2022  Larry Greene Auto Allowance October 100.00 10 GENERAL
2022-Greene

Total 10/12/2022 100.00

28440

28441 10/12/2022  Matt Luksch Reserve Stipend For 100.00 10 GENERAL
September 2022

Total 10/12/2022 100.00

28441

28442 10/12/2022  Morgan Suit Reserve Stipend for 100.00 10 GENERAL
September 2022

Total 10/12/2022 100.00

28442

28443 10/12/2022  Thomas Mosqueda Reserve Stipend for 50.00 10 GENERAL
September 2022

Total 10/12/2022 50.00

28443

28444 10/12/2022 MuniServices/ Avenu UUT Fixed Fee Maylé, 1,272.85 10 GENERAL
2022-June 30, 2022

28444 10/12/2022  MuniServices/ Avenu UUT Fixed Fee July 2,500.00 10 GENERAL
2022-Sept 2022

Total 10/12/2022 3,772.85

28444

28445 10/12/2022  Nicolas Thomas Refund for over payment for 322.00 10 GENERAL
Business License #5629

Total 10/12/2022 322.00

28445

Date: 11/5208 20221 Council Agenda

Page"t5



City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 10/1/2022 Through 10/31/2022

Matching
Check Document Check Fund Fund Short
Number Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code Title
28446 10/12/2022 PV Maintenance Inc. Street & Facility 388.02 10 GENERAL
Maintenance
12/1/21-12/31/21
28446 10/12/2022 PV Maintenance Inc. Street & Facility 561.37 10 GENERAL
Maintenance 9/1/22-9/30/22
28446 10/12/2022 PV Maintenance Inc. Street & Facility 769.01 20 GAS TAX
Maintenance
12/1/21-12/31/21
28446 10/12/2022 PV Maintenance Inc. Street & Facility 1,954.54 20 GAS TAX
Maintenance 4/1/22-4/30/22
28446 10/12/2022 PV Maintenance Inc. Street & Facility 2,176.19 20 GAS TAX
Maintenance 9/1/22-9/30/22
28446 10/12/2022 PV Maintenance Inc. Street & Facility 952.66 60 ENTERPR...
Maintenance 9/1/22-9/30/22 FUND
Total 10/12/2022 6,801.79
28446
28447 10/12/2022  Regional Conservation MSHCP Feees Collected for 7,270.00 50 AGENCY
Authority September 2022
Total 10/12/2022 7,270.00
28447
28448 10/12/2022  Ryan Ramos Reserve Stipend for 50.00 10 GENERAL
September 2022
Total 10/12/2022 50.00
28448
28449 10/12/2022  James Sanchez Reserve Stipend for 100.00 10 GENERAL
September 2022
Total 10/12/2022 100.00
28449
28450 10/12/2022  Southern California Dues for Fiscal Year 1,441.00 10 GENERAL
Association of 2022-2023
Government
Total 10/12/2022 1,441.00
28450
28451 10/12/2022  Nathan Smith Reserve Stipend for 100.00 10 GENERAL

Date: 11/y200228%2213% Council Agenda

September 2022

Page't6



City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 10/1/2022 Through 10/31/2022

Matching

Check Document Check Fund Fund Short

Number Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code Title

Total 10/12/2022 100.00

28451

28452 10/12/2022  STAPLES Office Supplies 132.60 10 GENERAL

28452 10/12/2022  STAPLES Office Supplies 266.25 60 ENTERPR...

FUND

Total 10/12/2022 398.85

28452

28453 10/12/2022  Syntech Group Cyber Security Program 1,550.00 10 GENERAL
8/31/22

28453 10/12/2022  Syntech Group Microsoft Subscriptions & 1,230.55 10 GENERAL
Programs 7/1/22-7/31/22

28453 10/12/2022  Syntech Group Microsoft Subscriptions & 1,254.00 10 GENERAL
Programs 8/1/22-8/31/22

28453 10/12/2022  Syntech Group Monthly IT Services 2,000.00 10 GENERAL
7/1/2022-7/31/2022

Total 10/12/2022 6,034.55

28453

28454 10/12/2022  Charter Communications  Digital Converter for City 5.55 10 GENERAL
Hall 9/22/22-10/21/22

Total 10/12/2022 5.55

28454

28455 10/12/2022  Toshiba America Fire Station Monthly Copies 60.01 10 GENERAL

Business Solutions 8/25/22-9/24/22

Total 10/12/2022 60.01

28455

28456 10/12/2022  Dale Welty Auto Allowance October 100.00 10 GENERAL
2022-Welty

Total 10/12/2022 100.00

28456

28457 10/12/2022  Zach Michel Reserve Stipend for 100.00 10 GENERAL
September 2022

Total 10/12/2022 100.00

28457

Date: 11/12200¢2022!E% Council Agenda

Page't7’



City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 10/1/2022 Through 10/31/2022

Matching

Check Document Check Fund Fund Short

Number Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code Title

28458 10/12/2022  ZF Signature Inc Medical Director Services 1,200.00 10 GENERAL

July-Sept 2022

Total 10/12/2022 1,200.00

28458

28460 10/19/2022  Allstar Fire Equipment, Boots for FF/PM Smith 409.58 10 GENERAL
Inc.

Total 10/19/2022 409.58

28460

28461 10/19/2022  American Legal S-14 Folio/Internet July 2022 14.88 10 GENERAL
Publishing

Total 10/19/2022 14.88

28461

28462 10/19/2022  Bankcard Center See Credit Card Review 0041 4,078.43 10 GENERAL

Total 10/19/2022 4,078.43

28462

28463 10/19/2022  Bankcard Center See Credit Card Review 3081 2,738.09 10 GENERAL

Total 10/19/2022 2,738.09

28463

28464 10/19/2022  BIO-TOX Blood Analysis 8/4/22 51.55 10 GENERAL
LABORATORIES

Total 10/19/2022 51.55

28464

28465 10/19/2022  California Building Permit Valuation July 364.50 10 GENERAL
Standards Commission through September 2022

Total 10/19/2022 364.50

28465

28466 10/19/2022  CANYON LAKE PEST Bi-Monthly Service 60.00 10 GENERAL
CONTROL, Steven E.
Young

Total 10/19/2022 60.00

28466

Date: L/ 3209 Z0021EY Council Agenda

Page 18



City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 10/1/2022 Through 10/31/2022

Matching

Check Document Check Fund Fund Short

Number Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code Title

28467 10/19/2022  CPR Training Centers CPR Traing for all Full-time 733.00 10 GENERAL
Personnel

Total 10/19/2022 733.00

28467

28468 10/19/2022  CR&R Rental Service 18533 60 ENTERPR...
10/1/22-10/31/22 (31542 FUND
Railroad Cyn Rd)

Total 10/19/2022 185.33

28468

28469 10/19/2022  CTAI Pacific Landscape Damage on 767.00 20 GAS TAX

Greenscape RRCR-Plant and Tree

Replacement

Total 10/19/2022 767.00

28469

28470 10/19/2022  DATA TICKET Code Enforcement Citation 110.00 10 GENERAL
Processing September 2022

28470 10/19/2022  DATA TICKET Monthly EMS Response Fee 100.00 10 GENERAL
September 2022

Total 10/19/2022 210.00

28470

28471 10/19/2022  DEPARTMENT OF Strong Motion 1,139.52 10 GENERAL

CONSERVATION Instrumentation & Seismic

Hazard July-Sept 22

Total 10/19/2022 1,139.52

28471

28472 10/19/2022  Fast Signs Veterans Day Banner 296.67 10 GENERAL

Total 10/19/2022 296.67

28472

28473 6/23/2022 Fire Smart Promotions Badges & Stickers 1,055.95 10 GENERAL

Total 6/23/2022 1,055.95

28473

Date: 11, V2072822101 Council Agenda

Paget?’



City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 10/1/2022 Through 10/31/2022

Matching
Check Document Check Fund Fund Short
Number Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code Title
28474 10/19/2022  Interwest Consulting Building & Safety for August 4,725.00 20 GAS TAX
Group 2022
Total 10/19/2022 4,725.00
28474
28475 10/19/2022  Knox Company Knox Key Switch fo Canyon 159.48 10 GENERAL
Club Condos
Total 10/19/2022 159.48
28475
28476 10/19/2022  Ryan Moore Reimbursement for 300.00 10 GENERAL
Paramedic Recertification
Total 10/19/2022 300.00
28476
28477 10/19/2022  Mr. Appliance Repairs on Ice Machine 255.00 10 GENERAL
Total 10/19/2022 255.00
28477
28478 10/19/2022  Nate Volk Video Broadcasting Meeting 500.00 10 GENERAL
10/12/2022
Total 10/19/2022 500.00
28478
28479 10/19/2022  PARS Monthly Administrative Fee 400.00 10 GENERAL
Period ending 8/31/22
Total 10/19/2022 400.00
28479
28480 10/19/2022 Regional Conservation MSHCP Fees Collected 3,635.00 50 AGENCY
Authority August 2022
Total 10/19/2022 3,635.00
28480
28481 10/19/2022  RIVERSIDE COUNTY Dispatch Services FY 21/22 55,871.70 10 GENERAL
FIRE DEPT Qtr 3 & 4 Combined
28481 10/19/2022  RIVERSIDE COUNTY FY 21/22 Q4 -Fire Protection 291.61 10 GENERAL
FIRE DEPT Services

Date: 11/1208Z9221E1% Council Agenda

Page20"



City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 10/1/2022 Through 10/31/2022

Matching

Check Document Check Fund Fund Short

Number Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code Title

Total 10/19/2022 56,163.31

28481

28482 10/19/2022  COUNTY OF SLF Costs August 2022 2,186.67 20 GAS TAX
RIVERSIDE-TLMA

Total 10/19/2022 2,186.67

28482

28483 10/19/2022  Riverside County FY 22-23 Property Taxes for 1,298.24 60 ENTERPR...
Treasurer - Tax Collector 31542 RRCR 1st Installment FUND

Total 10/19/2022 1,298.24

28483

28484 10/19/2022  Special District Risk Dental and Vision Insurance 1,300.15 10 GENERAL
Management Authority Novemebr 2022

Total 10/19/2022 1,300.15

28484

28485 10/19/2022  Syntech Group Monthly IT Services 2,000.00 10 GENERAL

10/1/2022-10/31/2022

Total 10/19/2022 2,000.00

28485

28486 10/19/2022  Charter Communications ~ FD TV and Internet 29441 10 GENERAL

10/10/22-11/9/22

Total 10/19/2022 294 .41

28486

28487 10/19/2022  Toshiba Financial Monthly Copier Lease 101.82 10 GENERAL
Services November 2022

Total 10/19/2022 101.82

28487

EFT616 SOUTHERN Electricity for Traffic Signals 24970 20 GAS TAX
CALIFORNIA EDISON  8/15/2022 to 9/13/2022

Total 249.70

EFT616

Date: 11/112708/2922 @Yy Council Agenda

Page21'



City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 10/1/2022 Through 10/31/2022

Matching

Check Document Check Fund Fund Short

Number Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code Title

EFT617 SOUTHERN Electricity for City Hall 1,474.27 10 GENERAL
CALJFORNIA EDISON  8/15/2022 to 9/13/2022

Total 1,474.27

EFT617

EFT618 SOUTHERN Electricity for Fire Station, 1,508.15 10 GENERAL
CALJFORNIA EDISON  8/15/2022 to 9/13/2022

Total 1,508.15

EFT618

EFT619 SOUTHERN Electricity for 31520 3224 60 ENTERPR...
CALIFORNIA EDISON  Railroad Cyn. Rd. Ste. D FUND

8/19 t0 9/19

Total 32.24

EFT619

EFT620 SOUTHERN Electricity for Admin 31526 536.56 10 GENERAL
CALJFORNIA EDISON  RRCR Ste. 4; 8/19 to 9/19/22

Total 536.56

EFT620

EFT621 SOUTHERN Electricity for 31526 34.79 10 GENERAL
CALIFORNIA EDISON  Railroad Cyn. Rd. Ste. 3;

8/19 to 9/19

Total 34.79

EFT621

EFT622 SOUTHERN Electricity for Traffic Signals 12.16 20 GAS TAX
CALIFORNIA EDISON  8/19/2022 to 9/19/2022

Total 12.16

EFT622

EFT623 SOUTHERN Electricity for Traffic Signals 72.16 20 GAS TAX
CALIFORNIA EDISON  &/22/2022 to 9/20/2022

Total 72.16

EFT623

Date: 11/ /208 209221C¥% Council Agenda

Page’22*



City of Canyon Lake

Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures

From 10/1/2022 Through 10/31/2022

Matching
Check Document Check Fund Fund Short
Number Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code Title
EFT624 SOUTHERN Electricity for 31540/31542 1,070.73 60 ENTERPR...
CALIFORNIA EDISON  RRCR 8/15/2022 to FUND
9/13/2022
Total 1,070.73
EFT624
EFT625 SOUTHERN Electricity for Veteran's Park 43.08 10 GENERAL
CALIFORNIA EDISON  8/19/2022 to 9/19/2022
Total 43.08
EFT625
EFT626 Sparkletts Drinking Water for City Hall 134.23 10 GENERAL
& Admin October 2022
Total 134.23
EFT626
EFT627 ELSINORE VALLEY Water for Irrigation 1,058.95 20 GAS TAX
MUNI WATER DIS 8/29/2022 to 9/27/2022
Total 1,058.95
EFT627
EFT628 ELSINORE VALLEY Water for Fire Station 371.72 10 GENERAL
MUNI WATER DIS 8/29/2022 to 9/27/2022
Total 371.72
EFT628
EFT629 ELSINORE VALLEY Water for Rental - 31542 88.42 60 ENTERPR...
MUNI WATER DIS RRCR 8/27/2022 to FUND
9/25/2022
Total 88.42
EFT629
EFT630 ELSINORE VALLEY Water for Rental - 315420 64.69 60 ENTERPR...
MUNI WATER DIS RRCR 8/27/2022 to FUND
9/25/2022
Total 64.69
EFT630

Date: 11/ 32000202218 Council Agenda

Page23"



City of Canyon Lake
Check/Voucher Register - Council Report - Expenditures
From 10/1/2022 Through 10/31/2022

Matching
Check Document Check Fund Fund Short
Number  Date Vendor Name Transaction Description Amount Code Title
EFT631 ELSINORE VALLEY Water for City Hall, 95.19 10 GENERAL

MUNI WATER DIS 8/27/2022 to 9/25/2022

Total 95.19
EFT631 :
Report Total 132,775.16

Date: 11/ 13200} 29221C5 Council Agenda Page 24’



City of Canyon Lake

Invoices Selected for Payment - COUNCIL CHECK REPORT

Vendor ID Invoice Description Cash Required
ABI Background for Reserves 121.45
ABILA Monthly Accounting Software Subscription 190.46
10/1/22-10/31/22
Allstar Fire Helmet Shields- Reserves 211.68
Amazon Office Supplies for Fire Station 193.84
Andrew Ladeau Reserve Stipend for September 2022 50.00
ANIMAL FRIENDS Animal Control Services of August 2022 3,500.00
Animal Control Services Month of Sept 2022 3,500.00
Bankcard See Attached CC Review 0066 99.95
See Attached CC Review 0025 177.66
See Attached CC Review 0058 832.07
Brown, ] Reserve Stipend for September 2022 50.00
CA Dept of Tax and Fee  Diesel Fuel tax-Acct # 245-963712 99.00
Admin
Calley Reserve Stipend For September 2022 100.00
CL PEST Monthly Pest Control Fire Station Sept 2022 45.00
Monthly Rodent Bait Service Fire Station Sept 2022 20.00
Control Pump Landscape for Booster Station September 2022 375.00
Coppock Reserve Stipend for September 2022 100.00
Corelogic Database for Services September 2022 144.90
CPS HR Consulting Period 05/29/22-8/27/22 101.25
Curtis Repairs to SCBA Compressor 240.46
Repairs to Hurst Spreaders 478.00
Dain Auto Allowance October 2022-Dain 100.00
DATA TICKET Monthly EMS Response Fee April 2022 100.00
Code Enforcement Citation Processing April 2022 214.00
Monthly EMS Response Fee August 2022 100.00
Code Enforcement Citation Processing August 2022 333.00
DOJ Fingerprint Apps September 2022 32.00
DSA Disability & Education Fee Quarter Ended 9/30/22 28.40
GAS CO SoCalGas 8/30/22-9/29/22 17.61
Jake Stouffer Reserve Sitpend for September 2022 50.00
Jeremy Smith League of the Cities Event Parking 66.00
Auto Allowance October 2022-Smith 100.00
Johnson, Marlon CACEO Training- Text Book Reimbursement 54.96
CACEO Training Mile Reimbursement 271.25
Jonathan Sasse Reserve Stipend for September 2022 100.00
Kasey Castillo Auto Allowance October 2022-Castillo 100.00
Koopman Reserve Stipend for September 2022 100.00
Larry Greene Auto Allowance October 2022-Greene 100.00
Luksch Reserve Stipend For September 2022 100.00
Morgan Suit Reserve Stipend for September 2022 100.00
Mosqueda Reserve Stipend for September 2022 50.00
MuniServices UUT Fixed Fee Mayl6, 2022-June 30, 2022 1,272.85
Date: 10/12/22
07:23:06 PM

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

Page: 1

Page 25



Vendor ID

City of Canyon Lake

Invoices Selected for Payment - COUNCIL CHECK REPORT

Invoice Description

Cash Required

NicolasThomas
PVM

RCA

Ryan Ramos
Sanchez]
SCAG

Smith, N
STAPLES

Syntech

Time Warner
Toshiba Business
Solutions, USA
Welty

Zach Michel

ZF

Report Total

Date: 10/12/22
07:23:06 PM

UUT Fixed Fee July 2022-Sept 2022

Refund for over payment for Business License #5629

Street & Facility Maintenance 9/1/22-9/30/22
Street & Facility Maintenance 9/1/22-9/30/22
Street & Facility Maintenance 9/1/22-9/30/22
Street & Facility Maintenance 4/1/22-4/30/22
Street & Facility Maintenance 12/1/21-12/31/21
Street & Facility Maintenance 12/1/21-12/31/21
MSHCP Feees Collected for September 2022
Reserve Stipend for September 2022

Reserve Stipend for September 2022

Dues for Fiscal Year 2022-2023

Reserve Stipend for September 2022

Office Supplies

Office Supplies

Cyber Security Program 8/31/22

Monthly IT Services 7/1/2022-7/31/2022

Microsoft Subscriptions & Programs 8/1/22-8/31/22
Microsoft Subscriptions & Programs 7/1/22-7/31/22

Digital Converter for City Hall 9/22/22-10/21/22
Fire Station Monthly Copies 8/25/22-9/24/22

Auto Allowance October 2022-Welty
Reserve Stipend for September 2022
Medical Director Services July-Sept 2022

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

2,500.00
322.00
561.37

2,176.19
952.66

1,954.54
388.02
769.01

7,270.00

50.00
100.00

1,441.00
100.00
132.60
266.25

1,550.00

2,000.00

1,254.00

1,230.55

5.55
60.01

100.00
100.00

1,200.00

40,504.54

Page: 2

Page 26



City of Canyon Lake

Invoices Selected for Payment - COUNCIL CHECK REPORT

Vendor ID Invoice Description Cash Required
Allstar Fire Boots for FF/PM Smith 409.58
American Legal S-14 Folio/Internet July 2022 14.88
Bankcard See Credit Card Review 0041 4,078.43
See Credit Card Review 3081 2,738.09
BIO-TOX Blood Analysis 8/4/22 51.55
CBsC Permit Valuation July through September 2022 364.50
CL PEST Bi-Monthly Service 60.00
CPR Traning Centers CPR Traing for all Full-time Personnel 733.00
CR&R Rental Service 10/1/22-10/31/22 (31542 Railroad 185.33
Cyn Rd)
CTAIL Landscape Damage on RRCR-Plant and Tree 767.00
Replacement
DATA TICKET Code Enforcement Citation Processing September 110.00
2022
Monthly EMS Response Fee September 2022 100.00
DEPT OF CONSER Strong Motion Instrumentation & Seismic Hazard 1,139.52
July-Sept 22
Fast Signs Veterans Day Banner 296.67
Fire Smart Badges & Stickers 1,055.95
ICG Building & Safety for August 2022 4,725.00
Knox Knox Key Switch fo Canyon Club Condos 159.48
Moore R Reimbursement for Paramedic Recertification 300.00
Mr. Appliance Repairs on Ice Machine 255.00
Nate Volk Video Broadcasting Meeting 10/12/2022 500.00
PARS Monthly Administrative Fee Period ending 8/31/22 400.00
RCA MSHCP Fees Collected August 2022 3,635.00
Riv Co Fire FY 21/22 Q4 -Fire Protection Services 291.61
Dispatch Services FY 21/22 Qtr 3 & 4 Combined 55,871.70
Riv Co TLMA SLF Costs August 2022 2,186.67
Riv Co Treasurer FY 22-23 Property Taxes for 31542 RRCR 1st 1,298.24
Installment
SDRMA Dental and Vision Insurance Novemebr 2022 1,300.15
Syntech Monthly IT Services 10/1/2022-10/31/2022 2,000.00
Time Warner FD TV and Internet 10/10/22-11/9/22 294.41
Toshiba Monthly Copier Lease November 2022 101.82
Report Total 85,423.58

Date: 10/20/22
12:061'

%895%22 City Council Agenda

Page: 1

Page 27



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 28



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 29



AME N LI

m_.ﬁs” Mwumm elhey :Ag pajeseuss EE L._mz_mbim,uuwf 0099-GPE-0¥S :dUoUd seakodw3 |y 18yl @ehoidws :Ag paieiiid
dg0:v0 2202/L2/0) :pRjelsuas) s.ﬁi& HHAeHUa) Bulpusasy aweN 1si14 ‘jse :Ag pauiog
o
™
Q
(@)
N
SL'E6T'BT  91°TIT  SL'8S8E 00°8€ a._ﬂor._..
65°18€'T SE'99 is|ejoL €0°129 STET €0°128 (8°9F  STET %BA
¥£'802 ST'TH v2:1ds (TSP 0560 aal e (8'9% 05’60  1V¥OM
¥S'8vE 0999 ¥2:iLIS | ST IbP'T 52'882 8£'S59'T 87°8LE is|jejoL 05'692 S£'S0 05692 (8'9%  SL°S0 BIS
€9'PLT vZ'pS Q3N ST'TEP'T 52882 SE'20€'T LP'092 d3dXld . TH'L90'L1 99'P9T  89'£L0T - - WS
8E'9S2'9T  TT'bITE (£9%0) @seud ; 80'0SS 9€'¥0T 1 - £b'ese 1811 HITH = $S'068 00°6T (TSP (8°9%  0S'60 0H
Wy ala jwy Aed 3N Jwv QLA Jwy saxet alA¥3l Juwy ¥3 ala 33 Jwy 33 uotjanpag | JWY diA SIH Q1A Jwy ajey SIH dA) Aeq
(1) 085~ :# Juswoje)s Aed ‘Jejnfiay :Alo6a3e) “einbay :adAL (ST/0T - T0/01) Z20Z/¥1/0T tm3eq Aed TEOT# - }NeJa@ WeyI0D Weypm
€0'6PT'T 62°LS is[ejol
15°S81 556 ¥2:1as
b9 TLT 66'8 VIS - , - YETOb'T £1°59 isfe3oL prb98'ST  00°8%L S€'898 00'SE  :is|ejoL
£S'PPT 6521 103 | - - 05°9€1 - W04 Y. 08'PIS 00°'%2 - - - IS
LOPIE YT €6'SHL 80Lp) BUDIORYD | SE'LPS 91'9¢2 14 - - ¥8'%97'T €1°59 a5k ¥9'6YE’9T  00°bEL $£°898 I8'vz 00'SE o3
Y alA Jwy Aed JoN ! 3wy a1A Jury saxel ; QLA ¥3 Jwy ¥3 atA 33 Jwy 33 uorONpag | JWY QLA SIH Q1A 3wy ajey S4H dAL Aed
(1) 645- :# uswajrejs Aed ‘sejnbay :Alobo3e) “Jeinbay adAL (ST/0T - 10/01).2202/¥1/07 to3eq Aed vIT# - 3nRjeq Nuzcrcw upg
£9°000°8%  00'TBST  0T'W¥S'T 0S'8L  isjesolL
97'88L'C 00°S6 - - - 28
ST'BET'S rbpTe isjeo) ] E1'766'T SL'S9 - - - PIS
v9°pIS ov'LT ¥2:14S ST9LE’y S0°0¥T [ azas] £0'STE _isjejoL ST'TYL'OF  SLPPET  0£'9ECT 'ZE  00°69 o
£V 084’1 SL9¢L ¥JI1IS 1 Z1°885°E S0°06T 66°01Z'¢ €LTLT didxid.  68'6Tt 00°60 - - - 10
L6€°9L9 zr9e IQ3W i - - 9P'E96'T PE'E0T HIMH'  0S0SLT 00°¢S 06°£0€ TP'Z€  05°60 10H
£6'£84'SE 69'p68'T 08£0) BUPPRYD | 6L b9p'E L1981 114 P €1'8%L 00'05 00056 00°0§ g5y 09'SLT 05°60 - - - dwo)
WY aQlA jwy Aed 1oN : jwy alA Jwuy saxel aiAad3a Jwy 3 aia 33 jwy 33 uoponpaa [ HUY dlA SIH Q1A jwy 2.y S4H dAL Aeq
(1) 845~ :# Jusweleys Aed Jeinboy tAlobere) “Jejnbay adAL (s1/0T - T0/0T)ZZ0Z/¥1/0T 193eq Aed POT# - UNRJEG PIRY2[03 MEsmo
©
€5'709'66  £9'661T  /8'089'S 00°+T u_muow
LOTHO'T 00T - - - B
1516841 £9'8£0T is|e3o0L 91°zel’6 00T (98T 9T'€9  0S'b0 e
€9°560'T 6+°29 v2i1as L0°(BL'L9  £9'9T8  69°ZTE'® - - o]
TELOE'SL 99'LETY sjejo) 19°8£0't 65'852 v:ILIS 05°59€'e 00°£S £6°009 9z'€s 0560 4®
ZELIS'TL 99°(80°p 9£89) BUDDBUD | bT'bip'T 8£'78 1Q3W LLC0E'6  00°091 - - - fiyie:
00'058'¢ 00°0ST 81EL) Bupioeyd | €0'ETE'TE L1589 114 192°€9¢'6 0S'LES 0L'EPE’9 85°¥9E ¥10XLd 92'8£6'8 - vS'2UP - - 0@
WY alA vy Aed 32N i Jwy Al Iy sexel | aLA ¥3 Wy ¥3 alA 33 Iy 33 uo[INpaQ | IWY ALA SIH LA 3wy ajey SIH dAL >m

(1) £4S- :# Juswajeis Aed ‘Jejnboy (Alobaje) Jejnboy tadAlL

(ST/0T - 10/0%) ZZ0Z/V1/0T 23eq Aed. |

: N
TOT# -3inejaq efiog |pNGpY
: o

pazijeui4 :smeg jjoihey
220271104 1ejnBay Ajuuon-lwas (jjoiked

swreN ise] eydyy 915189y
(s1uauralels Aed £q) 191S139Y [[01ed

sajelg paluy]
00Y6-28G26 VO ‘@xeT UoAue)

py uoAued peoljiey 9151¢
(}inejeq) axe uohues Jo AID




G Jo g abeyq

ullepy sauay elAe)y :Ag pajesauasy
dg0:v0 2202//2/0L ‘PejeIauRD

STy

HHA Ngmbﬁ_munfy. 0099-5VE-0¥S :2UoUd

_h.e.. HHAjleRUe)

sashojdw ] Iy :eyld 9sAclduwig :Ag paiayj4
Buipuadsy awen Jsild4 Jse :Ag psuos

—
™M

a.ﬂﬁ%ﬂ

S6'9£6'86  ¥6'LSST  SO'¥PE'Y ££'28
BE'LYS 05°60 - - - LYO u
LLLSL'S8  YEI8PT 99'96T'F - €8'eL Thsb=
08'020°£1 YE'bp8 is[ejoL 8E'¥8Z'E 00°LS 6E°LYS 29°LS 05°60 10H
1€'880'1 6£°bS v2:1as 00'sZH'1 - 00'SZ - - Y103713
ze'zLe's 18°11E VO:ILIS 00°000's - - - - SnNog
65'PEY'T 69'1L 1GAW . 1p'LbS 05'60 - - - ¥3g
S6'SST'SL 16°€bL'E 8zZ¥¢) BupidayD | 85'52T’8 SL'90b 114, 02'092'9 08'SSE 02'09¢2'9 08'SS€E Suvd ' 00°SLE'T - 00°S¢T - - 0oser
WY A1A Huy Aed 19N | WUy QLA wy saxel  dlA ¥3 Uy ¥3 dalA3a My 33 uonANpPaq | WY AlA S1H Q1A MUy ey SIH dA) Aeq
(1) v8s5- :# Juowees Aed ‘sejnbay :AiobajeD “sejnbay iadAyL (ST/01 - T0/0T) ZZOZ/P1/0T imeq Aed PZT# -nejag assaspuaier >v._tmn
65°796'8Y  0S'VI9T  TS6EL'T 05'S8  isjejol
8L°pZE'T 0S'Lb - - - JeA
¥6'$91'9E £8'200°C isjejol TEL6T'T 0SSP - - - HIS
P6'£20'1C £8'288 86/£) BUPP3YD ; 2T°69EL 66'CEY :sjejo) L9E8E'TY  0S'ETyT  2I9vE'e L8°0€ 00°9¢ 93y
00'1p1’9 00°000°T 9gey) Bupdayd : 65'8€S P1°0€ v2:1as Ly'95S oser - - - 10
00°000'C 00°00T (2e6s) sbuines | 85'2£9'T $6°001 VOILIS | 28'2es’e 91'L6T £5'82H'S 99'862 :sjejoL 69'v£9'1 00°LS L2'E62 £8°0€ 05'60 0H
00°00S 00°s¢ (¥720) sbuines . 96°60£ €L°6€ I03W , 28°225'E 9T'L61 £0°6ET'E 9T'8L1 d3dXLd | 61°£Z8 05°8¢ - - - dwop
00°00S’9 - £p2h) BUPDAYD - 66°THY'y L1292 14 - - 05'682'C 0S°0Z1 ] LY'T06'T - £1°00T - - 00521
Wy alA Huy Aed 19N [ jwy Q1A nuy SoXel ; 1A ¥3 My y¥3 alA 33 Wy 33 uonPNpaq ! Wy dLA SIH 1A Wiy ey SIH dAL Aed
(1) £85- :# Juawaers Aed ‘sejnbay :AsoBaje) ‘deinbay tadAL (sT/01 - TO/0T) ZZOZ/P1/0T i3eq Aeg 0ZT# - 3nejaq uosuyor _.Mo:mz
, : 62°L10'TZ  ST'TL8 19°0£2'2 00°'9L islejoL
18'902'2 18'58C isjejol : £8'847 05°60 - - - EL
€4'622 2474 vJ:10S 1 52'290'T £9'991 8b'155°C 60222 is|ejol 98'¥92 05°60 - - - »Is
0065291 [ YATA YA sjejoL (PSLbb 0529 VLIS § S7°Z90°1 £9°991 £8'656 (57081 d3dxld pb €T - - - - [eLNER]
25'2£8'ST 421t duBWY JO SjUeg | £8°20€ 96'1¢€ 1G3N - - 65°2ET 75'9¢ HLH1  05°2Z69'6T  ST'EE8 8L°TS6'T SE'6C 05'99 93y
8v'iey - ey | 1922t 11°2491 14 - - 20°6SH’T 00°0S LSt 99°£SS 00°61 £8'847 SE'6T 05°60 0H
WY alA ey Aed 12N | jJwy Q1A y saxel | ALA ¥3 Jwy ¥3 aia 33 Y a3 ueRONPaa | WY ALA SiH Q1A Ny ey SiH dAL Aed
(1) 8%~ i# Juswslels Aed ‘JenBey :AtoBere) ‘sejnbay tadAL (st/01- 10/0T) TTOZ/HT/0T 1038Q Aed 9TT# - ineya2a paeqqny :o_.v:mm
<
1 91°85£'9T $£°886 isejo A TO'EE8’69  £9'8E0T  TL'PO6'E 00°8€ "m_Eo.wm
08°2SL Piey v2iI1aS §8'995'1 0S°€€ 9L 1SE'T vy 0582 Lo
YEBIE'Y 01°LS2 VDILIS  8b°L9T’S 89162 20°0TT'9 90°LEE is|esol . ££°000°C 0S'9% - - - v_ww
£€°266 §5°SS 103W @ 8¥°£92'S 89162 L€'y LS'E9T d3dXld. E0'889'€S  €9°'106 9€°20T'e - - TS,
£8°596'9p TE'645'T 0652) BupP=YD ; 69°£69°0T SS°EE9 14 . - - 1£°96€'T 6b°EL HLH 08°4L5'T 00°2S 65'0St Eb'LY 05'60 188
WY dia iy Aed JoN | WY ALA iy soxe] ; dlA ¥l Jwy y3 aLA 33 uoponpaq ; JWY d1A SiH ALA 3wy ajey S4H dAy ASY

(1) 185~ i# Juswajels Aed ‘dejnbey tAtobaje) ‘dejhboy adAL

juy 33

(sT/01 - T0/0T) TZ0Z/¥1/0T ta3eqd Aed

ZZT# -3INeyaQ UBPUIRY PIA

pazijeuld :snjejg jloJAed

TT0T/Y 10| Jeinbey Ajqjuop-twes :fjoiked

swe) 1se] eydry Jo1s189y
(stuowiaelS Aed Aq) 191S139Y [[018ed

sajels palur

00¥6-28G¢6 VO ‘e uoAue)
pY uoAue) peoljiey 91GLE
(inegaq) oxe uoAue) jo AjD




G jo ¢ 9beq
ulely aauay elhey :Ag pejersus

HHARAUS =

Astg L

0099-5p€-0¥S :auoUd

saakojdwy (v :48)l4 vAoldw Ag pala))id

dg0'r0 2202/L2/0| ‘PRIRIBURD L HHAjeURD Buipueosy awen 3isdl4 '1se7 :Ag papog
[
..Eo_ﬁo
ST'TL9°6 £0°0SS is|ejoL 87°505 - - - - S TE|
ST'9bL 65 T v2:10S STLEE'EE 05686 - - - 93 uﬂ
18°€€8'T 99°80T v2:1IS 6L°T11'C 00°£S 8S'8.€E 58'6€ 0S'60 1
SS'€86 78'vS 1aan ELSET'T 05°8¢ - - - asﬁ:
€€°722'vS 82°600°¢ " £6ET) Buppayd  9°L0T1'9 00°SYE 114 0¥'00p'p 1174 68°LE6'E 8p' 122 d3dXid .  TO'C6V'6 - 85'66b - - 02521
vy alA iy Aed 19N JwyY Q1A iy soxel . 1A ¥3 WY U3 ala 33 iy 33 uo132Npad ; WY alA StH alA jwy a1ey siH dAL Aeq
(1) 885~ :# Juswales Aed 4e[nbay :Ato633e) ‘Jejnbay tadAy (ST/0T - T0/0T) ZZOZ/¥T/0T :33eq Aed B6# - 3Inejag o:ﬁ:m; qny
€9'920°6LT  T8'€SL £5°6£8'8 0S'6T  :slejoL
Pe'TLE'T 00°s¢ - - - »PIS
SE'0TL'LET  18'ET9 $S'6SE'9 - - s
0v'€80°C - - - - o3y
21625 00°LS 65'196 77101 0S'60 0H
6%°'SLY'TS £€8°919°C is[ejol 00'SZh’'1 - 00°s¢ - - Y1033
09°109'1 - v2:i1as 00'S2ELT - - - - SNNOS
16° 1001 £€2°50L VD:ILIS S9°86€'1Z ZT'1S¢E 26°2LT'ST 18'bbE isjejol 00°004’S - 00°00€ - - o3ny
?9'8%L'C 0€°2€ET 103N | T0°H98°0T 0S'99 ¥2'€9L'6 6009 dIdXld . 98°LLE'V 00'8% 0T'2I0'T 22101 0001 ATWaY
TT'BLE'TIT  €6°LL8'S ¥87Z) BUDPRYD | bE'EZL'EE 0€'64L'T 114 | $9°pES0T TLP8T 89°60b'S (44214 V414 95°E6%'T - YT IET - - 02571
WY alA Juy Aed 3oN Jwy diA iy saxel | AlA ¥3 Jwy Y3 ala 33 jwy 33 uonNPaq | IV Ak S4H QLA Wy ajey SiH dAL Aeq
(T) £85- 1# Juswaleys Aed “deinboy :AloBaje) ‘JenbHay adAL (ST/01 - T0/01) TTOZ/P1/0T t93eq Aed TIT# - HNeJag uuel ._u._nﬂ,m:._u
SS'ELE'LE L6TE6 62°26L'T 05’60 :slejoL
95°£96'S 05°S12 sjejoL zEL08 00°€2 - - - J A
1201y 1261 v2:1as P8'2LT'Y 00°0TT - - - PS
L P8 OrYT 8¢ 1Y YOS LE'S9L'LT  L6TWL £0°922'1 - - s
79°0SS 66°5C 103N | ST'SET'T 00°LS 69'80% ({124 05°60 TOH
80°5+9'6Z Pb'99p’1 ¥T8L) Buppayd  6£°8S5°E 75°'821 114 i $2°059° [4%44) TZ'19€°C SE0TT d3dXld ' £L0'€£66°C - €5°LST - - 02§21
Wy alA 1wy Aed 1oN | WY Q1A iy saxel ala ¥l Wy ¥3 ala 33 Jwy 33 uopEINPaqQ : WY AlA SIH ALA Wy aley SaH dAL Aed
(1) 985- :# Juowelels Aeqd ‘4ejnboy 1Atoboje) ‘einbay tedAL (ST/0T - 10/0T) TZOZ/¥P1/0T 131eq Aed LIT# - Jnejeq ujjew T_>mx
gL
SLETE'SE 00°8bTT SE'798 00°'SE  :siejofy
01°'007'1 00'8¢ - - - u%
66°0S1'€E $0°52 s[ejoL 62'88¢'1 0S'vb - - - s
. Sb'88¢ Ly'6 ¥2IIAS ; 62'616'0€  0S°L60T S€'798 19'%C 00°S€ ofy
1T 6L8 80°€ YOILIS ; 2L°699'C PEY9 6S'8EL'T 78'9L is|ejoy SS'LET'T 00°'8€ - - - Sow_
S0°2IS 6v°CT 1Q3W : 2£'699'C YE'¥9 L9'E8E"T $1'85 d3dX1d : 6v°£65 0502 - - - aE.Wy
LT'vTP'6T 6'65L Sibv) BUPPBYD | £0°TLE'T - 114 - - 6'SE 89°81 150d T4V €0°S4T 0S'60 - - - mW_m_
iy aiA jwy Aed 19N 3wV Q1A juy sexel | QLA 3 Jwy ¥3 aia a3 Jwy 33 uonoNpaqg | WY QLA SIH QLA WY a1ey SIH dAL ASY
(1) s85- 1# uswaiess Aed ‘ejnboy tAtobaje) ‘Jejnboy iadAL (ST/01°- T0/0T) ZZOZ/P1 /0T :910Q Aed €TT# - 3nejog essalpuaie wucw
- : —C
sejels pepuf]
.
sureN 158 yd[y so1S180y 00¥6-285¢6 VO ‘oxe uohued
pazileuld :snieig |josied . Py CO>CNO UNO‘:_NN_ @ _‘m _‘m
220217110} 1enBey AlpUOW-ILIBS Hoied (s1mowIeIS Aed Ag) 191ST3Y [[o14ed ()ineyeq) exe uokue) jo AyD




YUINES

m___w_\” mmwuw_m ejhe) :Ag pajeiausg) EE ._.ﬂg_mbzm.uumﬁ 0099-SH£-0S dUoyd saahojdw] |y 48)|I4 sakojdwT Ag pass)iy
dg0:¥0 2202/22/0) paieIsuasy __w:.s. UHAeNRU2D Buipuaosy aweN isi4 ‘jseq :Ag papos

™

9]

Q

(@)

o

96'9€4'98  £1°5/0T 79'92s’'s 0560 :s1e3ol |
64'50S'T 00°9€ - - - sepn
01°£6€ 05'60 - - - V014
1S°1Z8'TT 12658 is|ejoL €5°¢95'C 0S'€S - - - IS
TEEL6 T5'19 v2:1dS 81'86Z'S9  ET'IS8  90'€TH'¥ - - vs
66'S8E'T £6'p61 v2:ilIS , S6'Tv6'6 00285 6T'509°9 00°9TH is|ej0) 90°2z6'T 00°LS ¥6'945 €409  0S'60 J0H
00°€82'T 60°18 1Q3W ' 56'568°L 00'91S 61°0S€E’S 00°0S€ vIoX1d TS'IPL'E 00°89 - - - ATWAY
9Z'110'89  Tp'1ST'% LLTT) Buppayd | 1276417 £9°'12S 414 :00°90C 00'99 00'vST'T 0099 g9.5v:  8£'S00'0T - 79'92S - - 02521
Wy aLA wy Aed 39N  Jwv LA wy saxel ' LA ¥3 EUTATE | alA 33 wy 33 uopoENpaq | JWy alA SIH ALA 3wy aey S4H dA) Aed
(1) 165~ :# 3uswajels Aed “dejnboy :A10693e) ‘seinbay todA) (s1/0T - T0/0T) ZZOZ/¥1/0T ioaeq Ard , 80T# - 3Nejag epasnes euy
67°9TH'I8  S6YSST  16'120'v €78 is|ejol
0'S9L'L9  SYESPT  T6'0BE'E - €8°CL s
A4 2414 YT L6E'T isjejol v6'SY9'Z 0048 660t 9y 05°60 OH
85568 YT by v2:1aS 00'52H'T - 00°sZ - - ¥10313
18'42€'0S £0'8€€'T isjeoL 8E'VI9Y ST'¥2T v2:ilIS 00'000'S - - - - SnNog
8L'6EF'Ly  £0'8EE'Z 9) 06184 SII9M | $S"08T'T zE'8S 1a3W S6'v02'C 0s'L¥ - - - ATWay
€0°888°'2 - MIBUD | Z8TS6'8T £p°0£0'T 114 : 9T°9b¥'s ¥9°98¢2 9T 9bH'S ¥9°98¢ Suvd.  00°SLE'C - 00°s2T - - 0osz1
WY alA wy Aed 319N | WY QLA wy soxel ! LA ¥3 wy ¥3 alA 33 wy 33 uoPNPaAQ | JWY ALA SIH dLA Jwy ajey S4H dAL Aed
(1) 065- :# WSWalers Aed Je[nbey tAI063IED ‘1ejnbaY adAL (S1/01 .- T0/01) 2ZOZ/¥T/0T taleq Aed. ZOOT# - Ynejag spnwes _u_.Eu_z

(11798 Tv'esl isieyoL

9T b 69°€T v¥2'1aS | LYEPP'ET  00°ZES 6%'122'C 00'9¢ is|eiolL
90" 06°%1 VDILIS | 92°500'T S6'$9T 69°S¥T'T 09412 :sjej0L 08'€€T 05'60 - - - 10
€0°06T €TIE 1a3w 9T'p00°T §6'S9T bp'L06 S6°6T d3dxld: BE'869'ZT  0S'€0S 08°€v6'T £2°67 05°99 o3y
(B'SEE'TT 8P bPR'T olUBWY Jo sueg | 98°ESY 65°68 14 - - ST'BEE 5949 HLTH 6 T1S 00°6T 69°£4T €£2°67 05°60 T0H
Y diA wy Aed 19N MWV QLA jwy soxel ; qiA ¥l Wy ¥3a ala 33 wy 33 uolPNpag . Wy aii SIH QLA jwy 21ey SiH dAL >w_..,.._
(1) 685~ :# wswoiels Aed ‘JejnBoy 1Al0Bo1e) ‘sejnbey :adAL (s1/0T - T0/0T) ZTZOZ/¥1/01 iv1eq Aed TEOT# - Mnejeq epeiad anﬁ@
4
LE'TEB'L9  0S°Z8IT  €8'08L'E 05'60  i5teI0F
98'99/ 0507 - - - 253
85°8L€ 0560 - - - anw
88'T€S"T 05°0L - - - V_W,
96'TrS LT 0048 £9'2706°2 - - ._m
WY ailA uuy Aed 3N | WV Q1A iy soxeL | 1A ¥3 Wy ¥3 alA 33 wwy 33 uondNpaq ‘ Wy diA SIH ALA Wy ajey SIH dAL ABY
(1) 88s- :# Juswaielg Aed ‘Jejnboy tAtobaje) ‘ejnbay 19dAL (ST/0T - T0/0T) ZZ0Z/¥1/0T io3eq Aed 86# ~3nejaq o:mu:m; _an
=
s91E)S PaNLT]
oure 152 vyd[y ISy 00¥6-285¢6 YO ‘e uohuen
pazijeuld :sneg jloihed i _UN_ CO%CNO _UNO.:_NN_ mw _‘m _‘m
Z20ZIP1/0L 1eINBaY ALUop-ISS Hjoiked (s1ududlel§ Aeg Aq) 1915139y [[01deg (ynejaq) aye uoAuen Jo Al




G jo g abed
|eW 99usy elAe) :AgQ PajeIBuUsS)
d80:+0 ZZ0Z/LZ/0L :pojRiBUsD)

Mg men

AR,

0099-Gp¢£-04G 2uUoUd
YHAjeu8D)

saafojdwg Jy a)ii4 sakojdws Ag passijig
Bulpusosy sWeN Jsiid 1587 :Ag pauos

L@Wé{ﬁ%& ,f, ") 'u O3 =

4
™
S

Y

)

20'ST1'v02

vy 6LE'TT
65°v08'81 8sTe8
1 10'08Y't -
10°2T1T -
£5°212'bT 85'128
: £0°01€'s81 98°£55'01
+.8E'862'01 68'z2S
Sb'ZZ8’'B0L  T'Ze8'TY isjeloL L I9ETE'YY Z1pes’e
1§'60€’¢E - AIBUD © £S'TTL YT 85128
$6°ZIS'SOL  T'Z8R'TH u_mo%au,uﬂ_apw_mg,m: LT'6L9'9
WY qlA wy wy

isieral jiv
‘sjejol ¥3 : .
99°668'9/

YOIVLNS. | b1°5€9'28 9L'960'Y 81'802'%
¥DIDSTVLNS | 08°0v8'6E 01:000° 16'969'SE ze' 08T

Em_z,._ 1265241 0S'€S0'T 68°€69'TT 8S'bTL
skl L9£'902'eT py'Tr9 9£'902'21T vy er9
¥DIIdS - - YO'pET' 18'88¢
VOIS - - 05'682'2 05021

1a3W: - , - w6k 89'81
CLI4 LL'8ee'ET 2,00t yS'LEE'0T $9'S1S

wy u3

aiAa3a- jwy: 33

isjejo) i
 q3dXid
VIOX1d |
Suvd
HLTH

sa!
350414V |
aLSt

uojIonpeq WY, ALA

vS'TEO'TL6  T0'8STLT  SH'BYIY'9S 99'00Z isjelol
9Z'EL9'ET ST'L6E 6L°TL6'T ST ©ooep
09'v1E'C 00'LS LT'ShY 05'60 1vond
78'89v'62 00°'589 0v'9€E9 sLer S opIs
€E'TES’BBS  98CZ08  6T'SOE'EE 99'SHT {ovs
ze82L - - : 0¥13Y
8E'9TT'L6T  06'S989  0£°L0T'0T 00'8YE 93y
9£°986 0s'12 - - 10
TE'H06'TE 00'z2L 91°'182'9 00'EET " I0H
10'828'C 008 - - ;dwod
00'SLT'v - 00's22 - NTREYE!
00'S2E'2T - - - $NNOY
vv'Tes 00°67 - - R EL
00°004's - 00°00€ - ¢ ony
01'2E9’61 0S'€2E 0z'210'1 00°01 ATWav
91:066°CY - ¥9'292' - ,,OUmﬁ
$0°529°1 002§ - - ADISTIVD
SJH QLA 3y SaH

. dAL Aeg

Aed 38N - 3wV QLA

9T - SIUBWSIELS JO #-/ 9T - 5,33 Jo #

pazileuld :SMejg (oI
TZ0e/vLioL fenbay Alyjuop-lwes :fjoiked

swre) 1se] eydyy 191s189y
(sruswaels Aed Aq) 191513 [[01Led

€8'840'Ly  ¥9'TSTT  E€E'EEVT 00°zT u_Bmm

§9'2L8'T 0029 - - - o

9p°2rE 05°60 - - - vy

£0'508'9 LE'9SP is|ejol ¥8'2L0'T 0s'L€ 4] 68'2€ 0520 s

L8L1S (1T v2:10S 6L°0VI'BE  P9'6Z6  PIEIET - - 1%

ob'LES'T 08'80T v2:1IS S0°089'T 00°S 9b'ZTE 68'Z€  05°60 ._®

¥9'789 80'TY IQ3W 00°SLE'T - 00°STT - - 0258p

6T°45T4E  ST'H61'T 69T) BUPPBUD . 21990 [44-Va4 1141 ST'0LE'E 1€'202 1S°L10°E 18281 didxld,  ¥0°529'T 00°LS - - - o151
WY a1 wy Aed 38N 3wy QLA Iy saXel : dlA ¥3 wy ¥l d1A 33 wy 33 uoiINPaq | WY Q1A SiH Q1A 3wy srey SIH dA) >W?J_=
(1) 265~ 1# Juswaes Aed ‘ejnboy :Alobaged ‘sejnboy odAL (ST/0T - T0/0%) TZOZ/¥1/0T taaeq Aed 6TT# - 3nejeg plem mu:%
—S

s8)e}s papuT)

00¥6-28526 VO ‘axe uokue)
py uoAue) peoljiey 9461¢
(1ineyaQ) oxeT uokue) jo Ao




11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 35



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 36



L0 | abed
ule sausy elfe)) :Ag pajelouso 0099-Sp£-0bS ‘83UoUd sevoidwi iy 4oyl skojdw3 Ag paisylid
d60:+0 2202/22/0) PlEIBUSD YHAleUBD Buipuasy swen Jsii4 ‘1se :Ag papos
:w._oz..w
£1°552'ST 0T 16 804p) BupIRYD « 99965 11'6b 114 - - £5°8YET £L°€8 9L5% 60°99%'LT 00°69¢ SH'9T1'T 1892 00°'Sh o Q
WY QLA vy Aed 39N 3wy alA wy - soxel : LA u3 Jwy ¥3 alA 33 Jwy 33 uowoNpaq | 3wy aLA SiH QLA WUy aey SaH dAL heq [ O)
:xwow- i# Juewers Aed ‘4e|nbay iAlobejed ‘enboy adAL (1€/0T - 91/01) €20Z/TE/0T :03eq Aed PIT# - yneseq zonbuuz upg a
69'T£4'05  0S'999T  90°TLL'T 0568  isjejop
91'960'¢ 0S'v01 06°L0€ 1p°2€ 05°60 Jep
[ANAR] TPLE :sfejol ET'P66'] SL°59 - - - IS
£5'bbS 6862 v2:1QS ST'E65'P 00°£52 ¥8'p9b’9 6£'0VE sjejol TP'See'er  SL'0TYT  9T'E9bC 1p'2€ 00°9Z 93y
08'545°T L£°S6 YOILIS  TT'S6L°E 00°£02 $0'86€’E S0°/8T d3dXLd 68621 00°60 - - - 10
6L°LTL 0b'6€ 103W - - 08'990'¢ PE'E0T HLTH 0S5°0S4'T 0028 - - - 10H
8E'P6LLE §9°950°2 08£0) BupPayd  S£'p/9’E 95°602 L4 €1'86Z 00°0S 00°000'T 00'0S g45b 09°542 0560 - - - dwod
WY alA nuy Aed 318N ‘WY QLA ny saxel : QLA ¥3 FUTL AT ala 33 Wy 33 uoponpaq | WV aLA SIH QLA Wy ajey SIH dAL Aed
(1)-509- i# Juawajels Aed ‘Jenbay :Alobeje) ‘lejnboy tedAL (1€/0T - 9T/0T) 2Z0Z/TE/0T :@30Q Ad _POT# - 3IneJaQ. pioye]oo3 umeq
9'v6 £9°01 isjejoL
00°€€ og'e v2:10S
- - T wvoursC 00°000'¢ - 00°00€ - s|ejoL
05'ey SE'Yp 1Q3aW 00'002'T - - - - WS
8£'506'C £€'682 LPE0) Buppdayd 21'81 20'€ L3 suondNpaq oN 00°008'T - 00°00€ - - BEX
Y aLa Juy Aed 12N ; MY Q1A iy saxel | Q1A ¥3 Jwy ¥3 alA 33 wuy 33 uonINpaq | JWY ALA SiH LA 3wy ey S4H dAy Aed
(1)ip09- :# Juswmle)s Arg “tenbay 1AJoBaieD einbay adAL (1€/0T - 91/0T) ZZOZ/TE/0T :3eq Aed TZT# - YNeyaq ujeq J3juuag
059 S9°¢ :sjejoL
00°€E 0g'E v2:1aS
- - vD:LIS 00°000°¢ - 00'00€ - isjejoL
05°€Y SE'p 103 00°002'T - - - - s
05°€26'C SE'T6T 646T) Bupayd - - - LI suolPNPaQ oN 00°008'T - 00°00€ - - 93y
Wy alA nuy Aed 18N WY Q1A ny saxel : alA d3 nuy ¥3 qalA 3z y 33 uolINPaq ; JWY AlA SIH QLA jwy ey SiH dAg Aed
:vwnow- i# jJuswejels Aed ‘aepnbey (Alobeje) ‘dejnbay tadAyL (TE/0T - 9T/0T) ZZOZ/TE/0T :23eq Aed OTT# - 3Inejoq ojj13se) Aese)
, s
0v'€8T'S0T  €9°€0ZT  £B8'089'S 00°'v0  is|ejoL W
LLTHO'T 00'61 - - - sep K
€1°0£6'8T 79'840'T is|jejoL 02'SLE'S 00°1ST $0'€5T 92'€9 00'v0 1S m
T1'8ST'T 629 v2:1ds oc'zvl'es  £9'918 62°556’p - - s 13
66'009'6L  L9'LETP is|ejol 07482 65'8bC v2LIS 05°69€’E 00°2S - - - 04 P
66'¥09'9L  £9°L80'% 9£89) BupPBYD  19°975'T L£T8 1Q3W LLLOE"S 00°097T - - - Atway 2
00000’ 00°0S71 81£4) BUDPRYD - 0Z7'866°TT L1°589 114 - 9£°006°6 0S°LES 82°804'9 85'H9€ Y10X1d 08°05b°6 - ps Y - - 02521 ﬂ_u
Y QLA Yy Aed JaN - WY A1A uy saxXel . Q1A 3 pUTL BE] alAa 33 juy 33 uonPNpaq | JWY LA SIH QLA vy s1ey SIH dA) Aed M
(1)iz09- :# unwaiess Aed ‘einbay thiobeie) einbay tedAL (1€/0T - 9T/0T) zZOZ/TE/0T ta3kq Aed ZOT# - Unejaq efiog 2nbiW w
—
salels penun |
g 5 00¥6-28526 YO ‘e uokued
pp—— SHENISET PUCTY 193810 Py uoAue) peoljiey 91GLe
2202118104 2By AUUON-Lwes Hloiked (siumdurd)elS Aed Aq) 1215139y [[oaded (3negaq) axe] uoAue) 4o AjD




“_Wsm MM”MN_ elAey :Ag pajesaus) 0099-GHE-0PS :duoyd saskojdw3 ||y :4e)1d aako|dwi :Ag passyld
d50:¥0 ZZ02/LZ/0} PRIRIaUaD yHAlleRusD Buipusosy awen jsiid ‘1527 :Ag pavos |
..m‘_o_\mw
60°6¥S'T 8z'Tbe is|ejol £8°'822 05°60 - - - umﬂb
b0'LST 1€z ¥2:10S | 0L°6VT'T St'/81 6E°L64'T 16'SpT isjejol 92°28¢ 0S°€T ovLTT Se'6T 00'%0 xu_ﬁwu
bZ'08T'8T  pT'ITE'T isjezor 02°'82s 99°08 ¥OILIS . 0L°6¥2'T Sv'L8T 92°621'1 6£°697 d3dX.d ; P ETT - - - - oulL3
9L'8SL'LT  pTITET olaWY Jo ueq | £8°8EE 00°9¢ 1Q3W - - TT°65T 25'92 HLTH.  €5'¥80'2¢  S9'v16 £0°26E'C SE'6T 05°'18 Sh=
8v' T - P 2O'STY'T T€°86T 14 - - 20°60S°'T 00°0S L5p 99455 0067 - - - T0H
WY aLA wy Aed 39N - Jwv LA wy saXxeL a1A Y3 Jwv ¥3 aiA 33 wy 33 uodNpaq | WY alA SIH ALA 3wy ey S4H dAL Aed
@v 0T9- :# Juawajeys Aed “seinbay :A1063je) ‘Jenbay :adAL (1£/01 - 91/01) ZZ0Z/TE/0T 3300 Aed 9ZT# - ANkJoa pieqqnH ucpueld
0S°9vL LT PE'886 isjejor TLLEL'EL  £9°9L0T  TLPO6'E 00'8€  isje3oL
v6'v6L Py ¥2:1aS 61°69€'€ 0S'TL pEZ08'T £b'Lp  00°8E sep
bh9Ls'y oT°45¢ VDILIS ' 91°655'S 89'T62 80°Lbb'9 90°LEE isjejorL €£°000'Z 05°'9v - - - »PIS
88°L¥0'T S§°SS 103W , 9T°655’S 89'162 8Z°LL6'Y £5°€92 dadxld  0p'064'S9  E9'TO6  LE'TOT'T - - ws
pI'bPS'6r  TE6LST 0652) BUPPBYD " vT'LTE'TT SS'EE9 1 - - 08'69t'T 6v°€L HLTH:  08°245°2 00°LS - - - 10H
WY alA Jwy Aed 39N | 1LV AL1A Jwy soxel ALA Y3 Jwy 3 aiA 33 wy 33 uonRINPaQ | WY ALA S4H QLA 3wy ajey SIH dAL Aeq
(1) 609- :# Juswajeis Aed ‘tejnboy :A106a3e) ‘1einbay :adAL (T€/0T - 9T/0T) ZZ0Z/TE/0T :03eq Aed TTT# - UneyaqQ USpUlEH piaeq
05'9Z S9°L isjejorL
00°€E og'e ¥2:1GS
- - v2:1IS 00°000'¢ - 00°00€ - isjejo)
0s'EP SEv 103w 00°00Z'7 - - - - s
05°€26'2 SE'Z6T 890T) BuppPaYD - - JAE] suonanpag oN 00°008'1 - 00°00€ - - REK|
WY alA iy Aed 39N 3wV QLA Jwy soxel  dlA ¥3 Wy 3 alA 33 wy 33 uoRINPIQ ' WY ALA SIH ALA Wy ajey S4H dAL Aed
(1) 809- i3 Juswayeys Aed ‘1ejnbay (Alobaje) ‘seinbay 1adAL (T£/0T - 9T1/0%) TZOZ/1E/0OT :93eQ Aed €0T# - 3NeJ2Q dudald Auseq
05'ZST'€EL 91'212 SL'8SB'E - isjejol
SE'TIT 94622 isjejo) €0°729 ST'ET - - - 2BA
67'65C ST'TP ¥DiIAS 0§°62L'T ST'887 90°'pET'T 82°845 isteyor LT Shy 05°60 - - - LvOT4
pS'z0P 00'vS vDILIS © 05'624'T S2'882 78'295'T (p'092 d3dXLd 05'692 SL'S0 - - - pEDS
88'8T€ ST'YS 1Q3W - - YT TLY 18417 HIWH® 9T'926'0T  99'%91 SL'8S8'C - - s
60°£0€'6T 1£°050'E (£9¥0) @seYD . p1'0E9 9£°08 14 - - 00002 00°002 a5y pS°068 00°61 - - - 1ad
WY alA Jwy Aed 19N 3wV dlA wy soxel . dlA ¥3 Jwy u3 alaA3a jwy 33 uouonpad WY alA SiH QLA Jwy ajey S4H dAL >mm
(¥) £09- :# Juswalers Aed ‘sejnboy :Alobaje) ‘Jenbay tadAL (T€/0T - 91/0%) ZZ0Z/TE/07 1932q Aed TEOT# - ANeJ2Q weyson En___zmmv
2
1S9°0vZ'T 79'16 isjelol 3
6LL6T 8z'et ¥2'1aS O
89587 P0'PT VOIS - - £0°S8Y'T €L'€8 is|eoL 68°086'¢T  00°€6¢ SPOTT'T 00°st "m_ﬂom,
z£'092 61°9T QW - - 0S°9€T1 - 150d 14V 08°'p1S 00'+T - - - ARG
WY alA Jwy Aed 39N : JWY ALA wy saxel | LA ¥3 Jwy ¥3 alA 33 jwy 33 uonoNpaq / WY A1 SIH QLA wy ey SIH dAL >m
(1) 909- :# Juswaieys Aed ‘seinboy :Alobaje) ‘aenbay iadAL (T€/0% - 91/01) 220Z/1€/01 123eq Aed PIT# -3nejoq zenbpiug :_w
=
$9je}S pajun
owrgy 19e eyd[y 1015180 00¥6-.85¢6 VO '®xeT] uokuen
pazijeuly :snejs [|oJAey . P CO>CNO PEOJIEY 91Gl¢E
2202/1.£/01 JenBay Alyjuoiy-lwes :1oiked AWHﬂQEQHNHm %.&aH %MV h@ﬂ@%@ﬂﬂ MMO.H%.&aH C_jmuaﬂv e CO>CNO jo \G_O




w__ﬁ_\m mmmm”_x e|fe)] :Ag pajessusgy 0099-SPE-0PS :2uoyd saahojdw3 ||v :4e}1d 9akodwz :Ag paie: u\ir
ds0:v0 2202/22/01 :palelauss HHAJes3UaD Buipuadsy awep 1sil4 ‘JseT :Ag paLos
Q)
--21010Y)
8L°6L1'CE 04'pES‘T pz8L) BUBPAUD TT'656'E £8°00b 114 - - S6°0TT S6°0T1T HATH L0°€66'C - - - - SmNAG
WY QLA vy Aed 39N WV AlA Jwy saxel : QLA ¥3 Jwv ua ala 33 Juy 33 uolONPaQ | WY ALA SIH QLA Wy ajey S4H dAL kedD)
(1) p19- :# Jusweels Aed ue|nbay :At06a3e) Lie|nboy :adAL (TE/0T - 9T/0T) 2ZOZ/TE/0T i33eq Aed LTT# - INE12Q ulew elACD
S1°867'9€  00°88¢T 0v'v86 00'0v :s|ejol
01°001°T 00°8¢€ - - - sep
0L181°¢ TL°0€ s|eyoL 62°882'1 0S'tvb - - - RES
87'66E £8°01 v2:1aS 69'€06'TE  0G'LETT 0t'v86 1942 00°0¥% 93y
£0°588 19'§ ¥DILIS STEPL'T €5'€L [ %434 £1°S8 s|ejor SSTET'T 00'8¢ - - - I0H
TE'928 LTt I03W - ST'EPL'T £5'€L z1osy’s Sp'99 d3dxid 60°€6S 05°02 - - - dwod
££'762'0€ 95'898 SLbp) BubpPRYD £0°TLE'T - 14 - - 09°€LE 89°'8T 350d 1Y £0'S42 0S'60 - - - Y3g
WY ALA ny Aed 19N - WY ALlA juy saxel . dlA ¥3 v ¥3 arA 3z Juy 33 uopdnpaq  IWY ALA SIH QLA Wy ajey SIH dAL Aed
(1) £19- 1# Wwawayels Aed “aeinBay 1A10683e) LEnBay tadAL (TE€/0T - 9T/0T) TZOZ/TE/OT t®3Rq ARd €TT# - Unejag assaipuatel Apuln
00'T88°60T  £T'0P9T S0'bPe’y ££'78 isjejoL
6£°LYS 05'60 - - - LYOTd
78°T05'06  LTPIST  SO'vvi'v - £€'28 s
T1°598°LT ZEPH8 isjeyoL 8E'¥8Z'E 00°LS - - - I0H
6921’1 8E'YS vi1aS | 00°00S'T - 00°S¢Z - - 10313
£8'E8S'9 1S'TIE vI1IS 00°000°S - - - - SNNOH
LT°908°T 89'TL 1Q3W 1P LYS 05'60 - - - y3g
88°668'8L E6'EPL'E 8ZbL) BuPdBYD  ££°2£9'8 SL'90p 114 00°9TT'2 08'SSE 00°9TT'L 08'SS€E Syvd!  00°00S'C - 00°'52T - - 02821
Wy alA jwy Aed 19N 1Y ALA jwy saxel ; AlA ¥3 Jwy ¥3 aiA 33 Jwy 33 uoronpaa | JWy aLA SIH Q1A 3wy ajey SIH dAL Aed
(1) ZT9- 1# JuswWalEs Aed ‘1ejnbay :Al0631eD ‘iejnboy tadAL (TE/OT - 9T/0T) ZZ0Z/TE/0T @kq Aed YTTI# - Unejeq assalpusieq Asayec
PR'8OP'TS 050691  ST'9PP'Z 00’9, is|eiol
8L VTE'T 0S¢y - - - 2ep
90°'166'LE 21'928'T s|ejoL L6 0S'SP - - - bl
90°52L'12 TI'10L 86LE) BupBYD  6E°0TL L LTTPE isjejoL 6L'6TL'cy  0G'66¥1  Z1'9pE‘T £8'0E 00°'9L 93y
00'Tp1'L 00°000'T 9E2PH) BupdayD ¢ 05595 16°9¢ v2:1dS L'95S 0S¢t - - - 1g
00°001'C 00'001 (ze6s) sbuines - Ly pSL'T 68'9L vDilIS 80'869'€ 9z'SLT 6£°L0L'S 98'842 :sjejol 69'0L9'T 00'LS - - - ._om
00°s2S 00°s¢ (pT20) sbuines  g€p'SbL LY'SE I03W 80°869'¢ 97'sLT 6€°L62'E 9€'8ST d3dXLid 6T'€Z8 05°8¢ - - - anMJ
00'008°9 - EbZy) BupPRYD : 66°HH9'y 00202 i - - 00°0T#°2 05'021 [5e) 09°200'2 - £1°00T - - 005&:
Uy QLA wy Aed J2N Jwvy QlA iy SaXeL ' d1A Y3 Ny ¥3 aLA 33 Jwy 33 uopdNpag | WY alA SIH QLA 3wy ajey S4H dAL >mm
(1) TT9- i# Jualuagels Aed ‘tenbay :Alo6aje) aeinbay tadAL (TE/0T -~ 9T/0T) TTOZ/TE/OT :@3eq Aed 0ZT# -3InejaQg uosuyor :o.k@
=
=
TL9T58'€T S9°956 £v'605°C 05'S8  is|R0Ly
MUY QLA yy Aed 19N Jwy QLA nuy soxel  QlA¥3 Wy ¥l alA 33 Jwy 33 uopdNpaq | WY alA SJH AlA 3wy ajey SJH dAL >&.
Ac 019- i# Juswaels Aed ‘aejnbay A1obajed ‘Jejnbay edAL (Te/0T - 9T/0T) ZTTOT/TE/OT :23eq Aed 9TT# - ANejeq pleqqny :ou:m.m
=
$8JElS pPaliun
suren 1e eydpy 1015150} 00628526 YO ‘@xeT] uokued
pazijeutd :sMejg [[oIAed . Py CO\ACNO UNO.___NK 9iGlE
: (s1uduralels Aed Aq) 1915139y [[o1ed (3nejaq) 8xe uoAuen Jo A

2ZOZ/LE/0L Jenbay AlUiuop-Iwas (jjoiled




240 ¢ abed
utepy asusy ejie) :Ag pajelsusn)

HH Al ,w,%_mwuy

RS

0099-5P€-0pS ‘2UOUd

saako|dw3 ||y a4 9akoidwg :Ag pasaipd

de0:t0 2202/22/0) (pajRIaUID) P UHA|leUsD Suipuaosy aweN 1sJi4 '1sen :Ag pauos
o
-.m._ozﬂ-
01'S6 v0°12 ¥DILIS - S6°061'T 69°981 €0'C8P'T PE'9ET islejolL 89°'£L59 0s'ze 89'£59 £7°6T 0s'ze ﬁ&cﬂ
62°522 92'SE 103W ; S6°06T'T 69°981 €1°920'1 69'891 d3dXLd 18'980°v1 00°1SS £p'88E'T £2'62 0S'LY wuﬁu
66'76E'ET z1'650'2 SUBWY Joued  £5'bLS £9°021 14 - - 06'S0b $9°L9 HLIH 6v°T1S 00'61 - - - JOD|
WY dlA nuy Aed 312N | 3wy AlA Hnuy soxel ' Q1A ¥3 FUTTAE] ala 33 Jwy 33 uonPNPaq | WY AdlA SIH AQlA 3wy ey SiH dAL Aed
(¥) £19- :# Jusweiels Aed ‘1einbay :A10693e) “1enbay :adAL (1€/0T - 97/0T) ZZOZ/TE/OT :o1eq Aed TEOT# - Hneyaq epssad Yraqezis
02'C19'1L 0S°'281T £8'08L'€ - :s|ejof
88'992 0502 - - - Sep
85'8LE 0S'60 - - - Lvo4
88'1£5°C 05704 - - - IS
12°€28°02 00°LS S7'182'¢ - - s
zz'1ee'on £0°0SS isjejo L 82'50S - - - - oYLy
£L'L8¢ 85'Tp v2:1ds ST'LEE’EE 0S'6E6 - - - oy
LY'ZPE'T 99°'801 v2iLIS 6411’ 00°LS - - - TOH
8£'8€0'T £8'vS 103N €L'SET'T 05°82 - - - dwo)
19°1£2748 82°600°E L6ET) BUDPRYD - $9°CSH'Y 00°SbE L4 1S°Sv9'p 11°Sb¢ LE6ST Y 8v'12¢ d3dX.d 09°'166'6 - 85661 - - [e]14¢
WY ALA awy Aed 19N ! 3wy Q1A nuy saxel , alA ¥3 Yy ¥3 ala 33 Jwy 33 uondNpPaq - WY dlA SAH QLA 3wy ajey SaH dAL Aed
hU 919~ :# jJudwaie)s Aed ‘dejnbay Ai0Bajes ‘uejnbay iadAL (t€/01 - 9T/0T) TZOZ/1E/0T 030Q ARd 86# - Iineaq ouezuep |1qny
0Z2'998°£8T  18'88L £5°6£8'8 00'SE  :s|ejolL
PETLET 00°ST - - - MIS
86'015°ZPT  18°€T9 £9°06L' - - s
0v°€80°C - - - - EE
z1°625'S 00°£S - - - 10H
96'SZ1'pS LY7059°2 isjejoL 00°00S°T - 00°'S¢L - - 103713
09°'109'1T - v2:1as 00'SZELT - - - - SNNOY
6TETT'PI 8ETTL VIS 18'2s2'Te 91'pS8 $9'LSP’ST 2L P8T is|ejoL 00°000'9 - 00°00€ - - oy
07°688°C 95'0%1T [QIW - 10'598°01 - $2'£9L'6 - d3dX.d 95'026'L 00°€8 0L2pS'E [4A 10): 00°'SE  AlWav
092828711  8£'406°S 8zT) Bupppayd - £8°1zs’se €5°86L'T 114 . 08'88€'TT 9T'4S8 0p'v69'S TLY8T 9LSh 08'v29't - vT'IET - - 0Js21
Ny dlA jwuy Aed 19N JuY QLA jwy saxel . 1A Y3 Hy ¥y ala 33 My 33 uonaNpaq Wy dla SiH LA Wy aey S4H dAlL Aeg
(1) §T9- :# Juswajels Aeq “tejnbay :Aobejes Lenbay radAL (t€/07 - 91/07) TTOZ/1E/0T 0300 ARd TIT# -1Inejoq uuep :E._Bmt._m
<
TS'SIS'TY  L6°2E6 L9 TPS'E - "m_uuoulm
2529’9 96'959 isjejo L TE£08 00°'€2 - - - ol
S¥'SSP YLLE v2:1as v8'TLT'Y 00°011 - - - sha
8609’1 £9'891 v2:LIS - 08'716'C 95'%92 (444 Y44 10'0S€ isjejoL P0'LOE'TE  L6'THL £9'198'¢E - - ._%,
LE'009 SL6Y I03W : 08'$T6'T 95'$92 £2°009'C 90°6£2 d3dXLd ST'S€T'T 00°£5 - - - 1R
WY ALA iy Aed 19N 3wy dlA Rruy saxel ; AlA ¥3 FUTAE] ala 33 Jwy 33 uoiPNpag ; WY Al SaH QLA 3wy ajey SIH dAL >@_
(¥) p19- 1# Juswajers Aed ‘Jenbey 1Alo6aje) “enboy todAL (T£/01 - 9T1/0T) TTOZ/TE/OT :93ed Aed LTT# - YNejoq UleW 2lALR
=

pazieurd SnjBS |losked
TTOT/LEIDL JeinBay Aljuon-1was (jloifed

(srudwalels Aed Aq) 1915139y [[oased

swrey 1se] eydry 191s133y

selels panun

00¥6-/8526 YO ‘oe uohuey
Py UOAUBD peol|iey 91GLE
(inejeq) exeq uoAued jo Ao




/10 g 8beg
uiley 2auay elhe)| Ag pajesauss

0099-G¥€-0v5 -auoUd

saaAojdw |y 19|13 sshojdw3 :Ag palal)id

d60:v0 2202/LZ/0L paIRIBUBD dHAleusd Buipuassy auweN Jsuid ‘|se :Ag pauog
i
4
)
(@)]
®
0592 59 s|e30L a
00°€g og'e v2:1aS
- - v2:LIS 00°000’ - 00°00€ - 1s|ejol
0s'eh SE'P 103W 00°002'T - - - - ws
0S5'€26'2 SE'262 £66€) Bupppayy - - 1 suondNpaQ ON 00°008°T - 00'00€ - - BER
WY QlA U Aed 19N | JWy QLA Huy saxey , dlA ¥3 Y ¥3 aLA 33 Jwy 33 uononpaq | Wy alA SJH d1A Jwy aey S4H dA) Aed
(1) 0Z9- :# WswWajeys Aed “IeInbay 1A10baje) Lenbay adAy (TE/0T -9T/0T) TTOT/TE/0T 123eq Aed 60T# -3INeyag yHws Awasag
8S°€96'16  SS'640T  29'92S'S Hp0  is|e3oL
6L'50S'T 00'9€ - - - dBA
0T°L6€ 05'60 - - - Y014
£4°089°CT zT 658 isfejol £5°£95'C 0S'€S - - - ANS
£8'pE0’T z5'19 v2:1dS S£°620°0L £1°158 L5°TEL'Y - - ws
26°085°C £6'6T vD:LIS : §6°€25°01 00285 61'020°2 00°'91¢ s|ejoL 90°226'C 0025 - - - 10H
0T°'$9E’T 01'18 [Q3W | S6°TTH'8 00°91S 61°00£'S 00°0S€ v1OXLd S6°600'F [A A £5'892 ££'09 r'P0 ATWQY
99'292'2¢ 0 IST'Y £LTT) Buppayd @ 88°004°L £9'128 1140072112 00°99 007021 0099 4.5t 0p'Zes’'on - 29'928 - - [ele]-T41
WY Q1A Jwy Aeqd 19N  Jwy Q1A Jwy SoXRL ; QLA Y3 wy ¥3 alA 33 jwy 33 uorINPaqQ  JWY ALA SIH QLA Wy ajey SIH dAy Aey
(1) 6T9- :# Juswaje)s Aeq ‘de|nbay :Alobaje) ‘senbay adAL (TE/0T - 9T/0T) ZZOZ/1E/0T to3eq Aed 80T# - JInejaQ epasnes euy
0Z'8EP’'S8  8T'0PIT  16'120°0 €78 is|ejon
86°188 0061 86°'188 ' 9b 00°61 oBA
66'0b 05'60 66'0b (414 05'60 LvOT4
LE'TPE'89  BL'BLPT  L6°SLTT - £€'ST ws
S5°6£0°L2 £2°L6E'T isjejol ¥6'5%9°'T 00°48 - - - TOH
28'6£6 a4 v2:1aS 00°005'T - 00°sZ - - 10313
$8°'599'2S ¥0'8EET spejoL £9°8€8'f SZ'veT vD:11S 00°000'S - - - - SnNog
w8 eLlsy #0°8EE’Z #9) obled s|lom - 58°8€T'T 1£°8S 103w 26°L2S'E 00'9Z L6'T2ET 4214 05°82 NIWNGY
£0'888°Z - PBYD * 527220702 £4°0L0'T 114 08°2€L'S £9°982 og'zeL’s #9°982 SUvd 00°005°z - 00'sZT - - oumm
WY LA 1wy Aed 19N : MY QLA wy saxel QLA Y3 Uy ¥3 alA 33 Wy 33 uoNPNPaq : WV AlA SiH Q1A Wy aey SJH dAL >%
(1) 879- 1# Juswalels Aed “ueinBay :A10Baje) leinboy todAL (T£/07 - 91/0T) ZZ0Z/1E/0T t93eq Aed TOOT# - }nejaa s|enwes PeyITH
z
© SR'TKE'ST  0S°/19 81'66b°C 05's8  :sperdy
£8'590'1 (43114 is{ejoL L0°ESH 0S°ST L0'ESt £2'62 05°ST umwu/,
16'041 SL'92 v2:1aS 08'€€2 05'60 - - - LYQTY
WY dlA jwy ARd 32N ; WV QLA Iy saxel | dlA ¥3 wy ¥3 aiA 33 jwy 33 uonPNpaq | JWy aiA SIH QLA Jwy aey sdH dAL >M_
(1) £T9- 1# JWewWDIES Ard ‘Jenbay 1A106a1eD “iejnbay 1adAL (1€/0T - 9T/0T) ZZ0Z/TE/0OT iaeq Aed TEOT# - }inejeq Epatad Weqez(
=

pazifeuld snjels floihed
2Z0T/LEI0L Jeinbay Auuon-iwas ifloiked

awe N 1se7 eydry 191s189y
(s1udwadIv)S A Aq) 191S189Y [[oased

seje)s peyn

00¥6-285¢6 VO ‘oxe uokued
Py uoAued peodjiey 91GLe
(3neyoq) axeT UoAueD Jo Aio




0 g a6l oy
w_wm% mmww_m e|fey| :Ag pajessusn ,m_r.mﬂ.w .__ﬂg_m‘ﬁe_rn 0099-SHE-0PS :auUoyd saakojdwy ||y eyjid sakojdwg :Ag parayly
d60:0 220Z/L2/0) ‘PojRISURD YHAlreRUaD Buipusosy sweN jsiid ‘jse Ag papos
N
oo
| 10°260°S 00'zL YOIVINS ; 80'€TY’L8 v6'£8L'y 0v'£pS'18 VL LY’y isjeloL To'sze'z 00°48 - - nEonmCH
; T€'LTT 08'T ¥21ISTVINS ¥9'296'1% v8'TZ1'Z vT'pT9'LE €ELT6'T d3dxdd . 00°00S’y - 00'sz72Z - I
- 0S'00€’ST 81268 1Q3W . TL'2TE'8T 05'€50°T Ly'80b'2T 85'pTL vIOXdd . - 00'szE’lz - - - m:zoDI
W 88'ETT'L6T T vLT'TT isjeoL ,08°'848'ZT vpTr9 08'8¥8°ZT i g4] SYUvd Pb'ze8 0061 - - u3g
1S0°L10'TT (ross , VOiIas | - - 08'€89'v 9L°660 HITH 0070009 - 00°00€ - oiny
vE'0E6'99L  pTiLET'Sh sjejoL {8T°S09'LY Ly'189'C VOIS i - - 00'0T%'C 0sozrT S 0Z'99L've 168 oT'vET’S 2649 AWaY
98°109'c S£262 HBYD - 05°00E'ST 81°Z68 1Q3W : - - 01'01§ 89°87 WOd TV LZ'S60'SH - T1°501°2 - 0oseT
8Y°'8ZE'E9L  68'¥YE'YY Asodaq p34a  SO'T6T'ELT 82°0€0°2 114 €6°862'pT 97'046 66'TL0'TT SP'YEL /57 p0'STYT 00°LS - - 0ISIVD
iy aia Jwy Aed 39N WV 1A Wy saxel | QLA ¥ Wy 3 alA 33 jwy 33 uopINPaq | WY QLA S4H Q1A 3wy SIH dAL Aedq
; 7z - swPwWlEIS Jo # / ZT - 5,33 40 #
Lo 191 3i0doy
05'94€ S9°LE isjejoL
00’ og'e v2:108
- - vIiLIS 00°000°€ - 00°00€ - isjejol
0S'€Y SE'p (EY 00'00Z'T - - - - s
0S'€29'7 S£'29Z £0T0) BuPBYS |, 00°00€ 00°0€ 114 Su01INPaQ ON 00°008°'T - 00°00€ - - 23y
WY dLA Juy Aed 39N | JWV ALA Wy saxel | 4lA u3 Wy u3 dia 33 Ay 33 uonINPaA | WV dlA SIH dLA wy aley SH dAL Aed
(1) €29~ :# Juswajels Aed ‘Jenboy :A10633e) ‘e|nboy :adAL (1€/0T - 9T/01) 2Z0Z/TE/0T i93eq Aed 8TT# -1nejeq Ayem sjeq
91'ZTI6'6vy  S9'98TT  ££'€€8'C 10vE  is|ejol
ve'166'C 10°96 65°8TT'T 68°2€ 10°v€ seA
9p'ZTE 05°60 - - - 1v0
0v'09T’L LE'SSY is|ezol ¥8'2L0'T 0§°LE - - - IS
€0'6¥S ST'1E v2:1as £5°0£L'6E  ¥9°6T6 vL'68S'T - - ws
0Z'9¥9'1 08'807 v2iLIS S0°089'T 00°£$ - - - T0H
ELETL 60'T¥ 1a3W 00°005'Z - 00°5ZT - - ooszt
PrISP'6E  STPET'Z 69TH) BUPIBYD pH IvE'D zE'SLT 114 1 95°2¢5'E 1€°202 TE'00Z'E 18281 d3dXLd v0'5Z9'T 00°£8 - - - JISITVD
WY alLA jwy Aed 39N | JWV A1A wy saxel : QLA ¥3 jwy ¥3 alA 33 Jwy 33 uoponpag | Wy alA SIH QLA 3wy ey SaH dA) Aeg;
(1) zz9- 1# WaweIeIs ARg “teinbay :Aiobaie) “Jeinboy iadAL (1€/0T - 9T/0T) zzoZ/1E/0T 23ea Aeg - 6TT# - }nejaq plem >m__mm
<
§9°L 592 is|ejoL m
0€'E og'e v2:1aS 3
- - vo:iLIS O
Se'y SE'Y 1Q3N 2]
SE'T6T SE'T6T PRy - - 114 suoiNpag oN 00°00€ - 00°00€ - - wm%
WY aLA Y Aed 32N | JWV QLA Y sexel  dLA ¥3 Jwy ¥3 alA33 jwy 33 uoRINpad | JWV 1A SIH AlA Jwy aey SIH dAL >@_
SJ 9bZ9E00Y 14 "IuiS Aed ‘Jeinboay tadAL (T£/0T - 9T/0T) ZZ0OZ/TE/0T t23eq Aed E€E0T# - 3NeJ3Q AdaL x._mw
=)
$8jelS pPapuNn
owreN 1597 eqd[y 1035180 0076-28526 VO ‘@)e uokuen
pazieuls smiEis [osed : pY uoAue) peodjied 91G1L€
2202/1€/01 J8INBax AlUOW-1WBS ‘[ohed (s1udwdels Aeg £Ag) 101sT0Y [jo1led (1inela() exe uoAuen jo AN




L)o / abed
uifey sausy ejfey| :Ag pajelaueg

0099-6¥€-0v5 duoUd

saahojdw3 ||y 9|4 2afojdw Ag pal

umo”vo 2202142104 ‘pejeIausD) m_.;__m.::wo mEvcwuw( awen )sdi4 ‘1set:Ag uwtm
)
(@)]
®
al
Y ) ;
.\_.@Audc)ag A7) #. Uum) ) SV S\@
79°165°Sp0’T 09'SS6LT 8065019 65269 isjeiol
i preT'sr  ozETs 88°€95'p 10°911T oBA
; 6556’2 05'99 66'0bb 05°60 1yo1d
w $6'96%'0¢ 0S'STL 21'820°1 0s'0€ % g
; 29'€0£°629  CS'0EI8  6T°TLL'bE 99'£0T ._M
i 74:173 - - - ouLTh
£6'9T2°£TZ  06'I€2L 650621 00'99¢ w%
0L'€€9'2TC 80'0PT'ZT S|E0L IV 9£'986 0S'12 - - 18
' 2867502 86°596 is|e0L U3 TE'P06°CE 00°22L - - Joﬂm,
t,:< QLA y Aed 19N | juv QLA iy soxel | LA H3 Wy ¥3 alA 33 iy 33 uopanpaq : Y QLA S4H QLA Jwy SIH dA) Av

pazijeuld :snieig (joJfed
TZOT/LE/OL JeinBay AIUON-IWAS :|[01hed

awe) 1se] eyd[y 19015189y
(s1udwaIe1S Avd Aq) 191S130Y [[01Led

sajels pajun

00¥6-/8G26 YO ‘@e uoAue)
Py UoAue) peoliiey 91GLE
{(yneyaq) exe uoAue) Jo AlD




11/09/2022 City Council Agenda P ag e 44



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 45



r—
m_wwsn MMMMN_ elAey :Ag pajesaussy WmI __ﬁgwwbﬂ;@“vnw 0099-S¥E-0FS 2uoyd saahojdw3 |y :d8))4 @akoidwg :Ag paia)iy
d9b:L0 Z20Z/L0/L | Petersuan _WVL.W_ WHARUD Buipusosy swen isiid ‘jse :Ag papog

O
-.w._oﬂu
Ly 0L £b°'ST v2:1as 00°'000°'s - - - - snngd)
8E'pSO’E yT 1L VOIS | £¥'L68'E §9'961 SL'E09'6 90°£0S sfe3oL 0T'v6 - - - - i D
29'8¢26 (433 IG3W * £b'L68'E S9°96T £b°L68'E S9°96T Suvd 00°00S - - - - 02
0v'#65'1S 29°26L'1 £T1£0) Buppayd  96°S15', £1°£81 14 - - 2E'90L'S T5°01€ HLH:  2eeso'e 05°69T - - - 058
Wy QLA wy Aed 19N | WY QLA iy saxel | QLA ¥3 Jwy Y3 alA 33 wy 33 uodNpaq - WY QLA SIH QLA Wy ajey S4H dAyL Aed
(1) T£S- # Juowajeys Aed enboay :AJoBaje) ‘lenbey odAL ‘(80/01 ~ §2/60) TZ0Z/P1/0T @3eq Aed 0TOT# - }jnejaq usaun zﬁm:ﬂmi
61'98p'€8  05°LL87  €£'p8T'E 00°€2T  islejoL
86°9T7'85  00°0T€EZ  £7T'808'C L0'ST 00°Z11 o3y
2E'86T'8T 66609 isjejol S9'ET1'81 0S'¢L6b 88'00€ 19°2€ 00°80 10
(€9°L16 z0°se v2:1as TS'10S'T 00°'09 st L0°ST 00°€0 vS14
0£'208'p L6'EST VOILIS  TLL2E'D 92°912 SLTEE'Y 92917 isjeyol  00°000°S - - - - SNNOg
19°602°1 81°9p 1Q3W ' TL°LeE’ 92°912 1L°¢Lee'y 92°912 SYvd Y0 bb1 - - - - av
T1'568'09 80°85£°C 1€02) BuBoayd  8£'897'T1T 28'bLE 114 - - ¥0°S9 - HLIH 00°00S - - - - 00521
Wy alA wy Aed 33N ' jwy QLA uy saxel | QLA ¥3 Jwy ¥3 qalA 33 iy 33 uoRdINPaQ ; JWY ALA SIH QLA 3wy ajey S4H dAL Aed
(1) 0£s- 14 uoweless Avg Lienboy :Aloberey Liejnbey adAL (80/01 - S2/60) TZ0Z/HT/0T :93eq Aed SO0T# - 3nej2q 1aH09 :_a“.::w._m
6T'IPE'Y9  0S'Th9Z  BELEL'T 00°STT isjejor
8v'8b6'9b  002LTC  09°€SST 08'z¢  00°2IT o3y
91°2SL'L 05'29¢ - - - 10
6€° 182’ b1 90°L6S is|ejoL 159521 0009 089 08'2Z 00°€0 vS14
£€°L69 11°0€ VvO'IAS | TT'v6S’E §9'961 P 180°S 0b'69T is|ejol 00'000's - - - - SnNog
06°956°C 98’111 VIS | TT'b6S'E 59°96T TT'¥65°E 59'96T SYvd ; 26'8€T - - - - rav
12616 69'6€ IQ3NW : - - 09°0€6 £5°9% 150d 14Y 09°20£'2 - 8€'STT - - 00521
9E'8L6'bY 26'0£8'T 8582) BUPPIYD 1 S6°£0L°6 ob'STH 114 .- - €£°955 229 aL5p [4WA43 00'8b - - - 0s8v1a
wy gila y Aed 18N JWyY QLA uy saxel | qlA ¥3 Jwy y3 aia 33 iy 33 uoidNpaq : JWY QLA SIH QLA 3wy ey S4H dAL Aed
(1) 695~ :# Jusweels Aeg ‘1éinbay :Alobaje) ‘Jeinbay tadAL . (80/0T - 5Z/60).220Z/p1/0T @31eq Aegd TIOT# - 3Nejaq ejalen _o_:_,m.zmz
19'8£8'e4  0T'6¥08  16'9€8'€E 00'p9T :s|e30L
L5°E6P 00°'ST - - - %>
[ehdd 00°1Z - - - Mfis
: P8°0T9'vY  00°542C  0Z'T1T'C vL61 oozit %w
9T1'96L'€T SS°€08 isje3oL Lo6°Lov's 82'0LT P0'Lb6'S PE"L6T isjejol zTeeL'st 01°899 0T'TISP'T 19'62 00'6% =®
0£°CI8 81°2h v2:1dS 06°L0b'E 82°0LT 06°L0b'€E 82041 SYVd 2eT8I'T 00°'09 €2°6S pL'6T 00°€0 w434
9v'86L'E LE'9TT v:ILIS - - 819 - OSIW:  00°000'S - - - - ,m:zmm_
9£'0L0°1 09'SS 1Q3W . - - 96°Z€ 90T HLTH | 75°L6 - - - - , @&
IV’ SET'vS 20'9EL'T £4T8) BuBBuD 9 pTT’8 ov'68b 114 . - - 00°00S°C 00°'s217 448y 09°£0E’'C - BE'STT - - OU%@H
Wy LA Jwy Aed 19N - 3wy QLA Jwy saxel ; QLA ¥3 v ¥3 [JPREE] Wy 33 uolPNpaq | JWY LA SIH QLA Wy ayey S4H dAy \ww_:
(1) 89S- 1# oweeys Aeg einboy (Alobajes Lenbay tedAL (80/0T - ST/60) ZTOZ/P1/0T toreq Aed 6001 # - 3nejeq nelg ._u_._nawm_.@_.mu
. A
ﬁ Ll
s8JelS Pyt
aure 35w Byd[y 1015180 00V6-28526 VO ‘@4eT uoAuen
pazijeuld :snjejg ||olihed . UN_ CO%CNO UNO.___NN_ @ _‘m _‘m”
Z202/bLI0L 1263y Apfeam-Ia :Hoiked (sjuawralelS Avd A) 1915139Y [[01ded (3inejeq) axe ucAues jo AN
_




€ jo g abed
Uley 99Uy elAey| :Ag pajesousn

0099-5p€-0pS ‘aucUd

saahojdw3 ||y :Jayji4 @akoidwg Ag pataili4

(A

dop:L0 220zZ/L0/LL PRlRIaURD HHAenuan Buipuassy swen isit4 ‘Jse :Ag papos
N~
4
)
(@)]
PE'669'98  0S'TEBT  SL'6LI'E 00°STT G_EHD”.
09'€99 00°¥C - - - T
$9'089 0012 - - - »ig
£€'729'09  00°bSZT  08'960'€ §9'LZ 00211 953y
0€'99T'4T 6T'TLE isjejol 9E'ZLY'LT  0S°ELY - - - 10
108926 95°'¢g v2iIdS - 95°ZP9'p 84'8€2 Sb'p2s’0T 1£'249 isjejor 10°929°'T 00'09 $6'28 §9°22 00°€0 VsS4
S£'628'C 9£°95 vDILIS 95'TH9’y 8p'8ET 95°2H9'p 8b'8ET Syvd 00°'000's - - - - SnNog
1 69°122'T £2vP 103w - - 06'vbb'Z (4414} HLH 6€'PET - - - - rav
6580029 SZ'9ET'C 19%£) BUDIOBYD  94'88T'6 $9°9€2 L4 - - 66'95b'E 19'40€ e} 00°00S - - - - 00821
iy dla Iy Aed 19N 1wy QLA juy sexel : dlA ¥3 iy ¥3 alA 33 v 33 uo1PNpaq | Y AlA SIH QLA iy aey SIH dA) Aed
(1) bLs- 1# uawerers Aed ‘tejnbay :Aloboye) ‘ae|nbay tadAL (80/0T - ST/60) TZOT/Y1/0T i83eq Aed 900T# - }nejag eddel,0 >ioEF
80°20b'¢ 02'sST is|ejor, 60°'69€'€Z  00'S90T  01°0£2'C 00°'STT :sjejoL
£6'25¢ L6'¥ v2:1QS | 0T'62Z'4T  00°Sb8 88'012'2 PL6T 00211 BREN
0p'LES £0°'6T ¥IILIS | TP TISET 92041 51091 97'0¢T :s|jejoL 6£'05€'s 00°081 - - - 10
TH'EEE 16°2¢€ 103W  ZH°TSE'T 92'0L1 ISE'T 92041 Suvd (a4 0012 zz'6S vL61 00°€0 vSTd
65°S9E’'6T  b9'p68'T ) sioh voweq pegsz'T SZ'89 14 - - 00°05¢ 00°0S :TA4 90'sL€ 0061 - - - 058+
WY ala wy Aed 19N ' JWY QLA wy saxel : dlA ¥3 v ¥3 aLA 33 Jwy 33 uoRdINPaqQ : JWyY ALA SIH QLA iy ajey S4H dA) Aeqd
(1) ££5- :# uawares Aed ‘“Ienbay :Aio6a3e) “eInbay :adAL (80/0T - SZ/60) TTOZ/¥T/0T id1eq Aed OEOT# - Ynejeq SI2AW =_o==.d
€1°'620'82  SZ'00TT  pb'L9S'T 0072, is|elolL
99'CE 05'10 - - - »18
91'6£9'C 8T°9¢T ispejol 8T'0vS’CZ  ST'080T  bb'L9S'1 LL1e 002 93y
50'90€ STLT v2:1ds 58'681 00'60 - - - VsS4
€L°€€8 80°6€ vD:iLIS 00°000°s - - - - SNNOE
[ 1d Lze 103N 2965 - - - - rav
£6'68E'ST 9T'1EY’T £564) BupdaYD  96'560°T £T°LS 114 ¢ suolPNPaqg oN 78'90¢ 05'60 - - - 058470
wy dlA jwy Aed 3oN 3wy ala jwy soxel i dLA ¥d vy u3 aia 33 wy 33 uonPNpPaa ' WY ALA SAH QLA wy ajey SH dAL Aey
(1) T45- :# Jueweens Aed ‘dejnboy :AloBee) ‘aenbay todAL (80/0T - ST/60) 2TOZ/¥1/0T i93eq Aed STOT# - }Nejod B100W :mm_
[®2)
<
85'TOV'EL  0S'TI8T  00°279'C 00'STT  is|eleL
0p'$60'T 00'8% - - - e
TLTET' P 0S°20TT 09°€SS°T 08'¢z  00°CIT u@
LLSLS'PT 0S'IEY - - - B
£p°€02'21 zeUL1g is|ejol _ 8T'€SE'T 00°09 0t'89 08'22 00°€0 &%_w_
iy ala uy Aed 19N Wy QLA wy soxel : QLA ¥3 wy ¥3 alA3a v 33 uolPNpaq | Wy dlA SIH QLA Wy ajey SIH dAL Aey

(1) 1£5- 1# JUuswajels Aed ‘Jejnboy :A4obaje) ‘dejnbay odAL

(80/0T - 52/60) ZZ0Z/P1/0T :2eq Aed

i N
OTOT# ~nejeq uea.n Eurﬁg
D

pazijeulq :snejs jjolhed
TZOZIPLIOL JeinBays Apjeap-ig :lloiked

awe) jseT eydly 1a1s13oy

(s1uswels Aed £g) 191s189Y [jo1led

=

sejels pajuTy

00¥6-285¢6 VO ‘oxe uokued
Py uoAued peoijiey 9161¢
{yneya() axe uokued Jo Ao




€ Jo € abed
uifepy 29uay ejAey :Ag pajelauas)
dgpiL0 2202/L0/ | spajelauss

1

HH }g@.@f&wuﬂy@ 0099-G¥E-0VS :oUOUd
b /

YHAlleuas

seshodwy ||y aYI4 9akojdws :Ag pasayid
Buipuaasy sweN }sii4 Jse :Ag pauos

o e

o0

4

8 ., QL
2o W) oy SR
. T ” \.F

60'TPE'STT §8'805'%
2S LEY'0T 26'9S€
00°025'C -
6629 -
£5'pS8'L 26°9S¢
LS'€06'Y0T £6'1ST'y
19'856'S 64042
SS'1Eb'SE 9£'856
£5'¥S8’L 76°9S€E
6L'T8T'90F  00°0TE'ST Jsodaq 102410 - 88°'859'S9 9¥'595'C
Wy alA nuy Aed 1N H iy ati nuy

is|jeyot |y
‘sjeol ¥3
VIIVLNS -
VDIDS VINS
IQ3W  ££'901'8 85°109'1 6 T0T'v £9'565'C
is|ejo), €£°'901'82 85°709'1 €£°901'82 85'T09'1
v2iIQS ' - - 8T'9 -
¥iIS - - 9T p1E’S 69'1bb
103W - - 66'9Et'E 19'b0€
Vol - - - 09'0€6 £5°9%
i - - ££°90€'E z2'102
soXel  alA u3 wy.y3 ata 33 july 33

G8°£8T1'S5S  S8'0€L0Z
L1LST'T 00'6¥
sT'7TT'T 05'16
isjejol by LE6'06E  SL'PTOLT
Suvd €1°298'96  09'0687
JSIW 82'506'6 00°62%
HLH 00°000°0% -
[Se} 2L'906 -
150d 14V PT'STT' -
9.5v . TLTIBT'S 00°9%C

uopoNpeg ' WY QLA

95'£50°s2

YL YIE'TT

19°68L'T
L0°LSS

L4 1%

SIH QLA Wy

00°050T is|eoL
00'896 ;

00'ss | 10

00" [ s

- SNNOY

- . cav

- 00521

- 058410

SIH n_>A,.r Aegd

6 - SIUBWIBIEIS JO # / 6 - 5,37 40 #

€301 hodey

86'€6T'8¢  00°0E€LT L2'T26' 00971 :s|e3ol
8L'841'85 00°02€2 6£'608'C 80°S¢ 00'2Z11 o3y
69°THE’9T 9L72es s|ejol 80'5£8'21 00°0S€ £9'L€ €9°L€ 00'10 10
[440:34:] ST'ee v2:1dS 60°20S'T 00°09 sT'se 80°S¢ 00°€0 VsS4
81°L62'Y 60°TET V¥D:ILIS . £6°828'p S£°91C 10'v6E'Y S£'912 isjejol 00°000'S - - - - SNNOH
LY'CET'T JA 47 103W £6°82E'Y S£°9TL £6°82E'Y SE°91¢ SYvd €0°8ET - - - - rav
87°8S¥'LS 91°€81'¢C $20b) BupPRYD  2Z'2S0°0T ST'LTE 114 - - $0°59 - HLTH 00°00S - - - - 00521
MUY ata nuy Aed 30N 3wY QLA iy saxef | ALA ¥3 WY Y3 ala 33 nuy 33 uoPNPaq ! WY AtA SIH AQlA Wy ajey S4H dAyL Aeq
(1) 945~ 13 Juswoels Avq ‘Je|nfoy tAlobaje) ‘aejnboy :adAg (80/0T - ST/60) TTOTZ/HT/0T 910q Aed 800T# - 3nejaqg m____zw Ewm
=]
o
$0°5£8°0T 89°8€9 1s[ejoL vL88L°€y  0S°2Z9T 8€°LEL'T 00'ST1 "m_,ﬂo@
89°'18% [AN v3:10s: P0'6Sb'SE 00°9SST 09'€S5'C 08'7¢ gozTT wm.w_
St IZE'C 28691 ¥2:1IS 05°0%6 0s'cz - - - 25
+6'PES 0L°6€ 1Q3W 97'688 00°6€ 0v°89 08¢t 00°€0 <m@
- - YOId ! 00°000'S - - - - SNNGS
£0°LSE'0€ 50°206'T Z8t0) BupPBUD - L6'9Eh’ L +S'61H 114 £9°955°2 S$9'96T £9°955°2 59°96T Syvd | +6'664'T - 8€'STT - - OUm.@Iw
Y atA nuy Aed 3aN Jwy QLA Huy s9XEel ' QLA ¥l 1wy y3 ata 33 nuy 33 uo1PNpaq | WY ALA SdH Q1A Wy ajey SIH dAL >w?J_s

(1) S§£S5- i# Juswajeys Aed ‘ejnboy (Aloboje) ejnbay iadAy

(80/0T - ST/60) TZOT/HT/0T :a3eq Aed

—
POOT# - }NEjaQ ZaydUEs oUaqUIng
g

pazijeuiq :snie)s |jothed
ZZ0ZIvLI0L Jeinbay Aeam-g illosked

awepN ise] eydpy 1915130y
(S1uswdelS Aed Aq) 1915189y [[014eg

00¥6-28526 VO ‘e uokuen
Py uoAued peoljiey 9164
(Inejaq) exe uoAue) jo AuD

$9Je)S pauT




11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 49



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 50



g vt
m_ﬂw_\” Mmmmmm ejfe) Ag pajeleuan QE %:ﬁ-@z@ﬁnﬂw 0099-5¥£-0p5 (3uoUd saafojdwq v eld safodw :Ag pala)|id
dibiL0o 2202/L0/LL (palelauas _,,ﬁ.{.\._ YHAleRUD Buipuaosy awen Jsiid ‘jse :Ag papos |
..wLoTO
6T 1vL [Z3°] v2:1aS 00°000'S - - - - m:z@u
zs'pee's PI'0LT VLIS | 80'P6Q'Y 59'96T 18'01T'0T 90°£05 :s|ejo) 02'v6 - - - - R
120°LL6 or'sy IQ3W : 80'F60'Y 59°96T 8060y 59961 SYvd - 00°00S - - - - 8@-
£2°490'%S €8°2L¥'C £1£0) Buppayd | 18°826°¢ S8'Z1v 147 - - ££°910'9 15'0TE HLIR 2€£'259'¢ 05°69T - - - 0587Q
WY LA juy Aed 19N  JWY QLA oy soxel  alA ¥3 Ny ¥3 aiLA 33 jwy 33 uoRINPaq | WY ALA S4H LA Jwy ajey S4H dAL Aed
(1) 965- :# swaers Aed ‘seinboy :Alobare) einbay redAL ., (zz/01 - 60/01)'TTOZ/8Z/0T :230a Aed OTOT# - UNBJSQ USBID MaYy¥ER
9£'26T'48  0S'9T0€  £T'90L'E ) 00'6€T isjeloL
12'S20°'19  00°2EPT  €£2'808'C L0'SZ 00°2TT 93y
78'686'81 05'16¢ isjejo LE'9PE'8T  0S'12S (A% 44:] 8Z'vE 00'p2 10
' 0t'856 LL°0F v2:10S PL9LS'T 00°€9 [447A £0°'52 00°€0 vS14
90°010'S 9€°202 VDILIS - L6'EVS'Y 92'912 10°609't 92'9T¢ tsjejol 00°000'S - - - - SNNOS
SE'E97'T vLES IQ3N | L6'EVS'Y 92'912 L6EPS'D 92'912 SYvd Y0 vr1 - - - - rav
€5'€65°€9 14'869°2 TE£0L) BupdaYD - 10°852'TT £9°680 14 - - #0°'S9 - HLTH 00'00S - - - - [onl-14¢
MY aLA wy Aed 12N ‘Jwy QLA ny soxe] ; QLA ¥3 Ny ¥3 aLA3a Jwy 33 uo{PNpaq - WY AlA SAH QLA Iy ajey SIH dAL Aeg
s §68- i# Juawaels Aed ‘teinfioy :Aiobsje) ‘einbay tedA) (zZ/0T - 60/01) ZzOZ/8Z /0T °1eA ARd S00T# - }neJaq 19109 Ujeuualg
L5°02¥'L9  0S°L9LZ  BEBLO'E 00°'SZT  :sleyol
80°Z0S'6y  00'bBEZ  09°€55'Z 08'zz 00211 93y
9160’8 0s'zLe 00'2HE 0T ve 00'0T 10
80°296'p1 69°089 isjejol 16'v1€'T 00°€9 0t'89 0822 00°€0 vST4
0TieL L8EE v2:14S 9£°064'€ 59961 9T'pSE’S [4: 424 isjejor 00'000'S - - - - SNNOE
S0°€0T’E ST9pT VI:ILIS F9L'06L°E 59'961 9£'064°€ 59961 Syvd 26'8E1T - - - - (av
98°€£96 S9°bb 193N - - €1°LL6 £5°9b 1504 14Y 86°2Tb'C - 8€'ST1 - - 00521
£T'VOT'Ly  LB'STT'Z 8582) Buppayd £6°€91°01 20'951 14 - - ££°985 v9°'62 L5t 25°LY6 00'8¥ - - - 058+v7Q
Wy aLa wy Aed 19N | Wy QLA wy saxel ' Q1A ¥3 Wy ¥3 aLA 33 wy 33 uondNpaq  JWY AlA SIH QLA Y ajey S4H dA) Aed
(1) v6s- :# Juswaieys Aed ‘tejnboy :Alobaje) Lenbay :adAy (zz/0T - 60/01) ZZOZ/8Z/0T (°10Q ARd TTOT# - Ynejeq eJden [ajueyieN
LT'S/6'9¢  01'88TE  95'960°C 00°6€T isjejol
(s°eeb 00'sZ - - - Bh
0Z'29€'T 00'69 99°LY6 vL6T 00'8t v_%
6€'vL8'SY  00°6£€Z  SSTE9TT vL61 00'%9 oy
LT9TY'pT 11°029 isjejoL 81°845'¢E 82°0L1 8Ev¥T’9 ¥E'L6T isjejol 96°'Z8b'0C  01'269 vL'0TL 19°6¢ 00'v2 Wc
vE'9Y8 v0'PE v2:1dS " 81'8L5'E 8201 81'845'E 82041 Syvd SS°Tv2'T 00°€9 £2'6S vL6T 00°€0 v
0T°6£6'€ #9°0v1T VLS - - 81'9 - JISIW 00°'000'S - - - - m:zW,Vm
€9°STT'T L8'vb 1g3W - - 20°S€ 90'2 HLTH 25°L6 - - - - @q
TS'v1E9S 116412 ££75) Buppays - 02'S1S’8 95°00% 114 - - 00'529° 00°5Z1 L5y 86'2Zb'C - 8€'STT - - OOR[E
Wy LA uy Aed 32N | WY dlA ny soxel - QLA ¥3 iy ¥3 alA 33 jwy 33 uoidNpaQ : WY AlA SIH ALA 3wy ajey SIH dAyL \mn_
(1) £65- 1# Juswajels Aed “1e|nbay iAlobaje) ‘seinbay iodA) (zz/0T - 60/07) TTOZ/8T /0T i31eq Aed 600T# - ynejaa nelg Lu__noﬁ_.@
=
§918)S pajun
ouren 35e7 eydqy 10351803 00Y¥6-185¢6 VO ‘@xeT uokuen
pazieuly snjejs |[olhed : UN_ CO\ACGO UmO._ .mN_ @ _‘m _\O.,
ZZ02/8Z/0L Jeinbay Apjeep-ig (orfed AW&QQEQ&N&@ ;hﬁn._“ ;hmHv h@ﬂ@mwvm :OH%NAH C_DE.GDV 9)eT CO>CNO jo \ﬁ_o




£ o ¢ abed
ullely 98uay elfey) :Ag pajelausg

-

W Aenus;

0099-SpE-0ps dUOHd

saakoldwy |y 49|13 9akojdwy Ag patel|i4

d/p:L0 2202/L0/L L (polRIBUSD YHAjeRUSD Bulpusasy aweN jsitd 1se :Ag panos
Mw_v
(<))
S8°12€'06  0S°656C 15'229°¢ 00°£2T "m_Eo._mﬂ...an
09°€99 00'¥2 - - - UB..
59'08s 00°12 - - - IS
EI'6TL'E9  00°99€7  08'960'¢ §9°/z  00°2IT PER
96'28 8v'1h 0020 10
64'0L9'pT 6105 isjejol TI'STE'LT  0S'S8% 08'65€ 86'SE 00°01 10
£2'596 £p'8€ v¥2:i1dS p0O188'% 8b'8€7 9L°96T'TT 1£'2L9 :sjejol 96'80L'T 00°'€9 S6'28 5922 00°€0 vST4
2I616'C L0768 vD:iLIS +0'188'b 8v'8EC ¥0°188'% 8v'8ET Syvd 00°'000'S - - - - SNNOY
peTLT'T $9°0S IdInW - - [AR 7444 [441:148 HLTH 6E°PET - - - - rav
0€'vSh'v9 1L'Svp'T T9bL) BUNPRYD 0T HIS'6 »9°SzE 114 - - 09'TrL'E 19°40¢ 5] 00°00S - - - - 00521
WY alA wy Aed 39N WY AlA iy saxel : dlA Y3 wy ¥3 alLA3a 3wy 33 uoidNpag Wy alA SIH AlA wy ajey S1H dAyL Aed
(1) 665~ 1# Juswaleys Aed ‘te|nbay :Alobaje) Lenbay tadAL (zZ/0T - 60/0T) TTOZT/8Z/0T :2eq Aed 900T# - }Inejaq enew,0 Ayjowyl
z9°LpT'E pS'ShL isjeyol 0S'TpL'Lz 00°1STT P 2LE' Y 00°'98T :siejoL
€0°T0€ 01’8t v2:1as 86'6EP'61T 00°£S6 88012’ PL6T 00°ZT1 93y
‘1ets2L 16'481 VOILIS - 89°T2S'T 9z°0LT 89'128'T 9z'022 :sjejol 0L'25b'L 00°152 1€2012 19'62 00°'TL 10
18'96€ 0p'£9 103W " 89°T2S'T 92'0L1 89'125°T 92'0LT SYvd 9L ELY 00'pT 2768 PL6T 00°€0 VS
o0z'TeL'ze 19°90p'E ) S18AW uoweq . Lp'pTL’T £1'9bp L4 - - 00°00€ 00'0S LSt 90°SLE 00°'6T - - - 058¥1Q
Wy ala juy Aed 1aN jwv ala wy saxel  QlA ¥3 jwy y¥3 ala 33 jwy 33 uopRINpaq WV AlA S4H AlA Wy ajey sS4y dAL Aed
(1) 865~ :# Judwajels Aed ‘dejnbay :Alobajed “enbay :adAL (Zz/01 - 60/01) TZOZ/8Z/0T :9jeq Aed 0EO0T# - 3INejoq SIdAW uoweq
8E'€45'82  §T'STTI STPPS 00'Sz  :slejolL
99'z¢ 05°10 - - - IS
p0'ES9'T 88'ET is|ejoL £p'P80'€Z  ST'SOTT ST'pbS LT 00°S2 RER]
£0'2T€ 86'S v2'1aS S8'681 00°'60 - - - VS
£L°E€8 - vD:LIS 00°000'S - - - - snNod
ETTH 06°L 1g3aw 29°6S - - - - ray
PE'026ST LE'0ES £564) BUPPRYD | 96'S60°T - L1d suoldnpaqg oN 78'90¢ 05'60 - - - 0s8v1a
WY alA 1y Aed 39N | JWV QLA iy sexel  dlA ¥3 wy ¥3 alaaa jwy 33 uopaNpaq  JWY ALA SIH QLA jwy ajey SdH dAL Agd
(1) £6S- :# uowajels Aed ‘teinbay :Alo6a3e) ‘enbey :edAL (ZZ/01 - 60/0T) TZOZ/8Z/0T :93eq Aed STOT# - 3Inejoq 2100k :mm_,
<
85'6¥0°ZL  05°956Z  00'8+9'E 00°'SbT "m_s..um
0b'$60°'T 00'8p - - - T
1€'689°6F  0S'PIZT  09°€5S'C 08'zz  00°2IT a4
LL°T09°ST  0S'I9b 00°920'T 0Z'vE 00'0€ %
pS TL82T 11'899 isjejoL 85 TZY'T 00°€9 0v'89 0822 00°€0 YRP
Wy ala juy Aed 319N jwv QlA juy saxel | alA ¥3 wy ¥3 alA 33 jwy 33 uolPNpaq ; 3WY AlA Si1H QLA vy ajey SIH dAL @
(1) 965~ 1# Juswaiers Aed ‘enbay tAiobaje) “einboy tadAL (ZZ/0T - 60/01) TZOZ/8Z/0T :33eq Aed OTOT# - UneJad UssID MUY
- =
s8lels pajun
swrep 157 eydpy o180y 00¥6-28GT6 YO ‘@jeT uoAued
pozieuy SIS foked : py uoAue) peoljied 91GL¢
2202/82/0) Jenbay Apeem-ig :floihed AWHAHQEQHNHW %.NAH %MV h@a.mm.wuﬂﬂ —HO-EANAH A:jm»_mﬂv ) 1= EO>CNO JO >.,:O




¢ jo ¢ 9beg
ujleiy 8auay ejfe)| :Ag pajeiausn)
dZp:L0 2202/L0/L L -PajessusD

0099-GPE-0bS 13UOUd
YHANERUSD

saakoidw3 ||y a4 99ko|dwz :Ag pasay
Buipusosy awep isiid Jse :Ag pauos

>t

- - 1
7 S/

/

2B U @%u ,C VAN <

C

L0
w.?@
¥

£8'806'021

59'2E8'0T
00°025°C
66'29
99'6¥2'8

: 22'9£0°011

; 9£'852'9
8005992
99'6v2'8

ysodag P2JId 21°816'89

Aed 39N ‘Jwv AlA

09'616°61
Juy

6£'20T'92P
Wy ala

84°£95'S
£1°56€
£71°56€
59°CLT'S
§SL'662
£S°8TC'T
£1°S6€
vz 65e'e
Jwuy

siejol v

TR E]
VDIVINS -
v¥2:2STVYINS
103W ' 1£'80£'6T 85°109'T $S'00L°9%
isjejor 1€'80£°62 85'109°1T 1€'80£°62
v¥DdS | - - 81'9
VOIS - - S6'SSL'8
IQ3W - - 09°1¥L’E
VoI - - £1°LL6
1140 - - LE'118°€E
soxel ' dlA Y3 Yy ¥3 alA 33

S0'665°C
85°109'1
69' Tt
19'40€
£5°9p
$9'p0¢
Wy 33

isjejol

SYvd -

JSIW
HLIH
SO

3504 1dv
945

uolpnpaq .y ata

ST°648'78S  G8'9p8TZ  0E'T169'LT 00°9TTT :sfejol
LTLSTT 00'6% - - 2BA
T6°690'€ 0S'6€T 99'LY6 00'8Y bl

PETEE'TTY  SL'U68BLT  06°E6E°0T 00'€48 RER]

99'80€°Z0T  09°T90€ £5°9¥P'S 00741 10
SE'T9Y'0T 00'ESY £0°LSS 00'v2 VsS4
00°'0000% - - - SNNoE

24906 - - - rav
82'79%'8 - $1°9%€ - 00521
zL18T's 00°9%2 - - 0s8471Q

SIH QLA Wy S4H dAL Aed
6 - SjudLIALIS Jo # [/ 6 -5,3T 40 #

ﬂv..,..,fumum

29'840'18  00'SPBT  b9'¥88'T 00'STT :sjejoL

L1'886'09  00°ZEPT  6E608'C 80°'sz 00211 93y

9£°158'91 £9°60S :s[eyoL 80°'S£8'2T  00°0SE - - - 10

ST'168 £L°TE ¥D'IAS PE'LLS'T 00°€9 ST'SL 80'ST 00'€0 vsT4

Ty T LT VDILIS CE'SPS'Y SE'9TT 9E'0T9'p SE'9TT is|jejor 00°000°S - - - - SNNOE

0L PLT'T £8'TH 103W * ZE'SPS'PY SE'9TT TE'SPS'P SE'9TT Syvd £0'8ET - - - - rav

06'979'65 29'851°¢ $20P) BUpIBYD  60°T9E°0T £8'80€ 14 - - - $0'S9 - HLTH 00°00S - - - - 0oset
Wy alA jwy Aed 19N 3wy Q1A wy saxel ' dlA Y3 v y¥3 dla 33 wy 33 uononpag Wy dli SiH QLA Wy ajey SdH dAL Aed
(1) 109- :# Juswayels Aed ‘4enbay :Ai0693e) einbay todAy (Z¢/01 - 60/01) 2202 /82/01 i31eq Aed 800T# - Unesaa stim r@
o]

0L°€15'TT 99'8€9 sjejol T1'925'9%  0S°LELT 8E°LEL'T 00'STT :sjeyol

6L'T1S 11°0€ v2:1as $9°210'8€  00°899T  09°€55'C 0g'zz 00211 uMm

LL0LY'T zE'6Y1 v2:LIS 05°0¥6 0§°LT - - - B

£9'%L9 69'6€ 103w 99°£56 00°2y 0t'89 08°22 00°€0 v§
- Vo4 00°000°s - - - - m:ngn

p1°652'CE £0'206'T 28%0) BuppaYd 15°958°L S'6TY 114 82'€SL°2 59°961 8T'€SL'T 59961 Suvd TE'STOT - 8E'STT - - ou&
WY arA Juy Aed 18N JWY Q1A Hnuy saxel ' QlA ¥3 juy ¥3 aLA 33 wy 33 uoiINpaq WY diA SJH AlA jwy ajey SIH dAy @
(1) 009~ :# Juswiajels Aed ‘deinbay :Alobaje) einbay tedAL (zz/01 - 60/07) ZZOZ/8Z/0T :a1eq Aed pOOT# - UNeJ2a ZBYduES OYIAqUITH
, 5
S9JE]S pajiun
surey 15e eydpy siBox 00Y6-285¢6 YO ‘@xeT uokued
pazjjeuld :[sniejs jjosked . UN_ CO>CNO UNO.___NN_ @rm —.m
2202/82/01 1EinBY ApesAE HHoked (siusurdel§ Aed Ag) 1015180y [[o1ded (yne1aq) axe ucAuen Jo AiD




11/09/2022 City Council Agenda P ag e 54



Credit Card Review

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 55



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 56



ITEM #

California Bank & Trust Statement dated 9-28-22

CREDITOR

The Canyon Cowboy
Ontario Airport

City Manager Office Expense
City Manager Communication
Conference/Meeting/Travel Expense

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT ACCOUNT

Working Lunch Re: LAFCO process & general plan update S 93.66 10-310-6510

Airport Parking ICMA Conference S 84.00 10-310-6510
S 177.66

Account Breakdown

10-310-6210

10-310-6310

10-310-6510 S 177.66
S 177.66

Check Figure S

Page 57



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 58



California Bank & Trust Statement dated 9-28-22

ITEM # CREDITOR
1 Tommy's Express
2 Tommy's Express
3 Tommy's Express
4

City Manager Vehicle Maintenance
Conference/Meeting/Travel Expense
Building & Safety Vehicle Maintenance
Vehicle Maintenance

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT ACCOUNT
Monthly car wash subscription September 2022 S 39.98 10-310-6415
Monthly car wash subscription September 2022 S 19.99 10-360-6415
Monthly car wash subscription September 2022 S 39.98  10-520-6415
S 99.95
Account Breakdown
10-310-6415 S 19.99
10-310-6510
10-360-6415 S 39.98
10-520-6415 S 39.98
$ 99.95

Check Figure S

Page 59



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 60



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 6 1



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 62



Ship to: Content | Footer | Weloom

dra | Melp | Contact Us | Log oub October 27, 2022

Reporting 3 o

cation  Other Orgé

Manage Reports Payroll Schedule Out-of-Class Validation Member Requests Health Reconciliation Retirement Appointr

Name: City of Canyon Lake CalPERS ID: 3813045770

Q Bavmeant Regquast Acceplance

Your request for payment has been accepted

« To generate the employer payment report, please click the print button.

« If you need to contact us with questions regarding this payment, please have your Payment Confirmation Number for faster access.

» Your payment will reflect as paid in myCalPERS if your payroll has successfully posted. Once your payment is processed any credits will roll
over to the same type of receivable in the next month, after your payroll has been processed.

= Your payment may take longer to post, depending upon your Financial Institution.

Q fFaymant Setup Tolat
| Total Payment Amount: $5,807.25

)

Q Payment Bummary

I Pavmuni BPaymeny . " Fayment Selpctad
i s e sceivable eivable ¥

[ Confirmation Authorization .?;}”Cd“d i gzigdzﬂi ZZ{:;!M Account Payment
| Mumbes ate ‘ ALript Micknamse Amount

| Employer Contribution, PEPRA, 26189, CalPERS, EFT ~ Citizens Business

% 1002230755 10/31/2022 100000016929815 10/16/2022 - 10/31/2022 Debit Bank -5402 $4,039.17
1 Employer Contribution, Classic, 1684, CalPERS, EFT - Citizens Business

! 1002230756 10/31/2022 100000016929776 10/16/2022 - 10/31/2022 Debit Bank -5402 $1,768.08

Build: v10.4.0.b Baseline: 221019_084025_v10.4_Int.9370 UID: 318

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 63



“/\-Manage Reports  Billing an

o~

1

Skip to; Content | Foater | Welcome Sandra | relp | Contact Us | Log cul  September 19, 2022

Profiie Reporting Pz

zations

Payroll Schedule Out-of-Class Validation Member Requests Health Reconciliation  Retirement Appointr

Name: City of Canyon Lake CalPERS 1ID: 3813045770

<
95 payment Beguest Accepiance

Your request for payment has been accepted

- To generate the employer payment report, please click the print button.

- If you need to contact us with questions regarding this payment, please have your Payment Confirmation Number for faster access.

« Your payment will reflect as paid in myCalPERS if your payroll has successfully posted. Once your payment is processed any credits will rolt
over to the same type of receivable in the next month, after your payroll has been processed.

« Your payment may take longer to post, depending upon your Financia! Institution.

Total Payment Amount: $15,538.68

Q Paymant Summsary

Payment Payment e i o v — Paymant Selected
Confirmation Authorization $5cewahu g:{;i:_‘.:agi; Z?;afdm Account Payment
Muymber Date P Nickname Amount
1002201593 10/01/2022 100000016938902 Health PA Billing - PERS EFT - Debit Citizens Business Bank -5402  $10,705.44

1002201594 10/01/2022 100000016938915 Health PA Billing - Non-PERS  EFT - Debit Citizens Business Bank -5402 $4,833.24

Contact Us | CalPERS Website | Privacy Policy | Conditions of Use | Accessibility | Copyright © 2022 California Public Employees’ Retirement System (CalPERS)

Buitd: v10.3,1 Baseline: 220823_110910_v10.3.1_Int.1791 UID: 318

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

Page 64



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 65



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 66



Page 67

aye7 uoAue) jo AlD

1938 YI9YD
9T°€0Z'€E ¢ suonnquiuo) [eloL

sjuedpiylied |ejol

85°T09‘T $ 8S°T09T S BEVSETTZ S s|elol
1207/9/TT  SE€9TC SE9TL ¥9'v88°C ceoz/ze/ot Ao “sifjIm
1207/67/TT  S9'96T 59961 00°779°C teoz/te/ot oMaquInH ‘zaydues
1202/9/t1  8¥'8¢C 81'8€T SL'6LT'E ceoz/te/ot Ayowi| ‘elieN,0
Teoz/1e/9 9T 0LT 97'0LT 01'0LT°C zeoe/ee/ot uowe( ‘siaAW
1202/9/t1  S9'961 G9'961 00'2279T ceoz/ze/ot Maynen .cwew
1202/62/1T  9T'91C 97'91¢ S'€88°C ceoz/ze/ot ureuualg ;mﬁow
1202/9/t1  S9'961 S9°96T 00729 ceoz/ze/ot [a1ueyIeN \m_e%m
1202/9/t1 8T 0LT 87°0LT vv'0LT'T ceoz/ze/ot Jaydoislyd \tm.ﬁ@
21eQ 4IH uoilngluo) uoingluo) sagdem a1eQ pu3 eyl um_m
soAojdw] JaAojdwg polad Aed dweN 31514 ‘Qwef

1se7 s,3uedilied



Page 68

zeoz/ig/ot
:91eQ YI3YD
88'v8Z‘T $ suonngliuoj [ejol

syuedijed |ejol
L AAE) S vrevo $ 9665958 ) siejol m
o
£9G76 L8] 2e0z/1/1 ¥9'98¢ ¥9°98¢ 16'178°e zeoz/1e/01 [PBYIIN .m_wsE@
L8516 \ 120Z/1/TT  08'SSE 08'3S¢€ SOvvL'Yy zeoz/te/ot J3r ‘a553UpUd L B
diz 8lels aleQ allH uolngluo) uoinquuoe) sagem aleqQ puj [eniu u.%
AD aaAojdwiy JaAo|dw3 polad Aed SwIeN 15414 .wEmw_

15e7 s,qued gy

11/0



FastPay

Payroll history & maintenance

Plan name
Plan number
Pay date
Pay center

Transaction type

CITY OF CANYON LAKE

0035273001

10/14/2022

CITY OF CANYON LAKE

Contribution

Submission status Processed
Participant contribution details Submission details Payment «
Payment submitter user ID kmalin

Submission date & time
Processed date
Payment type

Debit account nickname
Bank routing number
Bank account number

Debit account type

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

2022-10-13 16:22:01.556
2022-10-17 00:00:00.0
Debit ACH

Citizens Business Bank
wixrkg 4 4Q

*kxEREAGD

CHECK
Page 69



Debit ACH draft date 10/17/2022

Payment amount $801.44

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 7 O



Nationwide’

2>

Contact us at 1-877-496-1630 or NRSPlan@nationwide.com.

FastPay

Payroll detail payment submission

Plan name
Plan number
Pay Center

Submission date

CITY OF CANYON LAKE

Submiss:on iim; ”

| Pay date W

V)P.a\ymeﬁ; a’rrnour;tb ‘b
Debit YACH a?;céount
Bank routing number
Banl; éccounf number
béwsit“;é;ountytype

Debit ACH draft date

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

0035273001

CITY OF CANYON LAKE

10-11-2022

2:37:14 PM

10-14-2022
$201.22

Citizens Business Bank

****i4149

****i5402
Checking

10-14-2022

Page 71



Nationwide’

Contact us at 1-877-496-1630 or NRSPlan@nationwide.com.

FastPay

Payroll detail payment submission

Plan name CITY OF CANYONLAKE
.I;Ian number “ 00352731)31

“ Pay Center CITY OF CANYON LAKE

| .Submission date 10-27-2022

B Submission tirﬁé 9:34:58 PM
. Paydate 10_26:2022

Payment amount o $204.64

Debit ACH account

Bank routing number

Citizens Business Bank

*i***4 1 49

Bank account number

*****5402

Debit account type

Debit ACH draft date

Checking

10-31-2022

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

Page 72



Nationwide’

Contact us at 1-877-496-1630 or NRSPlan@nationwide.com.

FastPay

Payroll detail payment submission

Plan name CITY OF CANYON LAKE

Plan number 0035273001

Pay Center CITY OF CANYON LAKE

Submission date 10-27-2022

Submission time 9:42:42 PM

Pay date 10-31-2022

Payment amount $1,570.88

Debit ACH account Citizens Business Bank

Bank routing number wxerng 140

Bank account number 5402

Debit account type Checking

Debit ACH draft date 10-31-2022

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 73



Nationwide’

Contact us at 1-877-496-1630 or NRSPlan@nationwide.com.

FastPay
Payroll detail payment submission

Plan name CITY OF CANYON LAKE OBRA

Plan number 0035273002

Pay Center CITY OF CANYON LAKE OBRA

Submission date 10-27-2022

Submission time ' 9:49:07 PM

Pay date ‘ 10-31-2022

Payment amount $133.73

Debit ACH account Citizens Business Bank

Bank routing number nxakg 149

Bank account number 5402

Debit account type Checking

Debit ACH draft date 10-31-2022

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 7 4



FastPay

Payroll history & maintenance

Plan name CITY OF CANYON LAKE OBRA
Plan number 0035273002
Pay date 10/14/2022
Pay center CITY OF CANYON LAKE OBRA
Transaction type Contribution
Submission status Processed
Participant contribution details Submission details Payment
Payment submitter user ID kmalin

Submission date & time
Processed date
Payment type

Debit account nickname
Bank routing number
Bank account number

Debit account type

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

2022-10-13 16:24:45.215
2022-10-17 00:00:00.0
Debit ACH

Citizens Business Bank
*xk%444Q

whxRkEA()D

CHECK
Page 75



Debit ACH draft date 10/17/2022

Payment amount $115.13

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 7 6



Investment Reports

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 77



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 78



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 79



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 80



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 8 1



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 82



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 83



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda P ag e 84



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 85



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 86



ITEM 3

MINUTES
SPECIAL MEETING OF THE
CANYON LAKE CITY COUNCIL
Thursday, September 29, 2022

OPEN SESSION 5:00 PM

CALL TO ORDER

Mayor Smith called the meeting to order at 5:00 p.m.

FLAG SALUTE

The Flag Salute was led by City Attorney Steven Graham.

ROLL CALL

Present: Councilmember Castillo, Councilmember Dain, Mayor Pro Tem Greene,
Councilmember Welty, and Mayor Smith

APPROVAL OF THE CITY COUNCIL AGENDA

Motion and second by Mayor Pro Tem Greene/Councilmember Dain to approve the
agenda.

Motion carried 5-0, with Councilmember Castillo, Councilmember Dain, Mayor Pro
Tem Greene, Councilmember Welty, and Mayor Smith voting aye.

PUBLIC COMMENT

There were no comments.

BUSINESS ITEMS

(1) Report — Application Process and Selection for Issuance of Commercial
Cannabis Permits

Presentation by City Manager Chris Mann.
There were no public comments.

Motion and second by Councilmember Welty/Mayor Smith to receive and file the
report.

Motion carried 5-0, with Councilmember Castillo, Councilmember Dain, Mayor Pro
Tem Greene, Councilmember Welty, and Mayor Smith voting aye.

DRAFT
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 87



(2) Presentation — SoCal Therapeutics DBA The Syndicate Canyon Lake

Presentation by Rich Moline, President of SoCal Therapeutics DBA The Syndicate
Canyon Lake.

There were no public comments.

ANNOUNCEMENTS

Mayor Smith announced that the next regular City Council meeting would be on
Wednesday, October 12, 2022, at 5:00 p.m. for closed session and 6:30 p.m. for open
session.

ADJOURNMENT

The meeting was adjourned at 5:50 p.m.

Respectfully submitted,

Ana V. Sauseda, CMC
City Clerk

DRAFT
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 88



MINUTES
REGULAR MEETING OF THE
CANYON LAKE CITY COUNCIL
Wednesday, October 12, 2022

Closed Session — 5:00 p.m.
City Hall Administration Building
31526 Railroad Canyon Road, Suite 5
Canyon Lake, CA 92587

CALL TO ORDER

Mayor Smith called the meeting to order at 5:00 p.m.

ROLL CALL

Present:

Absent:

Councilmember Welty and Mayor Smith

PUBLIC COMMENTS

There were no public comments.

CLOSED SESSION

A.

CONFERENCE WITH REAL PROPERTY NEGOTIATORS — Pursuant to
Section 54956.8

Property: APN 349-290-008

Agency Negotiator: City Manager

Negotiating Parties: Jim Kipp

Under Negotiation: Price and Terms of Payment

CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL — ANTICIPATED LITIGATION —
Significant Exposure to Litigation — Pursuant to Section 54956.9(d)(2) —
1 case

CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL — INITIATION OF LITIGATION —
Pursuant to Section 54956.9 (d)(4) — 1 case

CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL — EXISTING LITIGATION —
Pursuant to paragraph (1) of subdivision (d) of Section54956.9 — Richard
Beck v. City of Canyon Lake, et al. Riverside Superior Court Case No.
CVRI2202608

The City Council entered Closed Session at 5:00 p.m.

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

DRAFT

Councilmember Castillo, Councilmember Dain, Mayor Pro Tem Greene,

Page 89



Open Session —6:30 p.m.
City Hall Council Chamber
31516 Railroad Canyon Road
Canyon Lake, CA 92587

CALL OPEN SESSION TO ORDER

Mayor Smith called the meeting to order at 6:30 p.m.

Mayor Smith called for a moment of silence in honor of the Military Personnel and First
Responders who have given the ultimate sacrifice.

INVOCATION

Invocation was led by Mayor Smith.

FLAG SALUTE

Flag Salute was led by Mayor Pro Tem Larry Greene.

ROLL CALL

Present: Councilmember Castillo, Councilmember Dain, Mayor Pro Tem Greene,
Councilmember Welty, and Mayor Smith

Absent:

CLOSED SESSION REPORT

City Attorney Graham reported that the Council added 1 additional case to Item B on the
closed session agenda by a vote of 5-0 but there was nothing to report out.

APPROVAL OF THE CITY COUNCIL AGENDA

Motion and second by Mayor Pro Tem Greene/ Councilmember Dain to approve the
agenda.

Motion carried 5-0, with Councilmember Castillo, Councilmember Dain, Mayor Pro
Tem Greene, Councilmember Welty, and Mayor Smith voting aye.

CEREMONIAL MATTERS Presentations, Awards, Proclamations

e Citizen of the Month
Mayor Smith announced that the Citizen of the Month for October was Elijah Thor. He
was unavailable to attend the meeting.

DRAFT
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 90



e Certificate of Recognition - Boy Scouts
Mayor Smith Recognized Gavin & Hayden Dalton for earning the rank of Eagle Scout.

e Recognition — Student of the Month
Councilmember Dain recognized Jayson Ceballos who was student of the month for
Temescal Canyon.

e Proclamation - CLWC
Councilmember Castillo presented Shawna Bowen and the Canyon Lake Women’s Club
with a Proclamation for the club’s 50th anniversary.

e Proclamation — Fire Prevention Week
Mayor Smith presented Chief LaTendresse with a Proclamation for Fire Prevention week.

e Presentation — Mayor Pro Tem Greene
At the September 14" City Council Meeting, Mayor Pro Tem Larry Greene announced
his resignation from the Canyon Lake City Council upon the appointment of his successor.

The following presented to Mayor Pro Tem Greene in person:

State Senator Melissa Melendez

Assemblymember Kelly Seyarto

Elsinore Valley Municipal Water District President Darcy Burke
Canyon Lake Property Owners Association President Renee Griffiths
Riverside County Sheriff's Department Lieutenant Dave Clark
Canyon Lake Fire Chief Jeff LaTendresse

The following agencies were not available to attend the meeting but sent certificates of
recognition for Mayor Pro Tem Greene:
e Supervisor Kevin Jeffries
City of Corona
City of Lake Elsinore
City of Murrieta
City of Wildomar
Regional Conservation Authority

City Manager Mann presented a plaque and street sign to Mayor Pro Tem Greene on
behalf of the City of Canyon Lake.

¢ Comments by Outgoing Council Member
Mayor Pro Tem Greene gave his outgoing Councilmember comments and received a
standing ovation from all those present.

DRAFT
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page o1



COMMUNITY REPORTS

e Elsinore Valley Municipal Water District Update - President Darcy Burke
President Darcy Burke gave an update on behalf of Elsinore Valley Municipal Water
District.

e Canyon Lake Property Owners Association Update - President Renee Griffiths
President Renee Griffiths gave an update on behalf of the Canyon Lake Property Owners
Association.

e Chamber of Commerce Update - President Jeanne O’Dell
President O’Dell was unavailable to attend the meeting.

PUBLIC SAFETY UPDATE

s Sheriff
Lieutenant Dave Clark gave an update on the statistics and answered questions from the
Council.

+ Code Enforcement
Ruby Manzano, Code Enforcement Supervisor, gave an update on the statistics and
answered questions from the Council.

s Fire
Chief Jeff LaTendresse gave an update on the statistics and answered questions from
the Council.

PUBLIC COMMENT

The following members of the public spoke:
¢ Rich Moline
e Brenda Dennstedt
e Lacy & Grant Vanderboom

CONSENT CALENDAR
(1) Waive Full Reading, Read all Ordinances by Title Only

(2) Resolution - Adoption of Resolution No. 2022-57 Approving Claims and
Demands of the City

(3) Minutes - Approval of City Council Minutes
e September 7, 2022 — Regular City Council Meeting

4) Resolution — Adoption of Resolution No. 2022-58, Approving an Amended
Service Agreement with Castaneda & Associates in the Amount of $20,000
for Preparation of Housing Element Materials

DRAFT
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 02



(5) Second Reading of Ordinance No. 223 — An Ordinance of the City Council
of the City of Canyon Lake, California, Amending Title 9: Planning and
Zoning, Chapter 9.32: Accessory Dwelling Units, 9.32.070 Square footage
of the Canyon Lake Municipal Code, to Increase the Permitted Size of
Detached Accessory Dwelling Units from 1,000 square feet to 1,200 square
feet

(6) Second Reading of Ordinance No. 224 — An Ordinance of the City Council
of the City of Canyon Lake, California, Amending Title 9: Planning and
Zoning, Article VI, Section 6.2a. R-1 Zone (One-Family Dwellings) of the
Canyon Lake Municipal Code, to Increase the Overall Building Height from
40 feet to 45 feet and Provide Street Related Building Height in Certain
Defined Instances

(7) Second Reading of Ordinance No. 225 — An Ordinance of the City Council
of the City of Canyon Lake, California, Amending Sections 2.01.010 and
2.01.020 of the Canyon Lake Municipal Code Related to the Date, Time
and Location of Meetings of the City Council

(8) Second Reading of Ordinance No. 226 — An Ordinance of the City Council
of the City of Canyon Lake, California, Adding Chapter 2.44 (Signatures) to
Title 2 of the Canyon Lake Municipal Code Regarding the Delegation of
Signing Authority and the Use of Digital Signatures

Motion and second by Mayor Pro Tem Greene/Councilmember Welty to approve
the consent calendar.

Motion carried 5-0, with Councilmember Castillo, Councilmember Dain, Mayor Pro
Tem Greene, Councilmember Welty, and Mayor Smith voting aye.

PULLED CONSENT CALENDAR ITEMS

BUSINESS ITEMS

(9) Ordinance — Introduction and First Reading of Ordinance No. 227, An Ordinance
of the City Council of the City of Canyon Lake, California, Adopting the 2022
California Fire Code amending Chapter 8.12 of the Canyon Lake Municipal
Code

Presentation by Chief LaTendresse.
There were no public comments.

Motion and second by Mayor Pro Tem Greene/Councilmember Dain to approve the
Introduction and First Reading of Ordinance No. 227.

Motion carried 5-0, with Councilmember Castillo, Councilmember Dain, Mayor Pro
Tem Greene, Councilmember Welty, and Mayor Smith voting aye.

DRAFT
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 03



(10) Ordinance — Introduction and First Reading of Ordinance No. 228, An Ordinance
of the City Council of the City of Canyon Lake California Amending Chapter 8.02
of the Canyon Lake Municipal Code, Adopting by Reference the 2022 Editions
of the California Codes (Including but Not Limited to the Green Building Code)
and Related Model Codes with Appendices and Amendments thereto and
Repealing Ordinance No. 189

Presentation by Administrative Services Director Mike Borja.
There were no public comments.

Motion and second by Councilmember Castillo/Mayor Pro Tem Greene to approve
the Introduction and First Reading of Ordinance No. 228.

Motion carried 5-0, with Councilmember Castillo, Councilmember Dain, Mayor Pro
Tem Greene, Councilmember Welty, and Mayor Smith voting aye.

Mayor Smith called for a recess at 7:56 p.m.
The meeting reconvened at 8:04 p.m.

(11) Appointment to Fill City Council Vacancy

e Applicant Interviews - Interview the Applicants recommended by the Ad
Hoc Committee
The City Council interviewed all 4 applicants in the following order:
» Mark Terry
» Josh Steeber
» Danielle Coats
> Kelly Bastman

e Public Comment - Members of the Public will be allowed no more than 3
minutes to comment on this item only

There were no comments from the public.

¢ Appointment to Fill City Council Vacancy - Select a Qualified Applicant
to fill the City Council Vacancy for the term expiring in December 2024

Mayor Pro Tem Greene stepped away from the dais at 9:43 p.m. and returned at 9:45
p.m.

Mayor Smith asked the members of the Council for a motion and second appointing one
of the applicants to the City Council.

Motion and second by Mayor Pro Tem Greene/Councilmember Welty to appoint
Kelly Bastman.

Motion failed 2-3, with Mayor Pro Tem Greene and Councilmember Welty voting
aye and Councilmember Castillo, Councilmember Dain, and Mayor Smith voting
no.

DRAFT
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda page o4



Motion by Mayor Pro Tem Greene to appoint Josh Steeber.

Motion failed due to a lack of a second.
Motion and second by Councilmembers Castillo/Dain to appoint Mark Terry.
Motion carried 4-1, with Councilmember Castillo, Councilmember Dain,

Councilmember Welty and Mayor Smith voting aye and Mayor Pro Tem Greene
voting no.

e Oath of Office — Swear-in Newly Appointed Councilmember

Newly appointed Councilmember Mark Terry was sworn in by City Clerk Ana Sauseda.

CITY MANAGER COMMENTS

City Manager Mann announced the State of the City would be held on Thursday, October
27, 2022.

COMMITTEE AND COUNCIL REPORTS/COMMENTS

e COUNCILMEMBER CASTILLO

Councilmember Castillo congratulated newly appointed Councilmember Mark Terry. She
was very excited to announce that Canyon Lake would be hosting the SW Riverside
County Women's Elected Leaders Collaborative for a luncheon on Thursday, October
13™. She announced that the Veterans Day event would be held on Friday, November
11, Lastly, she expressed her excitement of the upcoming Canyon Lake State of the City
event.

e COUNCILMEMBER DAIN

Councilmember Dain thanked the applicants for taking the time to apply to fill the vacancy.
She discussed the Animal Friends of the Valleys semiannual board meeting. Lastly, she
spoke about participating in the 15t annual League of California Cities Cornhole
Tournament.

e COUNCILMEMBER WELTY

Councilmember Welty also thanked the applicants and encouraged them to stay involved
with the City. He spoke about the increased complaints regarding mosquitos and gave
the phone number for the Northwest Mosquito & Vector Control District. He encouraged
the public to vote. Lastly, he gave a brief update from WRCOG

e COUNCILMEMBER TERRY
He had no further comments.

DRAFT
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page o5



¢ MAYOR SMITH
He congratulated Councilmember Terry on his appointment. In closing, he spoke highly
about his time working on the Council with Larry Greene.

ANNOUNCEMENTS

Mayor Smith announced that the next City Council meeting would take place on
Wednesday, November 9th at 5:00 p.m. for closed session and 6:30 p.m. for open
session.

ADJOURNMENT

Mayor Smith adjourned the meeting at 10:01 p.m.

Respectfully submitted,

Ana V. Sauseda, CMC
City Clerk

DRAFT
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 96



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 97



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 98



ATTACHMENT 1

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 99



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 100



ORDINANCE NO. 227

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CANYON LAKE,
ADOPTING THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE AS AMENDED AS CHAPTER 8.12
OF THE CANYON LAKE MUNICIPAL CODE

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CANYON LAKE DOES HEREBY ORDAIN AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. FINDINGS.

A. Every three years the State of California adopts a new California Fire Code, as part
of the California Building Standards Codes, which becomes effective 180 days after publication
by the California Building Standards Commission.

B. That Code has been published and adopted, as amended, by the California Building
Standards Commission into the California Code of Regulations as Title 24, Part 9, entitled the
California Fire Code.

C. Health and Safety Code Section 17958 permits the City of Canyon Lake to establish
more restrictive standards reasonably necessary to provide fire protection for life and property
because of local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions.

D. The City of Canyon Lake may establish more restrictive standards reasonably
necessary to provide fire protection for life and property because of local climatic, geological, or
topographical conditions.

1. Climatic Conditions:

The City of Canyon Lake is located in southern California and in western Riverside
County. This part of the County is subject to high temperatures, high velocity wind
conditions which may reach or exceed 70 m.p.h., and extended periods with little
to no precipitation. These dry climatic conditions and high winds cause drying of
vegetation and building materials and contribute to rapid spread of fires leading to
a need for increased levels of protection.

After many years of drought there are times when significant rainfall can affect the
City. The runoff from this rainfall can cause flooding and mudslides putting lives
and property at risk and cause emergency response delays. Frequent periods of
drought and low humidity add to the fire danger. This predisposes the area to large
destructive fires (conflagrations) which necessitates rapid identification, locating,
and extinguishment of all fires in the smallest stage possible. In addition to directly
damaging or destroying buildings, these fire are also prone to disrupt utility services
throughout the County. Obstacles generated by a strong wind, such as fallen trees,
street lights, and utility poles, will greatly impact the response time to reach in
incident scene.

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 101



Water demand in densely populated southern California far exceeds the quantity
supplied by natural precipitation; and although the population continues to grow,
the already-taxed water supply does not. California is projected to increase in
population by nearly 10 million residents over the next quarter of a century with 50
percent of that growth centered in southern California. Due to storage capacities
and consumption, and a limited amount of rainfall, future waster allocation is not
fully dependable. This necessitates the need for additional and on-site fire
protection features. It would also leave tall building vulnerable to uncontrolled fire
due to a lack of available water and an inability to pump sufficient quantities of
available water to floors in a fire.

2. Topographical Conditions:

Traftic and circulation congestion, along with limited access routes to the area,
contribute to increased response times to emergencies. These conditions increase
response times and makes it necessary to require additional life safety requirements
to protect lives and property.

3. Geological Conditions:

The City of Canyon Lake is located in an area of substantial seismic activity.
Several faults, including the San Andreas, San Jacinto, and Elsinore Fault, are
located near the City. These faults can be expected to have a major impact on the
City of Canyon Lake and pose a threat to lives and property. Bridges are
particularly vulnerable to collapse, and dam failure may generate major
downstream flooding.  Buildings vary in susceptibility, dependent upon
construction and the types of soils on which they are built. Earthquakes destroy
power and telephone lines; gas, sewer, or water mains; which in turn may set off
fires and/or hinder firefighting or rescue efforts. Ground shaking may occur in
areas 65 miles or more from the epicenter (the point of ground surface about the
focus). Ground shaking can change the mechanical properties of some fine grained,
saturated soils, where upon they liquefy and act as a fluid (liquefaction). Damage
to building construction, bridges, gas lines, water, and sewer lines would have a
catastrophic impact on the community and City resources would be taxed beyond
capabilities.

Previous earthquakes in southern California have been accompanied by disruption
of traffic flow and fires. A severe seismic event has the potential to negatively
impact any rescue or fire suppression activities because it is likely to create
obstacles similar to those indicated under the high wind section above. With the
probability of strong aftershocks there exists a need to provide increased protection
for anyone on upper floors of buildings.

Road circulation features located throughout the County and City of Canyon Lake
also make amendments reasonably necessary. Located through the County and the

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 102



City of Canyon Lake are major roadways, highways, and flood control channels
that create barriers and slow response times. Hills, slopes, street and storm drain
design, accompanied with occasional heavy rainfall, causes roadway flooding and
landslides and at times may make an emergency access route impassable. There
are areas in Riverside County that naturally have extended emergency times that
exceed our seven minute forty-five second response time goal.

California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5 require that the
modification or change be expressly marked and identified as to which each finding refers.
Therefore, the City Council finds that the following table sets forth the 2022 California Fire Code
sections that have been modified and the associated local climatic, geological, and/or
topographical conditions described above supporting the modification.

?::ecslzcﬂ:)r: Title/Subject Findings
101.1 Title Administrative
101.4 Severability Administrative
102.5 Application of Residential Code 1,2&3

103.1 Creation of Agency Administrative
104.1.1 Authority of Fire Chief and Fire Department | Administrative
104.7 Liability Administrative
104.13 Authority to close hazardous fire areas | Administrative
105.5.5 Carnivals, fairs, and special events 1,2&3
105.6.55 General use permit Administrative
107.1 Fees Administrative
107.7 Cost recovery Administrative
109.7 Occupant count Administrative
111.1 Board of Appeals established Administrative
112.4 Violation penalties Administrative
113.4 Failure to comply Administrative
202 Definitions Administrative
307 Open Burning 1,2&3
307.1.1 Prohibited Open Burning 1,2&3

307.6 Outdoor Fireplaces, Fire Pits, or other similar | 1,2 & 3

devices used at Group R Occupancies

307.6.1 Gas Fueled Devices 1,2&3
307.6.2 Where Prohibited 1,2&3
308.1.6.3 Sky lanterns 1,2&3

324 Mid-Rise Buildings 1,2&3

324.1 General 1,2&3
324.1.1 Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems and |1,2&3

Standpipes
324.1.2 Smoke Detection 1,2&3
324.1.3 Fire Alarm 1,2&3
3

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 103



E.
health, safety,

324.1.4 Emergency Voice Alarm Signaling System 1,2&3
324.1.5 Fire Command Center 1,2&3
324.1.6 Annunciation Identification 1,2&3
324.1.7 Elevators 1,2&3
324.1.8 Fire Department Communications Systems 1,2&3
324.1.9 Means of Egress 1,2&3
324.1.9.1 Extent of Enclosure 1,2&3
324.1.9.2 Pressurized Enclosures and Stairways ,2&3
324.1.9.3 Vestibules ,2&3
324194 Pressure Differences 1,2&3
324.1.9.5 Locking of Stairway Doors 1,2&3
503.2.1 Dimensions Administrative
503.2.2 Authority Administrative
503.2.3 Surface 1&2
503.6.1 Automatic Opener Administrative
503.7 Loading areas and passenger drop-off areas Administrative
507.5.1.1 Hydrant for Fire Department Connections 1&2
507.5.7 Fire hydrants size and outlets 1 &2
507.5.8 Fire hydrant marker 1 &2
508.1 General 1,2&3
508.1.1 Location and access 1,2&3
508.1.3 Size 1,2&3
508.1.6 Required features 1,2&3
508.1.8 Fire command center identification 1,2&3
509.2.1 Minimum clearances 1,2&3
605.11.1.2 Manual operation 1 &2
903.2 Where required 1&2
903.2.8 Group R 1,2&3
903.3.5.3 Hydraulically calculated systems 1,2&3
907.1.6 Fire Alarm Control Panel 1 &2
907.5.1 Occupant Notification Systems in Multi-tenant | 1 & 2
Buildings
3204.2.1 Minimum requirements for client leased or | Administrative
occupant owned warehouse
4902.1 General Administrative
4904.2.1 High Fire Severity Zones maps Administrative
5608.2 Firing 1
Appendix B Fire-flow requirements for buildings 1,2&3
Appendix C Fire hydrant locations and distribution 1,2&3

The additional requirements included herein are necessary to properly protect the
and welfare of the residents and workers of the City of Canyon Lake.

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda

Page 104




F. Revenue shortages make it difficult to locate additional fire stations and provide
staffing sufficient to control fires in single and multi-story retail, commercial, and industrial
buildings, making enhanced built in protection necessary.

G. The purpose of this ordinance is to adopt the 2022 California Fire Code, California
Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, as amended, to govern the safeguarding of life and property
from fire, explosion hazards, and hazardous conditions, and to regulate the issuance of permits and
collection of fees.

H. This ordinance is adopted pursuant to Health and Safety Code Sections 17958 and
17958.7 which allow City adoption of modifications or changes to the California Fire Code that
are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions.

L. The sections of the California Fire Code may be referred to by the same number
used in said published compilation preceded by the words “City of Canyon Lake Fire Code
Section” or “California Fire Code Section” or “Fire Code Section.”

J. Notwithstanding the provisions of this Ordinance, the City of Canyon Lake reserves
the right to determine the extent and level of its fire services.

SECTION 2. PURPOSE AND AUTHORITY. The purpose of this Ordinance is to adopt, by
reference the 2022 edition of the California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, of the California Code of
Regulations subject to the definitions, clarifications, and the amendments set forth in this
Ordinance. The Purpose of this Ordinance is also to provide minimum requirements and standards
for the protection of public safety, health, property, and welfare of the City of Canyon Lake. This
Ordinance is adopted under the authority of Government Code subsection 50022.2 and Health and
Safety Code Section 18941.5.

SECTION 3. CEQA. No further environmental review is required under the California
Environmental Quality Act pursuant to State CEQA Guidelines Section 15061(b)(3) because it
can be seen with certainty that there is no possibility that the activity in question may have a
significant effect on the environment. The proposed change repeals and replaces the California
Fire Code in the Canyon Lake Municipal Code. Because this action does not have the potential to
result in individually or cumulatively significant effects on the environment, this Municipal Code
amendment is exempt from review under CEQA. Therefore, this change is not subject to CEQA
review at this time under the General Rule and no further environmental review is necessary.

SECTION 4. Chapter 8.12 of the Canyon Lake Municipal Code is repealed in its entirety and
readopted to read as follows:

Chapter 8.12
Adoption of California Fire Code, as amended

Section

8.12.010 Adoption.

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 105



8.12.020
8.12.030
8.12.040
8.12.050
8.12.060
8.12.070
8.12.080
8.12.090
8.12.100
8.12.110
8.12.120
8.12.130
8.12.140
8.12.150
8.12.160
8.12.170
8.12.180
8.12.190
8.12.200

8.12.210
8.12.220

8.12.230
8.12.240
8.12.250
8.12.260
8.12.270
8.12.280
8.12.290
8.12.300
8.12.310
8.12.320
8.12.330
8.12.340
8.12.350
8.12.360
8.12.370
8.12.380
8.12.390
8.12.400
8.12.410
8.12.420
8.12.430
8.12.440
8.12.450

Title.

Severability.

Application of Residential Code.

Creation of agency.

Authority of Fire Chief and the Fire Department.
Liability.

Authority of Fire Chief to close Hazardous Fire Areas.
Carnivals, Fairs, and Special Events.

General Use Permit.

Fees.

Cost Recovery.

Occupant Count.

Board of Appeals Established.

Limitations on Authority.

Qualifications.

Violation Penalties.

Failure to Comply.

Definitions.

Open Burning, Recreational Fires, Fire Pits, Fire Rings, and Portable
Outdoor Fireplaces.

Prohibited Open Burning.

Outdoor Fireplaces, Fire Pits, Fire Rings, or other similar devices used at
Group R Occupancies.

Gas Fueled Devices.

Where Prohibited.

Sky Lanterns.

Mid-Rise Buildings.

Dimensions.

Authority.

Surface.

Automatic Opener.

Loading Areas and Passenger Drop-off Areas.
Hydrant for Fire Department Connections.
Fire Hydrant Size and Outlets.

Fire Hydrant Street Marker.

General.

Location and Access.

Size.

Required Features.

Fire Command Center Identification.
Minimum Clearances.

Manual Operation.

Where Required.

Group R.

Hydraulically Calculated Systems.

Fire Alarm Control Panel.

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 106



8.12.460 Occupant Notification Systems Required in Multi-tenant Buildings.
8.12.470 Minimum Requirements for Client Leased/Occupant Owned Warehouses.
8.12.480 General.

8.12.490 Fire Hazard Severity Zone Maps.

8.12.500 Firing.

8.12.510 Appendix B.

8.12.520 Appendix C.

8.12.010 Adoption.

The City Council of the City of Canyon Lake does hereby adopt the California Fire Code,
as amended. Except as stated in this Section or as amended below in this Ordinance, all of the
provisions and appendices of the 2022 California Fire Code, inclusive of all of the inclusions and
exclusions set for in each chapter’s matrix, are hereby adopted and shall apply to the City of
Canyon Lake. In addition, the following provisions that are excluded in the 2022 California Fire
Code are hereby adopted - Chapter 1, Division II of the California Fire Code is hereby adopted,
except that Section 111.3 is not adopted, and Chapters 3, 25, and Sections 403.11, 503, 510.2, and
1103.2, and 5707 are adopted. One copy of this Code has been and is now filed in the office of the
Fire Chief of the City of Canyon Lake Fire Department and the same is hereby adopted and
incorporated.

8.12.020 Title.

Section 101.1 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of
Canyon Lake, hereinafter referred to as “this Code.”

8.12.030 Severability.

Section 101.4 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 101.4 Severability. If any provision, clause, sentence or paragraph of this
ordinance or the application thereof to any person or circumstances shall be held invalid, such
invalidity shall not affect the other provisions of this ordinance which can be given effect without
the invalid provision or application, and to this end, the provisions of this ordinance are hereby
declared to be severable.

8.12.040 Application of Residential Code.

Section 102.5 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 107



Section 102.5 Application of residential code. Where structures are designed and
constructed in accordance with the California Residential Code, the provisions of this code shall
apply as follows:

1. Construction and design provisions of this code pertaining to the exterior of the
structure shall apply including, but not limited to, premises identification, fire apparatus
access, and water supplies. Where interior or exterior systems or devices are installed,
construction permits required by Section 105.6 of this code shall apply.

2. Administrative, operational, and maintenance provisions of this code shall apply.

3. Automatic fire sprinkler system requirements of this code shall apply to detached
accessory buildings 3,600 square feet or greater in accordance with Section 903.2. The
provisions contained in Section 903.2.18 of the California Fire Code or Section R309.6
of the California Residential Code may be used for the design of the automatic fire
sprinkler system for detached private garages or similar uses.

8.12.050 Creation of Agency.

Section 103.1 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 103.1. Creation of agency. The Canyon Lake Fire Department is hereby created
and the official in charge thereof shall be known as the fire code official. The function of the
agency shall be the implementation, administration, and enforcement of the provisions of this code.
8.12.060 Authority of the Fire Chief and Fire Department.

Section 104.1.1 is added to Section 104 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

Section 104.1.1. Authority of the Fire Chief and the Canyon Lake Fire Department.

1. The Fire Chief is authorized and directed to enforce all applicable State fire laws and
provisions of this ordinance and to perform such duties as directed by the Canyon Lake
City Council.

2. The Fire Chief is authorized to administer, interpret, and enforce this ordinance. Under
the Fire Chief’s direction, the Canyon Lake Fire Department is authorized to enforce
ordinances of the City of Canyon Lake pertaining to the following:

2.1. The prevention of fires.

2.2. The suppression or extinguishment of dangerous or hazardous fires.

2.3. The storage, use, and handling of hazardous materials.

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 108



2.4. The installation and maintenance of automatic, manual, and other private fire
alarm systems and fire extinguishing equipment.

2.5. The maintenance and regulation of fire escapes.

2.6. The maintenance of fire protection and the elimination of fire hazards on land,
in buildings, structures and other property, including those under construction.

2.7. The maintenance of means of egress.

2.8. The investigation of the cause, origin, and circumstances of fire, and
unauthorized releases of hazardous materials.

3. The following persons are hereby authorized to interpret and enforce the provisions of this
code and to make arrests and issue citations as authorized by law:

3.1. The Fire Chief, Fire Marshal, Battalion Chief, and all members of the Canyon
Lake Fire Department.

3.2. The Riverside County Sheriff and any Deputy Sheriff.
3.3. Officers of the California Highway Patrol.

3.5. Code Enforcement Officers of the City of Canyon Lake Code Enforcement
Department.

3.6. Peace Officers of the California Department of Parks and Recreation.
3.7. The law enforcement officers of the Federal Bureau of Land Management.
8.12.070 Liability.

Section 104.7 and 104.7.1 of the California Fire Code are deleted in their entirety and
replaced with the following:

Section 104.7 Liability. Any liability against the City of Canyon Lake or any officer or
employee for damages resulting from the discharge of their duties shall be as provided by law.

8.12.080 Authority of the Fire Chief to Close Hazardous Fire Areas.
Section 104.13 is added to Section 104 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:
Section 104.13. Authority of the Fire Chief to close hazardous fire areas. Except upon
National Forest Land, the Fire Chief is authorized to determine and announce the closure of any

hazardous fire area or portion thereof. Any closure by the Fire Chief for a period of more than
fifteen (15) calendar days must be approved by the Canyon Lake City Council within thirty (30)

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 109



calendar days of the Fire Chief’s original order of closure. Upon such closure, no person shall go
in or be upon any hazardous fire area, except upon the public roadways and inhabited areas. During
such closure, the Fire Chief shall erect and maintain at all entrances to the closed area sufficient
signs giving notice of closure. This section shall not prohibit residents or owners of private
property within any closed area, or their invitees, from going in or being upon their lands. This
section shall not apply to any entry, in the course of duty, by a peace officer, duly authorized public
officer or fire department personnel. For the purpose of this section, “hazardous fire area” shall
mean public or private land that is covered with grass, grain, brush, or forest and situated in a
location that makes suppression difficult resulting in great damage. Such areas are designated on
Hazardous Fire Area maps filed with the Canyon Lake Fire Department.

8.12.090 Carnivals, Fairs, and Special Events.

Section 105.5.5 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 105.5.5 Carnivals, fairs, and special events. An operational permit is required to
conduct a carnival, fair, or special event. A detailed plan must be submitted, and an operational
permit issued, to conduct a carnival, fair, or special event.

8.12.100 General Use Permit.
Section 105.5.55 is added to Section 105 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

Section 105.5.55 General Use Permit. A General Use Permit shall be required for any
activity or operation not specifically described in this section, which in the judgement of the fire
code official is likely to produce conditions hazardous to life or property.

8.12.110 Fees.

Section 107.1 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 107.1 Fees. For each and every permit issued (or amended) pursuant to this code,
there shall be paid to the City of Canyon Lake a fee in such amount as established by the agency
issuing the permit or providing the service. Failure to pay such fees shall be cause for revocation
of the permit.

8.12.120 Cost Recovery.
Section 107.7 is added to Section 107 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:
Section 107.7 Cost Recovery. Fire suppression, investigation, rescue, or emergency
medical costs are recoverable in accordance with Health and Safety Code Sections 13009 and

13009.1, as may be amended from time to time. Additionally, any person who negligently,
intentionally, or in violation of law causes an emergency response, including, but not limited to, a

10
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 110



traffic accident, spill of toxic or flammable fluids, or chemicals is liable for the costs of securing
such emergency, including those costs pursuant to Government Code Section 53150, et seq, as
may be amended from time to time. Any expense incurred by the City of Canyon Lake or the
Canyon Lake Fire Department for securing such emergency shall constitute a debt of such person
and shall be collectable by the City of Canyon Lake in the same manner as in the case of an
obligation under contract, express or implied.

8.12.130 Occupant Count.
Section 109.7 is added to Section 109 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

Section 109.7 Occupant Count. The supervisor of each place of assembly shall have an
effective system to maintain a count of the number of occupants present in order to keep the
number at or below the allowable occupant load. If the fire code official determines at any time
that an accurate count of occupants is not being maintained, the occupancy shall be cleared to
obtain an accurate count.

8.12.140 Board of Appeals Established.

Section 111.1 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 111.1 Board of appeals established. The Board of Appeals shall be the City
Manager. If he or she determines an outside board is needed, he or she shall designate an outside
hearing officer to hear the appeal. The Fire Chief or designee shall be notified of any appeal and
the Fire Chief or designee shall be in attendance at the appeal hearing. Depending on the subject
of the appeal, specialized expertise may be solicited, at the expense of the applicant, for the purpose
of providing input to the Board of Appeals.

8.12.150 Limitations on authority.

Section 111.2 Limitations on authority is hereby deleted in its entirety.
8.12.160 Qualifications.

Section 111.3 Qualifications is hereby deleted in its entirety.
8.12.170 Violation Penalties.

Section 112.4 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 112.4 Violation penalties. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, corporation or

association of persons to violate any provision of this ordinance, or to violate the provisions of any
permit granted pursuant to this code or ordinance. Punishments and penalties for violations shall

11
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 1 1 1



be in accordance with the City of Canyon Lake ordinances, City fee schedule, and Health and
Safety Code Sections 17995 through 17995.5.

8.12.180 Failure to Comply.

Section 113.4 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 113.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having
been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to
remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be in violation of this Code and be subject to citations

and penalties in amounts as determined by the Canyon Lake City Council as identified in the
City’s Fee Schedule.

8.12.190 Definitions.

Section 202 Definitions. The following definitions are amended/added to Section 202 of
the California Fire Code and reads as follows:

ALL WEATHER DRIVING SURFACE. An all-weather driving surface is a concrete
or asphalt covering over base material and a roadbed compacted to ninety-five percent, and of
sufficient thickness to support heavy fire apparatus (approximately 75,000 gross vehicle weight)
with a grade of no more than fifteen percent (15%) and a minimum width of twenty-four (24) feet,
unless approval for a lesser amount is obtained from the Fire Code official.

FIRE CHIEF. The Fire Chief of the Canyon Lake Fire Department or designee.

FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause
an increase of, the hazard or menace of fire to a greater degree than customarily recognized as
normal by persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing or extinguishing fire; or which
may obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction, delay or hindrance to the
prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire.

FUEL MODIFICATION ZONE. A strip of land where combustible vegetation has been
thinned or modified or both and partially or totally replaced with approved fire resistant and/or
irrigated plats to provide an acceptable level of risk from vegetation fires. Fuels modification
reduces the radiant and convective heat on a structure and provides valuable defensible space for
firefighter to make a stand against an approaching fire front.

HAZARDOUS FIRE AREA. Includes all areas identified within Section 4906.2 and
other areas as determined by the Fire Code Official due to the presence of combustible vegetation
or the proximity of property to an area that contains combustible vegetation.

MID-RISE BUILDING. A building four or more stories high but not exceeding 75 feet
in height and not defined as a high-rise building by section 202 of the California Building Code.

12
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 1 12



Measurements shall be made from the underside of the roof or floor above the topmost space that
may be occupied to the lowest fire apparatus access road level.

8.12.200 Open Burning, Recreational Fires and Portable Outdoor Fireplaces

Section 307 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 307. Open Burning, Recreational Fires, Fire Pits, Fire Rings, and Portable Outdoor
Fireplaces.

8.12.210 Prohibited Open Burning

Section 307.1.1 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 307.1.1. Open burning shall be prohibited within the jurisdictional boundaries of
the City of Canyon Lake.

8.12.220 Qutdoor Fireplaces, Fire Pits, Fire Rings, or other similar devices used at
Group R Occupancies

Section 307.6 is added to the California Fire Code to read as follows:

Section 307.6 Outdoor Fireplaces, Fire Pits, Fire Rings, or other similar devices used at
Group R Occupancies. Outdoor fireplaces, fire pits, fire rings, or similar exterior devices shall
comply with this section.

Exception. Barbeques, grills, and other portable devices intended solely for cooking.
8.12.230 Gas Fueled Devices

Section 307.1 is added to the California Fire Code to read as follows:

Section 307.1 Gas Fueled Devices. Outdoor fireplaces, fire pits, and similar devices fueled
by natural gas or liquefied-petroleum gas are allowed when approved by the Building and Fire
Departments and the device is designed to only burn a gas flame and not wood or other solid fuel.
At R-3 occupancies, combustible construction and flammable vegetation shall not be located
within 10 feet. At other R occupancies, the minimum distance shall be 20 feet. Where chimneys
or vents are installed, they shall have a spark arrester as defined in section 202.

8.12.240 Where Prohibited.

Section 307.6.2 is added to the California Fire Code to read as follows:

13
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 1 13



Section 307.6.2 Where Prohibited. The burning of wood and other solid fuels shall not be
conducted within the very high fire hazard severity zone, fuel modification zones, wildfire risk
areas, or the wildland urban interface or intermix or in locations where conditions could cause the
spread of fire to the wildfire risk area or wildland urban interface/intermix. No burning of any
type shall occur during declared “Red Flag” conditions within the City of Canyon Lake.

8.12.250 Sky Lanterns.

Section 308.1.6.3 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 308.1.6.3 Sky lanterns or similar devices. A person shall not release or cause to
be released a sky lantern or similar device.

8.12.260 Mid-Rise Buildings.

Section 324 of the California Fire Code is added to read as follows:

Section 324 Mid-Rise Buildings.

Section 324.1 General. A newly constructed mid-rise building or mid-rise building which
undergoes a complete renovation that requires the building to be completely vacated shall comply
with this section.

Exception:

1. Buildings used exclusively as an open parking garage.

2. Buildings where all floors above the fourth floor level are used exclusively as an open
parking garage.

3. Building such as a power plant, lookout tower, steeple, grain house, and other similar
structures with intermittent human occupancy.

Section 324.1.1 Automatic fire sprinkler systems and standpipes. Mid-rise buildings shall
be protected throughout by an automatic fire sprinkler system designed and installed in
conformance with the latest edition of NFPA 13 and in accordance with the following:

1. A shut-off valve and a water flow alarm shall be provided for each floor. Each shut-
off valve and water flow alarm shall be electronically supervised.

2. Mid-rise building shall be provided with a class I standpipe system that is
interconnected with the automatic fire sprinkler system. The system shall consist of 2
Y2-inch hose valves located in each stair enclosure on every floor. Tow hose outlets
shall be located on the roof outside of each stair enclosure which penetrates the roof.

14
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 1 1 4



The standpipe system shall be designed, installed, and tested in accordance with the
latest edition of NFPA 14.

3. Fire department standpipe connections and valves serving each floor shall be located
in the vestibule and located in a manner so as not to obstruct egress when hose lines
are connected and charged.

Section 324.1.2 Smoke Detection. Smoke detectors shall be provided in accordance with
this section. Smoke detectors shall be connected to an automatic fire alarm system and shall be
installed in accordance with the latest edition of NPFA 72. The actuation of any device required
by this sections shall operate the emergency voice alarm signal system and shall operate all
equipment necessary to prevent the circulation of smoke through air return and exhaust ductwork.
smoke detectors shall be located as follows:

1. Inevery mechanical equipment, electrical, transformer, telephone equipment, unstaffed
computer equipment, elevator machinery or similar room and in all elevator lobbies.
elevator lobby detectors shall be connected to an alarm verification zone or be listed as
a releasing device.

2. In the main return air and exhaust air plenum of each air conditioning system. The
smoke detector shall be located in a serviceable area downstream of the last duct inlet.

3. Ateach connection to a vertical duct or riser serving two or more stories from a return
air duct or plenum of an air conditioning system. In Group R, Division 1 and 2
occupancies, an approved smoke detector is allowed to be used in each return air riser
carrying not more than 5,000 cubic feet per minute and not serving more than 10 air
inlet openings.

4. For Group R, Division 1 and 2 occupancies, in all corridors serving as a means of egress
for an occupant load of 10 or more persons.

Section 324.1.3 Fire alarm system. An approved and listed, automatic and manual, fully
addressable and electronically-supervised fire alarm system shall be provided in conformance with
this code, the California Building Code, and the latest edition of NFPA 72.

Section 324.1.4 Emergency voice alarm signaling system. The operation of any automatic
fire detector or water flow device shall automatically sound an alert tone followed by a pre-
recorded voice instruction giving appropriate information and direction on a general or selective
basis to the following terminal areas:

1. Elevators

2. Elevators lobbies

3. Corridors

15
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 1 15



4. Exit stairways

5. Rooms and tenant spaces

6. Dwelling units

7. Hotel guest rooms

8. Areas designated as safe refuge within a building

Section 324.1.5 Fire Command Center. A fire command center for fire department
operations shall be provided for single structures in excess of 300,000 square feet in size. The
location and accessibility of the fire command center shall be approved by the fire department.
The room shall be separated from the remainder of the building by not less than a 1-hour fire
barrier. The room shall be a minimum of 200 square feet with a minimum dimension of 10 feet.
It shall contain the following facilities at a minimum:

1. Voice alarm and public address panels

2. Fire department communications panel

3. Fire alarm enunciator panel

4. Elevator enunciator panel (when building exceeds 55 feet in height)

5. Status indicators and controls for air-handling systems (stairwell pressurization)

6. Controls for unlocking stairwell doors
7. Fire pump status indicators (if required)

8. Set of complete building plans

9. Elevator control switches for switching emergency power

10. Work table

11. Access keys for all building spaces

Section 324.1.6 Annunciation identification. Control panels in the central control station
shall be permanently identified as to their function. Water flow, automatic fire detection, and
manually-activated fire alarms, and supervisory and trouble signals shall be monitored by an
approved UL-listed central monitoring station and annunciated in the fire command center by
means of an audible and visual indicator. For the purposes of annunciation, zoning shall be in

accordance with the following:

1. When the system serves more than one building, each building shall be a separate zone.

16
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 1 16



2. Each floor in a building shall be a separate zone, and coincide with the floor level.
3. When one or more risers serve the same floor, each riser shall be a separate zone.

Section 324.1.7 Elevators. Elevators and elevator lobbies shall comply with Chapter 30
of the California Building Code. At least one elevator cab shall be assigned for fire department
use and shall serve all floors of the building. The cab shall be provided large enough to
accommodate an ambulance-type stretcher in accordance with section 3002.4 of the California
Building Code.

Section 324.1.8 Fire Department Communications Systems. An approved two-way fire
department communication system designed and installed in accordance with the latest edition of
NFPA 72 shall be provided for fire department use per section 907.2.13.2.

Section 324.1.9 Means of Egress. In addition to the requirements of Chapter 10, egress
components of mid-rise buildings shall comply with section 324.1.9.1 through 324.1.9.5.

Section 324.1.9.1 Extent of Enclosure. Stairway enclosures shall be continuous and shall
fully enclose all portions of the stairway. Exit enclosures shall exit directly to the exterior of the
building or include an exit passageway on the ground floor leading to the exterior of the building.
Each exit enclosure shall extend completely through the roof and be provided with a door that
leads onto the roof.

Section 324.1.9.2 Pressurized Enclosures and Stairways. All required stairways and
enclosures in a mid-rise building shall be pressurized as specified in section 909. Pressurized
stairways shall be designed to exhaust smoke manually when needed.

Section 324.1.9.3 Vestibules. Pressurized stairway enclosures serving a mid-rise building

shall be provided with a pressurized entrance vestibule on each floor that complies with section
909.

Section 324.1.9.4 Pressure Differences. The minimum pressure difference between a
vestibule and adjacent areas shall comply with section 909.

Section 324.1.9.5 Locking of Stairway Doors. All stairway doors that are locked to
prohibit access from the interior of the stairway shall have the capability of being unlocked
simultaneously, without unlatching, upon a signal from the fire command center. Upon failure of
normal electrical service or activation of any fire alarm, the locking mechanism shall automatically
retract to the unlocked position.

A telephone or other two-way communication system connected to an approved emergency

service which operates continuously shall be provided at not less than every third floor in each
required exit stairway vestibule.

17
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 117



Approved signage stating doors are locked shall be provided in each stairwell vestibule on
each floor in which entry may be made and on each floor in which a telephone is located. Hardware
for locking stairway vestibules doors shall be State Fire Marshal listed and approved by the Fire
Chief by permit before installation. Stairway doors located between the vestibules and the stairway
shaft shall not be locked.

8.12.270 Dimensions.

Section 503.2.1 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width
of not less than 24-feet, exclusive of shoulders, except for single-family residential driveways
serving no more than two (2) single family dwellings, which shall have a minimum of 12-feet of
unobstructed improved width. Any of the following, which have separated lanes of one-way
traffic: gated entrances with card readers, guard stations or center medians, are allowed, provided
that each lane is not less than 14-feet wide.

All fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less
than 13 feet 6 inches.

Vertical clearances or road widths shall be increased when the fire code official determines
that vertical clearances or road widths are not adequate to provide fire department access.

Vertical clearances or road width may be reduced when the fire code official determines
the reduction does not impair access by fire apparatus. In cases where the vertical clearance has
between reduced, approved signs shall be installed and maintained indicating the amount of
vertical clearance.

8.12.280 Authority.

Section 503.2.2 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 503.2.2 Authority. The fire code official shall be the only authority authorized to
designate fire apparatus access roads and fire lanes and to modify the minimum fire lane access
widths for fire or rescue operations.

8.12.290 Surface.

Section 503.2.3 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 503.2.3 Surface. Fire apparatus access road shall be designed and maintained to

support the imposed loads of fire apparatus at 75,000 pounds and shall be paved or concrete so as
to provide an all-weather driving capability. Pervious pavers may be used when designed,

18

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 1 18



installed, and maintained to hold the imposed loads of fire apparatus at 75,000 pounds and are
approved by the fire code official.

8.12.300 Automatic Opener.

Section 503.6.1 is added to Section 503.6 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

Section 503.6.1 Automatic Opener. New motorized gates shall be provided with means to
be automatically opened remotely by emergency vehicles in accordance with the requirements of
the Canyon Lake Fire Department.

Exception: Gates serving individual one and two-family dwelling parcels do not need to
have the automatic opener but are required to have a Canyon Lake Fire Department override
“Knox” key switch.

8.12.310 Loading Areas and Passenger Drop-Off Areas.

Section 503.7 is added to Section 503 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

Section 503.7 Loading areas and passenger drop-off arecas. On private properties, where
fire apparatus access roads are utilized for loading or unloading, or utilized for passenger drop-off
or pick-up, an additional eight (8) feet of width shall be added to the minimum required width for
the fire apparatus access road.

8.12.320 Hydrant for Fire Department Connections.

Section 507.5.1.1 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 507.5.1.1 Hydrant for Fire Department Connections. Building equipped with a
fire sprinkler and/or a fire standpipe system installed in accordance with Section 905 shall have a
fire hydrant within 100 feet of the fire department connections.
8.12.330 Fire Hydrant Size and Outlets.

Section 507.5.7 is added to Section 507 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

Section 507.5.7 Fire Hydrant size and outlets. As determined by the fire code official, fire
hydrant sizes and outlets shall be based on the following:

1. Residential Standard — one (1) four (4) inch outlet and one (1) two and one-half (2 '5)
inch outlet.

2. Super Hydrant Standard — one (1) four (4) inch outlet and two (2) two and one-half (2
¥2) inch outlet.

19
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 119



3. Super Hydrant Enhanced — two (2) four (4) inch outlets and one (1) two and one-half
(2 '2) inch outlet.

8.12.340 Fire Hydrant Street Marker.
Section 507.5.8 is added to Section 507 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

Section 507.5.8 Fire hydrant street marker. Fire hydrant locations shall be visually
identified as required by the fire code official. Fire hydrants may be identified by a reflectorized
blue marker with a minimum dimension of 3 inches, in the center of the travel lane and adjacent
the water source, or by other methods approved by the fire code official. At intersections, a
reflectorized blue marker may be required on each cross street. Any hydrant marker damaged or
removed during the course of street construction or repair shall be immediately replaced by the
contractor, developer, or person responsible for removal or damage.

8.12.350 General.

Section 508.1 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 508.1 General. Where required by other sections of this code and in all buildings
classified as high-rise buildings by the California Building Code, in buildings greater than 300,000
square feet in area, and in Group I-2 occupancies having occupied floors located more than 75 feet
above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access, a fire command center for fire department
operations shall be provided and comply with Sections 508.1.1 through 508.1.8.

8.12.360 Location and Access.

Section 508.1.1 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 508.1.1 Location and access. The fire command center shall be located adjacent
to the main lobby and shall be accessible from fire department vehicular access or as approved by
the fire code official. The room shall have direct access from the building exterior at the lowest
level of fire department access.

8.12.370 Size.

Section 508.1.3 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 508.1.3 Size. The fire command center shall be not less than 0.015 percent of the
total building area of the facility served or 200 square feet (19 m2) in area, whichever is greater,
with a minimum dimension of 0.7 times the square root of the room area or 10 feet (3048 mm),
whichever is greater.

20
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 120



When a fire command center is solely required because a building is greater than 300,000
square feet, the fire command center shall have a minimum size of 96 square feet with a minimum
dimension of 8 feet where approved by the fire code official.

8.12.380 Required Features.
Section 508.1.6 of the California Fire Code is amended to include the following exception:
Section 508.1.6 Required features.

Exception: A fire command center solely required because a building is greater than
300,000 square feet in area shall comply with NFPA 72 and contain the features set forth in
Subsection 508.1.6, subsection 5, 8, 10, 12, 13, and 14. The features set forth in Section 508.1.6
subsections 1,2, 3,4,6,9, 11, 15, 16, 17, 18, and 19 shall be required when such building contains
systems or functions related to these features.

8.12.390 Fire Command Center ldentification.

Section 508.1.8 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 508.1.8 Fire command center identification. The fire command center shall be
identified by a permanent easily visible sign stating “Fire Dept. Command Center,” located on the
door to the fire command center.

8.12.400 Minimum Clearances.
Section 509.2.1 is added to Section 509 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

Section 509.2.1 Minimum clearances. A 3-foot clear space shall be maintained around the
circumference of exterior fire protection system control valves, or any other exterior fire protection
system component that may require immediate access, except as otherwise required or approved.

8.12.410 Manual Operation.

Section 608.11.1.2 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with
the following:

Section 608.11.1.2 Manual operation. When required by the fire code official, automatic
crossover valves shall be capable of manual operation. The manual valves shall be located in an
approved location immediately outside of the machinery room in a secure metal box or equivalent

and marked as Emergency Controls.

8.12.420 Where Required.

21
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 12 1



Section 903.2 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

Section 903.2 Where required. In all new buildings and structures which are 3,600 square
feet or greater, an approved automatic sprinkler system shall be provided regardless of occupancy
classification. Where the Sections 903.2.1 — 903.2.21 of the California Fire Code require more
restrictive requirements than those listed below, the more restrictive requirement shall take
precedence.

Exception: Unless required elsewhere in this Code or the California Building Code,
automatic fire sprinkler systems shall not be required for the following:

I. Detached Group U occupancies used for agricultural purposes constructed in
accordance with the California Building Code.

2. Detached non-combustible equestrian arena shade canopies that are open on all sides
and used for riding only - no commercial, assembly, or storage uses.

3. Detached fabric or non-combustible shade structures that are open on all sides and used
to shade playground equipment, temporary storage of vehicles, and dining areas with
no cooking.

4. Where determined by the Fire Chief that no major life safety hazard exists, and the fuel
load does not pose a significant threat to firefighter safety or to other structures or
property, automatic fire sprinklers may be exempted.

One and two family dwellings shall have an automatic fire sprinkler system regardless of
square footage in accordance with the California Residential Code. Fire sprinkler systems shall be
installed in mobile homes, manufactured homes, and multifamily manufactured homes with two
dwelling units in accordance with Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations.

Fire sprinkler systems are required in existing residential buildings under the following
conditions:

1. Additions are made to a building equipped with an automatic sprinkler system whether
or not the building was required to have a sprinkler system.

2. When an addition is 33% or more of the existing building area, and the resulting
building area exceeds 5,000 square feet.

3. When an addition exceeds 2,000 square feet and the resulting building area exceeds
5,000 square feet.

4. Anadditional story is added above the second floor regardless of fire areas or allowable
area.

22
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 122



When additions, alterations or repairs are done where the building would be required
to be sprinklered after the additions, alterations or repairs are completed and the
additions, alterations, or repairs have a valuation of 50% or more of the building’s
valuation prior to the additional, alterations or repairs. The cumulative value of
additions, alterations, and repairs done within any three year period is the valuation
used to determine the 50% threshold compliance with this section. The valuation used
for existing building and for the additions, alterations, and repairs is the valuations
established in the City’s resolution for computation of building permit fees.

The following exceptions in the California Fire Code shall not be allowed:

1.

Exception in section 903.2.3

2. Exception in section 903.2.11.3

8.12.430

Group R.

Section 903.2.8 of the California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the

following:

Section 903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
section 903.3 shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area as follows:

1.

2.

New Buildings: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout.

Existing Buildings: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout when
one of the following conditions exists:

a. Additions are made to a building equipped with an automatic sprinkler system
whether or not the building was required to have a sprinkler system.

b. When the addition is 33% or more of the existing building area as defined in Section
202, and greater than 1,000 square feet within a two-year period.

c. When an existing Group R occupancy is being substantially renovated, and where
the scope of the renovation is such that the Building Code Official or Fire Code
Official determines that the complexity of installing a sprinkler system would be
similar as in a new building.

d. Additions, alterations, or repairs are done where the additions, alterations, or repairs
have a valuation of 50% or more of the buildings valuation prior to the additions,
alterations, or repairs. The cumulative value of additions, alterations, and repairs
done within any three-year period is the valuation used to determine the 50%
threshold compliance with this section. The valuations used for existing building
and for the additions, alterations, and repairs is the valuations established in the
City’s resolution for computation for building permit fees.

23

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 123



For the purposes of this section, firewalls, fire barriers, or fire partitions shall define
separate buildings.

Exceptions:

1. Existing Group R-3 occupancies converted to R-3.1 occupancies not housing bedridden
clients, not housing non-ambulatory clients above the fire floor, and not housing clients
above the second floor.

2. Existing Group R-3 occupancies converted to Group R-3.1 occupancies housing only
one bedridden client and complying with Section 435.8.3.3 of the California Building
Code.

3. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code, Section 13113, occupancies housing ambulatory
children only, none of whom are mentally ill children or children with intellectual
disabilities, and the building or portions thereof in which such children are housed are
not more than two stories in height, and building or portions thereof house such children
have an automatic fire alarm system active by approved smoke detectors.

4. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code, Section 13143.6, occupancies licensed for
protective social care which house ambulatory clients only, none of whom is a child
(under the age of 18 years), or who is elderly (65 years of age or over).
8.12.440 Hydraulically Calculated Systems.
Section 903.3.5.3 is added to Section 903 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

Section 903.3.5.3 Hydraulically calculated systems. The design of hydraulically calculated
fire sprinkler systems shall not exceed 90% of the water supply capacity.

8.12.450 Fire Alarm Control Panel.
Section 907.1.6 is added to section 907 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:
Section 907.1.6 Fire alarm control panel. The main fire alarm control panel (FACP) shall
be located in the same room as, and sharing the same access as the fire sprinkler riser. The FACP
shall have a minimum 36 inches of face clearance and 6 inches side clearance from any other wall
or equipment.
8.12.460 Occupant Notification Systems Required in Multi-tenant Buildings.

Section 907.5.1 is added to section 907 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

Section 907.5.1 Occupant notification system required in multi-tenant buildings. In multi-
tenant buildings where the automatic fire sprinkler bell cannot be heard within the tenant space

24
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 12 4



shall upon tenant improvement(s) requiring a building permit for that tenant space add one
audio/visual device to alert occupants of an activation of one of the fire protection systems
identified in section 907.5.

8.12.470 Minimum Requirements for Client Leased or Occupant Owned Warehouses.
Section 3204.2.1 is added to Section 3204 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

Section 3204.2.1 Minimum requirements for client leased or occupant owned warehouses.
Designs of an automatic sprinkler system for client leased or occupant owned buildings containing
high pile storage shall be based on the requirements of NFPA 13. The responsible fire protection
engineer shall perform a survey of the building to determine commodity classification, storage
configuration, building height, and other information related to the development of an appropriate
sprinkler system design. The fire protection engineer shall also make reasonable efforts to meet
with the building owner or operator to understand seasonal or customer related fluctuations to the
stored commodities, storage height, and configuration. The sprinkler design shall be based on the
most demanding requirements determined through the onsite survey and discussions with the
building owner or operator. The technical report shall describe the basis for determining the
commodity and sprinkler design selection, how the commodities will be isolated or separated, and
include references to the design document(s). If a specific fire test is used as the basis of design, a
copy of the fire test report shall be provided at the time of plan review.

8.12.480 General

Section 4902.1 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to include the following
additional definitions:

Section 4902.1 General. For the purpose of this chapter, terms as defined as follows:

COMBUSTIBLE VEGETATION. Material that in its natural state will readily ignite,
burn, and transmit fire from native or landscape plants to any structure or other vegetation.
Combustible vegetation includes dry grass, brush, weeds, litter, or other flammable vegetation that
creates a fire hazard

DEFENSIBLE SPACE. An area either natural or man-made, where material capable of
allowing a fire to spread unchecked has been treated, cleared, or modified to slow the rate and
intensity of an advancing wildfire and to create an area for fire suppression operation to occur.
Distance measurements for defensible space shall be measured on a horizontal plane.

FIRE PROTECTION PLAN. A document prepared for a specific project or development
proposed in the wildland-urban interface fire area that describes ways to minimize and mitigate
potential loss from wildfire exposure, with the purpose of reducing impact on the community’s
fire protection delivery system.

FUEL BREAK. An area, strategically located for fighting anticipated fires, where the
native vegetation has been permanently modified or replaced so that fire burning into it can be

25

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 125



more easily controlled. Fuel breaks divide fire-prone areas into smaller areas for easier fire control
and to provide access for firefighting.

LOCAL AGENCY VERY HIGH FIRE HAZARD SEVERITY ZONE. An area
designated by a local agency upon the recommendations of the Director of the California
Department of Forestry and Fire Protection pursuant to Government Code sections 51177(c),
51178, and 51189 that is not a State Responsibility Area (SRA) and where a local agency, city,
county, city and county, or district is responsible for fire protection.

8.12.490 Fire Hazard Severity Zone Maps.
Section 4904.2.1 is added to Section 4904 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:

4904.2.1 High Fire Severity Zone Maps. In accordance with Government Code Section
51175 through 51189, Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones (VHFHSZ), located in the Local
Responsibility Area (LRA), are designated as shown on the most recently published VHFHSZ in
LRA map, as recommended and published by the Director of the California Department of Forestry
and Fire Protection (Cal Fire), which may be revised from time to time. The most recent VHFHSZ
in LRA map is on file at the office of the Fire Chief, which supersedes other maps previously
adopted.

8.12.500 Firing.
Section 5608.2 is added to Section 5608 of the California Fire Code to read as follows:
Section 5608.2 Firing. All fireworks displays shall be electrically fired.

8.12.510 Appendix B.
Appendix B, Table 105.2 of the California Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

TABLE B105.2 — REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN
ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3 AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND

TOWNHOUSES
AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER MINIMUM FIRE FLOW DURATION
SYSTEM FLOW (hours)
(Design Standard) (gallons per minute)

No automatic sprinkler system Value in Table B105.1(2) | Duration in Table B105.1(2)
Section  903.3.1.1 of the | 50% of the value in Table | Duration in Table B105.1(2)

California Fire Code B105.1(2)* at the reduced flow rate
Section  903.3.1.2  of the | 50% of the value in Table | Duration in Table B105.1(2)
California Fire Code B105.1(2)° at the reduced flow rate

For SI: 1 gallon per minute = 3.785 L/m.

26
11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 126



a. The reduced fire-flow shall be not less than 1,000 gallons per minute.
b. The reduced fire-flow shall be not less than 1,500 gallons per minute.
8.12.520 Appendix C.

Section C103.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

Section C103.1 Hydrant spacing. Fire apparatus access roads and public streets providing
required access to buildings in accordance with Section 503 of the California Fire Code shall be
provided with one or more fire hydrants, as determined by Section C102.1. Where more than one
fire hydrant is required, the distance between required fire hydrants shall be in accordance with
Sections C103.2 and C103.3. Fire Hydrants shall be provided at street intersections.

SECTION 5. EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance shall take effect on January 1, 2023.

PASSED APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 9th day of November, 2022.

Jeremy Smith, Mayor

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Ana V. Sauseda, City Clerk Steven Graham, City Attorney

27

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 127



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 128



ATTACHMENT 2

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 129



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 130



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 13 1



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 132



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 133



Attachments

1. Ordinance No. 228
2. Notice of Public Hearing

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 134



ATTACHMENT 1

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 135



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 136



ORDINANCE NO. 228

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CANYON LAKE,
CALIFORNIA, AMENDING CHAPTER 8.02 OF THE CANYON LAKE MUNICIPAL
CODE, ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2022 EDITIONS OF THE CALIFORNIA
CODES (INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE GREEN BUILDING CODE) AND
RELATED MODEL CODES WITH APPENDICES AND AMENDMENTS THERETO

WHEREAS, pursuant to Government Code Section 50022.1 et seq., the City of Canyon Lake,
California (“City”) may adopt by reference the 2022 Editions of the California Codes as provided
in Titles 24 and 25 of the California Code of Regulations and other codes, including, without
limitation, the Green Building Code; and

WHEREAS, the California Building Standards Commission recently adopted the 2022 Editions
of the California Codes; and

WHEREAS, the City desires to adopt the California Codes; and

WHEREAS, the City held a public hearing on 228, at which time all interested persons had the
opportunity to appear and be heard on the matter of adopting the Codes as amended herein; and

WHEREAS, all legal prerequisites to the adoption of this Ordinance have occurred.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CANYON LAKE DOES
HEREBY ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. Chapter 8.02 of the Canyon Lake Municipal Code is repealed in its entirety
readopted to read as follows:

Chapter 8.02
Adoption of California Building Standards Codes

Section
8.02.010 Construction Codes Adopted
8.02.020 Exceptions

8.02.010 Construction Codes Adopted.

For the purpose of prescribing regulations for erecting, construction, enlargement, alteration,
repair, improving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, equipment use, height, and area
of buildings and structures, the following construction codes subject to the modifications set forth
in this Chapter, are hereby adopted: the California Building Code, 2022 Edition, including Chapter
1 Division II, and appendix J based on the 2021 International Building Code published by the
International Code Council; the California Residential Code, 2022 Edition including appendixes J
and V, based on the 2021 International Residential Code as published by the International Code
Council; inclusive of all of the inclusions and exclusions set for in each chapter’s matrix, are

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 137



hereby adopted and shall apply to the Canyon Lake. In addition, the California Green Building
Standards Code, 2022 Edition; the California Plumbing Code 2022 Edition, based on the 2018
Uniform Plumbing Code as published by the International Association of Plumbing and
Mechanical Officials; the California Mechanical Code, 2022 Edition, based on the 2021 Uniform
Mechanical Code as published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical
Officials; the California Electrical Code, 2022 Edition, based on the 2020 National Electrical Code
as published by the National Fire Protection Association; the International Property Maintenance
Code, 2021 Edition, as published by the International Code Council; the Uniform Code For The
Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997 Edition, as published by the International Code Council.

The provisions of these Construction Codes as amended by this chapter shall constitute the
Building Regulations of the City of Canyon Lake. Where the California Code of Regulations and
the California Building Standards Codes differ from any sections of the Construction Codes, State
regulations shall prevail over the Construction Codes.

8.02.020 Exceptions

Exemptions from permit requirements of this Code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for
any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of this Code or any other laws or
ordinances of this jurisdiction.

SECTION 2. Effective Date. This ordinance shall take effect January 1, 2023.

PASSED APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 9th day of November, 2022.

Jeremy Smith, Mayor

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:
Ana V. Sauseda, CMC Steven Graham, City Attorney
City Clerk

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 138



ATTACHMENT 2

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 139



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 1 40



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 1 41



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 1 42



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 143



Fiscal Impact

Increased expenditures in the Building and Facilities Maintenance budget of the General
Fund (account #: 10-550-6610 Professional/Specialized Services — Maintenance &
Repairs) not to exceed $3,000.

Attachments

1. Resolution No. 2022-60
2. Proposal from Hoffman’s Painting

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 144



ATTACHMENT 1

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 1 45



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 1 46



RESOLUTION NO. 2022-60

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CANYON LAKE,
CALIFORNIA, APPROVING A BUDGET ADJUSTMENT IN THE AMOUNT OF $3,000
FOR EXTERIOR PAINTING OF THE CITY HALL BUILDING

WHEREAS, the Canyon Lake Property Owners Association (CLPOA) is planning to update their
signage and apply new paint to their main office building located at 31512 Railroad Canyon Road;
and

WHEREAS, the CLPOA General Manager has requested that the City have its building painted
to match as the City Hall building, located at 31516 Railroad Canyon Road, is immediately
adjacent and connected to the CLPOA building; and

WHEREAS, the CLPOA has received a bid from Hoffman’s Painting to do the paint work on the
properties in question; and

WHEREAS, this work was not anticipated when the budget was adopted for Fiscal Year 2022-
2023, therefore, a budget adjustment must be approved by the City Council in order for staff to
move forward with the project.

NOW THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CANYON LAKE DOES
HEREBY RESOLVE AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. The City Council authorizes a Budget Adjustment in the amount of $3,000 in
account number 10-550-6610 to increase Professional/Specialized Services —
Maintenance & Repairs for the painting of the exterior of City Hall.

PASSED, APPROVED, AND ADOPTED on this 9th day of November, 2022.

Jeremy Smith, Mayor

ATTEST:

Ana V. Sauseda, CMC
City Clerk

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Page 1 47



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 1 48



ATTACHMENT 2

11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 1 49



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 150



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 15 1



11/09/2022 City Council Agenda Pag e 152



	11/09/2022 City Council Agenda
	ITEM 2 - RESOLUTION NO. 2022-59 CLAIMS & DEMANDS
	ITEM 3 - MINUTES
	ITEM 4 - SECOND READING OF ORDINANCE NO. 227
	ITEM 5 - SECOND READING OF ORDINANCE NO. 228
	ITEM 6 - RESOLUTION NO. 2022-60 BUDGET ADJUSTMENT



