

COCHISE COUNTY, PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT – BID TABULATION

IFB 11-54-HFP-04 – AGGREGATE CRUSHING at COUNTY LOCATED PITS

Company Name: Harvey Trucking, Inc. Tucson, AZ
Bid Item 1: Crushed Aggregate

Geographic Location	10,000 to 19,999 tons	20,000 to 29,999 tons	30,000 to 39,999 tons
Sierra Vista - Hereford	\$5.15 per ton	\$5.15 per ton	\$5.00 per ton
Tombstone	\$5.50 per ton	\$5.50 per ton	\$5.40 per ton
Douglas	\$6.40 per ton	\$6.40 per ton	\$6.30 per ton
Willcox	\$6.00 per ton	\$6.00 per ton	\$5.90 per ton
Elfrida	\$6.30 per ton	\$6.30 per ton	\$6.20 per ton
Bowie – Simon	\$6.60 per ton	\$6.00 per ton	\$6.50 per ton
Benson	\$5.40 per ton	\$5.40 per ton	\$5.30 Per ton

Company Name: Harvey Trucking, Inc. Tucson, AZ
Bid Item 2: Crushed Concrete without steel

Geographic Location	10,000 to 19,999 tons	20,000 to 29,999 tons	30,000 to 39,999 tons
Sierra Vista - Hereford	\$8.00 per ton	\$8.00 per ton	\$7.90 per ton
Tombstone	\$8.00 per ton	\$8.00 per ton	\$7.90 per ton
Douglas	\$8.00 per ton	\$8.00 per ton	\$7.90 per ton
Willcox	\$8.00 per ton	\$8.00 per ton	\$8.00 per ton
Elfrida	\$8.00 per ton	\$8.00 per ton	\$7.90 per ton
Bowie – Simon	\$9.00 per ton	\$9.00 per ton	\$8.90 per ton
Benson	\$8.00 per ton	\$8.00 per ton	\$7.90 per ton

Company Name: Harvey Trucking, Inc. Tucson, AZ
Bid Item 3: Crushed Concrete with steel

Geographic Location	10,000 to 19,999 tons	20,000 to 29,999 tons	30,000 to 39,999 tons
Sierra Vista - Hereford	\$9.00 per ton	\$9.00 per ton	\$8.90 per ton
Tombstone	\$9.00 per ton	\$9.00 per ton	\$8.90 per ton
Douglas	\$9.00 per ton	\$9.00 per ton	\$8.90 per ton
Willcox	\$9.00 per ton	\$9.00 per ton	\$8.90 per ton
Elfrida	\$9.00 per ton	\$9.00 per ton	\$8.90 per ton
Bowie – Simon	\$10.00 per ton	\$10.00 per ton	\$9.90 per ton
Benson	\$9.00 per ton	\$9.00 per ton	\$8.90 per ton

Company Name: Maddux & Sons, Douglas, AZ
Bid Item 1: Crushed Aggregate

Geographic Location	10,000 to 19,999 tons	20,000 to 29,999 tons	30,000 to 39,999 tons
Sierra Vista - Hereford	\$5.35 per ton	\$5.35 per ton	\$5.35 per ton
Tombstone	\$4.80 per ton	\$4.80 per ton	\$4.75 per ton
Douglas	\$4.25 per ton	\$4.25 per ton	\$4.25 per ton
Willcox	No bid	No Bid	No Bid
Elfrida	\$5.50 per ton	\$5.50 per ton	\$5.50 per ton
Bowie – Simon	No bid	No Bid	No Bid
Benson	No bid	No Bid	No Bid

Company Name: Maddux & Sons, Douglas, AZ
Bid Item 2: Crushed Concrete without steel

Geographic Location	10,000 to 19,999 tons	20,000 to 29,999 tons	30,000 to 39,999 tons
Sierra Vista - Hereford	\$6.35 per ton	\$6.35 per ton	\$6.35 per ton
Tombstone	\$5.80 per ton	\$5.80 per ton	\$5.80 per ton
Douglas	\$5.25 per ton	\$5.25 per ton	\$5.25 per ton
Willcox	No bid	No Bid	No Bid
Elfrida	\$6.50 per ton	\$6.50 per ton	\$6.50 per ton
Bowie – Simon	No bid	No Bid	No Bid
Benson	No bid	No Bid	No Bid

Company Name: Maddux & Sons, Douglas, AZ
Bid Item 3: Crushed Concrete with steel

Geographic Location	10,000 to 19,999 tons	20,000 to 29,999 tons	30,000 to 39,999 tons
Sierra Vista - Hereford	No bid	No Bid	No Bid
Tombstone	No bid	No Bid	No Bid
Douglas	No bid	No Bid	No Bid
Willcox	No bid	No Bid	No Bid
Elfrida	No bid	No Bid	No Bid
Bowie – Simon	No bid	No Bid	No Bid
Benson	No bid	No Bid	No Bid

Company Name: Bray Construction, Inc., Glendale, AZ
Bid Item 1: Crushed Aggregate

Geographic Location	10,000 to 19,999 tons	20,000 to 29,999 tons	30,000 to 39,999 tons
Sierra Vista - Hereford	\$6.58 per ton	\$5.87 per ton	\$5.60 per ton
Tombstone	\$6.50 per ton	\$5.75 per ton	\$5.50 per ton
Douglas	\$6.50 per ton	\$6.00 per ton	\$5.75 per ton
Willcox	\$6.25 per ton	\$5.75 per ton	\$5.50 per ton
Elfrida	\$7.50 per ton	\$7.00 per ton	\$7.00 per ton
Bowie – Simon	\$6.00 per ton	\$5.75 per ton	\$5.70 per ton
Benson	\$5.50 per ton	\$5.40 per ton	\$5.25 per ton

Company Name: Bray Construction, Inc., Glendale, AZ
Bid Item 2: Crushed Concrete without steel

Geographic Location	10,000 to 19,999 tons	20,000 to 29,999 tons	30,000 to 39,999 tons
Sierra Vista - Hereford	\$8.75 per ton	\$8.40 per ton	\$8.25 per ton
Tombstone	\$8.80 per ton	\$8.45 per ton	\$8.30 per ton
Douglas	\$9.00 per ton	\$8.75 per ton	\$8.60 per ton
Willcox	\$8.25 per ton	\$8.00 per ton	\$7.90 per ton
Elfrida	\$9.25 per ton	\$9.00 per ton	\$8.80 per ton
Bowie – Simon	\$8.50 per ton	\$8.25 per ton	\$8.00 per ton
Benson	\$8.50 per ton	\$8.25 per ton	\$8.00 per ton

Company Name: Bray Construction, Inc., Glendale, AZ
Bid Item 3: Crushed Concrete with steel

Geographic Location	10,000 to 19,999 tons	20,000 to 29,999 tons	30,000 to 39,999 tons
Sierra Vista - Hereford	\$9.25 per ton	\$8.90 per ton	\$8.75 per ton
Tombstone	\$9.30 per ton	\$8.95 per ton	\$8.80 per ton
Douglas	\$9.50 per ton	\$9.25 per ton	\$9.10 per ton
Willcox	\$8.75 per ton	\$8.50 per ton	\$8.40 per ton
Elfrida	\$9.75 per ton	\$9.50 per ton	\$9.30 per ton
Bowie – Simon	\$9.00 per ton	\$8.75 per ton	\$8.50 per ton
Benson	\$9.00 per ton	\$8.75 per ton	\$8.50 per ton

Company Name: AGE Contracting, Inc., Nogales, AZ
Bid Item 1: Crushed Aggregate

Geographic Location	10,000 to 19,999 tons	20,000 to 29,999 tons	30,000 to 39,999 tons
Sierra Vista - Hereford	\$4.41 per ton	\$4.21 per ton	\$4.12 per ton
Tombstone	\$4.54 per ton	\$4.34 per ton	\$4.25 per ton
Douglas	\$4.41 per ton	\$4.21 per ton	\$4.12 per ton
Willcox	\$5.41 per ton	\$5.21 per ton	\$5.12 per ton
Elfrida	\$4.41 per ton	\$4.21 per ton	\$4.12 per ton
Bowie – Simon	\$5.65 per ton	\$5.45 per ton	\$5.36 per ton
Benson	\$4.69 per ton	\$4.49 per ton	\$4.40 per ton

Company Name: AGE Contracting, Inc., Nogales, AZ
Bid Item 2: Crushed Concrete without steel

Geographic Location	10,000 to 19,999 tons	20,000 to 29,999 tons	30,000 to 39,999 tons
Sierra Vista - Hereford	\$5.90 per ton	\$5.70 per ton	\$5.61 per ton
Tombstone	\$5.90 per ton	\$5.70 per ton	\$5.61 per ton
Douglas	\$5.90 per ton	\$5.70 per ton	\$5.61 per ton
Willcox	\$5.90 per ton	\$5.70 per ton	\$5.61 per ton
Elfrida	\$5.90 per ton	\$5.70 per ton	\$5.61 per ton
Bowie – Simon	\$6.88 per ton	\$6.68 per ton	\$6.59 per ton
Benson	\$5.90 per ton	\$5.70 per ton	\$5.61 per ton

Company Name: AGE Contracting, Inc., Nogales, AZ
Bid Item 3: Crushed Concrete with steel

Geographic Location	10,000 to 19,999 tons	20,000 to 29,999 tons	30,000 to 39,999 tons
Sierra Vista - Hereford	\$6.90 per ton	\$6.70 per ton	\$6.61 per ton
Tombstone	\$6.90 per ton	\$6.70 per ton	\$6.61 per ton
Douglas	\$6.90 per ton	\$6.70 per ton	\$6.61 per ton
Willcox	\$6.90 per ton	\$6.70 per ton	\$6.61 per ton
Elfrida	\$6.90 per ton	\$6.70 per ton	\$6.61 per ton
Bowie – Simon	\$7.88 per ton	\$7.68 per ton	\$7.59 per ton
Benson	\$6.90 per ton	\$6.70 per ton	\$6.61 per ton

Company Name: Meridian Engineering Co, Tucson, AZ			
Bid Item 1: Crushed Aggregate			

Geographic Location	10,000 to 19,999 tons	20,000 to 29,999 tons	30,000 to 39,999 tons
Sierra Vista - Hereford	\$11.30 per ton	\$8.50 per ton	\$7.70 per ton
Tombstone	\$11.30 per ton	\$8.50 per ton	\$7.70 per ton
Douglas	\$16.00 per ton	\$13.50 per ton	\$12.50 per ton
Willcox	\$14.00 per ton	\$11.50 per ton	\$10.50 per ton
Elfrida	\$11.30 per ton	\$8.50 per ton	\$7.70 per ton
Bowie – Simon	\$11.30 per ton	\$8.50 per ton	\$7.70 per ton
Benson	\$11.30 per ton	\$8.50 per ton	\$7.70 per ton

Company Name: Meridian Engineering Co, Tucson, AZ			
Bid Item 2: Crushed Concrete without steel			

Geographic Location	10,000 to 19,999 tons	20,000 to 29,999 tons	30,000 to 39,999 tons
Sierra Vista - Hereford	\$13.00 per ton	\$11.00 per ton	\$10.00 per ton
Tombstone	\$13.00 per ton	\$11.00 per ton	\$10.00 per ton
Douglas	\$13.00 per ton	\$11.00 per ton	\$10.00 per ton
Willcox	\$13.00 per ton	\$11.00 per ton	\$10.00 per ton
Elfrida	\$13.00 per ton	\$11.00 per ton	\$10.00 per ton
Bowie – Simon	\$13.00 per ton	\$11.00 per ton	\$10.00 per ton
Benson	\$13.00 per ton	\$11.00 per ton	\$10.00 per ton

Company Name: Meridian Engineering Co, Tucson, AZ			
Bid Item 3: Crushed Concrete with steel			

Geographic Location	10,000 to 19,999 tons	20,000 to 29,999 tons	30,000 to 39,999 tons
Sierra Vista - Hereford	\$17.00 per ton	\$15.00 per ton	\$14.00 per ton
Tombstone	\$17.00 per ton	\$15.00 per ton	\$14.00 per ton
Douglas	\$17.00 per ton	\$15.00 per ton	\$14.00 per ton
Willcox	\$17.00 per ton	\$15.00 per ton	\$14.00 per ton
Elfrida	\$17.00 per ton	\$15.00 per ton	\$14.00 per ton
Bowie – Simon	\$17.00 per ton	\$15.00 per ton	\$14.00 per ton
Benson	\$17.00 per ton	\$15.00 per ton	\$14.00 per ton