Preliminary Bid Tabulation

Cochise County Procurement Department
IFB 15-38-HFP-04 — Crushed Aggregate & Riprap

7/6/2016

Company Name: Tombstone Gold & Silver, Inc, Tombstone, AZ

Bid Item 1: Crushed Aggregate

1 to 500 tons

501 to 1,000 tons

1,001 to 5,000 tons

5,001 to 10,000 tons

$5.50 per ton

$5.50 per ton

$5.50 per ton

$5.50 per ton

Bid Item 2: Riprap

Size 1to 10 tons 11 to 20 tons 21 to 100 tons 101 tons and above
1Y -4 $15.00 per ton $15.00 per ton $15.00 per ton $14.50 per ton
3"-6" $15.00 per ton $15.00 per ton $15.00 per ton $14.50 per ton
4" - g" $15.00 per ton $15.00 per ton $15.00 per ton $14.50 per ton
4" - 12" $16.00 per ton $16.00 per ton $16.00 per ton $15.50 per ton
8" —16" $16.00 per ton $16.00 per ton $16.00 per ton $15.50 per ton
8" — 24" $16.00 per ton $16.00 per ton $16.00 per ton $15.50 per ton

Company Name: Maddux & Sons, Douglas, AZ

Bid Item 1: Crushed Aggregate

1 to 500 tons

501 to 1,000 tons

1,001 to 5,000 tons

5,001 to 10,000 tons

$8.50 per ton

$8.25 per ton

$8.00 per ton

$8.00 per ton

Bid Item 2: Riprap

Size 1to 10 tons 11 to 20 tons 21 to 100 tons 101 tons and above
1Y -4 $26.00 per ton $26.00 per ton $25.50 per ton $25.00 per ton
3"-6" $26.00 per ton $26.00 per ton $25.50 per ton $25.00 per ton
4" - 8" $26.00 per ton $26.00 per ton $25.50 per ton $25.00 per ton
4" - 12" $26.00 per ton $26.00 per ton $25.50 per ton $25.00 per ton
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Preliminary Bid Tabulation

Cochise County Procurement Department
IFB 15-38-HFP-04 — Crushed Aggregate & Riprap

7/6/2016

Company Name: Maddux & Sons, Douglas, AZ (continued)

8” _ 16”

$29.00 per ton

$29.00 per ton

$28.50 per ton

$28.00 per ton

8” _ 2411

$31.00 per ton

$31.00 per ton

$30.50 per ton

$30.00 per ton

Company Name: Fisher Sand & Gravel, Tempe, AZ

Bid Item 1: Crushed Aggregate

1 to 500 tons

501 to 1,000 tons

1,001 to 5,000 tons

5,001 to 10,000 tons

$7.00 per ton

$7.00 per ton

$6.75 per ton

$6.50 per ton

Bid Item 2: Riprap

Size 1to 10 tons 11 to 20 tons 21 to 100 tons 101 tons and above
1Y -4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3"-6" $12.00 per ton $12.00 per ton $12.00 per ton $12.00 per ton
4" - g" $14.00 per ton $14.00 per ton $14.00 per ton $14.00 per ton
4" - 12" $14.00 per ton $14.00 per ton $14.00 per ton $14.00 per ton
8" —16" $16.00 per ton $16.00 per ton $16.00 per ton $16.00 per ton
8" —24" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Company Name: AGE Contracting, Nogales, AZ

Bid Item 1: Crushed Aggregate

1 to 500 tons

501 to 1,000 tons

1,001 to 5,000 tons

5,001 to 10,000 tons

$11.50 per ton

$11.50 per ton

$11.50 per ton

$11.50 per ton
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Preliminary Bid Tabulation

Cochise County Procurement Department
IFB 15-38-HFP-04 — Crushed Aggregate & Riprap

7/6/2016

Company Name: AGE Contracting, Nogales, AZ (continued)

Bid Item 2: Riprap

Size

1to 10 tons

11 to 20 tons

21 to 100 tons

101 tons and above

1% -4

$12.70 per ton

$12.70 per ton

$12.70 per ton

$12.70 per ton

311 _ 6”

$21.80 per ton

$21.80 per ton

$21.80 per ton

$21.80 per ton

4 g

$25.90 per ton

$25.90 per ton

$25.90 per ton

$25.90 per ton

4"-12"

$25.90 per ton

$25.90 per ton

$25.90 per ton

$25.90 per ton

8" -16"

$23.90 per ton

$23.90 per ton

$23.90 per ton

$23.90 per ton

8" — 24"

$23.90 per ton

$23.90 per ton

$23.90 per ton

$23.90 per ton

Company Name: Empire Homes, Inc., Sonoita, AZ

Bid Item 1: Crushed Aggregate

1 to 500 tons

501 to 1,000 tons

1,001 to 5,000 tons

5,001 to 10,000 tons

$8.50 per ton

$8.25 per ton

$8.00 per ton

$7.75 per ton

Bid Item 2: Riprap

Size 1to 10 tons 11 to 20 tons 21 to 100 tons 101 tons and above
1Y -4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3'-6" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4"- 8" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" -12" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8"—16" $14.00 per ton $14.00 per ton $13.00 per ton $13.00 per ton
8" —24" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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