PRICING SHEET

Landscape and Utility Vehicles, Trailers and Equipment

OFFEROR:

Category 1: Lawn and Garden Equipment

Instructions: The basis for pricing shall be fixed discount(s) off published price list(s) or catalog(s). The
discount offers shall clearly identify the percent of discount to apply to the contract category. Proposed
products shall be for materials and equipment in current production and marketed to the general public
and education/government agencies at the time the proposal is submitted. For each manufacturer
and/or product line offered, include at minimum, manufacturer's name, percent of discount offered and
Manufaturer's website.

Percent Off List Manufacturer's

Manufacturer . .
Price Website

NO BID




PRICING SHEET

Landscape and Utility Vehicles, Trailers and Equipment

OFFEROR:

Category 2: Mowers

Instructions: The basis for pricing shall be fixed discount(s) off published price list(s) or catalog(s). The
discount offers shall clearly identify the percent of discount to apply to the contract category. Proposed
products shall be for materials and equipment in current production and marketed to the general public
and education/government agencies at the time the proposal is submitted. For each manufacturer
and/or product line offered, include at minimum, manufacturer’'s name, percent of discount offered and
Manufaturer's website.

Percent Off List Manufacturer's

Manufacturer R .
u u Price Website

NO BID




PRICING SHEET

Landscape and Utility Vehicles, Trailers and Equipment

OFFEROR:

Category 3: Athletic Field and Turf Equipment

Instructions: The basis for pricing shall be fixed discount(s) off published price list(s) or catalog(s). The
discount offers shall clearly identify the percent of discount to apply to the contract category. Proposed
products shall be for materials and equipment in current production and marketed to the general public
and education/government agencies at the time the proposal is submitted. For each manufacturer
and/or product line offered, include at minimum, manufacturer’'s name, percent of discount offered and
Manufaturer's website.

Percent Off List Manufacturer's

Manufacturer R .
u u Price Website

NO BID




PRICING SHEET

Landscape and Utility Vehicles, Trailers and Equipment

OFFEROR:

Category 4: Sprayers

Instructions: The basis for pricing shall be fixed discount(s) off published price list(s) or catalog(s). The
discount offers shall clearly identify the percent of discount to apply to the contract category. Proposed
products shall be for materials and equipment in current production and marketed to the general public
and education/government agencies at the time the proposal is submitted. For each manufacturer
and/or product line offered, include at minimum, manufacturer’'s name, percent of discount offered and
Manufaturer's website.

Percent Off List Manufacturer's

Manufacturer R .
u u Price Website

NO BID




PRICING SHEET

Landscape and Utility Vehicles, Trailers and Equipment

OFFEROR:

Category 5: Brush or Wood Chippers

Instructions: The basis for pricing shall be fixed discount(s) off published price list(s) or catalog(s). The
discount offers shall clearly identify the percent of discount to apply to the contract category. Proposed
products shall be for materials and equipment in current production and marketed to the general public
and education/government agencies at the time the proposal is submitted. For each manufacturer
and/or product line offered, include at minimum, manufacturer’'s name, percent of discount offered and
Manufaturer's website.

Percent Off List Manufacturer's

Manufacturer R .
u u Price Website

NO BID




PRICING SHEET

Landscape and Utility Vehicles, Trailers and Equipment

OFFEROR:

Category 6: Tractors

Instructions: The basis for pricing shall be fixed discount(s) off published price list(s) or catalog(s). The
discount offers shall clearly identify the percent of discount to apply to the contract category. Proposed
products shall be for materials and equipment in current production and marketed to the general public
and education/government agencies at the time the proposal is submitted. For each manufacturer
and/or product line offered, include at minimum, manufacturer’s name, percent of discount offered and
Manufaturer's website.

Percent Off List Manufacturer's

Manufacturer . .
Price Website

NO BID




PRICING SHEET

Landscape and Utility Vehicles, Trailers and Equipment

OFFEROR: SONSRAY MACHINERY, LLC

Category 7: Compact Excavators

Instructions: The basis for pricing shall be fixed discount(s) off published price list(s) or catalog(s). The discount offers shall clearly identify the percent of discount to apply to the
contract category. Proposed products shall be for materials and equipment in current production and marketed to the general public and education/government agencies at the time
the proposal is submitted. For each manufacturer and/or product line offered, include at minimum, manufacturer’'s name, percent of discount offered and Manufaturer's website.

Manufacturer List Price Percent Off List Price Manufact-urer's
Website
CASE SKID STEER LOADER:
SR160B $62,143.00 24% CASECE.COM
SR175B $65,784.00 24% CASECE.COM
SV185B $69,930.00 24% CASECE.COM
SR210B $69,551.00 24% CASECE.COM
SR240B $73,196.00 24% CASECE.COM
SR270B $86,406.00 24% CASECE.COM
SV280B $74,767.00 24% CASECE.COM
SV340B $93,972.00 24% CASECE.COM
CASE COMPACT TRACK LOADER:
TV270B $87,860.00 32% CASECE.COM
TR310B $92,113.00 32% CASECE.COM
TR340B $112,718.00 33% CASECE.COM
TV370B $101,621.00 33% CASECE.COM
TV450B $119,866.00 33% CASECE.COM
TV620B $155,777.00 32% CASECE.COM
CASE COMPACT MINI EXCAVATOR:
CX17C $45,876.00 26% CASECE.COM
CX26C $53,112.00 29% CASECE.COM
CX30C $57,793.00 29% CASECE.COM
CX37C $61,947.00 28% CASECE.COM
CX57C $100,029.00 29% CASECE.COM
CX60C $104,968.00 30% CASECE.COM
CASE MIDI EXCAVATOR:
CX75C $129,961.00 30% CASECE.COM
CX80C $143,059.00 30% CASECE.COM
CASE TRACTOR LOADER:
570NEP 2WD $105,694.00 30% CASECE.COM
570NEP 4WD $115,541.00 30% CASECE.COM
CASE TRACTOR LOADER BACKHOE:
580NEP 2WD $121,411.00 32% CASECE.COM
580NEP 4WD $132,414.00 32% CASECE.COM
580N 2WD $135,025.00 32% CASECE.COM
580N 4WD $144,543.00 34% CASECE.COM
580SN 2WD $143,863.00 34% CASECE.COM
580SN 4WD $158,117.00 34% CASECE.COM
580WT $170,985.00 34% CASECE.COM
590SN $190,509.00 34% CASECE.COM
CASE WHOLE GOOD ATTACHMENTS SAME AS MACHINE THAT THE ATTACHMENT IS ORDERED WITH  |CASECE.COM




PRICING SHEET

Landscape and Utility Vehicles, Trailers and Equipment

Category 8: Utility Trailers

Instructions: The basis for pricing shall be fixed discount(s) off published price list(s) or catalog(s). The
discount offers shall clearly identify the percent of discount to apply to the contract category. Proposed
products shall be for materials and equipment in current production and marketed to the general public
and education/government agencies at the time the proposal is submitted. For each manufacturer and/or
product line offered, include at minimum, manufacturer’'s name, percent of discount offered and

Manufaturer's website.

OFFEROR SONSRAY MACHINERY, LLC

Percent Off List

Manufacturer's

Manufacturer Price Website
FELLING TRAILERS:
FT-101 DROP DECK | SERIES 12%|FELLING.COM




PRICING SHEET

Landscape and Utility Vehicles, Trailers and Equipment

OFFEROR:

Category 9: Utility Boxes

Instructions: The basis for pricing shall be fixed discount(s) off published price list(s) or catalog(s). The
discount offers shall clearly identify the percent of discount to apply to the contract category. Proposed
products shall be for materials and equipment in current production and marketed to the general public
and education/government agencies at the time the proposal is submitted. For each manufacturer
and/or product line offered, include at minimum, manufacturer’s name, percent of discount offered and
Manufaturer's website.

Percent Off List Manufacturer's

Manufacturer R .
u u Price Website

NO BID




PRICING SHEET

Landscape and Utility Vehicles, Trailers and Equipment

OFFEROR:

Category 10: Utility Vehicles

Instructions: The basis for pricing shall be fixed discount(s) off published price list(s) or catalog(s). The
discount offers shall clearly identify the percent of discount to apply to the contract category. Proposed
products shall be for materials and equipment in current production and marketed to the general public
and education/government agencies at the time the proposal is submitted. For each manufacturer
and/or product line offered, include at minimum, manufacturer’s name, percent of discount offered and
Manufaturer's website.

Percent Off List Manufacturer's

Manufacturer R .
u u Price Website

NO BID




PRICING SHEET

Landscape and Utility Vehicles, Trailers and Equipment

Category 11: Towable

Instructions: The basis for pricing shall be fixed discount(s) off published price list(s) or catalog(s). The
discount offers shall clearly identify the percent of discount to apply to the contract category. Proposed
products shall be for materials and equipment in current production and marketed to the general public
and education/government agencies at the time the proposal is submitted. For each manufacturer and/or
product line offered, include at minimum, manufacturer's name, percent of discount offered and
Manufaturer's website.

OFFEROR:

Manufacturer

Percent Off List
Price

Manufacturer's
Website

NO BID




