City of Flagstaff

Streetlight Code Compliant Luminaires (2022-31), bidding on 01/11/2022 2:00 PM (MST)

Bid Results

Bidder Details

Vendor Name
Address

Respondee
Respondee Title
Phone

Email

Vendor Type
License #

Bid Detail

Bid Format
Submitted
Delivery Method
Bid Responsive
Bid Status
Confirmation #

Border States Electric Supply
5519 E Washington Street
Phoenix, Arizona 85034
United States

Jason Elgin

Account Manager
602-615-5253
jelgin@borderstates.com

Electronic
01/11/2022 10:19 AM (MST)

Submitted
277353

Respondee Comment

Buyer Comment

Attachments

File Title

File Name

Page 1 of 3
Printed 01/12/2022

File Type

City of Flagstaff - 2022-31 Streetlight Code Compliant Luminaires City of Flagstaff - 2022-31 Streetlight Code Compliant Luminaires General

Revised_12.22.21.pdf

Revised_12.22.21.pdf

PlanetBids, Inc.

Attachment



Line [tems

Item
Code

Item
#
Section 1
1 1A
2 1B
3 2
4 3
5 4
6 1A

1B
7

(3
8 2
9 3
10 4
11 1A
12 1B
13 2
14 3
15 4
16 1A
17 1B
18 2
19 3
20 4
21 1A
22 1B
23 2

Discount Terms

No Discount

Item Description

ASTROPHILE, 4000-PS1828-45-590
ASTROPHILE, 4000-PS1828-45-590-Ill
ASTROPHILE, 4000-PS1828-90-590
ASTROPHILE, 4000-PS1828-125-590
ASTROPHILE, 4000-EPH58-100-1650

COOPER, NVN-SA2A-AMB-U-SL2-AP-20K-PR7-10X
COOPER, NVN-SA2A-AMB-U-SL3-AP-20K-PR7-10X

COOPER, NVN-SA4A-AMB-U-SL2-AP-20K-PR7-10X

COOPER, GAN-SA8A-AMB-U-SL2-MA-AP-20K-
PR7-10X

COOPER, GAN-SAOA-AMB-U-SL2-ADJS-AP-20K-
PR7-10X

LUMEC, RFS-[60W16LEDTA-001]-G2-R2M-UNV-
DMG-API-RCD7-SP2-GY3

LUMEC, RFS-[60W16LEDTA-001]-G2-R3M-UNV-
DMG-API-RCD7-SP2-GY3

LUMEC, RFS-[108W32LEDTA-001]-G2-R2M-UNV-
DMG-API-RCD7-SP2-GY3

LUMEC, RFL-[180W80LEDTA-002]-G2-R2M-UNV-
DMG-API-RCD7-SP2-GY3

LUMEC, RFL-[350W112LEDA-001]-G2-R2M-UNV-
DMG-API-RCD7-SP2-GY3

AEL, ATBO P201 MVOLT R2 NL P7 RFD323775

AEL, ATBO P20X MVOLT R3 LWAMB NL P7
RFD323776

AEL, ATB2 P60X MVOLT R2 LWAMB NL P7
RFD323777

LITHONIA, DSX2 LED P4 AMBLW T2M MVOLT KMAS8
PER7 DDBXD MEZ147911

AEL, ATB2 P60X MVOLT R2 PCAMB NL P7
RFD323778

VPS/48L-45/AM/T2/UNV/MAF/LGS/PCR7-
SC/SF2/GYS

VPS/48L-45/AM/T3/UNV/MAF/LGS/PCR7-
SC/SF2/GYS

VPL/80L-140/AM/T2/UNV/MAF/LGS/PCR7-
SC/SF2/GYS

uoMm

Lump
Lump
Lump
Lump
Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

Lump

QTY Unit Price

1
1
1
1
1
1 $495.0000
1 $495.0000
1 $785.0000

1 $1,702.0000

1 $2,030.0000

1 $224.0000

1 $224.0000
1 $417.0000
1 $601.0000
1 $744.0000
1 $249.0000
1 $249.0000
1 $537.0000

1 $1,976.0000

1 $496.0000

1 $1,016.0000

1 $1,016.0000

1 $1,642.0000

Line Total

$14,898.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000

$495.0000

$495.0000

$785.0000

$1,702.0000

$2,030.0000

$224.0000

$224.0000

$417.0000

$601.0000

$744.0000

$249.0000

$249.0000

$537.0000

$1,976.0000

$496.0000

$1,016.0000

$1,016.0000

$1,642.0000

Response

No
No
No
No
No

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Comment

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

No bid

Quotation: 0025503213 Notwithstanding any offer under this quotation or other, separate
commitment to hold pricing for any period of time, Signify reserves the right, with our without
notice to the C

Quotation: 0025503213 Notwithstanding any offer under this quotation or other, separate
commitment to hold pricing for any period of time, Signify reserves the right, with our without
notice to the C

Quotation: 0025503213 Notwithstanding any offer under this quotation or other, separate
commitment to hold pricing for any period of time, Signify reserves the right, with our without
notice to the C

Quotation: 0025503213 Notwithstanding any offer under this quotation or other, separate
commitment to hold pricing for any period of time, Signify reserves the right, with our without
notice to the C

Quotation: 0025503213 Notwithstanding any offer under this quotation or other, separate
commitment to hold pricing for any period of time, Signify reserves the right, with our without
notice to the C
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Line Item Subtotals

Section Title Line Total
Section 1 $14,898.0000
Grand Total $14,898.0000

PlanetBids, Inc.



