MEMORANDUM

from the
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

Mike Reals, Public Works Manager w-—I:)XS;-

THROUGH: Tony Barnes, Director of Purchasing L , \/\ \

f | | | v W
FROM: Georgia Montgomery, Purchasing Specialist \JW%U\ VX\ \
SUBJECT: Bid No. 2016-029 ~ Inlet Linear Park Light Fixtures
DATE: August 24, 2016

Attached is the tabulation sheet for the above referenced bid and a copy of each bid
submitted. The file is available for review in the Purchasing Department.

The invitation was sent to 160 vendors. Eighteen (18) vendors requested
specifications with three (3) responding (16.66 %) plus 0 “No Bid” (16.66 %
total response).

Please respond to the Purchasing Department for recommendation of award.

Expiration date is October 22, 2016. Commission approval must be completed by this
date.

/gm
Attachment

cc: JT McDermott, Facilities Maintenance Division Manager



CITY OF FORT PIERCE
TABULATION OF BIDS

"Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received t'irmelyE
as of the above opening date and time. All other offers submitted in|
%response to thls s011c1tat10n, if any, are hereby reJected as late." ‘

&

'BID ON: ‘ Inlet Linear Park Light Fixtures
BIDNUMBER: | 2016029
'DATE: 08/23/16 @ 3:00 PM
'RECOMMENDED AWARD: | Pending

| RESPONSE

| 30f18=1666%

i 0 ”No Bids"

Total = 16.66 %

Vendor Unit Price Total

Mayer Electric Supply, Inc.

Tampa, FL $1,405.00 $50,580.00

J TI Electric USA Inc.

| West Palm Beach, FL $1424.86 $51,294.96
Graybar Electric §1425.00 | §51.300.00

Ft Pierce, FL

PLEASE NOTE: COMMISSION MEETINGS ARE HELD
THE FIRST AND THIRD MONDAY OF EVERY MONTH.
CALL THE PURCHASING DEPARTMENT WEDNESDAY
PRIOR TO THE MEETINGS FOR RECOMMENDATION OF
AWARD.

\/




DELIVER TO:

City of Fort Pierce
100 North U.S. #1
Fort Pierce, FL 34950

MAIL TO:

City of Fort Pierce Procurement Dept.
P.O. Box 1480

Fort Pierce, FL 34954-1480

INVITATION TO BID

and

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGMENT

Contact: Gelencia Carter, (772) 467-3748

Bid No: 2016-029

Pre-Bid Conference:
N/A

Bid Title: LIGHT FIXTURES — INLET
LINEAR PARK

Pre-Bid Conference Location:

N/A

Bid Opening Location:

City of Ft. Pierce Procurement Dept.
100 North U.S. #1, 1st Floor

Ft. Pierce, Florida 34950

Bid Due Date & Time:

8/23/16 by 3:00 PM

If you need any reasonable accommodation for
any type of disability in order to participate in
this procurement, please contact this department
as soon as possible.

Bidder Name:

Mailing Address:
6101 E Adamo Dr

I hereby certify that this bid is made without
prior understanding, agreement, or
connection with any corporation, firm, or
person submitting a bid for the same
materials, supplies or equipment, and is in all
respects fair and without collusion or fraud. I
agree to abide by all conditions of this bid and
certify that I am authorized to sign this bid for
the bidder.

UL

Authorized Signature (Manual)

City, State, Zip Code: Typed or Printed Name:
Tampa, FL 33619 Russ Williams
Type of Entity (Circle One): Title:
Partnership Proprietorship Outside Account Manager
; . ; brsiness
Incorporated in the State of: Alabama Year: 1930 Delivery in 60-75 days, ARO )z.)y Wiela

Phone Number: 239-672-0450

Payment Terms: Net 30 Days

Fax Number: 813.628-4578

FEIN or SS Number: 63-0274133

E-Mail Address: rwilliams@mayerelectric.com

Local Business: __ Y X N MWBE: _ Y XN

Bid Security is attached, when required, in the
amount of $

F.0.B. DESTINATION

If returning as a "No Bid" state
reason:

THIS PAGE MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED WITH YOUR BID

Revised July 2009

Bid No. 2016-029




o W=

Request for Taxpayer Give form to the
ev. October 200 requester. Do not
immmrzm Identification Number and Certification €600 s BIE.
Intemal Reverye Sanvice
.| Name (as shown on your Income tax retum)
S | Mayer Electric Supply Co, Inc.
g Business name, if dferent from above
g
8 g Check appropriate box: O wndivid VSole m C D Partnership Exempt
2% | LI umited iabitty company. Enter the tax classification (D=clsregarded entity, C=corporation, P=partrership) » . ... . O payee
63 | [ other (soa wstnuctiors) >
_:E: E Address (number, street, and apt. or suite no.) Requester's name and address (optional)
o | 3405 4th Avenue South
€ | oy, state, and ZIP code
& | Birmingham, AL 35222
(}8; List account number(s) here (cptional)

Taxpayer Identification Number (TIN)

Enter your TIN in the appropriate box. The TIN provided must match the name given on Line 1 to avoid
backup withholding. For individuals, this is your social security number (SSN). However, for a resident ' '
alien, sole proprietor, or disregarded entity, see the Parl | instructions on page 3. For other entilies, it is
your employer identification number (EIN). If you do not have a number, see How fo get a TIN on page 3. or

Note. if the account is in more than one name, ses the chart on page 4 for guidelines on whose

number to enler.

Social security number

' '

Employer identification number

63:0274133

I centification

Under penalties of perjury, | certify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer identification number (or | am waiting for a number 1o be issued to me), and
2. 1am not subject to backup withholding because: (a) | am exempt from backup withhelding, or (b) | have not been notified by the Internal

Revenue Service (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as

rotified me that | am no longer subject to backup withholding, ar
3. lamaU.S. citizen or other U.S, person (defined below).

a resuft of a failure to report all interest or dividends, or (c} the IRS has
d

Certification instructions. You must cross out item 2 above if you have been notified by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup
withholding because you have failed to report all interest and dividends on your tax return. For real estate transactions, item 2 does not apply.
For morigage interest paid, acquisition or abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, contributions to an individual retirement
arangement (IRA), and generally, payments other than interest and dividends, you are not required to sign the Certification, but you must

provide your correct TIN, See the instructions on page 4.

Sign Signature of
Here U.S. person b

Z 1L

Date > 5/ C(//é

General Instructions

Section references are to the Intemal Revenue Code unless
otherwise noted. .

Purpose of Form

A persan viho Is required to file an information retum with the
IRS must obtain your correct taxpayer identification number (TIN)
to report, for example, income paid to you, real estate
transactions, mortgage interest you paid, acquisition or
abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, or
contributions you made to an IRA,

Use Form W-9 only if you are a U.S. person (including a
resident alien), to provide your correct TIN to the person
requesting it (the requester) and, when applicable, to:

1. Centify that the TIN you are giving is correct (or you are
waiting for a number to be issued),

2. Cerlify that you are not subject to backup withholding, or

3. Claim exemption from backup withholding if you are a U.S.
exempt payee. If applicable, you are also certifying that as a
U.S. person, your allocable share of any partnership income from
a U.S. frade or business is not subject {o the withholding tax on
foreign partners' share of effectively connected income.

Note. If a requester gives you a form other than Form W-9 to
request your TIN, you must use the requester's form if it is
substantially similar to this Form W-9.

Definition of a U.S. person. For federal tax purposes, you are
considered a U.S. person if you are:

© An individual who is a U.S. citizen or U.S. resident alien,

® A partnership, corporation, company, or association created or
organized in the United States or under the laws of the United
States,

® An estate (other than a foreign estate), or

® A domestic trust (as defined in Regulations section
301.7701-7).

Special rules for partnerships. Partnerships that conduct a
trade or business in the United States are generally required to
pay a withholding tax on any foreign partners’ share of income
from such business. Further, in certain cases where a Form W-9
has not been received, a partnership is required fo presume that
a parlner is a foreign person, and pay the withholding tax.
Therefore, if you are a U.S. person that Is a parinerin a
partnership conducting a trade or business in the United States,
provide Form W-9 to the parinership to establish your U.S.
slatus and avoid withholding on your share of partnership
income.

The person who gives Form W-9 to the partnership for
purposes of establishing its U.S. status and avoiding withholding
on its allocable share of net income from the partnership
conducting a trade or business in the United States is in the
following cases:

® The U.S. owner of a disregarded entity and not the entity,

Cat. No. 10231X

W-9 Form

-14-

Form W-9 Rev. 10-2007)

Bid No. 2016-029



THE SUNRISE CITY

FORT PIERCE

(& 3
< 7 (/(I' l’/; '/{,//(

BID RESPONSE FORM

Bid Item

LIGHT FIXTURES — INLET LINEAR PARK

Bid Number

2016-029 || Due Date & Time 3:00 PM, Tuesday, August 23, 2016

The offerer

agrees to furnish the following items or services to the City of Fort Pierce at the

place specified, in accordance with specifications herein at the prices quoted below:

Quantity

Description

36

Philips Lighting Bollard $ 1.405.00 $ 50580.00

Model # BRM830-42CWL-NW-LA-
180-UNV

The Bidder hereby acknowledges receipt of the following addenda:

ADDENDUM NO. ADDENDUM DATE

(Please Check One)

** Do you accept the Purchasing Card (Visa): W Yes X No

¢ Percentage of discount off bid price when payment is made with Visa: 0 %

Manufacturer Proposed: _PHILIPS LIGHTING

Model:

BRM830-42CLW-NW-LA-180-UNV

Warranty: 1 YEAR WITH CUSTOM FINISH - Phillips warranty info attached
Vendor_MAYER ELECTRIC SUPPLY

Address

6101 E ADAMO DR

City, State, Zip Code_ TAMPA, FL 33619

Email Address Williams@mayerelectric.com

Typed Name, Title, Russ Wiliams ; Outside Account Manager

Signature

Z LYy Date_ 8122/16

Telephone # 239'672'0450 Fax # 81 3"628'4578

Bid Response Form -16 - Bid No. 2016-029




(*Please include Remit to address if different than address stated above)
Remit To: P.O.B0OX73812
NEWNAM, GA 30271

Check block below for applicable minority indicator:
71 Asian Indiano J Black o 0 Asian Pacific o Hispanic o

I Native American o Small Business 5 TWomen Owned o Small Disadvantage Business

Bid Response Form -17 - Bid No. 2016-029



Quote # F16-0506 FT PIERCE INLET LINEAR PARK BOLLARDS Date: 8/3/2016 Page 1

1133 West Morse Blvd.
= = Suite 100
s e s c a lighting ... Park, FL 32789
Moving almost at the speed of light! Tel: (407) 629-6100
Roadway and Municipality Division Fax: (407) 629-6213
To: Job/Project Name:
MAYER ELECTRIC FT PIERCE INLET LINEAR PARK BOLLARDS

Bid Date: 8/23/2016

Qty| Type Mfg |Description Unit Price Extd.Price

36 GARD |BRM830-42CLW-NW-LA-180-UNV

42" CAST ALUM WITH DOM LOVER
1 GARD |SET UP PAINT CHARGE SPECIAL COLOR

STERNBERG PARK GREEN
COLOR CHIP REQUIRED

36 GARD |POWDER COAT PER BOLLARD

TOTAL:
Prices firm for entry by: 45 Days $hipment by: 45 Days |Icad Time: 12-14 WEEKS

Complete quote must be used.

Subject to manufacturer's published terms and conditions of sale. Quotation is void if changed.

Per: Email: FDOT@SESCOLIGHTING.COM

Page 1 of 1



PHILIPS

Limited Warranty: Outdoor Professional Luminaires

Philips Lighting North America Corporation (“Philips”) warrants to the original purchaser (“Purchaser”) that the Philips branded outdoor
professional luminaires identified on Schedule 1 (“Products”) will be free from defects in material and workmanship which cause the
Product to fail to operate in accordance with the performance specifications set forth in documentation published for or provided with the
Product (“Specifications™) for the applicable period and subject to the additional terms and conditions set forth on Schedule 1 from the
date of purchase (as set forth in the applicable invoice) (“Warranty Period”). Unless otherwise noted on Schedule 1, Philips warrants
that any standard finish on a Product will be free of cracking, peeling, excessive fading, and corrosion defects during the applicable
Warranty Period. To the extent that an authorized Philips distributor is the Purchaser of the Products, such distributor may transfer this
limited warranty to subsequent purchasers of the Products, provided that such Products are resold in new condition and in their ori ginal
packaging. For LED Products, the Product shall be considered defective only if 10% or more of the LED components fail for such
Product.

Photocells (standard issue NEMA and button type), occupancy sensors, low voltage indicators, fuses, surge suppressors and other third
party accessories that are not manufactured by Philips are excluded from this warranty, but may be covered by a third party manufacturer.
Such third party manufacturer shall be solely responsible for the costs related to any claims associated with any such accessories. Extended
life photocells carry a 10-year limited warranty from the third party manufacturer. Emergency battery packs and polycarbonate lenses
(used on vandal resistant products or as vandal resistant covers or options) have a Warranty Period of | year.

If any Product covered by this limited warranty is returned by Purchaser in accordance with Philip’s Terms and Conditions of Sale
(available at www.philips.com/termsandconditionsprofessional) within the Warranty Period, and Philips determines to its satisfaction that
such Product failed to satisfy this warranty, Philips will, at its option, repair or replace the Product or the defective part thereof, or
reimburse Purchaser for the purchase price, subject to the terms and conditions set forth herein. For purposes of clarity, "repair or replace
the Product or the defective part thereof” does not include any removal or reinstallation costs or expenses, including, without limitation,
any labor costs or expenses, shipping costs to return non-conforming Products or any damages that may occur during the return of Product
to Philips. If Philips chooses to replace the Product and is not able to do so because it has been discontinued or is not available, Philips
may replace it with a comparable product. Philips reserves the right to use new, reconditioned, refurbished, repaired or remanufactured
products or parts in the repair or replacement of any Product covered by this limited warranty.

This limited warranty is subject to the following additional conditions:

e The Products have been properly handled, stored, wired, transported, installed, operated and maintained in accordance with
the applicable Specifications.

e A Philips representative will have access to the failed Products and the fixtures used to operate them. If the fixture or other
parts become suspect, the representative shall have the right to invite other manufacturers’ representatives to evaluate the
lighting system components.

e The Product has been purchased directly from an authorized Philips distributor/dealer for use in regions that are within the
jurisdiction of the United States or Canada.

¢ Purchase receipt for the Product is available for inspection by Philips.

This limited warranty does not apply to damage or failure to perform arising as a result of any acts of God or from any abuse, misuse,
abnormal use, improper power supply, powers surges or fluctuations, corrosive environments, neglect, exposure or any use or installation
in violation of the instructions or restrictions prescribed by Philips or any applicable standard or code, including those contained in the
latest National Electrical Code, Standards for Safety of Underwriters Laboratory, Inc. (UL), the American National Standards Institute
(ANSI), or, in Canada, the Canadian Standards Association (CSA). No agent, distributor or dealer is authorized to change, modify or
extend the terms of this limited warranty on behalf of Philips. THIS LIMITED WARRANTY IS VOID IF THE PRODUCT IS NOT
USED FOR THE PURPOSE FOR WHICH IT IS DESIGNED OR IF ANY REPAIRS OR ALTERATIONS ARE MADE BY ANY
PERSON NOT AUTHORIZED BY PHILIPS IN WRITING.

THIS LIMITED WARRANTY IS THE ONLY WARRANTY GIVEN BY PHILIPS WITH RESPECT TO THE PRODUCTS AND THE
SOLE REMEDY FOR ANY AND ALL CLAIMS, IN CONTRACT, IN TORT OR OTHERWISE ARISING FROM THE FAILURE OF
PRODUCT AND IS GIVEN IN LIEU OF ALL OTHER WARRANTIES, EXPRESS OR IMPLIED, INCLUDING, BUT NOT LIMITED
TO, WARRANTIES OF MERCHANTABILITY OR FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE, WHICH WARRANTIES ARE
HEREBY EXPRESSLY DISCLAIMED. PURCHASER'S EXCLUSIVE REMEDY FOR ANY NONCONFORMITY OR DEFECT IN
ANY PRODUCT SHALL BE ONLY AS EXPLICITLY SET FORTH HEREIN. UNDER NO CIRCUMSTANCES SHALL PHILIPS’
AGGREGATE LIABILITY ARISING OUT OF OR IN CONNECTION WITH A DEFECTIVE PRODUCT, IN CONTRACT, TORT
OR OTHERWISE, EXCEED THE PURCHASE PRICE OF THE PRODUCT TO WHICH SUCH LIABILITY RELATES. IN NO
EVENT SHALL PHILIPS BE LIABLE FOR SPECIAL, INCIDENTAL, CONSEQUENTIAL, INDIRECT OR COMPENSATORY
DAMAGES, INCLUDING, WITHOUT LIMITATION, DAMAGES RESULTING FROM LOSS OF USE, PROFITS, BUSINESS OR

Updated June 2015

Philips Lighting North America Corporation
200 Franklin Square Drive, Somerset, NJ 08873.
Tel. 855-486-2216

Philips Lighting Canada Ltd.
281 Hillmount Rd, Markham, ON, Canada L6C 253
Tel. 800-668-9008




GOODWILL EVEN IF PHILIPS WAS ADVISED OF OR WAS OTHERWISE AWARE OF THE POSSIBILITY OF SUCH
DAMAGES.

Special conditions related to all solar Products:

e The Warranty Period for batteries, pole/finish and solar panel racking is 1 year.

e Batteries are fully charged when shipped to the Purchaser or installation site. The batteries must be installed and operational
no later than 2 months from the day of shipment. If stored beyond such time period, the Purchaser is responsible for recharging
the batteries according to battery manufacturer’s instructions at 2 months and every two month thereafter. This limited
warranty does not cover batteries if: (i) program has been altered without Philips’ authorization, (ii) systems that have not been
designed or sized according to Philips standard design practices, or (iii) systems where Philips has conveyed as per specific
sales orders, that battery life and other components will be less than the Warranty Period.

e Improper installation includes but is not limited to improper placement, orientation, tilt and/or shading conditions not
considered in the energy profile and design conditions.

This limited warranty is effective for the purchases of the Product on or after the effective date set forth herein and is in consideration of
and is expressly subject to and conditioned by the terms set forth herein. Philips reserves the right to modify this warranty from time to
time and any modifications shall be effective for all orders placed on or after the effective date of such revised warranty.

Updated June 2015

Philips Lighting North America Corporation

200 Franklin Square Drive, Somerset, NJ 08873.
Tel. 855-486-2216

Philips Lighting Canada Ltd.
281 Hillmount Rd, Markham, ON, Canada L6C 253
Tel. 800-668-9008




PHILIPS

OUTDOOR PROFESSIONAL LUMINAIRES (E

ise decribed below shall have a arraty eriod of 1 r e

Limited Warranty: Outdoor Professional Luminaires

Special Conditions
E Stanrd shes: 5 ye warraty finish for LED dcs and | yar arraty on all other roducts. =F
. 5 years 1 year

PHIU ps Custom finishes: 1 year warranty on the finish on all products.

Stu n cﬂ Optical color filters made from glass or polymeric materials such as acrylic, polyester or polycarbonate
have a Warranty Period of 1 year from the date of original shipment. Color fading of the lens material of
any kind is not covered under this limited warranty.

Standard finishes: 5 year warranty on finish.

PHILIPS 5 years 5 years
Custom finishes: 1 year warranty on finish.

G carpco
Optical color filters made from glass or polymeric materials such as acrylic, polyester or polycarbonate
have a Warranty Period of 1 year from the date of original shipment. Color fading of the lens material of
any kind is not covered under this limited warranty.

Urban Standard finishes: 5 year warranty on finish.
5 years 3 years

PHILIPS Custom finishes: 1 year warranty on finish.

HAaDCOo

PHILIPS

LUMEL

Landscape and Residential Landscape Products: Warranty Period for all grade mounted composite luminaires, copper luminaires and
5 years 3 years transformers is 10 years. Lifetime warranty offered on the finish for all cast bronze and stainless steel

PHILIPS housing.

HADCO Residential Products: Lifetime warranty offered on the finish to all original Purchasers on residential
lighting fixtures and posts.

Roadway Standard finishes: 10 year warranty on the finish for LED products and 5 year warranty on the finish for all
10 years 3 years other products.
PHILIPS Custom finishes: 1 year warranty on finish.
LUMELC
POLES AND BRACKETS
T “Philips Brand - Aluminum | Stegi 7 2 dameine ” : Special Conditions
Standard finishes on aluminum: 5 year warranty on finish.
PHILIPS 3 years 1 year Custom finishes on aluminum: 1 year warranty on finish.
G GARDCO Standard finishes on steel: 1 year warranty on finish.
Custom finishes on steel: 1 year warranty on finish.

PHILIPS

BAREREEG High Mast poles and raising/lowering devices have a 1 year Warranty Period.

PHILIPS

LUMEL

Updated June 2015

Philips Lighting Canada Ltd.
281 Hillmount Rd, Markham, ON, Canada L6C 253
Tel. 800-668-9008

Philips Lighting North America Corporation
200 Franklin Square Drive, Somerset, NJ 08873.
Tel. 855-486-2216




COLORKINETICS

,,,,,,,,, __ Special Conditions.

: T ALL POUCTS arranty Period for products puhasd used 7' onTal e
— three (3) years.
@ ¥ KiNETICs
VYAYA WHITE UL 5 yearsl ‘Warranty Period for products purchased or used for touring and / or rental PUIposes is
PRODUCTS one (1) year.
VAYA ALL 5 'Warranty Period assumes that the Products are operated for less than 12 hours per
OTHER PRODUCTS A day;

Updated June 2015

Philips Lighting North America Corporation

200 Franklin Square Drive, Somerset, NJ 08873.
Tel. 855-486-2216

Philips Lighting Canada Ltd.
281 Hillmount Rd, Markham, ON, Canada L6C 253
Tel. 800-668-9008




PHILIPS

G carpco

Bollards

- Dome/bevel topr louver

Project

Location:

Cat No:

Type

Quantity

Notes

Philips Gardco dome and bevel top louver LED bollards provide uniform

illumination, superior spacing and solid vandal resistance. Rugged extruded and
cast construction with silicone seals and gasketing assure years of durability. Our
advanced stack-louver LED technology and motion response provide maximized
light output energy savings.

Ordering guide Example: BRM830-42-CWL-NW-360-UNIV-BRP-SPR
LED LED Lighted
Prefix Height Control* Selection Coverage Voltage Finish Options
BRM830- |[42 - |[CWL- NW |-LA|| 180 |- |[UNIV]- |[SC |- 1]
BRM830 4 MR cw 360 347° BLP SPR
Dome top with cast 4 Motion Response 6500K. 75 CRI 360’ lighted NIV Black Paint Surge Protection for 120-277V input
aluminum base 362 l— LE:);:‘tlay (;n low NW louvers (120-277v) wp meeting ANSI C62.41.2
BRM31' 36" ev‘:‘( Wiwhen :‘° 4500k 75CRI| {[180 White Paint SPRH
Dome top head only 5 o ‘_on Bpiesen 180° lighted Surge Protection for 347V input meeting
u anddingregsnto ww louvers (pro- BRP ANSIC62.412
BRM833 m full light output 3000K, 75CRI 'd dp . Bronze Paint
Dome top with natrual (41W) when motion Hoss re u'ce
concrote baga fsfactad backside light) NP
etecte ’ ¢
Solid Colors Natural Aluminum Paint
BRM833B T
Dome top with beige c W, LA® oc
F:) g onst.an attage ks Optional Color Specify optional color
conereic base Full Light Output - OrRAL. ex. OC-LGP or OC-RAL7024
BRM33G full light output only =
’ (41W). No motion
Deme topawithgrey sensorincluded [Special Color Specify. Must suppl
concrete base ; : .
fcolor chip. Requires factory quote.
BRM834

Bevel top with cast
aluminum base

BRM835'
Bevel top head only

BRM837
Bevel top with natural
concrete base

BRM837B
Bevel top with beige
concrete base

BRMB837G
Beveltop with grey
concrete base

1. Not available in 347V.
2. BRM830 and BRM834 only.

3. 11" height option to be selected only for "head only” units - BRM831and BRM835.

4. Avariation of LED wattage (+/- 8%) may occur due to LED manufacturer's forward
volt specification and ambient temperature.)

LED_bollard_BRM830_837 07/16 pagelof3

5. Consult factory for lead times

6. 347V bollards require and include a step-down transformer in bollard. Not available

in BRM831 or BRM835.



Dome or bevel top louver

BRM830/831/833/834/835/837 LED bollard

Dimensions
BRM830 / BRM834 BRM831/ BRM835
Y

LED Power st
Supply - MR
|~ Units Only?

42" (106,68 cm)
or
36" (9144 cm) —

inl[iary Transformer
(347V Bollards on

= L 3. LED Power Supply

g locations shown are
for Motion Response

(2032 cm (MR) luminaires
only. CWL luminaires

feature the LED
Power Supply in the

bollard head.
BRM830 / BRM834

4 3/4" Bolt Circle (1207 cm)

Stub-up Projection 3" Max. (7.32 cm)
Bolt Projection 11/2" + 1/4" 37
cm £ .64 cm)

3" Conduit Opening

(762 cm)

NOTE: Factory supplied template must be used when setting anchor bolts. Philips Gardco will not honor any

é 11" (27.94 cm)

8" Concrete Base

BRM833 / BRM837

e

el

| 4

17"
(4318 cm)

>

LED Power g
Supply - MR~

Units Only?

o

PR S S T
AN AN T N L AN

(20.32 cm)

3/8" X 8" X 11/2" Anchor Bolts
(953 cm x 20.32 cm x 3.81cm)

BRM833 / BRM837

9 1/2" Bolt Circle
(2413 cm)

claim for incorrect anchorage placement from failure to use factory supplied templates.

LED_bollard_BRM830_837 07/16 page 2of 3

Grade

LED Bollard

Cast Top

Motion
Sensor
and
LED Driver

Modular
Louvers



BRM830/831/833/834/835/837 LED bollard

Dome or bevel top louver

Specifications
Upper Housing

Diecast aluminum dome top secures to one-piece louvered casting
with three (3) concealed tamper resistant screws.

Lower Housing

BRM830 / BRM834: Luminaire features a cylindrical 125" (:318 cm)
wall 6063-T5 extruded aluminum base housing. Bottom section has a
welded-in cast ring for attachment to base assembly with four (4) hex
head set screws.

BRM831 / BRM835: Louver head assembly is affixed to ballast mounting
bracket which is suitable for insertion into architectural elements (by
others)

BRM 833 / BRM837: Luminaire includes a pre-cast concrete base
constructed with steel molds and wire reinforcing. Base is acid-etched
to provide a smooth textured aggregate finish.

LED Performance

PREDICTED LUMEN DEPRECIATION DATA*

Terr?pn;zft;]rte ’C Driver mA L;, Hours®
15°C 350 112,000
25°C 350 90,000
40°C 350 65,000

4 Predicted performance derived from LED manufacturer's data and engineering design
estimates, based on IESNA LM-80 methodology Actual experience may vary due to field
application conditions

5 Ly, is the predicted time when LED performance depreciates to 70% of initial lumen output

Optical System

Philips Gardco LED Bollards feature the advanced Gardco stacked
louver LED technology, assuring maxmimized light output. Each
individual louver is replaceable if needed or desired.

Anchorage

BRMB830 / BRM834: Base assembly consists of a cast aluminum
platform and ballast mounting bracket. Assembly is secured and
leveled to the mounting foundation with four (4) 3/8" X 8" x 11/2" (953
€m x 20.32 cm x 3.81 cm) anchor bolts on a 4 3/4" (12.07 cm) bolt circle.

BRM 831/ BRM835: Mounting plate is cast aluminum with slots to
accept anchor bolts (by others) at 90° on a 6 1/4” (15.88 cm) diameter
bolt circle. A 41/2" (11.43 cm) diameter opening is required to house LED
Power Supply for Motion Response (MR) units.

BRM833 / BRM837: Base assembly consists of four (4) galvanized steel
base tabs fastened to pre-cast concrete base. Assembly is secured and
leveled to the mounting foundation with four (4) 3/8" X 8" X 1 1/2" (953
€m x 20.32 cm x 3.81 cm) anchor bolts on a 9 1/2" (2413 cm) bolt circle.
Base is designed for 5" (12.7 cm) direct burial.

Electrical

For CWL bollards, the LED power supply is located within the bollard
head. For Motion Response (MR) bollards the LED power supply is
located within the bollard shaft. Bollards accept from 120 Volts through
277 Volts, 50hz to 60 hz, input. Bollards with 347V input require and
include a step-down transformer (placed within the bollard shaft) to
provide proper input voltage to the LED power supply. The LED driver
is located in the upper dome. LED power supplies and LED drivers are
replaceable. LEDs provided as specified.

Luminaires ordered with Motion Response include a microwave motion
sensor. The motion sensor is completely and safely concealed within
the LED Bollard head to avoid potential vandalism to the sensor.

LEDs operate on Low Level (8 watts) when no motion is present. LEDs
increase to full light output (41 watts) when motion is detected. Motion
Response system permits adjustments for time on high level and
motion sensitivity.

Approximate Motion Sensor Detection Pattern:

<—— PATHWAYDIRECTION —M— »

Bollard orientation is adjustable in 120° increments. Consult LED Bollard
Motion Response installation instruction sheets for more detailed
information concering bollard placement and sensor performance.
Luminaire Finish

Each luminaire receives a fade and abrasion resistant, electrostatically
applied, thermally cured textured powdercoat finish

Labels

All luminaires bear UL or CUL (where applicable) Wet Location labels.

Warranty

5 year limited warranty. See philips.com/luminaires for complete details
and exclusions.

©2015 Koninklijke Philips NV. All rights reserved.

Philips reserves the right to make changes in specifications
and/or to discontinue any product at any time without notice
or obligation and will not be liable for any consequences
resulting from the use of this publication.
philips.com/luminaires

LED_bollard_BRMB830_837 07/16 page3of3

PHILIPS

Philips Lighting, North America Corporation
200 Franklin Square Drive, Somerset, NJ 08873
Tel. 855-486-2216

Philips Lighting Canada Ltd.
281 Hillmount Rd, Markham, ON, Canada L6C 253
Tel. 800-668-9008



Scott Randolph, Tax Collector

Local Business Tax Receipt Orange County, Florid:

"his local business tax receipt is in addition to and not in lieu of any other tax required by law or municipal ordinance. Businesses are subject to regulation of zoning, health and ofl
awful authorities. This receipt is valid from October 1 through September 30 of receipt year. Delinquent penalty is added October 1.

2015
3502 WHOLESALE-ELECTRICA $50.00
2600 PANEL BOARD MANUFAC $30.00

TOTAL TAX $130.00
REGULATED WASTE $50.00
PREVIOUSLY PAID $180.00
TOTAL DUE $0.00

4161 N JOHN YOUNG PY
A - ORLANDO, 32804

- PAID: $180.00 0098-00673870- -7/13/2015 -
Scott Randolph, Tax Collector

EXPIRES  9/30/2016 3502-0597724

21 EMPLOYEE {3200 RETAL $50.00 21 EMPLOYEE |
10 EMPLOYEE ! ] '

SUMMERLIN JAMES T PRESIDENT

MAYER ELECTRIC SUPPLY COMPANY INC
C/O TAX DEPT

P O BOX 1328

BIRMINGHAM AL 35201-1328

Local Business Tax Receipt Orange County, Florid:

“his local business tax receipt is in addition to and not in lieu of any other tax required by law or municipal ordinance. Businesses are subject to regulation of zoning, health and otf
awful authorities. This receipt is valid from October 1 through September 30 of receipt year. Delinquent penalty is added October 1.

2015
3502 WHOLESALE-ELECTRICA $50.00
2600 PANEL BOARD MANUFAC $30.00

TOTAL TAX $130.00
REGULATED WASTE $50.00
PREVIOUSLY PAID $180.00
TOTAL DUE $0.00

4161 N JOHN YOUNG PY
A - ORLANDO, 32804

PAID: $180.00 0099-00673870 7/13/2015

EXPIRES 9/30/2016 3502-0597724
$50.00 21 EMPLOYEE !

21
10

MMERLIN JAMES T PRESIDENT

AYER ELECTRIC SUPPLY COMPANY INC
/0 TAX DEPT

P O BOX 1328

BIRMINGHAM AL 35201-1328

This receipt is official when validated by the Tax Collector.

HIT- £ ] ~0¢ 5T




ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT ¢« PERMITTING

Local Business Tax Receipt
City Hall, 400 South Orange Avenue, First Floor
Post Office Box 4990
Orlando, FL 32802-4990

Phone: 407.246.2204 Fax: 407.246.3420

PROMPT! Interactive Voice Response System: 407.246.4444
Visit our website: www.CityofOrlando.net/permits




CITY OF FORT PIERCE BIDDER’S CHECKLIST

This checklist is provided to assist each Bidder in the preparation of their bid response. Included in this
checklist are important requirements, which is the responsibility of each Bidder to submit with their response in
order to make their response fully compliant. This checklist is only a guideline, it is the responsibility of each
Bidder to read and comply with the Invitation to Bid in its entirety.

Check “Yes” or “No” to each of the following:
YES NO

N
P

Is Invitation to Bid cover page (page 1) completed, signed and attached?

~
P

Is Bid Response Form completed, signed and attached?

A X

W-9 Form completed, signed and attached?

All prices have been reviewed for mathematical accuracy, all price
corrections initialed, and all price extensions and totals thoroughly
checked.

Include proof of proper licensing as stated in bid documents.

Bid envelope is marked accordingly.

O P‘ |?‘

Are three (3) complete bid packages included (one original and two copies)?

Is each Bid Addendum (when issued) signed and included? No ;UJLM(M}

PLEASE SIGN AND RETURN WITH BID %_4"&-

& —_—

Bidder’s Checklist - 18- : Bid No. 2016-029



DELIVER TO:

City of Fort Pierce
100 North U.S. #1
Fort Pierce, FLL 34950

MAIL TO:

City of Fort Pierce Procurement Dept.
P.O. Box 1480

Fort Pierce, FL. 34954-1480

INVITATION TO BID

and

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGMENT

Contact: Gelencia Carter, (772) 467-3748

Bid No: 2016-029

Pre-Bid Conference :
N/A

Bid Title: LIGHT FIXTURES — INLET
LINEAR PARK

Pre-Bid Conference Location:

Bid Opening Location:
City of Ft. Pierce Procurement Dept.
100 North U.S. #1, 1st Floor

-----__I_[__ LlocrBie USSR -ZNQ.

Mailing Address:
_________ Q1 Dfavhe fus
e W1 Cay | Beeh £y

/A Ft. Pierce, Florida 34950
Bid Due Date & Time: If you need any reasonable accommodation for
’ any type of disability in order to pal"ticipate in
ﬂ J 0) & 3 {) 0 } (ﬁ :ll;lssolz)l:;ls":(:lsl:illl)?el_)lease contact this department
Bidder Name: I hereby certify that this bid is made without

prior understanding, agreement, or
connection with any corporation, firm, or
person submitting a bid for the same
materials, supplies or equipment, and is in all
respects fair and without collusion or fraud. I
agree to abide by all conditions of this bid and
certify that I am authorized to sign this bid for
the bidder.

X G’ﬂ/ﬂﬁﬁ C @U«\uﬂ&)
Authorizéd Signature (Manual)

City, State, Zip Code:

Typed or Printed Name: O

Wesi %,,_/w 6@13:@!“'/ ,'7[ ?3’40‘% e o(Ge ) )ﬁ/\J/ﬁ{
/
TypeofEntity (Circle One): Title: _ ”
;Corporatiop) Partnership Proprietorship 5/2 arelr MhAws vl L3

Incorporated in the State of: FLOQ\ P{Year: Jrp <

So > [-Ro
Delivery in Re QOOT"dJ;,S' “Ro Sesce

Phone Number: 5@; b¥& b 379 ¥

Payment Terms: Net 30 Days

Fax Number: Rel 65 24 ’f’ 7

FEIN or SS Number: o6 -5 9na 497

E-Mail Address: SﬂLﬁ 5@ frereasRic U SQ ,Com

Local Business: __Y __N) MWBE: _Y _N

Bid Security is attached, when required, in the
amount of $

F.0.B. DESTINATION

If returning as a "No Bid" state
reason:

THIS PAGE MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED WITH YOUR BID

Revised July 2009

Bid No. 2016-029




THE SUNRISE CITY

'FORT PIERCE

/ lakida
BID RESPONSE FORM
Bid Item LIGHT FIXTURES — INLET LINEAR PARK
Bid Number 2016-029 Due Date & Time 3:00 PM, Tuesday, August 23, 2016

The offerer agrees to furnish the following items or services to the City of Fort Pierce at the
place specified, in accordance with specifications herein at the prices quoted below:

Quantity | Description Unit Price Total
Philips Lighting Bollards 1994, 8l e
36 Model # BRM830-42CWL-NW-LA- s 1197, $_51 474
180-UNV

The Bidder hereby acknowledges receipt of the following addenda:

ADDENDUM NO. ADDENDUM DATE _
(IVzeck One)
% Do you accept the Purchasing Card (Visa): O Yes No

% Percentage of discount off bid price when payment is made with Visa: ( 2 % Cod WS

3.6 Pecee”

R em €30-Y2 CoW ~ N - LA ~ 4O Ut

Manufacturer Proposed:

Model: ‘
- Warranty: 6 f/./('q({_

Vendor T | Elecfe  USA TG
Address 27 8‘1 SHawnNee Avc-

/ g
City, State, Zip Code Qmm Deac »( Fo 3340
Email Address S"“”%C i eLéc(ﬁlc USA, L
Typed Name, Title, éeo( 9e C OL) A2
Signature é\”fﬁ"’jvf/ C/@‘-‘@A Date 515 20l
Telephone # 5&)‘ b 59928 Fax # 56 [ é §b3G4 7

Bid Response Form -16 -

Bid No. 2016-029



‘Quote # F16-0506 FT PIERCE INLET LINEAR PARK BOLLARDS Date: 7/29/2016 Page 1
1133 West Morse Blvd.

s e 5 c o lighting \Sh}lii;:ei(l)’(;ﬂg FL 32789

Moving almost at the speed of light! Tel: (407) 629-6100
Roadway and Municipality Division Fax: (407) 629-6213

To: Job/Project Name:
TI ELECTRIC FT PIERCE INLET LINEAR PARK BOLLARDS
2724 SHAWNEE AVE
WEST PALM BEACH, FL
. Bid Date: 8/2/2016
Q| Tpe | Mg [Desaipion T UnePrce] FxdPrcs
36 GARD |BRM830-42CLW-NW-L.A-180-UNV ’ y
42" CAST ALUM WITH DOM LOVER a
1 GARD [SET UP PAINT CHARGE SPECIAL COLOR , *(_} 3
STERNBERG PARK GREEN
COLOR CHIP REQUIRED !
36 "GARD |POWDER COAT PER BOLLARD
TOTAL: | [ .
Prices firm for entry by: 45 Days | Shipment by: 45 Days [Lead Time: 12-14 WEEKS |
Subject to manufacturer's published terms and conditions of sale. Quotation is void if changed. '
Complete quote must be used. Fd

Printed: 07/29/16 14:13:25 Per: D Stewart Email: FDOT@SESCOLIGHTING.COM

Page 1 of 1



fon W=9

(Rev. December 2014)
Department of the Treasury
Internal Revenue Service

Request for Taxpayer
Identification Number and Certification

Give Form to the
requester. Do not
send to the IRS.

1 Name (as shown on your income tax retumn). Name Is required on this line; do not leave this line blank.
Tl Electric USA Inc.
& 2 Business name/disregarded entity name, if different from above
o
g
2‘ 3 Check appropriate box for federal tax classification; check only one of the following seven boxes: 4 Sx'empttii(t){‘s (Co‘i"?Sdi_iRgly ?nly to
i s uals;
g O Ir}di\l/iduaVs%Ie ;;_r‘(_)grietor or C Corporation [ ] s Corporation [ ] Partnership [ Trust/estate ﬁ,it,fjgtﬁﬂ,s 2,3, ;:g;na)):w HsiSee
0 single-member
S.' -3 E] Limited liability company. Enter the tax classification (C=C corporation, S=S corporation, P=partnership) » Exempt payee code (i any)
> — . ;
° S Note. For a single-member LLC that is disregarded, do not check LLC; check the appropriate box in the line above for Exemption from FATCA reporting
R the tax classification of the single-member owner, code (if any)
ta f [] other (see instructions) > {Applies to accounts maintained outside the U.S.)
'% 5 Address (number, street, and apt. or suite no.) Requester's name and address (optional)
8. |2724 Shawnee Ave
@ [ & City, state, and ZiP cods
]
© |West Palm Beach, FL. 33409
7 List account number(s) here (optional)

m: Taxpayer Identification Number (T IN)

Enter your TIN in the appropriate box. The TIN provided must match the name given on line 1 to avoid
backup withholding. For individuals, this is generally your social security number (SSN). However, for a
resident alien, sole proprietor, or disregarded entity, see the Part | instructions on page 3. For other = =
entities, it is your employer identification number (EIN). If you do not have a number, see How to geta

TIN on page 3.

Social security number l

or

Note, If the account is in more than one name, see the instructions for line 1 and the chart on page 4 for | Employer identification number

guidelines on whose number to enter,

2(0|~-|8l4]0|2]|4|4|7

ETAIN  Certification

Under penalties of perjury, | certify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer identification number (or | am waiting for a number to be issued to me); and

2. | am not subject to backup withholding because: (a) | am exempt from backup withholding, or (b) I have not been notified by the Internal Revenue
Service (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a result of a failure to report all interest or dividends, or (c) the IRS has notified me that | am

no longer subject to backup withholding; and

3. l'am a U.S, citizen or other U.S. person (defined below); and

4. The FATCA code(s) entered on this form (if any) indicating that | am exempt from FATCA reporting is correct.
Certification instructions. You must cross out item 2 above if you have been notified by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup withholding
because you have failed to report all interest and dividends on your tax return. For real estate transactions, item 2 does not apply. For mortgage
interest paid, acquisition or abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, contributions to an individual retirement arrangement (IRA), and
generally, payments other than interest and dividends, you are not required to sign the certification, but you must provide your correct TIN. See the

instructions on page 3. A 7
Sign Signature of ) P
Here US.person> __ J¢ Y (/& ,é_—_. Date b g / /Q
N é [«
° Form 1098 (home mortgage interest), 1098-E (student loan interest), 1098-T

General Instructions

Section references are to the Internal Revenue Code unless otherwise noted.,
Future developments. Information about developments affecting Form W-9 (such
as legislation enacted after we release it) is at www.irs.gov/fwg,

{

Purpose of Form

An individual or entity (Form W-9 requester) who is required to file an information
return with the IRS must obtain your correct taxpayer identification number (TIN)
which may be your social security number (SSN), Individual taxpayer identification
number (ITIN), adoption taxpayer identification number (ATIN), or employer
identification number (EIN), to report on an information return the amount paid to
you, or other amount reportable on an information return. Examples of information
returns include, but are not limited to, the following:

° Form 1099-INT (interest earned or paid)

° Form 1099-DIV (dividends, including those from stocks or mutual funds)

¢ Form 1099-MISC (various types of income, prizes, awards, or gross proceeds)
° Form 1099-B (stock or mutual fund sales and certain other transactions by
brokers)

° Form 1099-S (proceeds from real estate transactions)

° Form 1099-K (merchant card and third party network transactions)

(tuition)
* Form 1099-C (canceled debt)
° Form 1098-A (acquisition or abandonment of secured property)

Use Form W-9 only if you are a U.S, person (including a resident alien), to
provide your correct TIN.

If you do not return Form W-9 to the requester with a TIN, you might be Subject
to backup withholding. See What is backup withholding? on page 2.

By signing the filled-out form, you: ¥

1. Certify that the TIN you are giving is correct (or you are walting for a number
to be issued),

2. Certify that you are not subject to backup withholding, or

3. Claim exemption from backup withholding if you are a U.S. exempt payee. If
applicable, you are also certifying that as a U.S. person, your allocable share of
any partnership income from a U.S. trade or business is not subject to the
withholding tax on foreign partners' share of effectively connected income, and

4. Certify that FATCA code(s) entered on this form (if any) indicating that you are
exempt from the FATCA reporting, is correct, See What is FATCA reporting? on
page 2 for further information,

Cat. No. 10231X

Form W=9 (Rev. 12-2014)




(*Please include Remit to address if different than address stated above)

Remit To:
Check block below for applicable minority indicator:
O Asian Indiano 0 Black o 0 Asian Pacific o Hispanic){

0 Native American o Small Business o OWomen Owned o Small Disadvantage Business

Bid Response Form -17- Bid No. 2016-029



SMALL BUSINESS CERTIF ICATION
The City of West Palm Beach’s Small Busmess Program
A Certlﬁes that

TI ELECTRIC USA INC

Has met the necessary requlrements for cértiﬁcaﬁon asa Small Busm%ss under the Small Business
Program as prescrrbed 'by the City pf West Palm Beach’s Ordménce Number 3366-00.

The followmg L1st of Serv1ces and/or Product are covered under thls certification:
'\ ok ok ke ot !
o Electrical Cables and W1res (Not Electronic)
e Electrical Equipment and Supplies (Except Cable and Wire); Street and Hwy Lighting Luminaires,
Accessones and parts
A { Pipe and Tubing |
' Pipe and Fittings

* k %k %

Issued by the City of West Palm Beach for a three year period February 28, 2015 to February 28, 2018

o N

Certificate Vendor Number: 1041636 Frank Hayden
Procurement Official



Palm Beach Coun ty

Office of Small Business Assistance
Certifies That

TI Electric USA, Inc.

VENDOR # VC0000131356

is @ Small Business Enterprise as prescribed by section 2-80.21 - 2-80.35 of the Palm Beach
County Code for a three Year period from May 6, 2014 - May 5, 2017

The following Services and/or Products are covered under this certification:

Ballasts, All Kinds; Circuit Breakers, Load Centers, Boxes and Panel boards; Conduit and
Fittings, Plastic/PVC; Fuses, Fuse Blocks and Holders, Links, etc; Lamps: Fluorescent,
Incandescent, Mercury Vapor, Quartz and Sodium Vapor; Lighting Fixtures, Indoor: All
Kinds and Parts (Including Lamp holders and Recycled Types); Lighting Fixtures, Out-
door: Floodlights, Spotlights, Yard Lights and all other Weatherproof Fixtures (Except

Streetlights) (Including Recycled Types); Power Systems Switchgears and related accesso-
ries; Wire Molding, Raceways, Accessories and Fittings

LS

Tond/a Davis Johnsgh, Director

March 28, 2014

Palm Beach County Board of County Commissioners

Priscilla A. Taylor, Mayor
Paulette Burdick, Vice Mayor
Hal R. Valeche
Shelley Vana
Steven L. Abrams
Mary Lou Berger
Jess R. Santamaria

County Administrator
Robest Weisman

Deputy County Administrator
Verdenia C. Baker




@m&x\m\ & ¢ lovidea

Minority, Women & Florida Veteran
Business Certification

Tl Electric USA Inc

Is certified under the provisions of
287 and 295.187, Florida Statutes, for a period from:

02/25/2015 to | om\Nm\No‘_.\

‘a g_,,_rﬁ.wmmmm? CES m

Chad | —voﬁ.mm‘\ Secretary
i - Florida Department of Management Services

Office of Supplier Diversity » 4050 Esplanade Way, Sukte 380« Tallahassee, FL 32399 « 850-487-0915 » www.osd.dms state.fl.us



CITY OF FORT PIERCE BIDDER’S CHECKLIST

This checklist is provided to assist each Bidder in the preparation of their bid response. Included in this
checklist are important requirements, which is the responsibility of each Bidder to submit with their response in
order to make their response fully compliant. This checklist is only a guideline, it is the responsibility of each
Bidder to read and comply with the Invitation to Bid in its entirety.

Check “Yes” or “No” to each of the following:
NO

Is Invitation to Bid cover page (page 1) completed, signed and attached?
Is Bid Response Form completed, signed and attached?
W-9 Form completed, signed and attached?

All prices have been reviewed for mathematical accuracy, all price
corrections initialed, and all price extensions and totals thoroughly

checked.

\ \v\{\{\\é

Include proof of proper licensing as stated in bid documents.

W/l
Bid envelope is marked accordingly. /
Are three (3) complete bid packages included (one original and two copies)?

Is each Bid Addendum (when issued) signed and included? ﬂ)[ A

PLEASE SIGN AND RETURN WITH BID

Bidder’s Checklist -18- Bid No. 2016-029



DELIVER TO:

City of Fort Pierce
100 North U.S. #1
Fort Pierce, FL 34950

MAIL TO:

City of Fort Pierce Procurement Dept.
P.O. Box 1480

Fort Pierce, FL 34954-1480

INVITATION TO BID

and

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGMENT

Contact: Gelencia Carter, (772) 467-3748

Bid No: 2016-029

Pre-Bid Conference:
N/A

Bid Title: LIGHT FIXTURES — INLET
LINEAR PARK

Pre-Bid Conference Location:

Bid Opening Location:
City of Ft. Pierce Procurement Dept.
100 North U.S. #1, 1st Floor

N/A Ft. Pierce, Florida 34950
Bid Due Date & Time: If you need any reasonable accommodation for
any type of disability in order to participate in
N ~ 2 e l’ P this procurement, please contact this department
@ / 2.2 /-éf- I L 2. v as soon as possible.
Bidder Name: I hereby certify that this bid is made without
. = | = i derstanding, agreement, or
Y o 7 L prior un ‘ A ent, o
--C"'-}"SJ-\Z!--"?-:?---\-‘------ =17t S o connection with any corporation, firm, or
e person submitting a bid for the same
Malllng Addr‘ess: o o materials, supplies or equipment, and is in all
3_'}1_5__‘____ L2 L__E;i_—’j_y_\‘_\_{?_};:_&ii_‘_____;___\}}_ .. respects fair and without collusion or fraud. 1
s — . to abide by all conditions of this bid and
= e ~ - TS - agree : ; e
. __L__r____\_-LSE;@_-"_.:‘__LL_;;__h_L_-_,L__Q_:(_l_%{_z certify that I am authorized to sign this bid for
’ the bidder.

I = /3L f

~ Authorized Signature (Manual)

City, State, Zip Code:

Typed or Printed Name:
Pav.o OCVvo A n <

Er. PEpeq  Fu, 34982

7
Type of Entity (Circle One):
Corporation ) Partnership Proprietorship

Title:
SALELS Q £

Incorporated in the State of: Year:

Delivery in G@ days, ARO

Phone Number: 77 2 - 465 - (,_732 Z

Payment Terms: Net 30 Days

722-465-3%05

Fax Number:

FEIN or $S Number: '3 -O7943 ¢ ©

) PR
E-Mail Address: v (. b L‘C)(\Q\S(C/\’@ﬁm\/b‘
\w— T

Th '
)-ﬁoéﬁl Business: _J_Y _N MWBE:_Y_N

Bid Security is attached, when required, in the
amount of $

F.0.B. DESTINATION

If returning as a "No Bid" state
reason:

THIS PAGE MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED WITH YOUR BID

Revised July 2009

Bid No. 2016-029




FORT PIERCE

Certification Statement
Local Vendor Preference

I certify that my company meets all of the following qualifications to be eligible for the local vendor
preference:

1) That my company has a fixed, staffed office or distribution point located in and having a street
address within St. Lucie, Indian River, Martin or Okeechobee County for at least one year prior to the
issuance of the request for competitive bids or request for proposals by St. Lucie County; and

2) That my company holds any business or contractor license required by St. Lucie County and/or can
document payment of business license taxes in St. Lucie County;

3) That my company is principal offeror who is single offeror; a business which is the prime contractor
and not a subcontractor; or a partner or joint venturer submitting an offer in conjunction with other
businesses.

4) Attached is a copy of a business or contractor license and/or business tax receipt for St. Lucie County,

Indian River, Martin or Okeechobee Counties to verify that I have been in business at least one year

prior to the issuance of the Request for Bid or Proposal.
Company Name:_{-= 2.4 VA A F | Fere. o Co

¥ i [ -~ [ -
Address:_ 3451 CiLieandE 2 Do g

Business or Contractor License Number:

Phone Number: 272 - &S - /.92 = Fax Number: 772 - (-5. £965
7 1 ) TP WA ST
Owner's Name: ¢ M Peeyid  Duwindd S, INJoN
: R = C/‘ ] MY COMMISSION # §F 105899
Signature: # P 2 - EXPIRES: June 28, 2018
T lid Undenwiiters

Sworn to before me this g th day of Aoqust 20110

Notary Public for the State of £ ocida My Commission Expires lP/ 2ol %
Notary Public Signature B \/\/L/l7t/ Printed Name B rigd W 48 o

FOR PROCURMENT OFFICE ON LY DO NOT COMPLETE BELOW

To be ver1f1ed and completed by an authorized representative from the City of Fort Pierce
Purchasing Department:

Vendor Certified by: Date:
(Authorized Signature)

To be approved as a local bidder and receive bid preference on an eligible local project, this certification and a copy
of your local business or contractor license must be submitted with your bonafide Bid/RFP package.

Bid Response Form -15 - Bid No. 2016-029




Give form to the
requester. Do not
send to the IRS.

Request for Taxpayer
identification Numker and Certification

Form W-l 9
(Rev. October 2007)

Department of the Treasury
Internal Revenue Service L,

Name (as shown on your income tax return)
GRAYBAR ELECTRIC COMPANY, INC

Business name, if different from above

Check appropriate box: D Individual/Sole proprietor Corporation D Partnership Exempt
O Limited liability company. Enter the tax classification (D=disregarded entity, C=corporation, P=partnership) » _._.... O payee

[] other (see instructions) B

Address (number, street, and apt. or suite no.)
3451 Oleander Ave

City, state, and ZIP code

Fort Pierce, FL 34982

List account number(s) here (optional)

Requester’s name and address (optional)

Print or type
See Specific Instructions on page 2.

Taxpayer Identification Number (TIN)

Enter your TIN in the appropriate box. The TIN provided must match the name given on Line 1 to avoid | Social security number

\ 1 1

backup withholding. For individuals, this is your social security number (SSN). However, for a resident : i
alien, sole proprietor, or disregarded entity, see the Part | instructions on page 3. For other entities, it is -

your employer identification number (EIN). If you do not have a number, see How to get a TIN on page 3. or
Note. If the account is in more than one name, see the chart on page 4 for guidelines on whose

number to enter.

41§  Certification

Under penalties of perjury, | certify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer identification number (or I am waiting for a number to be issued to me), and

2. | am not subject to backup withholding because: (a) | am exempt from backup withholding, or (b) | have not been notified by the Internal
Revenue Service (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a result of a failure to report all interest or dividends, or (c) the IRS has
notified me that | am no longer subject to backup withholding, and

3. lam a U.S. citizen or other U.S. person (defined below).

Certification instructions. You must cross out item 2 above if you have been notified by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup
withholding because you have failed to report all interest and dividends on your tax return. For real estate transactions, item 2 does not apply.
For mortgage interest paid, acquisition or abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, contributions to an individual retirement

Employer identification number

13 | 0794380

arrangement (IRA), and generally, payments other than interest and dividends, you are not required to sign the Certification, but you must

provide your correct TIN. See Ih; instructions on page 4.

— 1

Sign Signature of  © /
Here U.S. person > / 714 L

Date P & L//Z///C:

General Instructions ~
Section references are to the Internal Revenue Code unless
otherwise noted.

Purpose of Form
A person who is required to file an information return with the
IRS must obtain your correct taxpayer identification number (TIN)
to report, for example, income paid to you, real estate
transactions, mortgage interest you paid, acquisition or
abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, or
contributions you made to an IRA.

Use Form W-9 only if you are a U.S. person (including a
resident alien), to provide your correct TIN to the person
requesting it (the requester) and, when applicable, to:

1. Certify that the TIN you are giving is correct (or you are
waiting for a number to be issued),

2. Certify that you are not subject to backup withholding, or

3. Claim exemption from backup withholding if you are a U.S.
exempt payee. If applicable, you are also certifying that as a
U.S. person, your allocable share of any partnership income from
a U.S. trade or business is not subject to the withholding tax on
foreign partners’ share of effectively connected income.

Note. If a requester gives you a form other than Form W-9 to
request your TIN, you must use the requester’s form if it is
substantially similar to this Form W-9.

Definition of a U.S. person. For federal tax purposes, you are
considered a U.S. person if you are:

® An individual who is a U.S. citizen or U.S. resident alien,

® A partnership, corporation, company, or association created or
organized in the United States or under the laws of the United
States,

® An estate (other than a foreign estate), or

® A domestic trust (as defined in Regulations section
301.7701-7).

Special rules for partnerships. Partnerships that conduct a
trade or business in the United States are generally required to
pay a withholding tax on any foreign partners’ share of income
from such business. Further, in certain cases where a Form W-9
has not been received, a partnership is required to presume that
a partner is a foreign person, and pay the withholding tax.
Therefore, if you are a U.S. person that is a partner in a
partnership conducting a trade or business in the United States,
provide Form W-9 to the partnership to establish your U.S.
status and avoid withholding on your share of partnership
income.

The person who gives Form W-9 to the partnership for
purposes of establishing its U.S. status and avoiding withholding
on its allocable share of net income from the partnership
conducting a trade or business in the United States is in the
following cases:

® The U.S. owner of a disregarded entity and not the entity,

Cat. No. 10231X

Form W-9 (Rev. 10-2007)



FORT PIERCE

BID RESPONSE FORM
Bid Item LIGHT FIXTURES — INLET LINEAR PARK
Bid Number 2016-029 Due Date & Time 3:00 PM, Tuesday, August 23, 2016

The offerer agrees to furnish the following items or services to the City of Fort Pierce at the
place specified, in accordance with specifications herein at the prices quoted below:

Quantity 'rDescrlptloni [ UnitPlice Total
Philips Lighting Bollards H7% 00 Sy 200 o ©
36 Model # BRM830-42CWL-NW-LA- $ 142200 | 5{ 30,
180-UNV

The Bidder hereby acknowledges receipt of the following addenda:

. _ADDENDUMNO. |  ADDENDUM DATE
(Please Check One)
% Do you accept the Purchasing Card (Visa): | Yes 5/ No
% Percentage of discount off bid price when payment is made with Visa: C Y%

Manufacturer Proposed: THL LT Ps L LEH TN (=

Model: __ ©R N 630 42 cwii _ pood Ly (&= (g
Warranty:
Vendor__ (=2 AL B ¥ E D e el R W S
Address___ 3451 OLEAIDT L ‘AL/VQI. . Peucc » e S/98.

—_

City, State, Zip Code__ Y. {ig cces . /~, 549€2

5 - .
Email Address. A245v 1 0, (Sewcias sics (o0 (vamy B s & ton

Typed Name, Title, = Ao s t“/‘\j\&vf

Slgnatureﬂi_\, v . , Date_ & / Z2 / 2¢( 4
Telephone # 772~ Ljé;‘-’; — .5 Fax # 4% )22 ‘?’Z)S- Ag(}&'g

-

Bid Response Form -16 - Bid No. 2016-029



CITY OF FORT PIERCE BIDDER’S CHECKLIST

This checklist is provided to assist each Bidder in the preparation of their bid response. Included in this
checklist are important requirements, which is the responsibility of each Bidder to submit with their response in
order to make their response fully compliant. This checklist is only a guideline, it is the responsibility of each
Bidder to read and comply with the Invitation to Bid in its entirety.

Check “Yes” or “No” to each of the following:

YES NO
Is Invitation to Bid cover page (page 1) completed, signed and attached? 4‘/7 o
Is Bid Response Form completed, signed and attached? 4\'/* o
W-9 Form completed, signed and attached? 4L -

All prices have been reviewed for mathematical accuracy, all price
corrections initialed, and all price extensions and totals thoroughly
checked.

s

/
v

Include proof of proper licensing as stated in bid documents.

Bid envelope is marked accordingly.

Are three (3) complete bid packages included (one original and two copies)?

Is each Bid Addendum (when issued) signed and included? \‘/
PLEASE SIGN AND RETURN WITH 31357 " ’{g// —

Bidder’s Checklist - 18- Bid No. 2016-029




