
 

 

 

 
 

CITY OF FORT PIERCE  

TABULATION OF BIDS 

 BID ON: 
DISPOSITION OF CITY SURPLUS 

PROPERTIES 

 BID NUMBER: 2021-025 

 DATE: 04/27/21 @ 3:00 PM 

 RECOMMENDED AWARD: Pending 

 

 
 
 
 
 

 

 

PLEASE NOTE: “NO BID” means the respondent/vendor name chose not to submit for the 
said property. 
 

VENDOR NAME 
133 N 10th 

Street 

N. 25th St. 
2408-501-
0066-000-6 

N. 25th St. 
2048-501- 
0067-00-3 

606 N 14th 
Street 

701 N 14th 
Street 

N 14th St. 
2404-814-
0012-000-2 

 Brenda V. Smith & 
John D Bess 

Washington, D.C. 
$13,100.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Discount Connections 
Fort Pierce, FL 

NO BID $11,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

JBM Properties, LLC 
San Diego, CA $5,100.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 

Joanna Gilchrist 
Fort Pierce, FL $3,000.00 $0.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,000.00 

Telco Investments, LLC 
Boynton Beach, FL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5,000.00 $5,000.00 

Travis Wimes 
Fort Pierce, FL NO BID $5,000.00 $1,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

2nd Generation Building 
Corp 
Port St Lucie, FL 

$10,200.00 $11,100.00 $11,100.00 $7,100.00 NO BID $6,100.00 

N4S Investments, LLC 
Pembroke Pines, FL 

   NON-RESPONSIVE   

1865 Realty Group, 
LLC 
Fort Pierce, FL 

$200.00 $200.00 $0.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 

 
 

 RESPONSE 

9 of 9 = 100.% 

0 "No Bids" 

Total = 100 

"Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and 
time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late." 

PLEASE NOTE: COMMISSION MEETINGS ARE HELD THE FIRST AND THIRD MONDAY OF EVERY MONTH. 

CHECK THE CITY’S WEBSITE, https://www.cityoffortpierce.com/223/Agendas- Minutes or CALL THE 

PURCHASING DIVISION, (772) 467-3102, WEDNESDAY PRIOR TO THE MEETINGS FOR RECOMMENDATIO N 

OF AWARD. 

 

https://www.cityoffortpierce.com/223/Agendas-
https://www.cityoffortpierce.com/223/Agendas-Minutes

