HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
BID TABULATION SHEET

DEPARTMENT NAME: Hidalg County Purchasing
BID OPENING DATE: November 29, 2006 BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.
DESCRIPTION OF BID: “Safety End Treatments”

BID NO: 06-273-11-29-06CGV
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~ HIDALGO COUNTY ~
“SAFETY END TREATMENTS”
BID NO. 2006-273-11-29CGV

TABULATION PAGE
Participants: ™% I. Precast Safety End Treatment - Type II RIPRAP-PSET-RR
L & R Precast Concrete Works Inc. , Rio Valley Pipe, LTD.
Size Slope Price Pipe Runner Size Slope Price Pipe Runner
18" 6-1 $500.00 $250.00 18" 6-1 $518.00 $260.00
18" 4-1 $415..00 $210.00 18" 4-1 $437.00 $234.00
24" 6-1 $600.00 $315.00 24" 6-1 $614.00 $336.00
24" 4-1 $565.00 $275.00 24" 4-1 $576.00 $285.00
30" 6-1 $890.00 $575.00 30" 6-1 $905.00 $589.00
30" 4-1 $800.00 $520.00 30" 4-1 $816.00 $538.00
L ——
Participants: 2% II. Precast Safety End Treatment - Type II Cross Drainage PSET-SC and
PSET-RC
L & R Precast Concrete Works Inc. Rio Valley Pipe, LTD.
PSET-SC----(NO BIDS on PSET-RC) ; PSET-SC----(NO BIDS on PSET-RC)
Size Slope Price Pipe Runner Size Slope Price Pipe Runner
18" 6-1 $320.00 $250.00 18" 6-1 $336.00 $260.00
18" 4-1 $285.00 $215.00 18" 4-1 $298.00 $23400
24" 6-1 $465.00 $315.00 24" 6-1 $475.00 $336.00
24" 4-1 $425.00 $275.00 24" 4-1 $437.00 $285.00
30" 6-1 $815.00 $575.00 30" 6-1 $823.00 $589.00
30" 4-1 $700.00 $515.00 30" 4-1 $715.00 $538.00
Participants: ™% I I. Precast Safety End Treatment - Type II Parallel Drainage PSET-RP
L & R Precast Concrete Words Inc. Rio Valley Pipe, LTD.
Size Slope Price Pipe Runner Size Slope Price Pipe Runner
18" 6-1 NO BID NOBID 18" 6-1 NO BID NO BID
18" 4-1 NOBID NO BID 18" 4-1 NO BID NO BID
24" 6-1 NO BID NOBID 24" 6-1 NO BID NO BID
24" © 4-1 NO BID NO BID 24" 4-1 NO BID NOBID
30" 6-1 NO BID NO BID 30" 6-1 NO BID NO BID
30" 4-1 NO BID NO BID 30" 4-1 NOBID NOBID




DEC-84-2006 14:53 FROM: COMMISSIONER HANDY 9737804 TO: 3182629 P.171

Memorandum

To: PURCHASING DEPT.

ATTN: CRIS VILLARREAL, BUYER
From: NOF MONTF?

Date:  12/4:.2006

Re: [ABULATION SHLL I FOR SAFETY END TREATMENTS

PLEASE BE ADVISED THAT PCT. | IS RECOMMENDING AWARD OF BID TO LOW
BIDDER MEETING ALL SPECIFICATIONS.

PLEASE PROCEED WITH YOUR PLAN TO PLACE ON THE NEXT COMMISSIONERS COURT
MEETING FOR AWARD.

THANKS

A

NOE MONTEZ



12/p6/20686 17:55

TO:

FROM:

DATE:

SUBJECT:

9567874683 HIDALGO CO PCT 2

MEMO

Hidalgo County Purchasing Department VIAFAX: 318-2629

c/o: Cris Villarreal-Buyer

Hidalgo County Precinct #2
Ricardo Cuellar-Field Operations Director @

December 7, 2006

Safety End Treatments
BID #2006-273-11-29CGV

PAGE 81

Please let this memo serve a recommendation as per reviewing the tabulation
sheet to award the lowest bidder for the “Safety End Treatments” and be placed on the
next Commissioners’ Court Agenda (12/12/2006).

If you have any questions regarding this matter please do not hesitate to contact
me, Thaok you.



