JANITORIAL/INDUSTRIAL SUPPLIES- HIDALGO COUNTY

QUOTE NO. 07-239-07-10-YSI
TABULATION SHEET- BUYBOARD
	
	
	Gulf Coast Paper
	CC Distributors

	Item No.
	Description
	Qty
	Cs/

Unit
	Product No.
	Qty
	Cs/

Unit
	Product No.

	01.
	Paper Towels Multi Fold

(Georgia Pacific or Equal)
	4000
	$13.41

.00335 ea
	Georgia Pacific
	4000
	$14.80

.00370 ea
	Baywest

	02.
	Paper Towels Multi Folds White Bleached 9.25x9.5
	4000
	$16.94
.00423
	Georgia Pacific
	4000
	$17.50

.00437
	Baywest



	03.
	Paper Towels Multi Folds Universal Dispensers (Plastic)
	1
	$25.92
	Kimberly Clark
	1
	$20.70
	San Jamar

	04.
	Paper Towels Multi Folds Universal Dispensers (Metal)
	1


	$16.00
	Georgia 
Pacific
	1
	$26.85
	San Jamar

	05.
	Kitchen Roll Towels (Scott or Equal 11s9)
	20/120 (2400)
	$18.94
.00789
	Kimberly Clark
	30/90 (2700)
	$19.85

.00735
	Baywest

	06.
	Brown Roll Towels Standard Size

(Georgia Pacific or Equal)
	12/350'
	$17.17
1.43
	Georgia Pacific
	12/350'
	$18.35
1.52
	Baywest

	07.
	Roll Paper Towel Dispenser Lever or Crank

(Metal or Plastic)
	1 (Metal)
	$35.02
	Kimberly Clark
	1 (Metal)
	$69.55
	Georgia Pacific

	08.
	Paper Bags 1/6 BBL Brown 1657

(Duro or Equal)
	500
	$30.40

.0608
	Duro
	500
	$43.89
.0876
	Duro

	09.
	Paper Bags #4 Brown

(Duro or Equal)
	500
	$7.57
.015
	Duro
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	10.
	Paper Bags #8 Brown 

(Duro or Equal)
	500
	$11.61
.023
	Duro
	1000
	$48.35

.048
	Duro

	11.
	Paper Bags #10 Brown 

(Duro or Equal)
	500
	$13.00
.026
	Duro
	1000
	$55.75

.055
	Duro

	12.
	Baggies 4"x4" Econo Zip

(Ziplock Regular Sandwich Bags)
	1000
	$9.33
.0093
	Huckster 
	1000
	$8.25

.0082
	Prime Source

	13.
	Baggies 1/4 Size Slider Bag Ziplock Snack Bags

(Hefty or Equal)
	500
	$21.57
.0431
	Reynolds 
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	14.
	Baggies Ziplock 7x8 Quart Size

(Hefty or Equal)
	1000
	$33.45
.0334
	Reynolds
	1000
	$39.95
.039 
	PrimeSource

	15.
	Baggies- Ziplock 10x11 Gallon Size 

(Hefty or Equal)
	250
	$28.48
.113
	Reynolds
	250
	$25.85
.103
	Ziploc

	16.
	Baggies- Ziplock 

(Other Size; Specify)
	1000

5x8


	$16.47
.0164
	Huckster
	100 15½ x13       
	$24.70 .2470
	Ziploc

	17.
	Freezer Bags 10x11-200 Ct/ s

(Quick Seal or Equal)
	200
	$28.48
.142
	Reynolds
	250
	$31.55
.126
	Ziploc


	18.
	One (1) Gallon 12x11 Ziplock Freezer Bags
	200
	$28.48
.142
	Reynolds
	250
	$31.55 .126
	Ziploc

	19.
	One (1) Quart 7x8 Ziplock Freezer Bags
	1000
	$33.45
.033
	Reynolds
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	20.
	Butcher Paper 24"
	24x

1000'
	$22.00
.022
	Damsky
	No Bid'
	No Bid
	No Bid

	21.
	Foil Wrap 18" Heavy Duty 500 Ft.

(Reynolds or Equal)
	18"x

500'
	$30.04
.060
	Reynolds 
	18"x

500'
	$41.86
.083
	Prime Source

	22.
	Potato Foil Wrap

(Reynolds or Equal)
	3000
sheets
	$44.75
.014
	Reynolds
	3000
sheets
	$64.80
.021
	PrimeSource

	23.
	Film Wrap 18" Heavy Duty 2000 Ft

(Reynolds or Equal)
	18"x

2000'
	$18.00
.009
	Reynolds
	18"x

1000’
	$84.40
.084
	Alcan

	24.
	Film Wrap 18" Heavy Duty 3000 Ft

(Reynolds or Equal)
	18" x

3000'
	$24.15

.008
	Reynolds
	18"x

1000’
	$84.40

.084
	Alcan

	25.
	Toilet Tissue 2 Ply Small Short Sheet

(Georgia Pacific or Equal)
	80/550 44000 sheets
	$31.11
.00070 sheet
	Georgia
Pacific
	96/500 48000 sheets
	$32.89
.00068 sheet
	Baywest

	26.
	Jumbo Toilet Tissue 6/2000 Ft

(Georgia Pacific or Equal)
	6/2000'
	$28.35
4.72
	Kimberly Clark
	6/2000'
	$23.86
3.97
	Baywest

	27.
	Jr. Jumbo Toilet Tissue 12/1000'

(Georgia Pacific or Equal)
	12/

1000'
	$25.05
2.08
	Kimberly 

Clark
	12/ 1000'
	$23.86
1.98
	Baywest

	28.
	Toilet Seat Covers
	2500 case
	$22.56
.0090
	Hospeco
	5000 case
	$44.59
.0089
	Baywest

	29.
	Toilet Dispensers Universal 

(12" Jumbo Toilet Tissue)
	1
	$36.00
	Kimberly Clark
	1
	$19.75
	Baywest

	30.
	Facial Tissue 

(Georgia Pacific or Equal)
	30 bxs 100sh
	$17.64
.58 box
	Kimberly Clark
	30 bxs 100 sh
	$16.20

.54 box
	Baywest

	
	
	
	
	
	30 bxs 100 sh
	$21.20

.70 box
	Baywest

	31.
	Sanitary Napkins- Thin No. 4 Folded

(Stayfree, Rochester, ect.)
	250
	$26.66
.1066
	Hospeco
	250
	$48.50

.194
	Rochester
Maxithins

	32.
	Sanitary Napkins Maxi No. 4 Folded

(Stayfree, Rochester, ect.)
	250
	$26.66

.1068
	Hospeco
	250
	$41.60

.166
	Rochester #4

Gardsmaxi

	33.
	Sanitary Napkins Super No. 4 Folded

(Stayfree, Rochester, ect.)
	250
	$26.66

.1068
	Hospeco
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	34.
	Panty Liners
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	35.
	Scrubbing Cleansers, 21 oz 

(Comet or Equal)
	24      21 oz
	$21.33
.88 oz
	Colgate
	24      21 oz
	$17.04
.71 oz
	Ajax

	36.
	Scouring Sponges Yw/ Green

Standard Size 3M/ Eq
	20
	$30.38
1.51
	3M
	40
	$26.00

.65
	Gust

	37.
	Feather Dusters 21 Inch 

Ostrich or Equal
	1     
	$6.10
	Malish
	1      23”
	$6.09
	TX Feathers

	38.
	Feather Dusters 26 Inch 

Ostrich or Equal
	1   
	$6.81
	Lagasse

	1      31”
	$8.90
	TX Feathers

	39.
	Feather Duster Extensions 8 Ft.
	1
	$12.61
	TX Feathers
	1
	$48.35
	Unger

	40.
	Feather Duster Extensions 12 Ft.
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	1
	$65.60
	Unger

	41.
	Dust Pans Metal
	1
	$5.93
	Continental
	1
	$2.50
	Continental

	42.
	Dust Pans Plastic
	1
	$2.04
	Rubbermaid
	1
	$2.05
	Continental

	43.
	Lobby Dust Pan Metal
	1
	$16.53
	Continental
	1
	$19.90
	Continental

	44.
	Lobby Dust Pan Plastic
	1
	$9.10
	Rubbermaid
	1
	$10.48
	Continental

	45.
	Buffing Pads 17" White
	5
	$10.19
2.03
	Americo
	5
	$11.69
2.33
	Norton

	46.
	Buffing Pads 20" White
	5
	$13.24 2.64
	Americo
	5
	$15.40

3.08
	Norton

	47.
	Stripping Pads 17" Black
	5
	$10.19
2.03
	Americo
	5
	$11.69
2.33
	Norton

	48.
	Stripping Pads 20" Black
	5
	$13.24
2.64
	Americo
	5
	$15.40

3.08
	Norton

	49.
	Latex Gloves- Small Disposable

(Ansell or Equal)
	1000
	$32.00
3.20/  100 ct
	Ansell 
	100
	$3.75

	Memphis

	50.
	Lates Gloves Small Non-Disposable

Yellow (Ansell or Equal)
	12
	$4.80
.40
	Ansell
	12
	$7.85
.65
	Galaxy

	51.
	Latex Gloves- Medium Disposable 

(Ansell or Equal)
	1000
	$32.00
3.20/

100 ct
	Ansell 
	100
	$3.75

	Memphis

	52.
	Latex Gloves- Non Disposable

Yw (Ansell/ Equal)
	12
	$4.80
.40
	Ansell
	12
	$7.85
.65
	Galaxy

	53.
	Latex Gloves- Large Disposable
	1000
	$32.00
3.20/ 100ct
	Ansell
	100
	$3.75

	Memphis

	54.
	Latex Gloves- Large Non- Disposable

Yw. (Ansell or Equal)
	12
	$4.80
.40
	Ansell
	12
	$7.85
.65
	Galaxy

	55.
	Food Service Gloves- Medium Clear

(Brand Name)
	1000
	$14.69
1.46/  100 ct
	Tidi Products
	10/100
	$9.40

.94/    100 ct
	Prime Source

	56.
	Food Service Gloves- Large Clear

(Brand Name)
	1000
	$14.69
1.46/   100 ct
	Tidi Products
	10/100
	$9.40

.94/    100 ct
	Prime Source

	57.
	Maid(s Brooms- Straw (Waco or Equal)
	12
	$48.13
4.01
	Lagasse 
	1
	$3.90
	Lasswell

	58.
	Janitorial Booms- Straw
	12
	$58.92
4.91
	Lagasse 
	1
	$5.60
	Wilen

	59.
	Plastic Angel Broom
	12
	$56.86 4.74
	Lagasse
	1
	$4.95
	Unisan

	60.
	Mop Bucket Combo Std Size
Rubbermaid 7580 or Equal
	1
	$43.26
	Rubbermaid
	1
	$47.70
	Continental

	61.
	Mop Head Cotton Size 16 Oz
	12
	$24.80
2.06
	Wilen
	1
	$2.25
	Laswell

	62.
	Mop Head Cotton Size 24 Oz.
	12
	$40.00
3.33
	Wilen
	1
	$3.10
	Wilen

	63.
	Mop Head Cotton Size 32 oz.
	12
	$53.28
4.44
	Wilen
	1
	$4.28
	Wilen


	64.
	Mop Head Rayon Size 16 Oz.
	12
	$36.80

3.07
	Wilen
	1
	$2.88
	Wilen

	65.
	Mop head Rayon Size 24 Oz.
	12
	$55.20

4.60
	Wilen
	1
	$4.60
	Wilen

	66.
	Mop Head Rayon Size 32 Oz
	12
	$72.00
6.00
	Wilen
	1
	$6.48
	Wilen

	67.
	Mop Handles Wood 54" Junior
	1
	$5.60
	Wilen
	1
	$7.80
	Wilen

	68.
	Mop Handles Fiber Glass 54" Jr. Etc/ Equal
	1
	$9.73
	Wilen
	1
	$10.25
	Wilen

	69.
	Dust Mop 24" x 3 Disposable
	12
	$91.68
7.64
	Wilen
	1
	$7.00
	Unisan

	70.
	Dust Mop 24"x 5 Disposable
	12
	$91.68
7.64
	Wilen
	1
	$4.98
	Wilen

	71.
	Dust Mop 24"x3 Non Disposable
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	72.
	Dust Mop 24" x 5 Non Disposable
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	1
	$13.45
	Wilen

	73.
	Dust Mop Treatment (Aerosol)
	12/16 oz
	$29.15
.1518   oz 
	Spartan 
	12/17 oz
	$34.50 .1691   oz
	Wilen

	74.
	Dust Cloths (Disposable) Yw
	200
	$48.05
.24
	Georgia Pacific
	100
	$37.48
.37
	Chicopee

	75.
	Dust Cloths Non Disposable
	12


	$36.00
3.00
	Majestic
	24
	$43.40 1.80
	Kimberly Clarke

	76.
	Dust Mop Treatment RTU
	12/32 oz
	$17.74
.0461 oz.
	Spartan 
	4 gal / case
	$36.80
.0718 oz
	Betco

	77.
	Dust Mop Frames 24" x 5
	12
	$36.80
3.06
	Wilen
	1
	$3.80
	Wilen

	78.
	Dust Mop Handles- Swivel Snap On
	12
	$63.48
5.29
	Wilen
	1
	$9.15
	Wilen

	79.
	Bowl Mops (Rayon)
	1
	$.52
	Wilen
	1
	.62
	Wilen

	80.
	Toilet Brushes (Standard Size) Plastic
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	1
	$1.92
	Rubbermaid

	81.
	Liquid Bleach
	6-96 oz
	$7.88
$1.31
	Pure Brite
	6-96 oz
	$9.50
1.58
	Pure Brite

	82.
	Heavy Duty Laundry Detergent 

(For Commercial Laundry System)
	5 gal
	  $78.42
15.68  gal
	US Chemical
	5 gal
	$59.95
11.99 gal
	Betco

	
	
	
	
	
	40 lbs powder
	$17.20 .43 lb
	Premiere

	83.
	Spray Bottles w/ Trigger 32 Oz. Empty
	1
	$.70
	Contico
	1
	$1.03
	Continental

	84.
	Spray Bottles W/ Trigger 24 Oz. Empty
	1
	$.81
	Contico
	1
	$.99
	Unisan

	85.
	Styrofoam Plates 9" Divided 

(Mobil TJ 1-0011 or Equal) 
	500
	$18.76
.037
	Dispozo
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	86.
	Styrofoam Tray Hinge 9x9

Compartment with Lid
	200
	$17.30
.08
	Pactive
	200
	$21.45
.10
	Gen Pak

	87.
	Styrofoam Bowls 12 oz 

(Pacific 1-0012 or Equal)
	1000
	$21.00
.021
	Dispozo
	1000
	$24.95
.024
	Gen Pak


	88.
	Styrofoam Plates 9" Unlaminated
	500
	$18.76 .037
	Dispozo
	500
	$21.95
.043
	Gen Pak

	89.
	Styrofoam Plates 9" Laminated
	500
	$18.76
.037
	Dispozo
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	90.
	Styrofoam Plates 6" Unlaminated
	1000
	$18.76
.018
	Dispozo
	1000
	$21.95
.021
	Gen Pak

	91.
	Styrofoam Plates 6" Laminated
	1000
	$18.76
.018
	Dispozo
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	92.
	Styrofoam Cups 4 oz 

(UJ4 or Equal)
	1000
	$14.50
.0145 
	Dart
	1000
	$14.80

.01480
	Dart

	93.
	Styrofoam Cup 8 Oz. 

(8J8 or Equal)
	1000
	$15.00

.01500 
	Dart
	1000
	$15.98
.01598
	Dart

	94.
	Plastic Forks 2,000 Ct

(James River Wn F2P or Equal)
	1000
	$8.95
.0089
	Dispozo
	1000
	$7.49

.00749
	PrimeSource

	95.
	Medium Weight White Plastic Forks 1,0000 Ct

(Solo or Equal)
	1000
	$8.95
.00895
	Dispozo
	1000
	$7.49

.00749
	PrimeSource

	96.
	Plastic Spoons 1,000 Ct

(Solo or Equal)
	1000
	$17.57
.0175
	Dispozo
	1000
	$7.49

.00749
	PrimeSource

	97.
	Medium Weight White Plastic Spoons

(1,000 Ct)
	1000
	$17.57
.0175
	Dispozo
	1000
	$7.49

.00749
	PrimeSource

	98.
	Plastic Sporks 

(Solo or Equal)
	1000
	$10.27 .0102
	Dispozo
	1000
	$7.49

.0074
	PrimeSource

	99.
	Clear Forks (1,000 Ct.)
	1000
	$19.52
.0195
	Dispozo
	1000
	$7.65

.0076
	PrimeSource

	100.
	Trash Cans 10 Gallon
	1
	$7.01
	Rubbermaid
	1
	$6.45
	Continental

	101.
	Trash Cans & Lids 16 Gallon
	1
	$30.00
	Rubbermaid
	1         20 gal
	$29.95
	Continental

	102.
	Trash Cans & Lids- 32 Gallon

(Rubbermaid or Equal)
	1
	$25.56
	Rubbermaid
	1
	$26. 50
	Continental

	103.
	Tall Trash Can 8 MIC 24x33 High Density Can Liners
	1000
	$17.69
.0176
	Rhino
	1000
	$26.89
.0268
	HPB

	104.
	Large Trash Can 13 MIC 30x37 High Density Can Liners
	500
	$18.79
.0375
	Rhino
	500
	$25.35
.0507
	HPB

	105.
	Large Trash Can 16 MIC 33 Gallon 33x40 High Density Can Liners
	250
	$14.75
.059
	Rhino
	250
	$18.55

.074
	HPB

	106.
	X Large Trash Can 45 Gallon 40x48 16 MIC High Density Can Liner
	250
	$20.71
.082
	Rhino
	250
	$23.74
.094
	HPB

	107.
	XX Large Trash Can 55 Gallon 38x58 1.5 MIL
	100
	$19.23
.1923
	Rhino
	100

1.4 mil
	$25.45
.2545
	HPB

	108.
	Portion Paper Cups 1 Oz 

(Solo or Equal)
	5000
	37.64
.00752
	Solo Cup
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	109.
	Laced Doilies 

(Different Sizes and Types)
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	110.
	Napkins 2 Ply Quarter Fold

(Georgia Pacific or Equal)
	6000 13”x5”
	$31.17

.0051
	Cascade
	3000 17”x17”
	$50.38 .0167
	Hoffmaster


	111.
	Party Packs (Spoons, Fords, Knife, Napkin, Salt & Pepper)
	250
	$16.60

.066
	Dispozo 
	250
	$20.50

.082
	Prime Source

	112.
	Dishwashing Liquid 32 Oz

(Dawn or Equal)
	12/32 oz
	$32.66
2.72
	Palmolive
	12/32 oz
	$57.60

4.80
	Betco

	113.
	Dishwashing Liquid 42 Oz

(Dawn or Equal)
	12/32 oz
	$32.66

2.72
	Palmolive
	12/32 oz
	$57.60

4.80
	Betco

	114.
	Body Shampoo P/ Gallon
	4 gal 
	$24.09

6.02
	Spartan
	4 gal
	$41.00
10.25
	Betco

	115.
	Toothbrush Soft Specify Size
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	144 cs Full Size
	$49.50 .34
	Colgate

	116.
	Toothbrush Medium Specify Size
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	117.
	Toothbrush Firm- Specify Size
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	118.
	Toothpaste Travel Size, Specify Size
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	240 cs
	$82.15 .34
	Colgate

	119.
	Toothpaste Std Size, Specify Size
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	120.
	Deodorant, Specify Size
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	121.
	Shaving Cream
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	122.
	Razors- Double Edged
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	123.
	Body Towels Standard Size
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	124.
	Hand Towels Standard Size
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	125.
	Menu Tissue 12x12
	10000
	$69.37
.0069
	Dixie
	10000
	$79.90 .0079
	Papercon

	126.
	Workhorse Wipers (Rags) Kimberly Clark or Equal)
	912
	$41.05
.045
	Kimberly Clarke
	1080 12pks of 90
	$31.95
.029
	Kimberly Clark

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
INDUSTRIAL SUPPLIES
	
	
	
	
	
	

	01.
	Hospital Disinfectant Deodorant Spray
	12/18 oz
	$27.63
.0127   oz
	Spartan
	12/14 oz
	$32.45

.1931   oz
	Betco

	02.
	Hospital Disinfectant Foam Cleaner
	12/18 oz
	$22.90
1.90
	Spartan
	12/18 oz
	$25.20

2.10
	Betco

	03.
	Hospital Disinfectant Deodorant Spray Aerosol

(1 Minute Kill Time)
	12/18 oz
	$27.63
.1279   oz
	Spartan
	12/16 oz
	$38.85

.2023   oz
	Betco

	04.
	Hospital Disinfectant Bleach Cleaner Dry Air
	6/96 oz
	$7.88
.0136   oz
	Pure Brite
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	05.
	Hospital Disinfectant Deodorant Spray

(Tuberculicidal Rated)
	12/18 oz
	$27.63
.1279   oz
	Spartan
	12/16 oz
	$38.85
.0203   oz
	Betco

	06.
	Air Freshener- Aerosol Asst Scents
	12/18 oz
	$25.34
.1173   oz
	Spartan
	12/16 oz
	$33.00
.1718   oz
	Betco

	07.
	Time Mist Air Freshener Asst. Scents 6.6 Oz.
	12
	$36.80

.4646   oz
	Waterbury
	6          7 oz
	$21.82
.5195   oz
	Hospeco


	08.
	Time Mist Air Freshener Dispenser
	1
	$25.26
	Waterbury
	1
	$28.80
	Time Mist

	09.
	Odor Eliminator- Non Aerosol
	12      32 oz
	$17.51
.045/oz
	Spartan
	4 gal
	$55.00

.107/oz
	Betco

	10.
	Enzyme Deodorizers Per Gallon( Liquid
	4 gal
	$27.37
6.84
	Spartan
	4 gal
	$40.80

10.20
	Betco

	11.
	Disinfectant & Deodorizer Cleaner Aerosol
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	12      18 oz
	$25.20

2.10
	Betco

	12.
	Furniture Polish- Aerosol
	12      16 oz
	$24.57
.1279 oz
	Spartan
	12      19 oz
	$33.30
.1460 oz
	System Clean

	13.
	Carpet Spot Remover 32 Oz.
	12
	$15.35
1.27
	Spartan
	12
	$29.65
2.47
	Betco

	14.
	Carpet Powder & Deodorizer
	12      16 oz
	$29.13
.1517 oz
	Big D
	12      15 oz
	$28.10
.1561 oz
	Purex

	15.
	Disinfectant Cleaner- Concentrate Liquid
	4 gal
	$22.34

5.63
	Spartan
	4 gal
	$15.80

3.95
	Montgomery 

	16.
	Glass Cleaner- Liquid Concentrate
	4 gal

	$26.24
6.56
	Spartan


	4 gal
	$12.97
3.24
	Montgomery

	17.
	Floor Finish Liquid (Spartan or Equal)
	4 gal
	$33.03
8.25
	Spartan
	4 gal
	$40.90

10.22
	Betco

	18.
	High Speed Wax Stripper Floor Finish Liquid
	4 gal
	$31.91
7.97
	Spartan
	4 gal
	$41.10
10.27
	Betco

	19.
	Car Shampoo Liquid
	4 gal
	$32.25
8.06
	Carroll Co.
	4 gal
	$32.00
8.00
	Betco

	20.
	Car Shampoo- Liquid Ammonia Free
	4 gal
	$32.25
6.22
	Carroll Co.
	4 gal
	$32.00
8.00
	Betco

	21.
	Liquid Hand Soap Antibacterial p/ Gallon
	4 gal
	$28.46
7.12
	Spartan
	4 gal
	$23.40

5.85
	Pink Panda

	22.
	Bag In Box Liquid Hand Soap
	12    800 ml
	$28.53
.0029/ml
	Kimberly Clarke
	12    900 ml
	$27.89
.0025/ml
	Betco

	23.
	Glass Cleaner RTU- 32 Oz.
	12
	$16.67
1.39
	Spartan
	12
	$18.34
1.52 
	Betco

	24.
	Liquid Bowl Cleaner 23%-26% HIC EPA Registered
	12      32 oz
	$13.85
1.15
	Spartan
	12      32 oz
	$17.80
1.48
	Betco

	25.
	Liquid Bowl Cleaner (Non Acid) EPA Registered
	12      32 oz
	$14.54
1.21
	Spartan
	12      32 oz
	$15.78
1.31
	Betco

	26.
	Waterless Hand Cleaner
	6          4 lbs
	$68.58 .1785
	Gojo
	6       4.5 lbs
	$54.69
.1265
	Betco

	27.
	Liquid Hand Soap Dispensers (Bulk Soap)
	1
	$15.85
	Spartan
	1
	$13.45
	Impact

	28.
	Deodorant Urinal Screens- Screens Only
	6
	$12.86
2.14
	Spartan
	12
	$11.57
.96
	Impact

	29.
	Urinal Block W/ Screens
	12
	$18.82
1.57
	Fresh Products
	12
	$14.00
1.16
	ESS

	30.
	Urinal Blocks (Blocks Only)
	12
	$4.34
.36
	Fresh Products
	12
	$7.80

.65
	Impact

	31.
	Hanging Toilet Bowl Blocks
	12
	$7.31
.60
	Fresh Products
	12
	$8.70
.72
	Impact

	32.
	Bar Soap .75 Oz 1,000 Per Case
	1000
	$44.00
.044
	Cashmere
	1000
	$68.40

.068
	Cashmere

	33.
	Bar Soap Anti Bacterial 3.5 Oz 1,000 P/Cs
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	72
	$45.75

.63
	Dial Gold

	34.
	Degreaser 55 Gallon
	55 Gal
	197.62
$3.59 gl
	Spartan

	55 Gal
	$284.00

5.16 gl
	Betco

	35.
	Weed Killer 55 Gallon Concentrated- Specify Dilution
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	55 Gal Dilute 1:10
	$1020.00

18.54 gal
	Betco

	36.
	Weed Killer Round Up or Equal
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	4 gal
	$43.72
10.93
	Enforcer

	37.
	Lice Killer Aerosol
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	12      13 oz
	$199.80 1.28 oz
	Claire

	38.
	Oven Cleaner 24 Oz Foam Cleaner
	12      19 oz
	$34.25
2.85
	Carroll Co.
	12       19 oz
	$32.43
2.70
	Systems Clean

	39.
	Wasp/ Hornet Spray
	12      19 oz
	$55.20 .2421   oz
	Carroll Co.
	12      16 oz
	$37.70 .1963   oz
	Enforcer

	40.
	Wasp/ Hornet Spray - 20 Ft Stream
	12      18 oz
	$28.14 .1302   oz
	Spartan
	12      16 oz
	$37.70
.1963   oz
	Enforcer

	41.
	Mosquito Repellent Lotion
	12        6 oz Aerosol
	$66.00 5.50
	Deepwoods Off
	12        6 oz Aerosol
	$55.80 4.65
	Deepwoods Off

	42.
	Mosquito Repellent Lotion
	12        6 oz
	$62.77 5.23
	Deepwoods Off
	12        6 oz
	 $68.97 5.74
	Off Skintastic

	43.
	Ant & Roach Spray Odorless
	12      18 oz
	$52.54
.2432    oz
	Carroll Co.
	12    17.5 oz
	$40.65
.0193   oz
	Enforcer

	44.
	Ant & Roach Spray Odorless- To Contain Deltametrin
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	45.
	Stainless Steel Cleaner- Waterless Based
	12      16 oz
	$434.12
.1777
	Spartan
	12      15 oz
	$43.70
.0242
	System Clean


