i
3

SYLVIA S. HANDY

County Commissioner, Pct. 1
1902 Joe Stephens Ave.
Weslaco. TX 78596
(956) 968-8733

November 26, 2007

viartha Sailazar

Hidalgo County Purchasing Department
101 F Cano 4™ Flnor

Edinburg, Texas 78539

Re: Bid No. 2007-404-11-31CGV (Road Construction for {3} County Roads-Group 1}

Dear Marty:

Please be advised that Pct. 1 is recommending award to Sascon. inc. which was the iow bidder. Siease
be advised that we are recommending award of Labor only. Precinct One will supply materials for

subiject projects.

If vou have anv auestions piease feei free to contact me or Mr. joseph Paiacios. Chiet Administrator of
my staff.

Sincerely,

! .Q{' ,r\/,./\«

SYLVIA 5. HANDY
County Commissioner, Pct. 1
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BIDS TAKEN OCTOBER 31, 2007
COUNTY PROJECTS FOR PRECINCT #1

JM CONSTUCTION
LABOR LABOR
ONLY &
MATERIAL
MILE 13 2 $ 404,857.25 $ 948,269.25
MILE 5 $ 78,767.50 $ 176,134.50
MILE 12 $ 146,037.00 $ 330,376.00
TOTAL $ 629,661.75 $ 1,454,799.75
MISSION PAVING
LABOR LABOR
ONLY &
MATERIAL
MILE 13 % NO BID NO BID
MILE 5 NO BID NO BID
MILE 12 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL -0- -0-
10C COMPANY
LABOR LABOR
ONLY &
MATERIAL
MILE 13 % $ 377,136.82 $ 848,686.28
MILE 5 $ 77,896.52 $ 160,831.42
MILE 12 $ 136,996.30 $ 297,331.48
TOTAL $ 592,029.64 $ 1,306,849.18




CRIS EQUIPMENT

LABOR LABOR
ONLY &
MATERIAL
MILE 13 Y2 $ 368,905.25 $ 844,124.29
MILE S $ 83,782.50 $ 162,984.55
MILE 12 $ 136,772.00 $ 295,179.49
TOTAL $ 589,459.75 $ 1,302,288.33
S & G PAVING
LABOR LABOR
ONLY &
MATERIAL
MILE 13 7% $ 348,334.50 $ 810,064.00
MILE 5 $ 81,982.00 $ 163,934.00
MILE 12 $ 129,866.00 $ 292,474.00
TOTAL $ 560,182.50 $ 1,266,482.00
SASCON, INC.
LABOR LABOR
ONLY &
MATERIAL
MILE 13 % 8 355,888.40 $ 827,516.40
MILE 5 $ 65,457.40 $ 153,129.40
MILE 12 $ 123,137.80 $ 285,437.80

TOTAL

$ 544,483.60

$ 1,266,083.60




CLOSNER CONSTRUCTION

LABOR LABOR
ONLY &
MATERIAL
MILE 13 % $ 487,893.25 $ 1,060,983.25
MILE 5 $ 100,523.50 $ 209,412.15
MILE 12 $ 174,551.00 $ 372,832.35
TOTAL $ 762,967.75 $ 1,643,227.75




THE STATE OF TEXAS §

DRAFT

CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT
ROAD CONSTRUCTION

COUNTY OF HIDALGO §

This Agreement, entered in to the day of December, 2007 by and between
Hidalgo County Precinct No. 1 (hereinafter called the "Owner," and (A
Texas Corporation), of County of Hidalgo, and State of Texas, hereinafter called
"Contractor."

WITNESSETH

That for and in consideration of the payments and agreement hereinafter
mentioned, to be made and performed by the OWNER, the CONTRACTOR hereby
agrees with the OWNER to commence and complete the construction described as

follows:

Mile 13 1/2 (From FM1015 West to Mile 6)
Mile 12 (From FM88 to Mile 6)
Mile 5 (From Milano to Midway)

Hereinafter called ''the project,” for the sum of

and all extra work in connection therewith, under the terms
and stated in the General and Special Conditions printed or written explanatory
matter thereof, the specification and contract documents therefore as prepared by
RODRIGUEZ ENGINEERING, entitled the Engineer, along with the Performance
and Payment Bonds hereto attached; all of which are made a part hereof and
collectively evidence and constitute the entire contract.

The CONTRACTOR hereby agrees to commence work under this contract on or
after a date to be specified in written ""Notice to Proceed" of the OWNER and to
fully complete the project within _ 120 working days thereafter. The
CONTRACTOR further agrees to pay, as liquidated damages, the sum of $ 250.00
for each consecutive working day thereafter.

The OWNER agrees to pay the CONTRACTOR in current funds the price of unit
prices in the Bid Proposal Form which forms a part of this contract, such payments
to be subject to the Special Conditions and Specifications of the Contract. Payments
will be made based the amount of work completed per month.

DRAFT



IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties to these present have executed this contract
in four (4) counterparts, each of which shall be deemed and original, in year and

day first above mentioned.

APPROVED BY COMMISSIONERS COURT ON, OF DECEMBER, 2007.

CONTRACTOR:

Print Name & Title:

Name of Firm:
Address:

Fed. ID:
STATE OF TEXAS
COUNTY OF HIDALGO

This instrument was acknowledged before me on this the day of
, 2007 by

of and on behalf of

(Title) (A Corporation)

(Seal)

Notary Public Signature

APPROVED AS TO FORM:
Atlas & Hall, L.L.P.
800 Pecan

McAllen, TX 78504 DR AFT

BY:

ATTEST: COUNTY OF HIDALGO:

Arturo Guajardo Jr., County Clerk Juan D. Salinas, 111, County Judge



