HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
BID TABULATION SHEET

§

DEPARTMENT NAME: Hidalg County Purchasing

BID OPENING DATE: November 29, 2006

BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.

DESCRIPTION OF BID: “Safety End Treatments”

BID NO: 06-273-11-29-06CGV

BID # BEE BOND OR CHECK
RFB# NAME OF COMPANY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE INCLUDED

#1 L & R Precast e | See Bid Tabulation
Mission, Tx Sheet
: : See Bid Tabulation
49 R!o Yalley Pipe, LTD Sheet
Mission, Tx
See Bid Tabuiation
#3 Hanson Pipe & Precast Sheet
#4
#5
#6
#7
#8
#9

#10
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'HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING BIDDER'S LOG
SPECIFICATIONS/BID PACKETS

IBF-RFP-RFQ-RFI

BID OPENING DATE:

November 21, 2007 BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.

DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION: ~ “Safety End Treatments”

BID NO: 06-273-11-29-06CGV

NAME OF BIDDER: REQUEST Ok NTALS OF rArF ALooeeinG | aTe e
COMPANYIFIRM WVIA MAILOUT PHONE & FAX NO.s
1. L & R Precast Concrete BLM CcGvV 11-6-07 3807 N. Bentsen Palm Dr.
Mission, Tx 78572
2. Rio Valley Pipe, L.L.C. BLM CGvV 11-6-07 7301 W Expwy 83
Mission, Tx 78572
3. Hanson Pipe & Precast IP 11-9-07 | PO Box 1905

La Feria, Tx 78559

10.

VIA:

IN PERSON (IP)

TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR)
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM)




€ 12/0%/2007 13:06 FAX 31828628 @ootso0s

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
County Of Hidalgo
MEMORANDUM
TQ:  Hon. Sylvia Handy, Commissioner Hon. Joe M. Flores, Commissioner
Hidalge County Precinct No. 1 Hidalgo County Precinct No. 3
ATTN: Mr, Noe Montes, Assistant Administrator - ATTN: Mr. Saul Ramirez, Field Operations Foreman
TO:  Hon. Hector ‘Tito” Palacios, Commissioner Hon. Oscar Garza Jr., Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct No. 2 Hidalgo County Precinct No. 4
ATTN: Mr. Ricardo Cuellar, Field Operations Foreman ATTN: Mr. Robert Andrade, Field Operations Foremar

FROM: Cris Villarreal, Buyer
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: December 7, 2007

RE:  “Pre-Cast Safety End Treatments” for Hidalgo County Project’

m

Enclosed you will find the tabulation sheet for the above referenced project. Please review it and forward your recommendation so as
to proceed with award of contract by no later than Tuesday, December 11, 2007 at 2:00 P.M.

If you have any questions, please call me at 318-2626.

APPROVE DISAPPROVE a

Recommending vendor and/er vendors: /; ‘7{' l/&

FUNDS AVAILABILITY: ‘}/ Yes No Other (specify)

BUDGET ACCOUNT#: _7-/20/-¥3 (- 00 [ 2/- 025 -0 — 4 7¥~
703 38-€3(- 00—/ 2LI-0tL O 57 )

/L/A/ f"‘a?’ Sy AL [ 2 "1/;/)‘2//&/7

>
AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE PRINTED NAME DATE

All Via Fax Transmittals

SUBMIT THIS FORM TO THE HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT, VIA FAX TO (956) 318-2629 OR {956) 292-7612.
* Edinburg, Texas 78539 & (956) 318-2626 % Fax (956) 318-2629
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12/07/2007 13:12 FAX 3122829 @o01/003
., 4
) PURCHASING DEPARTMENT \
a County Of Hidalgo y(}ﬂ%
MEMORANDUM
TO:  Hon. Sylvia Handy, Commissioner Hon. Joe M. Flores, Commissioner
Hidalge County Precinct No. 1 Hidalge County Precinct No. 3
ATTN: Mr, Noe Montes, Asslstant Administrator ATTN: Mr. Saul Ramirez, Field Operations Foreman
TO:  Hon. Hector “Tito" Palacios, Commissioner Han. Oscar Garza Jr., Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct No, 2 Hidalga County Pracinct No. 4
ATTN: Mr.Ricardo Cuellar, Field Operations Foreman ATTN: Mr. Rebert Andrade, Fleld Operations Foremai

FROM: Cris Villarreal, Buyer
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE; December 7, 2007
RE:  "Pre-Cast Safety End Treatments’ for Hidalga County Project”

.

Enclosed you will find the tabulation sheet for the above referenced project. Please review it and forward your recommendation so as
to proceed with award of contract by na later than Tuesday, December 11, 2&07 at 2:00 P.M.

if you have any questions, please call me at 318-2828,

APPROVE &’ DISAPPROVE o
Recommending vendor andfor vendorsﬂﬁﬁl ﬁﬂ/ﬁ )8, /{Mcﬂﬂ/m &7] 97"5/7 g;@ é Spgﬁ
e e s e ————t R e ————— e —
FUNDS AVAILABILITY: //h Yes No Other (spectfy)

BUDGET ACCQUNT # ) 1902 -¥21- 00 - |32 -00 b~0(1 ¥

ﬂ /7
JZ#E&J A‘@/M /0’ 47
AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE PRINTED NAME DATE

All Via Fax Transmittals

SUBMIT THIS FORM TO THE HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT, VIA FAX TO (956) 318-2629 OR (956) 282.7612.
% Edinburg, Texas 78539 4 (956) 318-2626 % Fax (956) 318-2629



T2/07/2007 13:13 FAX 3182629 #Ho01/003

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
County Of Hidalgo
MEMORANDUM
TQ!  Hon, Sylvia Handy, Commissioner Hon. Joe M. Flores, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct No. 1 Hidalgo County Precinct No. 3
ATTN: Mr, Noe Montes, Assistant Administrator A%: v Hiraz, e OparationeFareman
emiwes Ui llgrreal Tr i
TO:  Hon. Hector ‘Tito" Palacios, Commissioner Hon. Oscar GaRa Jr., Commissioner, C o ord j Ma “‘ILM’
Hidalgo County Precinct No. 2 Hidalgo County Precinct No. 4 ov Pc:T, 3
ATTN: Mr. Ricardo Cuellar, Field Operations Foreman ATTN: Mr. Robert Andrade, Field Operations Foremar
[}
FROM: Cris Villarreal, Buyer !

Hidalgo County Purchasing Department
DATE: December 7, 2007

RE: *Pre-Cast Safety End Treatments" for Hidalgo County Project”

Enclosed you will find the tabulation sheet for the above referenced project. Please review it and forward your recommendation so as
to proceed with award of contract by no later than Tuesday, December 11, 2007 at 2:00 P.M.

If you have any questions, please call me at 318-2626.

APPROVE 12/ DISAPPROVE Q
Recommending vendor and/or vendors: L+£ pf (’6&8"' [" vCr ef e ork Inc.

— ot ————
— e ——————— e —

FUNDS AVAILABILITY: _L—"Yes No Other (specify)
TD@ST ACCOUNT #: 2/ 303- 4/ 7 00- 133 05.0- 4,74
< / - ~ I
/’\/(QYVH%%\V émelﬁ/ﬂ/@ Dmm L /\/jx U; ///{ v vie /d/'
AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE PRINTED NAME C Y c/ . 7[ DATE
COvY nater

_) /=077
T[‘\or Per. > /‘72 /10
All Via Fax Transmittals

SUBMIT THIS FORM TO THE HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT, VIAFAXTO (956) 318-2629 OR (956) 292-7612,
¥ Edinbure, Texas 78539 % (956) 318-2626 4 Fax (956) 318-2629



PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
County Of Hidalao

MEMORANDUM

ATTN Mr S«’iff Rdﬂ”ﬂ@m F tf Operations Foraman

Mr *Ric rdo C,aehar Fi eld Operations Foreman A“{ N Mr Rcbert Ardrad g, §~ ald Onerations Foremas

8 for Hidalgo County Proiser’
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SUBMITTHIS FORM TO THE HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DE PAQTMENT VIAFAXTO (956) 318-2629 OR (956} 292-7612.
{ A ,‘
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PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
County Of Hidalgo

MEMORANDUM
TO: Hon. Hector “Tito” Palacios, Commissioner Via Fax: 956-787-4683
Hidalgo County Precinct No. 2
ATTN: Mr. Ricardo Cuellar CV -
Field Operations Foreman
FROM: Cris Villarreal, Buyer
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department
DATE: December 14, 2007
RE: “Precast Safety End Treatments” for Hidalgo County Project

| received and reviewed the recommendation by each precinct regarding the bids received for the above
referenced project. After thoroughly reviewing the bid packets for each vendor and based on your
recommendation for multiple low bidders for each separate size of pipes, one of the vendors submitted an
incomplete bid; therefore, bid award will be based on bidder meeting all specifications and/or requirements.

The item will be place on Commissioner’'s Court agenda meeting of December 26, 2007, for award of bid. If
you have any questions in regards, please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626.

Please acknowledge receipt by signing below and return back to Purchasing Department, Via Fax to
(956) 318-2629 or 292-7612.

Printed Name:

Signature:

Date:

- % Edinburg, Texas 78539 % (956) 318-2626 % Fax (956) 318-2629



HIDALGO COUNTY [\j)
“SAFETY END TREATMENTS”
BID NO. 2006-273-11-29CGV

TABULATION PAGE

Participants: ™™ I. Precast Safety End Treatment - Type I[I RIPRAP-PSET-RR
L & R Precast Concrete Works Inc. Rio Valley Pipe, LTD.
Size Slope Price Pipe Runner Size Slope Price Pipe Runner
18" 6-1 $500.00 $250.00 18" 6-1 $518.00 $260.00
18" 4-1 $415..00 $210.00 18" 4-1 $437.00 $234.00
24" 6-1 $600.00 $315.00 24" 6-1 $614.00 $336.00
24" 4-1 $565.00 $275.00 24" 4-1 $576.00 $285.00
ap? 6-1 $890.00 $575.00 30" 6-1 $905.00 $589.00
30" 4-1 $800.00 $520.00 30" 4-1 $816.00 $538.00

Participants: ™™™ L. Precast Safety End Treatment - Type II Cross Drainage PSET-SC and
PSET-RC
L & R Precast Concrete Works Inc. Rio Valley Pipe, LTD.
PSET-SC----(NO BIDS on PSET-RC) PSET-SC----(NO BIDS on PSET-RC)

Size Slope Price Pipe Runner Size Slope Price Pipe Runner
18" 6-1 $320.00 $250.00 18" 6-1 $336.00 $260.00
18" 4-1 $285.00 $215.00 18" 4-1 $298.00 $23400
24" 6-1 $465.00 $315.00 24" 6-1 $475.00 $336.00
24" 4-1 $425.00 $275.00 24" 4-1 $437.00 $285.00
30" 6-1 $815.00 $575.00 30" 6-1 $823.00 $589.00
30" 4-1 $700.00 $515.00 30" 4-1 $715.00 $538.00

Participants: ™M™ I. Precast Safety End Treatment - Type II Parallel Drainage PSET-RP

L & R Precast Concrete Words Inc. Rio Valley Pipe, LTD.

Size Slope Price Pipe Runner Size Slope Price Pipe Runner
18" 6-1 NO BID NO BID 18" 6-1 NO BID NO BID
18" 4-1 NO BID NO BID 18" 4-1 NO BID NO BID
24" 6-1 NO BID NO BID 24" 6-1 NO BID NO BID
24" 4-1 NO BID NO BID 24" 4-1 NO BID NO BID
30" 6-1 NO BID NO BID 30" 6-1 NO BID NO BID
30" 4-1 NO BID NO BID 30" 4-1 NO BID NO BID




THE STATE OF TEXAS §

COUNTY OF HIDALGO g
REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT
C-07-00-00-00
THIS CONTRACT is made and entered into this . 2007 by and between the COUNTY OF HIDALGO,
TEXAS ("County"), and , Texas ("Company").

WHEREAS, Company responded to advertised notices for bids for “Precast Safety End Treatments”(the
"Services"); and

WHEREAS, Company submitted a bid to provide services in accordance w%th the specifications as bid, a copy of such
specifications and bid being attached hereto as Exhibits "A" and "B" respectively, and incorporated herein for all
purposes (the "Specifications"); and

WHEREAS, in recognition of and in consideration of Company's agreement to perform the Services in accordance with
Specifications, the Commissioners Court of County awarded the bid to Company.

NOW, THEREFORE, in mutual consideration of the foregoing and the further consideration of the following, the parties
hereto agree as follows:

1. County and Company hereby agree that this Contract is entered into in order to provide the Services to Hidalgo
County for Project as listed on specification . This Contract does not extend to any third parties any duties or benefits
conferred in any manner hereunder or otherwise.

2. Company hereby promises and agrees to render and provide, during the term of this Contract, and shall be
obligated to render and provide the Services in accordance with the Specifications within Hidalgo County following
a request for Services by the Commissioner or his designated agent. Company agrees in performing the Services
that it will use proper professional standards, comply with any and all appropriate laws and regulations in providing the
Services, and devote such time as is necessary to safely and efficiently provide the Services.

3. This Contract shall be for a period beginning , 2007, and ending on




, and may be extended at the sole discretion of County for an additional ninety(90) days, unless this
Contract is terminated pursuant to the provisions herein, whichever occurs first.
4. As a condition of this Contract, Company shall hold and maintain throughout the term of this Contract all
licenses and permits required, or which may be required by any authority during the term hereof to provide the
Services.
5. All trucks or vehicles operated by the Company to perform the Services shall contain all equipment required
by any authority to operate on streets and roads and all persons in the employ of Company who operate such trucks
or vehicles shall have the required licenses, qualifications, skill and expertise to perform such Services and shall comply
with all laws, rules and regulations prescribed by any agency or authority having jurisdiction with regard to the operation
of such trucks or vehicles in providing the Services.
6. As consideration for rendering the Service provided for in this Contract, the County agrees to pay Company the
amounts specified in Exhibit "B" attached hereto payable against wri&'eh invoice submitted by Company.
7. Company shall provide insurance in force on all its vehicles and all persons connected with providing services
under this Contract naming County as an additional insured (with the coverages and in the amounts described on
Exhibit "C" attached hereto and incorporated herein at this point for all purposes), and shall furnish to County
certificates of such insurance coverage.
8. Company shall provikde; a sufficient number of trucks, vehicles, personnel and equipment available to safely
and efficiently provide the Services.
9. Company shallindemnify and hold harmless County, its elected officials, employees and agents from any and
all claims, damages, losses, and expenses including attorney's fees for the defense of 'any action against County
arising out of, resulting from, or connected with the provision of the Service by Company under this Contract. Said
indemnity shall cover any act or failure to act by the Company, its agents or employees.
10. This Contract shall not be assignable in whole or in part by either party without prior written consent of the other

party.

1. ltis expressly agreed that this Contract and the performance by the parties hereunder does not create any



agency relationship or master-servant relationship, that County has no supervision of the performance of the Services
provided by Company, and that Company is an independent contractor under this Contract.
12. Any notice required or permitted to be given hereunder shall be in writing and shall be delivered personally or
sent by certified mail, postage prepaid, as set forth below:
If to County: The County of Hidalgo

Attn: County Judge

100 E. Cano
Edinburg, Texas 78539

If to Company:

13. In case any one or more of the provisions contained in this Agreement shall for any reason be held to be
invalid, illegal or unenforceable in any respect, such invalidity, iﬂegality, or unenforceability shall not affect any other
provision thereof and this Agreement shall be construed as if such invalid, illegal, or unenforceable provision had never
been contained herein.

14, This Agreement may be terminated by either party without cause upon thirty (30) days written notice.

15. This Agreement shall be binding-upon and inufetb the benefit of and be enforceable by the parties hereto and
their respective heirs, executors, administratbrs, legal representatives, successors, and assigns where permitted by
this Agreement. S

16. This Agreement shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws of the State of Texas and
shall be performable in Hidalgo County.

WITNESS our hands in duplicate originals this day of , 2007.

COUNTY OF HIDALGO

By:
Juan D. Salinas, County Judge

ATTEST:




Arturo Guajardo,Jr., County Clerk

Approved as to form:
Atlas & Hall, L. L. P.

By:

COMPANY:

By:

Printed Name:

Title:




HIDALGO COUNTY
“Safety End Treatments”
Bid No. 2006-273-00-00CGV

TERMS AND CONDITIONS/SPECIFICATIONS:

Bidder(s) shall supply, where needed (on an “As Needed” Basis) in Hidalgo County, or Job Site, “Precast
Safety End Treatments”.

Hidalgo County reserves the right to continue this bid for an additional sixty (60) day Grace Period at the end
of the contract term for unforseen delay in award of new bid for next contract term.

Hidalgo County may award the bid on a lump sum basis to one (1) bidder or to multiple bidders on an item bid
basis, whichever is in the best interest of the County.

After bid is awarded and low bidder(s) default(s) in meeting the general instructions to bidders and/or comply
with contractual agreement, Hidalgo County reserves the right to seek services from the next low bidder(s).
In such event, County shall charge the successful bidder(s) the difference for any additional cost of such
item(s).

Any contract award to a successful bidder will be in effect until (a) the contract expires, (b) delivery and
acceptance of products, and/or performances of services ordered, or (c) terminated by County with thirty (30)
days written notice prior to cancellation. :

Allcosts and expenses associated with the preparation and submission of (bids, proposals and or/quotes) shall
be the responsibility of the bidder and no reimbursements for such charges or expenses shall be passed onto
Hidalgo County

Market Volatility and Unit Price Adjustments:

Hidalgo County recognizes that during periods of national crisis and unstable economic conditions, unforeseen price
increases might affect costs for goods and services contracted on an annual basis. The following procedure may be
employed to mediate price volatility:

1). Requesting Price Adjustment: Upon written request of the Vendor to the County Purchasing Agent, the
County may review evidence of prevailing industry-wide market conditions that warrant an adjustment in bid
prices contained in the contract.

* A Vendor must tie any price change clause to an industry-wide or otherwise nationally recognized
index, or some other form of verifiable document. Such written request must be accompanied by a
certified copy of the supplier's advisory or notification to the vendor of the price changes.

* The Vendor must put the Purchasing Agent on the mailing lists for such publications so that the
Purchasing Agent can monitor said changes. Such membership shall be at no cost to the County.

* The County Purchasing Agent retains the right to determine whether or not such proposed price
changes are in the best interest of the County.

* No price escalation will be authorized in excess of the amount of the increase referred to in the
supplier's notice.

* The County may only grant a price increase if the evidence presented is deemed reliable. Should the
County allow a price increase, the approved price change shall be honored for all orders received by
the vendor or contractor after the effective date of such price change. Approved price changes are
not applicable to orders already issued and in process at time of price change.



HIDALGO COUNTY
“Safety End Treatments”
Bid No. 2007-117-00-00CGV

BID PAGE

. PRECAST SAFETY END TREATMENT - TYPE Il RIPRAP-PSET-RR

(SEE ATTACHED EXHIBIT “B” FOR MEASUREMENTS OF PRECAST SAFETY END TREATMENTS)

SIZE SLOPE UNIT PRICE
18" 6-1 $
18" 4-1 $
24" 6-1 $
24" 4-1 $
30" 6-1 $
30" 4-1 $
SIZE PIPE RUNNERS UNIT PRICE
18" 6-1 $
18" 4-1 $
24" 6-1 $
24" 4-1 $
30" 6-1 $
30" 4-1 $

ADDITIONAL FEES: (IF ANY) $




HIDALGO COUNTY
“Safety End Treatments”
Bid No. 2006-273-00-00CGV

BID PAGE

Il. SAFETY END TREATMENT - TYPE |ll- CROSS DRAINAGE PSET-SC AND PSET-RC

-—

SIZE SLOPE UNIT PRICE SIZE SLOPE UNIT PRICE
PSET-SC P SET-RC
18" 6-1 $ 18" 6-1 $
18" 4-1 $ 18" 4-1 $
24" 6-1 $ 24" 6-1 $
24" 4-1 $ 24" 4-1 $
30" 6-1 $ 30" 6-1 $_
30" 4-1 $ 30" 4-1 $
SIZE PIPE RUNNERS UNIT PRICE
18" 6-1 $
18" 4-1 $
24" 6-1 $
24" 4-1 $
30" 6-1 $
30" 4-1 $

ADDITIONAL FEES: (IF ANY) $




HIDALGO COUNTY
“Safety End Treatments”
Bid No. 2007-117-00-00CGV

BID PAGE

lll. PRECAST SAFETY END TREATMENT - TYPE Il PARALLEL DRAINAGE -PSET-RP

SIZE

18"
18"
24"
24"
30"
30"

SIZE
18"
18"
24"
24"
30"
30"

ADDITIONAL FEES: (IF ANY)

SLOPE UNIT PRICE
6-1 s
4-1 $
6-1 $
4-1 $
6-1 $
41 $
PIPE RUNNERS UNIT PRICE
6-1 $
4-1 $
6-1 $
41 $
6-1 $
4-1 $

$

BIDDER'S NAME:
ADDRESS:
CITY/STATE/ZIP CODE:
PHONE NUMBER:

FAX NUMBER :

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE:
PRINTED NAME:

TITLE:

DATE:




