HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING BIDDER'S LOG
SPECIFICATIONS/BID PACKETS

IBF-RFP-RFQ-RFI

BID OPENING DATE: January 9, 2008

BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.

DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION:*HIDALGO COUNTY- GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL

(ALL GRADES)"
BID NO.: 07-122-01-09-rol
BID SIGNATURE (IF APPLICABLE)
NAME OF VENDOR: REQUEST OR INITIALS OF STAFF :
‘ COMPANY /FIRM *VIA ADDRESSING MAIL OUT DATE |[ PHONE NO ADDRESS &
1. Goldstar Petroleum _ 1000 E. Expressway 83 (Rear) 702-7827 PO Box 363
Attn: Paul C. Rodriguez email San Juan, Texas 78589 Pharr, Texas 78577
2. Arguindegui Oil Company Tl Danny Perez 380-3040 PO Box 1367
Attn: Rene Torres Em.z:u an dannyp@aocpetroleum.com Laredo, Texas 78042
3. Valero Corporation Email and One Valero Way (210)345-
mail San Antonio Texas 75249 2000
4. Susser Petroleum Email ttesch(@susser.com 832 234-
3600
5. Comdata Corporation Email Tom Gustin

tgustin@comdata.com

10.

*VIA:
IN PERSON (IP)

TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR)
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM)




GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL
BID COMPARISON BY PARTICIPATING VENDORS

OPTION I: DELIVERY OF FUEL TO HIDALGO COUNTY SITES (BULK FUEL)

State Tax |

GOLD STAR PETROLEUM INC. ARGUINDEGUI1 OIL CO.
UNLEADED REGULAR UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
GASOLINE
Opis Price $2.5230 $2.4381
|
0.2000 0.2000

Margin of Profit

TRANSPORT DEL. 0.0823

TRANSPORT DEL. 0.0708

BOBTAIL DEL. 0.1748

BOBTAIL DEL. 0.1234

Total Price Per Gallon

TRANSPORT DEL. $2.8053

TRANSPORT DEL. $2.7089

BOBTAIL DEL. $2.8978

BOBTAIL DEL. $2.7615

UNLEADED MID GRADE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
GASOLINE .

Opis Price $2.5955 $2.5095
State lax 0.2000 0.2000

Margin of Profit

TRANSPORT DEL. 0.0823

TRANSPORT DEL. 0.0708

BOBTAIL DEL. 0.1748

BOBTAIL DEL. 0.1234

Total Price Per %allon

TRANSPORT DEL. $2.8778

TRANSPORT DEL. $2.7803

BOBTAIL DEL. $2.9703

BOBTAIL DEL. $2.8329

UNLEADED PREMIUM UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
GASOLINE

Opis Price $2.7153 $2.6355
State Tax 0.2000 0.2000
Margin of Proflt TRANSPORT DEL. 0.0823 TRANSPORT DEL. 0.0708

BOBTAIL DEL. 0.1748

BOBTAIL DEL. 0.1234

Total Price Per Gallon

TRANSPORT DEL. $2.9976

TRANSPORT DEL. $2.9063

BOBTAIL DEL. $3.0901

BOBTAIL DEL. $2.9589




DIESEL FUEL:

LOW SULFER DIESEL UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Opis Price $2.7535 $2.6331
State Tax 0.2000 0.2000

Margin of Profit

TRANSPORT DEL. 0.0880

TRANSPORT DEL. 0.0708

BOBTAIL DEL. 0.1843

BOBTAIL DEL. 0.1234

Total Price Per Gallon

TRANSPORT DEL. $3.0415

TRANSPORT DEL. $2.9039

BOBTAIL DEL. $3.1378

BOBTAIL DEL. $2.9565

#2 ULTRA LOW SULFER DIESEL UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
2.6667

Opis Price $2.7845 $

State Tax 0.2000 0.2000

Margin of Profit

TRANSPORT DEL. 0.1026

TRANSPORT DEL. 0.0708

BOBTAIL DEL. 0.1929

BOBTAIL DEL. 0.1234

I
Total Price Per Qallon

TRANSPORT DEL. $3.0871

TRANSPORT DEL. $2.9375

BOBTAIL DEL. $3.1774

BOBTAIL DEL. $2.9901

#2 ULTRA LOW SULFER DIESEL UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
(WITH ENDHANCED ADDITIVE)

2.
Opis Price $2.7845 $2.6667
State Tax 0.2000 0.2000

Margin of Profit

TRANSPORT DEL. 0.1326

TRANSPORT DEL. 0.0933

BOBTAIL DEL. 0.2229

BOBTAIL DEL. 0.1459

Total Price Per Gallon

TRANSPORT DEL. $3.1171

TRANSPORT DEL. $2.9600

BOBTAIL DEL. $3.2074

BOBTAIL DEL. $3.0126

UNIT PRICE

UNIT PRICE

#2 ULTRA SULFER DYED DIESEL

Opis Price

$2.7960

$2.7460

State Tax

Margin of Profit

TRANSPORT DEL. 0.1026

TRANSPORT DEL. 0.0708

BOBTAIL DEL. 0.1929

BOBTAIL DEL. 0.1234

Total Price Per Gallon

TRANSPORT DEL. $2.8986

TRANSPORT DEL. $2.8168

BOBTAIL DEL. $2.9889

BOBTAIL DEL. $2.8694

[§]




GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL

BID COMPARISON BY PARTICIPATING VENDORS

OPTION II: VENDOR FUEL SITES

GOLD STAR PETROLEUM INC. ARGUINDEGUI OIL CO.
UNLEADED REGULAR UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
GASOLINE
N
Opis Price O BID $2.4381
State Tax NOBID 0.2000
Margin of Profit NOBID 0.0979
Total Price Per Gallon NOBID $2.7360
UNLEADED MID GRADE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
GASOLINE
O BID
Opis Price N $2.5095
State Tax NOBID 0.2000
Margin of Profit NOBID 0.0979
. o NO BID $2.8074
Fotal Price Per Gallon
UNLEADED PREMIUM UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
GASOLINE
. D )
Opis Price NOBI $2.6355
State Tax l NOBID 0.2000
1
Margin of Profit NOBID 0.0979
Total Price Per Gallon NOBID $2.9334
DIESEL FUEL:
#2 ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
FUEL
Opis Price NOBID $2.6667
State Tax NOBID 0.2000
Margin of Profit NOBID 0.0979
5
Fotal Price Per Gallon NOBID §2.9646




#2 ULTRA SULFUR DYED UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DIESEL FUEL
NO BIE )
Opis Price O BID $2.7460
. - NO BID
State Tax
NO BID
Margin of Profit 0.0979
NO BID $2.8439

Total Price Per Gallon




& PURCHASING DEPARTMENFECE Y gm
;_'; ‘ ;,%:’y}'g« County Ot Hidalgo #rpen
g “URCHASING pEp;

—_—

January 4. 2008

RE: ADDENDUM NO.1
FOR BID No.: 07-122-01-09-rol
“HIDALGO COUNTY —
GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL
(ALL GRADES)

Dear Gentlemen:

Attached you will find ADDENDUM NO. 1, PAGE 1 OF 1 in connection with HIDALGO COUNTY -
request for bids for “ GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL (ALL GRADES)".

Please add this ADDENDUM NO. 1 to your bid packet 5o as to perrhit your company to submit a complete bid.
See original bid packet LEGAL NOTICE page 3 paragraph 9.

Acknowledge receipt of ADDENDUM NO. 1 by signing and returning this notice to us VIA FAX AT
(956) 318-2629.

If you do not receive all pages of ADDENDUM NO. 1 please notify us immediately at (956) 318-2626.

Please be advised that this ADDENDUM NO. 1 will complete your bid packet for “HIDALGO COUNTY —
GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL (ALL GRADES)".

Thank you for your prompt attention to this matter.

e Q)\%‘M g gQQQ_k’Ki e BY:

Martha L. Salazar, CPPB ADDENDUM NO. |
Hidalgo County Purchasing Agent ACKNOWLEDGMENT OF RECEIPT
MLS/rf

Enclosures



ADDENDUM NO. 1

“HIDALGO COUNTY
GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL (ALL GRADES)"'BID NO.: 07-122-01-09-rol
Bid Opening Date: January 9, 2008

PLEASE NOTE CHANGES AS FOLLOWS:

No. 1 Exhibit “B” Bid Page

I, /4 /««wﬂ N\, acknowledge receipt of ADDENDUM NO. | dated,
January/4, 2008, for RYB-*HIDAGO COUNTY — GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL (ALL
GRADES)", date modifigdtions.

%%//lapo;w d// (0. 7 7/> 7 /og

Printefl Bidder Name Date

NOTE: PLEASE SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL ADDENDUM
WITH YOUR BID PACKET, IN ORDER TO
COMPLETE THE BID.....




EXHIBIT “B”
HIDALGO COUNTY
“GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL (ALL GRA
BID NO. 2007-122-01-09-rol

BID PAGE

OPTION I- DELIVERY OF FUEL TO HIDALGO COUNTY SITES (BULK).

GASOLINE:

DES)"

UNIT PRICFE

E Unleaded Regular Gasoline

OPIS PRICE 7“;2 43 87
STATE TAX s 2000
Margin of profit includes remediation fees 2)4? ll:fg}\?llT Bﬁ?jgroyn . o770 )
by | o 1234

TOTAL PRICE PER ‘CALLON FOR TRANSPORT DELIVERY

|
| TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON FOR BOBTAIL DELIVERY

$
Z.7¢|5
4 UNIT PRICE
' Unleaded Mid Grade Gasoline OPIS PRICE 7 '2,, 50 7 6 ,;
STATE TAX e 2. 000
Margin of profit includes remediation fees g‘? sg(l;;” Er;?vsgc;n e O 7O 2)
Bobtail R
Delivery & /Z ?) 4

TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON FOR TRANSPORT DELIVERY

*2 780>

)
- TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON FOR BOBTAIL DELIVERY

27,8229




UNIT PRICE

| Unleaded Premium Gasoline OPIS PRICE Z . é% 55
| STATE TAX c 2000
i T
| Margin of profit includes remediation fees CN;? F%IS(])NFIT Dz?js:;n o 0'7 I8 % {
i !
; Bobtail
Delivery P l 2 54
TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON FOR TRANSPORT DELIVERY 5 2 7@@3
TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON FOR BOBTAIL DELIVERY :
!
| 2.9589
DIESEL: v
; UNIT PRICE
. LOW SULFER DIESEL OPIS PRICE *-‘P 2 é 3= /
STATE TAX e LOO0O
i . . T
Margin of profit includes remediation fees g’? :}RG(I)];” Dﬁ?‘fs:;n v 07@ 8
Bobtail
Delivery o /Z % Lil
TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON FOR TRANSPORT DELIVERY h) Z 705 7
TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON FOR BOBTAIL DELIVERY SZ q 5& 5
_ UNIT PRICE
OPIS PRICE % , ‘
#2 Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel Z éé é 7 '
] STATE TAX e 2000 |
Margin of profit includes remediation fees (A)dlf\ EIS(I)I;]T [T)E?Vss;n ‘7 O e)
Bobtail
Delivery - /Z % sl

TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON FOR TRANSPORT DELIVERY

2.9%75

TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON FOR BOBTAIL DELIVERY

2. 990l

tJ



, UNIT PRICE

x #2 Ultra low sulfur Diesel with Enhanced Additive

OPIS PRICE

&

F2.0007

4‘7“)000@/ 56(V)~C€/ bfa,op + STATE TAX ¢ 2000
‘ T
- Margin of profit includes remediation fees gﬁg&?n Dr;?:sroyn O 73 ‘%
Bobtail
Delivery 159

1

TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON FOR TRANSPORT DELIVERY

52_,,‘7@06

' TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON FOR BOBTAIL DELIVERY

2. 026

; UNIT PRICE
#2 Ultra Sulfur Dyed Diesel Fuel OPIS PRICE 2 717[ 6O
STATE TAX —
i T
Margin of profit includes remediation fees I\OA? :}S&EIT Dﬁ?js,oyn s O 70 %
Bobtail
Delivery e / Z % 4

| TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON FOR TRANSPORT DELIVERY

$2.8 /68

TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON FOR BOBTAIL DELIVERY

2.8694

Note: These are the most common fuels used by Hidalge County.

MARGIN OF PROFIT :( PRICE IN DOLLARS AND CENTS)

(o8]



HIDALGO COUNTY

“GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL (ALL GRADES)”
BID NO. 2007-122-01-09-rol

BID PAGE
OPTION II- VEDOR FUELING STATIONS.
GASOLINE:
: UNIT PRICE |
Unleaded Regular Gasoline OPIS PRICE 9 2 (-;é)g /
STATE TAX . 2 008
' Margin of profit includes remediation fees MARGIN OF PROFIT ) O éi 7 ?
| TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON 2. 7360
;UNIT PRICE
. Unleaded Mid Grade Gasoline OPIS PRICE P 2.5094
| STATE TAX .2 000
Margin of profit includes remediation fees MARGIN OF PROFIT | , , 07 79
| TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON Z.807
| , UNIT PRICE
* Unleaded Premium Gasoline OPIS PRICE Z, L,Z; Ss
STATE TAX e OO
! —
- Margin of profit includes remediation fees MARGIN OF PROFI T P O 7 77

. TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON

[
72. 93




DIESEL.:
INIT PRICE
#2 Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel OPIS PRICE 2 ’ é éé /
STATE TAX . Z2.COD
Margin of profit includes remediation fees MARGIN OF PROFIT :
e . 0979
TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON By N 2.9 4/é
UNIT PRICE
#2 Ultra Sulfur Dyed Diesel Fuel OPIS PRICE #2745
W ( é/ ‘ SZZ * STATE TAX ‘o -
oC Apaifeble @ Vetas ) Stores
Margin of profit includes remediation fees MARGIN OF PROFIT . Oq 7 7
¥
TOTAL PRICE PER GALLON 2.8439

1. Please specify if you will provide Hidalgo County with 24 hour service (yes or no) Z/{){y
2. Please provide locations for fueling on a separate page (Store names, city and addresses) in Hidalgo County.

Note: These are the most common fuels used by Hidalgo County.



THE STATE OF TEXAS  §
§
COUNTY OF HIDALGO  §

SERVICE CONTRACT
C-08-122-00-00

THIS CONTRACT is made and entered into this day of
the COUNTY OF HIDALGO, TEXAS ("County"), and, Texas ("
WHEREAS, Company responded to advertised notices for bi

FUEL (ALL GRADES)"(the "Services"); and

unty awarded the bid to

going and the further consideration

hat this Contract is entered into in order to

ject as listed on specification . This Contract does

1



designated agent. Company agrees in performing the Services that it will use proper professional

standards, comply with any and all appropriate laws and regulations in providing the Serviges, and

devote such time as is necessary to safely and efficiently provide the Servicgs.

3. This Contract shall be for a period beginning March 1, 2§ 0 ending 0

| e (1)

1, 2009 and may be extended at the sole discretion of County for an aftional two

terms, unless this Contract is terminated pursuant to the provisions cver occurs first.

County also reserves the right to continue this bid for an additional s Grace Period,

under the same rates terms and conditions.

4, As a condition of this Contract, Company shall j gaintain thro® m

of this Contract all licenses and permits required, or wi any auth@e¥y during

ol

the term hereof to provide the Services.

e Services shall contain

5. All trucks or vehicles operatg e Comp

o
crateon s

all equipment required by any authority d all persons in the employ

of Company ofl-hicles sha ed licenses, qualifications, skill

and ex y nd shall coMply with all laws, rules and regulations

prescribed by iction with regard to the operation of such trucks

or vehicles in prg



with providing services under this Contract naming County as an additional insured (with the
coverages and in the amounts described on Exhibit "C" attached hereto and incorporated herein at
this point for all purposes), and shall furnish to County certificates of such ipsurance ¢
8. Company shall provide a sufficient number of truck
equipment available to safely and efficiently provide the Services.
9. Company shall indemnify and hold harmless County, cials, employees
and agents from any and all claims, damages, losses, and expenses inc 's fees for the
defense of any action against County arising out of, resulting from,
of the Service by Company under this Contract. Said indemnj
by the Company, its agents or employees.
10.  This Contract shall not be assignab ¥ without prior
written consent of the other party.
11.
does not creatge : b that County has no supervision
of the p - - /, and that Company is an independent
contractor und
12. 0 be given hereunder shall be in writing and shall
be delivg d mail, postage prepaid, as set forth below:
bunty of Hidalgo
ttn: County Judge

00 E. Cano
Edinburg, Texas 78539




13.  In case any one or more of the provisions contained in this Agreement shall for any

reason be held to be invalid, illegal or unenforceable in any respect, such invalidity, illegality, or
unenforceability shall not affect any other provision thereof and this Agreemept shall be

if such invalid, illegal, or unenforceable provision had never been contg crein.

LW (30) N

14.  This Agreement may be terminated by either party withgiilicause upon
written notice.

15.  This Agreement shall be binding upon and inure to the b¥ be enforceable
by the parties hereto and their respective heirs, executors, admingggfators, gtatives,

successors, and assigns where permitted by this Agreement.

laws of

16.  This Agreement shall be governed by ag nce with

the State of Texas and shall be performable in Higho County

WITNESS our hands in duplicate o s this , 2008.

24

COUNT

By:
Blinas 11, County Judge

ATTEST:

Arturo Guajardo

COMPANY:
By:
Printed Name:

Title:



APPROVED AS TO FORM:
Atlas & Hall, L.L.P.

By:



